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UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT
DISTRICT OF MAINE

Inre
Chapter 11
MONTREAL MAINE & ATLANTIC RAILWAY LTD., Case No. 13-10670

Debtor.

N N N N N N N

FIRST INTERIM APPLICATION FOR COMPENSATION
AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES FOR
VERRILL DANA LLP AS SPECIAL COUNSEL TO THE TRUSTEE FOR
THE PERIOD OF AUGUST 22, 2013 THROUGH APRIL 30, 2014

This is a First Interim Application

Name of Applicant: Verrill Dana LLP

Authorized to Provide Professional Services To: Robert J. Keach, duly appointed Trustee
Petition Date: August 7, 2013

Date of Retention Order: September 10, 2013

Period for Which Compensation and August 22, 2013 through April 30, 2014
Reimbursement is Sought

Fees for Services: $335,647.00

Expenses for which Reimbursement is Sought: 4,088.34

Amount Paid by Insurance: ($143,238.46)

Total Payment Sought: $196,496.88

Amount Paid by Estate to Date: $0.00

Retainer Balance: $0.00

Pursuant to 11 U.S.C. § 330(a)(1), Rule 2016(a) of the Federal Rules of Bankruptcy
Procedure, and D. Me. LBR 2016-1(a), the law firm of Verrill Dana, LLP (“Verrill Dana™),

counsel to Robert J. Keach, Esqg. the Trustee in the above-captioned case (the “Trustee”), hereby

submits this first interim application (the “Application”) approving reasonable and necessary

fees of $335,647.00 and expenses of $4,088.34 for the period August 22, 2013 through April 30,

2014 (the “Application Period”) and hereby requests that this Court enter an order authorizing

payment to Verrill Dana in the amount of $196,496.88, reflecting the balance owed after receipt

5302064_3.DOC



Case 13-10670 Doc 911 Filed 05/27/14 Entered 05/27/14 15:12:22 Desc Main
Document Page 2 of 8

of payments from the Debtor’s insurance carrier—XL Group. In support of this Application,
Verrill Dana states as follows:

1. On August 7, 2013 (the “Petition Date”), the Debtor filed a voluntary petition for
relief under Chapter 11 of the United States Bankruptcy Code, 11 U.S.C. 8 101, et seq (the
“Code”).

2. On August 21, 2013, the U.S. Trustee appointed the Trustee [DE 64] as trustee of
the Debtor pursuant to 11 U.S.C. § 1163.

3. On September 10, 2013, this Court entered an Order [DE 195] approving the
employment of Verrill Dana, LLP, effective as of August 22, 2013, as special counsel to the

Trustee (the “Retention Order”).

4. This is a core proceeding; the Court has jurisdiction to enter a final order on this
Motion pursuant to 28 U.S.C. 8§ 157(b)(2)(A) and (M).

Basis of Request for Allowance of Compensation
and Reimbursement of Expenses

5. This is the first application for compensation which Verrill Dana has submitted to
the Court in this Chapter 11 case.

6. No agreement or understanding exists between Verrill Dana and any individual,
person or other entity for the sharing of the compensation and reimbursement of expenses sought
by this Application, except among partners and employees of Verrill Dana. In addition, no
payments have been made or promised to Verrill Dana for services rendered or to be rendered in
connection with the Debtor’s Chapter 11 case, except as set forth herein.

7. All services for which approval of compensation is requested were performed for

and on behalf of the Trustee and not for any other individual, person or entity.
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Services Provided by
Verrill Dana to the Trustee and Expenses Incurred

8. During the Application Period, Verrill Dana provided essential professional
services to the Trustee under the Code, the Federal Rules of Bankruptcy Procedure, and the
Local Rules of this Court. The services provided by Verrill Dana to the Trustee are described in
detail in the attached Exhibit A.

9. Attached hereto as Exhibit B is a table showing the number of hours billed and
the hourly rate for each timekeeper. The blended hourly rate for time spent by attorneys on this
matter is $285.81. The blended hourly rate for time spent by paralegals on this matter is
$134.22.

10.  Attached hereto as Exhibit C is a brief professional biography of each Verrill
Dana professional who rendered services in connection with the fees and expenses sought in this
Application, as required by D. Me. LBR 2016-1(a)(3)(V)..

11. Below is an allocation of fees by category of services.

Fee Category Hours for Period Fees for Period

Case administration, including
transition services, cash collateral
issues, analysis of accounts receivable,
accounts payable, recoupment, set off,
railroad clearinghouse transactions,
rolling stock, executory contract and
unexpired leases, and preparation of
schedules and statement of financial
affairs; advise trustee regarding
insurance coverage issues. 261.9 $65,518.50
Criminal investigation conducted by
Sdreté du Quebec and internal analysis
of accident, including representation
during witness interviews, negotiation
with SQ, FBI and Office of U.S.
Attorney, establish protocols for review
and production of electronically stored 1,071.9 $270,128.50
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information; interview employees of
Debtor; work with Debtor’s IT staff to
facilitate document production; review
documents and ESI for privilege;
negotiate search terms and other
protocols for ESI; produce documents
and ESI in accordance with subpoenas;
work with outside vendors to minimize
cost of responding to subpoenas;
regularly report to and advise Trustee
regarding investigation as to cause of
accident, criminal investigation, and
Trustee’s duties and rights regarding
subpoenas.

Totals $335,647.00

12.  Verrill Dana’s services on behalf of the Trustee can be divided into two broad
categories. First, Verrill Dana has provided services to assist with the administration of the case,
particularly relating to the transition of administration of this case from the Debtor to the Trustee,
and the preparation of bankruptcy schedules and the statement of financial affairs. Verrill Dana
was well positioned to provide these services in light of its historic representation of the Debtor,
including its representation of the Debtor prior to and in connection with the voluntary
bankruptcy filing on August 7, 2014, and continuing to represent the Debtor post-petition until
the Trustee was appointed on August 21, 2014. Verrill Dana met with the Trustee and his
primary counsel to provide information about the Debtor’s operations and financial affairs,
including issues relevant to the Debtor’s use of cash collateral. These issues were complex in
light of the Debtor’s participation in the national railroad interline settlement system, and its
complex and interrelated relationships with various Irving entities engaged in the rail, petroleum,
pulp and paper, and forest products industries. The issues were made more complex by the
existence of cross-border issues with the Debtor’s subsidiary — Montreal, Maine & Atlantic
Canada Co. (“MMAC”). Verrill Dana assisted the Trustee in understanding various issues,

relationships, and historical practices of the Debtor, and accompanied the Trustee in initial

-4-
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meetings with the Debtor’s management and counsel for MMAC, as well as the monitor
appointed by the Canadian court in connection with the MMAC CCAA filing, which occurred on
or about August 6, 2014. Verrill Dana worked with the Debtor's management to gather
information and prepare and file the Debtor’s schedules and statement of financial affairs.
Verrill Dana also assisted the Trustee in causing an insurance carrier to reimburse a significant
portion of the Trustee’s legal expenses in connection with the Sireté du Québec in Canada,
which is discussed more fully below. Verrill Dana attorneys and paralegals spent 261.9 hours
and billed $65,518.50 for services described in this paragraph. A detailed description of Verrill
Dana’s time entries in connection with its general representation of the Trustee on the matters
described above is attached as Exhibit A-1, and is identified in Verrill Dana’s billing files by
matter number 45775-9145.

13. Verrill Dana’s second broad category of services on behalf of the Trustee
involved the criminal investigation of the Debtor launched by Sireté du Québec (the “SQ”) in
Canada, which included the SQ’s affiliation with the United States Attorney’s Office and the
Federal Bureau of Investigation in the United States. Verrill Dana first learned of the SQ
investigation on August 9, 2014 (shortly after the Petition Date) when it received a call from a
member of the Debtor’s management reporting that the SQ had unexpectedly arrived at the
homes of one or more of the Debtor’s employees on a Friday night, accompanied by an FBI
agent, to conduct interviews regarding the accident in Lac-Mégantic which precipitated the
Debtor’s bankruptcy filing. Immediately following his appointment, the Trustee retained Verrill
Dana to continue its work in connection with the SQ investigation. Verrill Dana, at the direction
of the Trustee, represented the Debtor and certain of its employees for purposes of the SQ’s
investigation, including advising the Debtor on cross-border legal issues concerning criminal
investigations and prosecutions. Verrill Dana attended a substantial number of the interviews of

-5-
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the Debtor’s employees that were conducted by the SQ and/or FBI over the course of several
months and at the Debtor’s offices across Maine and Vermont. At the request of the Trustee, and
in order to properly represent the Debtor for purposes of the SQ’s investigation, Verrill Dana
simultaneously undertook an investigation into the facts and circumstances that led to the
accident in Lac-Mégantic.

In addition to the interviews, SQ also served the Debtor with a broad subpoena for
documents (both paper and electronic) relating to the accident, the company’s operations, and
safety practices more generally. In order to respond to the subpoena, Verrill Dana collected,
reviewed and processed more than 66,000 emails, 100,000 pages of paper documents, and
millions of electronic documents (totaling more than 500 GB of data). Verrill Dana attorneys
collected the documents and data from 30 custodians. A team of Verrill Dana attorneys was
charged with reviewing the documents for responsiveness and privilege. To date, Verrill Dana
has produced more than 235,000 documents in response to SQ’s subpoenas and identified
approximately 50 GB of additional data in native format. Verrill Dana also spent a significant
amount of the time reviewing and negotiating the scope of these subpoenas with the U.S.
Attorney’s Office and advising the Trustee on methods of document review and production that
resulted in significant cost savings to the estate. Verrill Dana represented the Trustee in asserting
claims under one of the Debtor’s insurance policies issued by XL Group. Verrill Dana has also
assisted the Trustee in other matters where the Trustee needed ready access to documents or facts
concerning the previous operations of the Debtor prior to filing. Verrill Dana attorneys and
paralegals spent 1071.9 hours and billed $270,128.50 for services described in this paragraph. A
detailed description of Verrill Dana’s time entries in connection with its general representation of
the Trustee on the matters described above is attached as Exhibit A-2, and is identified in Verrill
Dana’s billing files by matter number 40231-9121.
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14.  Verrill Dana, on behalf of the Trustee, has sought reimbursement of its fees in
connection with the SQ criminal investigation from the Debtor’s insurance carrier — XL Group.
XL Group has paid $196,806.71 to Verrill Dana in connection with the services performed
during the Application Period. ' XL has denied coverage for $60,431.97 in services rendered
between August 22, 2013 and February 28, 2014. XL has not yet responded to an invoice in the
amount of $131,011.04 recently sent for services from March 1 through April 30, 2014. The
Trustee’s right to contest XL’s denial of coverage is preserved. Verrill Dana shall promptly turn
over to the Trustee any amounts received from XL that would constitute an overpayment. Verrill
Dana seeks payment from the bankruptcy estate of $196,496.88, which represents its unpaid
balance after applying payments received from XL Group for services during the Application
Period.

15.  Verrill Dana’s reimbursable expenses on behalf of the Trustee totaled $4,088.34
during the Application Period, in accordance with the standard Maine expense level list
(“SMELL”). An itemization of expenses incurred on behalf of the Trustee is set forth in
Exhibit D. These charges cover only Verrill Dana’s direct costs that are not incorporated in
Verrill Dana’s hourly fees. All expenses in this matter are in-line with the usual and customary
expenses in non-bankruptcy matters of comparable size and complexity.

Conclusion

16. The professional services rendered and expenses incurred by Verrill Dana on

behalf of the Trustee during the Application Period were necessary and beneficial to the estate

and to Trustee’s administration of the Chapter 11 case, and work performed in a timely manner,

! Verrill Dana has received a total of $172,855.46 from XL in connection with services for the Debtor
and Trustee. $29,253.00 of this amount was for post-petition services prior to the appointment of the
Trustee, and $364 was for prepetition services that were submitted to XL for reimbursement post-petition.
The remainder of the amount paid by XL, $143,238.46 (computed as $172,855.46 less $29,253.00 less $365.00)
would be applied to the fees and expenses described in this Application if it were approved by the Court.
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commencing or with the complexity and nature of the issues involved. The fees for which
Verrill Dana seeks compensation pursuant to this Application are reasonable based on the rates
charged for such services by comparably skilled professionals to clients other than clients in
cases under the Code. The compensation requested is reasonable in light of the nature, extent,
and value of the services provided.

WHEREFORE, Verrill Dana respectfully requests that this Court enter an order:

A Approving, on an interim basis, Verrill Dana’s fees in the amount of $335,647.00,
to Verrill Dana as compensation for reasonable and necessary professional services rendered by
it to the Trustee during the Application Period, and $4,088.34 for actual and necessary expenses
incurred by Verrill Dana on behalf of the Trustee during such period, for a total amount
approved of $339,735.34.

B. Authorizing the Trustee to pay $196,496.88 to Verrill Dana, which represents the
balance due to Verrill Dana for services rendered and expenses incurred by Verrill Dana on
behalf of the Trustee during the Application Period; and

C. Granting such other and further relief as this Court deems just and equitable.

Dated: May 27, 2014
VERRILL DANA, LLP

Isl Roger A. Clement, Jr.

VERRILL DANA, LLP Roger A. Clement, Jr., Esq.
One Portland Square Nathaniel R. Hull, Esq.
P.O. Box 586

Portland, ME 04112-0586
207-774-4000 — Phone
207-774-7499 - Fax
rclement@verrilldana.com;
nhull@verrilldana.com
bankr@verrilldana.com
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A-I—"Page Torz2s One Portland Square
_ P.O. Box 586
- . 1 1 _ Portland, Maine 04112-05 Q - l
» er r 1 DanaLLP Telephone: 52073 T74-4(
Facsimile:  (207) 774-74

Attorneys at Law

Employer 1D No. 01-0176171

TO: ROBERT J. KEACH, TRUSTEE
: C/0O BERNSTEIN SHUR
100 MIDDLE STREET, 6TH FLOOR :
P.O. BOX 9729 INVOICE *%%kk%
PORTLAND, MAINE 04104-5029
May 27, 2014

RE: MONTREAL, MAINE & ATLANTIC RAILWAY LTD.

45775-9145

For services rendered in the above-referenced matter, in accordance
with the attached statement, for the period ending April 30, 2014

Legal Fees: . $65,518.50
Costs Incurred: £840.56

Current Charges: 566,359.06
Amount Due: $66,359.06

Payment is due upon receipt of this invoice. A late charge of 1-/2% per month will be assessed upon
all balances that remain unpaid for more than 30 days after the invoice date. Verrill Dana, LLP is
committed to providing quality legal services. If you have any questions concerning this invoice or the

Please detach this portion and return in the enclosed envelope with your payment. Thank you.

May 27, 2014
INVOICE  kkkx%%

o * .
KEACH, ROBERT J.,TRUSTEE
Verrill Dana.., s, rosser g mosmss

Attorneys at Law 45775-9145 .

One Portland Square Amount Due: $566,359.06
Portland, Maine 04112-0586 ‘

Amount Enclosed:; $
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VERRILL DANA LLP
ONE PORTLAND SQUARE
P.O., BOX 586
PORTLAND, MAINE 04112-0586
207/774-4000

Desc Exhibit

May 27, 2014 PAGE 2

ROBERT J. KEACH, TRUSTEE
MATTER NUMBER 45775-9145

INVOICE:

DATE ATTY

08/22/13 RAC

08/22/13 NH

08/22/13 NH

*kkkkr

DESCRIPTTION HOURS

E-mall to Attorney Keach regarding Verrill 8.30
Dana's status and rcle (0.4); e-mail from and
to Jonathan Stemplewicz regarding FRA's
request for documents (0.1)}; telephone
conference with Mr. Gardner to prepare for
today's hearings (0.3); review numerous
e-mails regarding revisions to cash
collateral order (1.5); conference with
Attorney Hull regarding today's hearings
{0.3}); telephone conference with Attorney
Morrell regarding hearings today and related
igsues (0.3); prepare for hearings this
afternoon on cash collateral, payroll,
utilities, and bank accounts (1.5); attend
hearings in Bankruptcy Court, including
post-hearing conference with Attorney Lepene
(for Irving) regarding cash collateral budget
(1.7); meet with Mr. Gardner following
hearings to review schedules and cash
projectiong (0.7); e-mall to Mr. Gardner
regarding schedules (0.2); review letter from
Mr. Grindrod to STB regarding request for
gwitch to two person crews on trains (0.3);
telephone conference with Attorney Keach
regarding Daily Review Report and concerns
about revenue drop this week due to Canadian
Pacific freight embargo (0.5); telephone
conference with Mr. Gardner regarding same
(0.5)

Finalize and oversgee filing of second interim .40
cash collateral order

Coordinate with Trustee's primary counsel to 4.70
transfer word versions of various forms of

order and other information needed for hearing

(1.2); attend hearing on continued first day

hearings and follow-up regarding same (3.5)

2739.00

94.00

1104.50
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MATTER NUMBER 45775-9145
INVOICE: *k kK kK
08/23/13 RAC Telephone conference with Mr. Burkhardt 7.50 2475.00

regarding revenue shortages this week caused
by CP embargo, in preparation for meeting
this. morning with Trustee (0.3); meet with
Mr. Burkhardt regarding transition to Trustee
{(0.2); meeting with Messrs. Keach, Burkhardt,
Carugo, and Gardner to discuss financial
gstatements, cash flows, revenue, budgeting,
accounts receivable, et al (2.4); e-mail from
Ms. Ryan regarding second amended complaint
in Quebec; e-mail same to Trustee (0.3);
telephone conference with Derrick Tay, Esqg.
(Gowlings, for MMAC) regarding bringing
Trustee up to gpeed on Canadian issues (0.2);
telephone conference with Denis S$St-Onge
regarding same (0.3); telephone conference
with Mr. Grindrod regarding Canadian
proceedings (0.3); e-mails from and to Mr.
Grindrod regarding sale of scrap wheelg to
Irving (0.2); numercug e-mails to Trustee
with critical information, including loan
documents, UCC-11, and insurance policies
(1.0); conference with IT staff to arrange
for Trustee and professionals to have accegs
to virtual data room; e-mail to Trustee
regarding same {(0.4); e-mails to schedule
conference calls with US and Canadian Counsel
and Trustee (0.4); conference call with
Trustee and his counsgel, and Gowlings'
attorneys regarding Canadian proceedings
{1.0); follow-up telephone conference with
Attorney St-Onge regarding same (0.2);
telephone conference with Mr. Keach regarding
chapter 15 and to schedule meeting with
Monitor, and to discuss litigation pending in
Chicago (0.3)

08/23/13 NH Continued transitilon activities to bring 3.20 752,00
Trustee's new primary counsel up to speed on
case (.5); meet with Trustee, Attorney Clement
and Mr. Burkhardt regarding cage status (2.3};
follow-up actions after meeting (.4)
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08/24/13 RAC E-mails from and to Attorney Fagone regarding 1.10 363.00

scheduling of meeting and other transition
igsues (0.3); telephone conference with
Attorney Fagcne regarding variocus pending
issues, including Maine Revenue Service's
assertions of use tax owed, and possible
unencumbered assets (0.8)

08/25/13 RAC Telephone conference with Mr. Grindrod .20 66 .00
regarding preparation of revised cash
projections in connection with MDOT financing
and relationship of game with Irving

08/26/13 RAC E-mails from Mesgsrs. CGrindrod and Gardner 1.80 594 .00
regaxrding responsible person letters from
State regarding use tax (0.2); e-mails from
and to Attorney Fagone regarding responsible
person use tax letters received by Messrs.
Gardner and Grindrod; brief research
regarding use tax (0.9); e-mails from and to
Attorneys Keach and Fagone regarding
tomorrow's meeting in Hermon (0.4); e-mail
from and to Mr. Burkhardt regarding status of
chapter 11 case and role of Trustee, and
Verrill Pana's future role (0.3)

08/26/13 RAC Direct Paralegal Hoglund regarding schedules .30 99.00

08/26/13 RAC Review Great Northern Holdings law suit and 1.40 462.00
related materials (0.4}; telephone conference
with Mr. Burkhardt regarding same (0.5); two
e-mails to Attorney Fagone regarding same
(0.5)

08/26/13 NH Review and reply to e-mail from Ms. Ryan .40 94 .00
(MMA) regarding health insurance (.2);
telephone conference regarding same {.2)

08/27/13 RAC Travel to Hermon, Milo (Derby Shopsg) and 12.50 4125.00
Brownville Junction with Trustee and
Trustee's counsel; meet with Trustee,
Trustee's counsel, Megsrs. Grindrod, Gardner
and Fred Caruso (Trustee's financial advisor)
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INVOICE: ok Kk K

to discuss all aspects of Debtor's cash flow,
projections, and operationg; asgist Trustee
and ccunsel with transition by providing
information regarding history and status of
Debtor and operationg; return travel to
Portland

08/27/13 NH Review e-mail from Trustee's counsel
requesting leases, prepare and send same
(.4); follow-up regarding same (.2)

08/27/13 NSH Review and respond to questiong received from
Attorney Clement regarding schedules and
information received to date.

08/28/13 RAC Conference with Attorney Hull regarding
application to employ Verrill Dana as Special
Counsel

08/28/13 RAC E-mail from and to Attorney Fagone regarding
GNP Holdings litigation (0.2); review
regsponse from Travelers regarding business
interruption ingurance policy (0.1}; e-mail
from Messrs. Gardner and Grindrod regarding
law suit in Pennsylvania regarding Troester
matter; direct Staff to add to Schedules
(0.4); telephone conference with Mr.
Burkhardt regarding defense of litigation
brought by GNP Holdings in State Court (0.3);
draft Answer and Affirmative Defensesg to
litigation brought by GNP Holdings in State
Court (1.0)

08/28/13 NH Coordinate meeting with Canadian counsel and
Trustee's counsel

08/29/13 RAC Meet with Derrick Tay, Esgq. regarding cross
border issues (0.3); conference in Portland
with coungel for MMAC (4 Gowlings Attorneys),
Monitor (Richter) and counsel, Attorneys Keach
and Fagone, and Gordon Levigne, Egg. (Canadian

PAGE
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1584.00
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ROBERT J. KEACH, TRUSTEE
MATTER NUMBER 45775-9145

INVOICE:

08/29/13 NH

08/29/13 NSH

09/03/13 RAC

hhkdhkkk

counsel for Trustee) regarding all issues in
case, especially cross border issues (3.3);
lunch meeting with same group (0.5); review,
revigse, and file Answer in lawsuit brought by
GNP Holdings (0.3); review pleadings filed by
Trugtee, 1ncluding applicaticns to employ
special counsel and motion for relief from stay
filed by Travelers Ingurance Company (0.4)

Meet with Trustee and Canadian professionals
regarding case status and strategy moving
forward

Update and revise gchedules.

Conference with Paralegal Hoglund regarding
bankruptcy schedules (0.2); review bankruptcy
pleadings, including U.S. Trugtee's objection
to employment applications, and Trustee

"Keach's objection to motion for expedited

hearing filed by Travelers Insurance Company
(0.3); review correspondence between
Trustee's counsel and Mr. Grindrod regarding
status of rolling stock leases (0.2); revise
Application to Employ Verrill Dana (2.0);
review and revise schedules and statement of
financial affairs, including two telephone
conferences with Fred Carugo; telephone
conference with Sarah Osborne and telephone
conference with Mr. Gardner regarding same;
numercus e-mails to and from Paralegal
Hoglund; conference with Attorney Hull, all
regarding schedules and statement of
financial affairs (2.8); e-mail to Attorney
Fagone regarding scope of FRA mortgage (0.1);
review Monitor's report filed in CCAA
proceeding (0.5); review pleadings filed in
case, including objections filed by Irving
and GNP Holdings (0.8); e-mail from Michael
Cutler, Egg. (Covington & Burling) regarding
FRA and notice of default sent to Montreal,
Maine & Atlantic Corporation and LMS
Acgquigition Corporation (0.2)

3

3

7.

Desc Exhibit
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MATTER NUMBER 45775-9145
INVOICE: R

09/03/13 RAC E-wmail to and telephone conference with
Attorney Morrell requesgting enlargement of
time to file schedules

09/03/13 NH Conference with Attorney Clement regarding
case status (.3); conference with Paralegal
Hoglund regarding schedules and statements
{.2); review and revisge gchedules and
statements (1.2); review e-mails regarding
game {.3)

09/03/13 NSH Continue to collect and receive new
information from Mr. Gardner, Mr. Grindrod
and Ms. Ryan, continue updating, revising and
completing schedules and statements for
upcoming deadline.

09/04/13 RAC Review and revise motion for enlargement of
time to file schedules (0.4); conference with
Attorney Hull regarding schedules and SOFA
(0.2) ;e-mail from Attorney Fagone regarding
scope of FRA mortgage (0.1); further work on
schedules, including leases, secured
creditors, and executory contractg (1.5)

09/04/13 RAC Further work on scheduleg, including review
of various municipal tax claims, and advice
to Staff regarding executory contracts and
other igssues (2.0); review and revige
application to employ Verrill Dana a Special
Counsel, including proposed Order and
Verified Statement {(1.3); e-mail to and from
Attorney Fagone regarding same (0.2); e-mail
to Attorneys Keach and Fagone regarding
Debtor's application to employ Verrill Dana
(0.1)

09/04/13 NH Prepare motion to enlarge deadline to file
achedules and statements and form of oxrder
regarding same (.8); continue to review and
revise schedules and statements (3.1)

3.
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66.00

470.00

810.00

726,00

1188.00
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INVOICE :

09/04/13 NSH

09/05/13 RAC

09/05/13 RAC

09/05/13 RAC

09/05/13 RAC

09/05/13 NSH

09/06/13 RAC

kkdkkd

Extensive revisions to Schedules

and

Statements after receiving new information,

data, documents, leases, licenses,

and new class action suit complaints.

creditors

Conference with Attorxney Shannon regarding
gtatus of criminal investigation and SQ's

interviews of employees

E-mail from and to Attorney Fagone regarding
LaSalle Bank security interest on locomotives

Telephone conference with Trustee Keach

regarding status of sale process

and

‘relationship with management of Debtor;

discuss Verrill Dana retention application
(0.3); telephone conference with Attorney
Morrell regarding Verrill Dana retention

application (0.2); multiple e-mails from and

to Mesgers. Caruso, Gardner and Grindrod
regarding schedules, including schedules of
real property, leasesg, licenses, crogsing

easements, etc., and regarding municipal tax

claims and State franchise tax claimsg;
conference with Paralegal Hoglund regarding

game {2.9)

E-mail from and to investment banker

Kellett Capital)

Extensive revisions to Schedulesg

and

{Mount

Statements after receiving new information,

data, documents, leages, licenses,

and new clasg action sult complaints
Review and respond to request from Attorney
Fagone and Attorney Shubert related to

leages, licenses and new information received

post conference call (2.0)

credlitors

(4.0)

Conference call with Attorneys Fagone and

Anderson, and Mr. Gardner regardi

relationship with Irving in order to prepare

for section 542 turncover motion,
discussed GNP Holdinge settlement

ng

also

10.

PAGE

.80

.20

.40

.10

.00

.90

8

1350.00

264,00

66.00

1122.00

33.00

810.00

297.00
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09/06/13 RAC Draft Stipulation of Dismisgsal regarding GNP 5.30 1749.00
Holdings v. MMA; e-mall to Attorney Fagone
regarding same (0.4}); review various

information regarding schedules and SOFA
{0.9); conferences with Paralegal Hoglund
regarding game (0.4); conference call with
Paralegal Hoglund and Mesgssrg. Grindrod,
Gardner and Caruso, and Ms. Ryan regarding
all information on schedules, including
executory contractg, assets, and liabilities
(3.0); follow-up conference with Paralegal
Hoglund regarding same {(0.2); e-mail to Mr.
Tardif, et al regarding crossing licenses,
etc. (0.2); e-mall to Attorneys Fagone and
Anderson regarding Ilrving's assignment of
claim to effectuate set-off (0.2)

09/06/13 RAC Review pleadings filed in bankruptcy case, .30 99,00
including Order effectuating settlement with
GNP Holdings

09/06/13 NH Revige schedules and statements (2.5); 3.70 869.50
conference call with Trustee's financial
advisor regarding same (1.2)

09/06/13 NSH Extensive revigions to Schedules and 5.50 742.50
Statements after receiving new information,
data, documents, leases, licenses, creditors
and new class action suit complaints (5.0)
Review and respond to request from Attorney
Shubert related to leases, licenses and new
information from Ms. Ryan (.5)

09/07/13 NH Review email from Trustee's counsel (M. .20 47.00
Fagone) and reply to same

09/08/13 RAC E-mail from and to Attorney Fagone regarding .20 66.00
claim of Clean Harbors; e-mail to Paralegal ‘
Hoglund regarding same

09/09/13 RAC E-mail to Clean Harbors regarding amount of 1.90 627.00
claim (0.2); e-mail from Attorney Anderson
regarding MMA rolling stock corporation
(0.1); telephone conference with Mr. Grindrod
regarding same (0.3); e-mail to Attorney
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ROBERT J. KEACH, TRUSTEE
MATTER NUMBER 45775-9145
INVOICE: *okokkk ok

Anderson regarding same (0.1); advise
Paralegal Hoglund regarding schedules,
including schedules of real property, claims
held by State of Maine, rolling stock leaseg,
and other items (1.0); e-mail from and to
Attorneys Fagone and Pincug (for US Trustee's
Office) regarding form of order on
application to employ Verrill Dana (0.2)

09/09/13 RAC Review e-mails from Kenyon Shubert, Mr.
Grindrod and Paralegal Hoglund regarding
rolling stock, for purposes of schedules

09/09/13 RAC Review pleadings, including notice of
participation by Wheeling & lLake Erie in 542
action by Debtor against Irving (0.5);
e-mails from Attorney Fagone regarding 542
action against Irving (0.1); e-mail from Mr.
Gardner regarding assets for inclusion in
gcheduleg; respond to game (0.2); e-mail from
and to Paralegal Hoglund and Mr. Tardif
regarding licenses (0.2); e-mail to group
regarding schedules {0.2)

09/09/132 NH Continue to prepare and revise Debtor's
schedules and statements '

Desc Exhibit

PAGE

.50

.20

.20

09/09/13 NSH Review new information from client and update 11.00

Schedules A, B, G and F. Regpond to research
for information related to Schedule G request
received from Attorney Shubert. Extensgive
telephone conferences with Mr. Gardner and
Ms. Ryan and well as Attorney Shubert.

09/10/13 RAC E-mail from and to Mr. Burkhardt regarding
varicus issues (0.1) ;telephone conference
with Attorney Fagone regarding claimg against
Irving, and upcoming trial on section 542
turnover action (0.5); extensive work on
gchedules, including review and revisions;
numerous conferences and e-mails with
Paralegals Hoglund and Henderson; conference
call with entire "team" from MMA, including
Mr. Caruso {4.0)}

.60

10

165.00

396.00

517.00

1485.00

1518.00
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09/10/13 RAC Telephone conference with Mr. Burkhardt .40 132,00

regarding various isgsues, including to convey
communications protocols regarding sale
process, as requested by Mr. Keach

09/10/13 NH Additional review and continued revisions to 3.80 893.00
the Debtor's gchedules and statements

09/10/13 NSH Extensive work on bankruptcy schedules and 10.00 1350.00

: gtatement of financial affairs, including
multiple phone calls with Mr. Grindrod, Mr.
Gardner and Ms. Ryan; extensive conference
with Attorney Clement regarding revisgions,
updates and producing new information.
Multiple telephone calls and email exchanges
with Attorney Shubert regarding migsing
information from client, update schedules and
research into leases, dates of termination
and contracts in existence.

09/10/13 MJH Preparation of exhibits to schedules .80 . 68.00
09/11/13 RAC E-mails from and to Mr. Keach and Attorney 7.10 2343.00
Fagone regarding liquidity ilgsues and Verrill
Dana retainer (0.2); extensive work on

bankruptcy scheduleg and statement of
financial affaire, including telephone
conferences with Messrs. Grindrod and
Gardner, and Attorney Shubert; extensive
conferences with Paralegal Hoglund, e-mails
to and from Gowlings regarding notice to be
given to Canadian governmental authorities;
revigions to Schedules A, B, G and F; review
of rolling stock issues for schedules (6.9)

09/11/13 RAC Review pleadings filed in bankruptcy case, .40 132.00
including objection of tort claimants to
formation of creditors' committee comprised
of different types of creditors, and
Trustee's objection to formation of
creditors' committee
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09/11/13 NH Further revisions to Schedule D of the
Debtor's Schedules and Statements (.8); final
edits and coordinate filing of Debtor's
schedules and statements (3.9); telephone
conference with personal injury counsel (.3};
email to counsel to Trugtee (M. Fagone)
regarding same (.1)

09/11/13 NSH Extensive work on bankruptcy schedules and
statement of financial affairs, including
multipie phone callg with Mr. Grindrod, Mr.
Gardner and Ms. Ryan; extensive conference
with Attorney Clement regarding revisions,
updates and producing new information.
Prepare schedules for filing and file same
with U.S. Bankruptcy Court.

09/11/13 MJH Revise Schedule B

09/12/13 RAC Review e-mails from Attorney Shannon regarding
criminal investigation; review media reports
regarding same; review e-mailgs from Pierre
Legault and Marc-Antoine Carette regarding SQ
investigation (0.5); two telephone conferences
with Attorney Shannon regarding same {0.3);
review media reports regarding SQ criminal
investigation (0.2)

09/12/13 RAC Begin preparing notice to holders of disputed
claimg, in compliance with Local Rule
1007-1(c) (0.4); e-mail to Trustee Keach and
Attorney Fagone regarding same (0.3)

09/12/13 RAC Begin drafting Verrill Dana fee application

09/12/13 RAC E-mail to Trustee Keach and Attorney Fagone
regarding compliance with Local Bankruptcy
Rule 1007 (0.3); review appraisals of Debtor
property pledged to secure Bangor Savings
debt (0.7); draft revised description of BSB
collateral for purposes of Schedule B;
e-mails to Mr. Grindrod, et al regarding
game; e-mail to Paralegal Hoglund regarding
game {(0.9)

12,

Desc Exhibit

PAGE 12

.10 2198.50
00 1620.00
.50 127.50
.00 330.00
.70 231.00
.40 132.00
.90 627.00
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09/12/13 NH Analysis of administrative claim igsue for
Attorney Clement

09/12/13 NSH Update schedule of leaseg and licenses for
use by Mr. Farnsworth. Review and respond to
document requests received by Ms. Ryan and
Grindrod.

09/13/13 RAC Further review of rolling stock issues and
schedules, including collateral for claim of
Bangor Savings Bank; telephone conference
with Kenyon Shubert, Esq. regarding same

09/16/13 RAC Conference with Attorney Shannon regarding
statug of investigation by Securite Quebec
and regarding Verrill Dana's duties as
counsel to Trustee (0.5); conference with
Michael Fagone, Esg. (counsel to Trustee)
regarding status of investigation, and
discussing fulfillment of Verrill Dana's
duties, including preservation of
attorney/client relationship in connection
with XL's request for status report (2.1)

0%/17/13 RAC E-mails from Nat Rosenblatt and Mike Fagone
regarding transactions that have occurred,
for purposes of bankruptcy schedules

09/17/13 NH Multiple telephone conferences with Trustee's
counsel (M. Fagone; K. Shurbert) regarding
insurance policiesg (.4); search and forward
documents to Trustee's counsel responding to
gsame {.4)

09/17/13 NSH Review, respond and research materials needed
for Attorney Shubert and Mr. Farsnworth
regarding data room, leaseg, schedules and
materials received from Mr. Tardiff.

09/18/13 RAC Telephone conference with Jim Howard
regarding bankruptcy schedules

09/18/13 RAC E-malil from and to Mr. Gardner regarding
status of payvment of trust fund taxes

Desc Exhibit

PAGE

.50

.40

.00

.60

.40

.80

.00

.10

.10

13

352,

324,

660.

858,

132,

188.

270.

33.
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50
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INVOICE:

hkkhhkk

09/18/13 NSH Extensive emalls with Mr. Farnsworth

9/19/13

09/19/13

09/23/13

09/23/13

09/24/13

09/25/13

09/26/13

09/30/13

RAC

NSH

RAC

NSH

RAC

RAC

RAC

regarding leases, schedules and lists.
Regpond and provide materials needed.

Review media reports as they relate to
criminal investigation; e-mails to Attorney
Shannon regarding same

Review and provide documents pursuant to
request received by Ms. Ryan regarding Rail
World, Inc. and materials needed for hearing
and by counsel.

bAdvise staff regarding creation of list of
disputed claims in order to comply with Local
Bankruptcy Rule 1007-1 (¢)

Create and organize FTP site for use in
exchanging materials with Mr. Farnsworth.
Continue organziation of leases and licenses
with Attorney Shubert. '

Review pleadings in case (0.4); telephone
conference with Messrs. Caruso and Gardner
regarding ISS setoff issues (0.3)

E-mail to Messrs. Caruso and Gardner
regarding ISS setoff issues

E-mail from and to Attorney Fagone regarding
MMA documents (0.2); meet with Trustee and
Attorney Fagone at Bernstein Shur to discuss
crimindl investigation and related matters
(2.5); telephone conference with Attorney
Fagone regarding schedules, locomotives, cash
collateral, and Local Rule 1007 (0.3)

Telephone conference with Mike Lane, Esg.
(for Kennebec Lumber) regarding interest in
purchasing 20 acres in Bangor from Debtor;
e-mail to Attorney Fagone regarding same

PAGE

.00

.30

.00

.40

.50

.70

.20

.00

.20

14

270.

99

270.

132

607.

231.

66.

990

66

00

.00
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.00
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00
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10/01/13 RAC Review objection filed by MMAC in CCAA
proceeding objecting to motion of Travelers
for relief from stay to adjudicate coverage
issues in USDC

10/01/13 RAC Review miscellaneous pleadings and docket
entries (0.4); telephone conference with
Attorney Shannon regarding his telephone
conference with Alan Gilbert earlier today
regarding criminal investigation (0.1)

10/02/13 RAC E-mail to Trustee Keach regarding JM Huber
lease and MMA Corporation litigation

10/02/13 RAC Draft supplement to verified statements

10/02/13 RAC Conference with Attorney Shannon regarding
request by other counsel for information
regarding criminal investigation and advice
to our client regarding same

10/03/13 NH Review e-mall from coungel to Wheeling (A.
Helman} regarding schedules and statements
(.1); telephone conference with A. Helman
regarding same (.2)

10/07/13 RAC E-mails from and tc Andrew Hellman, Esg. and
Attorney Fagone regarding licenseg listed on
Schedule B and Wheeling's request for copies
of same (0.4); e-mails to and from Paralegal
Hoglund regarding same (0.2); e-wmail to
Attorney Fagone regarding possible amendments
to Schedules (0.5); review adversary
complaint filed by Wheeling vs. MMA, et al.
(0.4} ; numerous e-malls with Attorney Fagone
regarding Schedules, digclosuxesg, GNP
litigation, and Wheeling litigation (0.5);
review pleadings regarding sale process, and
Camden National Bank financing (0.5)

PAGE

.30
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.20

.30
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66.
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10/07/13 NH Telephone conference with counsel to OTT
Communications regarding utilities motion
(.1); e-mail to Attorney Fagone regarding

same (.1); review e-maill from counsel to
Wheeling regarding service and consider same
(.2)

10/08/13 RAC Direct Paralegal Hoglund to prepare amended
Scheduleg B and G {(0.3); telephone conference
with Attorney Shannon regarding status of
criminal invegtigation and Firm's role asg
attorney for Trustee and limited role as
attorneys for employees being interviewed
(for purposes of interview only) with consent
of Trustee (0.2)

10/09/13 RAC Direct Staff to make amendments to Schedules
B and G

10/09/13 NSH Process and review new inforamtion from Mr.
Tardiff regarding licenses not included in
filing (1.0) Conference with Attorney
Clement regarding late information and need
for amendement (.2) Conference with Ms.
Henderson regarding assistance with data
input (.2)

10/10/13 RAC Telephone conference with Tom Tardif
regarding amendments to scheduleg (0.1);
review e-malls regarding Assistant United
States Attorney's request for documents
{(0.2); advige Attorney Shannon regarding same
{(0.1); e-mails from and to Attorneys Shannon
and Keach regarding interviews of Engineers
and document request by AUSA (0.3)

10/10/13 NSH Attention to revigions to Schdule B and
Schedule G (1.). Conference with Attorney
Clement regarding updated changes with regard
to licensesg (.2)

PAGE
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.20
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16
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INVOICE:

kokdhekdok

10/11/13 RAC E-mails to and from Attorney Shannon

10/11/13

10/15/13

10/15/13

10/16/13

10/16/13

10/17/13

10/18/13

NSH

RAC

NSH

RAC

RAC

RAC

RAC

regarding retention and joint defense
agreement with engineers to be interviewed by
SQ/FBI (0.3}; telephone conferences with
Meigsee Hon of Clyde & Co. (counsel for XL)
regarding billing protocols (0.2); e-mall to
Walt McKee, Esqg. regarding same (0.1)

Attention to amendments to schedules and.
filing (.4)

Telephone conference with Attorney Shannon
regarding criminal investigation (0.1);
review Wheeling's cbjection to settlement
with Irving (0.4); draft reviged supplemental
statement (0.5); e-mail game to Attorney
Fagone; e-mail from Attorney Fagone regarding
game {(0.3}; direct Staff to file revised
Schedules B and G (0.2)

Review and revise schedules for filing and
amendment pursuant to request received from

Attorney Clement.

E-mail from and to Attorney Fagone regarding
Verrill Dana sgupplemental statement

Telephone conference with Mr. Grindrod and
e-mail to Mr. Grindrod regarding amendments
to Schedules B and G

Review information and hearing recording on
motion to compromise with Irving, and
objection filed by Wheeling

Telephone conference with Attorney Keach
regarding 8SQ investigation and recent
incident in Hermon involving engineers (0.3} ;
e-mails from and to Attorney Shannon
regarding same {(0.2); conference with
Attorney Shannon regarding same: (0.4} ;
conference call with Attorneys Keach, Shannon
and Wertheimer regarding and regarding recent
incident in Hermon {0.3}; e-mail from and to
Attorney Fagone regarding amendments to

PAGE

.60
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.50
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.40

.40

.40
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INVOICE:

10/18/13 RAC

10/18/13 NH

10/18/13 NSH

10/22/13 RAC

10/25/13 RAC

10/28/13 RAC

10/28/13 RAC

10/30/13 RAC

10/30/13 NH

106/30/13 MJH

10/31/13 MJH

*k ok kkk

Schedules (0.2)

E-mail from and to Roma Desai, Esg. (for
Trustee) regarding amendments to schedules

Review e-mail from counsel to Trustee (M.
Fagone) regarding amended schedules

Updated amended files to date (.4).
Telephone call with Ms. Stewart regarding
export of BestCase data and export same (.4)

E-mails from and to Trustee's counsel
regarding Troster litigation

Receive summons and complaint in adversary
proceeding -- Wheeling & Lake Erie v. Keach,
et al.

Review summons and complaint in Wheeling &
Lake Erie v. MMA adversary proceeding (0.4);
e-mail to Attorney Fagone regarding same;
e-mail from Attorney Fagone regarding same
(0.1); e-mail from Trustee regarding letter
from potential buyer of assets (0.2)

Review Trustee's response to objection of
informal committee to employ Shaw, et al as
Special Counsel

E-mails from and to Attorney Fagone regarding
litigation hold issues and status of criminal
investigation (0.2); e-mails from Attorneys
Shannon and Fagone regarding status of
criminal invegtigation (0.2)

Review e-mail from Trustee's counsel (M.
Fagone) regarding notice to employees

Work on creditor address corrections

Work on creditor address corrections

PAGE
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11/01/13 RAC E-mail to and from and telephone conference 1.60 528.00

with Attorney Fagone regarding status of
matters involving SQ investigation, and
lawsuits filed in Chicago (0.4): two
telephone conferences with Attorney Shannon
regaxrding SQ subpoena (0.3); conference with
Attorney Fagone regarding same (0.4); review
and revise litigation hold letter (0.3);
follow-up telephone conference with Attorney
Shannon regarding same (0.2)

11/01/13 MJH Attention to creditor address corrections due 1.00 85.00
to returned mail

11/04/13 RAC Review objection by Committee to order .30 99.00
approving carve-out

11/04/13 MJH Attention to c¢reditor addresgsg corrections due .20 17.00
to returned mail

11/05/13 RAC E-mail from and to Attorney Fagone regarding .60 198.00
XL+ Insurance coverage (0.3); telephone
conference with Attorney Fagone regarding
game (0.3)

11/05/13 NSH Exchange emails with Ms. Stewart regarding .90 121.50
matrix issues. Research same and met with
Ms. Hendersgon regarding servicing center.
Review matrix and compare to filed amendments.

11/06/13 RAC Advise Paralegal Hoglund regarding responding 1.90 627.00
to subpoena by AUSA through US District
Court, regarding to Canadian criminal
investigation (0.3); two telephone
conferences with Attorney Wertheimer
regarding same (0.3); telephone conference
with Mr. Grindrod regarding procedure and
protocols for document production (0.6);
e-mail to Mr. Grindrod regarding same (0.3);
e-mails from and to Attorney Wertheimer
regarding same (0.3); e-mail from Attorney
Fagone regarding same (0.1)
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11/07/13 RAC Conference with Attorney Wertheimer regarding 1.20 396.00

regponse to subpoena, including logistics of
copying, scanning, production, coordinating
with Trustee, ramifications regarding civil
liability, etec. (0.8); conference with
Attorney Shannon regarding same (0.4)

11/08/12 RAC Conference with Attorney Shannon regarding 2.50 825.00
regponse to subpoena, document production and
retention, litigation hold letters, etc.
(0.5); telephone conference with Attorney
Wertheimer regarding document retention
(0.2}; e-mall Attorney Fagone regarding sgame
(0.2); telephone conference with Attorney
Fagone in response to subpoena, expenses,
document preservation, etec. (0.4); conference
with Attorney Shannon regarding same (0.1);
review e-mail from Attorney Wertheimer
regarding same (0.1); review and revise
e-mail memo to Trustee regarding document
production (1.0)

11/12/13 RAC E-mails from and to Attorneys Shannon and .60 198.00
Keach regarding regponge Lo subpoena issued
by US Attorney's Office (0.3); telephone
conference with Attorney Shannon regarding
gsame (0.3)

11/13/13 RAC Conference with Attorney Shannon regarding .50 165.00
regponse to document production; review
multiple e-mails regarding same (0.3}; review
bills in connection with future fee
application {0.2)

11/14/13 RAC Work on fee application .20 66.00

11/15/13 RAC Draft e-mail to Paul Keopff (XL Insurance) 2.40 792.00
regarding document subpoena and Trustee's
regponse to same; e-mails to and from
Attorneys Wertheimer and Shannon regarding
game (0.9); review time entries in connection
with for fee application (1.5)
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INVOICE:

11/18/13 RAC

11/19/13 RAC

11/20/13 RAC

11/21/13 RAC

11/21/13 RAC

11/22/13 RAC

12/02/13 RAC

12/05/13 RAC

*kkkkk

Work on fee application (0.2); e-malil from
and to Attorney Shannon regarding response to
gubpocena (0.1); revise and gend e-mail report
to Paul Koepff regarding subpoena (0.4)

E-mail from and to Attorney Shannon regarding
response to subpoena

E-mails from Paralegal Hoglund regarding
document scanning and return of 28 boxes to
MMA (0.3); e-mailg to and from Attorney
Fagone regarding invoice for scanning (0.1)

Advise Attorney Shannon regarding response to
SQ's subpoena (0.1); review private
communications (0.3); review multiple e-mails
regarding same (0.4); e-mail from Paralegal
Hoglund and Attorney Shannon regarding Evidox
contract for e-discovery services (0.2);
e-mails and to Attorney Hull regarding
additional boxes of documents (0.4); e-mail
from Paul Koepff regarding insurance coverage
(0.1)

Review and revise draft memo to Trustee
regarding status of response to subpoenas and
proposed course of action

Advige Attorney Shannon regarding strategies
for dealing with AUSA in responding to
document sgubpoena (0.1); review various
e~malls regarding same; brief conference with
Paralegal Hoglund regarding same (0.1);
review e-malls regarding same (0.2)

E-mail from Attorney Fagone regarding CP
agreement; conference with staff regarding
same

Conference with Attorney Shannon regarding
response to subpoena

Desc Exhibit

PAGE 21

.70 231.00
.10 33.00
.40 132.00
.50 495,00
.40 132.00
.40 132.00
.20 66.00
.20 66.00
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INVOICE:

12/06/13 RAC

12/09/13 RAC

12/09/13 JLH

12/10/13 RAC

12/10/13 NH

12/11/13 RAC

12/12/13 RAC

12/13/13 RAC

12/13/13 JLH

12/16/13 RAC

12/18/13 RAC

12/24/13 RAC

*hkhkik

Letter from Paul Koepff regarding insurance
coverage (0.2); review insurance policy
{(0.3); e-mails to and from Attorneys Keach
and Fagone regarding same (0.1); e-mail to
Attorney Fagone regarding CP agreement (0.1)

Review various pleadings, including objection
of WLE to Trustee's motion to sell tax credits

Prepare for document review and production
{per Attorney Shannon)

Review pleadings, including pleadings filed
by GNP Holdings in connection with Troester
litigation

Review e-mail from Trustee's counsel
regarding executory contracts

Conference with Attorney Hull regarding
contracts (0.1); conference with Attorney
Andergon and Mr. McCarthy regarding leases
and contracts (0.5); e-mails to Attorney
Andergon with copies of loan documents (1.1)

Review docket entries and pleadings regarding
yvesterday's hearings

Review sale pleadings

Prepare second document production for
gservice (per Attorney Shannon)

Review Order approving compromise with Irving
E-mails from and to Attorney Fagone regarding
status of fees on matters Verrill Dana is

working on

Review pleadings in Travelersgs compromise

PAGE
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.50

.40
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.70

.20
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12/26/13 RAC Review pleadings filed in case, including

01/07/14

01/13/14

01/14/14

01/21/14

01/22/14

01/24/14

01/24/14

01/29/14

01/30/14

RAC

NSH

NSH

RAC

RAC

motion of Wrongful Death Claimants Committee
to modify order concerning formation of
creditorg! committee

Review e-mails regarding labeling of product
in train that crashed and related isgssues

Review various pleadings in bankruptcy case

E-mails from Attorney Shannon regarding
recent SQ request for documents

Telephone conference with Mr. Keach regarding
auction of railroad assetg today

Telephone conference with Attorney Shannon
regarding status of c¢riminal investigation,
particularly in light of pending gale of rail
assets

Conference with Evidox regarding search
terms, status of custodian searches and
back-~up tapes.

Research document review gtatus and draft
email to Attorney Wertheimer and Attorney
Shannon regarding status of last review and
productiong statistics.

E-mails from Attorney Shannon regarding
discovery requests in Canadian criminal
investigation; e-mail to Attorney Shannon
regarding same

Telephone conference with Attorney Shannon
regarding status of discovery requests in
Canadian criminal investigation; review
complaint filed by Trustee against World
Fuels (0.4); review motion filed by Wheeling
regarding cash collateral order (0.2)

Desc Exhibit

PAGE

.30

.20

.40
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INVOICE:

01/31/14 RAC

02/03/14 RAC

02/10/14 RAC

02/24/14 RAC

02/24/14 RAC

03/05/14 RAC

03/06/14 RAC

03/11/14 RAC

03/11/14 RAC

03/12/14 RAC

03/18/14 RAC

03/28/14 RAC

Kk kkkxk

Attend hearing in USDC regarding motion to
remove personal injury cases filed in Cook
County

E-mail from Attorney Shannon regarding
discover requests by SQ, et al.

Review motion of class action plaintiffs
regarding claims filing process (0.2); e-mail
from and to Attorney Fagone regarding status
of Verrill Dana fees and expenses (0.2)

E-mails from and to Attorney Keach regarding
c¢logsing documentation from 2011 transaction;
regspond to same

E-mail from Michael Cutler and to Attorney
Keach regarding notices to and from Federal
Rail Administration

E-mail from Paralegal Hoglund regarding
invoice from Evidox for document production
services (0.1); forward to Attorney Fagone
(0.1)

Telephone conference with Attorney Keach
regarding 2011 closing with MDOT

E-mail from Paralegal Hoglund and to Attorney
Fagone regarding invoices from Evidox

Further e-mails from and to Attorney Fagone
and Don Gardner regarding Evidox invoices

E-mails from and to Rail World and to
Attorney Fagone regarding address change for
Rall World

Conference with Attorney Wertheimer regarding
status of response to subpoena in criminal
investigation (0.2); conference with Attorney
Shannon regarding same (0.1)

Review various pleadings (.5)

Desc Exhibit
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04/28/14 NH Confer with Attorney Anderson regarding .30 76.50

documents for sale of rail assets (.1);
e-mail regarding same (.2)

04/29/14 RAC E-maills regarding documents requested by .30 103.50
Trustee regarding closing with State of Maine

04/29/14 NH Review information collected and respond to .30 76.50
request from S. Anderson for documents
relating to second amendment to the FRA loan

Total Feeg: $65,518,50

Summary of Hours:
Roger Clement 127.00 hours at $330.00 = 41910.00
Roger Clement 8.60 hours at $345.00 = 2967 .00
Nate Hull 37.50 hours at $235.00 = 8812.50
Nate Hull 0.60 hours at $255.00 = 153.00
Nicole Hoglund 82.50 hours at $135.00 = 11137.50
Jennifer Harrell 1.20 hours at $130.00 = 156.00
Marilyn Henderson 4.50 hours at 585.00 = 382.50
Costs Incurred:

PACER BILLING 11.50

CUTSIDE TOLL CALLS 227,19

PHOTOCOPY 222.30

TRAVEL, TOLLS & HOTEL 151.90

TELECOPIER/FAX CHARGE 0.80

FEDERAL EXPRESS 197.12

MEALS 29.75

Total Costs $840.56





