

**UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT
DISTRICT OF MAINE**

In re:

MONTREAL MAINE & ATLANTIC
RAILWAY, LTD.

Debtor.

Bk. No. 13-10670
Chapter 11

**THIRD INTERIM APPLICATION FOR COMPENSATION AND REIMBURSEMENT
OF EXPENSES FOR BERNSTEIN, SHUR, SAWYER & NELSON, P.A., AS COUNSEL
TO THE TRUSTEE, ROBERT J. KEACH, FOR THE PERIOD FROM
OCTOBER 1, 2014 THROUGH OCTOBER 31, 2015**

Name of Applicant:	Bernstein, Shur, Sawyer & Nelson, P.A.
Authorized to Provide Professional Services as:	Counsel to Robert J. Keach, the duly appointed Chapter 11 Trustee of the bankruptcy estate of the Debtor
Petition Date:	August 7, 2013
Date of Retention:	August 28, 2013 <u>nunc pro tunc</u> to August 21, 2013
Period for Which Compensation and Reimbursement is Sought:	October 1, 2014 through and including October 31, 2015
Total Amount of Compensation sought as actual, reasonable and necessary:	\$902,228.00
Total Amount of Expenses sought as actual, reasonable and necessary:	\$11,611.71
Total Fees and Expenses Requested:	\$913,839.71

This is an Interim Application.

Prior Fee Applications:

Date Filed	Period Covered	Requested		Approved/Received	
		Fees	Expenses	Fees	Expenses
5/12/14	August 21, 2013 – April 30, 2014	\$1,019,528.40	\$28,169.42	\$1,019,528.40	\$28,169.42
10/24/14	May 1, 2014 – September 30, 2014	\$282,287.50	\$4,260.58	\$282,287.50	\$4,260.58

COMPENSATION BY PROFESSIONAL

	DEPARTMENT AND YEAR ADMITTED*	HOURLY BILLING RATE†	TOTAL BILLED HOURS	TOTAL COMPENSATION
Sam Anderson	BRI–2000	\$365.00	63.2	\$23,068.00
		\$370.00	145.7	\$53,909.00
Michael Bosse	LPG–1996	\$290.00	0.8	\$232.00
Robert J. Crawford	MUN–1989	\$290.00	4.9	\$1,421.00
Michael Fagone	BRI–1997	\$385.00	66.6	\$25,641.00
		\$390.00	37.6	\$14,664.00
Katherine Joyce	ENR–2003	\$250.00	12.6	\$3,150.00
		\$255.00	2.1	\$535.50
Paul McDonald	LPG–1987	\$370.00	66.8	\$24,716.00
		\$375.00	82.8	\$31,050.00

* BLPG – Business Law Practice Group; BRI – Business Restructuring and Insolvency; ENR – Energy & Environmental Practice Group; LEPG – Labor and Employment Practice Group; LPG – Litigation and Dispute Resolution; MUN – Municipal and Regulatory Practice Group; REPG – Real Estate Practice Group. A brief biography of each professional who has rendered services in connection with the fees and expenses herein is set forth on **Exhibit B**.

† BSSN implemented across-the-board annual rate increases for firm timekeepers on January 1, 2015. As stated in the Retention Application (defined below), BSSN’s “hourly rates are subject to change from time to time in accordance with BSSN’s established billing practices and procedures.” Retention Application, ¶ 14.

	DEPARTMENT AND YEAR ADMITTED*	HOURLY BILLING RATE†	TOTAL BILLED HOURS	TOTAL COMPENSATION
Matthew Tarasevich	LEPG-1994	\$275.00	0.8	\$220.00
		\$280.00	0.2	\$56.00
Nelson A. Toner	BLPG-1985	\$360.00	11.9	\$4,284.00
OF COUNSEL				
Jessica A. Lewis	BRI-2006	\$250.00	5.6	\$1,400.00
ASSOCIATE				
Rachael Becker	‡	\$160.00	38.6	\$6,176.00
Bodie Colwell	BRI-2011	\$195.00	50.9	\$9,925.50
		\$200.00	59.2	\$11,840.00
Roma Desai	BRI-2009	\$200.00	70.7	\$14,140.00
		\$205.00	484.4	\$99,302.00
Stephen Gerlach	BLPG-2006	\$280.00	3.6	\$1,008.00
Will Hueske	BRI-2010	\$200.00	73.9	\$14,780.00
		\$205.00	228.4	\$46,822.00
Timothy McKeon	BRI-2012	\$195.00	165.3	\$32,233.50
		\$200.00	648.1	\$129,620.00
Michael Siedband	BRI-2009	\$195.00	87.8	\$17,121.00
		\$200.00	396.7	\$79,340.00
Lindsay Zahradka	BRI-2011	\$205.00	654.3	\$134,131.50
PARALEGAL				
Daniel A. Chalaby	REPG	\$165.00	1.0	\$165.00

‡ Rachael Becker served as a summer law clerk at BSSN and is not yet admitted to practice

	DEPARTMENT AND YEAR ADMITTED*	HOURLY BILLING RATE†	TOTAL BILLED HOURS	TOTAL COMPENSATION
Karla Quirk	BRI	\$150.00	45.5	\$6,825.00
		\$165.00	251.1	\$38,920.50
Angela Stewart	BRI	\$180.00	56.0	\$10,080.00
		\$185.00	351.7	\$65,064.50
LIBRARIAN				
Christine B. Bertsch		\$90.00	4.3	\$387.00
TOTAL			4,173.1	\$902,228.00

Blended hourly rate (excluding paralegal time): \$225.43

Blended hourly rate for paraprofessionals only: \$171.64

COMPENSATION BY PROJECT CATEGORY

PROJECT CODE	PROJECT DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT
1	Asset Analysis and Recovery	112.5	\$22,129.50
2	Asset Disposition	30.9	\$7,783.00
3	Business Operations	18.1	\$4,939.50
4	Case Administration	452.2	\$92,313.00
5	Claims Administration and Objections	322.5	\$66,990.00
6	Employee Benefits/Pensions	7.0	\$2,479.50
7	Fee/Employment Applications	201.9	\$40,729.50
9	Financing	0.4	\$148.00
10	Litigation	1,899.0	\$432,996.00
12	Plan and Disclosure Statement	889.6	\$180,123.50
14	Other	217.3	\$44,436.50
21	Tax Issues	21.7	\$7,160.00
TOTAL		4,173.1	\$902,228.00

EXPENSE SUMMARY

EXPENSE CATEGORY	AMOUNT
Recording Fee	\$62.00
Filing Fee	\$5,526.00
Transcript	\$761.05
Certified Copies	\$60.96
Certified Mail/Courier	\$33.50
Postage	\$1,824.00
Federal Express	\$2,117.36
CourtCall (Telephonic Hearing Service)	\$37.00
Miscellaneous	\$2.62
Staff Overtime	\$372.96
Travel Expense	\$799.86
Overtime Meals	\$14.40
Total Charges & Disbursements	\$11,611.71

UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT
DISTRICT OF MAINE

In re:

MONTREAL MAINE & ATLANTIC
RAILWAY, LTD.

Debtor.

Bk. No. 13-10670
Chapter 11

**THIRD INTERIM APPLICATION FOR COMPENSATION AND REIMBURSEMENT
OF EXPENSES FOR BERNSTEIN, SHUR, SAWYER & NELSON, P.A., AS COUNSEL
TO THE TRUSTEE, ROBERT J. KEACH, FOR THE PERIOD FROM
OCTOBER 1, 2014 THROUGH OCTOBER 31, 2015**

Bernstein, Shur, Sawyer & Nelson, P.A. ("BSSN"), counsel to Robert J. Keach, the duly appointed chapter 11 trustee (the "Trustee") in the above-captioned chapter 11 case of Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway, Ltd. (the "Debtor"), submits this third interim application (the "Fee Application") for compensation for professional services and reimbursement of expenses for the period from October 1, 2014 through October 31, 2015 (the "Compensation Period"). In support of the Fee Application, BSSN states as follows:

JURISDICTION AND VENUE

1. This Court has jurisdiction over this matter pursuant to 28 U.S.C. §§ 157 and 1334. Venue is proper pursuant to 28 U.S.C. §§ 1408 and 1409. This matter is a core proceeding pursuant to 28 U.S.C. §157(b)(2). The statutory predicates for the relief sought herein are sections 327(a) and 330 of the Bankruptcy Code, Federal Rule of Bankruptcy Procedure 2016(a), and Rule 2016-1 of the local rules of this Court (the "Local Rules").

BACKGROUND

2. On August 7, 2013 (the "Petition Date"), the Debtor filed a voluntary petition for relief under chapter 11 of 11 U.S.C. § 101 et seq. (the "Bankruptcy Code") in the United States

Bankruptcy Court for the District of Maine (the “Bankruptcy Court”). On August 21, 2013, the United States Trustee (the “U.S. Trustee”) appointed the Trustee to serve in the Debtor’s chapter 11 case (the “Case”) pursuant to 11 U.S.C. § 1163.

3. On August 21, 2013, the Trustee filed his Application for Order, Pursuant to Sections 327 and 328 of the Bankruptcy Code, Authorizing the Employment of Bernstein, Shur, Sawyer & Nelson, P.A., as Attorneys for the Trustee [Docket No. 74] (the “Retention Application”). Thereafter, on August 28, 2013, the Court entered an order authorizing the employment of BSSN as counsel to the Trustee pursuant to sections 327 and 328 of the Bankruptcy Code [Docket No. 107] (the “Retention Order”).

4. As set forth in the Retention Order, BSSN is authorized to, inter alia, “[advise] the Trustee with respect to his powers and duties in the Trustee’s continued management and operation of the Debtor’s business and property,” “[take] all necessary action to protect and preserve the Debtor’s estate,” and “[perform] all other necessary legal services and providing all other necessary legal advice to the Trustee in connection with the Case.” See Retention Order, at 2–3. The Retention Order further provides that BSSN shall receive compensation on an hourly basis and in accordance with the applicable provisions of the Bankruptcy Code, the Federal Rules of Bankruptcy Procedure, the Local Rules, the United States Trustee Guidelines for Reviewing Applications for Compensation & Reimbursement of Expenses filed under 11 U.S.C. § 330 (the “UST Guidelines”), and any applicable orders of the Court. See Retention Order, at 1; see also Retention Application, ¶¶ 13–14.

5. On May 12, 2014, BSSN filed the First Interim Application for Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses for Bernstein, Shur, Sawyer & Nelson, P.A., as Counsel to the Trustee, Robert J. Keach, for the Period from August 21, 2013 Through April 30, 2014 [Docket

No. 870] (the “First Interim Fee Application”). The First Interim Fee Application sought allowance of compensation for professional services in the amount of \$1,019,528.40 and reimbursement of expenses incurred in connection with rendering such services in the amount of \$28,169.42. By order of this Court entered on June 11, 2014 [Docket No. 962], the Court awarded BSSN \$1,019,528.40 in fees and \$28,169.42 in expenses in relation to the First Interim Fee Application. As of the date of this Fee Application, all fees and expenses requested in the First Interim Fee Application have been paid.

6. On October 24, 2014, BSSN filed the Second Interim Application for Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses for Bernstein, Shur, Sawyer & Nelson, P.A., as Counsel to the Trustee, Robert J. Keach, for the Period from May 1, 2014 Through September 30, 2014 [Docket No. 1169] (the “Second Interim Fee Application”). The Second Interim Fee Application sought allowance of compensation for professional services in the amount of \$286,548.08 and reimbursement of expenses incurred in connection with rendering such services in the amount of \$4,260.58. By order of this Court entered on November 19, 2014 [Docket No. 1251], the Court awarded BSSN \$286,548.08 in fees and \$4,260.58 in expenses in relation to the Second Interim Fee Application. As of the date of this Fee Application, all fees and expenses requested in the Second Interim Fee Application have been paid.

7. Since entry of the Retention Order, and throughout the Compensation Period, BSSN has worked with the Trustee to meet the challenges presented by this Case in a manner beneficial to the Debtor and the creditors of the Debtor’s estate. The following discussion and materials annexed hereto cover the major categories of services for which allowance of compensation is sought.

COMPENSATION AND REIMBURSEMENT REQUEST

8. BSSN seeks allowance of compensation for professional services in the amount of \$902,228.00 and reimbursement of expenses incurred in rendering such services in the amount of \$11,611.71. Pursuant to Rule 2016(a) of the Federal Rules of Bankruptcy Procedure and Local Rule 2016-1(a)(3)(i), a detailed statement of professional services provided by BSSN to the Trustee (the “Billing Statement”) is set forth on Exhibit A, annexed hereto and incorporated herein by reference. BSSN has carefully reviewed the Billing Statement on a line-by-line basis to ensure that services have been billed under the correct fee category.¹

9. Pursuant to Local Rule 2016-1(a)(3)(iv), a detailed statement setting forth billing rates, total hours billed, and total amounts billed for each professional and paraprofessional at BSSN during the Compensation Period and associated expenses incurred is contained in the tables located at the beginning of this Fee Application.

10. Other than an agreement between BSSN and the Trustee for the sharing of compensation with the Trustee as a shareholder of BSSN, no agreement or understanding exists between BSSN and any other entity for the sharing of compensation sought by this Fee Application. In addition, no payments have been made or promised to BSSN for services rendered or to be rendered in connection with the Case, except as set forth in the Retention Application and detailed in this Fee Application.

11. BSSN has substantial expertise in such areas as business restructuring and bankruptcy, energy and environmental law, and litigation and dispute resolution. Pursuant to Local Rule 2016-1(a)(3)(v), a brief biography of each BSSN professional and paraprofessional

¹ BSSN implemented twenty-two (22) task codes for specific categories of work to permit a more detailed analysis of the fees incurred. Given the multitude of attorneys and professionals involved and the number of task codes, inconsistencies are inevitable despite BSSN’s best efforts to ensure that work on a specific topic is billed to a single task code.

who has rendered services in connection with the fees and expenses herein is set forth on **Exhibit B**, annexed hereto and incorporated herein by reference.

12. This Fee Application is BSSN's third application to this Court in this Case for compensation for professional services and reimbursement of expenses pursuant to sections 328 and 331 of the Bankruptcy Code, Rule 2016 of the Federal Rules of Bankruptcy Procedure, and Rule 2016-1 of the Local Rules. As required by paragraph (b)(v) of the UST Guidelines, the Trustee has been given the opportunity to review this Fee Application and has approved the requested amount.

SUMMARY OF SERVICES

13. BSSN serves as legal counsel to the Trustee with respect to all bankruptcy matters that arise in or relate to this bankruptcy action. In rendering professional services to the Trustee, BSSN's legal team includes professionals with extensive experience in bankruptcy, real estate, and litigation practices, among others. BSSN professionals have worked closely with the Trustee and his other professionals to coordinate assignments in order to maximize efficiency and avoid any duplication of effort.

14. All of the services for which BSSN requests compensation herein were rendered on behalf of the Trustee in connection with this Case, and all the time described on the attached exhibits represents the actual amount of time spent by BSSN professionals who rendered the described services.

15. BSSN does not wish to burden the Court with an overly detailed recitation of each and every matter with respect to which it has rendered services during the Compensation Period. Accordingly, this Fee Application is intended to serve as a summary description of the more significant services rendered by BSSN, and to highlight the benefits which have been conferred

upon the creditors of the Debtor's estate as a result of BSSN's efforts. The following section provides an overview of certain of the significant services rendered by BSSN during the Compensation Period.

Wheeling Collateral Litigation; Wheeling Compromise

16. On January 9, 2015, the parties entered a Joint Pretrial Order [Docket No. 1334], agreeing to consolidate the disposition of the Motion for an Order Pursuant to 11 U.S.C. 506(c) Authorizing the Recovery of Expenses from Wheeling and Lake Erie Railway Co. or its Collateral [Docket No. 854] (the "506(c) Surcharge Motion"), with the Wheeling Adversary Proceeding and the Motion to Enforce Cash Collateral Order [Docket No. 603] into a single, consolidated adversary proceeding, with a hearing on all issues originally scheduled for February 26, 2015. Briefing was completed, and a hearing was held on June 25, 2015, at which, the Court entered an order allowing Wheeling & Lake Erie Railway Company ("Wheeling") a superpriority administrative expense claim in an agreed amount with any payment subject to adjudicating the 506(c) Surcharge Motion.

World Fuel Services Adversary Proceeding

17. On January 30, 2014, the Trustee filed a Complaint commencing adversary proceeding number 14-01001 against World Fuel Services Corporation, World Fuel Services, Inc., Western Petroleum Company, World Fuel Services, Canada, Inc. and Petroleum Transport Solutions, LLC (the "World Fuel Defendants") for, inter alia, alleged negligence in connection with the Derailment [Docket No. 605]. The action alleges that the World Fuel Defendants failed to comply with safe and prudent shipping practices, as well as governmental regulations in the United States and Canada, which mandate that parties who offer for shipment certain types of products that are deemed to be hazardous, including crude oil, must properly classify, identify,

label, and package the product so as to enable safe transport of such cargo. The Trustee alleges that the failure to follow these practices resulted in the derailment and explosion at Lac-Mégantic. The Trustee has pursued this cause of action, including related settlement negotiations, as a successful outcome would significantly benefit the Debtor's estate and its creditors, and all victims of the Derailment.

18. On June 8, 2015, the Trustee and the World Fuel Defendants announced the conclusion of an agreement whereby, subject to Court approval in Canada and in the United States, the World Fuel Defendants will contribute \$110,000,000 to the Trustee's fund for settling Derailment Claims.

Wheeling Preference Action

19. On May 26, 2015, the Trustee filed an adversary proceeding (the "Wheeling Preference Action") against Wheeling to avoid and recover transfers to Wheeling as an insider of the Debtor, pursuant to section 544 of the Bankruptcy Code and 14 M.R.S.A § 3576. On July 10, 2015, Wheeling filed a motion to dismiss the Wheeling Preference Action.

2011 Transactions

20. On July 29, 2015, the Trustee commenced an adversary proceeding against certain of the investors and certain of the Debtor's directors. The Trustee seeks the avoidance and recovery of certain unauthorized dividends, fraudulent transfers, and insider preferences, as well as awards of money damages for multiple counts of breach of fiduciary duty, all of which arise from the series of transactions wherein the Debtor sold certain rail assets to the State of Maine (the "2011 Transactions"). While the 2011 Transactions were allegedly undertaken to provide the Debtor with working capital, they were carried out in such a way as to provide the maximum benefit to certain of the Debtor's investors and creditors, while providing the Debtor

with no additional working capital. The transaction was not at arm's length and was undertaken while the Debtor was insolvent. The trustee seeks to avoid and recover payments totaling at least \$13,862,165.29, and recover damages for breach of fiduciary duty.

Plan and Disclosure Statement

21. During the Compensation Period BSSN professionals, with the Trustee, devoted significant time to drafting the plan of reorganization and disclosure statement of the Debtor. On March 31, 2015, the Trustee filed the Trustee's Plan of Liquidation Dated March 31, 2015 [Docket No. 1384] and the Disclosure Statement with Respect to Trustee's Plan of Liquidation Dated March 31, 2015 [Docket No. 1385]. On July 7, 2015, the Trustee filed with the Court the Trustee's First Amended Plan of Liquidation Dated July 7, 2015 [Docket No. 1495] and the First Amended Disclosure Statement with Respect to Trustee's Plan of Liquidation Dated July 7, 2015 [Docket No. 1497]. On July 15, 2015, the Trustee filed the Trustee's Revised First Amended Plan of Liquidation Dated July 15, 2015 [Docket No. 1534] (the "Plan") and the Revised First Amended Disclosure Statement with Respect to Trustee's Plan of Liquidation Dated July 15, 2015 [Docket No. 1535] (the "Disclosure Statement").

22. On July 17, 2015, this Court entered the Order (I) Approving Proposed Disclosure Statement; (II) Establishing Notice, Solicitation and Voting Procedures; (III) Scheduling Confirmation Hearing; and (IV) Establishing Notice and Objection Procedures for Confirmation of the Plan [Docket No. 1544] (the "Disclosure Statement Order"). Pursuant to the Disclosure Statement Order, Solicitation Packages conforming to the requirements of the Disclosure Statement Order were transmitted to creditors and parties-in-interest.

23. On October 9, 2015, this Court entered the Order Confirming Trustee's Revised First Amended Plan of Liquidation Dated July 15, 2015 and Authorizing and Directing Certain Actions in Connections Therewith [Docket No. 1801].

Derailment Settlements

24. The Trustee, with the assistance of BSSN, was able to recover funds for the benefit of creditors, including those creditors with claims arising out of the Lac-Mégantic derailment. The Trustee worked with counterparts in Canada to create a nine-figure settlement fund to be implemented in plans filed in this Case and the Canadian Case. As part of those efforts, during the Compensation Period, the Trustee and BSSN professionals devoted a substantial amount of time to meeting with parties in attempting to establish that settlement fund, including various defendants in pending litigation, counsel to victims, the Monitor in the Canadian Case, and other parties. As a result of these negotiations, approximately 25 entities or groups of affiliated entities have entered into settlement agreements, whereby the released party will contribute to the settlement funds in exchange, *inter alia*, for a full and final release of all claims arising out of the Derailment, including any claims for contribution and/or indemnity (including contractual indemnity) asserted by third parties, as well as the protection of a global injunction barring assertion of any Derailment-related claims against the released parties. The settlement funds constitute approximately CAD\$445,000,000.00.

Other Tasks

25. In addition to the narrative summary above, the following is an explanation and definition of the fourteen (14) principal task codes for which BSSN has rendered services and recorded time:²

² The examples given under each task code or project category are not all-inclusive; **Exhibit A** contains comprehensive details for each code and category.

a. Asset Analysis and Recovery

This project category includes services relating to the analysis of the Debtor's assets and BSSN's efforts at recovering and maximizing the value of the Debtor's assets for the benefit of its estate and creditors. During the Compensation Period, services rendered by BSSN under this project category include analysis of potential preference actions, including analysis and research relating to the 2011 Transactions.

BSSN spent 112.5 hours on this project category resulting in \$22,129.50 in associated fees.

b. Asset Disposition

This project category includes services relating to BSSN's efforts concerning the sale and lease of certain property of the Debtor, and related transactional work. During the Compensation Period, services rendered by BSSN under this project category include:

- i. Drafting of a motion to abandon certain real property;
- ii. Tasks relating to sale of certain locomotives; and
- iii. Reviewing and revising certain leases.

BSSN spent 30.9 hours on this project category resulting in \$7,783.00 in associated fees.

c. Business Operations

This project category includes services related to the Trustee's operation of the Debtor. Among the tasks performed by BSSN in this project category are tasks relating to environmental issues, tasks relating to storage of property of the estate, and tasks relating to insurance.

BSSN spent 18.1 hours on this project category resulting in \$4,939.50 in associated fees.

d. Case Administration

This project category includes services related to time spent assisting in the efficient administration of this bankruptcy action. During the Compensation Period, services rendered by BSSN under this project category include:

- i. Internal discussions and conferences with the Trustee regarding case strategy;

- ii. Miscellaneous filings and organization of documents, including ECF filings, affidavits of service, and communication with the Court;
- iii. Preparing for and attending various hearings; and
- iv. Review of various documents, including court filings, insurance documents, contracts, licenses, and agreements.

BSSN spent 452.2 hours on this project category resulting in \$92,313.00 in associated fees.

e. Claims Administration and Objections

This project category includes services related to claims administration and objections. During the Compensation Period services rendered by BSSN professionals under this project category include:

- i. Responding to claim inquiries;
- ii. The drafting of the motion to set the administrative claims bar date; and
- iii. The analysis of and objection to claims.

BSSN spent 322.5 hours on this project category resulting in \$66,990.00 in associated fees.

f. Employee Benefits/Pensions

This project category includes services related to certain employee severance agreements and other employee benefits.

BSSN spent 7.0 hours on this project category resulting in \$2,479.50 in associated fees.

g. Fee/Employment Applications

This project category includes services related to the preparation of fee and/or employment applications. During the Compensation Period, BSSN prepared and/or filed the fee applications of the Trustee [Docket No. 1170], BSSN [Docket No. 1169], Development Specialists, Inc. [Docket No. 1168], Baker Newman & Noyes, LLC [Docket No. 1202], Shaw Fishman Glantz and Towbin LLC [Docket No. 1222] and Kugler Kandestin, LLP [Docket No. 1203]. Additionally, BSSN professionals prepared the Motion Pursuant to Sections 327 and 328 of the Bankruptcy Code to Amend the Terms of Retention of Development Specialists, Inc. as Financial Advisor to the Trustee Nunc Pro Tunc to August 11, 2014

[Docket No. 1130]. Lastly, BSSN professionals prepared the Application to Employ Prime Clerk, LLC as Noticing and Solicitation Agent [Docket No. 1429].

BSSN spent 201.9 hours on this project category resulting in \$40,729.50 in associated fees.

h. Financing

This project category includes services related to matters arising under sections 363 and 364 of the Bankruptcy Code, including cash collateral, secured claims, and loan document analysis. During the Compensation Period, BSSN professionals billed under this project category for reviewing the cash collateral order and related tasks.

BSSN spent 0.4 hours on this project category resulting in \$148.00 in associated fees.

i. Litigation

This project category relates to time spent conducting legal research, drafting and filing various motions and pleadings, and the initiation of, as well as defense against, certain adversary proceedings, and time for related court appearances.

During the Compensation Period, services rendered by BSSN under this project category include:

- i. Preparing the Trustee's Objection to Wheeling & Lake Erie Railway Company's Motion to Intervene as of Right Pursuant to Bankruptcy Rule 7024 and Rule 24(a) of the Federal Rules of Civil Procedure and Incorporated Memorandum of Law [Docket No. 40] [Adv. Pro. 14-01001];
- ii. Research relating to claims under the Carmack Amendment;
- iii. Research and analysis relating to the appeal of the order to transfer of nineteen civil actions pending in the United States District Court for the Northern District of Illinois to the United States District Court for the District of Maine, pursuant to 28 U.S.C. § 157(b)(5);
- iv. Preparation of various Derailment settlement agreements;
- v. Preparation of the Trustee's Objection to Wheeling & Lake Erie Railway Company's Motion to Enforce Cash Collateral Orders [Docket No. 34] [Adv. Pro. 13-01033]; and
- vi. Preparation of the Trustee's Reply to Wheeling & Lake Erie Railway Company's Initial Brief Regarding the Applicability

and Enforceability of the Court's 2014 Rulings Determining that the So-Called Canadian Receivables are Wheeling's Collateral [Docket No. 66] [Adv. Pro. 13-01033].

BSSN spent 1,899.0 hours on this project category resulting in \$432,996.00 in associated fees.

j. Plan and Disclosure Statement

This project category relates to time spent by BSSN on services related to the Debtor's Plan and disclosure statement. During the Compensation Period, services rendered by BSSN under this project category include:

- i. Preparing the Trustee's Revised First Amended Plan of Liquidation Dated July 15, 2015 [Docket No. 1534];
- ii. Preparing the Revised First Amended Disclosure Statement with Respect to Trustee's Plan of Liquidation Dated July 15, 2015 [Docket No. 1535];
- iii. Reviewing objections to the Plan;
- iv. Drafting Trustee's Memorandum of Law in Support of, and Omnibus Reply to Objections to, Confirmation of Trustee's Revised First Amended Plan of Liquidation Dated July 15, 2015 [Docket No. 1684]; and
- v. Attending hearings relating to confirmation of the Plan.

BSSN spent 889.6 hours on this project category resulting in \$180,123.50 in associated fees.

k. Other

This project category includes services related to the various efforts BSSN undertakes to support the Trustee, including legal research, meetings with the Debtor, interoffice conferences, and addressing issues relating to the Canadian Case. Additionally, BSSN professionals billed time under this category for tasks relating to the Chapter 15 petition for MMA Canada.

BSSN spent 217.3 hours on this project category resulting in \$44,436.50 in associated fees.

l. Tax Issues

This project category relates to time spent by BSSN on issues involving tax services for the Debtor

BSSN spent 21.7 hours on this project category resulting in \$7,160.00 in associated fees.

ACTUAL AND NECESSARY DISBURSEMENTS

26. As set forth on **Exhibit A** attached hereto, BSSN has disbursed \$11,611.71 as expenses incurred in providing professional services during the Compensation Period. The expenses incurred arise from Federal Express charges, postage, courier charges, recording fees, certified copies, filing fees, transcript and court reporter expenses, overtime meals, staff overtime and travel expenses. These expenses represent the out-of-pocket disbursements incurred during the regular course of the provision of legal services.

THE REQUESTED COMPENSATION SHOULD BE ALLOWED

27. Pursuant to section 330 of the Bankruptcy Code, the Court may award professionals “reasonable compensation for actual, necessary services.” 11 U.S.C. § 330(a)(1)(A). The Court may, on its own motion or an objection filed by a party in interest, “award compensation that is less than the amount of compensation that is requested.” 11 U.S.C. § 330(a)(2). In evaluating the amount of reasonable compensation to be awarded, the Court should consider:

the nature, the extent, and the value of such services, taking into account all relevant factors including:

- (A) the time spent on such services;
- (B) the rates charged for such services;
- (C) whether the services were necessary to the administration of, or beneficial at the time at which the service was rendered toward the completion of, a case under this title;
- (D) whether the services were performed within a reasonable amount of time commensurate with the complexity, importance, and nature of the problem, issue, or task addressed;

- (E) with respect to a professional person, whether the person is board certified or otherwise has demonstrated skill and experience in the bankruptcy field; and
- (F) whether the compensation is reasonable based on the customary compensation charged by comparably skilled practitioners in cases other than cases under this title.

11 U.S.C. §§ 330(a)(3)(A–F).

28. BSSN submits that the services for which it seeks compensation in this Fee Application were necessary for and beneficial to the Debtor's estate. The services rendered by BSSN were performed economically, effectively, and efficiently. Accordingly, the compensation requested herein is reasonable in light of the nature, extent, and value of such services to the Debtor.

29. The work conducted was carefully assigned to appropriate professionals or paraprofessionals according to the experience and level of expertise required for each particular task. Whenever possible and where appropriate, BSSN sought to minimize the costs of its services by utilizing associates and paraprofessionals.

30. In sum, the services rendered by BSSN were necessary and beneficial to the Debtor and such services were consistently performed in a timely manner, commensurate with the complexity and nature of the issues involved. Accordingly, approval of compensation sought herein is warranted.

CONCLUSION

WHEREFORE, BSSN respectfully requests that the Court enter an order: (a) approving on an interim basis, pursuant to 11 U.S.C. § 330, compensation for services rendered in the

amount of \$902,228.00 and reimbursement of expenses in the amount of \$11,611.71; and (b) granting such other and further relief as the Court deems just and proper.³

DATED: November 9, 2015

**BERNSTEIN, SHUR, SAWYER &
NELSON, P.A.**

By:

/s/ Sam Anderson
Sam Anderson, Esq.
Bernstein, Shur, Sawyer & Nelson, P.A.
100 Middle Street
P.O. Box 9729
Portland, ME 04104
Telephone: (207) 774-1200
Facsimile: (207) 774-1127
E-mail: sanderson@bernsteinshur.com

*Counsel for Robert J. Keach, Chapter 11
Trustee of Montreal Maine & Atlantic
Railway, Ltd.*

³ BSSN believes that it may be entitled to a fee enhancement under applicable law. See e.g., In re Public Service Co. of N.H., 160 B.R. 404 (Bankr. D.N.H. 1993). BSSN has not sought such an enhancement in this interim application, but BSSN reserves the right to seek such enhancement in connection with its final fee application.

Bernstein Shur

Counselors at Law
I.D. #01-0378211



100 Middle Street
P.O. Box 9729
Portland, Maine 04104-5029
(207) 774-1200

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

Fees for Professional Services 10/01/14 Through 10/31/15	\$902,228.00
Expenses 10/01/14 Through 10/31/15	\$11,611.71

Total This Invoice	\$913,839.71

----- S E R V I C E S S U M M A R Y -----

Associate

RACHAEL BECKER	38.60	160.00	\$6,176.00
BODIE COLWELL	110.10	197.69	\$21,765.50
ROMA DESAI	555.10	204.36	113,442.00
STEVEN GERLACH	3.60	280.00	\$1,008.00
WILL HUESKE	302.30	203.78	\$61,602.00
TIMOTHY MCKEON	813.40	198.98	161,853.50
MICHAEL SIEDBAND	484.50	199.09	\$96,461.00
LINDSAY ZAHRADKA	654.30	205.00	134,131.50
TOTAL FOR Associate	2961.90	201.37	596,439.50

Librarian

CHRISTINE B. BERTSCH	4.30	90.00	\$387.00
TOTAL FOR Librarian	4.30	90.00	\$387.00

Of Counsel

JESSICA LEWIS	5.60	250.00	\$1,400.00
TOTAL FOR Of Counsel	5.60	250.00	\$1,400.00

Paralegal

DAN CHALABY	1.00	165.00	\$165.00
KARLA QUIRK	296.60	154.23	\$45,745.50
ANGELA STEWART	407.70	184.31	\$75,144.50
TOTAL FOR Paralegal	705.30	171.64	121,055.00

Please return the enclosed REMITTANCE COPY with your
payment to ensure proper credit to your account.

Shareholder			
SAM ANDERSON	208.90	368.49	\$76,977.00
MICHAEL BOSSE	0.80	290.00	\$232.00
ROBERT J. CRAWFORD	4.90	290.00	\$1,421.00
MICHAEL FAGONE	104.20	386.80	\$40,305.00
KATHERINE JOYCE	14.70	250.71	\$3,685.50
PAUL MCDONALD	149.60	372.77	\$55,766.00
MATTHEW TARASEVICH	1.00	276.00	\$276.00
NELSON A TONER	11.90	360.00	\$4,284.00
TOTAL FOR Shareholder	496.00	368.84	182,946.50

Remittance Copy

Bernstein Shur

Counselors at Law
I.D. #01-0378211

P.O. Box 9729
Portland, Maine 04104-5029
(207) 774-1200

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway .

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

A late charge of 1 1/2% per month may be imposed
for payment after 30 days.
To Ensure Proper Credit to Your Account:

Please return this Remittance Copy with your payment.

If paying by check, please mark the invoice number on your check.

If paying by Visa or Mastercard, please complete the information below.

Card Number _____ Exp. Date _____

Signature _____ Amount _____

REQUIRED PRIVACY ACT NOTICE

Bernstein Shur does not disclose any nonpublic information about our clients or former clients, except as permitted by law. We restrict access to nonpublic personal information about you to those who need to know that information in order to provide services to you. We maintain physical, electronic and procedural safeguards that comply with federal regulations to guard your nonpublic personal information.

Bernstein Shur

Counselors at Law
I.D. #01-0378211

100 Middle Street
P.O. Box 9729
Portland, Maine 04104-5029
(207) 774-1200

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

01

Asset Analysis and Recovery

Date	ATTY	Hours	
10/01/14	MAS	7.70	Draft discussion section of memo re: 2011 transaction, including additional research on choice of law and governing law for breach of fiduciary duty and fraudulent transfer claims.
10/02/14	MAS	7.40	Continued drafting of discussion section of memo re: 2011 transaction.
10/03/14	MAS	7.60	Draft discussion section of memo re: 2011 transactions, including additional research into Delaware corporation fiduciary duties.
10/06/14	MAS	7.90	Continued drafting of 2011 transaction memo, including additional research on UFTA provisions and law. Additional research on parent-subsiary fiduciary duties.
10/07/14	MAS	5.80	Continued drafting of memo re: 2011 transaction.
10/08/14	MAS	7.40	Continued drafting of memo re: 2011 transactions.
10/09/14	MAS	2.20	Review memo re: 2011 transaction. Draft additional analysis re: collapsing transactions.
10/23/14	DSA	0.20	Reviewed e-mails from F. Caruso concerning issues with preference actions (.2)
11/10/14	MAS	0.10	Confer with Bob about subject of complaint to draft for upcoming adversary proceeding.
11/11/14	MAS	0.30	Confer with Bob Keach re: complaint against D&O and Investors and begin to assemble necessary documents.
11/11/14	MAS	3.50	Create complaint template and begin drafting complaint re: 2011 transactions.
11/13/14	MAS	2.50	Continue drafting complaint for breach of fiduciary duty, recharacterization, and fraudulent transfer.
11/13/14	MAS	0.80	Review additional caselaw for breach of fiduciary duty complaint.

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

11/14/14	MAS	5.20	Continue drafting complaint re: 2011 transactions, including research into corporate status and location of various defendants.
11/17/14	MAS	1.80	Continue drafting complaint re: 2011 Transaction.
11/18/14	MAS	6.00	Draft complaint re: 2011 transaction. Investigate whether additional documents re: transaction/company are available for factual allegation/basis.
11/19/14	MAS	6.80	Continue drafting complaint re: 2011 transaction.
11/20/14	MAS	0.40	Review audited financial of Debtor in connection with drafting 2011 transactions complaint.
11/20/14	MAS	6.00	Continue drafting complaint re: 2011 Transaction including review of successful complaints in Del. cases on similar issues (from PACER).
11/21/14	MAS	0.70	Create spreadsheet to link 2011 transaction investor entities to related entities, debtor's board of directors, and equity holders.
11/24/14	MAS	0.10	Exchange emails with Bob Keach re: additional documents for 2011 transaction (debtor's counsel will forward).
12/08/14	MAS	0.10	Check status of additional 2011 transaction documents and email to Bob Keach re: same.
12/22/14	MAS	0.10	Review deadlines for filing complaint for breaches of fiduciary duty and fraudulent transfers.
12/23/14	MAS	0.30	Brief review of documents delivered from debtor's counsel re: 2011 sale.

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

01/06/15	MAS	3.20	Review additional documents produced by debtor's counsel re: 2011 Sale transaction and draft updates/revisions to complaint re: same (part).
01/07/15	MAS	1.50	Review additional documents produced by debtor's counsel re: 2011 Sale and draft revisions/additions to complaint re: same (part).
01/07/15	MAS	2.80	Review additional documents provided by debtor's counsel re: 2011 Sale and draft revisions/additions to complaint re: same as necessary (part).
01/08/15	MAS	0.50	Review additional documents produced by Debtor's counsel re: 2011 Sale transaction and related issues (part).
01/09/15	MAS	1.50	Review documents produced by debtor's counsel re: 2011 sale and related issues (part).
01/09/15	MAS	0.10	Confer with Bob Keach re: content of documents produced by debtor's counsel and lack of information on corporate records, noteholder records, etc.
01/12/15	MAS	1.10	Review documents produced by debtor's counsel re: 2011 sale and email outlining results to Bob Keach (completion of initial paper document review).
01/13/15	MAS	2.50	Review electronic database documents (CDs) re: 2011 rail line sale to State of Maine.
01/19/15	MAS	4.20	Review additional documents on DMS re: 2011 sale complaint, specific inquiry to find corporate organization and note/shareholder-related documents.
01/19/15	MAS	0.20	Exchange emails with Angela Stewart re: corporate record searches for 2011 transaction complaint and supporting documents.

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

01/20/15	MAS	0.50	Brief review of draft GERSCO plan support and settlement agreement.
01/21/15	MAS	0.30	Confer with Mike Fagone re: 2011 sale transaction complaint and strategy, factual issues, and legal issues related thereto.
01/23/15	MAS	0.40	Brief review of documents from Fred Caruso (DSI) re: 2011 sale transaction, corporate records and audits, related documents and exchange emails with Fred Caruso and Mike Fagone re: same.
01/26/15	MAS	0.20	Phone call with Fred Caruso re: MMA documents for 2011 sale, discussion of data room in Hermon, ME, need to review additional documents, and current documents lacking.
01/27/15	MAS	1.50	Review additional documents produced by Fred Caruso re: 2011 sale transaction and draft memo to Bob Keach and Mike Fagone re: current documents and next steps, including documents in data room in Hermon, ME.
01/27/15	MAS	0.20	Reviewing and categorizing electronic records re: 2011 sale documents from Fred Caruso.
01/28/15	MAS	1.10	Review summation documents re: board of director operations and board materials (relevant to 2011 sale transaction and surrounding periods).
01/28/15	MAS	1.80	Draft template demand letters based on two-step initial/final demand and email to Tim McKeon and Sam Anderson re: same and meeting to discuss preferences.
01/30/15	TJM	0.40	Draft email re request to continue hearings on 503(b) claims and confer S Anderson re same
01/30/15	TJM	0.30	Review Trustee's 506(c) motion and Wheeling opposition re same, and review cited cases re same

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

02/04/15	MAS	0.00	Review email exchange between trustee and Alan Gilbert re: Chubb insurance policy (related to 2011 sale transaction complaint) and exchange emails with Bob Keach re: same.
02/04/15	MAS	0.10	Exchange emails with Fred Caruso re: available documents and conference call with Bob Grindrod re: same (related to 2011 sale complaint).
02/05/15	MAS	0.10	Exchange email with Fred Caruso and Bob Grindrod re: conference call to discuss documents and information related to the 2011 sale.
02/05/15	MAS	0.90	Pull and review relevant existing documents and draft questions for tomorrow's conference call with Grindrod and Caruso re: 2011 sale (complaint).
02/06/15	MAS	0.70	Teleconference with Fred Caruso and Bob Grindrod re: 2011 sale, and related issues (supporting documents, etc.).
02/06/15	MAS	0.80	Review notes from conference with Caruso and Grindrod and draft summary/status memo to Bob Keach and Mike Fagone.
02/06/15	MAS	0.50	Review two document indices from Caruso, save spreadsheets, and email same to Mike Fagone and Bob Keach with comment.
02/12/15	MAS	0.60	Confer with Mike Fagone re: 2011 transaction complaint, documentary support for allegations, and areas to investigate further.
02/12/15	MAS	1.70	Draft revisions to 2011 transaction complaint following discussion with Mike Fagone.
02/12/15	TJM	0.40	Confer with S Anderson re motion to continue hearing re admin applications and changes and status re same
02/26/15	MAS	0.10	Teleconference with Matt Farnsworth (@DSI) re: improvement in position analysis.

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

03/03/15	MAS	0.30	Review Pebblier furniture case (concerning improvement in position analysis) and email same to Fred Caruso with note.
03/03/15	MAS	0.30	Review DSI's initial improvement in position analysis, exchange email with Bob Keach re: results, and follow up email to Fred and Matt at DSI.
04/02/15	MAS	0.80	Begin drafting preference complaint for Wheeling & Lake Erie Railway.

Total 01		112.50	

02 Asset Disposition

Date	ATTY	Hours	
10/10/14	WAH	0.40	Corresponding with K. Joyce re leased premises.
10/22/14	WAH	0.70	Corresponding with F. Caruso and S. Anderson re payments in connection with sale closing.
10/27/14	WAH	1.10	Coordinating application for title with respect to vehicle included in sale of assets to CMQ.
11/03/14	WAH	0.30	Corresponding with A. Cummings re title for vehicle sold to CMQR.
11/06/14	DSA	0.10	Reviewed e-mails and e-mailed F. Caruso concerning sale of note position (.1)
11/14/14	DSA	0.10	Reviewed e-mails concerning issues with LMS guaranty obligations and telephone conference with M. Hahn concerning issues with LMS sale (.1)
11/14/14	WAH	0.50	Corresponding with F. Caruso re purchase of MMAC payables under Third and Fifth Amendments to APA.
12/08/14	WAH	1.70	Drafting mortgage discharge for X-Ring Industries; corresponding with S. Anderson re same.

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

12/09/14	MAF	0.30	Call with M. Troy (FRA counsel) regarding sale price allocation; e-mail to J. Steen regarding same
12/10/14	DSA	0.40	Reviewed e-mails and e-mailed X-Ring concerning issues with settlement (.2); conference with Trustee concerning issues with X-Ring discharge and e-mailed X-Ring concerning same (.2)
12/11/14	DSA	0.40	Reviewed Sherbrook lease agreement and e-mailed Gowlings concerning issues with rejecting lease (.4)
01/07/15	WAH	1.30	Reviewing payments made to various creditor constituencies in connection with sale of assets and corresponding with F. Caruso re same.
01/20/15	DC	0.50	Search for parcel description of Derby railroad yard in Milo.
02/05/15	DSA	0.20	Reviewed e-mails concerning issues with BSB locomotive and status of selling same (.2)
02/06/15	MAF	0.20	Call and e-mail with R. Wertheimer regarding Loco 5017
03/30/15	DSA	0.10	Reviewed e-mails concerning transfer of inventory to MMA from RailWorld (.1)
04/13/15	DSA	0.20	Reviewed e-mails and conference with W. Hueske concerning issues with sale of RailWorld locomotives (.2)
04/20/15	RND	0.30	Meeting with R. Keach re: motion to abandon Hermon Parcel
04/22/15	DSA	0.60	Reviewed and made further changes to sale of locomotive agreement after changes made by P. Maxcy (.6)
04/23/15	DSA	0.30	Reviewed e-mails and changes to escrow agreement and e-mailed parties concerning issues with sale of locomotives (.3)

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

04/24/15	DSA	1.20	Reviewed e-mails and e-mailed parties concerning issues with Rail World escrow agreement (.3); telephone conference with P. Maxcy concerning issues with transfer of locomotives and settlement terms (.3); reviewed revisions to E. Burkhardt affidavit and e-mailed parties concerning same (.3); telephone conference with A. Addesky concerning issues with changes to escrow agreement (.3)
04/24/15	ALS	0.30	Office conference with R. Desai re draft motion to abandon rail tie (.1); review documents relating to rail tie (.2)
04/24/15	ALS	0.20	Email to R. Desai re service on motion to abandon (.1); office conference with R. Desai re service on motion to abandon (.1)
04/24/15	RND	2.90	Review closing documents and description of tie pile including potential liens on same; draft motion to abandon Hermon Parcel
04/24/15	RND	0.20	Meeting with A. Stewart re: service of motion to abandon property
04/24/15	TJM	0.20	Confer R Desai re potential liens on Hermon property and review file re same
04/27/15	RND	2.50	Draft motion to abandon Hermon Parcel
04/27/15	RND	0.10	Email with R. Keach re: Harmon Parcel
04/27/15	DSA	0.40	Reviewed e-mails and e-mailed Rail World concerning issues with locomotive escrow (.2); reviewed e-mails and e-mailed parties concerning issues with Monument Title as escrow agent (.2)
04/28/15	KAJ	0.60	Consult with DEP regarding 10/2014 air license surrender.
04/29/15	KAJ	0.30	Correspond with DEP regarding surrender process.

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

04/29/15	DSA	0.70	Reviewed release of deposit agreement for Canadian section of track (.3); reviewed e-mails and e-mailed parties concerning issues with escrow agreement for Rail World locomotives (.3); telephone conference with Monument concerning issues with escrow agreement (.1)
04/30/15	DSA	1.40	Reviewed and made changes to escrow agreement for sale of Locomotives and e-mailed parties concerning issues with same (.4); reviewed and made further changes to amended scheduling order after review by Wheeling (.4); telephone conference with D. Johnson concerning issues with same (.1); telephone conference with F. Caruso concerning issues with Wheeling collateral (.3); telephone conference with F. Caruso and D. Johnson concerning issues with same (.2)
05/21/15	DSA	0.20	Reviewed e-mails and e-mailed parties concerning issues with insuring locomotive 5017 and issues with transfer of Derby (.2)
05/22/15	DSA	0.20	Reviewed e-mails and e-mailed parties concerning issues with sale of locomotive to SQ (.2)
05/26/15	DSA	0.10	Reviewed e-mails and e-mailed parties concerning issues with sale of unit 5017 (.1)
06/01/15	DSA	0.30	Reviewed e-mails and e-mailed parties concerning issues with sale of locomotives (.3)
06/14/15	RND	0.90	Revise motion to abandon Hermon Parcel based on R. Keach's edits/comments
06/15/15	RND	0.70	Further revisions to motion to abandon Hermon Parcel

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

06/18/15	DSA	0.40	Telephone conference with VD concerning issues with storage and agreement for unit 5017 (.2); reviewed e-mails and e-mailed parties concerning issues with same (.2)
06/22/15	TJM	0.20	Review letter from J Fischer re request to remove property of the estate (0.1) and email Trustee re same (0.1)
07/17/15	RND	0.80	Revise motion to abandon herman parcel and prepare same for filing
07/17/15	KQ	0.80	Finalize, file and serve the Motion to Authorize Abandonment of the Hermon Parcel
07/20/15	DSA	0.20	Reviewed motion to abandon the Hermon Parcel (.2)
07/20/15	RND	0.10	Call from STB re: questions concerning motion to abandon Hermon Parcel; email to R. Keach re: same
07/22/15	RND	0.10	Call (voicemail) to STB re: answering their question re: abandonment of Hermon Parcel
07/24/15	RND	0.50	Review recent case law re: granting motion to abandon over objection
07/25/15	DSA	0.20	Reviewed e-mails and e-mailed Rail World concerning issues with turnover of inventory (.2)
07/27/15	DSA	0.30	Reviewed e-mails relating to turnover of inventory and locomotives by Rail World (.2); conference with T. McKeon concerning issues with sale proceeds for same (.1)
07/27/15	TJM	0.40	Research re agreement b/w Trustee and Rail World re sale of locomotives re escrow of funds
07/28/15	DSA	0.30	Reviewed e-mails and e-mailed parties concerning payments for locomotives (.1); reviewed e-mails concerning issues with sale of Derby (.2)

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

08/03/15	DSA	0.20	Reviewed e-mails concerning issues with damages under the rejection of railcar leases (.2)
08/04/15	ALS	0.10	Emails from/to R. Schneider re sale hearing
08/05/15	RND	1.40	Draft stipulated order with Maine DEP re: Motion to Abandon Hermon Parcel
08/05/15	RND	0.10	Meeting with R. Keach re: Motion to Abandon Hermon Parcel
08/07/15	RND	0.10	Email with R. Keach re: motion to abandon Hermon Parcel
08/11/15	RND	0.10	Review email from MDEP re: revisions to consent order on motion to Abandon Hermon Parcel
08/12/15	RND	0.10	Email with R. Keach re: revisions to proposed order on Motion to Abandon Hermon Parcel
08/24/15	LKZ	0.40	Emails (.1) and call (.1) w/F.Caruso re: rail tie parcel; review survey of same (.1); emails w/B.Keach re: same (.1).
09/08/15	KQ	0.20	Finalize and file the motion to pay for storage with automatic destruction
09/08/15	KQ	0.10	Prepare and send e-mail service related to the motion to pay for storage with automatic destruction
09/10/15	KQ	0.40	Draft and file the Certificate of Service related to the motion to pay for storage
10/13/15	DSA	0.20	Reviewed e-mails and e-mailed parties concerning issues with sale of unit 5017 (.2)
10/13/15	DSA	0.10	Telephone conference with B. Hochman concerning issues with sale of unit 5017 (.1)
Total 02		30.90	

03 Business Operations

Date	ATTY	Hours	
10/01/14	DSA	0.20	Reviewed e-mails concerning issues with insurance for Derby (.2)

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

10/03/14	KAJ	0.50	Meet with Attorneys Keach and Anderson regarding VRAP.
10/03/14	KAJ	0.10	Leave message for Attorney Tourangeau regarding VRAP and schedule.
10/06/14	KAJ	0.60	Call with Attorney Tourangeau to discuss schedule and substance of VRAP.
10/06/14	DSA	0.30	Reviewed e-mails and e-mailed parties concerning issues with Vermont transfer taxes (.2); telephone conference with K. Joyce concerning issues with VRAP status (.1)
10/07/14	KAJ	0.70	Correspond with Attorney Anderson and Mr. Caruso regarding short term deliverables for VRAP, including scope of work and draft Phase II workplan; review scope of work.
10/08/14	KAJ	1.20	Review proposed scope of work; meet with Attorney Anderson to discuss VRAP scope of work; call with Mr. Caruso regarding same; call with Attorney Fischer to clarify funding of VRAP completion (including any remediation).
10/08/14	DSA	1.50	Reviewed e-mails and environmental plans for Derby phase II (.2); telephone conference with F. Caruso and K. Joyce concerning issues with VRAP (.7); telephone conference with J. Fischer concerning issues with same (.2); conference with K. Joyce concerning same (.2); telephone conference with F. Caruso concerning issues with same (.2)
10/09/14	KAJ	0.50	Meet with Attorney Anderson regarding the 3 outstanding items to be completed before lease goes into effect. Review lease regarding same.

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

10/10/14	KAJ	1.60	Review Limited Phase II proposal; summarize feedback; call with Mr. Caruso; review document related to leased premises to compare against Phase II figure; provide feedback to Attorney Tourangeau.
10/14/14	KAJ	0.20	Correspond with Attorney Tourangeau regarding VRAP progress.
10/15/14	KAJ	0.40	Correspond with Mr. Caruso and Attorney Tourangeau to approve moving forward with VRAP at Derby.
10/16/14	KAJ	0.70	Review DEP requests regarding VRAP; review counterproposal; correspond with Attorney Tourangeau for confirmation on counterproposal details; correspond with Mr. Caruso regarding same.
10/17/14	KAJ	0.40	Review VRAP materials from TRC and correspond with Mr. Caruso regarding the same.
10/20/14	DSA	0.10	Reviewed e-mails from K. Joyce concerning issues with Derby environmental work (.1)
10/31/14	DSA	0.10	Reviewed e-mails concerning issues with continued insurance coverage for Derby (.1)
11/04/14	WAH	0.70	Corresponding with S. Anderson and F. Caruso re Maine Railroad Tax payments pre- and post-petition.
12/22/14	DSA	0.40	Telephone conferences with K. Joyce concerning issues with terms of VRAP (.3); reviewed VRAP consent of MMA (.1)
12/22/14	KAJ	2.70	Coordinate finalization of VRAP - review and revise Declaration of Environmental Covenants
01/05/15	WAH	0.70	Researching terms of Derby lease with respect to material alterations of premises.
01/12/15	DSA	0.50	Reviewed memorandum of lease agreement for Derby and e-mailed B. Keach concerning issues with same (.3); reviewed lease effective date agreement (.2)

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

01/16/15	DC	0.50	Obtain legal description of Derby Station for VRAP matter.
01/20/15	KAJ	0.60	Finalize exhibits for MMA VRAP.
01/20/15	WAH	0.30	Correspondence with K. Joyce re Derby lease premises.
01/27/15	DSA	0.20	Reviewed e-mails and e-mailed F. Caruso concerning issues with X-Ring payments (.2)
01/30/15	KAJ	0.20	Correspond with DEP on update regarding recording status.
02/06/15	DSA	0.10	Reviewed e-mails concerning issues with storage of locomotives (.1)
04/27/15	DSA	0.30	Telephone conference with M. Hahn concerning issues with insurance on locomotives (.3)
04/30/15	KAJ	0.40	Call with Attorney Tucker re: lease and DEP issues.
05/12/15	DSA	0.10	Reviewed e-mails and e-mailed parties concerning issues with air emission charges (.1)
05/14/15	DSA	0.20	Reviewed e-mails concerning the transfer of Derby facility to the Town of Milo (.2)
05/20/15	DSA	0.10	Reviewed e-mails and e-mailed K. Joyce concerning issues with Milo operations (.1)
05/26/15	DSA	0.10	Reviewed e-mails concerning issues with lease of crane to third parties (.1)
07/01/15	DSA	0.20	Reviewed e-mails and e-mailed parties concerning issues with insurance for Unit 5017 (.2)
07/01/15	TJM	0.40	Call w/ Nancy from AirGas re return of equipment (0.2) and review file re same (0.2)
07/08/15	DSA	0.10	Reviewed e-mails relating to insurance on Unit 5017 (.1)
07/13/15	DSA	0.20	Reviewed e-mails and e-mailed parties concerning issues with insurance for locomotive (.2)

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

Total 03 18.10

04 Case Administration

Date	ATTY	Hours	
10/01/14	ALS	0.60	Obtain pleadings in adversary cases relating to MPM Silicones case for M. Fagone's review (.4); office conference with R. Desai regarding pleadings from MPM Silicones case (.20)
10/01/14	ALS	2.70	Continue work on processing document production received from Verrill & Dana
10/02/14	ALS	0.10	Docket scheduling relating to response to oral argument notice deadline in Wheeling's BAP appeal
10/02/14	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alert
10/02/14	DSA	0.10	Reviewed e-mails concerning the VRAP of Derby (.1)
10/02/14	KAJ	0.20	Read NAA letter.
10/03/14	KAJ	0.20	Read NAA letter.
10/03/14	DSA	0.50	Conference with Trustee and K. Joyce concerning issues with phase II on Derby (.5)
10/03/14	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alert
10/03/14	ALS	1.20	Research for R. Keach relating to New England Compounding Pharmacy case
10/06/14	ALS	0.30	Telephone conference with Clerk at U.S. Bankruptcy Court in Massachusetts regarding request for transcript in Northern Berkshire case (.2); email to R. Keach regarding in Northern Berkshire case (.1)
10/07/14	DSA	0.30	Reviewed e-mails and e-mailed F. Caruso concerning issues with Derby phase II (.2); reviewed 2004 filings (.1)
10/08/14	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alerts
10/09/14	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alerts

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

10/09/14	DSA	0.10	Reviewed e-mails concerning issues with insurance coverage for Derby (.1)
10/10/14	DSA	0.30	Reviewed phase II for Derby proposal and e-mailed relating thereto (.2); reviewed e-mails and e-mailed parties concerning issues with same (.1)
10/10/14	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alert
10/14/14	DSA	0.20	Reviewed e-mails and e-mailed J. Fischer concerning issues with Vermont taxes and fees (.2)
10/15/14	DSA	0.10	Reviewed e-mails and e-mailed B. Keach concerning issues with review of Railworld financials (.1)
10/15/14	ALS	0.40	Confirm docket scheduling of upcoming hearings and objection deadlines
10/15/14	ALS	0.10	Email to T. McKeon regarding update to Rule 2004 motions contact list based on recent notice of appearance filed with the Court
10/16/14	ALS	0.10	Update docket scheduling relating to time and location change for oral argument in Wheeling & Lake Erie Railway appeal
10/16/14	ALS	0.40	Filing and service of Reply to Response to Order to Show Cause in Roy, et al appeal
10/16/14	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alert
10/17/14	DSA	0.70	Reviewed e-mails from T. Tardiff and others relating to pressure vessel certifications (.1); reviewed MEMIC report (.1); telephone conference with C. Lisman and J. Fischer concerning issues with closing fees (.3); reviewed e-mails and e-mailed F. Caruso concerning Vermont expenses (.2)
10/18/14	DSA	0.10	Reviewed e-mails and e-mailed parties concerning issues with Vermont invoices (.1)

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

10/20/14	TJM	0.40	Review letter from Canadian counsel (0.1) and email Trustee re letter and TC w/ Union Tank counsel (0.3)
10/20/14	TJM	0.20	Prepare for hearings re (i) setting administrative claim bar date and (ii) motion to intervene in World Fuel adversary proceeding
10/21/14	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alerts
10/21/14	KAJ	0.20	Correspond with Mr. Caruso and Attorney Tourangeau regarding work on Phase II.
10/22/14	DSA	0.80	Reviewed e-mails from F. Caruso concerning issues with payments on assumed contracts (.2); reviewed e-mails and e-mailed M. Fagone concerning issues with Railworld production of documents (.1); telephone conference with F. Caruso concerning issues with preference actions (.5);
10/23/14	BBC	1.10	Conference with Trustee re hearing dates in November (0.1); conference with court re: rescheduled hearing dates (0.2); draft email to Trustee re: rescheduled hearing dates (0.2); review email from Trustee re: rescheduled hearing dates (0.1); Conference call with A Stewart re: rescheduling hearing date (0.2); conference with T McKeon re: consent to continue hearing (0.1); call with the court re: rescheduling hearing dates (0.2).
10/23/14	BBC	0.20	Draft/send email to F Caruso re: September Monthly Operating Report (0.1); review email from F Caruso re: September Monthly Operating Report (0.1).
10/23/14	BBC	0.10	Review email from M Farnsworth (DSI) re: September Monthly Operating Report.

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

10/23/14	ALS	0.30	Office conference with B. Colwell regarding potential continuance of matters scheduled for hearing on November 18th (.1); telephone call to L. Stocker at U.S. Bankruptcy Court regarding matters scheduled for hearing on November 18th (.1); office conference with R. Keach regarding matters scheduled for November 18th (.1)
10/23/14	ALS	0.40	Office conference with R. Keach regarding amended verified statements filed by counsel to wrongful death claimants (.1); review docket for amended verified statements filed by counsel to wrongful death claimants (.2); email to R. Keach attaching amended verified statements filed by counsel to wrongful death claimants (.1)
10/23/14	TJM	0.40	Confer K Quirk and B Colwell re procedure and questions re adjournment of 11/18 hearings
10/27/14	DSA	0.30	Reviewed e-mails from F. Caruso concerning issues with carve out (.1); telephone conference with F. Caruso concerning issues with same (.2)
10/28/14	MAF	0.10	E-mail from and to M. Hahn regarding insurance on Loco 5017
11/03/14	DSA	0.10	Reviewed e-mails concerning issues with insurance for Derby (.1)
11/03/14	ALS	0.20	Update status summary of Rule 2004 motions
11/04/14	ALS	0.20	Update status summary of Rule 2004 motions
11/04/14	ALS	0.20	Office conference with T. McKeon regarding filing of consent motion to extend deadlines re 2004 motions
11/04/14	ALS	0.80	Filing and service of Consent Motion to Extend Time to file Responses to Trustee's Rule 2004 Motions

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

11/04/14	DSA	0.40	Reviewed e-mails relating to potential settlement with purchase of prepetition property (.1); reviewed objection to discovery requests filed by Slawson (.2); reviewed e-mails and e-mailed party concerning settlement of mortgage debt on previously sold property (.2)
11/05/14	DSA	0.20	Reviewed additional objection to 2004 examination motions (.2)
11/05/14	ALS	0.20	Emails from/to K. Quirk regarding Court's deficiency order on Motion to Extend Time and filing of revised proposed order
11/05/14	KQ	0.20	File via ECF the revised Proposed Order related to the consent motion to extend the deadline to respond to the Trustee's Motion for Rule 2004 examinations
11/08/14	DSA	0.10	Reviewed e-mails concerning issues with preserving data and upcoming hearings (.1)
11/10/14	DSA	0.30	Reviewed e-mails from F. Caruso concerning issues with insider payments (.1); reviewed e-mails and e-mailed settlement proposal on mortgage obligations from third party (.2)
11/10/14	ALS	0.10	Email to A. Cummings and K. Quirk regarding updated address for matrix
11/10/14	ALS	0.20	Review emails from T. McKeon regarding extended deadlines to file responses to Rule 2004 motions
11/11/14	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alert
11/11/14	ALS	0.10	Emails from/to J. Smith regarding handling of notices of appearances filed recently
11/11/14	ALS	0.20	Update status summary relating to Rule 2004 motions (.1); email to R. Keach and T. McKeon regarding same (.1)

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

11/12/14	KQ	0.50	Finalize, file via ECF and serve the Second Consent Motion to Extend Deadline to Respond to the Trustee's Motions for Rule 2004 Examinations
11/12/14	KQ	0.20	File via ECF the Certificate of Service related to the Second Consent Motion to Extend Deadline to Respond to the Trustee's Motions for Rule 2004 Examinations
11/12/14	KQ	0.40	Finalize, file via ECF and serve the omnibus reply to responses filed in response to the Trustee's motion for 2004 examinations
11/12/14	KQ	0.40	Draft and file via ECF the Certificate of Service related to the omnibus reply to responses filed in response to the Trustee's motion for 2004 examinations
11/13/14	ALS	0.10	Update docket scheduling relating to Order granting extension for Rule 2004 parties to file objection to Rule 2004 motions
11/13/14	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alert
11/13/14	DSA	0.30	Reviewed e-mails concerning issues with FRA carve out and sale of locomotives (.2); reviewed e-mails and e-mailed W. Hueske concerning issues with guaranty of LMS debt (.1)
11/14/14	ALS	0.40	Emails from/to T. McKeon regarding preparation for filing of Motion for Leave to file Amended Complaint, Amended Complaint and Objections to Claims (.2); email to (.1) and conference with (.1) T. McKeon regarding claims filed to date
11/17/14	ALS	0.30	Emails from/to J. Smith regarding preparation for Rule 2004 hearings (.1); follow up with S. Swander regarding preparation of hearing binder for November 18th hearings (.2)

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

11/17/14	ALS	0.30	Telephone call to U.S. Bankruptcy Court in Bangor requesting omnibus hearing dates for first quarter 2015 (.1); email to T. McKeon regarding omnibus hearing dates for first quarter 2015 (.1); docket scheduling omnibus hearing dates (.1)
11/17/14	ALS	0.30	Conferences with K. Quirk regarding filing and service of Consent Motion to Continue the Hearing on the Trustee's Motions for Rule 2004 Examinations of Slawson Exploration Company, Inc. and Devlar Energy Marketing, LLC and Consent Motion to Extend the Objection Deadline and Continue the Hearing on the Trustee's Motions for Rule 2004 Examinations
11/18/14	ALS	0.80	Review document management system for transactional documents relating to the State of Maine per M. Siedband's request
11/18/14	ALS	0.10	Email to T. McKeon regarding filing of revised proposed orders relating to Rule 2004 motions
11/18/14	ALS	0.20	Filing of revised proposed order relating to Rule 2004 motions (.1); conference with T. McKeon regarding filing revised proposed order relating to Rule 2004 motions (.1)
11/18/14	ALS	0.40	Review Court minute entries relating to fee applications and Rule 2004 motions heard on November 18th
11/18/14	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alerts
11/18/14	DSA	5.30	Reviewed e-mails concerning issues with phase II for Derby (.2); travel to and from Bangor and attended fee application hearings and hearings on 2004 examination motions (5.1)

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

11/19/14	DSA	0.40	Reviewed e-mails and documents relating to permits for pressure vessels for Derby (.1); reviewed e-mails and e-mailed parties concerning issues with payment of fees (.1); telephone conference with Bangor Daily concerning issues with status of case (.2)
11/19/14	ALS	1.30	Emails to/from R. Keach, P. McDonald and T. McKeon regarding preparation of subpoenas relating to Rule 2004 motions (.2); initial preparation of Rule 2004 subpoenas (1.1)
11/19/14	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alerts
11/19/14	ALS	0.30	Docket scheduling relating to deadlines associated with Rule 2004 examinations
11/19/14	KQ	0.20	Update matrix regarding credit address changes
11/20/14	MAF	0.40	Call with T. Shannon regarding SQ investigation
11/20/14	ALS	0.20	Conferences with T. McKeon and R. Keach regarding service of subpoenas relating to Rule 2004 motions
11/20/14	ALS	0.30	Email to T. McKeon with contact information for issuance of subpoenas relating to Rule 2004 motions
11/21/14	ALS	2.20	Preparation of subpoenas and acceptances of service for Rule 2004 motions, including coordination of service upon counsel for Rule 2004 parties
11/21/14	ALS	0.90	Conference with R. Keach regarding asset allocation (.1); review files for asset allocation reports (.8)
11/21/14	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alert
11/21/14	DSA	0.10	Reviewed e-mails concerning issues with allocation of purchase price between estates (.1)
11/22/14	DSA	0.10	Reviewed e-mails and orders entered in case (.1)

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

11/24/14	DSA	0.10	Reviewed e-mails concerning issues with reconciliation for payments to State of Maine (.1)
11/24/14	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alert
11/24/14	KAJ	1.10	Review Phase II report from the Derby facility.
11/25/14	KAJ	0.50	Correspond with Mr. Caruso and Attorney Anderson regarding Phase II report for Derby facility.
11/25/14	MAF	0.40	Call from Patrick Maxcy and T. Amlot regarding documents in Hermon and Derby (0.2); e-mail to chapter 11 trustee regarding same (0.1); e-mails from and to R. Keach and F. Caruso regarding document preservation (0.1)
11/25/14	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alert
11/25/14	ALS	0.10	Update electronic filing with file index prepared by B. Grindrod
11/25/14	DSA	0.10	Reviewed e-mails concerning issues with preservation of additional documents at Hermon and Derby (.1)
11/26/14	ALS	0.20	Review status of receipt of acceptances of service relating to Rule 2004 subpoenas
12/01/14	ALS	0.10	Update docket scheduling relating to hearing and objection deadline for Application of the CIT Group/Equipment Financing, Inc. for Payment of Administrative Expense
12/01/14	DSA	0.40	Reviewed e-mails and e-mailed parties concerning issues with environmental report (.2); telephone conference with F. Caruso concerning issues with preference actions and documents storage (.2)
12/01/14	MAF	0.10	E-mail to R. Keach regarding upcoming hearings

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

12/01/14	KAJ	0.80	Review Phase II for incorporation/resolution of our comments.
12/02/14	ALS	1.00	Preparation of email notice (including review of docket to determine contact list) to all parties regarding time and location change of December 16th hearings
12/02/14	ALS	1.10	Docket scheduling relating to administrative claim applications, including review of docket and Court's hearing calendar
12/02/14	ALS	0.10	Docket scheduling relating to extension of plan moratorium period
12/02/14	TJM	0.10	Confer with A Stewart re notice of rescheduled hearing re December omnibus hearing date
12/03/14	ALS	0.10	Email to K. Quirk regarding Order Establishing the Deadline for filing Administrative Claims
12/03/14	DSA	0.10	Reviewed e-mails and e-mailed parties concerning issues with settlement of mortgage obligations from X-Ring (.1)
12/04/14	DSA	0.10	Reviewed orders entered in case and e-mails concerning payment of fees (.1)
12/04/14	ALS	0.10	Update docket scheduling relating to document production deadline re Rule 2004 for Marathon
12/04/14	ALS	0.20	Docket scheduling extended deadline for Marathon Oil to produce documents pursuant to Order granting Rule 2004 Motion (.1); emails from/to T. McKeon re Marathon Oil (.1)
12/05/14	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alerts
12/08/14	DSA	0.30	Reviewed X-Ring settlement letter and e-mailed parties concerning issues with same (.3)
12/09/14	DSA	0.40	Reviewed and made changes to F. Caruso relating to the X-Ring payment (.2); reviewed e-mails from F. Caruso concerning issues with status of wrap up matters for case (.1)

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

12/10/14	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alert
12/11/14	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alert
12/12/14	ALS	0.70	Filing and service of Second Consent Motion to Continue Hearing on the Trustee's Motions for Rule 2004 Examinations of Slawson Exploration Company, Inc. and Devlar Energy Marketing, LLC (.6); conference with T. McKeon regarding service of Second Consent Motion (.1)
12/15/14	ALS	0.20	Update docket scheduling on Rule 2004 Motions re: Slawson Exploration Company, Inc. and Devlar Energy Marketing, LLC
12/15/14	DSA	0.30	Reviewed e-mails and notes concerning status of Railworld settlement (.1); reviewed orders entered in case and reviewed reply to opposition to amended complaint (.2)
12/16/14	DSA	0.20	Reviewed orders entered in case (.2)
12/16/14	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alert
12/17/14	ALS	0.10	Update audio file with December 16th hearing
12/17/14	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alerts
12/17/14	DSA	0.20	Reviewed e-mails concerning issues with filing operating reports (.2)
12/18/14	DSA	0.40	Reviewed e-mails concerning the status of settlements relating to plan of reorganization (.2); reviewed pleadings filed in case (.2)
12/18/14	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alerts
12/19/14	ALS	0.10	Email to R. Keach, M. Fagone and S. Anderson regarding Wheeling's Notice of Appeal to the First Circuit
12/19/14	ALS	0.30	Service of Consent Motion to Continue the Hearing on Lexington Insurance Companys Application for Allowance and Payment of Administrative Claim and to Extend Related Deadlines and Consent Motion for Entry of

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

			Consented-To Protective Order With Respect to the Trustees Motions for Orders Compelling Certain Parties to Appear for Rule 2004 Examinations and to Produce Documents in Connection Therewith upon email distribution list
12/19/14	ALS	0.20	Assist K. Quirk with filing of Consent Motion for Entry of Consented-To Protective Order With Respect to the Trustees Motions for Orders Compelling Certain Parties to Appear for Rule 2004 Examinations and to Produce Documents in Connection Therewith
12/19/14	DSA	0.20	Reviewed and made changes to motion to extend hearing date for Lexington claim (.2)
12/22/14	ALS	0.40	Preparation of Certificate of Service relating to consent motions filed on December 19th (.3); filing of Certificate of Service with Court (.1)
12/22/14	ALS	0.10	Conference with T. McKeon regarding filing of Trustee's status report
12/22/14	ALS	0.10	Follow up email to T. McKeon regarding document production deadline for SMBC relating to Rule 2004 Examination
12/22/14	ALS	0.50	Telephone conference with K. Joyce regarding deed information relating to Derby Shops facility (.1); review closing documents relating to Derby Shops facility (.2); emails to/from W. Hueske regarding same (.1); email to K. Joyce regarding requested deed information (.1)
12/22/14	ALS	0.40	Filing of Chapter 11 Trustee's Report on CCAA Proceedings with Court (.2); service of same upon e-mail distribution list (.1); preparation of Certificate of Service relating to Chapter 11 Trustee's Report on

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

			CCAA Proceedings (.1)
12/22/14	TJM	0.60	Draft, edit, revise and finalize for filing Trustee's Report on CCAA proceeding
12/23/14	ALS	0.20	Docket scheduling relating to statute of limitations on filing a claim for breach of fiduciary duty and fraudulent transfers
12/23/14	DSA	0.20	Reviewed e-mails concerning issues with Derby environmental report (.1); conference with parties concerning issues with recording discharge (.1)
12/24/14	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alert
12/29/14	DSA	0.40	Reviewed e-mails and e-mailed parties concerning issues with changes to leased premises at Derby and changes to VRAP (.3); reviewed e-mails relating to discharge of X-Ring mortgage (.1)
01/05/15	DSA	0.30	Reviewed e-mails concerning issues with Wheeling appeal of Travelers' matters (.1); conference with parties concerning issues with recording VRAP documents (.2)
01/05/15	ALS	0.10	Docket scheduling relating to telephone conference with Judge Nivison re Motion for Order Amending and Restating Consent Order Staying Proceedings Pending Appeal
01/05/15	ALS	0.80	Filing of Fourth Consent Motion to Extend Objection Deadline and Continue Hearing relating to the Trustee's Motions for Rule 2004 Examinations (.2); preparation of Certificate of Service relating to Fourth Consent Motion to Extend Objection Deadline and Continue Hearing relating to the Trustee's Motions for Rule 2004 Examinations (.2); service of Fourth Consent Motion to Extend Objection Deadline and Continue Hearing relating to the Trustee's Motions for

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

			Rule 2004 Examinations upon notice parties (.4)
01/05/15	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alerts
01/06/15	ALS	0.20	Review email from R. Keach regarding translation of press article (.1); return email to R. Keach attaching translation of article (.1)
01/06/15	ALS	0.20	Docket scheduling relating to continued hearing on Trustee's Motions for Rule 2004 Examinations relating to First Union, Union Tank, GE and Trinity entities (.1); review order relating to continued hearing on Trustee's Motions for Rule 2004 Examinations relating to First Union, Union Tank, GE and Trinity entities (.1)
01/06/15	ALS	0.20	Emails from/to W. Hueske regarding teleconference relating to the Motion for Order Amending and Restating Consent Order Staying Proceedings Pending Appeal (.1); review calendar event for same (.1)
01/06/15	TJM	0.60	Edit, revise and finalize letters to pro se admin claimants re scheduling of hearing.
01/09/15	TJM	0.40	Draft, edit and revise motion to continue hearing re Rule 2004 motions re Devlar and Slawson (0.3) and email Trustee re same (0.1)
01/09/15	TJM	0.10	Review email from local counsel to Devlar and Slawson re hearing on Rule 2004 motions and respond re same
01/12/15	TJM	2.40	Draft, edit and revise motion and FOO re request to extend moratorium period
01/12/15	ALS	0.20	Office conference with S. Anderson regarding transmittal of upcoming hearings to M. Linder (.1); email to M. Linder with upcoming hearings from Court calendar (.1)

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

01/12/15	ALS	0.60	Filing and service of Chapter 11 Trustee's Report on CCAA Proceedings and Consent Motion of the Trustee to Extend the Plan Moratorium Period
01/12/15	ALS	0.20	Emails from/to T. McKeon regarding documents produced in response to Rule 2004 motions
01/12/15	ALS	0.20	Organize documents forwarded by R. Keach regarding representation of wrongful death clients
01/12/15	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alert
01/12/15	DSA	0.20	Reviewed e-mails and orders entered in case relating to Wheeling (.2)
01/12/15	KQ	0.40	Draft and file via ECF the COS related to the third consent motion to continue hearing on the trustee's motion for Rule 2004 examinations of Slawson
01/12/15	KQ	0.40	Finalize, file and serve via ECF the third consent motion to continue hearing on the Trustee's motion for Rule 2004 examinations of Slawson Exploration and Devlar Energy
01/12/15	KQ	0.30	Finalize, file and serve the Chapter 11 Trustee's Report on CCAA Proceedings.
01/12/15	KQ	0.20	Finalize and file the Certificate of Service related to the Chapter 11 Trustee's Report on CCAA Proceedings.
01/13/15	TJM	0.50	Review email from counsel for SMBC and draft response re same
01/14/15	TJM	1.30	Research, draft, edit and revise Motion for contempt re SMBC failure to comply with Court order re Rule 2004 production of documents
01/14/15	TJM	0.10	TC w/ counsel for Irving re acceptance of service re amended compliant

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

01/14/15	ALS	0.40	Office conference with R. Desai regarding research In Re Nortel Networks case (.2); obtain and send In Re Nortel Networks docket for R. Desai's review (.2)
01/14/15	ALS	0.10	Email to T. Renfroe regarding service of MMA pleadings on 1/12
01/14/15	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alerts
01/15/15	DSA	0.60	Reviewed environmental notice for Derby and e-mailed F. Caruso concerning issues with same (.1); reviewed motion to withdraw the reference (.3); reviewed e-mails and orders entered in case (.2)
01/16/15	DSA	0.20	Reviewed e-mails concerning issues with withdrawal of the reference and issues with tracking freight revenue (.2)
01/16/15	ALS	0.20	Office conference with M. Siedband regarding review of electronic files for corporate records
01/16/15	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alert
01/16/15	RND	0.10	Emails with R. Keach re: team meeting on case
01/19/15	MAF	0.40	Prepare for meeting on open MMA items
01/20/15	MAF	1.00	Attend meeting regarding plan, various litigation, settlement agreements, and other case tasks
01/20/15	MAS	0.50	Review additional documents located by Aubrey Cummings and confer with Aubrey Cummings re: location of additional documents.
01/20/15	MAS	1.00	Meeting with Bob Keach, Sam Anderson, Mike Fagone, Roma Desai, Tim McKeon, and Will Hueske re: strategy, case agenda, discussion of remaining issues and timelines.
01/20/15	ALS	0.40	Continue search for corporate records per M. Siedband's request (.3); emails to M. Siedband regarding same (.1)
01/20/15	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alerts

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

01/20/15	DSA	1.10	Conference with Trustee and parties concerning status of issues in case and issues with plan filing (1.0); e-mailed parties concerning issues with claims (.1)
01/20/15	RND	1.00	Meeting with MMA team re: chapter 15 filings, Plan/D.S., and pending litigation in case
01/20/15	PM	1.00	Conference call with MMA team re. planning and staffing upcoming events.
01/20/15	TJM	1.00	Meeting w/ MMA Team re case status and project deadlines
01/20/15	TJM	0.80	Review Rule 2004 - doc production (0.5) and confer P McDonald re same (0.2)
01/20/15	TJM	0.30	Revise motion seeking to have SMBC held in contempt for failure to comply w/ Court order re comments from P McDonald and Trustee
01/20/15	WAH	1.00	Meeting with MMA team (B. Keach, S. Anderson, M. Fagone, R. Desai, T. McKeon) on case assignments, status, plan and disclosure statement, preference actions, and claims.
01/21/15	RND	0.10	Emails with A. Stewart re: filings for chapter 15
01/21/15	ALS	0.40	Continue research on Chapter 15 pleadings per R. Desai's request
01/21/15	DSA	0.20	Reviewed e-mails concerning issues with cancellation of insurance (.2)
01/22/15	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alert
01/22/15	TJM	0.10	TC w/ P McDonald re email from counsel for Arrow re Rule 2004 and protective order
01/22/15	TJM	0.30	Review email from counsel for SMBC re Rule 2004 and respond re same
01/23/15	TJM	0.10	Review documents produced by Arrow re Rule 2004
01/23/15	TJM	0.10	Email counsel for SMBC re failure to provide documents in response to Rule 2004 order

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

01/23/15	DSA	0.10	Reviewed motion for relief filed by Irving railroads (.1)
01/26/15	TJM	0.30	Review documents produced by Arrow re Rule 2004
01/28/15	ALS	0.20	Email to M. Siedband regarding MMA board material documents (.1); review email from M. Siedband regarding MMA board material documents (.1)
01/28/15	ALS	2.10	Search safety manual and related documents produced by Verrill & Dana per R. Keach's request
01/28/15	ALS	0.10	Email to R. Keach attaching article translation
01/28/15	ALS	0.10	Organize policy and procedures documents per R. Keach's request
01/28/15	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alerts
01/29/15	ALS	0.40	Telephone conferences (x2) with Clerk's office at U.S. Bankruptcy Court regarding omnibus hearing dates for April and May and hearings on administrative claims applications (.2); office conferences (x2) with T. McKeon regarding same (.2)
01/29/15	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alert
01/29/15	ALS	0.30	Telephone conference with K. Ford and L. Stocker regarding omnibus hearing dates (.1); office conferences (x2) with T. McKeon regarding same (.2)
01/29/15	TJM	0.60	Rescheduling hearing re Wheeling motion to enforce cash collateral motions and TR's 506(c) motion, as well as admin claim hearings, and confer A Stewart re same
01/29/15	TJM	0.10	Review email from counsel for Union Tank re continuance re Rule 2004 motion and email Trustee re same

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

01/29/15	TJM	0.10	Respond to email from counsel for Union Tank re continuance of Rule 2004 motion
01/29/15	TJM	0.10	TC w/ M Fagone re case status and strategy
01/30/15	TJM	0.10	Email Trustee re status of hearings re Trinity, Devlar, and Slawson re Rule 2004
01/30/15	TJM	0.20	Review file for transcript of hearing re May 8, 2014 and email Trustee re same.
01/30/15	TJM	0.20	Draft, edit and revise fourth consent motion continuing hearing re Rule 2004 re Slawson and Devlar
01/30/15	ALS	1.30	Work on translation of PowerPoint presentation and other articles
01/30/15	ALS	0.50	Update docket scheduling in World Fuels adversary proceeding based on Amended Pretrial Scheduling Order (.3); conference with T. McKeon regarding same (.1); emails from/to J. Smith regarding same (.1)
02/02/15	ALS	1.80	Filing and service of Fifth Consent Motion to Extend the Objection Deadline and Continue the Hearing on the Trustee's Motions for Rule 2004 Examinations and Fourth Consent Motion to Continue the Hearing on the Trustee's Motions for Rule 2004 Examinations of Slawson Exploration Company, Inc. and Devlar Energy Marketing (1.6); emails from/to T. McKeon regarding filing of consent motions relating to Rule 2004 Examinations (.2)
02/02/15	DSA	0.10	Reviewed orders entered in case (.1)
02/04/15	DSA	0.30	Reviewed and made changes to motion to continue response deadline for withdrawing the reference (.3)
02/04/15	ALS	0.30	Review emails from/to R. Keach regarding filings in U.S. District Court relating to Motion to Withdraw Reference

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

02/04/15	ALS	0.70	Filing of Consent Motion to Extend Time to File Responses to Canadian Pacific Railway Company's Motion to Withdraw the Reference (.2); preparation of Certificate of Service regarding Consent Motion to Extend Time to File Responses to Canadian Pacific Railway Company's Motion to Withdraw the Reference (.1); office conferences with R. Desai regarding filing of same (.3); email to R. Keach to confirm filing of Consent Motion (.1)
02/04/15	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alert
02/05/15	ALS	0.40	Telephone conference with Michelle at U.S. District Court regarding status of order relating to Consent Motion to Extend Time for filing of Objection to Motion to Withdraw Reference (.1); email to R. Keach regarding status of order on Consent Motion to Extend Time for filing of Objection to Motion to Withdraw Reference (.1); office conferences with R. Desai regarding status of Order on Consent Motion to Extend Time for filing of Objection to Motion to Withdraw Reference (.2)
02/05/15	ALS	0.10	Update docket scheduling relating to deadline to respond to Motion to Withdraw Reference
02/05/15	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alert
02/05/15	TJM	0.50	Prepare and send out emails to counsel for 503(b) claimants re continuance of hearing
02/10/15	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alert
02/10/15	ALS	0.30	Office conference with R. Desai regarding Transport Canada's Regulations relating to Transportation of Dangerous Goods

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

02/10/15	ALS	0.30	Filing of Consent Motion for Leave to File Response in Excess of Page Limitation with Court (.2); office conference with R. Desai regarding same (.1)
02/11/15	ALS	0.10	Docket scheduling relating to reply deadline relating to Trustee's Response in Opposition to CPR's Motion to Withdraw Reference
02/11/15	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alert
02/11/15	DSA	0.40	Reviewed opposition to motion to withdraw the reference (.2); reviewed e-mails relating to case (.2)
02/11/15	TJM	0.20	Email Trustee re MSDSs produced by ConocoPhillips, Enserco, InCorr and Arrow re Rule 2004
02/12/15	ALS	0.40	Office conference with R. Keach regarding pleadings relating to Motion to Bar Trustee's Prosecution of Derailment Claims (.1); obtain pleadings from docket relating to Motion to Bar Trustee's Prosecution of Derailment Claims (.2); email to R. Keach attaching pleadings relating to Motion to Bar Trustee's Prosecution of Derailment Claims (.1)
02/13/15	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alert
02/13/15	TJM	0.30	Review email from M Fagone to F Caruso re discovery requests from Wheeling
02/16/15	MAF	0.10	Call with M. Hahn regarding BSB lending relationship with Bangor Savings Bank
02/17/15	KQ	0.10	E-mail from and to M. Farnsworth regarding funds in IOLTA account
02/17/15	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alert
02/17/15	ALS	0.30	Update docket scheduling relating to Order continuing hearing and deadlines on Wheeling's motion to enforce cash collateral orders (.2); review Order continuing hearing and deadlines on Wheeling's motion to enforce

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

			cash collateral orders (.1)
02/17/15	TJM	0.40	Assist K Quirk re filing documents re Debtor's A/R
02/17/15	TJM	0.10	Email F Caruso re entry of order granting consent motion to continue hearing re Wheeling motion to enforce and Trustee's 506(c) motion
02/18/15	TJM	0.20	Review file re Order granting stay in district court proceeding and confer A Cummings re same
02/18/15	TJM	2.60	Confer Trustee re motion to extend deadline (0.1); Review case file and docket re background of proceedings (0.4); Draft, edit and revise motion to extend deadlines (2.1)
02/18/15	ALS	0.20	Office conference with A. Cummings regarding proposed order re stay pending appeal (.1); search document database for Word version of proposed order re stay pending appeal (.1)
02/19/15	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alert
02/19/15	DSA	0.10	Reviewed e-mails relating to continuing administrative claims bar date (.1)
02/19/15	BBC	0.10	Review email from M Farnsworth re: 18th MOR.
02/19/15	TJM	0.90	Review case file and docket re filings re FRA and Maine DOT lending relationship w/ Debtor
02/19/15	TJM	0.40	Finalize joint motion to extend certain deadlines in District Court case 13-mc-184, and prepare for filing
02/19/15	TJM	0.10	Confer K Quirk re service of joint motion
02/19/15	TJM	0.10	Review article from Trustee re Oil Trains
02/19/15	TJM	0.30	Review email from Court re joint motion re extending deadlines and confer w/ Trustee and A Stewart re same (0.2); TC w/ Court re same (0.1)
02/20/15	TJM	0.20	TC w/ Court re withdrawal of motion filed in error

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

02/20/15	TJM	0.40	Review file and research re motion to withdraw filing (0.2) and confer A Stewart re same (0.2)
02/20/15	ALS	0.30	Notarize Affidavit of Robert J. Keach re Motion for an Interim Stay of the Class Action suit (.1); fax Affidavit of Robert J. Keach to Patrice Benoit (.1); email to R. Keach confirming transmittal of Affidavit to P. Benoit (.1)
02/20/15	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alert
02/20/15	ALS	0.20	Docket scheduling relating to MMA's Response Deadline re: Irving Oil Limited's First Set of Interrogatories and First Requests for Production of Documents (.1); review email from J. Smith regarding Irving Oil Limited's First Set of Interrogatories and First Requests for Production of Documents (.1)
02/21/15	DSA	0.40	Reviewed e-mails and orders entered in case (.2); reviewed e-mails relating to updated financials for MMA (.2)
02/22/15	DSA	0.10	Reviewed e-mails concerning issues with Wheeling appeal (.1)
02/23/15	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alert
02/23/15	ALS	0.50	Obtain copies of amended plan and disclosure statement and related pleadings from New England Compounding Pharmacy, Inc. case for R. Keach's review
02/23/15	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alert
02/23/15	KQ	0.20	Finalize and file the Chapter 11 Trustee's Report on CCAA Proceedings via ECF
02/23/15	KQ	0.20	Prepare and send E-mail service of the Chapter 11 Trustee's Report on CCAA Proceedings

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

02/23/15	KQ	0.40	Draft and file via ECF the Certificate Of Service related to the Chapter 11 Trustee's Report on CCAA Proceedings
02/24/15	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alert
02/24/15	DSA	0.10	Reviewed e-mails concerning issues with Wheeling hearing on cash collateral (.1)
02/25/15	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alert
02/25/15	ALS	0.20	Office conference with R. Keach regarding obtain pleadings from CIT, GERSCO and New England Compounding cases
02/25/15	ALS	0.40	Obtain pleadings from Plan Supplement filed in the New England Compounding Pharmacy case (.3); email to R. Keach and W. Hueske attaching pleadings from New England Compounding Pharmacy case (.1)
02/25/15	TJM	0.30	Draft, edit and finalize Trustee's report re motion in CCAA proceedings re stay in Class Action
02/26/15	TJM	0.20	Finalize Trustee's Report re Canadian Court Order dated 2/24/15 and coordinate for filing
02/26/15	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alerts
02/26/15	DSA	0.30	Reviewed e-mails and e-mailed DSI concerning issues with preference defenses (.3)
02/26/15	KQ	0.20	Finalize and file via ECF the Trustee's Report on CCAA Proceedings.
02/26/15	KQ	0.20	Prepare and send e-mail service of the Trustee's Report on CCAA Proceedings (.1); draft and file the Certificate of Service related to the same (.1)
02/27/15	DSA	0.20	Reviewed e-mails concerning issues with preliminary review of plan by various creditors and reviewed operating reports (.2)
02/27/15	ALS	0.20	Emails from/to T. McKeon regarding continued deadlines relating to World Fuel

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

02/27/15	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alert
02/27/15	ALS	1.40	Email to A. Adessky attaching December 2014 and January 2015 Operating Reports (.1); update pleadings with December 2014 and January 2015 Operating Reports (.1); comparison between US Bankruptcy Court's docket and Monitor's website to determine pleadings not included on Monitor's website (1.2)
03/02/15	ALS	0.50	Filing and service of Sixth Consent Motion to Extend the Objection Deadline and Continue the Hearing on the Trustee's Motions for Rule 2004 Examinations
03/02/15	TJM	0.80	Draft, edit and revise consent motion to extend objection deadlines and continue hearing re Rule 2004 motions re Union Tank, First Union, GE and Trinity
03/03/15	TJM	0.10	TC w/ counsel for Shell re general case information
03/03/15	ALS	0.20	Obtain copy of Order Approving Disclosure Statement in New England Compounding Pharmacy case for R. Keach's review
03/03/15	ALS	0.10	Email to Monitor attaching Order Granting Sixth Consent Motion to Extend the Objection Deadline and Continue Hearing on Trustee's Motions for Rule 2004 Examinations
03/03/15	ALS	0.10	Update docket scheduling per Order Granting Sixth Consent Motion to Extend the Objection Deadline and Continue Hearing on Trustee's Motions for Rule 2004 Examinations
03/03/15	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alert
03/03/15	DSA	0.20	Reviewed e-mails from Trustee on train derailments and issues relating to claims objections (.2)

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

03/04/15	DSA	0.10	Reviewed e-mails and orders entered in case (.1)
03/04/15	ALS	0.10	Email to K. Quirk regarding update to email service list
03/05/15	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alert
03/05/15	ALS	0.60	Continue work on comparison of pleadings included on Monitor's website and U.S. Bankruptcy Court docket
03/05/15	DSA	0.10	Telephone conference with K. Joyce concerning issues with status of vrap for Derby (.1)
03/05/15	TJM	0.10	Review email from local counsel to Slawson/Devlar re continuing hearing re Rule 2004 motions and respond re same
03/05/15	TJM	0.40	Draft, edit and revise Fifth Consent Motion to continue hearing re Rule 2004 re Slawson and Devlar
03/06/15	DSA	0.10	Reviewed e-mails and orders entered in case (.1)
03/06/15	ALS	0.80	Emails from/to A. Adessky regarding request for complete set of pleadings (.1); continue comparison of Monitor's website to U.S. Bankruptcy Court docket (.7)
03/09/15	ALS	0.50	Filing and service of Fifth Consent Motion to Continue Hearing on Rule 2004 Motions relating to Slawson and Devlar
03/09/15	ALS	0.10	Office conference with T. McKeon regarding filing motion to continue Rule 2004 hearings relating to Slawson and Devlar
03/09/15	TJM	0.10	Review email from Court re scheduling of hearing re Rule 2004 motions and respond re same
03/09/15	TJM	0.10	Review email from local counsel for Devlar and Slawson re hearing on Rule 2004 motions and respond re same

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

03/09/15	TJM	0.20	Review and finalize consent motion to continue hearing re Rule 2004 motions re Slawson and Devlar
03/10/15	ALS	0.60	Continue working on compiling pleadings for transmittal to Monitor
03/10/15	ALS	0.10	Update docket scheduling relating to continued hearing on Trustee's Rule 2004 Motions relating to Devlar and Slawson
03/10/15	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alert
03/11/15	DSA	0.70	Conference with B. Keach concerning issues with preference demand letters (.1); telephone conference with F. Caruso concerning issues with status of settlements and case (.4); reviewed e-mails and orders entered in case (.2)
03/11/15	KQ	0.10	E-mail from and to Matt Farnsworth regarding balance in MMA escrow account
03/12/15	DSA	0.10	Reviewed e-mails from RailWorld concerning issues with changes to plan (.1)
03/12/15	ALS	2.30	Continue comparison of pleadings on Monitor's website to U.S. Bankruptcy Court docket
03/12/15	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alerts
03/12/15	TJM	0.10	Email F Caruso re hearing date re Wheeling Motion to Enforce and Trustee Surcharge Motion
03/13/15	ALS	0.30	Email to T. McKeon regarding deposition notice served by counsel for Wheeling & Lake Erie (.1); review deposition notice served by Wheeling & Lake Erie (.1); transmittal of deposition notice served by Wheeling & Lake Erie to A. Adessky (.1)
03/13/15	ALS	0.30	Filing of Consented to Motion to Amend Joint Pretrial Statement/Pretrial Order in World Fuel Services adversary proceeding
03/13/15	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alerts
03/16/15	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alert

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

03/16/15	DSA	0.20	Reviewed e-mails and orders entered in case and RailWorld comments to plan (.1); reviewed changes to settlement agreement made by CIT (.1)
03/17/15	ALS	0.20	Emails from/to C. O'Donnell regarding comparison of pleadings on U.S. Bankruptcy Court docket to Monitor's website
03/17/15	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alerts
03/17/15	ALS	0.70	Continue to work on comparison of Court docket to Monitor's website for additional pleadings to send to Monitor
03/18/15	TJM	0.10	Email Trustee re scheduling re April 7 deposition date
03/19/15	TJM	0.10	Confer with A Stewart re scheduling of case deadlines
03/19/15	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alert
03/20/15	ALS	0.10	Emails from/to J. Smith re upcoming deadlines in World Fuels adversary proceeding
03/20/15	DSA	0.30	Reviewed e-mails concerning issues with the status of CIT settlement (.1); reviewed e-mails relating to notice of settlements filing (.1); telephone conference with M. Seidband concerning issues with Wheeling demand (.1)
03/20/15	TJM	3.00	Review, revise and finalize for filing re Trustee's Report on Settlement Status and related exhibits and schedules (2.4); Emails w/ Trustee re same (0.2); Confer A Stewart re same (0.3); TC w/ Trustee re same (0.1)
03/20/15	TJM	0.10	Finalize mail service re Trustee's report re list of settling defendants
03/20/15	TJM	0.10	TC w/ US District Court re status of filing Trustee's Report
03/20/15	TJM	0.20	Email Trustee re TC w/ Court re status of filing

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

03/20/15	TJM	0.10	Review email from the Trustee re filing list of settling parties and respond re same
03/21/15	DSA	0.10	Reviewed e-mails and e-mailed parties concerning issues with Wheeling demand (.1)
03/22/15	DSA	0.10	Reviewed e-mails and e-mailed parties concerning issues with deposition of F. Caruso (.1)
03/23/15	ALS	0.20	Emails to A. Adessky attaching various pleadings from U.S. District Court for the District of Maine cases
03/24/15	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alert
03/24/15	DSA	0.10	Reviewed e-mails and e-mailed parties concerning issues with preference demands (.1)
03/24/15	TJM	0.10	Confer with F Caruso re service list re admin bar date motion and email re same
03/25/15	ALS	1.60	Download and organize pleadings from U.S. Bankruptcy Court's docket for transmittal to Monitor
03/26/15	ALS	0.50	Finalize organization of bankruptcy court pleadings requested by Monitor (.4); transmit pleadings to Monitor email distribution group via file transfer link (.1)
03/26/15	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alert
03/27/15	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alert
03/27/15	TJM	0.30	Confer with A Stewart re upcoming deadlines and case status (0.3)
03/30/15	TJM	1.10	Research and review file re identifying rejected contracts (1.0) and confer TR re same (0.1)
03/30/15	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alert
03/30/15	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alert
03/30/15	ALS	0.10	Email to M. Siedband re TSB Report and related documents
03/30/15	ALS	0.20	Emails from/to K. Quirk re filing of notice of withdrawal of attorney re M. Fagone

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

03/30/15	KQ	3.20	Draft, finalize and file via ECF the Notice of Withdrawal As Attorney of Record of M. Fagone in the matters involving the Ch. 11 matter, World Fuel, Wheeling & Lake Erie Railway and Red Shield
03/31/15	ALS	0.10	Review email from R. Keach re executed signature pages re settlement agreements for ConocoPhillips and Enserco
03/31/15	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alert
03/31/15	TJM	0.20	Confer with Trustee re ILL law re "good faith" settlement re release of liability
04/01/15	TJM	0.80	Confer Trustee, S Anderson and M Fagone re case status and strategy re Wheeling Motion to Enforce and Trustee Surcharge Motion
04/01/15	ALS	0.30	Review deficiency order entered by Court re Keach v World Fuel adversary proceeding (.1); office conference with T. McKeon re deficiency order re Stay Motion (.2)
04/02/15	ALS	0.20	Email to Monitor attaching recent pleadings filed in bankruptcy case and World Fuel adversary proceeding
04/02/15	DSA	0.20	Reviewed orders entered in case (.1); conference with B. Keach concerning issues with documents requested by Wheeling (.1)
04/04/15	DSA	0.10	Reviewed e-mails and orders entered in case (.1)
04/06/15	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alerts
04/06/15	ALS	0.20	Emails to/from M. Paione re scheduling of omnibus hearing dates (.1); email to T. McKeon re scheduling of omnibus hearing dates (.1)
04/07/15	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alert

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

04/07/15	DSA	0.80	Reviewed e-mails and e-mailed B. Keach concerning issues with Wheeling hearing (.2); telephone conference with G. Marcus concerning issues with Wheeling hearings (.2); telephone conference with Court concerning issues with continuing Wheeling (.1); telephone conference with D. Johnson concerning issues with same (.1); telephone conference with Court concerning issues with same (.2)
04/07/15	KQ	0.10	E-mail from and to Matt Farnsworth at DSI regarding MMA's escrow account
04/08/15	KQ	1.40	File via ECF 14 address changes for returned mail which served the Hearing Notice on the Disclosure Statement
04/08/15	KQ	0.30	Re-serve Notice of Hearing related to the Disclosure Statement for those parties whose original notices were returned in the US mail.
04/08/15	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alert
04/08/15	ALS	0.20	Email to Monitor email distribution group attaching pleadings filed with Court on April 7th
04/08/15	TJM	0.10	Review email from Trustee re April 28 status conference scheduled by court and respond re same
04/09/15	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alert
04/09/15	DSA	0.40	Telephone conference with parties concerning issues with Milo taxes (.1); telephone conference with F. Caruso concerning issues with Wheeling hearing and disclosure statement (.3)
04/09/15	BBC	0.10	Review email from M Farnsworth re: MMA 20th MOR.
04/10/15	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alert

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

04/10/15	ALS	0.20	Update docket scheduling for Wheeling First Circuit appeal based on briefing schedule issued by Court (.1); office conference with T. McKeon re briefing schedule (.1)
04/13/15	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alert
04/14/15	KQ	0.40	Update the matrix to reflect change of addresses for 6 creditors
04/14/15	LKZ	0.50	Confer with Bob Keach regarding case background
04/15/15	KQ	0.10	File via ECF the change of address due to returned mail for creditor American Industries Midland
04/16/15	KQ	0.20	Update creditor matrix to reflect address changes due to returned U.S. Mail
04/16/15	ALS	0.10	Email Amended Notice of Hearing to Monitor email distribution group
04/17/15	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alert
04/17/15	ALS	0.20	Review email from W. Hueske re draft motion to seal (.1); review service requirements on draft motion to seal (.1)
04/17/15	ALS	0.10	Emails from/to C. O'Donnell at Richter re receipt of pleadings filed on Bankruptcy Court docket
04/17/15	ALS	0.10	Office conference with T. McKeon re preparation for upcoming hearings
04/17/15	DSA	0.90	Reviewed e-mails concerning issues with continuance of administrative claims hearings (.1); reviewed and made changes to escrow agreement for Rail World (.7); e-mailed parties concerning issues with same (.1)
04/17/15	KQ	0.10	File via ECF the change of address for creditor Trinity Tank Co as specified on return envelope

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

04/20/15	DSA	0.50	Reviewed e-mails concerning issues with administrative claims and continuance (.2); reviewed e-mails concerning issues with operating reports and issues with changes to motions to continue hearings on administrative claims (.3)
04/20/15	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alert
04/20/15	ALS	0.40	Filing of Monthly Operating Reports for February 2015 and March 2015 (.2); emails to R. Keach and M. Farnsworth re February 2015 Monthly Operating Report (.2)
04/20/15	ALS	0.40	Filing and service of Seventh Consent Motion to Extend the Objection Deadline and Continue the Hearing on the Trustee's Motions for Rule 2004 Examinations
04/20/15	ALS	0.70	Telephone conference with L. Zahradka re omnibus hearing dates and upcoming deadlines (.1); office conference with L. Zahradka re upcoming deadlines (.1); emails to/from L. Zahradka re upcoming hearings and deadlines (.2); review calendar of events via CM/ECF (.3)
04/20/15	ALS	0.10	Emails from/to C. O'Donnell re transmittal of bankruptcy pleadings and related documents
04/20/15	ALS	0.40	Emails to/from M. Paione at U.S. Bankruptcy Court re scheduling of omnibus hearing dates (.1); docket scheduling of omnibus hearing dates (.2); email to T. McKeon re scheduling of omnibus hearing date (.1)
04/20/15	RND	0.90	Review closing docs re: tie pile carve out
04/21/15	TJM	0.10	Tc w/ counsel for Lexington Insurance re opposition filed against Disclosure Statement
04/21/15	ALS	0.10	Office conference with W. Hueske and K. Quirk re scheduling of sealing motion

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

04/21/15	ALS	0.10	Docket scheduling with respect to sealing motion
04/21/15	ALS	0.70	Docket scheduling based on recently entered orders relating to continuance of hearings and related deadlines on Rule 2004 motions and administrative expense applications
04/21/15	ALS	0.60	Review Court's docket (.3) and transmit pleadings to Monitor email distribution group (.3)
04/21/15	ALS	0.10	Emails from/to Lindsay re May 6th hearings re: Motion to Enforce Cash Collateral Orders & Motion for Order Authorizing the Recovery of Expenses
04/21/15	ALS	1.30	Filing and service of Third Consent Motion to Continue the Hearing on Lexington Insurance Company's Application for Allowance and Payment of Administrative Claim and to Extend Related Deadlines, Second Consent Motion to Continue the Hearing on Canadian Pacific Railway Company's Application for Allowance and Payment of Administrative Expense Claim and to Extend Related Deadlines and Second Consent Motion to Continue Hearings on Parties' Applications for Administrative Expenses and to Extend Related Deadlines
04/21/15	DSA	0.20	Reviewed e-mails and e-mailed parties concerning issues with sale of RW locomotives and reviewed consent motions on administrative claim motions (.2)
04/21/15	LKZ	1.50	Update case cal (.5); review draft pro hac (.1); review local rules for Bankruptcy Court for District of Maine (.9).
04/22/15	KQ	0.30	Update creditor matrix regarding returned mail with undeliverable or changed addresses
04/22/15	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alert

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

04/22/15	ALS	0.10	Email to F. Caruso attaching CCAA Plan
04/22/15	ALS	0.50	Preparation of MMA deadlines chart
04/22/15	ALS	0.30	Revise P. McDonald's chart of upcoming deadlines (.2); email to J. Smith re same (.1)
04/22/15	ALS	0.20	Send docket update and recently filed pleadings to Monitor email distribution list
04/23/15	ALS	0.30	Preparation of draft Sixth Consent Motion to Continue Hearing re Trustee's Rule 2004 Motions for Devlar and Slawson, along with proposed order and certificate of service
04/23/15	KQ	0.20	Finalize and file via ECF the Certification for Admission Pro Hac Vice for L. Zahradka
04/23/15	KQ	0.20	Draft and file the Certificate of Service related to the Certification for Admission Pro Hac Vice for L. Zahradka
04/23/15	KQ	0.20	Prepare and send the e-mail service related to the Certification for Admission Pro Hac Vice for L. Zahradka
04/24/15	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alert
04/24/15	ALS	0.20	Office conference with T. McKeon re preparation for upcoming hearing on 506(c) motion (.1); review supporting documents relating to 506(c) motion (.1)
04/27/15	ALS	0.30	Review summary of fees included in 506(c) motion (.2); email to T. McKeon re review of same (.1)
04/27/15	ALS	0.10	Emails from/to T. McKeon re SMBC's consent to motion to amend the complaint
04/27/15	ALS	0.10	Emails from/to J. Smith re status conference scheduled for 4/28/15
04/27/15	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alerts
04/27/15	ALS	0.20	Meeting with T. McKeon re preparation of hearing on 506(c) motion

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

04/27/15	ALS	0.50	Meeting with K. Quirk re preparation for hearing on 506(c) motion (.1); office conference with W. Hueske re preparation for hearing on 506(c) motion (.1); review email correspondence re 506(c) motion (.3)
04/28/15	ALS	0.30	Download bankruptcy docket and recent filings for transmittal to Monitor email distribution list
04/28/15	ALS	0.50	Listen to 4/28 hearing audio (.3); preparation of list of upcoming filings for notice/service purposes (.2)
04/28/15	ALS	0.10	Telephone conference with C. O'Donnell re service of bankruptcy pleadings and docket on a daily basis and Richer's service list.
04/29/15	ALS	0.30	Office conference with T. McKeon re: Motion for Leave to File Second Amended Complaint (.1); email to T. McKeon re procedure for entering consent to Motion via CM/ECF (.2)
04/29/15	ALS	0.10	Docket scheduling re deadline for parties to respond to the preference demand letters
04/30/15	ALS	0.10	Update docket scheduling re Wheeling & Lake Erie adversary case
04/30/15	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alerts
04/30/15	ALS	0.80	Office conference with R. Keach re translation of agreement (.1); translate legal services agreement (.6); email to R. Keach re translation of legal services agreement (.1)
04/30/15	ALS	0.40	Obtain transcripts and audio files of hearings for R. Keach
04/30/15	ALS	0.40	Email docket sheets and pleadings to Monitor email distribution group (.1); download docket sheets and pleadings for Monitor email distribution group (.3)

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

04/30/15	RND	0.60	Review audio re: 3/19/14 hearing on unofficial committee's 2019 motion and coordinate retrieval of transcript re: same
05/01/15	ALS	0.30	Emails from/to S. Anderson re proposed joint pretrial order in Wheeling adversary case (.1); email to M. Paione at U.S. Bankruptcy Court re oral argument in Wheeling adversary case (.1); filing of proposed joint pretrial order in Wheeling adversary case (.1)
05/01/15	ALS	0.30	Obtain pleadings filed in main bankruptcy case and Wheeling adversary case and docket sheets (.2); transmit docket sheets and pleadings to Monitor email distribution list (.1)
05/04/15	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alerts
05/04/15	ALS	0.10	Docket scheduling re disclosure statement hearing
05/04/15	ALS	0.10	Office conference with K. Bigelow re contact at U.S. Court of Appeals for the First Circuit
05/05/15	ALS	0.20	Email to Monitor email distribution group attaching pleadings and docket from bankruptcy case (.1); obtain docket and pleadings from bankruptcy case (.1)
05/05/15	ALS	0.10	Docket scheduling confirmation hearing date
05/05/15	ALS	1.70	Emails from/to L. Zahradka re MMA and MMAC service lists (.2); work on MMA service lists (1.3); emails from/to C. O'Donnell re service lists (.2)
05/05/15	ALS	0.50	Review Pre-Trial Scheduling Order entered by Court in Wheeling Adversary proceeding (.1); email to R. Keach and S. Anderson re Pre-Trial Scheduling Order entered in Wheeling adversary proceeding (.1); docket scheduling Pre-Trial Scheduling Order (.2);

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

			emails to/from K. Ford at U.S. Bankruptcy Court re Pre-Trial Scheduling Order (.1)
05/05/15	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alert
05/05/15	TJM	0.10	Email F Caruso re payments from Red Shield
05/06/15	ALS	0.20	Email to Monitor email distribution list re docket sheets for Wheeling and Red Shield adversary proceeding, along with Third Amended Joint Pretrial Order and Stipulations entered in the Wheeling adversary proceeding
05/06/15	ALS	2.90	Telephone conference with A. Adessky, C. O'Donnell and R. Keach re service/notice lists (.5); work on service list with respect to Maine District Court cases and contract counterparties included in service of sale documents (2.4)
05/06/15	ALS	0.20	Emails from/to J. Smith re upcoming deadlines/hearings
05/06/15	ALS	0.60	Preparation of attorney contact/mailing list for Monitor's review
05/06/15	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alert
05/06/15	BBC	0.70	Review service in MMA for notices of hearings and related pleadings.
05/06/15	KQ	0.30	File via ECF the Suggestion of Bankruptcy in the adversary matter of Keach v. Red Shield
05/07/15	KQ	5.60	Prepare schedule of parties in district court cases
05/07/15	BBC	0.40	Continue to review service in MMA for notices of hearings and related pleadings.
05/07/15	DSA	0.10	E-mailed P. Maxcy concerning issues with status of escrow agreement (.1)
05/07/15	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news release
05/07/15	ALS	0.60	Continue to work on service lists

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

05/07/15	ALS	0.20	Email to R. Keach re address list for Counter-Parties included on Contract & Cure Schedule (.1); email to A. Adessky and C. O'Donnell attaching address list for Counter-Parties included on Contract & Cure Schedule (.1)
05/07/15	ALS	0.90	Office conference with K. Quirk re list of counsel in Maine District Court cases (.1); review and revise list of counsel in Maine District Court Cases (.8)
05/08/15	ALS	0.30	Preparation of draft Amended Notice of Hearing re Motion for Entry of an Order Authorizing Filing of Settlement Agreements Under Seal
05/08/15	ALS	0.20	Docket scheduling proposed stay termination date filed in two of the U.S. District Court cases (.1); review Notice Terminating Stay (.1)
05/08/15	ALS	0.20	Emails to/from F. Caruso re employee lists (.1); office conference with R. Keach re employee lists (.1)
05/08/15	ALS	0.10	Update docket scheduling re deadline for Wheeling to file Reply Brief in First Circuit case
05/08/15	ALS	0.30	Email to R. Keach re Notice Terminating Stay (.1); email to Monitor attaching Notice Terminating Stay and docket filed in the District Court case (.2)
05/08/15	DSA	0.20	Reviewed e-mails and e-mailed parties concerning issues with Rail World escrow agreement (.2)
05/08/15	TJM	0.10	Email counsel for Lexington Insurance re follow up to voicemail re helping with solicitations motion

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

05/11/15	RND	0.10	Meeting with R. Keach re: drafting of Trustee's Report on CCAA Proceedings
05/11/15	RND	1.00	Draft and coordinate filing of Trustee's Report on CCAA Proceedings
05/11/15	DSA	0.10	Reviewed e-mails and orders entered in case (.1)
05/11/15	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alerts
05/11/15	ALS	0.10	Email to G. Ryan requesting addresses of MMA and MMAC employees
05/11/15	ALS	0.20	Office conference with R. Keach re address lists for MMA and MMAC employees (.1); reply email to G. Ryan re address list for MMA and MMAC employees (.1)
05/11/15	ALS	0.30	Telephone conference with Mary-Ellen at U.S. Bankruptcy Court re upcoming hearings (.2); email to R. Keach re disclosure statement hearing (.1)
05/11/15	ALS	0.60	Office conference with T. McKeon re filing of Amended Notice of Hearing on Motion for Order Authorizing Filing of Settlement Agreements Under Seal (.1); filing of Amended Notice of Hearing on Motion for Order Authorizing Filing of Settlement Agreements Under Seal (.1); preparation of certificate of service re Amended Notice of Hearing on Motion for Order Authorizing Filing of Settlement Agreements Under Seal (.2); service of Amended Notice of Hearing on Motion for Order Authorizing Filing of Settlement Agreements Under Seal (.2)
05/11/15	ALS	0.60	Updates email distribution service list (.4); email to C. O'Donnell re update to email distribution service list (.1); office conference with K. Quirk re updated email distribution list (.1)

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

05/11/15	ALS	0.20	Office conference with R. Desai re brief to be filed in Wheeling & Lake Erie adversary proceeding
05/11/15	ALS	0.30	Email to Monitor distribution group re docket sheets and recent pleadings filed in main bankruptcy case and World Fuel adversary proceeding (.1); obtain pleadings filed in main bankruptcy case and World Fuel adversary proceeding (.2)
05/11/15	ALS	1.60	Office conference with L. Zahradka re filing of retention application, service of solicitation motion and related pleadings (.2); work on service lists for upcoming filings (1.4)
05/11/15	ALS	0.20	Office conference with R. Desai re filing of Trustee's Status Report (.1); review docket for previous status reports (.1)
05/11/15	KQ	0.50	Finalize exhibits and file the Chapter 11 Trustee's Report on CCAA Proceedings
05/11/15	KQ	0.20	Prepare and send e-mail service of the Chapter 11 Trustee's Report on CCAA Proceedings
05/11/15	KQ	0.30	Draft and file via ECF the Certificate of Service related to the Chapter 11 Trustee's Report on CCAA Proceedings
05/11/15	KQ	0.40	Revisions to MMAC service list
05/11/15	KQ	0.30	Prepare service documents related to the US District Court cases
05/12/15	ALS	0.20	Emails from/to M. Paione re special set hearings
05/12/15	ALS	0.30	Emails from/to G. Ryan re employee lists (.2); email to C. O'Donnell re employee lists (.1)
05/12/15	ALS	0.80	Revisions to service lists

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

05/13/15	ALS	0.20	Obtain pleadings from New England Compounding Pharmacy case for R. Keach
05/13/15	ALS	1.40	Emails from/to R. Keach re service lists and email from Monitor (.1); update D&O contact list (.1); email to C. O'Donnell re update to D&O contact list (.1); continue work on service lists for upcoming filings (1.1)
05/13/15	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alert
05/13/15	KQ	0.50	Revisions to the schedule of parties who appear in the district court cases for the wrongful death claimants
05/14/15	KQ	0.30	Complete revisions to the schedule of parties in the district court cases
05/14/15	KQ	0.10	E-mail from and to M. Farnsworth regarding balance in escrow account for MMA
05/14/15	ALS	0.20	Update docket scheduling on motion to withdraw reference (.1); emails from/to T. McKeon re scheduling of oral argument on motion to withdraw reference (.1)
05/14/15	ALS	0.40	Email to C. O'Donnell re updated list of attorneys appearing in U.S. District Court cases (.1); review updated list of attorneys appearing in U.S. District Court cases (.3)
05/14/15	ALS	3.30	Continue to work on service lists in anticipation of upcoming filings
05/15/15	ALS	0.60	Update creditor mailing matrix (.3); email to C. O'Donnell re service lists (.1); review email from R. Keach re conference call re mailing lists (.1); office conference with R. Keach re participation in conference call (.1)
05/15/15	ALS	0.60	Email to L. Zahradka re pleadings from Androscoggin Energy case (.1); obtain pleadings from Androscoggin Energy case for L. Zahradka (.3); review docket in Androscoggin Energy case (.2)

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

05/15/15	ALS	0.20	Email to K. Ford at U.S. Bankruptcy Court re status of proposed Order on Motion for Leave to File Second Amended Complaint (.1); email to R. Keach and T. McKeon re status of proposed order on Motion for Leave to File Second Amended Complaint (.1)
05/15/15	ALS	1.10	Participation in conference call with L. Zahradka and A. Adessky, et al re service issues
05/15/15	ALS	0.90	Review service lists and outstanding issues in preparation for conference call
05/15/15	ALS	1.60	Translation of amended proof of claim form per R. Keach's request
05/15/15	ALS	0.40	Docket scheduling re CCAA Judgment on the Motion for the Convening of a Creditors' Meeting
05/15/15	DSA	0.10	Reviewed e-mails and orders entered in case (.1)
05/15/15	LKZ	0.70	Confer w/B. Keach re: motion to disband official committee (.5); confer w/A. Stewart re: same (.2).
05/15/15	RND	0.20	Research re: Delaware decision in opposition to Barnet; email to R. Keach re: same
05/18/15	BBC	0.10	Review email from M Farnsworth re: April MOR.
05/18/15	ALS	0.30	Docket scheduling re Prime Clerk retention application and Solicitation Procedures Motion
05/18/15	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alert
05/18/15	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alert
05/18/15	ALS	2.20	Preparation for service of solicitation procedures motion and Prime Clerk retention application

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

05/19/15	ALS	0.30	Emails from/to L. Zahradka re Trustee's response to committee formation (.1); review pleadings for Trustee's response to committee formation (.2)
05/19/15	ALS	0.60	Participation in conference call with A. Adessky and R. Keach re service lists
05/19/15	ALS	2.50	Additions to Richter mailing list spreadsheet (.7); email to A. Adessky and C. O'Donnell re additions to mailing list spreadsheet (.1); email to C. O'Donnell re claims contact list (.1); preparation of conference call, including review of Richter and BSSN service lists (.6); continue work on service lists for upcoming filings (1.0)
05/19/15	ALS	0.40	Review remaining service parties relating to solicitation procedures motion (.2); conference with K. Quirk re further service of solicitation procedures motion (.2)
05/19/15	ALS	0.30	Telephone conference with K. Felkel at U.S. Bankruptcy Court re Court's procedure for adding creditors to matrix after receipt of proof of claim (.1); office conference with A. Cummings re proof of claim filings and matrix issues (.2)
05/19/15	ALS	0.30	Docket scheduling re plan supplement filing deadline and solicitation procedures motion hearing and objection deadline
05/19/15	ALS	0.30	Transmit proofs of claims to C. O'Donnell via file transfer
05/19/15	ALS	0.40	Translation of Notice of Attorney General of Quebec and Prosecutor General of Canada for R. Keach's review

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

05/19/15	LKZ	5.50	Confer w/B. Keach re: motion to disband committee (.3)(.8)(.4); research re: same (3.5); review examples of same (.3); review Trustee's response to request to for Committee (.2).
05/20/15	ALS	0.30	Obtain pleadings filed in CCAA case for L. Zahradka
05/20/15	ALS	0.50	Telephone conference with U.S. Bankruptcy Court in Mass. requesting transcript from NECP confirmation hearing (.2); contact eScribers to request NECP confirmation hearing transcript (.2); forward transcript from NECP confirmation hearing to R. Keach and L. Zahradka (.1)
05/20/15	ALS	0.20	Emails to/from K. Ford at U.S. Bankruptcy Court re status of summons for SMBC in World Fuel adversary proceeding (.1); email to K. Bigelow re status of summons for SMBC in World Fuel adversary proceeding (.1)
05/20/15	ALS	0.10	Email to R. Keach and L. Zahradka attaching NECP Confirmation Order
05/20/15	ALS	0.40	Review pleadings filed in Tribune Company case with respect to Bar Date Motion/Order (.2); emails to/from L. Zahradka re Tribune Company pleadings (.2)
05/20/15	ALS	0.10	Email to C. O'Donnell requesting updated service list information
05/20/15	ALS	0.70	Review docket and obtain pleadings for L. Zahradka from Filene's bankruptcy case
05/20/15	ALS	0.10	Email to K. Bigelow re summons issued for SMBC in World Fuel adversary proceeding

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

05/20/15	ALS	0.20	Obtain Revised Proposed Findings of Fact, Conclusions of Law and Order Confirming the Third Amended Joint Chapter 11 Plan from New England Compounding case for R. Keach (.1); email to L. Zahradka re Revised Proposed Findings of Fact, Conclusions of Law and Order Confirming the Third Amended Joint Chapter 11 Plan from New England Compounding case (.1)
05/21/15	ALS	0.30	Email to M. Thibodeau at U.S. District Court re clarification of deadlines re Motion to Stay Order (.1); review District Court docket (.1); email to R. Keach re deadlines associated with Motion to Stay Order (.1)
05/21/15	ALS	0.20	Emails to/from L. Zahradka re CCAA Representation Order
05/21/15	ALS	0.40	Docket scheduling re SMBC related deadlines in World Fuel Services adversary proceeding (.2); review Summons issued by Court (.1); email to T. McKeon re docket scheduling pretrial conference, answer deadline, conference of counsel and proposed pretrial scheduling order deadlines (.1)
05/21/15	ALS	0.40	Revisions to certificate of service re solicitation procedures motion (.3); review service issues and prepare for supplemental service of solicitation procedures motion (.1)
05/21/15	ALS	0.40	Obtain pleadings from Tribune Company case for L. Zahradka's review
05/21/15	DSA	0.20	Reviewed e-mails and e-mailed parties concerning issues with Baker Newman fees (.2)
05/22/15	ALS	4.40	Further revisions to service lists, including email distribution and mail distribution lists

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

05/22/15	ALS	0.60	Revisions to certificate of service and exhibits re solicitation procedures motion (.4); filing of certificate of service and exhibits re solicitation procedures motion (.2)
05/22/15	ALS	0.20	Emails from/to L. Zahradka re service of amended hearing notice on motion to seal (.1); review certificate of service re amended notice of hearing on motion to seal (.1)
05/22/15	ALS	0.20	Obtain Victims' Committee related filings for L. Zahradka's review
05/22/15	LKZ	4.20	Confer w/B. Keach re: case status (.2); draft motion to disband committee (4.0).
05/26/15	LKZ	3.60	Revise motion to disband committee.
05/26/15	ALS	1.60	Update to service lists based on additional contact information forwarded by A. Adessky and R. Keach
05/26/15	ALS	1.70	Translation of Judgment on Application for Leave to Exercise Class Action per R. Keach's request
05/26/15	ALS	0.10	Emails from/to L. Zahradka re hearing transcript
05/27/15	ALS	0.30	Review email from L. Zahradka re engagement letter (.1); review documents relating to Quebec engagement letter (.1); email to L. Zahradka re engagement letter filed with U.S. Bankruptcy Court (.1)
05/27/15	ALS	0.30	Update docket re Wheeling adversary proceeding
05/27/15	ALS	0.20	Office conference with T. McKeon re acceptance of service received from SMBC (.1); filing of Acceptance of Service re SMBC with Court (.1)

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

05/27/15	ALS	2.30	Organization of cases cited in CP's Motion to Withdraw Reference and Trustee's reply to CP's Motion to Withdraw in advance of oral argument
05/27/15	ALS	0.10	Email to R. Keach re Plaintiffs Motion for Leave to File a Memorandum in Excess of Stated Page Limit.
05/27/15	ALS	0.30	Emails from/to L. Zahradka re entering appearance in litigation in District Court cases and CM/ECF registration requirements
05/27/15	LKZ	1.00	Revise motion to disband committee (.9); emails w/B. Keach re: same (.1).
05/27/15	TJM	0.60	Review invoices from Duvernay Reporting
05/28/15	ALS	0.40	Telephone call to U.S. District Court re hearing and response deadline re Motion to Stay (.1); email to R. Keach re hearing and response deadline re Motion to Stay (.1); update docket scheduling re Motion to Stay (.2)
05/29/15	ALS	0.10	Follow up email to C. O'Donnell re mailing lists
05/29/15	ALS	0.30	Emails from/to L. Zahradka re Committee filings
05/29/15	ALS	0.40	Emails from/to R. Keach re settlement status and need for assistance with correspondence re same (.2); review emails from K. Quirk re assistance with correspondence (.1); telephone conference with K. Quirk re assistance with correspondence (.1)
05/29/15	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alert
05/29/15	ALS	0.90	Obtain recent pleadings filed in the main bankruptcy case and adversary proceedings, along with the docket sheets for transmittal to the Monitor email distribution group
05/29/15	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alert

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

05/29/15	LKZ	1.40	Revise Motion to Disband Committee (1.2); confer w/B. Keach re: same (.2).
06/01/15	KQ	0.40	Prepare and file the Certification for Admission Pro Hac Vice for L. Zahradka
06/01/15	DSA	0.30	Reviewed e-mails and e-mailed parties concerning Shell's issues with confirmation (.2); telephone conference with J. Fischer concerning issues with status of hearings (.1)
06/01/15	ALS	0.20	Review email from C. O'Donnell re mailing lists (.1); emails to C. O'Donnell re mailing lists (.1)
06/01/15	ALS	1.80	Work on translation of May 27th Judgment in CCAA
06/02/15	ALS	1.60	Work on translation of CCAA documents for R. Keach
06/02/15	ALS	0.90	Work on updates to service lists (.6); review of service lists sent by C. O'Donnell (.2); email to C. O'Donnell re service list for late filed claims (.1)
06/03/15	ALS	0.50	Emails from/to B. Keach re request for CCAA claims (.1); review electronic files for CCAA claims (.4)
06/03/15	ALS	0.20	Emails from/to J. Geller re hearing on Motion to Seal
06/03/15	ALS	0.40	Emails from/to L. Zahradka re MMA logo for Prime Clerk website (.1); review documents from MMA re: same (.3)
06/03/15	ALS	0.50	Review email from S. Hopkins at Comcast Cable and R. Keach re same (.2); review schedules and statements (.2); email to R. Keach and F. Caruso re Comcast Cable (.1)

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

06/03/15	ALS	0.80	Review files for 2002 Asset Purchase Agreement and Rail Funding AAgreements per M. Siedband's request (.6); emails from/to M. Siedband re location of requested documents (.2)
06/03/15	ALS	0.40	Review court docket for upcoming hearings and objection deadlines
06/04/15	ALS	0.30	Email to R. Keach and S. Anderson re Wheeling's Motion to Compel re Settlement Agreements and Motion to Expedite Hearing (.1); review bankruptcy docket and obtain pleadings filed by Wheeling (.2)
06/04/15	ALS	0.10	Docket scheduling relating to Wheeling's Motion to Compel re Settlement Agreements
06/04/15	ALS	0.60	Review bankruptcy court and district court dockets and obtain pleadings for transmittal to Monitor email distribution group
06/04/15	ALS	0.10	Email to K. Quirk re filing of motion to disband committee
06/04/15	ALS	0.50	Translation of fee agreement for R. Keach
06/04/15	ALS	1.10	Service of Trustees Motion for an Order Disbanding the Official Committee of Victims
06/04/15	ALS	2.70	Update service lists based on lists provided by Monitor's office
06/04/15	ALS	0.20	Emails from/to J. LaHuta at Iron Star Excess re receipt of Trustees Motion for an Order Disbanding the Official Committee of Victims
06/04/15	ALS	0.10	Docket scheduling re Trustees Motion for an Order Disbanding the Official Committee of Victims
06/04/15	ALS	0.20	Emails to/from C. O'Donnell re service issues
06/04/15	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alert
06/04/15	KQ	0.40	Draft Notice of Hearing related to the Motion to disband the committee of victims

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

06/04/15	KQ	0.20	File via ECF the Trustee's motion to disband the committee of victims
06/04/15	KQ	2.60	Prepare service of the Trustee's motion to disband the committee of victims
06/04/15	KQ	0.40	Begin draft of Certificate of Service related to the Trustee's motion to disband the committee of victims
06/04/15	LKZ	2.20	Revise motion to disband committee (1.1); confer w/B.Keach re: same (.2); review NOH (.1); draft FOO (.5); confer w/A.Stewart re: filing same (.3).
06/04/15	RND	0.20	Email follow up with RJK re: chapter 15 call with A. Adessky and R. Clement and outstanding questions re: chapter 15 filings
06/05/15	KQ	2.50	Assist in preparation of service related to the Trustee's motion to disband the victim's committee
06/05/15	DSA	0.40	Reviewed motion to disband the committee (.2); reviewed e-mails and e-mailed parties concerning issues with discovery for Wheeling (.2)
06/05/15	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alert
06/05/15	ALS	0.50	Review docket entries relating to Wheeling's Motion to Expedite Hearing, Motion to Compel and Objection to Trustee's Motion to Seal (.2); telephone conference with K. Ford re clarification of same (.1); office conference with T. McKeon re Wheeling's pleadings and upcoming hearing (.1); docket scheduling hearing and objection deadline on Wheeling's Wheeling's Motion to Expedite Hearing, Motion to Compel and Objection to Trustee's Motion to Seal (.1)
06/05/15	ALS	3.30	Comparison of service lists from Monitor (.7); update MMA service lists (2.6)

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

06/08/15	ALS	0.60	Download Court dockets and pleadings and transmit same to Monitor email distribution group
06/08/15	ALS	1.80	Continue to work on service lists, including comparison of Monitor email list to US email service list
06/08/15	ALS	0.20	Review emails from/to R. Keach and L. Zahradka re notice issues and email from C. Goldblatt re XL policies
06/08/15	ALS	0.10	Review emails from/to R. Keach re translation of CP's Objection to MMAC plan
06/08/15	ALS	0.40	Translation of CP's Objection to MMAC plan
06/08/15	ALS	0.20	Office conference with L. Zahradka re Prime Clerk and service of future filings (.1); review email from L. Zahradka re retention of Prime Clerk (.1)
06/08/15	DSA	0.20	Reviewed e-mails and orders entered in case (.2)
06/08/15	KQ	0.30	Finalize and file the Trustee's Objection to Wheeling's Motion to Compel and Motion for Expedited Hearing
06/08/15	KQ	0.40	Draft and file the Certificate of Service related to the Trustee's Objection to Wheeling's Motion to Compel and Motion for Expedited Hearing
06/08/15	KQ	1.60	Work related to parties served who were served the motion to disband the victim's committee
06/09/15	LKZ	0.30	Review news reports on WFS settlement (.2); emails w/B.Keach re: same (.1).
06/09/15	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alerts
06/09/15	ALS	0.10	Update pleadings with Order Denying CP's Motion to Withdraw Reference

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

06/09/15	ALS	0.60	Preparation of certificate of service re Trustees Reply to Wheeling & Lake Erie Railway Companys Initial Brief (.2); office conference with R. Desai re filing of Trustees Reply to Wheeling & Lake Erie Railway Companys Initial Brief (.1); filing of Trustees Reply to Wheeling & Lake Erie Railway Companys Initial Brief (.2); email to R. Desai re filing of Brief (.1)
06/09/15	ALS	0.50	Preparation of certificate of service re notice of filing plan supplement (.3); emails to/from L. Zahradka re filing of certificate of service re notice of filing plan supplement (.1); filing of certificate of service with Court (.1)
06/09/15	ALS	1.00	Continue to work on MMA service lists for transmittal to Prime Clerk
06/10/15	ALS	0.40	Email to L. Zahradka re A. Goodling's email regarding service of motion to disband committee (.1); review list of non-operating parties (.1); reply to A. Goodling's email (.1); review reply emails from A. Goodling and L. Zahradka re same (.1)
06/10/15	ALS	0.60	Review L. Zahradka's email re service lists for chapter 15 filing (.1); preparation of service list spreadsheets for chapter 15 filings (.4); email to R. Desai re service lists for chapter 15 filing (.1)
06/10/15	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alerts
06/10/15	ALS	0.10	Office conference with R. Keach re inclusion of additional notice parties to service list
06/10/15	ALS	0.30	Emails from/to R. Keach re sale orders (.1); review CCAA docket re sale order (.2)

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

06/10/15	ALS	2.10	Review draft certificate of service re motion to disband committee (.2); preparation of Ex A to certificate of service for motion to disband committee (.2) update service lists (1.7)
06/10/15	KQ	0.60	Finalize service list and file Certificate of Service related to the Trustee's Motion to Disband the Victim's Committee
06/10/15	KQ	0.50	Prepare compilation of settlement parties
06/10/15	DSA	0.10	Reviewed e-mails concerning issues with claims filed in Texas and issues with CMQ (.1)
06/11/15	ALS	0.20	Email to R. Keach, S. Anderson and T. McKeon re UST's Objection to Motion to Seal re Settlement Agreements (.1); update pleadings re UST's Objection to Motion to Seal re Settlement Agreements (.1)
06/11/15	ALS	0.20	Review email from R. Keach requesting transmittal of Order Denying CP's Motion to Withdraw Reference (.1); email to P. Legault and P. Benoit attaching Order Denying CP's Motion to Withdraw Reference (.1)
06/11/15	ALS	0.70	Return call from Fidelity Explorer re service of pleadings (.1); emails from/to S. Anderson re call from Fidelity Explorer (.1); review lists of non-operating interests and insurers included in Plan (.3); review emails from additional non-operating interests and insurers re service of pleadings (.2)
06/11/15	ALS	0.10	Docket scheduling re continued hearing on Wheeling's Motion to Compel
06/11/15	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alerts
06/11/15	ALS	0.90	Revisions to service lists
06/11/15	ALS	0.50	Review Court dockets for scheduling purposes

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

06/12/15	ALS	0.40	Review email from R. Keach re transmittal of email to counsel for Settling Defendants (.1); email to R. Keach re same (.1); office conference with R. Keach re transmittal of email to counsel for Settling Defendants (.1); email to counsel to Settling Defendants re litigation status and proposed stipulated order (.1)
06/12/15	ALS	0.10	Reply email to A. Bayus re settlement agreements
06/12/15	ALS	0.20	Office conference with T. McKeon re preparation of signature blocks for proposed stipulated order in new litigation case (.1); email to T. McKeon re list of counsel to Settling Defendants (.1)
06/12/15	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alert
06/12/15	ALS	0.20	Updates to email distribution list
06/12/15	ALS	0.20	Update court file with recently pleadings in main bankruptcy case
06/12/15	ALS	3.40	Review of settlement agreements (3.2); office conference with R. Keach re organization of settlement agreements (.1); email to P. Benoit and A. Bayus re settlement agreements (.1)
06/12/15	TJM	0.50	Review file re signature blocks for settling parties re consent order re staying personal injury cases
06/13/15	ALS	0.50	Review and respond to emails from/to R. Keach re review of engagement letters and powers of attorney (.2); review electronic files for engagement letters and powers of attorney sent by Plaintiffs' counsel (.3)
06/14/15	ALS	6.80	Review engagement letters and powers of attorney sent by Plaintiffs' counsel and prepare summary regarding same

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

06/14/15	TJM	2.10	Review file re organize signature blocks for settling parties re consent order re staying personal injury cases
06/15/15	TJM	0.10	Confer with A Stewart re consented to judgment re signature blocks
06/15/15	TJM	2.20	Prepare and finalize order re stay of personal injury cases in US district court
06/15/15	ALS	0.10	Review email from R. Keach re update to chart re engagement letters and powers of attorney
06/15/15	ALS	0.20	Email to K. Quirk requesting pleadings from various MMA cases for transmittal to Monitor (.1); office conference with K. Quirk re pleadings for Monitor (.1)
06/15/15	ALS	0.10	Emails from/to L. Zahradka re Schedule A to Plan
06/15/15	ALS	0.20	Docket scheduling re oral argument scheduled in First Circuit case (.1); review notice from First Circuit (.1)
06/15/15	ALS	0.10	Review email from L. Zahradka re preparation for upcoming filings
06/15/15	ALS	0.10	Review email from L. Zahradka re draft sanction order
06/15/15	ALS	0.30	Review Plaintiff's Motion for Leave to File Amended Complaint and Motion for Emergency Hearing for docket scheduling purposes (.2); docket proposed objection deadline (.1)
06/15/15	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alerts
06/15/15	ALS	0.20	Update to master service list
06/15/15	ALS	1.10	Office conferences (x2) with R. Keach re further review of engagement letters and powers of attorney (.2); review emails from R. Keach re same (.2); review additional engagement letters sent and parties included complaint filed in new litigation (.7)

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

06/15/15	ALS	0.40	Office conferences with T. McKeon re signature blocks for proposed stipulated order on new litigation (.3); emails to T. McKeon re stipulated order (.1);
06/15/15	KQ	1.00	Obtain pleadings for transmission to the Monitor
06/16/15	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alerts
06/16/15	ALS	0.10	Office conference with T. McKeon re status of CCAA hearing on CP's request to order the release of records
06/16/15	ALS	0.20	Email to R. Keach, S. Anderson and T. McKeon re CP's Objection to Motion to Seal (.1); follow up email to S. Anderson re CP's Objection to Motion to Seal (.1)
06/16/15	ALS	0.10	Email to R. Keach re CP's Objection to Disclosure Statement
06/16/15	ALS	0.10	Email to R. Keach re Wheeling's Objection to Solicitation Procedures Motion
06/16/15	ALS	0.10	Email to R. Keach re Wheeling's Supplemental Objection to Motion to Seal
06/16/15	ALS	0.10	Emails to/from R. Keach re UST's Consent Motion to Extend Time to Object or Comment re Disclosure Statement
06/16/15	ALS	0.20	Review pleadings from newly filed Illinois cases
06/16/15	TJM	0.10	Review emails b/w Trustee and Canadian counsel re settlement agreements
06/16/15	TJM	0.20	Confer with A Stewart re Canadian hearing re motion to seal settlement agreements
06/17/15	ALS	0.10	Docket scheduling re Objection Deadline for QEP, Devlar, Slawson, Oasis and Marathon to Motion to Seal re Settlement Agreements
06/17/15	ALS	0.10	Docket scheduling re deadline for UST to object to disclosure statement

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

06/17/15	ALS	0.30	Review additional powers of attorney (.1); update summary regarding same (.2)
06/17/15	ALS	0.10	Return call to S. Phillips at Fidelity Exploration re service of pleadings
06/17/15	ALS	0.80	Review Court dockets for recent pleadings (.5); transmittal of pleadings to Monitor email distribution group (.3)
06/17/15	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alerts
06/17/15	ALS	0.20	Reply email to B. Hart at Hulcher Services re request for creditor's list (.1); review Court's creditor list (.1)
06/17/15	ALS	0.10	Reply email to K. Furburt at Allied World re service of pleadings
06/17/15	ALS	0.10	Reply email to R. Kox at Telus re request for pleadings
06/17/15	ALS	0.10	Reply email to Iron-Starr Claims re service of pleadings
06/17/15	ALS	0.10	Reply email to J. Jimenez at ArgoRe Ltd re service of pleadings
06/17/15	KQ	0.20	Re-service Trustee's Motion to Disband Victim's Committee to parties where the original service was returned by the USPO.
06/18/15	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alerts
06/18/15	ALS	0.20	Reply to A. Skoda re service of pleadings (.1); review email from A. Cummings re voicemail message from A. Skoda re service of pleadings (.1)
06/18/15	ALS	0.30	Review electronic files for MMA/First Union Agreement (.2); reply email to C. Kimball attaching executed MMA/First Union Agreement (.1)
06/18/15	ALS	1.70	Continue work on service lists for transmittal to Prime Clerk (1.6); email to L. Zahradka re service lists (.1)

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

06/18/15	ALS	0.10	Reply email to S. Anderson re request for recently filed pleadings
06/18/15	ALS	0.20	Reply email to S. Phillips at Fidelity E&P Company re service of pleadings
06/18/15	TJM	0.30	Confer with Trustee re objection to CP admin claim (0.2) and re reply re motion to seal (0.1)
06/19/15	TJM	0.20	TC w/ J Fischer re hearing on motion to seal (0.1) and parties request to remove property from Derby property (0.1)
06/19/15	KQ	2.30	Finalize, file and serve the Notice of Adjournment of Omnibus Hearing Previously Scheduled for June 23, 2015
06/22/15	KQ	0.30	Research related to service party for Saratoga & North Creek Railway as requested by M. Siedband and e-mail to M. Siedband regarding same
06/22/15	KQ	0.40	Draft and file the Certificate of Service related to the Notice of Adjournment of June Omnibus Hearing
06/22/15	ALS	0.20	Docket scheduling re updated deadlines for objections to Disclosure Statement (.2); emails from/to L. Zahradka re same (.1)
06/22/15	ALS	0.10	Emails from/to K. Quirk re email from J. Windgrove re Bloomberg question
06/22/15	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alerts
06/22/15	ALS	0.80	Compare letter from J. Webster and engagement letters to summary of engagement letters (.6); email to R. Keach re comparison of same (.1); office conference with R. Keach re review of additional engagement letters (.1)
06/22/15	ALS	0.30	Review upcoming deadlines in main bankruptcy case and adversary cases
06/22/15	TJM	0.10	Confer w/ Trustee re settlement agreement w/ GA

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

06/22/15	TJM	1.60	Edit and revise insurance settlement agreement
06/23/15	ALS	0.10	Docket scheduling re service of process deadline in Roy case
06/23/15	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alerts
06/23/15	ALS	0.10	Reply email to R. Keach re CBC video
06/23/15	ALS	0.10	Return call to A. Skoda re service of pleadings
06/23/15	KQ	0.40	Review service returned by the US Post Office and update service lists
06/23/15	KQ	0.10	E-mail from and to M. Farnsworth at DSI regarding the escrow account
06/23/15	LKZ	0.30	Review article re: criminal charges (.1); review emails re: case update (.1); confer w/B.Keach re: same (.1).
06/24/15	DSA	0.40	Reviewed e-mails concerning issues with debtor's financials for operating report (.1) ; reviewed motion to dismiss filed by CP (.3)
06/24/15	ALS	0.20	Emails from/to R. Keach re article on Irving Oil
06/24/15	ALS	0.80	Preparation of contact list of Counsel to Settling Defendants for R. Keach's review
06/24/15	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alerts
06/24/15	BBC	0.10	Review email from M Farnsworth re: May MOR.
06/25/15	ALS	1.70	Compare summary of engagement letters/powers of attorney to attachments to Statement of Jeffrey Sternklar
06/25/15	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alert
06/25/15	DSA	0.20	Reviewed supplemental filings relating to representation of wrongful death claimants (.2)
06/25/15	KQ	0.30	Finalize and file the Third Consent Motion to Continue CP's application for allowance and payment of administrative claim

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

06/25/15	KQ	0.40	Prepare and send e-mail service of the Third Consent Motion to Continue CP's application for allowance and payment of administrative claim
06/25/15	KQ	0.30	Draft and file the Certificate of Service related to the third consent motion to continue CP's application for allowance and payment of administrative claim
06/25/15	RND	0.10	Meeting with UST re: motion to seal settlement agreements
06/26/15	DSA	0.20	Reviewed e-mails and orders entered in case (.1); reviewed e-mails and e-mailed parties concerning issues with insurance on locomotive 5017 (.1)
06/26/15	ALS	0.10	Emails from/to L. Zahradka re service lists
06/26/15	ALS	0.10	Review email from R. Keach re CP's Motion to Dismiss
06/29/15	ALS	0.10	Emails from/to R. Keach re redacted settlement agreement
06/29/15	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alert
06/29/15	DSA	0.40	Reviewed e-mails and e-mailed parties concerning issues with Canadian receivables (.1); telephone conference with F. Caruso concerning issues with Wheeling claims (.3)
06/29/15	RND	0.10	Email with F. Caruso and R. Clement re: Canadian bank accounts in US
06/30/15	DSA	0.10	Reviewed motion to amend complaint filed by wrongful death parties (.1)
06/30/15	ALS	0.20	Emails from/to R. Keach re pleadings from Madoff adversary proceeding
07/01/15	ALS	0.10	Email to A. Cummings re contact list
07/01/15	TJM	0.10	Call w/ A Cummings re stipulated order
07/02/15	ALS	0.70	Review CP's filings via EDGAR and SEDAR
07/02/15	ALS	0.10	Email to B. Keach and T. McKeon re CP annual reports and related filings

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

07/02/15	ALS	0.10	Email to R. Keach attaching proposed order on Wheeling & Lake Erie Railway Company's Motion to Enforce Cash Collateral Orders
07/02/15	ALS	0.20	Email to R. Keach re pleadings relating to sale and bid procedures
07/06/15	ALS	0.20	Office conference with L. Zahradka re Monitor's website (.1); email to L. Zahradka re link to Monitor's website (.1)
07/06/15	ALS	0.20	Emails from/to L. Zahradka re extension to objection deadlines with respect to Disclosure Statement and Sealing Motion
07/06/15	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alerts
07/06/15	ALS	0.10	Update docket scheduling re deadline for Committee to file Objection to Disclosure Statement & Sealing Motion
07/06/15	ALS	0.20	Preparation of translation of CP's motion to seek leave to appeal Justice Dumais' order on the communication of settlement agreements (.1); email to R. Keach re translation of CP's motion to seek leave to appeal Justice Dumais' order on the communication of settlement agreements (.1)
07/06/15	DSA	0.20	Reviewed e-mails concerning issues with lease of L. Bell and e-mails relating to transfer of cases (.2)
07/07/15	KQ	0.50	Draft and file the Certificate of Service via ECF related to the Trustee's omnibus reply to objections to the motion to seal
07/07/15	ALS	0.80	Prepare service list re filed and scheduled claims for Prime Clerk
07/07/15	ALS	0.20	Email to S. Travitsky re service lists re CCAA claims (.1); telephone conference with S. Travitsky re service lists re CCAA claims (.1)
07/07/15	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alert

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

07/07/15	ALS	0.20	Telephone conference with L. Zahradka re Wheeling pleadings
07/07/15	TJM	0.40	Review/Research case file re information re amount owed to Wheeling
07/08/15	ALS	0.20	Email to R. Keach and MMA team re change in hearing location for hearings on July 21st
07/08/15	ALS	4.90	Continue to work on service lists for Prime Clerk, including review of claims analysis and proofs of claims
07/08/15	KQ	0.20	Draft the Amended Notice of Hearing related to the motion to disband the victim's committee
07/08/15	KQ	1.80	Work related to the publication notice, multiple e-mails and call to newspaper publications
07/09/15	KQ	0.10	E-mail to L. Zahradka regarding printing of the publication notice in Canadian papers and related deadlines
07/09/15	KQ	0.10	Revisions to Amended Notice of Hearing related to the Motion to Disband and e-mail to L. Zahradka regarding same.
07/09/15	DSA	0.50	Reviewed consent of wrongful death victims to motion to disband the committee (.2); reviewed omnibus reply to motion to seal (.2); reviewed changes to WD Trust agreement filed with the Court (.1)
07/09/15	ALS	0.20	Email to R. Keach and L. Zahradka re Joinder of Derailment Wrongful Death Claimants to Trustee's Motion for Order Disbanding the Official Committee of Victims (.1); update pleadings with Joinder of Derailment Wrongful Death Claimants to Trustee's Motion for Order Disbanding the Official Committee of Victims (.1)

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

07/09/15	ALS	0.10	Email to K. Quirk re preparation of certificate of service re recent filings
07/09/15	ALS	0.30	Emails to/from R. Keach re transmittal of CCAA claims to M. Toups (.1); transmit file transfer link to M. Toups re access to CCAA claims (.2)
07/10/15	KQ	0.20	File via ECF the Amended Notice of Hearing related to the motion to disband the victim's committee
07/10/15	KQ	1.20	Prepare and send US mail and electronic mail service of the Amended Notice of Hearing related to the motion to disband the victim's committee
07/10/15	KQ	0.30	Finalize and file the Certificate of Service related to the Amended Notice of Hearing related to the motion to disband the victim's committee
07/13/15	KQ	0.60	Work related to translation of Canadian pleadings from French to English
07/13/15	KQ	0.20	Office conference with L. Zahradka regarding printing of publication notice in various US and Canadian papers.
07/13/15	KQ	0.20	Telephone call with A. Duchene at NiwriMedia regarding schedules and deadlines for printing publication notice
07/13/15	KQ	0.10	E-mail to F. Caruso regarding payment of publication notices
07/13/15	DSA	0.20	Reviewed motion to disband the committee and related documents (.2)
07/13/15	RND	0.30	Meeting with R. Keach and S. Anderson re: recent decision denying CP's motion on jurisdiction in MMA Canada case
07/14/15	RND	1.20	Draft and assemble Trustee's Report on CCAA Proceedings re: Plan Sanction Order and Order Denying CP's Jurisdiction Motion

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

07/14/15	RND	0.10	Email with R. Keach re: drafting Trustee's report on CCAA proceedings
07/14/15	KQ	0.20	Multiple e-mails from and to L. Zahradka regarding publication notice
07/14/15	KQ	1.80	Multiple calls and e-mails to 5 Canadian newspapers regarding printing of publication notice and e-mails to B. Keach and L. Zahradka regarding same.
07/14/15	KQ	0.20	Prepare and send e-mail service of the Trustee's report on CCAA proceedings
07/14/15	KQ	0.30	Finalize and file the Certificate of Service related to the Trustee's report on CCAA proceedings
07/14/15	KQ	0.20	Finalize and file the Trustee's report on CCAA proceedings
07/14/15	LKZ	0.50	Review responses to motion to disband (.4); emails w/B.Keach re: same (.1).
07/15/15	KQ	0.10	E-mail to L. Zahradka regarding service list for Prime Clerk
07/15/15	KQ	1.80	Preparation of documents to be used in disclosure statement hearings
07/15/15	KQ	0.30	Multiple e-mails from and to C. Pullo at Prime Clerk and L. Zahradka regarding service of solicitation packages
07/15/15	DSA	0.30	Reviewed joinder to motion to seal filed by Trinity (.1); reviewed objection to motion to seal filed by the committee (.2)
07/17/15	DSA	0.40	Reviewed e-mails and e-mailed DSI concerning issues with preference claims (.2); reviewed e-mails concerning issues with funding under proposed plan and fee applications (.2)
07/17/15	KQ	0.10	E-mail from and to M. Farnsworth at DSI regarding MMA escrow account
07/17/15	KQ	0.50	Obtain pleadings from the docket and forward same to the Monitor

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

07/17/15	KQ	0.10	E-mail from and to L. Zahradka regarding status of publication notes and calendaring of deadline dates related to the motion to disband
07/17/15	KQ	0.10	E-mail to Monitor forwarding MMA pleadings
07/20/15	LKZ	0.50	Call with creditor constituency re: service question (.3); emails w/K.Quirk re: same (.2).
07/20/15	BBC	0.60	Review pre-petition agreements relating to Irving Railroads.
07/20/15	BBC	0.10	Review email from M Farnsworth re: June monthly operating report.
07/21/15	KQ	1.30	Prepare exhibits for the opposition to Canadian Pacific's motion to dismiss
07/21/15	KQ	0.20	Telephone calls and e-mails to and from the district court regarding filing the Trustee's report re: transfer
07/21/15	KQ	0.10	Telephone call from M. Henderson (VerrillDana paralegal) regarding matrix for Ch. 15 filing
07/21/15	KQ	0.50	Finalize and file the Trustee's Report on the Status of Case Transfer (District Court)
07/21/15	RND	0.70	Review/revise stipulated order amending and restating order staying proceedings (derailment litigation)
07/21/15	RND	5.10	Continue reviewing/revising Joint motion for entry of Stipulated Second Amended and Restated Order staying proceedings and prepare same for filing
07/21/15	TJM	0.10	Email F Caruso re location/information re Airgas canisters
07/22/15	TJM	0.30	Confer Trustee re report filed w/ D. ME (0.1) and confer R Desai re same (0.1) and confer K Quirk re same re TC w/ court re contents of motion (0.1)

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

07/22/15	KQ	0.50	Finalize and file via ECF the Confirmation Hearing Notice and Confirmation Hearing Notice for Derailment Claims
07/22/15	KQ	0.10	Obtain from the docket and forward to T. McKeon the Ch. 11 Trustee's Report on the Status of Case Transfer as filed with the district court.
07/22/15	KQ	0.10	Telephone call to and from the District Court regarding the joint motion filed on 7/21 to verify the consent of all parties
07/22/15	DSA	0.60	Reviewed e-mails and e-mailed parties concerning issues with new value and status of preference settlements (.2); reviewed and made further changes to preference complaint template (.2); reviewed e-mails and e-mailed parties concerning issues with Rail World parts request (.2)
07/23/15	ALS	0.20	Update docket scheduling with respect to upcoming hearings
07/23/15	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alerts
07/23/15	TJM	0.10	Respond to email from F Caruso re AirGas
07/24/15	RND	0.40	Draft Trustee's report re: unofficial translation of plan sanction order
07/24/15	ALS	0.10	Docket scheduling Wheeling's Motion to Dismiss Adversary Proceeding
07/24/15	DSA	0.90	Reviewed e-mails and e-mailed Trustee concerning issues with preference settlements for various parties (.3); conference with B. Keach concerning issues with preference settlements (.1); conference with M. Seidband concerning issues with same (.1); began reviewing sanctions order (.3); reviewed e-mails concerning issues with sale of Derby to Milo (.1)

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

07/24/15	KQ	0.30	Finalize, file and serve the Chapter 11 Trustee's Report on CCAA Proceedings
07/24/15	KQ	0.30	Draft and file the Certificate of Service related to the Chapter 11 Trustee's Report on CCAA Proceedings
07/27/15	ALS	0.10	Emails to/from R. Desai re abandonment of Herman parcel
07/27/15	ALS	0.20	Emails from/to L. Zahradka and K. Quirk re certification of publication (.1); review Local Rules re certificates of service (.1)
07/27/15	ALS	0.30	Emails from/to R. Keach re translation of CP's Motion for Leave to Appeal Judgment of the Superior Court (.1); translation of CP's Motion for Leave to Appeal Judgment of the Superior Court (.2)
07/28/15	ALS	0.30	Emails from/to L. Zahradka re search for CBA (.1); review electronic files for CBA (.2)
07/28/15	DSA	0.50	Telephone conference with F. Caruso concerning issues with claims objections and plan funding (.5)
07/29/15	KQ	0.10	Telephone to and from the court regarding potential hearing on a 9019 motion and follow up with M. Siedband regarding same
07/29/15	RND	0.20	Emails with M. Siedband re: 9019 Motion for MMA's preference claims
07/30/15	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alerts
07/30/15	ALS	0.20	Review emails (x2) from L. Zahradka re hearing transcripts
07/31/15	ALS	0.20	Docket scheduling re Motion to Expedite Hearing & Trustees Motion for Order Approving Compromise and Settlements
07/31/15	ALS	0.20	Emails from/to L. Zahradka re Rule 2004 motions filed in main case

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

07/31/15	TJM	0.10	Email counsel for CP re CP discovery demands re plan confirmation (0.1) and confer Trustee re same (0.1)
08/03/15	MAS	0.40	Prepare pro hac vice filing and attention to filing.
08/03/15	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alerts
08/03/15	ALS	0.20	Email to M. Siedband re application for admission pro hac vice (.1); filing of pro hac application for M. Siedband (.1)
08/04/15	ALS	0.60	Filing of Affidavits of Service of Prime Clerk with Court (.3); office conferences (x2) with L. Zahradka re filing of Affidavits of Service with Court (.3)
08/04/15	DSA	0.70	Reviewed e-mails and e-mailed M. Seidband concerning issues with preference settlements and conference with M. Seidband concerning same (.2); travel to and from and attended hearing on preference settlements (.4); reviewed e-mails and orders entered in case (.1)
08/05/15	ALS	0.10	Docket scheduling with respect to Order Approving Compromise and Settlement Agreements with Certain Preference Recipients
08/05/15	ALS	0.10	Office conference with R. Desai re proposed order with respect to motion to abandon
08/06/15	ALS	0.60	Work on translation of administrative hearing notice
08/07/15	ALS	0.20	Docket scheduling with respect to First Circuit's Order of August 5, 2015
08/07/15	DSA	0.20	Reviewed e-mails concerning issues with preference settlements (.2)
08/07/15	KQ	3.10	Draft, file and serve the Third Amended Notice of Hearing related to the Motion to Disband the Committee of Victims

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

08/07/15	KQ	0.50	Redaction of Settlement Agreement as requested by L. Zahradka
08/07/15	LKZ	0.80	Revise notice of adjournment of motion to disband committee (.2); supervise filing of same (.1); review flagged emails for action (.5).
08/08/15	DSA	0.20	Reviewed orders entered in case and e-mails relating to retaining conflict counsel (.2)
08/10/15	DSA	0.20	Reviewed e-mails concerning issues with railcar lease objections and issues with retaining conflict counsel (.2)
08/10/15	KQ	0.50	Draft, file and serve the Certificate of Service related to the Third Amended Notice of Hearing on the Motion to Disband the Victim's Committee
08/10/15	ALS	0.20	Email to M. Paione at U.S. Bankruptcy Court re hearings scheduled for August 18th (.1); conference with T. McKeon re hearings scheduled for August 18th (.1)
08/10/15	TJM	1.40	Edit and revise responses to CP's discovery requests
08/11/15	ALS	0.10	Docket scheduling re Trustee's Application to Employ Molleur Law Office
08/11/15	ALS	0.10	Docket scheduling re Trustee's Objection to The Meredith Management Group, Inc.'s Proof of Claim
08/11/15	ALS	0.60	Email to T. McKeon re upcoming hearing with respect to CP's Motion to Dismiss and Pre-Trial Conference in adversary proceeding (.1); emails to/from M. Paione re rescheduling of hearings on August 18th to August 20th (.2); continue hearings from August 18th to August 20th via docket entries (.2); office conference with T. McKeon re rescheduling of hearings (.1)

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

08/11/15	KQ	0.10	E-mail to M. Siedband regarding service issues related to the 2011 motion
08/11/15	KQ	0.30	Review Debtor's schedules, Proof of Claims filed and spreadsheet provided to Prime Clerk to verify appearance of Promutuel Monts et Rives and send e-mail to L. Zahradka regarding same.
08/11/15	KQ	0.10	E-mail from and to L. Zahradka regarding creditors from the state of MD.
08/13/15	ALS	0.20	Docket scheduling re UST's Motion to Expedite Hearing & Motion to Continue Hearing on Motion for Entry of an Order Recognizing and Enforcing the Plan Sanction Order
08/14/15	ALS	0.20	Translate letter for R. Keach's review
08/14/15	KQ	0.10	E-mail from and to M. Farnsworth at DSI regarding MMA escrow account
08/14/15	LKZ	0.30	Review upcoming case deadlines (.2); confer w/A.Stewart re: same (.1).
08/15/15	DSA	0.20	Reviewed e-mails and e-mailed parties concerning issues with tax forms for Rail World escrow (.2)
08/17/15	ALS	0.20	Email to M. Siedband attaching transcript from NECP confirmation hearing (.1); office conference with M. Siedband re filing of pleading in Ch. 15 case (.1)
08/17/15	ALS	0.20	Office conferences with K. Quirk re filing of pleading in Ch. 15 case
08/17/15	BBC	0.10	Review email from M Farnsworth re: July MMA MOR.
08/18/15	ALS	1.00	Assist with service of Consent Motion for Order Granting Temporary Allowance of Claims of Federal Railroad Administration Solely for Voting Purposes

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

08/18/15	DSA	0.30	Reviewed e-mails and e-mailed escrow agent concerning issues with tax payments (.1); reviewed e-mails and e-mailed parties concerning issues with answer extension for 2011 transactions litigation (.2)
08/18/15	KQ	0.60	Prepare and send e-mail service of the joinder and memo of law supporting verified petition in the Ch. 15 case
08/18/15	KQ	0.40	Draft and file via ECF the Certificate of Service related to the joinder and memo of law supporting verified petition in the Ch. 15 case
08/19/15	DSA	0.20	Reviewed opinion on Traveler's decision (.2)
08/19/15	LKZ	0.20	Review upcoming case deadlines.
08/20/15	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alert
08/21/15	ALS	0.20	Office conference with T. McKeon re upcoming hearing dates
08/21/15	ALS	0.40	Emails from/to R. Keach re executed copies of settlement agreements (.1); emails from/to A. Bayus re request for fully executed settlement agreements (.2); email to J. Hardin and R. Keach re settlement agreement (.1)
08/21/15	DSA	0.40	Reviewed e-mails and e-mailed parties concerning issues with preference cases (.1); conference with parties concerning issues with preference litigation settlements (.2); reviewed e-mails and orders entered in case (.1)
08/24/15	DSA	0.20	Reviewed e-mails concerning orders entered in case for the chapter 15 and in relation to various adversary proceedings (.2)
08/24/15	KQ	0.40	Finalize, file and serve the Eighth Consent Motion to Extend the Objection Deadline and Continue Hearing on Rule 2004 Examinations

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

08/25/15	ALS	0.40	Update docket scheduling on hearings for Trustee's Rule 2004 motions and hearings on creditors' applications for administrative
08/26/15	ALS	0.20	Emails from/to R. Keach re Order Recognizing and Enforcing the Plan Sanction Order of the Quebec Superior Court
08/26/15	KQ	0.50	Finalize and file the Certificates of Publication for the confirmation hearing and Ch. 15
08/26/15	KQ	0.30	Final revisions to Certificate of Publication for the Confirmation Hearing and Ch. 15, and forward same to L. Zahrdaka
08/26/15	DSA	0.10	Reviewed e-mails concerning issues with preference settlements (.1)
08/26/15	LKZ	0.50	Review email from F.Caruso re: storage fees (.2); draft response to same (.2); follow-up correspondence re: same (.1).
08/26/15	TJM	0.60	TC w/ counsel for CP re 3018 claim (0.2) and email Trustee re same (0.2) and email counsel for CP re same (0.2)
08/27/15	LKZ	0.50	Emails w/F.Caruso (.2), Prime Clerk (.1), counsel to CIT (.1), B.Keach (.1) re: various case issues.
08/28/15	ALS	0.20	Docket scheduling re Motion for Estimation and Temporary Allowance of Claim Pursuant to Federal Rule of Civil Procedure 3018 and the Motion to Expedite Hearing (.1); email to R. Keach re Motion for Estimation and Temporary Allowance of Claim Pursuant to Federal Rule of Civil Procedure 3018 and the Motion to Expedite Hearing (.1)
08/31/15	LKZ	3.30	Draft list of outstanding items (.3); confer w/B.Keach re: stipulation resolving motion to disband committee (.2); draft same (2.6); review B.Keach comments to same (.2).

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

08/31/15	DSA	0.50	Reviewed motion to compel filed by CP (.2); reviewed e-mails and conference with T. McKeon concerning issues with settlement of preference claims (.3)
09/01/15	LKZ	2.50	Emails w/F.Caruso re: storage for records (.1); review proposal for same (.1); review upcoming case deadlines (.1); emails w/B.Keach re: motion to disband (.1) and confer w/S.Anderson re: same (.1); research re: motion for authority to store records (.7); begin draft of same (1.0); call w/F.Caruso re: same (.3).
09/02/15	LKZ	2.70	Confer w/B.Keach re: case status (.2); revise motion to approve storage agreements (1.5), research re: same (.8) and emails w/B.Keach (.1), F.Caruso (.1) re: same.
09/02/15	RND	0.60	Review FRA carve out order and second borrowing order with CNB re: amount of FRA carve out in light of First Circuit decision affirming Travelers Stipulation
09/02/15	RND	0.10	Meeting with S. Anderson re: FRA Carve-out in light of First Circuit decision affirming Travelers' stipulation
09/02/15	RND	0.10	Email with S. Anderson re: FRA Carve-out
09/03/15	LKZ	2.10	Call w/F.Caruso re: storage motion (.2); emails (.2) and calls (.2)x2 with Verrill Dana re: storage of certain documents; revise motion as per same (1.1) and emails w/B.Keach re: same (.1).
09/03/15	DSA	0.50	Reviewed e-mails and e-mailed parties concerning issues with debtor financials and carve out (.1); telephone conference with F. Caruso concerning issues with carve out (.4)
09/03/15	KQ	0.40	Draft the Fourth Amended Notice of Hearing related to the Trustee's Motion to Disband the Victim's Committee

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

09/04/15	LKZ	0.10	Emails w/K.Quirk re: notice of adjournment for motion to disband committee.
09/04/15	ALS	0.10	Emails from/to L. Zahradka re upcoming filings
09/08/15	ALS	0.30	Emails from/to L. Zahradka re objection deadline for 3018 motion (.2); review notice of hearing on 3018 motion (.1)
09/08/15	ALS	0.10	Email to R. Keach re CP's Notice of Appeal filed in Ch. 15 case
09/08/15	ALS	0.10	Update docket scheduling re Trustee's Application to Employ Molleur Law Office as Special Counsel
09/08/15	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alert
09/08/15	LKZ	2.60	Calls w/F.Caruso re: record retention motion (.2)(.3); emails w/B.Keach (.1)x2, F.Caruso (.1)x2 re: same; review upcoming deadlines (.4); confer w/A.Cummings re: binder for B.Keach for 9/9 hearing (.2); draft FOO (.2) and review NOH (.1) for record retention motion; review filing version of record retention motion (.8).
09/08/15	KQ	0.10	E-mail to L. Zahradka regarding service provision regarding the CP 3018 motion and the motion to pay for storage
09/08/15	KQ	0.20	Finalize and file the objection to CP 3018 motion
09/08/15	KQ	0.80	Prepare and send e-mail service related to the fourth Amended Notice of Hearing related to the Motion to Disband Victims Committee
09/08/15	KQ	0.30	Finalize and file the Certificate of Service related to the Fourth Amended Notice of Hearing related to the motion to disband the victim's committee
09/08/15	KQ	0.10	E-mail from Matt Farnsworth regarding MMA escrow account

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

09/08/15	KQ	0.80	Obtain pleadings requested by the Monitor and forward same to S. Bourguine
09/09/15	KQ	0.70	Obtain pleadings requested by the Monitor and forward same to S. Bourguine
09/09/15	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alerts
09/09/15	ALS	0.10	Docket scheduling re Trustee's Motion for Order Authorizing (A) Entry Into Agreement with Earl W. Noyes & Sons Pertaining to Storage and Destruction of Certain Records and (B) Destruction of Certain Records
09/09/15	ALS	0.40	Docket scheduling re preference cases
09/09/15	ALS	0.10	Update docket scheduling re deadline to file pretrial scheduling order in World Fuel services adversary case
09/09/15	ALS	0.10	Docket scheduling re First Interim Application for Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses for Prime Clerk LLC
09/09/15	ALS	0.10	Docket scheduling re Trustee's Motion for Order Approving Procedures and Authority for Trustee to Compromise with Certain Preference Defendants
09/09/15	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alerts
09/09/15	DSA	0.60	Reviewed motion to store documents (.2); reviewed e-mails relating to scheduling of preference matters (.1); telephone conference with F. Caruso concerning issues with sale of Derby (.3)
09/11/15	ALS	0.10	Review email from L. Zahradka re upcoming filings
09/13/15	DSA	0.10	Reviewed e-mails concerning issues with scheduling preference action litigation (.1)
09/14/15	DSA	0.20	Reviewed objection to plan filed by Irving railroads (.1); reviewed objection to motion to compel filed by CP (.1)

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

09/14/15	ALS	0.10	Office conference with K. Quirk re filing of stipulation on motion to disband
09/14/15	KQ	1.10	Finalize, file and serve the Trustee's objection to CP's motion to compel
09/14/15	KQ	0.40	Draft and file the Certificate of Service related to the Trustee's objection to CP's motion to compel
09/14/15	KQ	0.80	Finalize, file and serve the stipulation related to the Trustee's motion to disband the victim's committee
09/14/15	LKZ	1.50	Revise stipulation resolving motion to disband committee (.9); emails w/B.Keach (.1) re: final version of same; further revise same (.4); emails w/K.Quirk re: filing and service of same (.1).
09/15/15	LKZ	0.50	Various emails w/B.Keach (.3), K.Quirk (.2) re: status of stip, hearing on motion to disband.
09/15/15	ALS	0.10	Emails from/to J. Geller re hearing on motion to disband committee
09/16/15	ALS	0.10	Emails to/from J. Geller re hearing on motion to disband committee
09/16/15	ALS	0.40	Emails from/to L. Zahradka re email distribution list for counsel to settling defendants (.2); comparison of email distribution lists re settling defendants (.2)
09/16/15	LKZ	0.20	Emails w/constituents re: status of hearing on motion to disband committee (.1), so ordered version of stipulation (.1).
09/16/15	TJM	2.50	Draft, edit, and revise stipulation and agreement re production of settlement agreements to committee re filing
09/17/15	ALS	0.20	Emails from/to M. Zimmerman and R. Keach re executed settlement agreement with Arrow Midstream

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

09/20/15	ALS	0.10	Docket scheduling with respect to Motion to Expedite & Motion to Approve, and Authorize the Trustee to Enter Into, Stipulation With Counsel for the Official Com. of Victims Concerning the Production of Settlement Agreements
09/21/15	ALS	0.10	Emails from/to J. Geller re hearing on September 22nd
09/21/15	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alerts
09/21/15	ALS	0.10	Emails from/to L. Zahradka re matters scheduled for hearing on September 22nd
09/22/15	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alerts
09/22/15	ALS	3.30	Review and organize unredacted and redacted settlement agreements in advance of confirmation hearing
09/22/15	ALS	0.10	Emails from/to S. Anderson and D. Johnson re continued status conference on surcharge motion
09/22/15	ALS	0.10	Email to R. Keach re Order Granting Motion to Approve, and Authorize the Trustee to Enter Into, Stipulation with Counsel for the Official Committee of Victims Concerning the Production of Settlement Agreements
09/22/15	ALS	0.10	Emails from/to J. Geller re hearing on Motion to Approve, and Authorize the Trustee to Enter Into, Stipulation with Counsel for the Official Committee of Victims Concerning the Production of Settlement Agreements
09/22/15	ALS	0.10	Review Court hearing schedule for September 22nd
09/23/15	DSA	0.20	Reviewed e-mails concerning declarations filed in support of confirmation (.1); conference with T. McKeon concerning issues with preference settlements (.1)

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

09/24/15	DSA	3.90	Travel to and from and attended confirmation hearing (3.9)
09/25/15	DSA	0.10	Reviewed e-mails relating to the status of preference actions (.1)
09/25/15	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alerts
09/25/15	ALS	0.30	Filing of Notice of Rescheduled Hearings with Court
09/25/15	ALS	0.20	Docket scheduling re Motion for Extension of Time to File Proof of Claim by Creditor Estate of Yvon Ricard and All Heirs of the Estate of Yvon Ricard
09/25/15	LKZ	1.10	Emails w/K. Quirk re: notice of rescheduled hearing (.1)x2; draft same (.3); review docket re: same (.3), confer w/B.Keach (.1), A.Stewart (.1)x2 re: same.
09/26/15	DSA	0.10	Reviewed e-mails relating to preference settlements (.1)
09/28/15	ALS	0.50	Preparation of certificates of service with respect to notice of rescheduled hearing filed in main case and Caisse de Depot adversary proceed (.3); service of notice of rescheduled hearing upon email distribution list and first class mail (.2)
09/29/15	DSA	0.10	Reviewed e-mails and orders entered in case (.1)
09/30/15	DSA	0.50	Reviewed e-mails and e-mailed parties concerning issues with destruction of documents objection and issues with unit 5017 (.3); telephone conference with F. Caruso concerning issues with same (.1); reviewed e-mails concerning issues with Wheeling claim (.1)
09/30/15	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alert

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

09/30/15	LKZ	0.80	Review CP objection to record retention motion (.3); discuss same and case status w/B.Keach (.4); emails w/F.Caruso re: same (.1).
10/01/15	KQ	5.30	Obtain from the docket and forward to the Monitor pleadings filed in the MMA main case (13-10670)
10/01/15	ALS	0.20	Emails from/to J. Geller re re-noticing of hearings scheduled for October 6th
10/01/15	TJM	0.20	Respond to email from counsel for First Union re access to Settlement Agreements (0.1) and email Trustee re same (0.1)
10/02/15	TJM	0.20	Confer with Trustee re case status
10/02/15	ALS	0.40	Docket scheduling with respect to Court orders continuing hearing and deadlines on applications for payment of administrative claims
10/02/15	KQ	0.10	E-mail from/to L. Zahradka and B. Keach regarding change of hearing dates for the Trustee's Motion for Order Authorizing (A) Entry Into Agreement with Earl W. Noyes & Sons Pertaining to Storage and Destruction of Certain Records and (B) Destruction of Certain Electronic Records; and Trustee's Motion for Order Approving Procedures and Authority for Trustee to Compromise with Certain Preference Defendants.
10/04/15	DSA	0.10	Reviewed e-mails and e-mailed parties concerning issues with preference settlements (.1)
10/05/15	DSA	0.10	Reviewed e-mails concerning issues with scheduling for preference cases (.1)
10/06/15	DSA	0.10	Reviewed e-mails concerning issues with preference settlements (.1)

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

10/07/15	DSA	0.20	Reviewed e-mails concerning issues with the status of the preference settlements (.2)
10/08/15	ALS	0.20	Docket scheduling re Motion for Emergency Hearing & Trustee's Application to Compromise a Controversy with Great American Insurance Company and Certain Insureds
10/08/15	ALS	0.50	Review draft 9019 motion and proposed order with respect to Great American (.1); review local rules with respect to noticing requirements (.2); office conference with L. Zahradka re noticing requirements (.1); email to L. Zahradka with sample notice (.1)
10/08/15	KQ	0.60	Prepare service related to the Trustee's Motion for Order Approving Compromise and Settlement with Great American Insurance Company
10/08/15	KQ	0.10	File via ECF the Incremental Redline Confirmation Order
10/08/15	KQ	0.60	Finalize, file and serve the Trustee's Report on CCAA proceedings
10/08/15	LKZ	1.90	Revise record retention FOO (.6), emails (.3) and calls (.3) w/parties re: same; confer w/F.Caruso (.4), B.Keach (.3) re: same.
10/08/15	TJM	0.50	Confer with Trustee re trustee's report (0.1) and draft and finalize re same (0.4)
10/09/15	ALS	0.40	Review Court docket re claims objections (.2); update docket scheduling relating to claims objections (.2)
10/09/15	ALS	0.10	Email to M. Paione re continuance of hearing on Motion to File Claims After Claims Bar Date
10/13/15	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alert
10/13/15	ALS	0.40	Filing and service of Chapter 11 Trustee's Report on CCAA Proceedings
10/13/15	ALS	0.10	Review L. Zahradka's email re upcoming filings

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

10/13/15	ALS	0.10	Emails from/to L. Zahradka re Earl Noyes motion and continued hearing date
10/13/15	LKZ	0.90	Call w/F.Caruso (.4), counsel to CP (.5) re: record retention motion.
10/13/15	RND	0.10	Email with A. Stewart re: CCAA Report
10/13/15	RND	0.30	Emails with R. Keach and T. McKeon re: CCAA Order Varying the Order Approving the Amended Plan of Compromise and Arrangement
10/13/15	RND	0.10	Email with R. Keach re: CCAA Report
10/14/15	LKZ	0.20	Confer w/F.Caruso re: record retention motion (.1); revise NOA re: same (.1).
10/14/15	KQ	0.10	File on the docket in the the agreed continuance of the hearing on the trustee's motion for Order to enter into an Agreement with Earl W. Noyes regarding storage and destruction of documents.
10/14/15	KQ	0.20	Office conference and call to the US Bankruptcy court regarding obtaining old pleadings in the Jackson Brook Institute case
10/14/15	KQ	0.40	Prepare and send e-mail service of the Trustee's Request for Adoption of Proposed Findings
10/14/15	KQ	0.40	Draft and file the Certificate of Service related to the Trustee's Request for Adoption of Proposed Findings
10/14/15	DSA	0.40	Reviewed filings relating to holding CP in contempt (.1); reviewed e-mails and conference with T. McKeon concerning issues with orders to show cause for preference actions (.3)
10/15/15	DSA	0.20	Reviewed e-mails concerning issues with the status of the preference settlements (.1)
10/15/15	LKZ	0.10	Call w/criminal counsel to Grindrod re: record retention motion.

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

10/17/15	DSA	0.10	Reviewed e-mails and e-mailed parties concerning issues with District Court hearing on plan (.1)
10/19/15	DSA	0.20	Reviewed e-mails concerning issues with settlement of preference actions (.2)
10/20/15	DSA	0.10	Reviewed e-mails relating to claims objections (.1)
10/20/15	ALS	1.40	Review Court dockets for docket scheduling purposes (.3); update docket scheduling for upcoming hearings, objection deadlines, etc. in MMA-related cases, including adversary proceedings (1.1)
10/20/15	BBC	0.10	Review email from A Cummings re: monthly operating reports for August and September.
10/21/15	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alert
10/21/15	ALS	1.10	Reivew Court dockets for docket scheduling purposes (.4); docket scheduling for upcoming hearings and other deadlines (.7)
10/21/15	DSA	0.20	Reviewed scheduling deadlines relating to preference actions (.1); telephone conference with A. Lepene concerning issues with claims objection (.1)
10/22/15	DSA	0.10	Reviewed e-mails and e-mailed parties concerning issues with preference settlements (.1)
10/23/15	ALS	0.30	Office conferences with R. Desai (.1) and L. Zahradka (.2) re filing of 157(b)(5) motion
10/23/15	RND	0.20	Review memo re: funding timelines
10/24/15	DSA	0.20	Reviewed funding memorandum from the Trustee (.2)
10/26/15	RND	0.10	Review emails re: MMA settlement payment timeline
10/27/15	LKZ	0.30	Call w/F.Caruso re: record retention issue (.2); draft email to B.Keach re: same (.1).

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

10/27/15	ALS	0.20	Emails to/from L. Zahradka re post-confirmation deadlines
10/27/15	ALS	0.30	Review emails from L. Zahradka re timing of filing motion to transfer (.2); telephone conference with K. Quirk re same (.1)
10/28/15	ALS	1.10	Review multiple Court dockets and CM/ECF notifications for docket scheduling purposes
10/28/15	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alert
10/28/15	DSA	0.10	Reviewed e-mails relating to status of preference settlements (.1)
10/29/15	DSA	0.20	Reviewed orders entered in case relating to Wheeling claims and preference claims and Irving Railway claims (.2)
10/29/15	ALS	0.20	Update email distribution list
10/29/15	RND	6.80	Research Carmack Amendment re: applicable venue options
10/29/15	RND	0.10	Email with R. Keach re: Carmack venue research
10/29/15	RND	0.10	Review email from Monitor re: payment timeline
10/30/15	RND	0.20	Review Order Authorizing Abandonment of Hermon Parcel and email with F. Caruso re: same
10/30/15	RND	1.30	Draft email memorandum to R. Keach re: Carmack research
10/30/15	ALS	0.10	Docket scheduling re CP's Motion to Exceed Page Limits
10/30/15	ALS	0.10	Office conference with T. McKeon re upcoming filings
10/30/15	DSA	0.20	Telephone conference with F. Caruso concerning issue with fee applications (.2)
10/30/15	LKZ	0.30	Emails w/F.Caruso re: status of record inventory (.1); draft email to counsel to Burkhardt re: same (.1); revise order accordingly (.1).

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

10/31/15	DSA	0.10	Reviewed e-mails and e-mailed parties concerning issues with sale of unit 5017 (.1)
10/31/15	RND	4.40	Research Carmack Amendment re: applicability of waiver/consent to venue
10/31/15	RND	0.10	Email with R. Keach re: further question/research of Carmack Amendment

Total 04		452.20	

05 Claims Administration and Objections

Date	ATTY	Hours	
10/01/14	TJM	0.10	Confer with S Anderson re Trustee edits and changes to motion to set administrative bar date motion
10/01/14	TJM	2.10	Edit and revise motion to set admin bar date per comments from Trustee (0.6) and draft, edit and revise motion papers re motion to expedite motion re admin bar date (1.5)
10/01/14	KQ	0.20	Revisions to Certificate of Service related to the administrative bar date motion
10/01/14	KQ	0.20	Begin preparation of service related to the administrative bar date motion
10/01/14	DSA	0.10	Conference with T. McKeon concerning issues with changes to administrative claims bar date motion (.1)
10/02/14	DSA	0.60	Reviewed and made changes to motion to expedite administrative claims bar date motion (.4); reviewed and made changes to proposed order and notice relating to same (.2)
10/02/14	TJM	0.90	Review edits to motion papers for motion to set admin bar date per comments from S Anderson and edit re same
10/03/14	TJM	1.10	Review and finalize motion papers re motion to set administrative bar date and motion to expedite re filing

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

10/03/14	DSA	0.20	Reviewed e-mails and e-mailed Trustee concerning status of bar date motion (.1); telephone conference with F. Caruso concerning issues with same (.1)
10/03/14	KQ	1.30	Finalize, file and serve the Motion to Set Administrative Bar Date, Motion to Expedite and Notice of Hearing
10/03/14	KQ	0.30	Draft Certificate of Service related to the Motion to Set Administrative Bar Date, Motion to Expedite and Notice of Hearing
10/03/14	KQ	0.20	File via ECF the Certificate of Service related to the Motion to Set Administrative Bar Date, Motion to Expedite and Notice of Hearing
10/03/14	ALS	0.20	Conference with R. Keach regarding CCAA claims (.1); email file transfer link to R. Keach regarding CCAA claims (.1)
10/08/14	TJM	0.50	Draft, edit and revise amended order setting admin bar date
10/09/14	TJM	0.70	Edit and revise proposed order re admin bar date
10/15/14	TJM	0.80	Revise proposed order re admin claim bar date
10/15/14	ALS	0.10	Emails from/to K. Quirk regarding claims analysis
10/16/14	DSA	0.50	Reviewed and made changes to bar date order after comments by committee (.3); e-mailed the committee concerning changes to the bar date order (.2)
10/16/14	TJM	0.20	Confer with S Anderson re motion to set admin bar date and procedure re same
10/16/14	TJM	1.40	Edit and revise proposed order re admin bar date and notice of admin bar date (1.2) and confer A Stewart re proof of claim filed by Quebec (0.2)

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

10/17/14	TJM	0.70	Revise and finalize revised proposed order and notice of bar date
10/17/14	TJM	0.20	Prepare file re hearing on motion to set administrative bar date
10/20/14	ALS	0.30	Review notice provision relating to motion for an order establishing an administrative bar date
10/20/14	KQ	1.60	Begin preparation of service of the Administrative Bar Date Notice
10/20/14	DSA	1.20	Reviewed motion to set bar date and related filing and drafted notes for hearing (.8); reviewed and made changes to notice to administrative claimants after changes from the committee (.2); telephone conference with F. Caruso concerning issues with service of bar date order (.2)
10/21/14	DSA	6.50	Travel to and from and attended hearing on intervention and administrative claims bar date in Bangor (6.5)
10/21/14	KQ	0.10	E-mail to and from Fred Caruso regarding additional parties to serve the Administrative Bar Date Notice
10/21/14	KQ	2.60	Begin preparation of service upon employees of the Administrative Bar Date Notice
10/21/14	ALS	0.10	Docket scheduling relating to deadline to file revised proposed order on Administrative Claims Motion
10/21/14	TJM	0.40	Attend hearing re admin claim bar date
10/22/14	TJM	0.10	Review email from S Anderson re admin bar date order to counsel for Quebec
10/22/14	TJM	0.30	Confer S Anderson re entry of order setting admin bar date (0.1) and TC w/ local counsel for Quebec re same (0.1); TC w/ bankruptcy court re order (0.1)

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

10/22/14	TJM	0.20	Update notice of Admin Bar Date re confer K Quirk
10/22/14	ALS	0.10	Review email from T. McKeon regarding final version of administrative bar date notice
10/22/14	ALS	0.40	Assist with preparation for service of Administrative Bar Date Notice
10/22/14	KQ	3.10	Continued preparation of service for the Administrative Bar Date Notice
10/22/14	KQ	0.10	E-mail from T. McKeon regarding the Administrative Bar Date Notice
10/22/14	DSA	0.40	Telephone conference with B. Keach concerning issues with motion to intervene and bar date motion (.2); e-mailed Province concerning issues with order on bar date (.2)
10/23/14	KQ	0.10	Office conference with T. McKeon regarding service of the Administrative Bar Date Notice upon parties who receive service via ECF
10/23/14	KQ	1.30	Continued preparation of service of the Administrative Bar Date Notice
10/23/14	KQ	0.40	Revise and file via ECF the Certificate of Service related to the Administrative Bar Date Notice
10/23/14	KQ	0.30	Prepare and send e-mail service of the Administrative Bar Date Notice
10/23/14	TJM	0.10	Confer K Quirk re service of admin bar date notice
10/23/14	TJM	0.10	Confer S Swander and K Quirk re service of notice of admin bar date
10/24/14	DSA	0.20	E-mailed professionals concerning issues with fee claims against the estate (.2)
10/27/14	TJM	0.10	Check docket re entry re confirmation that Quebec counsel signed off on order approving admin bar date and confer S Swander re same
11/05/14	MAF	0.20	Call with F. Bopp regarding GNP claim

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

11/05/14	ALS	0.20	Emails from/to M. Fagone regarding claims filed to date (.1); email to M. Fagone attaching requested claim (.1)
11/10/14	ALS	0.30	Review email from R. Keach regarding claims register (.1); email to R. Keach regarding POCs filed to date (.2)
11/11/14	DSA	0.20	Reviewed e-mails and conference with T. McKeon concerning issues with form of application for administrative claims (.1)
11/11/14	TJM	0.50	Confer S Anderson re response to request from attorney from Weil re how to file application for admin payment (0.1) and research form re same (0.4)
11/11/14	TJM	0.10	TC w/ attorney from Weil re how to file application for admin expenses
11/14/14	TJM	0.60	Draft, edit and revise objection to proof of claim filed by New Brunswick Southern Railway
11/14/14	TJM	1.20	Draft, edit and revise objection to proof of claim filed by Maine Northern Railway
11/14/14	TJM	1.90	Draft, edit and revise objection to proof of claim filed by Canadian Pacific
11/21/14	ALS	0.10	Review email from R. Keach regarding administrative claims
11/21/14	MAF	0.10	Call from F. Bopp regarding GNP estate request for allowance and payment of admin claim
11/24/14	MAF	0.30	Review draft motion for allowance and payment of admin claim from GNP estate (0.2); e-mail to R. Keach regarding same (.1)
11/24/14	MAF	0.10	E-mails from and to F. Bopp regarding GNP estate admin request
11/24/14	ALS	0.10	Review Application for Administrative Expenses filed by CIT Group
11/25/14	MAF	0.20	Voice mails from and to E. Maccoll regarding CIT application for admin expense

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

11/25/14	DSA	0.40	Reviewed motion for payment of administrative claims filed by CIT (.1); telephone conference with F. Caruso concerning issues with CIT administrative claims (.3)
11/25/14	TJM	0.10	Review email from M Fagone re requests for allowance and payment of admin claims
11/26/14	ALS	0.20	Email to T. McKeon attaching Order Establishing Deadline for Filing Administrative Claims
11/26/14	DSA	0.10	Reviewed administrative claim filed by Troester and e-mailed T. McKeon concerning same (.1)
12/01/14	DSA	0.20	Reviewed administrative claim filing filed by Wheeling (.2)
12/01/14	KQ	0.10	E-mail from S. Anderson and to F. Caruso forwarding Wheeling's Application for Administrative Expenses
12/01/14	MAF	0.10	Review Wheeling request for allowance of admin claim; e-mail to G. Marcus and D. Johnson regarding same
12/01/14	MAF	0.10	Review World Fuels request for allowance of admin claim; e-mail to trustee regarding same
12/02/14	MAF	0.20	Review Lexington Insurance and First Union request for allowance of administrative expense claims
12/02/14	KQ	0.10	E-mail to F Caruso regarding forwarding of administrative claims
12/02/14	ALS	0.80	Revise summary of administrative expense claims, review docket and download additional claims (.7); email to F. Caruso attaching summary of administrative expense claims and copies of claims filed with Court (.1)
12/03/14	DSA	0.10	Reviewed e-mails concerning status of administrative claims (.1)

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

12/11/14	TJM	0.20	Review outline of admin claims filed, and Order of Court re same
12/15/14	TJM	0.70	Review admin claim filed by Lexington Insurance Company (0.4) and email Trustee re same (0.1); Confer A Stewart re scheduling re hearing dates/objection deadlines re admin claims (0.1)
12/15/14	TJM	0.20	Review schedule of hearings on 12/16 and confer A Cummings re same re Trustee preparation for hearings
12/15/14	TJM	0.40	TC w/ T Manhart re rescheduling hearing for Lexington Insurance's claim for admin claim (0.1) and email re same (0.2)
12/16/14	TJM	0.10	TC w/ Jeffrey Derant re application for admin claim re rescheduling hearing
12/16/14	TJM	0.10	TC w/ Stephen Currie re admin claim hearing date
12/16/14	TJM	0.50	Draft, edit and revise motion to reschedule hearing and deadlines re Lexington Insurance application for admin claim
12/16/14	TJM	0.10	Email counsel for Lexington Insurance re hearing on application for admin claim
12/17/14	TJM	0.70	Draft, edit and revise motion to reschedule hearing and deadlines re Lexington Insurance application for admin claim
12/19/14	TJM	0.10	TC w/ counsel for Lexington Insurance re motion extending deadlines re application for admin claim
12/19/14	TJM	0.10	Finalize consent motion to extend deadlines re Lexington Insurance's application for admin claim
12/19/14	TJM	0.10	Confer with A Stewart re scheduling of hearings re per se applications for admin claims

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

12/19/14	TJM	0.30	Edit and revise motion to extend hearing and other deadlines re application for admin claim filed by Lexington Insurance
12/19/14	TJM	0.10	Email counsel for Lexington re motion to continue hearing and related deadlines re application for admin claim
12/19/14	TJM	0.10	TC w/ Jeffrey Durant and Steve Currie re rescheduling hearings on applications for administrative claims
12/19/14	KQ	0.30	File via ECF the Consent Motion to Extend Deadlines and Continue Hearing re Lexington Insurance Admin Claim
12/19/14	KQ	0.20	Draft Certificate of Service related to the Consent Motion to Extend Deadlines and Continue Hearing re Lexington Insurance Admin Claim
12/19/14	ALS	0.40	Office conferences with T. McKeon regarding Administrative Claim Applications of Stephen C. Currie and Jeffrey C. Durant (.2); telephone call to K. Ford at U.S. Bankruptcy Court regarding Administrative Claim Applications of Stephen C. Currie and Jeffrey C. Durant and hearings relating to same (.1); email to K. Ford regarding notice to pro se parties regarding Administrative Claim Applications (.1)
12/22/14	ALS	0.20	Emails from/to K. Ford at U.S. Bankruptcy Court relating to notification to Mr. Currie and Mr. Durant regarding their administrative claim applications (.1); email to T. McKeon regarding notification to Mr. Currie and Mr. Durant regarding their administrative claim applications (.1)
12/29/14	TJM	0.10	VM to S Currie re hearing on application for admin claim

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

12/29/14	TJM	0.10	TC w/ J Durant re hearing re application for admin claim
01/07/15	ALS	0.50	Revisions to claims summary per discussion with R. Keach (.3); office conferences (x2) with R. Keach re claims summary (.2)
01/20/15	DSA	0.20	Conference with T. McKeon concerning issues with objections to administrative claims (.2)
01/20/15	TJM	0.20	Confer with S Anderson re status and objection deadlines re admin claims
01/20/15	TJM	0.20	Confer K Quirk and K Bigelow re admin claims
01/21/15	TJM	0.80	TC w/ S Anderson and DSI re preference action claims and admin claims and strategy re same
01/21/15	MAS	0.80	Teleconference with Sam Anderson, Tim McKeon, Fred Caruso and DSI re: preferences and 2011 sale transaction documents and related support.
01/21/15	DSA	1.50	Telephone conference with F. Caruso concerning issues with claim amounts (.4); reviewed documents in preparation for call with DSI concerning issues with administrative claims and preference actions (.3); telephone conference with Tim McKeon and M.Siedband and DSI concerning issues with preference actions and issues with administrative claims (.8)
01/22/15	ALS	0.20	Office conference with T. McKeon regarding admin bar claims and upcoming hearing (.1); review admin bar claims summary (.1)
01/22/15	TJM	0.40	Confer with A Stewart re status of admin claims and hearings re same (0.2) and review Order granting motion for admin claim bar date and notice re same (0.2)
01/23/15	TJM	0.50	Prepare for meeting re admin claims (0.2); Meet w/ S Anderson and Trustee re strategy re admin claims filed (0.3)

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

01/23/15	DSA	0.40	E-mailed Trustee concerning issues with administrative claims (.1); conference with Trustee and T. McKeon concerning issues with administrative expense claims (.3)
01/28/15	TJM	0.70	Research, draft, and revise objection to claim re Canadian Pacific
02/02/15	WAH	1.50	Corresponding with F. Caruso re general unsecured claims and potential objections to same, and reviewing scheduled claims and filed claims.
02/02/15	RND	0.20	Emails with A. Stewart re: claims analysis
02/03/15	TJM	0.80	Confer w/ S Anderson re admin claims and case strategy re same
02/03/15	WAH	1.60	Reviewing general unsecured claims for potential claims objections.
02/03/15	DSA	0.20	Conference with T. McKeon concerning issues with continuance of administrative claim hearings (.2)
02/04/15	WAH	2.20	Reviewing general unsecured claims for potential claims objections.
02/06/15	TJM	0.30	Email counsel for parties who have filed applications for admin claims re continuance of hearing
02/09/15	TJM	1.20	Draft, edit and revise motion to continue hearings re admin claim applications
02/09/15	DSA	0.20	Reviewed e-mails concerning issues with continuance of administrative claims hearing (.2)
02/09/15	ALS	0.20	Emails from/to W. Hueske regarding preparation of claims analysis
02/09/15	ALS	2.30	Initial preparation of analysis of scheduled and filed claims
02/10/15	ALS	1.40	Complete unsecured claim analysis (1.3); email to W. Hueske regarding same (.1)
02/10/15	TJM	0.30	Research re objection to CP proof of claim

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

02/10/15	TJM	2.00	Draft and revise motion to continue hearings and related deadlines re applications for admin claims
02/10/15	WAH	2.40	Corresponding with A. Stewart re MMA claims analysis and reviewing and analyzing proofs of claims for potential objections.
02/11/15	WAH	2.60	Reviewing and analyzing proofs of claims for potential objections.
02/11/15	TJM	4.50	Research re subrogation re objection to CPR proof of claim (1.8); Draft, edit and revise objection to CPR proof of claim (1.7); Confer R Desai re 502(e)(1) grounds for objecting to proof of claim (0.8); Confer M Fagone re objection to CPR proof of claim (0.2)
02/11/15	ALS	0.10	Office conference with W. Hueske regarding claims analysis
02/11/15	DSA	0.10	Reviewed e-mails relating to administrative claims hearing (.1)
02/11/15	MAF	0.20	Office conference with T. McKeon regarding objection to CPs claim
02/12/15	DSA	0.60	Reviewed and made changes to consent motions for administrative claim hearings and conference with T. McKeon concerning issues with the local rules for same (.5)
02/12/15	TJM	1.60	Research, draft, edit, and revise Objection to CP proof of claim
02/12/15	WAH	1.90	Reviewing and analyzing proofs of claims for potential objections.
02/13/15	WAH	1.50	Reviewing and analyzing proofs of claims.
02/13/15	TJM	0.40	Confer w/ M Fagone re objection to CPR claim
02/13/15	TJM	0.50	Finalize motions to continue hearings re Admin Applications, and extend related deadlines, and email counsel for claimants re same

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

02/13/15	TJM	3.30	Research, draft, edit and revise objection to CP claim
02/13/15	DSA	0.10	Reviewed e-mails concerning issues with consent motion to extend administrative claims bar date (.1)
02/17/15	DSA	0.10	Reviewed e-mails concerning issues with consent to continuance of administrative claims bar date (.1)
02/17/15	KQ	0.90	Finalize and File the Second Consent Motion to Extend Deadlines and Continue Hearing re: Lexington Ins. Admin Claim and the Consent Motion to Continue Hearings on Parties' Applications for Administrative Expenses and to Extend Related Dates
02/17/15	KQ	0.40	Prepare and send e-mail service related to the Second Consent Motion to Extend Deadlines and Continue Hearing re: Lexington Ins. Admin Claim and the Consent Motion to Continue Hearings on Parties' Applications for Administrative Expenses and to Extend Related Dates
02/17/15	KQ	0.40	Draft and file a Certificate of Service related to the Second Consent Motion to Extend Deadlines and Continue Hearing re: Lexington Ins. Admin Claim and the Consent Motion to Continue Hearings on Parties' Applications for Administrative Expenses and to Extend Related Dates
02/17/15	TJM	0.20	Email counsel for CIT and First Union re follow up on consent motion to continue hearing re admin application
02/17/15	TJM	2.30	Research, draft, edit and revise objection to CPR claim

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

02/17/15	TJM	0.50	Finalize consent motions to continue hearings and related deadlines re admin applications and coordinate filing re same*
02/17/15	TJM	0.10	Emails w/ K Quirk re filing of second consent motion re Lexington admin application
02/18/15	ALS	0.30	Docket scheduling relating to continued hearings and deadlines on administrative claim applications
02/19/15	TJM	0.80	Research, draft, revise, and edit objection to CPR proof of claim
02/20/15	TJM	2.20	Research, draft, edit and revise objection to CPR proof of claim
02/23/15	TJM	0.80	Confer with M Seidband re "new value" re preference actions
02/24/15	TJM	0.20	Review research re objection to CPR POC
03/03/15	TJM	5.20	Research, draft, edit and revise objection to CPR claim
03/03/15	WAH	0.80	Corresponding with A. Stewart and DSI re claims analysis.
03/03/15	ALS	0.10	Office conference with R. Keach and W. Hueske re claims analysis
03/03/15	ALS	2.70	Preparation of unsecured breakdown analysis using calculations sent by DSI
03/04/15	TJM	3.10	Research, draft, edit and revise objection to CPR claim
03/05/15	TJM	5.80	Research, draft, edit and revise objection to CPR claim (5.1) and confer M Fagone re same (0.7)
03/05/15	MRB	0.80	Review proof of claim from CPC (.2), conference with Fagone (.2), and research on subrogation claim (.4)
03/05/15	MAF	0.90	Review CPR proof of claim (.2); office conference with T. McKeon regarding same (.7)
03/06/15	TJM	4.70	Research, draft, edit and revise objection to CPR claim

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

03/09/15	TJM	0.10	Confer with M Fagone re section 509(a) and objection to CPR claim
03/09/15	TJM	3.00	Draft, edit, revise, and review research re objection to CPR proof of claim
03/09/15	MAF	0.00	Meeting with T. McKeon regarding Wheeling diminution claim (0.8 no charge)
03/10/15	DSA	0.40	Conference with T. McKeon concerning issues with objection to claims of CP (.3); reviewed e-mails and orders entered in case (.1)
03/10/15	TJM	5.30	Draft, edit, revise and review research re objection to CPR proof of claim
03/11/15	TJM	3.20	Draft, edit and revise claim objection re CPR
03/11/15	WAH	1.70	Reviewing revised claims analysis chart (1.2); corresponding with F. Caruso re claims (.5).
03/12/15	TJM	1.50	Edit and revise objection to CPR proof of claim
03/19/15	TJM	0.60	Review status of admin claims re comparing to list of settling parties while reviewing file re same
03/19/15	TJM	0.10	Confer with M Seidband re status of preference demand letters
03/20/15	WAH	1.00	Reviewing proofs of claims.
03/25/15	DSA	0.10	Reviewed e-mails and e-mailed parties concerning issues with tax claims (.1)
04/06/15	WAH	2.80	Reviewing claims analysis.
04/09/15	WAH	3.10	Reviewing proofs of claim and claims analysis.
04/10/15	WAH	2.30	Reviewing claims analysis.
04/14/15	WAH	2.30	Conference call with M. Farnsworth re claims analysis (.5); reviewing same (1.8).
04/15/15	TJM	0.20	Confer with K Quirk re continuing hearings on admin claims
04/15/15	TJM	0.10	Confer with Trustee re extension/continuance re admin claim applications

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

04/15/15	TJM	0.50	Draft emails counsel for clients re admin claim applications re continuance/extension of hearing and related deadline
04/16/15	TJM	0.40	Draft and send emails to counsel for parties that submitted admin claim applications re continuance of hearing
04/17/15	TJM	0.30	TC w/ counsel for Lexington re admin claim
04/17/15	TJM	0.20	TC w/ counsel for Lexington Insurance re admin claim (second, follow up call)
04/17/15	TJM	0.60	Review First Union settlement agreement re impact on Lexington Insurance (0.4) and confer R Desai re same (0.2)
04/17/15	TJM	0.10	Review admin claim application status
04/19/15	TJM	0.20	Email counsel for admin claim applications re continuance of hearing, deadlines, etc.
04/20/15	TJM	0.10	Email counsel for CP re continuance of hearing on admin claim
04/20/15	TJM	0.50	Draft, edit and revise motion to continue hearing re admin claim application re Lexington Insurance
04/20/15	TJM	2.00	Draft, edit and revise motion to continue hearing re admin claims re WFS, et al (0.5); Draft, edit and revise motion to continue hearing re admin claim application re CPR (0.7); Emails w/ opposing counsel re motions (0.4); Confer Trustee re same (0.2); Email counsel for parties re motions (0.2)
04/21/15	TJM	0.20	Finalize motion to continue hearing and extend deadlines re admin claim applications
04/21/15	TJM	0.10	Finalize motion to continue hearing and extend deadlines re CPR admin claim application

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

04/21/15	TJM	0.30	Finalize motion to continue hearing and extend deadlines re Lexington Insurance admin claim application re comments from Lexington Insurance
04/21/15	TJM	0.20	TC w/ counsel for First Union re motion to continue hearing re admin applications (0.1), and email re same (0.1)
04/21/15	TJM	0.10	Email counsels re continuance of hearing and extension of deadlines re admin claim applications
04/22/15	TJM	0.30	Review settlement agreement w/ Irving re New Brunswick Railway and Maine Northern Railway (0.2) and confer Trustee re same (0.1)
04/22/15	TJM	0.90	Prepare exhibits re preference demand letters (0.4) and confer M Seidband re same (0.2); Confer A Stewart re objection deadline re proof of claims (0.2) and confer W Hueske re same (0.1)
04/22/15	ALS	0.10	Office conference with T. McKeon re claims objections and related deadlines
04/22/15	ALS	0.10	Emails from/to R. Keach re Bar Date Motion
05/04/15	ALS	0.30	Office conference with R. Keach re J. Sternklar's request for claim information (.1); email to R. Keach attaching proof of claim filed by MMA in CCAA proceedings and MMAC proof of claim filed in U.S. Bankruptcy Court (.2)
06/01/15	TJM	2.10	Draft second demand letter to JPMorgan (0.8); Confer with M Seidband re case strategy and status (0.3); Research and review file re New Brunswick Southern Railway (0.8); TC w/ counsel for New Brunswick Southern Rail and Maine Northern Rail re responses to demand letters (0.2)

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

06/02/15	TJM	0.90	Research re "ordinary course of business" defense to preference demand (0.9)
06/04/15	ALS	0.10	Reply email to R. Desai re proof of claim filed by MMAC
06/10/15	RND	0.10	Email correspondence with R. Keach re: MMAC proof of claim
06/17/15	TJM	0.30	Confer with M Seidband re preference case strategies and status
06/17/15	TJM	0.20	Review file re CP's admin claim re preparation of objection
06/18/15	TJM	0.40	Review CP's application for admin claim re preparing objection to same
06/18/15	ALS	0.30	Reply email to R. Keach re correspondence from Groupe Maska (.1); review filed claims in response to correspondence from Groupe Maska (.2)
06/22/15	TJM	0.40	Confer w/ S Anderson and Trustee re response to CP admin claim (0.1) and email counsel for CP re same re briefing schedule (0.3)
06/22/15	TJM	0.20	Confer w/ M Seidband re analysis of preference claims
06/22/15	TJM	0.10	Review CP's admin claim
06/22/15	TJM	0.20	Review response to preference demand letter (0.1) and confer M Seidband re same (0.1)
06/22/15	TJM	0.10	Confer w/ M Seidband re preference actions and OCB defense
06/23/15	TJM	6.10	Draft, edit and revise settlement agreement w/ insurance carrier (5.8) and confer Trustee re same (0.3)
06/23/15	TJM	2.10	Draft, edit and revise objection to CP admin claim
06/23/15	TJM	0.10	TC w/ local counsel for CPR re admin claim deadlines

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

06/23/15	ALS	0.20	Office conference with T. McKeon re preparation of objection to administrative claim(.1); email to T. McKeon re preparation of objection to administrative claim (.1)
06/23/15	ALS	0.20	Emails from/to L. Zahradka re handling of Objection to Canadian Pacific Railway Companys Application for Allowance and Payment of Administrative Expense Claim
06/24/15	TJM	1.00	Emails w/ local counsel re continuation of hearing and extension of deadlines re CP admin claim (0.2) and confer local counsel re same (0.1); Draft, edit and revise motion continuing hearing and extending deadlines (0.7)
06/24/15	TJM	0.30	Update checklist re status re preferences claims
06/24/15	TJM	1.00	Edit and revise settlement agreement w/ insurer
06/24/15	TJM	2.10	Draft, edit and revise objection to CP admin claim
06/25/15	TJM	2.30	Revise and update preference status worksheet re current status of collection efforts and proposed settlements/next steps
06/29/15	DSA	0.30	Conference with L. Zahradka concerning issues with administrative expense claims (.3)
07/01/15	DSA	0.20	Reviewed e-mails concerning issues with Irving's 1171 claims (.2)
07/06/15	ALS	0.50	Review email L. Zahradka re calculation of claims relating to Maine Northern Railway and New Brunswick Southern Railway (.1); review claims filed by Maine Northern Railway and New Brunswick Southern Railway (.2); email to L. Zahradka re calculation relating to claims filed by Maine Northern Railway and New Brunswick Southern Railway (.2)

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

07/06/15	TJM	0.50	Review preference summary analysis and confer M Seidband re same (0.1) and email Trustee re same (0.1); Review response to preference demand letter from New Brunswick (0.3)
07/07/15	TJM	0.80	Review NBSR response to preference demand letter (0.6) and confer M Seidband re same (0.2)
07/07/15	ALS	0.10	Emails to/from R. Keach re claims analysis
07/09/15	ALS	0.10	Email to R. Keach re CCAA claims
07/09/15	KQ	0.40	Obtain and review the CCAA Proofs of Claim
07/16/15	TJM	0.40	Review emails from DSI re preferences (0.2); Review response to preference demand letter (0.2)
07/20/15	LKZ	0.20	Research re: claims objections (.1); confer w/B.Keach re: same (.1);
07/21/15	LKZ	2.80	Review CP proofs of claim (.7); review bar date order i/c/w same (.2); revise FOO re: CP claim objection (.2); revise CP claim objection (1.6); confer w/B.Keach re: same (.1).
07/21/15	TJM	0.10	Review objection to CP proof of claim (0.1)
07/21/15	TJM	0.10	Confer with Trustee and S Anderson re preference actions
07/22/15	TJM	0.10	Review email from Trustee re claim objections
07/22/15	LKZ	3.40	Revise CP claim objection (.9); confer w/B.Keach re: Irving RRs Claims Objection (.2); research i/c/w same (2.3).
07/23/15	LKZ	5.40	Prep for (.3) and meeting w/B.Keach and A.Stewart (.3) re: claims analysis; revise CP claim objection (2.7); review various proofs of claim (1.0); confer w/B.Keach re: 1171(b) research (.7); update claims objection chart (.4).

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

07/23/15	DSA	0.60	Reviewed e-mails and e-mailed Trustee concerning issues with claims objections (.2); telephone conference with F. Caruso concerning issues with claims objections and issues with turnover of Rail World property (.2); reviewed e-mails and e-mailed the Trustee concerning issues with same (.2)
07/23/15	ALS	1.80	Meeting with R. Keach and L. Zahradka re claims objections (.3); review emails from R. Keach and L. Zahradka re claims objections (.6); obtain claims for attorney review (.4); office conference with T. McKeon re claims objections (.1); review revised claims analysis sent by F. Caruso (.4)
07/23/15	ALS	0.30	Emails to/from R. Keach and L. Zahradka re claim filed by Telus Communications Company (.1); telephone conference with L. Zahradka re Telus claim (.1); draft email to S. Travitsky re Telus claim (.1)
07/23/15	CBB	0.40	Research re: section 558 and claim objections.
07/23/15	TJM	0.90	Review materials and agreements re rail car lease related claims
07/23/15	TJM	0.10	Review emails b/w Trustee, S Anderson and F Caruso re claim objections
07/24/15	ALS	0.10	Email to S. Travitsky re claim filed by Telus
07/24/15	LKZ	2.50	Various claims analysis (.3); research i/c/w/ same (.9); confer w/B.Keach re: 1171(b) research (.3), CP claim objection (.2), Telus claim (.1); revise CP objection (.4); emails w/F.Caruso re: claims (.1); emails w/A.Adessky re: same (.1)x2.
07/27/15	LKZ	2.80	Revise CP Claim objection (1.1); draft Durant wrongful termination claim objection (1.6); review emails re: Andersons correspondence (.1).

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

07/27/15	ALS	0.20	Email to R. Keach and L. Zahradka re proof of claim filed by Vermont Department of Taxes (.1); review proof of claim filed by Vermont Department of Taxes (.1)
07/27/15	TJM	0.20	Research re 546(a) deadline
07/27/15	TJM	0.60	Review settlement counteroffer from Andersons (0.1) and email S Anderson re same (0.1); Confer with S Anderson re status of preference negotiations (0.4)
07/28/15	LKZ	3.60	Further draft Durant wrongful termination claim objection (1.8); research re: same (1.0); confer w/Labor team re: same (.6); confer w/B.Keach re: same (.2).
07/29/15	LKZ	5.20	Further draft Durant claim objection (2.2); emails w/B.Keach re: same (.1); research re: same (1.7); emails w/F.Caruso re: underlying documentation for same (.2); review documentation (.2); emails w/B.Keach re: same (.1); draft form of order for same (.2); emails w/T.McKeon re: Andersons claim objection (.2) and emails w/B.Keach re: same (.1); update claim objection status chart (.2).
07/30/15	LKZ	6.50	Emails w/K.Libby re: wrongful termination claim objection (.1); draft objection to Meredith Mgmt claim (1.1); research i/c/w same (.8); review Debtor's schedules (.4), emails w/A.Stewart re: order granting extension of time to file same (.1)x2; confer w/S.Anderson, T.McKeon, B.Keach re: claims objections, timing (.2); draft Meredith obj. FOO (.1); emails w/A.Stewart re: underlying documentation for same (.1)x3; emails w/State of Maine re: tax claims (.2); review schedules re: same (.2); confer w/S.Anderson

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

07/30/15	DSA	1.70	re: same (.2); review Wheeling claim (.4), disclosure statement description of various disputes (.6), adversary proceeding pleadings (1.1); emails w/Telus re: claim (.2); confer w/B.Keach re: same (.2); call w/Richter re: same (.1); begin draft of Wheeling claim objection (.6) and research i/c/w same (.8). Telephone conference with F. Caruso concerning issues with claims objections (.3); conference with T. McKeon concerning issues with claims objections (.7); conference with Trustee and others concerning issues with claims objections (.3); conference with L. Zadradka concerning issues with claims objections (.2); conference with L. Zadrakha concerning issues with tax claims (.2)
07/30/15	TJM	2.20	Confer with S Anderson re claim objections re rail car leases (0.7); TC w/ S Anderson and F Caruso re claim objections re rail car leases (0.3); Confer w/ S Anderson, L Zahradka, and Trustee re claim objection strategy (0.5); Review 1168 stipulation and agreements re GATX and lease rejection motions and orders (0.6); Email claim objection group re same (0.1)
07/31/15	LKZ	6.70	Further draft Center Beam claim objection (1.8); call w/F.Caruso e: Maine State tax claim (.4); call w/K.Crosman re: same (.2)(.1); call w/Telus claimant re: claim (.4); research I/c/w Center Beam claim objection (.8) review GATX PoC (.3), underlying contracts (.4) and financial analysis re: same (.3); begin draft of GATX claim objection (1.8); draft list of outstanding questions to F.Caruso re: same (.2).

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

08/04/15	LKZ	3.00	Analysis re: additional railcar lease PoCs (.6), underlying documentation (.8) and schedules (.2); draft objection to Midwest PoC (.8); draft email to F.Caruso re: same (.4); emails w/A. Stewart (.1), B.Keach (.1) re: Meredith Mgmt PoC.
08/05/15	LKZ	3.30	Emails w/A.Adessky re: claims resolution status (.2); review Wheeling PoC and background materials (.6); confer w/M.Siedband (.1), S.Anderson re: same (.3); draft list of outstanding claims objection questions for B.Keach (.4); begin draft of Wheeling claim objection (1.7).
08/05/15	DSA	0.40	Reviewed e-mails concerning issues with status of claims of certain rail car lessors (.2); conference with L. Zahradka concerning issues with Wheeling claims (.2)
08/05/15	ALS	0.60	Preparation of draft derailment proof of claim schedule with respect to claims objections
08/06/15	DSA	0.10	Telephone conference with the Andersons concerning issues with claims (.1)
08/06/15	LKZ	4.50	Emails w/B.Keach re: claims objection questions (.2); confer w/B.Keach re: consent 3018 motion for FRA (.2); research re: underlying claim (.2) and standard for same (.2); draft same (1.4); prep for (.4) and call w/A.Adessky re: claims questions (1.1); confer w/B.Keach re: additional claims issues (.8).
08/07/15	LKZ	5.20	Revise CP Claim objection (1.9); review research i/c/w same (.8); confer w/B.Keach re: same (.2); review filing version of same (.2); supervise filing same (.2); further draft FRA 3018 consent motion (.5); revise Durant claim

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

			objection (.5); emails w/K.Quirk re: filing same (.2); draft Currie claims objection (.5); emails w/B.Keach re: same, claims objection status (.2).
08/07/15	KQ	0.30	Finalize and file the objection to CP's claim
08/07/15	KQ	0.30	Draft Notice of Hearing related to the objection to CP's claim
08/07/15	ALS	0.20	Docket scheduling with respect to Objection to CP's Proof of Claim(.1); assist K. Quirk with filing of Objection to CP's Proof of Claim (.1)
08/07/15	ALS	0.20	Emails from/to L. Zahradka re filing of claims objections
08/08/15	KQ	0.30	Draft Notice of Hearing related to the objection to claim filed by Durant
08/08/15	LKZ	0.10	Emails w/K.Quirk re: NOH for claims objection.
08/10/15	LKZ	4.60	Revise 3018 consent motion for FRA (.6); research i/c/w Midwest claims objection (1.3); revise same (1.0); emails w/B.Keach re: same (.2); review GATX (.2) and Center Beam (.2) PoCs for same issues; confer w/B.Keach re: claims objection status (.3); revise Meredith Mgmt Claims objection (.8).
08/10/15	KQ	0.10	Revise Notice of Hearing related to the objection to claim of Jeffrey Durant
08/10/15	KQ	0.20	Prepare and send e-mail service of the objection to CP's Proof of Claim
08/10/15	KQ	0.60	Draft and file the Certificate of Service related to the objection to CP's Proof of Claim
08/10/15	KQ	0.20	Finalize and file the objection to Proof of Claim submitted by Jeffrey Durant
08/10/15	KQ	0.90	Draft, finalize and file the Certificate of Service related to the objection to Proof of Claim submitted by Jeffrey Durant

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

08/10/15	KQ	0.30	Draft Notice of Hearing regarding objection to Proof of Claim submitted by Stephen Currie
08/10/15	KQ	0.40	Finalize, file and serve the objection to proof of claim submitted by Stephen Currie
08/10/15	KQ	0.60	Draft and file the Certificate of Service related to the objection to proof of claim submitted by Stephen C. Currie
08/10/15	ALS	0.30	Docket scheduling with respect to claims objections
08/10/15	DSA	0.10	Reviewed objection to Currie claim against the estate (.1)
08/11/15	ALS	0.10	Docket scheduling re hearing date and objection deadline on Trustee's Objection to Stephen Currie's proof of claim
08/11/15	KQ	0.40	Determine if parties on matrix from Maryland are creditors or parties in interest and e-mail to L. Zahradka regarding same.
08/11/15	KQ	0.20	Draft the Notice of Hearing regarding the objection to claim filed by The Meredith Management Group
08/11/15	KQ	0.10	Office conference with T. McKeon regarding additional parties to serve the summons and preference complaint
08/11/15	KQ	0.30	Finalize and file the objection to proof of claim filed by The Meredith Management Group
08/11/15	KQ	0.40	Prepare and send service of the objection to proof of claim filed by The Meredith Management Group
08/11/15	KQ	0.20	Finalize and file the Certificate of Service related to the objection to proof of claim filed by The Meredith Management Group

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

08/11/15	DSA	0.70	Reviewed e-mails on status of claims objections for railcar lessors and issues with preference settlements (.2); reviewed objection to CP claims filed by the Trustee (.1); telephone conference with R. Barr concerning issues with claims (.3); reviewed claim objection against Meridith Management (.1)
08/11/15	LKZ	10.20	Supervise filing of Meredith Mgmt claim objection (.2); revise Midwest claim objection (4.9); substantial research i/c/w same (3.9); draft email memo to B.Keach re: same (.7); emails w/K.Quirk re: various research issues for Midwest claims objection (.3); revise 3018 consent motion for FRA (.1); emails w/FRA re: same (.1).
08/12/15	LKZ	7.40	Draft FOO for Midwest claims objection (.1); emails w/K.Quirk re: NOH for same (.1) and Wheeling claim objection (.1); revise Wheeling claim objection (1.6); substantial research i/c/w same (1.3); emails w/B.Keach re: same (.1); confer w/F.Caruso re: railcar lease claims objection questions (.8); draft email to F.Caruso re: outstanding issues (.6); follow-up analysis I/c/w same (.8); confer w/B.Keach re: same (.3); revise Wheeling claim objection per B.Keach comments (.5); revise Midwest claim objection per B.Keach comments (1.1).
08/12/15	KQ	0.30	Draft Notice of Hearing related to the objection to Wheeling's Proof of Claim
08/12/15	KQ	0.10	Draft Notice of Hearing for the objection to the claim filed by Midwest Railcar
08/12/15	DSA	0.10	Reviewed e-mails and e-mailed parties concerning issues with the claim of Andersons (.1)

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

08/13/15	LKZ	0.30	Draft email to F.Caruso re: status of claims objections (.2); confer w/B.Keach re: same (.1).
08/14/15	LKZ	4.10	Calls w/F.Caruso re: railcar leases (.3)(.2); emails (.2) and confer (.2) w/B.Keach re: same; confer w/M.Siedband re: Helm/First Union and relation to Center Beam claim (.1); revise claims objections accordingly (1.3); review filing versions of Midwest (.8), Wheeling (.6) claims objections; call w/counsel to Union re: Durant and Currie claims objections (.2); emails w/B.Keach re: same (.2).
08/14/15	KQ	1.60	Finalize and file and serve the objection to claims for Wheeling and Midwest
08/14/15	KQ	0.40	Draft, file and serve the Amended Notice of Hearing related to the objection to Wheeling's claim
08/14/15	ALS	0.40	Docket scheduling re claims objections
08/15/15	LKZ	0.10	Emails w/B.Keach re: stipulation re: Currie and Durant claims objections.
08/17/15	LKZ	2.60	Revise FRA 3018 consent motion (.5); review local rules re: same (.4); confer w/A.Stewart re: same (.2); emails w/B.Keach re: same (.2); draft Durant claims stip (.6), review local rules re: same (.4); confer w/A.Stewart (.1), K.Quirk (.1), B.Colwell (.1) re: same.
08/17/15	KQ	0.40	Finalize and file the Certificates of Service for the objections to the claims filed by Wheeling and Midwest
08/17/15	ALS	0.20	Emails from/to L. Zahradka re papering a resolution of claims objections

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

08/17/15	TJM	1.90	Admin Claims - review file re status of admin claims (0.2); Draft and email counsel for parties that filed admin claims re continuance of hearing date (0.8); Draft, edit and revise motions to continue hearings on admin claims and extend deadlines (0.9)
08/18/15	ALS	0.30	Docket scheduling with respect to Consent Motion for Order Granting Temporary Allowance of Claims of Federal Railroad Administration (.1); office conferences with L. Zahradka re filing/service of Consent Motion for Order Granting Temporary Allowance of Claims of Federal Railroad Administration (.2)
08/18/15	ALS	0.20	Emails from/to L. Zahradka re upcoming hearing on administrative expense applications
08/18/15	KQ	0.20	Finalize and file the consent motion for order granting temporary allowance of claims of the FRA
08/18/15	KQ	2.50	Prepare service related to the consent motion for temporary allowance of FRA claims
08/18/15	KQ	0.80	Draft and file the Certificate of Service related to the consent motion for temporary allowance of FRA claims
08/18/15	KQ	0.20	E-mails to and from L. Zahradka and C. Pullo (Prime Clerk) regarding holders of claims in class 13.
08/18/15	LKZ	2.40	Review filing version of FRA 3018 consent motion (.2); emails w/K.Quirk re: same (.3); emails w/FRA re: same (.1); prepare service copies of same (1.1); emails w/K.Quirk re: Durant admin claim application (.1); confer w/A.Stewart (.1), T.McKeon (.1) re: same; revise order resolving claims objection accordingly (.2); emails w/B.Keach re: same (.2).

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

08/19/15	LKZ	0.40	Review MDOT PoCs (.2) and Plan treatment (.1) and draft email to B.Keach re: same (.1).
08/19/15	TJM	0.40	Review motions to continue admin hearings (0.2); Confer A Stewart re scheduling admin hearings (0.1); TC w/ Texas counsel for Lexington Ins. re continuance (0.1)
08/20/15	TJM	0.20	Email counsel for Lexington re continuance/extension re admin claim
08/20/15	LKZ	0.30	Confer w/various claimants re: resolution of claim objections (.2); confer w/B.Keach re: status of same (.1).
08/21/15	LKZ	0.20	Review ME AG claims question and confer w/B.Keach re: same (.1); call w/J.Kaplan re: Durant and Currie claims objection resolution (.1).
08/22/15	TJM	0.10	Finalize motion to continue hearing re Lexington admin claim (0.1)
08/24/15	LKZ	0.20	Call w/K.Crossman (ME AG) re: railroad tax claims, treatment of income tax claims.
08/24/15	KQ	0.40	Finalize and file the Fourth Consent Motion to Continue Hearing re CPR's Administrative Claim
08/24/15	KQ	0.20	Finalize and file the Fourth Consent Motion to Continue Hearing re CPR's Admin Claim
08/24/15	KQ	0.20	Prepare and serve via electronic mail the Fourth Consent Motion to Continue Hearing re CPR's Admin Claim
08/24/15	KQ	0.60	Finalize, file and serve the Fourth Consent Motion to Extend Deadlines and Continue Hearing re: Lexington Admin Claim
08/25/15	KQ	0.30	Finalize and file the Third Consent Motion to Continue Hearings on Parties' Applications for Administrative Expense and to Extend Related Deadlines

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

08/25/15	KQ	0.20	Prepare and send e-mail service of the Third Consent Motion to Continue Hearings on Parties' Applications for Administrative Expense and to Extend Related Deadlines
08/25/15	KQ	0.30	Draft and file via ECF the Certificate of Service related to the Third Consent Motion to Continue Hearings on Parties' Applications for Administrative Expense and to Extend Related Deadlines
08/25/15	DSA	0.20	Reviewed e-mails and orders entered in case relating to administrative claims (.2)
08/25/15	LKZ	0.20	Call w/counsel to Union re: Durant & Currie claims and admin claim applications (.1); draft email to counsel re: same (.1).
08/26/15	LKZ	0.40	Review revised consent order from counsel (.1); emails w/counsel re: same (.2); review motions to continue various admin claim applications (.1).
08/31/15	LKZ	0.20	Emails w/B.Keach re: stipulation resolving Durant claims objection.
09/01/15	LKZ	0.30	Draft Durant stipulation for Currie (.2); emails w/counsel to union re: same (.1).
09/02/15	KQ	0.10	Telephone call to court and e-mail to L. Zahradka regarding lack of objections and need for hearing on consent motion for order allowing temporary allowance of claims of FRA
09/09/15	KQ	0.20	E-mails from/to Chantal Comtois of the Ministry of Justice in Quebec regarding the hearing on CP's Motion for Estimation and Temporary Allowance of their Claims
09/10/15	KQ	0.10	E-mail to C. Comtois at the Ministry of Justice in Quebec regarding CP's motion for estimation and temporary allowance of claim
09/27/15	DSA	0.10	Reviewed e-mails relating to preference claims and claims objections (.1)

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

09/29/15	LKZ	0.50	Call w/Durant re: wrongful termination claim stipulation (.3) and revise same (.1); review status of responses to claim objections (.1).
09/29/15	LKZ	0.30	Call w/A.Adessky re: status of claims review.
09/30/15	KQ	0.20	Finalize and file the proposed order resolving the Durant claim objection
09/30/15	KQ	0.20	Finalize and file the proposed order resolving the objections to claim by Stephen Currie
09/30/15	LKZ	0.30	Calls w/claimants re: claims objections (.1); confer w/B.Keach re: same (.1); filing consent orders re: same (.1).
10/01/15	LKZ	0.30	Review Wheeling response to trustee's claim objection.
10/01/15	KQ	0.50	Draft and file the Certificate of Service related to the 5th Consent Motion to Extend Deadlines related to Lexington and the 4th Consent Motion to Continue Hearings related to admin claims
10/01/15	KQ	0.30	Finalize and file via ECF the 5th Consent Motion to Extend Deadlines related to Lexington and the 4th Consent Motion to Continue Hearings related to admin claims
10/08/15	MAS	0.10	Review filed claim and motion to extend deadlines.
10/08/15	MAS	0.10	Exchange emails with counsel to late-filed wrongful death claimant re: extension of deadlines and hearing.
10/09/15	MAS	0.80	Finalize dates for continued hearing on late-filed claimant's claim and draft motion to extend deadlines and continue hearing.
10/09/15	KQ	0.40	Finalize, file and serve the Consented to Motion for Order Extending Deadline and Rescheduling Hearing with respect to the Estate of Yvon Ricard

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

10/09/15	KQ	0.20	Draft and file the Certificate of Service related to the Consented to Motion for Order Extending Deadline and Rescheduling Hearing with respect to the Estate of Yvon Ricard
10/09/15	ALS	0.10	Email to M. Siedband re continuance of hearing on Motion to File Claims After Claims Bar Date
10/14/15	LKZ	0.40	Confer w/B.Keach re: claims objections.
10/15/15	LKZ	2.60	Draft objection to Irving 1171(b) claim (1.9); review Debtor's schedules (.2), Irving RRs' PoCs (.3), in connection with same; emails w/B.Keach (.1), F.Caruso (.1) re: same.
10/16/15	LKZ	2.50	Further draft Irving claim objection (2.0), draft FOO (.3), draft email to B.Keach re: same (.1) and review Local Rules Re: same (.1).
10/19/15	LKZ	2.90	Emails w/B.Keach re: hearing requirements for claim objections (.1) and research re: same (.2); emails w/B.Keach re: scheduling Wheeling claim objection (.1); revise Wheeling Claim Objection (.8), FOO (.2); draft motion to expedite same (.7), FOO (.2), NOH (.1); emails w/B.Keach re: same (.1); emails w/K.Quirk (.1)x2, A.Stewart (.1)x2 re: filing same.
10/19/15	ALS	0.50	Filing of Objection to Trustee's Objection to Claims of New Brunswick Southern Railway Company Limited and Maine Northern Railway Company Limited, Motion for Expedited Hearing and Notice of Hearing (.3); emails from/to L. Zahradka re same (.2)
10/21/15	LKZ	0.30	Call w/A.Levine re: Irving RRs claim objection.

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

10/23/15	LKZ	0.10	Review objection deadlines to motions to late file claims and email w/A.Lepene re: witnesses for Trustee's objection to 1171(b) claims.
10/26/15	LKZ	0.30	Emails w/A.Lepene re: discovery for 1171(b) claim objection (.1); call w/A.Lepene re: same (.2).
10/27/15	LKZ	1.60	Draft opposition to motion to late file claims (.9); research re: same (.5); confer w/M.Siedband re: CP declaration and exhibits re: Wheeling claim objection (.1); research re: same (.1).
10/28/15	LKZ	1.10	Review email from A.Lepene re: Irving RR claim objection (.2); review claim objection i/c/w same (.2); draft email to B.Keach re: conversation w/F.Caruso (.2); analysis re: same (.3); draft email to A.Lepene re: same (.2).
10/29/15	LKZ	5.40	Email w/A.Lepene re: 1171(b) claim objection (.1); further draft opposition to Tafisa motion to late file claims (3.3), research re: same (1.9), and emails w/B.Keach re: same (.1).
10/30/15	LKZ	0.60	Review email from M.Siedband re: status of Wheeling adversary proc/claim obj (.2); call w/A.Lepene re: MN/NB RR Claim objection (.2); confer w/B.Keach re: same (.1); emails w/A.Lepene re: same (.1).
Total 05		322.50	

06 **Employee Benefits/Pensions**

Date	ATTY	Hours	
10/06/14	DSA	0.60	Telephone conferences with G. Ryan concerning

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

				issues with severance agreement for T. Quint (.2); telephone conferences with T. Quint concerning issues with employment (.4)
12/29/14	DSA	1.30		Telephone conference with F. Caruso concerning issues with termination of employees and Derby lease (.3); e-mailed J. Fischer concerning issues with termination of employees (.2); reviewed e-mails and e-mailed parties concerning issues with status of termination agreements (.3); telephone conference with M. Terasevich concerning issues with termination notices (.3); telephone conference with F. Caruso concerning issues with termination notices (.2)
12/29/14	MT1	0.20		Confer with Attorney Anderson regarding Derby separation issues.
12/30/14	MT1	0.60		Review separation letters and severance agreement for Attorney Anderson; comment on same.
12/30/14	DSA	1.40		Reviewed e-mails concerning issues with Derby severance (.1); reviewed severance agreement and e-mailed CMQ concerning issues with same (.3); telephone conferences with J. Fischer concerning issues with severance agreements (.3); reviewed e-mails and changes to severance agreements and e-mailed parties concerning same (.7)
01/05/15	DSA	0.90		Telephone conference with F. Caruso concerning issues with termination notices (.2); telephone conference with employee concerning issues with severance agreement (.2); e-mailed parties concerning issues with terms of severance (.1); telephone conferences with F. Caruso and J. Fischer concerning issues with workers' compensation claims (.4)

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

01/06/15	DSA	0.30	Reviewed e-mails concerning issues with severance payments and workers' compensation claims (.2); telephone conference with F. Caruso concerning issues with workers' compensation claims (.1)
01/07/15	DSA	0.20	Reviewed e-mails and e-mailed parties concerning issues with severance agreements (.2)
01/08/15	DSA	0.30	Reviewed e-mails and e-mailed parties concerning issues with severance agreements (.2); telephone conference with J. Fischer concerning issues with same (.1)
01/09/15	DSA	0.20	Reviewed documents relating to injury for workers' compensation claim relating to severance agreements (.2)
01/12/15	DSA	0.20	Reviewed e-mails relating to severance agreements (.2)
01/13/15	DSA	0.30	Reviewed e-mails concerning issues with severance agreements for Derby employees (.1); reviewed e-mails and e-mailed parties concerning issues with severance agreements and issues with Wheeling appeal (.2)
01/22/15	DSA	0.10	Reviewed e-mails concerning issues with workers' compensation termination (.1)
01/23/15	DSA	0.10	Reviewed e-mails concerning issues with workers' compensation insurance (.1)
01/28/15	MT1	0.20	Confer with client regarding potential WC claims.
01/29/15	DSA	0.10	Reviewed e-mails concerning issues with workers' compensation claims (.1)

Total	06	7.00	

07 **Fee/Employment Applications**

Date ATTY Hours

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

10/01/14	ALS	0.80	Filing and service of Fourth Supplemental Declaration of Michael St. Patrick Baxter, Esq., in Support of the Application Authorizing the Employment of Covington & Burling LLP
10/01/14	ALS	0.20	Docket scheduling relating to Motion to Amend the Terms of Retention of Development Specialists, Inc.,
10/01/14	ALS	0.20	Emails from/to R. Keach regarding filing of Fourth Supplemental Declaration of Michael St. Patrick Baxter, Esq., in Support of the Application Authorizing the Employment of Covington & Burling LLP (.1); conference with R. Desai regarding filing of Fourth Supplemental Declaration of Michael St. Patrick Baxter, Esq., in Support of the Application Authorizing the Employment of Covington & Burling LLP (.1)
10/01/14	DSA	0.10	Reviewed e-mails concerning changes to scope of DSI retention application (.1)
10/01/14	KQ	0.40	Draft Certificate of Service related to the Motion to Amend Retention of DSI
10/01/14	KQ	2.10	Finalize, file via ECF and serve the Motion to Amend Retention of DSI
10/01/14	KQ	0.10	File via ECF the Certificate of Service related to the Motion to Amend Retention of DSI
10/01/14	WAH	0.80	Drafting, reviewing, and revising DSI amendment to retention.
10/03/14	BBC	0.10	Conference with Trustee re: fee application for DSI.
10/06/14	BBC	0.30	Continue drafting second interim fee application of DSI.
10/06/14	BBC	0.20	Draft notice of hearing for DSI's second fee application.

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

10/08/14	BBC	0.10	Conference with Sam Anderson re: second interim fee application of DSI.
10/08/14	BBC	0.20	Review emails from F Caruso re: DSI second interim fee application.
10/08/14	BBC	0.20	Draft Notice of Second Interim Fee Application of DSI.
10/08/14	BBC	2.70	Draft second interim fee application of DSI.
10/13/14	RND	0.10	Correspondence with Covington and Burling re: filing of Michael St. Patrick Baxter supplemental declaration
10/14/14	BBC	0.30	Revise second interim fee application for DSI based on comments from Sam Anderson.
10/14/14	DSA	0.40	Reviewed and made changes to DSI fee application papers (.4)
10/15/14	DSA	1.90	Reviewed e-mails and conference with B. Colwell concerning issues with status of fee applications (.2); began reviewing and making changes to Bernstein fee application (.4); conference with B. Colwell concerning issues with changes to DSI fee application (.2); reviewed additional changes to the DSI fee application after changes made by B. Colwell (.3); telephone conference with F. Caruso concerning issues with fee applications (.3); began reviewing and making changes to Fee Examiner fee application (.5)
10/15/14	KQ	0.10	E-mail to B. Colwell regarding service requirements for the filing of the fee application of RJK and BSSN
10/15/14	KQ	2.40	Begin preparation of service for the interim fee application of BSSN and RJK
10/15/14	BBC	0.20	Conference with Sam re: second interim fee application for DSI.
10/15/14	BBC	0.60	Revise second interim fee application for DSI based on comments from Sam Anderson.

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

10/15/14	BBC	0.30	Continue drafting second interim fee application of DSI.
10/15/14	BBC	4.60	Revise Fee Examiner's second interim fee application to include September (2.4); Revise BSSN's second interim fee application to include September (2.2).
10/15/14	ALS	0.10	Conference with K. Quirk regarding timing of filing of second interim fee applications and service of same
10/16/14	BBC	0.20	Conference with Sam Anderson re: revisions to second fee application for the Trustee.
10/16/14	BBC	0.20	Conference with Sam Anderson re: revisions to second interim fee application for BSSN.
10/16/14	BBC	0.20	Review email from F Caruso re: DSI fee application (0.1); draft/send email to F Caruso re: DSI fee application (0.1).
10/16/14	BBC	0.60	Revise fee application for DSI based on comments from F Caruso.
10/16/14	BBC	1.60	Revise Fee Examiner's second interim fee application based on comments from Sam Anderson.
10/16/14	BBC	1.40	Revise BSSN second interim fee application based on comments from Sam Anderson.
10/16/14	BBC	0.30	Draft/send email memo to Sam Anderson re: Trustee's second interim fee application.
10/16/14	BBC	0.70	Finalize second interim fee application for DSI for filing.
10/16/14	KQ	1.80	Begin preparation of service related to the Fee Applications of BSSN and RJK
10/16/14	KQ	0.70	Prepare Certificate of Service related to the second interim Fee Applications of BSSN and RJK

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

10/16/14	DSA	2.90	Continued reviewing and making further initial changes to Trustee's second fee application (.7); conference with B. Colwell concerning changes to Trustee's fee application (.2); reviewed and made changes to BSSN fee application (.6); conference with B. Colwell concerning initial changes to same (.2); reviewed and made further changes to Trustee's fee application after changes made by B. Colwell (.3); e-mailed B. Keach concerning issues with fee application for the Trustee (.3); reviewed and made further changes to Bernstein fee application after changes made by B. Colwell (.3); reviewed and made changes to notice of hearing for fee applications and proposed order (.3)
10/17/14	DSA	0.20	Reviewed e-mails and e-mailed B. Keach concerning issues with changes to fee applications (.2)
10/17/14	BBC	0.10	Revise DSI fee application based on email from F Caruso.
10/17/14	BBC	0.30	Review email from Trustee re: Trustee's second interim fee application (0.1); reply to email from Trustee re: second interim fee application (0.2).
10/23/14	KQ	1.50	Begin preparation of service for the fee applications of R. Keach, BSSN and DSI
10/24/14	KQ	0.10	Office conference with B. Colwell regarding filing and service of the fee applications of R. Keach and BSSN
10/24/14	KQ	0.40	Finalize and file the Second Fee Application of Development Specialists, Inc.
10/24/14	KQ	0.60	Finalize and file the Second Interim Fee Application of R. Keach, as Trustee

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

10/24/14	KQ	0.30	Revision to Certificate of Service related to the Second Interim Fee Applications of R. Keach, BSSN and DSI
10/24/14	KQ	5.10	Prepare and send service of Second Interim Fee Applications of R. Keach, BSSN, DSI and Verrill Dana
10/24/14	BBC	4.40	Revise Second Interim Fee Application of BSSN (1.6); Revise second interim fee application of Trustee (1.4); Conference with D Sam Anderson re: revisions to fee applications for BSSN and Trustee (0.2); draft/send email to A Stewart and K Quirk re: filing fee application for DSI (0.1); draft/send email to A Stewart and K Quirk re; filing fee application for BSSN (0.1); Meet with K Quirk re: filing of fee applications for BSSN, Trustee and DSI (0.1); conference with A Cummings (BSSN Staff) re: Trustee's revisions to Trustee's fee application (0.1); Conference with S Anderson re: service of Verrill Dana's notice of application (0.1); conference with S Swander and K Quirk re: filing of Verrill Dana's notice of application (0.3).
10/24/14	BBC	0.10	Conference with K Quirk re: service of fee applications for DSI, Trustee, BSSN.
10/24/14	DSA	1.60	Telephone conference with R. Clement concerning issues with fees and expenses (.1); reviewed and made changes to second fee application for Trustee (.4); reviewed and made changes to BSSN fee application and related documents (.4); reviewed and made changes to notices of hearings and proposed orders relating to fee applications (.3); telephone conference with R. Clement and coordinated service of documents

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

10/24/14	ALS	3.80	for VD and other fee applications (.5) Assist with service relating to Second Interim Fee Applications of Trustee, Bernstein Shur, DSI and Verrill Dana
10/24/14	ALS	0.30	Filing of Bernstein Shur's Second Interim Fee Application
10/27/14	ALS	0.10	Docket scheduling relating to Second Interim Fee Applications of Trustee, BSSN, DSI and Verrill Dana
10/27/14	ALS	0.10	Office conference with S. Anderson and K. Quirk regarding noticing of second interim fee applications
10/27/14	ALS	0.20	Telephone conference with K. Ford at U.S. Bankruptcy Court regarding hearing on motion to amend the terms of retention for DSI (.1); email to R. Keach regarding hearing on motion to amend the terms of retention for DSI (.1)
10/27/14	BBC	4.40	Conference with K Quirk re: notice on objection deadlines relating to the fee applications filed last week (0.2); conference with Trustee re: objection deadlines (0.2); Conference call with court re: re-noticing the objection deadlines (0.2); review and revise amended notice of hearing on the objection deadlines (0.5); draft/send email to Trustee re: notice (0.1); draft motion to expedite hearing on fee applications (2.6); draft notice of expedited hearing (0.6)
10/27/14	KQ	0.10	Telephone call with B. Colwell regarding notice from court regarding objection deadline on Notice of Hearing related to the fee applications of BSSN and RJK

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

10/27/14	KQ	0.20	Telephone call with the USDC in Bangor regarding objection deadline for hearing on fee applications for BSSN and RJK
10/27/14	KQ	0.80	Begin draft of Amended Notice of Hearing related to the second interim fee applications of BSSN and RJK
10/27/14	KQ	0.70	Draft Certificate of Service related to the fee applications of DSI, BSSN, RJK and VerrillDana
10/27/14	KQ	0.10	File via ECF the Certificate of Service related to the second interim fee applications of DSI, BSSN, RJK and VerrillDana
10/27/14	DSA	0.30	Conferences with B. Colwell concerning issues with service of fee applications and motion to expedite (.2); conference with B. Colwell concerning issues with motion to expedite fees applications (.1)
10/28/14	DSA	1.30	Reviewed e-mails and e-mailed F. Caruso concerning issues with scope of employment order (.2); reviewed rules of procedure in relation to fee applications (.3); reviewed and made changes to motion to expedite fee applications (.2); conference with B. Colwell concerning issues with same (.2); reviewed and made further changes to motion to expedite fee applications after further changes made by B. Colwell (.3); reviewed e-mails and e-mailed G. Levine concerning issues with second fee application (.1)
10/28/14	KQ	0.20	Office conference with A. Stewart and B. Colwell regarding service of expedited motion related to the second interim fee applications of DSI, BSSN, RJK and VerrillDana

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

10/28/14	KQ	1.10	Begin drafting Certificate of Service related to the Motion to Expedite related to the second interim fee applications of DSI, BSSN, RJK and VerrillDana
10/28/14	BBC	0.20	Conference with D Sam Anderson re: motion to expedite hearing on fee applications of Trustee, BSSN, DSI and Verrill Dana.
10/28/14	BBC	1.90	Revise Motion to Expedite fee applications of BSSN, Trustee, Verrill Dana, DSI based on comments from Sam Anderson.
10/28/14	BBC	2.20	Continue drafting motion to expedite hearing on fee applications.
10/28/14	ALS	0.30	Multiple conferences with B. Colwell and K. Quirk regarding service of motion to expedite relating to fee applications
10/29/14	BBC	1.10	Review engagement letters for Baker Newman Noyes for terms of payment and scope of employment.
10/29/14	DSA	0.60	Telephone conference with F. Caruso concerning issues with disclosure of assets and BNN fee applications (.4) ; reviewed e-mails relating to fee applications for various professionals (.2)
10/30/14	DSA	0.20	Reviewed e-mails relating to scope of work for BNN (.1)
10/30/14	BBC	3.30	Draft second interim fee application for Baker Newman Noyes (3.1); draft/send email to M Irish (BNN) re: second interim fee application (0.1); review email from M Irish re: BNN second interim fee application (0.1).
10/30/14	BBC	1.20	Revise and finalize motion to expedite fee application for BSSN, Trustee, DSI, and Verrill.

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

10/30/14	BBC	1.10	Draft motion to expedite second interim fee application of Kugler and second interim fee application of BNN.
10/30/14	ALS	0.10	Conference with B. Colwell and K. Quirk regarding filing of motion to expedite regarding fee applications
10/30/14	ALS	0.10	Docket scheduling relating to motion to expedite hearing on fee applications
10/30/14	ALS	0.30	Assist with service relating to motion to expedite hearing on fee applications
10/30/14	KQ	0.30	Finalize and file the Motion to Expedite Hearing on the Fee Applications of BSSN, Trustee, DSI and VerrillDana
10/30/14	KQ	0.30	Finalize and file the Certificate of Service related to the Motion to Expedite Hearing on the Fee Apps of BSSN, Trustee, Development Specialists and VerrillDana
10/31/14	ALS	0.20	Office conference with B. Colwell and K. Quirk regarding filing of additional fee applications for Trustee's professionals (.1); review docket for first interim fee applications filed by Trustee's professionals (.1)
10/31/14	BBC	0.10	Review email from M Irish (BNN) re: bios for second interim fee application of BNN.
10/31/14	BBC	2.30	Draft second interim fee application for Kugler Kandestin.
10/31/14	BBC	2.00	Continue drafting motion to expedite BNN and Kugler fee applications.
11/02/14	BBC	1.40	Continue drafting motion to expedite Kugler and BNN second fee applications (.8); continue drafting Kugler fee application (.6).

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

11/03/14	BBC	0.30	Revise proposed order for Trustee's second interim fee application reflecting revised distribution numbers.
11/03/14	BBC	0.10	Draft/send email to Trustee re: fee applications for BNN and Kugler.
11/03/14	ALS	0.30	Office conferences with B. Colwell (x2) regarding revised proposed Order relating to Trustee's Second Interim Fee Application (.2); telephone call to K. Ford at U.S. Bankruptcy Court regarding filing of revised proposed Order relating to Trustee's Second Interim Fee Application (.1)
11/04/14	BBC	0.20	Conference with K Quirk and S Swander (BSSN Staff) re: service of Kugler and BNN second fee applications.
11/04/14	BBC	0.50	Revise second interim fee application for BNN (0.2); draft/send email to M Irish with draft BNN fee application (0.1); review email from Sam Anderson re: proposed order on BNN fee application (0.1); review email from Sam Anderson on notice on BNN fee application (0.1).
11/04/14	KQ	0.10	Conference with B. Colwell regarding filing and preparation of service of the fee applications of Kugler Kandestin
11/04/14	DSA	0.40	Reviewed and made changes to BNN fee application (.3); reviewed and made changes to notice of hearing and order for BNN fee application (.1)
11/06/14	DSA	0.30	Reviewed and made changes to Kugler second fee application (.3)

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

11/06/14	BBC	1.90	Revise motion to expedite fee applications of BNN and Kugler (1.6); review email from G Sandborn re: BNN fee application (0.1); draft/send email to G Sandborn re: BNN fee application (0.1); draft email to Kugler re: fee application (0.1).
11/07/14	BBC	0.10	Draft/send email to R Keach re: status of motion to expedite BNN and Kugler fee applications.
11/07/14	BBC	0.30	Review email from I Chung re: fee application of Kugler (0.1); draft/send email response to I Chung re: same (0.1); review additional email from I Chung re: Kugler fee application (0.1).
11/07/14	BBC	0.40	Revise and finalize second fee application for Kugler Kandestin.
11/07/14	BBC	0.70	Revise and finalize Baker Newman second fee application.
11/07/14	BBC	0.70	Revise and finalize motion to expedite BNN and Kugler fee applications.
11/07/14	BBC	0.10	Conference with Trustee re: filing Motion to Expedite Kugler and BNN fee applications.
11/07/14	BBC	0.20	Conference with K Quirk re: filing and service of motion to expedite, BNN fee application and Kugler fee application.
11/07/14	ALS	0.40	Service of fee applications of Baker Newman and Kugler Kandestin, along with Motion to Expedite upon email service list
11/07/14	KQ	0.90	Finalize and file via ECF the Second Interim Fee Applications of Baker Newman & Noyes and Kugler Kandestin, and the Motion to Expedite related same.

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

11/10/14	KQ	1.00	Finalize drafting and file via ECF the Certificate of Service related to the second interim fee applications of Baker Newman & Noyes, Kugler Klandestin and related Motion to Expedite
11/10/14	ALS	0.20	Docket scheduling relating to Motion to Expedite Hearing, Second Interim Application of Baker Newman & Noyes and Kugler Kandestin
11/10/14	BBC	0.30	Review consent motion to extend time for UST to respond to Trustee's fee application (0.2); review order on consent motion (0.1).
11/10/14	BBC	0.10	Draft/send email to Trustee re: disbursement calculation for second interim fee application.
11/11/14	MAF	0.30	Call from D. Doyle regarding Shaw Fishman fee application (0.1); review same and e-mail to R. Keach regarding same (0.2)
11/13/14	MAF	0.10	E-mail from and to M. Troy regarding pending fee applications
11/13/14	KQ	0.10	File via ECF the revised proposed Order relating to the second interim fee application of the Trustee
11/13/14	BBC	0.40	Review email from Trustee re: revised proposed order (0.1); revise proposed order (0.2); conference with K Quirk re: filing revised proposed order (0.1).
11/14/14	BBC	0.80	Review draft fee application for Shaw Fishman (0.7); Call with D Doyle at Shaw Fishman re: filing fee application (0.1); Call with D Doyle at Shaw Fishman (second call on 11/14) re: filing Shaw Fishman fee application (0.2).
11/14/14	ALS	0.10	Conference with B. Colwell regarding filing of additional fee application

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

11/14/14	MAF	0.10	E-mails from R. Keach and F. Caruso regarding fee application; e-mail to M. Troy regarding same
11/16/14	DSA	0.90	Reviewed DSI fee application in advance of hearing (.3); reviewed motion to expedite fee hearings for certain professionals and reviewed Kugler and BNN fee applications and drafted notes in relation thereto for fee hearings (.6)
11/17/14	BBC	0.30	Conference with D Sam Anderson re: fee applications to be heard on November 18.
11/17/14	BBC	0.60	Call with D Doyle re: filing and serving fee application of Shaw Fishman (0.2); Finalize fee application of Shaw Fishman (0.4).
11/17/14	BBC	0.10	Conference with A Stewart re: fee applications to be heard 11/18.
11/17/14	BBC	0.10	Review email from A Stewart re: fee applications set for hearing on 11/18.
11/17/14	ALS	0.40	Telephone call to K. Ford at U.S. Bankruptcy Court regarding upcoming hearings on fee applications (.1); conference with S. Anderson and B. Colwell regarding upcoming hearings on fee applications (.2); email to S. Anderson regarding status of upcoming hearings on fee applications (.1)
11/17/14	ALS	0.50	Docket scheduling relating to First Application for Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses for Shaw Fishman Glantz & Towbin LLC (.2); assist K. Quirk with filing and service related issues regarding First Application for Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses for Shaw Fishman Glantz & Towbin LLC (.3)

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

11/17/14	KQ	0.60	Draft and file the Certificate of Service related to the first interim fee application of Shaw Fishman
11/17/14	KQ	0.30	Finalize and file via CM/ECF the fee application of Shaw Fishman
11/17/14	DSA	2.10	Conference with A. Stewart and e-mailed B. Keach concerning status of fee applications (.1); reviewed BSSN and Trustee fee applications and drafted notes in relation to fee hearings (1.4); conference with B. Colwell concerning issues with calculating Trustee fees (.3); telephone conference with F. Caruso concerning issues with operating reports and Trustee fee calculation (.3)
12/15/14	ALS	0.10	Email to R. Keach attaching Order Granting First Interim Fee Application of Shaw Fishman
12/15/14	BBC	0.20	Review order approving fees for Shaw Fishman.
03/10/15	ALS	0.10	Office conference with A. Cummings regarding fee applications
04/20/15	ALS	0.20	Emails from/to W. Hueske re contacting Trustee's professionals re outstanding fees
04/21/15	ALS	0.50	Draft certification of pro hac vice admission for L. Zahradka (.2); review Local Rules for D. Me re pro hac admission (.2); email to L. Zahradka attaching draft certification of pro hac admission (.1)
04/28/15	RND	4.40	Begin revising BSSN Retention Application re: chapter 15 filing
05/05/15	RND	0.10	Email correspondence with L. Zahradka re: employment of claims and noticing agent
05/05/15	ALS	0.30	Emails from/to L. Zahradka re application to employ/retain Prime Clerk (.1); review retention applications relating to Prime Clerk(.2)

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

05/05/15	LKZ	1.70	Begin draft of Prime Clerk retention app (.6), order (.2), affidavit (.4); review of local rules i/c/w same (.1); review Prime Clerk fee proposal (.2) and confer w/B. Keach re: same (.2).
05/06/15	LKZ	1.70	Call w/Prime Clerk re: retention proposal (.2); confer w/A. Stewart re: same (.2); draft email to B. Keach re: same (.2); confer w/B. Keach re: same (.3); review proposal (.2); update draft retention docs (.6).
05/07/15	LKZ	3.00	Further revise Prime Clerk retention app (1.2), order (.6), affidavit (.6); confer w/B. Keach re: same (.3), (.2).
05/07/15	ALS	0.50	Emails from/to L. Zahradka re application to employ/retain Prime Clerk (.2); obtain pleadings from various cases for L. Zahradka's review (.3)
05/08/15	LKZ	3.60	Confer w/B. Keach re: Prime Clerk proposal (.2), (.6); confer w/Prime Clerk re: same (.1), (.3); update retention documents accordingly (2.4).
05/11/15	LKZ	2.70	Confer w/A. Stewart (.2), B. Keach (.3), Prime Clerk (.2), (.2) re: Prime Clerk retention app; revise application (.5), order (.3), affidavit (.3) accordingly; confer w/A. Stewart re: list for Prime Clerk conflicts check (.2); review revised engagement agreement (.3) and confer w/B. Keach (.1), Prime Clerk (.1) re: same.
05/12/15	LKZ	2.20	Emails w/Prime Clerk re: retention app (.2), (.1), connections check (.2); confer w/A. Stewart re: same (.2); consider interim comp issue (.2) and emails w/Prime Clerk re: same (.1); revise motion to expedite notice on retention app (.6), order (.2) and notice of

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

				motion (.2); consult local rules re: same (.2).
05/12/15	ALS	0.20		Emails from/to L. Zahradka re retention of Prime Clerk
05/12/15	ALS	1.40		Finalize connections list for Prime Clerk's review (1.3); office conference with L. Zahradka re connections list for Prime Clerk's review (.1)
05/12/15	ALS	0.80		Preparation of motion to expedite hearing, proposed order and hearing notice re application to employ Prime Clerk
05/13/15	LKZ	0.80		Review Prime Clerk comments to retention apps and revise same accordingly (.5); emails w/Prime Clerk re: same (.2); emails w/B. Keach re: same (.1).
05/15/15	LKZ	0.40		Review Prime Clerk retention packet (.2); confer w/B. Keach re: same (.1).
05/18/15	LKZ	1.10		Revise Prime Clerk retention app and related docs as per B. Keach comments (.4); confer w/K.Quirk re: filing and service (.2)(.1); confer w/Prime Clerk re: signature page for affidavit (.2); review compiled application for filing (.2).
05/18/15	KQ	3.90		Finalize, file and serve the retention application of Prime Clerk as noticing and solicitation agent
05/18/15	ALS	0.10		Emails from/to L. Zahradka re filing of proposed order with Prime Clerk retention application
05/18/15	ALS	0.60		Assist with filing and service of Prime Clerk retention application
05/18/15	DSA	0.30		Reviewed motion and related documents relating to the retention of Prime Clerk (.3)
05/19/15	ALS	0.20		Review certificate of service re application to employ Prime Clerk

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

05/19/15	KQ	0.70	Address issues related to delivery of service of the application to employ Prime Clerk
05/19/15	KQ	0.10	Office conference with L. Zahradka regarding Certificate of Service for the Prime Clerk Application to Employ and related Motion to Expedite.
05/19/15	KQ	1.00	Draft and file the Certificate of Service related to the Prime Clerk Application for Employ and related Motion to Expedite.
05/19/15	DSA	0.10	Reviewed motion to expedite retention of claims agent (.1)
05/20/15	ALS	0.10	Email to L. Zahradka re Prime Clerk retention hearing
05/20/15	ALS	0.10	Email to M. Paione re hearing on Prime Clerk's retention application
05/21/15	BBC	1.90	Draft third interim fee application of Baker Newman Noyes.
05/21/15	BBC	0.20	Review email from Sam Anderson re: invoices of BNN (0.1); review email from M Irish re: same (0.1).
05/22/15	BBC	0.10	Conference with Trustee re: fee applications of BNN, BSSN and Trustee.
05/27/15	ALS	0.10	Emails from/to L. Zahradka re hearing on application to employ Prime Clerk
05/27/15	ALS	0.10	Office conference with L. Zahradka re objection deadline for Prime Clerk's retention application and anticipated date for order to enter
05/27/15	ALS	0.10	Review email from L. Zahradka to Prime Clerk re status of retention application and upcoming hearing
05/27/15	LKZ	0.10	Emails w/Prime Clerk re: objection deadline on retention app, next steps.
05/29/15	BBC	0.20	Conference with K Bigelow (BSSN Staff) re: final fee application of BSSN and Trustee.

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

06/01/15	BBC	0.20	Conference with K Bigelow re: final fee applications for BSSN and Trustee.
06/02/15	ALS	0.30	Emails to/from K. Ford at U.S. Bankruptcy Court re Order re Application to Employ Prime Clerk (.1); emails from/to L. Zahradka re Order re Application to Employ Prime Clerk (.2)
06/08/15	LKZ	0.10	Review Prime Clerk fee estimate and confer w/A.Stewart re: same.
06/24/15	LKZ	0.30	Call w/Prime Clerk re: interim fee apps (.2); emails w/B.Keach re: same (.1).
07/17/15	LKZ	0.80	Confer w/B.Colwell re: fee apps (.4); review local rules re: same (.2); confer w/B.Keach re: same (.2).
07/17/15	BBC	0.40	Conference with L Zahradka re: timeline for filing BSSN and Trustee's interim fee applications
07/21/15	BBC	0.40	Draft third interim fee application of BSSN as counsel to the Trustee.
07/23/15	BBC	0.10	Conference with K Bigelow (BSSN Staff) re: third interim fee application of BSSN.
08/07/15	MAS	1.90	Draft motion to employ Molleur Law as conflicts counsel for DRC Adversary.
08/10/15	MAS	0.30	Review changes from proposed conflicts counsel and email Bob Keach re: same.
08/10/15	MAS	1.50	Draft revisions to conflicts counsel application and exchange emails with proposed conflicts counsel.
08/11/15	MAS	0.90	Update conflicts counsel motion, draft form of order and attention to filing with Angela.
08/11/15	ALS	0.20	Review email from M. Siedband re application to employ (.1); email to M. Siedband and K. Quirk re application to employ (.1)

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

08/11/15	ALS	1.00	Filing and service of Application to Employ Molleur Law Office as Special Counsel to the Trustee
08/21/15	LKZ	0.20	Call w/Prime Clerk re: interim fee app (.1); review retention app order and rules re: same (.1).
08/24/15	BBC	4.60	Draft third interim fee application of BSSN.
08/24/15	MAS	0.10	Review language for fee application regarding Wheeling Preference complaint.
08/25/15	BBC	5.00	Continue drafting third fee application of BSSN.
08/26/15	BBC	1.10	Continue drafting third interim fee application of BSSN.
08/26/15	LKZ	1.30	Review first interim fee app of Prime Clerk (1.0); review local rules re: same (.1); review BSSN fee app re: review of same (.1); draft email to B.Keach re: same (.1).
08/26/15	RND	0.10	Email with M. Baxter re: final fee applications for Covington Burling
08/28/15	BBC	0.30	Continue drafting third fee application of BSSN.
08/31/15	BBC	0.90	Continue drafting third fee application of BSSN.
08/31/15	LKZ	0.10	Emails w/ Prime Clerk re: revised fee app.
09/01/15	LKZ	0.50	Review revised Prime Clerk fee app (.3); emails w/B.Keach (.1), Prime Clerk (.1) re: same.
09/01/15	BBC	0.40	Continued drafting third fee application of BSSN.
09/01/15	ALS	0.10	Filing of revised proposed order with respect to application to employ Molleur Law Office
09/03/15	BBC	4.20	Continue drafting third fee application of BSSN.

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

09/03/15	LKZ	0.50	Emails w/Prime Clerk re: fee app (.1); confer w/B.Keach re: same (.1); review filing version of same (.1); emails w/K.Quirk re: filing same (.1); review proposed order and NOH for same (.1).
09/03/15	KQ	0.20	Multiple e-mails from /to L. Zahradka regarding service of Prime Clerk's fee application
09/03/15	KQ	1.60	Begin preparation for service of Prime Clerk's First Interim fee application
09/04/15	KQ	2.30	Finalize and send service of the Prime Clerk Fee Application
09/04/15	KQ	0.50	Prepare and send the e-mail service of the First Interim Fee Application of Prime Clerk
09/04/15	KQ	0.60	Finalize and file the First Interim Fee Application of Prime Clerk
09/04/15	LKZ	0.10	Review filed version of Prime Clerk Fee app and emails w/Prime Clerk re: same.
09/04/15	DSA	0.30	Reviewed e-mails and conference with L. Zahradka concerning issues with fee applications (.2); reviewed e-mails and e-mailed parties concerning issues with professional fees (.1)
09/10/15	KQ	0.50	Draft and file via ECF the Certificate of Service related to the First Interim Fee Application of Prime Clerk
09/28/15	LKZ	0.20	Review Prime Clerk fee app.
09/29/15	KQ	0.10	E-mail to Mary Ellen Picone at the USBC regarding the hearing on Prime Clerk's fee application
10/13/15	BBC	0.30	Review email from F Caruso re: fees for BSSN (0.1); draft/send reply email to F Caruso re: same (0.2).
10/14/15	TJM	0.10	TC w/ Court re scheduling hearing re employment applications (0.1)

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

10/15/15	BBC	0.10	Review email from Trustee re: third fee application of BSSN.
10/15/15	BBC	2.30	Continue drafting third fee application of BSSN.
10/16/15	BBC	2.80	Draft Trustee's third fee application.
10/17/15	BBC	2.60	Continue drafting third fee application of BSSN.
10/19/15	BBC	0.40	Conference with A Stewart re: potential fee application hearing dates and professionals needing to file fee applications.
10/19/15	BBC	3.00	Continue drafting fee application of BSSN (2.3); Draft proposed order (0.3); draft notice of hearing (0.4).
10/19/15	BBC	2.20	Draft third fee application of DSI.
10/19/15	BBC	1.10	Continue drafting third fee application of DSI.
10/20/15	BBC	1.30	Draft bio exhibit for DSI third fee application.
10/20/15	BBC	0.80	Draft notice of hearing on DSI fee application (0.3); draft proposed order re: DSI fee application (0.5).
10/20/15	BBC	0.10	Review email from F Caruso re: third fee application of DSI.
10/21/15	ALS	0.30	Office conference with B. Colwell re filing of fee applications for Trustee's professionals
10/21/15	BBC	0.30	Conference with Trustee re: fee application of Trustee.
10/21/15	BBC	2.20	Continue drafting fee application of BSSN.
10/21/15	BBC	3.50	Continue drafting fee application for Trustee.
10/21/15	BBC	0.10	Review email from Covington & Burling re: fee application timeline.
10/22/15	BBC	0.40	Continue drafting third fee application of DSI.

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

10/22/15	BBC	0.10	Email to M St Patrick Baxter re: fee application and incurred fees by Covington.
10/22/15	BBC	0.10	Email to R Clement re: fee application and incurred fees by Verrill Dana as counsel to the Trustee.
10/22/15	BBC	0.10	Review email from L Zahradka re: fees incurred by Prime Clerk.
10/22/15	BBC	0.30	Review email from R Clement re: hearing dates on fee applications (0.1); respond to email from R Clement re: Verrill Dana fee application (0.2).
10/22/15	BBC	0.10	Draft email to M Irish re: fee application for Baker Newman.
10/22/15	BBC	0.10	Review email from M Baxter re: accrued fees for Covington.
10/22/15	BBC	0.40	Review second fee application of Kugler (0.2); draft email to G Kandestin re: third fee application of Kugler (0.2)
10/22/15	BBC	0.20	Draft email to D Doyle at Shaw Fishman re: accrued fees for Shaw Fishman.
10/22/15	BBC	1.00	Draft third fee application of Baker Newman.
10/22/15	BBC	1.30	Continue drafting fee application for Trustee.
10/22/15	BBC	0.20	Review email from A Adler re: fees and expenses incurred by Prime Clerk.
10/23/15	BBC	0.10	Review email from D Doyle re: fees and expenses for Shaw Fishman.
10/23/15	BBC	1.90	Continue drafting fee application for Trustee.
10/25/15	BBC	0.10	Review email from R Clement re: Verrill Dana fees and fee application.
10/27/15	BBC	0.70	Continue drafting third fee application of DSI.

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
 Matter Number: 047375-00001
 RE: Chapter 11

10/27/15	BBC	0.40	Review email from D Doyle (Shaw Fishman) re: Shaw Fishman fee application (0.2); call with D Doyle re: same (0.2).
10/27/15	BBC	0.80	Continue drafting fee application for Trustee.
10/28/15	BBC	2.00	Continue drafting fee application of Baker Newman.
10/28/15	BBC	0.40	Review email from M Irish (BNN) re: outstanding invoices and fee application (0.2); draft email to M Irish re: information needed for BNN fee application (0.2).
10/28/15	BBC	0.40	Review email from M Irish re: bios for fee application of Baker Newman (0.1); revise bios for fee application to include additional information (0.3)
10/30/15	BBC	1.70	Continue drafting third fee application of DSI.
10/30/15	BBC	0.10	Draft email to Trustee re: fee application for DSI.
10/30/15	BBC	0.10	Draft email to D Doyle re: effective date and final fee application of Shaw Fishman.
10/30/15	RND	0.10	Correspondence with M. Baxter re: Covington's final fee application
10/31/15	BBC	0.10	Review email from Trustee re: fee application of DSI.

 Total 07 201.90

09

Financing

Date	ATTY	Hours	
07/01/15	DSA	0.40	Reviewed cash collateral order and conference with R. Desai concerning issues with same (.4)

 Total 09' 0.40

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

10 Litigation

Date	ATTY	Hours	
10/01/14	DSA	1.10	Telephone conference with Trustee and others concerning issues with settlement with principals (1.1)
10/01/14	MAF	0.20	E-mails from B. Keach and BAP regarding oral argument; e-mail to T. McKeon regarding Wheeling motion to intervene
10/01/14	RND	1.70	Email with M. Fagone re: dispute over proceeds of common collateral (.1); research Momentive bankruptcy case re: dispute over proceeds of common collateral (1.5); Meeting with A. Stewart re: briefs in Momentive bankruptcy re: disputes over proceeds of common collateral (.1)
10/01/14	RND	0.10	Meeting with R. Keach re: liability limits under Carmack Amendment; email to R. Keach re: same
10/01/14	PM	0.10	Email communications with Bob Keach re. discovery requests for Defendant.
10/01/14	TJM	0.50	Draft email to counsel for oil producers and railcar lessors re Rule 2004 exams
10/01/14	TJM	0.10	Confer with Trustee re identification of counsel for oil producers and train car lessors re Rule 2004 exams
10/01/14	TJM	0.10	Confer with Trustee re noticing Rule 2004 exam motions for hearing
10/01/14	TJM	0.80	Create list of counsel for Rule 2004 motion recipients
10/01/14	TJM	0.60	Draft, edit and revision motion in opposition to Wheeling motion to intervene
10/02/14	TJM	0.60	Draft, edit and revise motion in opposition to motion to intervene by Wheeling in adversary proceeding re World Fuel

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

10/02/14	TJM	0.40	Research re Rule 7024/24 re motion in opposition to Wheeling motion to intervene
10/02/14	TJM	0.10	Confer S Swander re task assigned by M Fagone re preparation for hearing in Wheeling/Travelers appeal
10/02/14	TJM	0.90	Research and draft list of counsel for various entities receiving Rule 2004 motions
10/02/14	TJM	1.10	Email opposing counsels re scheduling and filing Rule 2004 examination motions
10/02/14	TJM	0.10	TC M Fagone re preparation for hearing in Wheeling/Travelers appeal
10/02/14	RND	6.30	Draft memorandum re: scope recoverable damages under Carmack Amendment
10/02/14	MAF	0.40	Continue preparing for BAP oral argument
10/02/14	KQ	1.20	Produce a review set in Summation Pro of Management Safety Manuals for review by P. McDonald
10/03/14	KQ	0.70	Locate and assemble Management System Manuals requested by P. McDonald
10/03/14	MAF	0.70	Meeting with R. Keach regarding MMA settlement documentation
10/03/14	MAF	0.90	Revise XL settlement agreement
10/03/14	MAF	1.20	Continue reviewing and revise XL agreement
10/03/14	MAF	0.10	E-mails from and to R. Keach regarding XL settlement documents
10/03/14	RND	4.00	Continue drafting memorandum re: scope of recoverable damages under Carmack Amendment
10/03/14	RND	2.50	Research re: carrier vs. carrier claims under Carmack Amendment
10/03/14	TJM	0.20	TC w/ counsel for Union Tank re Rule 2004 motion (0.1) and email Trustee re same (0.1)
10/03/14	TJM	3.30	Draft, edit and revise motion in opposition to motion to intervene by Wheeling in adversary proceeding re World Fuel

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

10/04/14	TJM	1.50	Review research re motion in opposition to Wheeling motion to intervene re World Fuel adversary proceeding
10/04/14	MAF	4.00	Continue preparing for BAP appeal
10/05/14	TJM	5.50	Edit and revise motion in opposition to Wheeling motion to intervene re World Fuel adversary proceeding
10/06/14	TJM	0.40	Confer with Trustee and P McDonald re status and strategy of case against World Fuel
10/06/14	TJM	4.60	Edit and revise motion in opposition to Wheeling motion to intervene re World Fuel adversary proceeding
10/06/14	TJM	0.90	Draft, edit and revise motion for expedited hearing re Rule 2004 motions
10/06/14	TJM	0.40	Revise Rule 2004 motions re scheduling
10/06/14	TJM	0.50	Confer with M Fagone re motion in opposition to Wheeling motion to intervene re World Fuel litigation
10/06/14	TJM	0.10	Confer with Trustee re Rule 2004 motions
10/06/14	TJM	0.20	TC w/ general counsel of Enserco re Rule 2004 motion papers
10/06/14	TJM	0.10	TC w/ counsel for Shell re Rule 2004 motions
10/06/14	TJM	1.30	Edit and revise motion in opposition to Wheeling motion to intervene re World Fuel adversary proceeding
10/06/14	RND	0.30	Email correspondence with R. Keach re: carrier v. carrier claims under Carmack Amendment
10/06/14	RND	5.00	Research regarding carrier vs. carrier claims under Carmack Amendment
10/06/14	PM	0.20	Telephone call from Shell counsel re. 2004 Exam and email to Tim McKeon re. same.
10/06/14	PM	0.10	Review article sent from Bob Keach re. CP comments on new regulations and nature of Bakken crude.

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

10/06/14	PM	1.00	Meet with Bob Keach to discuss amendment to Complaint to assert claims against Irving and Canadian Pacific.
10/06/14	MAF	1.00	Review and revise draft objection to Wheeling's motion to intervene
10/06/14	ALS	0.20	Office conference with T. McKeon regarding filing of motion to continue pretrial conference in World Fuel adversary matter (.1); Follow-up email to T. McKeon regarding filing of motion to continue pretrial conference in World Fuel adversary matter (.1)
10/07/14	ALS	2.20	Filing of fourteen Rule 2004 Motions with U.S. Bankruptcy Court
10/07/14	ALS	0.20	Emails to/from R. Keach and T. McKeon regarding service of Rule 2004 Motions
10/07/14	MAF	3.80	Review and revise opposition to Wheeling's motion to intervene (0.2); e-mail to P. Legault regarding XL (0.1); continued preparation for BAP appeal
10/07/14	PM	0.10	Various email communications with Bob Keach, World Fuels' counsel re. amendment of complaint.
10/07/14	PM	0.10	Email communications with Bob Keach re. CP bill of lading.
10/07/14	PM	2.40	Review case law re. Carmack Amendment.
10/07/14	PM	0.10	Email communications with Tim McKeon re. new Rule 2004 motions.
10/07/14	PM	0.20	Email communications with Tim McKeon and Bob Keach re. new Rule 2004 motions.
10/07/14	TJM	0.30	Edit and revise motion in opposition to Wheeling motion to intervene in adversary proceeding re World Fuel
10/07/14	TJM	0.10	Confer with M Fagone re edits to motion in opposition to motion by Wheeling to intervene in adversary proceeding re World Fuel

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

10/07/14	TJM	0.20	TC w/ counsel for Shell re Rule 2004 motions
10/07/14	TJM	0.20	Confer with A Stewart re procedure for adjourning hearing
10/07/14	TJM	0.10	Email counsel for Shell re Rule 2004 motion
10/07/14	TJM	3.40	Draft, edit, revise and finalize Rule 2004 motion papers for filing
10/07/14	TJM	0.30	Draft, edit and revise NOH for Rule 2004 motions
10/07/14	TJM	0.20	TC w/ local counsel for SMBC re Rule 2004 motions
10/07/14	TJM	0.10	TC w/ counsel for Shell re Rule 2004 motions
10/07/14	TJM	0.10	TC w/ general counsel for Enserco re scheduling re Rule 2004 hearing
10/08/14	TJM	0.50	Update attorney contact list re Rule 2004 motions (0.3) and confer A Stewart re service re same (0.2)
10/08/14	TJM	0.10	Voicemail for counsel for ConocoPhillips re Rule 2004 motion hearing date and draft and send follow-up email
10/08/14	TJM	0.10	Voicemail for counsel for InCorr re adjourning hearing on Rule 2004 motion and draft and send follow-up email
10/08/14	TJM	1.00	Draft, edit and revise motion for leave to amend complaint
10/08/14	TJM	0.20	TC w/ counsel for InCorr re hearing on Rule 2004 motion and draft and send follow-up email re same
10/08/14	TJM	0.20	Review email from counsel for ConocoPhillips re Rule 2004 motion hearing and respond re same
10/08/14	TJM	0.60	Draft, edit and revise amended notice of hearing re continued hearing re motion on Rule 2004s

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

10/08/14	TJM	1.50	Review and edit motion in opposition to Wheeling motion to intervene re adversary proceeding re World Fuel (0.7) and review research re same (0.8)
10/08/14	PM	0.10	Voicemail from Conoco Phillips' counsel re. Rule 2004 motion and email to Tim McKeon re. same.
10/08/14	PM	0.20	Various email communications with Enerco counsel and Tim McKeon re. Rule 2004 motion.
10/08/14	MAF	0.10	Office conference with T. McKeon regarding proposed orders
10/08/14	KQ	0.60	Draft Certificate of Service related to the Trustee's Objection to Wheeling's Motion to Intervene
10/08/14	KQ	0.50	Finalize and file via ECF the Trustee's Objection to Wheeling's Motion to Intervene
10/08/14	KQ	0.20	Finalize and file via ECF the Certificate of Service related to the Trustee's Objection to Wheeling's Motion to Intervene
10/08/14	KQ	0.10	Send e-mail service of the Trustee's Objection to Wheeling's Motion to Intervene
10/08/14	ALS	0.40	Preparation of certificate of service relating to Rule 2004 motions
10/08/14	ALS	0.20	Docket scheduling relating to Rule 2004 motions
10/08/14	ALS	3.80	Service of Rule 2004 motions upon notice parties
10/09/14	ALS	1.20	Filing and service of Notice of Continued Hearings relating to Rule 2004 Motions
10/09/14	ALS	0.30	Docket scheduling relating to continued Rule 2004 hearings
10/09/14	ALS	0.20	Emails to/from R. Keach regarding Reply to Response to Order to Show Cause in First Circuit Appeals case in Roy, et al.

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

10/09/14	MAS	2.00	Research re: interlocutory appeals in preparation for 1st Cir. BAP argument. Create working notes document.
10/09/14	PM	0.20	Phone calls with Jay Geller and Tim McKeon re. amendment of pretrial order.
10/09/14	TJM	0.80	Edit and revise motion to extend the deadlines re pretrial conference in adversary re World Fuel
10/09/14	TJM	2.70	Draft, edit and revise motion for leave to amend complaint re adversary re World Fuel
10/09/14	TJM	0.20	Edit and revise notice of continued hearing re Rule 2004 exams
10/09/14	TJM	0.20	Review Appellant response to Court issued OSC re dismissing appeal re lack of jurisdiction
10/10/14	TJM	0.10	Confer P McDonald re amending JPO re extending deadlines
10/10/14	TJM	0.50	Finalize Fourth Consent Motion to Reschedule Joint Pretrial Conference (0.3); Email Trustee and P McDonald re Consent Motion to Reschedule Joint Pretrial Conference (0.1); TC w/ P McDonald re Consent Motion to Reschedule Joint Pretrial Conference (0.1)
10/10/14	PM	0.20	Email communications with Tim McKeon re. motion to amend pretrial order and review draft of same.
10/10/14	MAS	5.10	Research re: interlocutory vs. final orders for purposes of a BAP/1st Cir. appeal. Draft working notes for upcoming BAP appeal of bankruptcy court order.
10/10/14	ALS	0.10	Emails from/to T. McKeon regarding filing of Consent Motion in World Fuel adversary proceeding
10/11/14	MAF	0.60	Revise reply to appellants' response to First Circuit OSC

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

10/11/14	MAF	0.20	Review appellants' response to First Circuit's OSC why appeal should not be dismissed
10/14/14	DSA	0.80	Reviewed e-mails and e-mailed Trustee concerning issues with Railworld discovery (.1); telephone conferences with F. Caruso concerning issues with Railworld discovery (.2); reviewed discovery materials from Railworld (.2); telephone conference with Railworld and others concerning status of document production (.3)
10/14/14	ALS	0.30	Office conference with T. McKeon regarding filing of Fourth Consent Motion for Entry of an Order (A) Rescheduling the Date of the Initial Pretrial Conference, (B) Extending the Deadline for Filing the Joint Pretrial Statement and Order, and (C) Granting Related Relief (.1); filing of Fourth Consent Motion for Entry of an Order (A) Rescheduling the Date of the Initial Pretrial Conference, (B) Extending the Deadline for Filing the Joint Pretrial Statement and Order, and (C) Granting Related Relief with Court in World Fuel adversary proceeding (.2)
10/14/14	ALS	0.10	Email to M. Fagone regarding reply to response to Court's Order to Show Cause in the Roy, et al. appeal
10/14/14	RND	0.10	Correspondence with M. Fagone re: drafting reply to OSC to dismiss appeal of section 157(b) (5) Motion
10/14/14	TJM	0.30	Update and finalize fourth consent motion re rescheduling initial pretrial conference

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

10/15/14	TJM	0.70	Review email from counsel for Wheeling re notice re Rule 2004 examination (0.1); Review notice procedures re Rule 2004 exams (0.5); Respond to email from counsel for Wheeling (0.1)
10/15/14	RND	7.90	Draft and revise Trustee's reply to OSC re: dismissal of appeal on Section 157(b) (5) decision; meetings with M. Fagone re: same (.5)
10/15/14	PM	0.20	Telephone call with Mike Fagone re. insurance issues.
10/15/14	ALS	0.30	Office conference with R. Desai regarding deadline to file reply to response to order to show cause in Roy, et al. appeal (.2); telephone call to Clerk's office at the First Circuit regarding reply to response to order to show cause in Roy, et al. appeal (.1)
10/15/14	MAF	0.50	Office conference with R. Desai regarding response to order to show cause
10/16/14	MAF	1.90	Review and revise response to OSC
10/16/14	ALS	0.30	Conference with R. Desai regarding status of reply to response to order to show cause in Roy, et al appeal (.2); email hearing transcript relating to 157(b) motion to R. Desai (.1)
10/16/14	ALS	0.10	Conference with T. McKeon regarding upcoming hearing on Rule 2004 hearings
10/16/14	RND	5.60	Continue drafting and revising Trustee's reply to OSC to dismiss appeal on Section 157(b) (5) Motion; meeting with M. Fagone re: same (.3); meeting with M. Fagone re: same (.5);
10/16/14	TJM	0.30	TC w/ counsel for ConocoPhillips re rule 2004 motion

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

10/16/14	TJM	0.30	Email trustee re Rule 2004 motion and ConocoPhillips re conversation with counsel
10/17/14	TJM	0.30	Confer with S Anderson re preparation re hearing on Wheeling's motion to intervene re World Fuel adversary
10/17/14	TJM	1.00	Research re Trustee's discretion re asserting causes of action in adversary proceeding
10/17/14	TJM	0.40	Review file in preparation of hearing re BAP re Travelers appeal
10/17/14	TJM	0.10	Confer with M Fagone re preparation re BAP appeal argument
10/17/14	TJM	0.20	Confer with S Swander re preparation re BAP argument re record on appeal
10/17/14	TJM	0.40	Review motion papers re Wheeling motion to intervene in World Fuel adversary proceeding re preparation for hearing
10/17/14	TJM	0.30	Confer with S Anderson re opposition to motion by Wheeling to intervene in World Fuel adversary proceeding
10/17/14	TJM	0.20	Review reply filed by Wheeling re motion to intervene in World Fuel adversary proceeding
10/17/14	RND	4.20	Research re: assignment of Carmack Amendment claims
10/17/14	ALS	0.20	Research for M. Fagone relating to insurance matters
10/17/14	MAF	3.50	Continue revising settlement agreements (XL and template) (3.3); e-mails to R. Keach and others regarding same (0.2)
10/17/14	MAF	0.20	Office conference with S. Anderson regarding Wheeling motion to intervene
10/17/14	MAF	0.50	Telephone call with P. Legault regarding insurance issues and settlement agreement templates

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

10/17/14	MAF	0.20	Review Wheeling reply to objection to motion to intervene and e-mail to R. Keach and S. Anderson regarding same
10/17/14	DSA	1.20	Conference with T. McKeon concerning issues with hearing on motion to intervene (.3); conference with M. Fagone concerning issues with motion to intervene (.2); began reviewing pleadings in relation to motion to intervene in World Fuels litigation (.7)
10/18/14	DSA	2.00	Reviewed e-mails from M. Fagone concerning issues Wheeling motion to intervene (.1); continued reviewing materials and drafting notes for hearing on motion to intervene (1.9)
10/18/14	MAF	5.00	Continue preparing for oral argument in BAP appeal by Wheeling on Travelers policy
10/18/14	TJM	0.60	Research re Delaware UCC re security interests in insurance policies (0.5) and email M Fagone re same (0.1)
10/19/14	MAF	2.30	Continue preparation for BAP argument
10/19/14	DSA	1.90	Continued reviewing cases and pleadings and drafting notes for hearing on Wheeling intervention (1.2); telephone conference with M. Fagone concerning issues with motion to intervene (.6)
10/20/14	MAF	0.20	Office conference with S. Anderson regarding motion to intervene
10/20/14	MAF	7.00	Travel to (1.5), prepare for and attend oral argument on Travelers appeal (4.0), and travel from Boston to Portland (1.5)
10/20/14	DSA	4.70	Continued reviewing documents and cases concerning motion to intervene and drafting notes for hearing on same (4.4); telephone conference with P. MacDonald concerning issues with intervention motion (.3)

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

10/20/14	TJM	7.00	Travel to hearing (1.5); Prepare for and attend BAP hearing re Wheeling appeal re Travelers appeal (4.0); Travel from hearing (1.5)
10/20/14	TJM	0.10	TC w/ counsel for Union Tank Car re case/settlement status
10/20/14	TJM	0.40	Confer with S Anderson re Wheeling motion to intervene re World Fuel adversary proceeding
10/20/14	PM	1.50	Review case law and statutes in preparation for drafting amended Complaint.
10/20/14	PM	0.60	Review opposition and reply brief re. Wheeling Motion to Intervene.
10/20/14	PM	0.30	Telephone call with Sam Anderson re. issues concerning intervention motions.
10/21/14	PM	0.10	Telephone call with Jay Geller re. status.
10/21/14	TJM	6.60	Travel to hearing (2.5); Attend hearing re Wheeling motion to intervene re World Fuel Adversary Proceeding (1.6); Travel from hearing (2.5)
10/21/14	MAF	1.80	Review e-mail from Gowlings regarding settlement template (0.3); e-mail to R. Keach regarding same (0.2); lengthy telephone call with Gowlings, Monitor and Monitors counsel regarding settlement agreement (1.3)
10/21/14	MAF	0.10	Office conference with S. Anderson regarding hearing on Wheeling motion to intervene
10/21/14	DSA	0.70	Reviewed documents in advance of hearing on intervention by Wheeling (.5); reviewed docket entries and orders and e-mailed B. Keach concerning issues with status of intervention (.2)

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

10/21/14	ALS	0.10	Docket scheduling relating to deadline to file Stipulated Order relating to reservation of rights to preserve the status quo vis a vis Wheeling's claim of a security in the estate's contract claim against the World Fuel defendants
10/22/14	MAF	0.10	E-mail from and to M. Troy regarding oral argument on BAP appeal by Wheeling
10/22/14	PM	1.60	Draft amendments to Complaint.
10/22/14	RND	4.00	Research re: waiver of claims under Carmack Amendment
10/23/14	PM	3.80	Draft Amended Complaint.
10/23/14	TJM	0.20	Listen to voicemail from Canadian counsel for Oasis re proposed settlement structure and confer w/ Trustee re same (0.1) and leave voicemail and send follow-up email to Canadian counsel re same (0.1)
10/23/14	ALS	0.20	Email to T. McKeon regarding Irving Oil presentation (.1); review documents for Irving Oil presentation (.1)
10/24/14	DSA	0.20	E-mailed and reviewed e-mails from G. Marcus concerning issues with order on motion to intervene (.2)
10/24/14	TJM	0.10	Review emails b/w S Anderson and G Marcus re FOO re motion to intervene re World Fuel adversary proceeding
10/27/14	TJM	0.20	TC w/ counsel for Arrow re Rule 2004 examination and related document request and request for MSDS sheets (0.1) and send follow-up email (0.1)
10/27/14	TJM	0.10	TC w/ counsel for Shell Oil re Rule 2004 examination and document request and send follow-up email
10/27/14	TJM	0.10	TC w/ counsel for Devlar re follow up issues re production of MSDS

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

10/27/14	TJM	0.10	TC w/ counsel for InCorr re Rule 2004 examination and document request and send follow-up email
10/27/14	TJM	0.30	TC w/ counsel to Devlar re request for SDS sheets (0.1) and email Trustee re same
10/27/14	TJM	0.10	Confer with Trustee re document production from oil producers re Rule 2004 requests
10/27/14	TJM	0.10	Confer w/ counsel for Marathon re request for SDS sheets
10/27/14	TJM	0.20	Prepare for calls with counsel re oil producers re request for safety data sheets
10/27/14	TJM	0.30	Left voicemail for Oasis counsel re document production re Rule 2004 motion and send follow up email
10/27/14	TJM	0.10	Left voice message w/ counsel for Slawson re document production re Rule 2004 motion and send follow up email
10/27/14	TJM	0.50	TC w/ counsel for InCorr re production of MSDS (0.2) and confer Trustee re same (0.1)
10/27/14	TJM	0.40	TC w/ Trustee and counsel for Enserco
10/27/14	TJM	0.20	Email counsel for Enserco re copies of complaint filed in adversary proceeding and Canadian class action
10/27/14	TJM	0.10	Review email from counsel for Enserco re MSDS
10/27/14	TJM	0.10	TC w/ counsel for Enserco re Rule 2004 examination and document production and request for MSDSS
10/27/14	TJM	0.10	TC w/ counsel for ConocoPhillips re Rule 2004 examination and document request and request re MSDSS
10/27/14	TJM	0.10	TC w/ American counsel for QEP re Rule 2004 examination and document request and send follow-up email re request for MSDSS
10/27/14	TJM	0.20	TC w/ counsel for Marathon re request for SDS sheets

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

10/27/14	TJM	0.10	TC w/ counsel for ConocoPhillips re request for MSDS
10/27/14	TJM	0.30	TC w/ Arrow Midstream re request re MSDSs
10/27/14	RND	0.20	Review Appellants' Motion to Strike in first circuit appeal of Section 157(b)(5) Motion.
10/27/14	DSA	0.20	Telephone conference with G. Marcus concerning issues with proposed order on motion to intervene (.2)
10/27/14	MAF	0.20	Review appellants' response to trustee's response to reply to OSC in the First Circuit; e-mail to R. Keach regarding same
10/28/14	MAF	0.10	Office conference with S. Anderson regarding Wheeling motion to intervene
10/28/14	ALS	0.20	Review documents produced by Enserco relating to Rule 2004 motion (.1); email to T. McKeon regarding organization of discovery relating to Rule 2004 motions (.1)
10/28/14	DSA	0.30	Reviewed proposed order relating to motion to intervene and e-mailed G. Marcus concerning issues with same (.3)
10/28/14	TJM	0.40	Review email from counsel for QEP re production of MSDS and draft response re same
10/28/14	TJM	0.10	TC w/ counsel for Slawson re request of MSDS
10/28/14	TJM	0.30	Review file re Rule 2004 motions and discovery received
10/28/14	TJM	0.10	Review docket re entry of order re motion to intervene
10/28/14	TJM	0.10	Confer with counsel for Oasis re request for MSDS
10/29/14	TJM	0.20	TC w/ S Anderson re opposition to Wheeling's motion for status conference
10/29/14	TJM	0.10	Review email from counsel for Union Tank Car Company and email Trustee re same

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

10/29/14	TJM	0.60	Review email from counsel for Union Tank re request for extension of objection deadline re Rule 2004 motion and respond re same re outlining counteroffer
10/29/14	TJM	0.10	Review MSDS sent from Slawson
10/29/14	TJM	2.40	Draft, edit and revise opposition to Wheeling's motion for status conference and to enlarge time for parties to file form of order pending such status conference.
10/29/14	TJM	0.10	Review emails b/w Trustee and counsel for First Union
10/29/14	RND	1.20	Review case file and previous motions, responses, and orders re: stay of derailment cases pending first circuit appeal (Section 157(b)(5) Litigation)
10/29/14	RND	0.20	Meeting with R. Keach re: drafting motion to amend stay order (157(b)(5) Litigation)
10/29/14	PM	0.10	Review Wheeling's Motion for Status Conference.
10/29/14	PM	0.10	Email communications with Mike Fagone re. request for extension of 2004 exam.
10/29/14	PM	2.30	Continue revisions to amended complaint.
10/29/14	ALS	0.20	Email to R. Keach, P. McDonald and T. McKeon regarding Motion for Status Conference and to Enlarge Time for Parties to File Form of Order Pending Such Status Conference, with Exhibit A and proposed form of Order filed in Word Fuel Services adversary proceeding (.1); conference with T. McKeon regarding Motion for Status Conference and to Enlarge Time for Parties to File Form of Order Pending Such Status Conference, with Exhibit A and proposed form of Order filed in Word Fuel Services adversary proceeding (.1)

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

10/29/14	ALS	0.10	Docket scheduling status conference in World Fuel adversary proceeding
10/29/14	MAF	1.00	Work on draft settlement agreements (XL and template) and conversations with R. Keach regarding same
10/29/14	DSA	0.60	Telephone conference with J. Geller concerning issues with Wheeling order on motion to intervene (.3); reviewed and made changes to opposition to status conference on motion to intervene (.3)
10/30/14	KQ	0.40	Finalize and file the Trustee's Objection to Wheeling's Motion for Status Conference
10/30/14	KQ	0.30	Draft and file the Certificate of Service related to the Trustee's Objection to Wheeling's Motion for Status Conference
10/30/14	MAF	0.20	E-mail to D. Dandeneau regarding draft settlement agreement (0.1); e-mails to and from R. Keach and T. Shannon regarding SQ interviews of witnesses (0.1)
10/30/14	MAF	1.40	Work on CIT settlement agreement
10/30/14	ALS	0.10	Docket scheduling relating to Red Shield adversary proceeding
10/30/14	ALS	0.30	Office conference with T. McKeon regarding preparation of consent motions to extend deadline relating to Rule 2004 motions (.1); email to T. McKeon regarding preparation of consent motions to extend deadline relating to Rule 2004 motions (.2)
10/30/14	ALS	0.30	Telephone conference with K. Ford at U.S. Bankruptcy Court regarding pending Rule 2004 motions (.1); conference with T. McKeon regarding pending Rule 2004 motions (.1); email to T. McKeon regarding draft consent motion to extend objection deadline (.1)

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

10/30/14	ALS	0.40	Office conference with T. McKeon regarding status of Rule 2004 motions (.1); preparation of spreadsheet tracking Rule 2004 motions (.2); email to R. Keach regarding Rule 2004 motions (.1)
10/30/14	PM	0.60	Finalize revisions to Amended Complaint.
10/30/14	RND	0.30	Call with M. Fagone re: district court decision on 157(b)(5) Motion; email decision re: same to M. Fagone
10/30/14	TJM	0.20	TC w/ counsel for Shell re Rule 2004 motions
10/30/14	TJM	0.10	Email Trustee re settlement discussions w/ Shell Oil
10/30/14	TJM	0.10	Confer with A Stewart re procedure for extending objection deadlines
10/30/14	TJM	0.10	TC w/ counsel for Shell re settlement
10/30/14	TJM	0.10	Confer with A Stewart re Rule 2004 motions and objection deadlines
10/30/14	TJM	0.50	Draft, edit and revise motion to extend objection deadline to Rule 2004 motion
10/30/14	TJM	0.30	Confer with R Desai re motion continuing stay of wrongful death litigation
10/30/14	TJM	0.70	Edit, revise and finalize motion in opposition to Wheeling motion to extend deadline to submit proposed order
10/30/14	TJM	0.10	Confer with Trustee re voicemail from counsel for Trinity and return call re same
10/31/14	TJM	0.50	Draft motion to extend objection deadlines re Rule 2004 Motions
10/31/14	RND	1.30	Begin drafting motion to amend stay order pending appeal of Section 157(b)(5) order
10/31/14	PM	0.30	Telephone call with Jay Geller re. discovery issues and email to Bob Keach re. same.
11/03/14	RND	1.30	Review case file and draft motion to stay proceedings pending appeal of Section 157(b)(5) Order

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

11/03/14	TJM	0.30	TC w/ counsel for SMBC re production of MSDS and settlement background (0.2) and send follow up email (0.1)
11/03/14	TJM	0.20	TC w/ local counsel for Trinity re extension of deadlines re Rule 2004 motions (0.1) and send follow up email re same (0.1)
11/03/14	TJM	0.20	TC w/ local counsel for Trinity re scope of representation
11/03/14	TJM	0.10	Confer with S Anderson re preparation for hearing re Wheeling motion to extend deadline
11/03/14	TJM	0.20	TC w/ counsel for SMBC re Rule 2004 motion
11/03/14	TJM	0.60	Listen to hearing re Wheeling to extend deadline to submit order (0.3) and confer S Anderson re same (0.3)
11/03/14	TJM	0.20	Review filings re extensions of objection deadlines re Rule 2004 motions while conferring w/ A Stewart
11/03/14	TJM	0.70	Draft, edit and revise motion papers to extend deadline to object to Rule 2004 motions
11/03/14	MAF	0.70	Call with XL counsel and Canadian counsel regarding settlement agreement
11/03/14	MAF	1.40	Revisions to settlement agreement regarding Hartford, Burkhardt and Rail World
11/03/14	DSA	2.10	Reviewed motion for status conference on Wheeling's motion to intervene and drafted notes in relation thereto (.8); attended status conference in relation to motion to intervene (.8); telephone conference with J. Geller concerning issues with motion to intervene and letter from Wheeling (.3); telephone conference with 2004 party concerning issues with process for producing documents (.2)
11/04/14	MAF	0.20	Call from F. Bopp regarding GNP and bar date for admin claims

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

11/04/14	TJM	0.10	Review email from local counsel for Trinity entities re extension of objection deadline re Rule 2004 motions and respond re same
11/04/14	TJM	0.10	Confer with A Stewart re procedure re filing consent motion to extend time to object
11/04/14	TJM	0.10	Confer with A Stewart re service of motion to extend deadlines re Rule 2004 motions
11/04/14	TJM	0.30	Review Devlar/Slawson objection to Rule 2004 Motion
11/04/14	TJM	0.40	Review opposition to Rule 2004 Motion filed by Arrow Midstream
11/04/14	TJM	0.40	Review Enserco and ConocoPhillips opposition to Rule 2004 motions
11/04/14	TJM	0.20	Review Joint Response and Objection to Motions for Rule 2004 Examinations
11/04/14	TJM	0.50	Edit and revise motion to amend complaint
11/04/14	TJM	0.10	TC w/ local counsel for Marathon re Rule 2004 motion
11/04/14	TJM	1.00	Edit and revise consent motion re extending objection deadline re Rule 2004 motions
11/04/14	RND	0.10	Email with R. Keach re: motion to stay proceedings pending appeal of Section 157(b)(5) order
11/04/14	RND	1.70	Draft and revise motion to stay proceedings pending appeal of Section 157(b)(5) Order (1.4); Review and revise draft proposed order re: same (.3)
11/04/14	PM	0.10	Phone call with Jeremy Fischer and email to Tim McKeon re. Rule 2004 Exams.
11/05/14	TJM	0.20	Revise FOO re extension of objection deadline re Rule 2004 Motions (0.1) and confer K Quirk re same (0.1)
11/05/14	MAF	0.10	E-mails to and from P. Maxcy regarding settlement agreement

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

11/06/14	MAF	0.80	E-mail from R. Keach regarding Wheeling complaint against CP; review same; e-mail to R. Keach and F. Caruso regarding same (0.2); telephone call with A. Gilbert and P. Maxcy regarding draft settlement agreement
11/06/14	TJM	0.10	TC w/ counsel for Union Tank re Rule 2004 motions and settlement offer
11/06/14	TJM	0.20	Email Trustee re TC w/ counsel for Union Tank Car
11/07/14	TJM	3.10	Draft, edit and revise pretrial order/pretrial statement
11/07/14	PM	0.10	Email communication from Jay Geller re. pretrial order and conference.
11/07/14	PM	0.10	Email communications with John Scott re. Rule 2004 Exam.
11/07/14	PM	0.20	Various emails with Jay Geller and Bob Keach re. Pretrial Conference issues.
11/10/14	PM	0.10	Email communications with Tim McKeon re. strategy meeting.
11/10/14	PM	1.30	Meet with Bob Keach and Tim McKeon to discuss Rule 2004 motions and amended complaint issues and strategy.
11/10/14	TJM	2.80	Review objections filed against Rule 2004 motions to draft summaries re same
11/10/14	TJM	0.10	TC w/ counsel for World Fuel re adjournment of deadlines for pretrial statement and send follow up email re same
11/10/14	TJM	0.40	Draft, edit and revise consent motion re extension of deadlines re pretrial statement
11/10/14	TJM	0.30	Edit and revise Joint Pretrial Statement/Pretrial Order

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

11/10/14	TJM	0.50	TC w/ counsel for ConocoPhillips re production of documents w/out waiving certain rights (0.2) and confer Trustee re same (0.1) and draft response email to counsel for ConocoPhillips re same (0.2)
11/10/14	TJM	1.30	Confer Trustee and P McDonald re Rule 2004 motions and objections
11/10/14	TJM	0.10	Confer A Stewart re motion to extend objection deadlines re Rule 2004 motions
11/11/14	TJM	0.30	Review and finalize Fifth Consented To Motion to Extend Deadlines re pretrial statement
11/11/14	TJM	7.90	Draft, edit and revise reply motion re Rule 2004 Motion
11/11/14	TJM	0.10	Email counsel for ConocoPhillips re turnover of documents w/out waiving objection to Rule 2004 motion
11/11/14	PM	0.10	Telephone call with Jay Geller re. discovery and settlement issues.
11/11/14	PM	0.10	Email communications with Bob Keach re. settlement issues.
11/11/14	PM	0.10	Review Motion to Revise Pretrial Order.
11/11/14	PM	0.10	Telephone call with Bob Keach re. World Fuel discovery issues and settlement.
11/11/14	PM	3.70	Legal research re. Rule 2004 Motion issues.
11/11/14	KQ	0.50	Finalize, file via ECF and serve the consent motion rescheduling the initial pretrial conference and extending the deadline for joint pretrial statement and order
11/11/14	KQ	0.40	Draft and file via ECF the Certificate of Service related to the consent motion rescheduling the initial pretrial conference and extending the deadline for joint pretrial statement and order

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

11/11/14	ALS	0.10	Conference with T. McKeon regarding filing of consent motion to extend deadlines in World Fuels adversary proceeding and filing of amended complaint
11/12/14	ALS	0.30	Office conference with T. McKeon regarding filing of reply to objections re Rule 2004 motions (.1); emails to/from R. Keach and T. McKeon regarding status of Rule 2004 motions (.2)
11/12/14	DSA	0.50	Reviewed e-mails and e-mailed parties concerning issues with status of XL settlement and the Railworld settlement (.2); telephone conference with F. Caruso concerning issues with status of BSB sale and reviewed e-mails relating to same (.3)
11/12/14	PM	1.60	Review and revise Reply to Motion for 2004 Exams.
11/12/14	PM	0.30	Telephone call with Tim McKeon re. drafts of omnibus reply to oppositions to Rule 2004 Motions.
11/12/14	TJM	0.20	Respond to email from counsel for Union Tank re Rule 2004 motion re objection deadline
11/12/14	TJM	0.10	Email w/ counsel for SMBC re objection deadline re Rule 2004 motion
11/12/14	TJM	0.10	TC w/ counsel for Union Tank re case status
11/12/14	TJM	0.70	Draft, edit, revise and finalize second consent motion to extend the objection deadline re Rule 2004 motions
11/12/14	TJM	4.60	Edit and revise omnibus reply motion re objections to Rule 2004 exam motions re comments and edits from Trustee and P McDonald
11/13/14	TJM	0.20	Confer with Trustee re status of amended complaint (0.1) and objections to Rule 2004 (0.1)

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

11/13/14	ALS	0.20	Docket scheduling relating to pretrial conference and pretrial order in World Fuel Services adversary proceeding
11/13/14	ALS	0.50	Conference with R. Keach regarding filing of Joint Motion for Agreed Order Amending and Restating Consent Order Staying Proceeding Pending Appeal (.1); telephone call to B. Allen and Case Administrator at U.S. District Court regarding filing of Joint MOTION for Order Amending and Restating Consent Order Staying Proceedings Pending Appeal (.1); filing of Joint MOTION for Order Amending and Restating Consent Order Staying Proceedings Pending Appeal with Court (.2); preparation of Certificate of Service (.1)
11/13/14	ALS	0.30	Telephone call with D. Richards at U.S. District Court regarding proposed order filed with Joint Motion for Agreed Order Amending and Restating Consent Order Staying Proceeding Pending Appeal (.1); email to R. Keach regarding same (.1); email to D. Richards at U.S. District Court regarding proposed order filed with Joint Motion for Agreed Order Amending and Restating Consent Order Staying Proceeding Pending Appeal (.1)
11/14/14	TJM	0.70	Confer with Trustee re amended complaint and motion for leave to amend
11/14/14	TJM	0.60	Draft, edit and revise FOO re motion for leave to amend complaint
11/14/14	TJM	0.80	Edit, revise and finalize motion for leave to amend complaint

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

11/14/14	TJM	1.00	Draft, edit and revise consent motion extending objection deadline and continuing hearing re Rule 2004 Motion re Tank Car parties
11/14/14	TJM	0.10	Confer A Cummings re ConocoPhillips objection to Rule 2004 Motion
11/14/14	PM	0.20	Review news reports re. requirement of testing of Bakken crude oil.
11/14/14	PM	1.00	Meet with Bob Keach and Tim McKeon to discuss settlement and Rule 2004 motions.
11/14/14	PM	1.10	Review and revise Motion to Amend Complaint and Amended Complaint.
11/17/14	PM	0.10	Email communications with Tim McKeon re. Motion to Amend.
11/17/14	PM	0.10	Review Order on Motion to Reschedule Pretrial Conference.
11/17/14	PM	0.30	Telephone call with Jeremy Fischer re. Rule 2004 motions.
11/17/14	PM	5.40	Review Motions, Oppositions, Reply and case law in preparation for oral argument on Rule 2004 motions.
11/17/14	TJM	0.10	TC w/ Trustee re settlement status re effect re Rule 2004 motions
11/17/14	TJM	1.30	Review and finalize motion for leave to file motion papers re amended complaint
11/17/14	TJM	0.30	Review, edit and finalize consent motion to extend deadlines and continue hearing re Rule 2004 hearings
11/17/14	TJM	0.20	TC w/ P McDonald re Rule 2004 hearing
11/17/14	TJM	0.10	Email P McDonald re list of attorneys and clients re conference call re Rule 2004 motions
11/17/14	TJM	0.30	TC w/ Steve Cope (Devlar and Slawson) re hearing on Rule 2004 motions (0.2) and email Trustee re same (0.1)

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

11/17/14	TJM	1.40	Call w/ P McDonald and counsel for Marathon, QEP and Shell re scope dispute of Rule 2004 Motion (0.6) and confer P McDonald re case strategy re same (0.8)
11/17/14	TJM	0.20	Email Trustee re summary of conference w/ counsel for Marathon, QEP, and Shell re scope dispute re Rule 2004 motions
11/17/14	TJM	2.40	Review research re motions in opposition to Rule 2004 motions
11/17/14	TJM	1.40	Prepare for hearing re Rule 2004 motions
11/17/14	TJM	0.30	Review, edit and finalize consent motion to extend deadlines and continue hearing re Rule 2004 hearings re Railcar Parties
11/17/14	TJM	1.10	Draft, edit and revise motion papers re continue hearing re Devlar and Slawson re Rule 2004 motions (1.0) and TC w/ counsel for Devlar and Slawson re same (0.1)
11/17/14	ALS	1.60	Preparation for filing Motion for Leave to Amend Complaint, relating to World Fuels adversary case including email to R. Keach regarding service, filing of Motion with Court and service upon notice parties
11/17/14	DSA	0.30	Telephone conference with S. Cope concerning issues with continuing 2004 motions (.3)
11/17/14	KQ	0.80	Finalize, file and serve the Consent Motion to Extend the Objection Deadline and Continue the Hearing on the Trustee's Motions for Rule 2004 Examinations
11/17/14	KQ	1.00	Finalize, file and serve the Consent Motion to Continue the Hearing on the Trustee's Motions for Rule 2004 Examinations of Slawson Exploration Company, Inc. and Devlar Energy Marketing, LLC

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

11/17/14	KQ	0.50	Draft and file via ECF the Certificates of Service for the Consent Motion to Extend Objection Deadline and Consent Motion to Continue the Hearing
11/17/14	MAF	1.50	Review and analyze proposed changes to settlement agreement with Rail World; e-mail to R. Keach regarding same
11/17/14	MAF	0.20	Call from P. McDonald regarding 2004 examinations
11/18/14	TJM	0.10	Review email from Trustee re Rule 2004 motion re SMBC and respond re same
11/18/14	TJM	0.80	Finalize consented to order re Rule 2004 Motions
11/18/14	TJM	7.50	Travel to and from hearing re Rule 2004 Motions (4.0) and attend hearing/negotiation re Rule 2004 motions w/ P McDonald (3.5)
11/18/14	PM	9.90	Review Motions, Oppositions, Reply and case law in preparation for oral argument on Rule 2004 Motions; travel/to/from Bangor; participate in hearing on Rule 2004 Motions.
11/18/14	PM	0.20	Email and phone communications with Tim McKeon re. Rule 2004 Order.
11/18/14	PM	0.20	Phone call with Bob Keach re. Rule 2004 Motion hearing.
11/19/14	PM	3.20	Draft Confidentiality Order.
11/19/14	PM	0.30	Various emails with John Scott, Tim McKeon, Bob Keach re. Rule 2004 Exam Order issues.
11/19/14	TJM	0.10	Email Trustee re Order granting Rule 2004 examination of SMBC Rail
11/19/14	TJM	0.10	Confer A Stewart re service of subpoena re Rule 2004 motion re SMBC
11/19/14	TJM	0.20	Review email from counsel for ConocoPhillips and Enserco and draft response re same

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

11/19/14	TJM	0.50	Set up call w/ counsel for ConocoPhillips and Enserco (0.1) and attend call with same and Trustee (0.4)
11/19/14	TJM	0.20	Confer A Stewart re service of subpoenas re Rule 2004 Motions
11/19/14	TJM	0.70	Draft, edit and revise motion for protective order re Rule 2004 motions/order
11/20/14	TJM	0.20	Confer with Trustee re hearing on Rule 2004 motions
11/20/14	TJM	0.10	Email counsel for SMBC re order granting Rule 2004 Motion
11/20/14	TJM	0.30	Update list of attorneys and client re entities re Rule 2004 motions (0.2) and email same to Trustee (0.1)
11/20/14	TJM	1.10	Draft, edit and revise Motion for protective order re Rule 2004 motions
11/20/14	TJM	0.70	Research re protective order re Rule 2004 motions
11/20/14	TJM	0.40	Review and edit service list re subpoenas re Rule 2004 motions
11/21/14	TJM	0.10	Review cover letter re Rule 2004 subpoenas
11/21/14	TJM	0.10	Confer K Quirk re Rule 2004 subpoenas
11/21/14	TJM	0.40	Email Rule 2004 parties re subpoenas
11/21/14	PM	0.20	Telephone call with Oasis counsel re. settlement and email communications with Bob Keach re. same.
11/21/14	PM	0.20	Telephone call with Bob Keach re. status of settlement and Rule 2004 exams.
11/21/14	PM	0.10	Telephone call with Kelly Friedman re. Oasis parties' settlement and document production.
11/24/14	PM	0.30	Email communications with Bob Keach re. revisions to confidentiality order.
11/24/14	RND	0.20	Emails with R. Keach re: Carmack issues in World Fuels litigation

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

11/24/14	TJM	0.10	Respond to email from counsel for InCorr re acceptance of service
11/24/14	TJM	0.10	Email Trustee re InCorr's counsel's acceptance of service
11/24/14	MAF	0.40	Call from M. Troy regarding allocation dispute; e-mails to and from B. Keach and F. Caruso regarding same; e-mail to J. Steen regarding same
11/25/14	TJM	0.40	Email P McDonald re names and email addresses re Rule 2004 protective order
11/25/14	PM	0.50	Revise Confidentiality Order and email communications with Bob Keach, Tim McKeon and opposing counsel re. same.
11/25/14	PM	0.30	Email communications with opposing counsel re. proposed confidentiality order concerning Rule 2004 exams.
12/01/14	PM	0.10	Email communications with Court and Bob Keach re. hearing on Motion to Amend.
12/01/14	MAF	1.00	Review and analyze proposed changes to XL and template settlement agreements from P. Benoit; e-mails to and from R. Keach regarding same
12/02/14	MAF	1.30	Call with Canadian lawyers regarding form of settlement agreements
12/02/14	MAF	0.20	Call from B. Sleeper regarding meeting in Montreal
12/03/14	TJM	0.10	Email Trustee and P McDonald re joint pretrial order/statement in adversary proceeding against World Fuel
12/04/14	TJM	0.10	Review email from counsel for World Fuel re extension of deadlines re JPO and settlement
12/04/14	TJM	0.10	Review email from counsel for InCorr re deadline to respond to Rule 2004 document request

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

12/04/14	PM	0.20	Email communications with Bob Keach and World Fuel's counsel re. pretrial conference.
12/04/14	ALS	0.10	Office conference with T. McKeon regarding objection deadline relating to Motion for Leave to Amend Complaint filed in World Fuels adversary proceeding
12/04/14	ALS	0.10	Docket scheduling relating to Objection Deadline re Motion for Leave to Amend Complaint in World Fuel adversary proceeding
12/05/14	ALS	0.30	Docket scheduling relating to reply deadlines re responses in opposition to Joint Motion for Order Amending and Restating Consent Order Staying Proceedings Pending Appeal
12/05/14	DSA	0.20	Reviewed oppositions to amend stay orders in wrongful death litigation (.2)
12/08/14	ALS	0.10	Review email from R. Keach regarding Objection to the Trustee's Motion for Leave to Amend Complaint filed by Irving Oil Limited in World Fuel adversary proceeding
12/08/14	PM	0.50	Email and phone calls with Bob Keach and Jay Geller re. Pretrial Order issues.
12/08/14	TJM	0.30	Draft, edit and revise consent motion re continue pretrial conference
12/09/14	TJM	2.20	Draft, edit, revise, and finalize consent motion to continue hearing re pretrial conference (0.7); Draft, edit, revise, and finalize motion papers re motion to expedite re consent motion to continue hearing re pretrial conference (1.2); TC w/ counsel for WFS Entities (0.1); Confer w/ Trustee re motion papers (0.2)
12/09/14	PM	0.30	Numerous emails with Tim McKeon, Bob Keach and World Fuels' counsel re. motion to extend pretrial conference.

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

12/09/14	ALS	0.20	Docket scheduling relating to Motion to Expedite Hearing & Sixth Consent Motion for Entry of an Order Rescheduling the Date of the Initial Pretrial Conference in World Fuel adversary proceeding (.1); conference with K. Quirk regarding filing of Motion to Expedite Hearing & Sixth Consent Motion for Entry of an Order Rescheduling the Date of the Initial Pretrial Conference in World Fuel adversary proceeding (.1)
12/09/14	MAF	0.10	E-mail from M. Linder regarding allocation issues; e-mail to M. Troy regarding same
12/09/14	MAF	0.20	Review BAP decision in Travelers appeal
12/09/14	MAF	0.10	E-mail to G. Marcus and D. Johnson regarding upcoming hearings
12/09/14	KQ	0.90	Finalize and File Consent Motion (Sixth) for Order Rescheduling Pretrial Conference, Motion to Expedite and Notice of Hearing
12/10/14	DSA	0.80	Reviewed decision of the BAP concerning Wheeling appeal of Travelers (.3); reviewed motion to extend dates in the World Fuels adversary (.2); reviewed e-mails and e-mailed parties concerning issues with schedule for Wheeling matters (.1); reviewed CP opposition to motion to amend complaint (.2)
12/10/14	MAF	0.20	E-mail from and to R. Keach regarding Wheeling matters; e-mail from S. Vauclair regarding Wheeling appeal
12/10/14	ALS	0.10	Email to R. Keach and P. McDonald regarding production deadline per Order Granting Trustee's Motions for Rule 2004 Examinations and Production of Documents in World Fuel adversary proceeding
12/10/14	PM	0.20	Email communications with Devlar's counsel and Bob Keach re. Rule 2004 Exam issues.

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

12/10/14	PM	0.10	Email communications with Kelley Friedman re. Devlar document production deadline.
12/10/14	PM	0.20	Email communications re. Rule 2004 exams for Devlar, Conoco, Shell.
12/10/14	PM	0.20	Telephone call and email communications with Shell counsel and Bob Keach re. settlement issues.
12/10/14	TJM	0.20	Email counsel for Shell re scheduling call with Trustee re Settlement (0.1) and email Trustee re same (0.1)
12/11/14	TJM	1.90	Draft, edit and revise motion for entry of consented-to protective order re Rule 2004 Order/Motions
12/11/14	PM	0.10	Email communications with Bob Keach re. upcoming hearing issues.
12/11/14	PM	0.40	Review First Union Rail Application for Allowance and Payment of Administrative Claim.
12/11/14	PM	0.50	Review Motion to Enter Protective Order re 2004 Exams and email communications with Bob Keach and Tim McKeon re. same; email to opposing counsel re. same.
12/11/14	RND	0.40	Meeting with R. Keach re: reply to Irving and CP's objections to amended complaint
12/11/14	RND	2.80	Review case law re: futility standard, motion to dismiss standard, Stern issues, and forum non conveniens argument in connection with objections to motion to amend complaint
12/11/14	RND	2.30	Begin drafting Reply to Irving's and CP's objection to motion to amend complaint (World Fuel Litigation)
12/11/14	ALS	0.30	Emails to R. Desai regarding reply to objections to Motion to Amend Complaint in World Fuel adversary proceeding (.2); conference with R. Desai regarding Motion to Amend Complaint in World Fuel adversary

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

			proceeding (.1)
12/11/14	MAF	0.50	Call with P. Maxcy and A. Gilbert regarding RW settlement issues
12/12/14	MAF	1.60	Review mark-up of XL agreement (0.5); office conference with R. Keach regarding settlement status and agreements (0.7); e-mails from and to P. Benoit regarding same (0.4)
12/12/14	RND	11.20	Research re: motion to amend complaint and continue drafting Reply to Irving's and CP's objection to motion to amend complaint (World Fuel Litigation)
12/12/14	PM	1.60	Review Irving and Canadian Pacific opposition to Motion to Amend.
12/12/14	PM	0.40	Review oil producers' revisions to proposed protective order.
12/12/14	PM	0.50	Review and analyze proposed revisions to confidentiality agreement.
12/12/14	PM	0.20	Email communications with Bob Keach and Tim McKeon re. continuing hearing on Rule 2004 motions.
12/12/14	PM	0.50	Review and analyze proposed revisions to confidentiality agreement.
12/12/14	PM	0.10	Phone call with Bob Keach re. proposed revisions to confidentiality agreement.
12/12/14	PM	0.50	Email to Oil Producer Defendants' counsel re. proposed confidentiality order.
12/12/14	TJM	0.40	Review objection to motion to amend complaint filed by Irving Oil
12/12/14	TJM	0.20	Review proposed changes/edit to Protective Order re Rule 2004 motion as proposed by the Oil Producers
12/12/14	TJM	0.70	Review Canadian Pacific opposition to motion for leave to amend complaint

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

12/12/14	TJM	0.10	TC w/ local counsel for Devlar and Slawson re hearing on Rule 2004 motions and potential adjournment
12/12/14	TJM	0.10	Email Trustee re local counsel for Devlar and Slawson request re hearing on Rule 2004 motions and potential adjournment
12/12/14	TJM	0.70	Draft, edit, revise, and finalize motion papers adjourning hearing on Rule 2004 motions re Slawson and Devlar
12/12/14	TJM	0.10	Review email from P McDonald re request for copy of order granting Rule 2004 motions and respond re same
12/13/14	RND	2.80	Continue drafting reply to Irving's and CP's objections to motion to amend complaint (World Fuel Litigation)
12/14/14	RND	2.50	Finish drafting reply to Irving's and CP's objections to amended complaint (World Fuel Complaint); review edits from R. Keach re: same and finalize; email to P. McDonald re: comments/edits to same
12/15/14	RND	0.40	Cite check reply to Irving's and CP's objection to amended complaint (World Fuel Complaint) and finalize reply for filing
12/15/14	PM	1.60	Review and revise Reply to Motion to Amend.
12/15/14	PM	0.20	Phone calls and emails with Roma Desai re. Reply to Motion to Amend.
12/15/14	MAF	1.00	Begin working on revisions to Rail World settlement agreement
12/15/14	MAF	0.20	Voice mail from case administrator regarding hearing on Wheeling matters; e-mails to and from R. Keach regarding same

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

12/15/14	ALS	0.50	Filing of Omnibus Reply to Irving Oil Limited's Objection and Canadian Pacific Railway Company's Objection to the Trustee's Motion for Leave to Amend Complaint in World Fuel adversary case (.1); preparation of Certificate of Service relating to Omnibus Reply to Irving Oil Limited's Objection and Canadian Pacific Railway Company's Objection to the Trustee's Motion for Leave to Amend Complaint (.2); conference with R. Desai regarding filing of Omnibus Reply to Irving Oil Limited's Objection and Canadian Pacific Railway Company's Objection to the Trustee's Motion for Leave to Amend Complaint (.2)
12/15/14	ALS	0.10	Email to R. Keach and P. McDonald regarding Omnibus Reply to Irving Oil Limited's Objection and Canadian Pacific Railway Company's Objection to the Trustee's Motion for Leave to Amend Complaint
12/16/14	ALS	0.10	Docket scheduling relating to continued pretrial conference in World Fuel adversary proceeding
12/16/14	PM	0.10	Email communications with Bob Keach re. hearings on pending motions.
12/16/14	PM	2.70	Attend hearings on motion to amend adversary complaint, reschedule pretrial conference and Wheeling cash collateral issues.
12/16/14	PM	0.60	Draft order on Motion to Amend Complaint.
12/16/14	PM	0.10	Email communications with Jeremy Fischer and Tim McKeon re. protective order and consent motion.
12/16/14	PM	0.10	Email communications with Tim McKeon re. protective order.
12/16/14	PM	0.30	Review and revise draft motion for protective order.

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

12/16/14	TJM	0.30	Listen to audio from hearing re "status conference" re adversary proceeding re World Fuel, et al
12/16/14	TJM	0.10	TC w/ counsel for SMBC re Rule 2004 subpoena
12/16/14	TJM	0.20	Review Rule 2004 materials re SMBC (0.1) and confer A Stewart re issuance of new subpoena (0.1)
12/16/14	TJM	0.10	Review email from J Fischer re consented-to protective order and comments from oil producers (0.1)
12/16/14	TJM	0.60	Revise motion for protective order re emails from P McDonald and counsel for oil producers
12/16/14	TJM	0.20	Revise consented-motion for entry of consented-to protective order re comments from P McDonald (0.1) and email counsel for oil producers re same (0.1)
12/16/14	TJM	0.10	Review email from A Shub re adjournment of hearing on application for admin claim and email Trustee re same
12/17/14	TJM	0.30	Revise motion for entry of protective order (0.1) and revise protective order (0.2)
12/17/14	PM	0.30	Telephone call with Tim Norton re. Oasis Petroleum document production issues and review of file re. same.
12/17/14	ALS	0.30	Docket scheduling relating to updated deadlines in World Fuel adversary proceeding
12/17/14	ALS	0.10	Email to T. McKeon regarding Court's request for Trustee to draft form of order consistent with outcome of December 16th hearing in World Fuel adversary proceeding
12/17/14	MAF	2.70	Substantial revisions to RW settlement agreement; e-mails to and from P. Maxcy and P. Legault regarding same

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

12/18/14	MAF	1.90	Call with Canadians regarding settlement agreements; revisions to same; e-mails to and from P. Benoit regarding revisions; e-mail to R. Keach
12/18/14	MAF	0.30	E-mails to and from P. Maxcy regarding Rail World settlement (0.2); e-mail to C. Goldblatt regarding XL settlement (0.1)
12/18/14	MAF	0.10	Call with M. Troy regarding allocation issues
12/18/14	MAF	0.90	Review GERSCO and CIT settlement agreements; e-mails to B. Keach regarding same
12/18/14	PM	0.20	Email communications with producers' counsel re. protective order.
12/18/14	PM	0.30	Various emails with Bob Keach and Canadian Pacific Counsel re. protective order issues.
12/18/14	PM	0.80	Prepare for and attend call with producers' counsel to discuss protective order.
12/18/14	PM	0.40	Finalize Order on Motion to Amend and email communications with Bob Keach and opposing counsel re. same.
12/18/14	PM	0.60	Review and revise latest draft of Protective Order and email to producers' counsel re. same.
12/18/14	TJM	0.10	Review email from counsel for Union Tank re adjournment re Rule 2004 motion and respond re same
12/19/14	TJM	0.60	Draft, edit and revise consent motion to extend objection deadline and hearing re Rule 2004 motion re Union Tank
12/19/14	TJM	0.80	Confer w/ Trustee and P McDonald re adversary proceeding against World Fuel
12/19/14	TJM	0.90	Finalize motion for protective order and prepare for filing.
12/19/14	PM	0.60	Meet with Bob Keach and Tim McKeon to discuss discovery of Irving and CP, Rule 2004 exams and Order on Motion to Amend.

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

12/19/14	PM	0.10	Meet with Bob Keach, Tim McKeon to discuss discovery of Irving and CP.
12/19/14	PM	0.10	Email with defendants' counsel re. motion to amend.
12/19/14	PM	0.30	Emails with producers' counsel re. motion for protective order.
12/19/14	PM	0.20	Various emails with Irving and CP counsel re. order on motion to amend.
12/19/14	PM	0.20	Various emails with opposing counsel re. protective order for Rule 2004 exams.
12/19/14	PM	0.20	Various emails with opposing counsel re. protective order for Rule 2004 exams.
12/19/14	PM	0.20	Various emails with opposing counsel re. amended complaint.
12/19/14	PM	0.20	Various emails with Irving and CP counsel and Bob Keach re. order on motion to amend.
12/19/14	MAF	2.60	Substantial revisions to GERSCO and CIT settlement agreements; e-mails and calls with R. Keach regarding same
12/19/14	MAF	0.30	E-mails regarding Wheeling relief from stay to collect receivables; review settlement with Wheeling regarding same; review Wheeling appeal to First Circuit
12/19/14	KQ	0.40	Finalize and file the Motion for Protective Order
12/19/14	DSA	0.10	Reviewed responses relating to wrongful death cases (.1)
12/19/14	ALS	0.30	Revisions to cover letter to S. Gummow re SMBC Rule 2004 Examination and Subpoena for Rule 2004 Examination of SMBC
12/22/14	DSA	0.20	Reviewed motion for protective order filed by the Trustee (.1); reviewed e-mails relating Wheeling appeal (.1)
12/22/14	KQ	0.20	File via ECF the proposed Order Granting Motion for Leave to Amend Complaint

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

12/22/14	MAF	0.40	Call with XL regarding status of various settlements
12/22/14	MAF	0.10	E-mail from and to G. Marcus regarding Wheeling accounts receivable
12/22/14	MAF	0.10	Office conference with trustee regarding potential claims against Wheeling
12/22/14	PM	0.10	Emails from Irving counsel re. Order on Motion to Amend.
12/22/14	PM	0.10	Emails from CP counsel re. Order on Motion to Amend.
12/22/14	PM	0.10	Emails from Bob Keach re. Order on Motion to Amend.
12/22/14	PM	0.10	Review order on motion to amend as filed.
12/22/14	PM	0.10	Review protective order.
12/22/14	PM	0.10	Email communications with Bob Keach re. GERSCO Rule 2004 motion.
12/22/14	PM	0.10	Voicemail and email with Shell counsel re. Rule 2004 document production.
12/22/14	PM	0.10	Email communications with Tim McKeon and Bob Keach re. settlement issues.
12/22/14	TJM	0.30	Finalized proposed order granting motion to amend complaint in World Fuel adversary proceeding
12/22/14	TJM	0.20	Edit and revise consent motion extending deadlines re Rule 2004 motions re Union Tank and GERSCO
12/22/14	TJM	0.10	TC w/ counsel for Shell re production of documents re Rule 2004
12/23/14	TJM	2.50	Research re jurisdictional discovery
12/23/14	TJM	0.20	Research re motion to amend caption
12/23/14	PM	0.10	Emails from Irving counsel re. order on Motion to Amend.
12/23/14	PM	0.10	Emails from CP counsel re. Order on Motion to Amend.

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

12/23/14	PM	0.10	Emails from Bob Keach re. Order on Motion to Amend.
12/23/14	PM	0.10	Review Order on Motion to Amend as filed.
12/23/14	PM	0.10	Review Protective Order.
12/23/14	PM	0.10	Email communications with Bob Keach re. GERSCO Rule 2004 Motion.
12/23/14	PM	0.10	Voicemail and email with Shell counsel re. Rule 2004 document production.
12/23/14	PM	0.10	Email communications with Tim McKeon and Bob Keach re. settlement issues.
12/29/14	PM	0.20	Email communications with Slawson's counsel re. document production.
12/29/14	TJM	0.80	Draft motion and FOO re amend caption of adversary proceeding
12/29/14	TJM	5.30	Draft, edit and revise interrogatories and document demands re jurisdictional discovery.
12/30/14	TJM	0.40	Revise fourth consent motion to extend objection deadline and hearing re Rule 2004 motions re First Union, Union Tank and GE
01/05/15	TJM	0.50	Revise and finalize for filing motion to extend hearing and objection deadlines re Rule 2004 motions re GE, First Union and Union Tank
01/05/15	TJM	2.20	Review pretrial order re World Fuel (0.3); Confer Trustee and P McDonald re case status and pretrial order (0.7); Draft and revise and finalize JPS (1.1); Email counsel for World Fuel re JPS (.1)
01/05/15	PM	0.70	Meet with Bob Keach and Tim McKeon to discuss pretrial order, status of 2014 exams and settlement.
01/05/15	PM	0.10	Email communications with Tim McKeon re. extension of Rule 2004 motion concerning UTCC.
01/05/15	PM	0.40	Email and telephone call with Dave Schoenfeld (Grippio & Eldin) concerning settlement issues.

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

01/05/15	PM	1.20	Revise Pretrial Statement.
01/05/15	PM	0.10	Email communications with Bob Keach and railcar defendants re. settlement.
01/05/15	PM	0.10	Email communications with Tim McKeon and Bob Keach re. Trinity Defendants' 2004 exam motions.
01/05/15	ALS	0.10	Emails from/to P. McDonald regarding Shell Trading document production
01/06/15	MAF	0.20	Review CIT revisions to settlement agreement; e-mail to R. Keach regarding same
01/06/15	PM	0.10	Email and telephone communications with Tim McKeon re. service of amended complaint.
01/06/15	PM	0.40	Review Defendants' changes to Pretrial Order.
01/06/15	TJM	0.80	Revise and finalize JPO for filing
01/07/15	TJM	0.20	Draft, edit and finalize motion to continue hearing re Rule 2004 motions re Slawson and Devlar
01/07/15	ALS	0.20	Conferences (x2) with T. McKeon regarding filing of Amended Complaint in World Fuels adversary proceeding
01/08/15	ALS	0.30	Docket scheduling relating to pre-trial scheduling order in World Fuel adversary proceeding
01/08/15	ALS	0.50	Review emails from T. McKeon regarding filing of first amended complaint in World Fuel adversary proceeding (.2); office conference with A. Cummings regarding same (.2); email to R. Keach, P. McDonald and T. McKeon regarding filing of first amended complaint (.1)
01/08/15	ALS	0.20	Emails to/from T. McKeon regarding deadlines contained in pre-trial scheduling order in World Fuel adversary proceeding
01/08/15	ALS	0.10	Review acceptance of service of Rule 2004 Subpoena from Susan Gummow on behalf of SMBC

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

01/08/15	ALS	0.10	Review disc containing documents produced by Shell in response to the Rule 2004 Subpoena
01/08/15	TJM	0.20	Draft emails to counsel for CP and Irving re acceptance of service re amended complaint
01/09/15	TJM	0.40	Review amended complaint (0.3); Coordinate filing of amended complaint (0.6); Email counsel for Irving and Canadian Pacific re acceptance of service re amended complaint (0.1)
01/09/15	PM	0.10	Email communications with Angela Stewart and Bob Keach re. filing Amended Complaint.
01/09/15	PM	0.60	Review World Fuel/Irving contract.
01/09/15	PM	0.60	Review Shell document production.
01/09/15	DSA	0.10	Reviewed e-mails concerning issues with Wheeling joint pretrial (.1)
01/09/15	KQ	0.30	File via ECF the First Amended Complaint regarding World Fuel
01/12/15	ALS	0.10	Docket scheduling relating to filing of consented pre-trial order in World Fuel adversary proceeding
01/12/15	ALS	0.50	Review adversary docket re Wheeling adversary proceeding (.3); docket scheduling relating to hearings on Motion for Order Authorizing the Recovery of Expenses and Motion to Enforce Cash Collateral Orders in Wheeling adversary proceeding (.2)
01/12/15	PM	0.30	Email communications with Bob Keach, Jay Geller and Tim McKeon re. SMBC 2004 exam.
01/12/15	PM	0.20	Phone call with Jay Geller re. status.
01/12/15	PM	0.20	Review various email communications with counsel re. conference to discuss pretrial order issues.
01/12/15	TJM	0.20	Review and finalize motion to continue Rule 2004 hearings re Slawson and Devlar

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

01/12/15	TJM	0.30	Review Wheeling's designation of record re appeal to First Circuit
01/12/15	TJM	0.20	Email counsel for SMBC re responses to discovery demands
01/12/15	TJM	0.50	Research, draft, edit and revise Motion for contempt re SMBC failure to comply with Court order re Rule 2004 production of documents
01/12/15	TJM	0.10	Email M Fagone re comments re Wheeling's designation of record re appeal re First Circuit
01/13/15	TJM	1.00	Review record from BAP and appellant designation of record re draft and finalize appellee designation of record
01/13/15	PM	0.10	Email communications re. conference to discuss pretrial order.
01/13/15	PM	0.30	Review SMBC Rule 2004 subpoena and order and email communications with Tim McKeon re. failure to comply.
01/13/15	PM	0.10	Email communications with Susan Gummow and Bob Keach re. SMBC contempt.
01/13/15	PM	4.90	Research re. legal issues raised by Canadian Pacific RW (Stern v. Marshall; mandatory withdrawal of reference).
01/13/15	MAF	0.20	E-mails/conferences w/ A Stewart regarding filing supplemental appendix; e-mail from Court regarding mandatory settlement conference
01/14/15	ALS	0.20	Docket scheduling relating to continued hearing re: Wheeling & Lake Erie Railway Company's Motion to Enforce Cash Collateral Orders and Motion for an Order Pursuant to 11 U.S.C. Sec. 506(c) Authorizing the Recovery of Expenses From Wheeling and Lake Erie Railway Co. or Its Collateral

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

01/14/15	ALS	0.20	Revision to Acceptance of Service for Canadian Pacific in World Fuel adversary proceeding
01/14/15	ALS	0.30	Email to R. Keach for clarification of Pre-Trial Scheduling Order entered in Wheeling adversary proceeding (.1); continued docket scheduling relating to Pre-Trial Scheduling Order entered in Wheeling adversary proceeding (.2)
01/14/15	PM	0.70	Conference call with Bob Keach and counsel for CPF, Irving, World Fuel re. pretrial order.
01/14/15	PM	0.10	Email communications with Tim McKeon and Bob Keach re. jurisdictional discovery.
01/14/15	PM	0.10	Phone call with Bob Keach re. status and next steps.
01/14/15	PM	0.70	Review and revise motion for contempt against SMBC, LLC.
01/14/15	TJM	0.50	Revise acceptance of service form and communicate w/ A Stewart, Trustee and counsel for Irving re same
01/14/15	TJM	4.10	Edit and revise jurisdictional discovery requests re Irving and CP
01/14/15	TJM	0.10	Email trustee re status of service of amend complaint re Keach v. World Fuel
01/14/15	TJM	0.20	Confer with A Stewart re status of adversary proceeding re Wheeling v. Keach
01/15/15	TJM	0.90	Revise Acceptance of Service re amended complaint re reservation of defendant's rights (0.3) and email Trustee re same (0.2); Confer S Stewart re certificate of acceptance and service of amended complaint (0.5)
01/15/15	TJM	0.30	Email counsel for Irving and Canadian Pacific re acceptance of service form re amended complaint

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

01/15/15	TJM	0.40	Review motion for withdrawal of the reference filed by CP
01/15/15	PM	0.10	Email communications with Tim McKeon re. service of complaint on Irving and CPR.
01/15/15	PM	0.10	Email communications with Slausen's counsel re. extension of time to produce documents.
01/15/15	PM	1.70	Review CPR motion to withdraw reference.
01/15/15	ALS	0.80	Discussions (x2) regarding service of First Amended Complaint and Summons in World Fuel adversary proceeding with T. McKeon (.4); emails to T. McKeon and R. Keach regarding service of First Amended Complaint and Summons in World Fuel adversary proceeding with T. McKeon (.2); revisions to Acceptances of Service (.2)
01/15/15	MAF	0.30	Call from Alan Lepene regarding Wheeling litigation to collect receivables, relief from stay and discovery
01/16/15	MAF	0.20	E-mail from A. Lepene regarding relief from stay; e-mail to R. Keach regarding the same
01/16/15	PM	0.10	Various emails w/ T McKeon re. scheduling.
01/16/15	PM	2.70	Revise Irving jurisdictional discovery.
01/16/15	TJM	0.20	Review rules re motion to withdraw the reference
01/19/15	TJM	0.10	Review email from A Stewart re filing of acceptances of service re amended complaint
01/19/15	MAF	0.80	Review CP's motion to withdraw the reference
01/19/15	DSA	0.20	Reviewed e-mails concerning issues with Wheeling litigation and wrongful death litigation (.2)
01/19/15	ALS	0.70	Docket scheduling relating to answer and other pleading deadlines for new defendants in World Fuel adversary proceeding (.4); preparation of memorandum relating to upcoming deadlines in World Fuel adversary

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

			proceeding (.3)
01/19/15	ALS	0.40	Docket scheduling relating to deadline to respond to Motion to Withdraw Reference in World Fuel adversary proceeding (.1); review U.S. District Court docket regarding Motion to Withdraw Reference (.2); email to R. Keach regarding review of U.S. District Court docket regarding Motion to Withdraw Reference (.1)
01/20/15	ALS	0.50	Continue review of upcoming deadlines and hearings in World Fuel adversary case (.4); office conference with T. McKeon regarding upcoming deadlines and hearings in World Fuel adversary case (.1)
01/20/15	MAF	0.10	Revisions to letter to Judge King (settlement judge for First Circuit)
01/20/15	TJM	0.20	Review amended JPO re comments and revisions from P McDonald
01/20/15	TJM	0.10	Confer with P McDonald re revised JPO re World Fuel AP
01/20/15	TJM	1.40	Draft, edit and revise letter to settlement judge re Wheeling appeal to First Circuit (1.3) and confer M Fagone re same (.1)
01/20/15	PM	0.20	Phone call with Tim McKeon re. amended pretrial order and Rule 2004 exams.
01/20/15	PM	0.10	Review order re. amendment of pretrial order and motion to exceed page limit.
01/20/15	PM	0.20	Review revised pretrial deadlines.
01/20/15	RND	0.60	Meeting with R. Keach re: response to CP's motion to withdraw reference
01/20/15	RND	4.20	Begin reviewing/analyzing CP's POCs and other filings in case
01/20/15	RND	0.10	Meeting with A. Stewart re: CP's motion to withdraw reference
01/21/15	PM	2.00	Draft discovery requests for Irving.

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

01/21/15	PM	2.40	Draft revised Joint Pretrial Statement and Pretrial Order.
01/21/15	TJM	0.10	Review email from counsel for Irving re amended JPO and Trustee's response re same
01/21/15	TJM	0.20	Review file on admin claims and confer S Anderson re same
01/21/15	TJM	0.50	Confer with A Cummings re First Circuit notice of appearance
01/21/15	TJM	0.10	Review preference claim analysis from DSI
01/21/15	TJM	1.40	Revise amended JPO and send same to P McDonald
01/21/15	TJM	0.20	Review amended JPO per revisions from P McDonald
01/21/15	TJM	0.60	Review Wheeling motion to enforce cash collateral motion
01/21/15	MAF	1.10	Review proposed revisions to Rail World settlement agreements; lengthy analysis of same and e-mail to R. Keach;
01/21/15	MAF	0.70	Review memo regarding 2011 transaction (.4); brief office conference with M. Siedband regarding same (.3)
01/21/15	MAF	0.10	Review and reply to e-mail from R. Kelley (Maine Northern counsel) regarding relief from stay order
01/22/15	TJM	0.10	TC w/ Trustee re Amended PTO
01/22/15	TJM	0.30	Email defendants' counsel re amended joint pretrial order
01/22/15	TJM	0.10	TC w/ P McDonald re Amended Pretrial Order
01/22/15	TJM	0.20	Review email from counsel for Arrow re protective order and respond re same
01/22/15	TJM	0.40	Review Trustee's 506(c) surcharge motion re Wheeling and Wheeling objection
01/22/15	TJM	0.10	Review objection to claim re CP claim
01/22/15	TJM	0.30	Review objection to Wheeling motion to enforce cash collateral orders

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

01/22/15	PM	0.30	Review various emails re. revised pretrial order and phone call with Tim McKeon re. same.
01/22/15	PM	0.20	Emails with Susan Gummow and Tim McKeon and phone calls with Tim re. SMAC Rule 2004 Exam issues.
01/22/15	PM	0.10	Emails with Arrow Midstream counsel and Tim McKeon and phone call with Tim re. Arrow Midstream Rule 2004 Exam issues.
01/22/15	PM	0.10	Phone call from Mark Zimmerman re. settlement issues and email to Bob Keach re. same.
01/22/15	PM	0.30	Review correspondence from CP's counsel re. protective order and access to Rule 2004 Exam documents and email to Bob Keach re. same.
01/22/15	RND	7.00	Review and analyze CP POC and motion to withdraw reference
01/23/15	RND	7.60	Continue to review/analyze CP POC and motion to withdraw reference
01/23/15	PM	0.30	Review WFS changes to proposed pretrial order and email to all counsel re. same.
01/23/15	PM	0.40	Phone call with Jay Geller re. revisions to pretrial order and settlement status.
01/23/15	PM	0.10	Review Maine Northern RW motion for relief from stay.
01/23/15	PM	0.30	Phone call and email with Chris Nemith re. proposed changes to pretrial order.
01/23/15	PM	0.10	Various emails with WFS counsel re. proposed changes to pretrial order.
01/23/15	PM	0.30	Various emails with WFS counsel and Bob Keach re. proposed changes to pretrial order.
01/23/15	PM	0.10	Phone call with Bob Keach re. pretrial order
01/23/15	PM	0.40	Finalize pretrial order and email communications with counsel re. same.
01/23/15	PM	2.20	Revise discovery requests.

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

01/23/15	PM	0.40	Review Canadian Center for Policy Alternatives Report on Lac Megantic incident and NBC News Report of same provide by Bob Keach.
01/23/15	TJM	0.10	Confer with Trustee re SMBC re production of documents re Rule 2004
01/23/15	TJM	0.60	Finalize amended pre-trial order
01/23/15	TJM	0.10	Review proposed changes to Amended JPO from WFS Entities
01/23/15	TJM	0.50	Review Wheeling objection to Trustee's 506(c) surcharge motion
01/23/15	TJM	0.10	Review email from WFS counsel re amended JPS and Trustee response re same
01/23/15	MAF	2.40	Continue working on revisions to GERSCO document; e-mails to and from R. Keach regarding same
01/23/15	ALS	0.30	Filing of proposed Amended Pretrial Scheduling Order in World Fuel adversary proceeding (.2); office conference with T. McKeon regarding filing of proposed Amended Pretrial Scheduling Order in World Fuel adversary proceeding (.1)
01/26/15	DSA	0.30	Reviewed e-mails relating to corporate disclosures and mediation with Wheeling (.3)
01/26/15	MAF	0.40	Call from Judge King (First Circuit settlement counsel) regarding Wheeling appeal
01/26/15	MAF	1.40	Review and analyze proposed changes to settlement agreement from Trinity
01/26/15	MAF	1.40	Review and analyze proposed changes to settlement agreement from First Union
01/26/15	MAF	0.10	E-mails to and from R. Keach regarding GERSCO settlement
01/26/15	MAF	0.10	E-mail from P. Legault regarding various settlement status and related matters
01/26/15	PM	0.90	Finalize discovery requests to Irving.

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

01/26/15	PM	0.10	Review Order on ME NRW motion for relief from stay.
01/26/15	PM	1.10	Letter to CP's counsel re. access to documents produced by Rule 2004 Examinees.
01/26/15	RND	8.10	Review and analyze case law re: preemption and mandatory withdrawal of reference
01/27/15	RND	7.90	Review cases re: timeliness and permissive withdrawal of reference
01/28/15	RND	0.20	Meeting and email with M. Siedband re: preference demand letters
01/28/15	RND	7.80	Review and analyze case law re: Stern decision and application and withdrawal of reference for jury trial request
01/28/15	PM	0.10	Review ECF notice of Pretrial Order.
01/28/15	PM	0.10	Email communications with Jay Geller and Tim McKeon re. Rule 25(f) conference.
01/28/15	TJM	0.40	Review documents produced by Enserco re Rule 2004
01/28/15	TJM	0.60	Review documents produced by ConocoPhillips re Rule 2004
01/28/15	TJM	1.10	Review documents produced by InCorr re Rule 2004
01/28/15	TJM	0.80	Review documents provided by Arrow re Rule 2004
01/29/15	TJM	0.30	Email counsel for Wheeling re continuance of hearing re motion to enforce cash collateral orders and TR's 506(c) motion
01/29/15	TJM	0.10	Confer w/ S Anderson and R Desai re preference actions
01/29/15	TJM	0.90	Confer w/ R Desai re motion in opposition to CP motion to withdraw the reference
01/29/15	TJM	0.90	Review Trustee's 506(c) motion and Wheeling opposition re same, and review cited cases re same
01/29/15	TJM	1.70	Research re "new value" re preference actions

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

01/29/15	PM	0.10	Email communications with Tim McKeon re. UTCC production of documents.
01/29/15	RND	8.60	Begin drafting response to CP's motion to withdraw reference
01/29/15	TJM	0.80	Confer w/ S Anderson and M Siedband re preference actions and strategy
01/29/15	TJM	0.30	Email F Caruso re attending Feb 26 hearing in Wheeling Adversary Proceeding and preparation re same
01/29/15	MAF	0.20	Call with F. Caruso regarding hearing on Wheeling matters
01/29/15	MAF	0.30	Review proposed changes to GERSCO document from Canadians; e-mail to R. Keach regarding same; revisions to GERSCO document; e-mail same to J. Steen and others
01/29/15	MAS	0.90	Meet with Sam Anderson and Tim McKeon (.8), and with Tim McKeon separately (.1) re: strategy and timetable for preference actions.
01/29/15	MAS	0.40	Draft memo to Tim McKeon, Sam Anderson, and Bob Keach with updated preference spreadsheet and highlighting outstanding issues.
01/29/15	MAS	1.30	Review preference spreadsheet and draft updates in light of assignments of preference actions, includes review of docket for payees represented by counsel.
01/29/15	DSA	1.60	Reviewed e-mails and demand letters for preference actions and e-mailed M. Seidband concerning issues with same (.2); conference with T. McKeon and M. Seidband concerning issues with preference actions (.8); reviewed demand letters for template and e-mailed Trustee concerning issues with new value defense (.3); reviewed e-mails and e-mailed parties concerning issues with preference demands (.3)

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

01/30/15	MAF	0.30	Review and respond to mark-up of Trinity settlement
01/30/15	MAF	0.60	Office conference with T. McKeon regarding preparations for Wheeling hearings; review Courts decision on 45G; e-mails from and to B. Keach regarding same
01/30/15	MAF	0.10	E-mail from and to Judge King (First Circuit settlement judge)
01/30/15	MAF	0.30	Review and respond to mark-up of First Union settlement
01/30/15	MAF	1.00	Review and analyze Irving settlement agreement draft; e-mail to R. Keach regarding same
01/30/15	DSA	0.70	Reviewed e-mails and e-mailed parties concerning issues with strategy for preference actions (.1); reviewed e-mails concerning issues with Wheeling litigation (.1); conference with T. McKeon concerning issues with new value defense to preference actions (.3); telephone conference with F. Caruso concerning issues with preference analysis and new value defense (.2)
01/30/15	TJM	0.40	Draft, edit and revise fourth consent motion re continuance of hearing and objection deadline re Rule 2004 motions re First Union, Union Tank, GE and Trinity
01/30/15	RND	11.50	Continue drafting response to CP's motion to withdraw reference
01/30/15	PM	1.40	Review various materials sent by Bob Keach re. FRA inspections and other reports of tank car safety and crude oil mislabeling.
01/30/15	TJM	1.40	Research re "new value" defense to preference actions

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

01/30/15	TJM	0.40	Confer w/ M Fagone re Wheeling motion to enforce cash collateral and preparation for hearing re same
01/30/15	TJM	0.20	Review file for motion to amend or strike findings re Wheeling security interest, and opposition and order re same (0.1) and email same to Trustee (0.1)
01/30/15	TJM	0.30	Confer w/ S Anderson re "new value" defense to preference action
01/30/15	TJM	0.10	Email Trustee and M Fagone re status of continuing hearing on Wheeling motion re enforce cash collateral order (0.1) and email opposing counsel re following up on email re continuance of hearing (0.1)
02/02/15	TJM	0.10	Respond to email from M Fagone re first amended complaint in Keach v. World Fuel, et al
02/02/15	TJM	0.20	Update and revise consent motions re Rule 2004 hearings
02/02/15	PM	0.20	Email communications with Bob Keach and Tim McKeon and phone call with Tim re. discovery requests to Irving.
02/02/15	PM	0.10	Review motion to extend objection deadline on Rule 2004 motion.
02/02/15	PM	0.10	Emails and phone calls with Bob Keach re. discovery of Irving.
02/02/15	RND	0.10	Email correspondence with R. Keach re: response to CP's motion to withdraw the reference
02/02/15	TJM	0.20	Finalize for filing re motions to continue hearing, etc re Rule 2004 motions re First Union, Union Tank, GE, Trinity(s), Delvar and Slawson
02/02/15	TJM	4.50	Draft and revise jurisdictional discovery demands re Irving

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

02/02/15	ALS	0.10	Docket scheduling relating to respond deadline re: Motion for Oral Argument/Hearing re Motion to Withdraw Reference in World Fuel District Court case
02/02/15	MAF	0.70	Redline draft settlement agreement for Irving
02/03/15	DSA	0.30	Telephone conference with DSI concerning issues with new value defense and reviewed e-mails relating to same (.3)
02/03/15	TJM	4.40	Draft and revise jurisdictional discovery demands
02/03/15	TJM	0.10	Respond to email from G Marcus re continuing hearing re motion to enforce and 506(c) motion
02/03/15	TJM	0.30	Confer w/ S Anderson and DSI re calculation of new value re preference claims
02/03/15	PM	0.40	Review recent case law on personal jurisdiction over adversary defendant.
02/03/15	PM	1.80	Review recent case law on personal jurisdiction over adversary defendant.
02/03/15	PM	0.10	Review various ECH notices re. Rule 2004 motion.
02/03/15	PM	1.00	Review discovery requests, pretrial order, rules of civil procedure in preparation for rule 26(f) conference.
02/03/15	PM	0.10	Email communications with Bob Keach and Tim McKeon re. ESI issues in preparation for Rule 26(f) conference.
02/04/15	PM	0.40	Meet with Tim McKeon to discuss jurisdiction discovery and motion to withdraw reference.
02/04/15	PM	0.20	Email and phone communications with Tim McKeon re. MMAR documents and ESI information.
02/04/15	PM	0.30	Telephone call with Tim Shannon and Nicole Hoglund re. MMAR locations, scope and format of MMAR documents.
02/04/15	PM	0.60	Prepare for and attend Rule 26(f) conference with World Fuel counsel.

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

02/04/15	PM	0.10	Email communications with Bob Keach re. Rule 26(f) conference.
02/04/15	PM	0.10	Email communications with Bob Keach re. Marathon settlement.
02/04/15	TJM	0.30	Rule 26(f) conference w/ P McDonald and counsel for World Fuel
02/04/15	TJM	0.40	Confer w/ P McDonald re status of jurisdictional discovery
02/04/15	TJM	5.30	Draft, edit and revise jurisdictional discovery requests
02/04/15	RND	1.20	Draft and revise consent motion for extension to Motion to Withdraw reference response deadline; coordinate filing re: same
02/04/15	RND	0.40	Emails and calls with R. Keach, J. Dow, and T. Thornton re: consent motion to extend response deadline to CP's Motion to Withdraw the Reference
02/04/15	MAF	0.40	Call from F. Caruso regarding Wheeling matters
02/05/15	MAF	0.60	Call with J. Steen, M. Linder and R. Keach regarding GERSCO settlement agreement (0.5); e-mail to J. Steen and M. Linder regarding same (0.1)
02/05/15	RND	0.20	Follow up with A. Stewart and District Court re: response deadline to CP's Motion to Withdraw the Reference
02/05/15	TJM	2.70	Research, draft, edit and revise motion to continue hearing re Motion to Enforce and Surcharge Motion
02/05/15	TJM	1.00	Draft and revise jurisdictional discovery re CP
02/05/15	TJM	0.10	Update Rule 2004 production document
02/06/15	TJM	0.10	Email P McDonald re updated draft of jurisdictional discovery re Irving

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

02/06/15	TJM	0.80	Draft and revise jurisdictional discovery re CP (0.5); Review revisions and edits to jurisdictional discovery re Irving from P McDonald (0.3)
02/06/15	TJM	0.10	Confer w/ P McDonald re jurisdictional discovery re Irving and CP
02/06/15	TJM	0.10	Review motion to continue hearing re Motion to Enforce and Surcharge motion, as well as FOO
02/06/15	PM	2.00	Revise discovery requests to Irving.
02/08/15	TJM	1.00	Review and revise jurisdictional discovery re CP
02/08/15	TJM	0.30	Review and edit motion to continue hearing re motion to enforce and surcharge motion (0.2) and email M Fagone re same (0.1)
02/08/15	RND	0.20	Emails with R. Keach re: objection to CP's motion to withdraw the reference (World Fuel Litigation)
02/08/15	RND	5.10	Review/revise Objection to CP's Motion to Withdraw the Reference (World Fuels Litigation)
02/09/15	RND	5.20	Research/Review additional case law re: overlap of POC with counterclaim (objection to CP's motion for withdrawal of reference in World Fuel Litigation)
02/09/15	RND	0.30	Emails with R. Keach re: revisions to objection to CP's motion to withdraw the reference (World Fuel Litigation)
02/09/15	TJM	0.10	Confer with K Bigelow re edits and revisions re proofing re jurisdictional discovery demands
02/09/15	TJM	0.60	Review jurisdictional discovery demands and email P McDonald re same

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

02/09/15	TJM	0.60	Finalize consent motion to continue hearing re Wheeling Motion to Enforce and Trustee's 506(c) Motion (0.5) and email counsel for Wheeling re same (0.1)
02/09/15	TJM	0.50	Finalize jurisdictional discovery demands re Irving (0.2) and email Trustee re same (0.3)
02/09/15	PM	0.40	Final review and approval of Irving jurisdictional discovery.
02/09/15	PM	0.60	Review and revise discovery requests to Canadian Pacific RR.
02/09/15	MAF	0.70	Continue revisions to 2011 transactions complaint
02/09/15	MAF	0.10	E-mails from and to R. Keach and P. Legault regarding settlement agreement revisions
02/10/15	RND	0.20	Emails with A. Cummings and R. Keach re: applicable page limit and motion to exceed page limit (World Fuel Litigation)
02/10/15	RND	0.70	Review applicable bankruptcy rules, district court rules, and local rules re: page limits and draft motion to exceed page limit (objection to CP's motion to withdraw reference in World Fuel Litigation)
02/10/15	RND	0.30	Meetings with C. Bertsch and A. Stewart re: Canadian Regulations for Transportation of Dangerous Goods Act (Obj to CP's motion to withdraw reference in World Fuel Litigation)
02/10/15	RND	0.20	Email and meeting with A. Stewart re: filing of consent motion to exceed page limitation for Obj to CP's motion to withdraw reference (World Fuel Litigation)
02/10/15	RND	5.80	Continue reviewing/revising updated draft of objection to CP's motion to withdraw reference (World Fuel Litigation)

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

02/10/15	TJM	0.90	Review documents produced in response to Rule 2004 Orders and located msds sheets re Trustee's review
02/10/15	TJM	1.10	Review documents produced by SMBC re Rule 2004 requests
02/10/15	TJM	1.30	Review jurisdictional discovery demands re Irving in preparation of sending out (1.2); Email counsel for Irving re jurisdictional discovery demands (0.1)
02/10/15	TJM	0.10	TC w/ counsel for Irving re jurisdictional discovery demands
02/10/15	TJM	0.20	Confer w/ K Bigelow re scanning documents received from SMBC re Rule 2004 requests
02/10/15	TJM	0.10	Email Trustee re conversation w/ counsel for Irving
02/10/15	TJM	0.10	Email counsel for Wheeling re following up on motion to continue hearing re motion to enforce and surcharge motion
02/11/15	TJM	0.10	Confer w/ P McDonald re status of jurisdictional discovery and case status
02/11/15	TJM	1.20	Review and revise P McDonald revisions to jurisdictional discovery re Irving (1.1) and email P McDonald re same (0.1)
02/11/15	TJM	0.10	Email counsel for Wheeling re motion to continue hearing re Motion to Enforce and Surcharge Motion
02/11/15	PM	0.10	Meet with Tim McKeon to discuss motion to withdraw reference and status of settlements.
02/11/15	PM	1.20	Final revisions to Canadian Pacific discovery requests.
02/12/15	PM	0.20	Final review of CPR jurisdictional discovery requests.
02/12/15	TJM	0.10	Confer with P McDonald re jurisdictional discovery re CP and case status

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

02/12/15	TJM	1.50	Finalize jurisdictional discovery and send out to counsel for CP
02/12/15	RND	0.80	Meeting with R. Keach re: Carmack research
02/12/15	MAF	1.50	Continued review of complaint regarding 2011 transaction (0.9) confer with Mike Siedband regarding revisions to same (0.6)
02/13/15	MAF	0.80	Call with Marathon, Slawson and QEP counsel (0.6); follow up e-mail to R. Keach (0.2)
02/13/15	MAF	0.70	Call with F. Caruso regarding Wheeling diminution calculation
02/13/15	MAF	0.50	Meeting with M. Siedband regarding 2011 transaction and draft complaint relating to the same
02/13/15	MAF	0.40	Review e-mail from A. Helman regarding discovery in federal court litigation between Irving and Wheeling (0.1); e-mail to and from F. Caruso regarding same (0.3)
02/13/15	MAS	4.30	Confer with Mike Fagone re: revisions to complaint (.5) and draft revisions to complaint (including review of VA LLC case regarding recharacterization) (3.8)
02/13/15	KQ	0.30	Finalize and file via ECF the Consent Motion to Continue Hearing and to Extend Related Deadlines, and proposed form of Order, with respect to Wheeling's Motion to Enforce
02/13/15	KQ	0.50	Draft and file the Certificate of Service related to the Consent Motion to Continue Hearing and to Extend Related Deadlines, and proposed form of Order, with respect to Wheeling's Motion to Enforce
02/13/15	RND	1.70	Research re: general defenses to carmack liability

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

02/13/15	TJM	0.40	Finalize motion to continue hearings re Wheeling's motion to enforce and Trustee's 506(c) motion for filing, and coordinate filing re same
02/16/15	PM	0.10	Email communications with Bob Keach re. research on personal jurisdiction issue.
02/16/15	PM	0.20	Review discovery requests of Irving directed to MMAR.
02/16/15	PM	0.10	Review ECF notices re. motions to continue hearings on parties applications for administrative expenses.
02/16/15	MAS	0.20	Review and exchange emails with Mike Fagone and Bob Keach re: content of 2011 transaction complaint and avenues for additional inquiry.
02/16/15	MAS	0.40	Exchange emails with Mike Fagone re: recharacterization analysis from "VA LLC" case, including my summary analysis of *AutoStyle Plastics* and *AtlanticRancher* lines of cases (re: 2011 transaction complaint).
02/16/15	MAS	0.70	Teleconference with Mike Fagone re: further revisions to 2011 transaction complaint, including documents to revisit, basis for various allegations, reason for including or excluding certain allegations, and additional counts to add or split.
02/16/15	MAF	5.20	Continued revisions to and research for 2011 transaction complaint (4.3); multiple e-mails to and from M. Siedband and R. Keach regarding same (.2); call with M. Siedband (0.7)
02/17/15	MAF	0.40	Call with M. Siedband regarding 2011 transaction complaint (.1); review documents regarding facts in support of same (.2); brief office conference with R. Keach regarding claims arising out of the transaction (.1)

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

02/17/15	MAF	0.30	Review revisions to various settlement agreements
02/17/15	MAF	0.20	Office conference with R. Keach regarding Marathon settlement agreement; e-mail to T. Renfroe regarding same
02/17/15	MAS	0.20	Exchange emails with Angela Stewart re: whether named defendants in draft 2011 transaction complaint have filed proofs of claim in case-in-chief.
02/17/15	MAS	0.20	Exchange emails with Angela Stewart and Bob Keach re: RailWorld management agreement with MMA, location of document, availability of updated or amended versions of document.
02/17/15	MAS	3.30	Draft revisions to 2011 transaction complaint based on discussions and notes from Mike Fagone (includes review of relevant documents, review of statutory basis of additional counts to complaint, and email to Bob Keach re: same).
02/17/15	ALS	0.70	Obtain claim information for M. Siedband based on draft adversary complaint (.2); emails from/to M. Siedband regarding same (.2); review electronic and hard copy files regarding executor contracts (.3); emails from/to M. Siedband regarding management agreement (.2)
02/17/15	PM	0.10	Review various ECF notices re. Lexington motion for payment approval.
02/17/15	PM	0.20	Review articles sent from Bob Keach re. tank car derailment.
02/17/15	MAS	0.40	Review Burkhardt letter to shareholders and exchange emails with Mike Fagone re: same and additional areas of inquiry for 2011 transaction complaint.

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

02/17/15	MAS	0.30	Brief review of 2003 Note and Warrant purchase document to determine if original document provided for convertible aspect of notes purchased.
02/17/15	RND	7.80	Research re: shipper's prima facie case under Carmack (World Fuel Litigation)
02/17/15	RND	0.10	Email with C. Bertsch (BSSN) re: treatise concerning Carmack liability (World Fuel Litigation)
02/18/15	RND	6.10	Research re: shipper's burden to show delivering in good condition under Carmack (World Fuel Litigation)
02/18/15	TJM	0.10	Review email from A Helman re request for documents and information re responses to notices to admit
02/18/15	TJM	1.00	Review email from F Caruso re responses to notice to admit served on Wheeling and confer M Fagone re same (0.4); Review Wheeling complaint re allegations re monies owed to MMA from Irving entities (0.3); Prepare and draft responses to notice to admit (0.3)
02/18/15	PM	0.10	Review various ECF notices re. applications for payment of CIT and Lexington.
02/19/15	PM	0.20	Voicemail and email communications with Tim McKeon re. issues concerning oil producers' settlements.
02/19/15	PM	0.10	Email communications with Tim Norton and Bob Keach re. settlement with oil producers.
02/19/15	MAS	0.70	Confer with Bob Keach and Mike Fagone re: 2011 transaction complaint, discussion of areas requiring additional documentation, structural changes.
02/19/15	TJM	1.10	Research re procedure for withdrawing as counsel in First Circuit appeal (0.6) and draft, edit and revise re same (0.5)

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

02/19/15	TJM	1.00	Draft, edit and revise initial disclosures re Rule 7026
02/19/15	RND	5.10	Continue Carmack research re: shipper's burden to show delivery in good condition and begin research re: defense of shipper negligence
02/19/15	ALS	0.80	Assist with filing of consent motion to extend deadlines re: Trustee to Notify Court of Result of Parties' Discussions & Plaintiffs to file written clarification of the scope of the requested amendment in U.S. District Court cases
02/19/15	MAS	5.00	Begin drafting additional revisions to 2011 transaction complaint, including review of Rail Funding Agreements (FRA loan) and Maine DOT loans.
02/19/15	MAF	0.70	Office conference with B. Keach and M. Siedband regarding 2011 transaction complaint
02/19/15	MAF	0.10	Telephone call with Mike Hahn regarding Bangor Savings Bank financing
02/19/15	KQ	0.30	Revise Joint Motion to Continue Deadlines to include COS
02/19/15	KQ	0.10	Office conference with T. McKeon regarding COS and FOO for Motion to Continue Deadlines
02/19/15	KQ	0.80	Finalize, file and serve the Joint Motion to Continue Deadline
02/19/15	KQ	1.00	Finalize and file Joint Motion to Continue Deadline on all related cases
02/20/15	MAS	6.80	Continued drafting of revisions and updates to 2011 transaction complaint.
02/20/15	RND	6.00	Carmack Research re: defense of shipper negligence
02/20/15	TJM	0.40	Confer with R Desai re case strategy and status re Carmack claims

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

02/20/15	TJM	0.30	Review email re filing of joint motion to extend deadlines (re personal injury cases) as filed on docket re CPR's motion to withdraw the reference, and respond re same
02/20/15	TJM	0.30	Review jurisdictional discovery served by Irving
02/22/15	MAS	2.90	Complete current series of revisions and additions to 2011 transaction complaint and email same to Bob Keach with note re: areas of imperfect information.
02/23/15	PM	0.10	Analyze Irving discovery requests.
02/23/15	PM	0.10	Email communications with Bob Keach re. Irving discovery requests.
02/23/15	PM	0.70	Review recent case law on personal jurisdiction issue.
02/23/15	PM	0.20	Review motion to stay Canadian class action.
02/23/15	TJM	0.50	Draft, edit and revise Trustee's report re motion for stay of certain proceedings in Canada (0.4) and coordinate filing re same (0.1)
02/23/15	TJM	0.20	Confer with M Siedband re preference demand letters
02/23/15	TJM	0.40	Review research re "new value" re demand letters re preference actions
02/23/15	RND	6.90	Research re: shipper negligence as defense to Carmack (World Fuel Litigation)
02/23/15	MAS	1.70	Review case-law re: "new value exception" in Maine and draft revisions to preference demand letter templates, confer with Tim McKeon re: application of new value relative to DSI's analysis, and email to Bob Keach re: same.
02/23/15	MAS	0.20	Confer with Tim McKeon re: new value caselaw for preference demand letters, discussion of short-form vs. long-form demand letter.

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

02/23/15	ALS	0.20	Update deadline re Trustee to Notify Court of Result of Parties' Discussions and Plaintiffs to file written clarification of the scope of the requested amendment in U.S. District Court cases (.1); review Order regarding same (.1)
02/23/15	ALS	0.40	Docket scheduling re Appellant's Briefing Notice in First Circuit Case re Wheeling & Lake Erie (.2); review Briefing Notice re First Circuit case re Wheeling & Lake Erie (.2)
02/23/15	DSA	0.80	Reviewed motion to stay proceedings in class action in Canada (.4); reviewed e-mails and cases on good faith findings for releases (.3); reviewed e-mails and orders entered in case (.1)
02/24/15	MAS	0.30	Confer with Tim McKeon re: new value exception analysis, including review of spreadsheets from DSI re: preferential payments.
02/24/15	MAS	0.50	Draft brief email memo to Bob Keach re: theories of recovery for preferences made to secured creditors.
02/24/15	MAS	3.00	Draft demand letter to Wheeling re: preference and payments received in 2011 transactions, includes brief review of insider preference law.
02/24/15	MAF	0.40	Office conference with M. Siedband regarding preference demands
02/24/15	RND	7.80	Research re: inherent vice defense to Carmack (World Fuel Litigation)
02/24/15	TJM	1.70	Research application of "new value" to prior preferences under Maine law (1.3) and confer M Seidband re same (0.4)

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

02/24/15	TJM	0.10	Review email from counsel for Wheeling re proposed stipulation of facts, etc re hearing on Motion to Enforce
02/24/15	TJM	0.20	Confer R Desai re Carmack claim research status
02/24/15	TJM	0.20	Review reply motion filed by CPR re motion to withdraw the reference
02/24/15	TJM	0.10	Review email from counsel for Wheeling re hearing re Motion to Enforce
02/24/15	PM	0.10	Email communications with Tim McKeon re. initial disclosures.
02/25/15	TJM	0.10	Review emails b/w counsel for Wheeling and Trustee re continuance of hearing on motion to enforce
02/25/15	TJM	0.50	Confer with M Seidband and S Anderson re "new value" defense
02/25/15	TJM	1.30	Research "new value" re Maine law (0.7); Confer re same w/ M Seidband and S Anderson (0.4); TC w/ DSI re "new value" law in Maine re preference analysis (0.2)
02/25/15	TJM	1.00	Prepare initial draft of Trustee's 26(a) disclosures
02/25/15	RND	5.60	Continue research re: inherent vice defense to Carmack (World Fuel Litigation)
02/25/15	MAS	0.10	Email Fred Caruso and Matt Farnsworth at DSI re: extending preference analysis for Wheeling for a full year and email Tim McKeon with follow up question for DSI for his email requesting updated analysis.
02/25/15	MAS	5.20	Research preference law under UFTA and Bankruptcy Code for undersecured creditors, confer with Bob Keach, and continued drafting of preference demand letter for Wheeling, includes research into improvement in position analysis and preferential payment

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

02/25/15	MAS	0.50	analysis re: undersecured creditor. Confer with Tim McKeon and Sam Anderson re: nature of new value exception in Maine and implications for preferential payment analysis and demands.
02/25/15	MAS	1.00	Research and analysis of new value exception to preferential payments in Maine bankruptcy courts, includes exchange of emails with Tim McKeon comparing analysis and outcomes for different creditor / preferential payment recipients, and phone call to DSI with Tim McKeon and Sam Anderson.
02/25/15	DSA	1.40	Reviewed reply to opposition to motion to withdraw the reference (.1); reviewed e-mails relating to continuance of Wheeling litigation (.1); reviewed cases relating to new value defense (.5); conference with T. McKeon and M. Seidband concerning issues with new value defense (.5); telephone conference with DSI concerning issues with preference analysis (.2)
02/25/15	ALS	0.50	Telephone conference with A. Adessky regarding filings in U.S. District Court case (.1); email to A. Adessky attaching Joint Motion of the Trustee, Annick Roy (o/b/o Jean-Guy Veilleux), Marie-Josée Grimard (o/b/o Henriette Latulippe), and the Official Committee of Victims for Agreed Order Extending Certain Deadlines and Agreed Order entered by Court (.1); further telephone conferences with A. Adessky regarding pleadings filed in MMA matter (.2); office conference with R. Keach regarding same (.1)

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

02/26/15	ALS	2.20	Preparation of pleadings binders for R. Keach regarding CIT v Western Petroleum case and the GERSCO v Western Petroleum case
02/26/15	MAS	0.20	Confer with Tim McKeon (.1) and exchange emails with Tim McKeon, Sam Anderson, and Matt Farnsworth (at DSI) (.1) re: new value exception application, and improvement in position analysis.
02/26/15	MAS	1.90	Continued research and drafting of Wheeling demand letter, includes exchange of emails with Matt Farnsworth at DSI re: improvement in position analysis.
02/26/15	RND	3.50	Begin drafting memo re: carrier's general defenses to Carmack amendment (World Fuel Litigation)
02/26/15	TJM	1.60	Research re "new value" re same day preference and new value payments
02/26/15	TJM	1.90	Prepare initial draft of Trustee's 26(a) disclosures
02/26/15	TJM	0.30	Confer M Seidband re "new value" credits when new value is made on separate days
02/26/15	TJM	0.40	Draft email to DSI re application of "new value" under Maine law
02/26/15	TJM	0.20	Confer K Bigelow re drafting responses to Irving discovery demands
02/26/15	PM	0.20	Review Trustee's Report to CCA Proceedings filed with Court.
02/27/15	PM	0.10	Review ECF Notices re. monthly operating report.
02/27/15	TJM	0.10	Review email from Wheeling counsel re scheduling of hearing re Motion to Enforce
02/27/15	TJM	0.90	Draft, edit and revise Rule 26(a) initial disclosures and email Trustee re same
02/27/15	TJM	1.70	Draft and revise objection to CPR POC

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

02/27/15	RND	5.60	Continue drafting memo re: general defenses to Carmack (World Fuel Litigation)
02/27/15	MAS	0.90	Complete drafting Wheeling preference demand letter and email same to Bob Keach.
02/27/15	MAF	0.60	Continued review of and revisions to 2011 transaction complaint
03/02/15	MAS	0.20	Confer with Tim McKeon and Sam Anderson re: strategic change to choice of new value defense caselaw (distinguishing "Leathers" case from D. Me.).
03/02/15	MAS	1.20	Draft revisions to 2011 transaction complaint in light of Mike Fagone's comments re: same, and email same to Bob Keach with comment.
03/02/15	MAS	0.50	Draft revisions to Wheeling demand letter based on Bob Keach's comments to first draft.
03/02/15	ALS	0.30	Update docket scheduling in World Fuel Services adversary case (.2); office conference with T. McKeon re Pre-Trial Scheduling Order in World Fuel adversary proceeding (.1)
03/02/15	DSA	0.40	Conference with associates concerning issues with new value defense (.2); e-mailed DSI concerning issues with same (.1); reviewed e-mails relating to claims objection (.1)
03/02/15	RND	6.90	Draft memo re: defenses to Carmack (World Fuel Litigation)
03/02/15	TJM	0.30	Confer "new value" w/ S Anderson and M Seidband
03/02/15	TJM	0.30	TC w/ counsel for Wheeling re scheduling conference w/ Court and confer Trustee re same (0.1) and email opposing counsel re same (0.1); Circulate calendar invite re same (0.1)

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

03/02/15	TJM	0.40	Finalize motion to withdraw M Fagone as counsel re First Circuit Wheeling appeal (0.3) and confer M Fagone re same (0.1)
03/02/15	TJM	0.30	Review research re "new value"
03/02/15	TJM	4.20	Draft, edit and revise motion to amend JPS re jurisdictional deadlines re Irving and Trustee
03/03/15	TJM	0.10	Finalize motion to withdraw re M Fagone re First Circuit appeal
03/03/15	RND	3.40	Continue drafting/revising memo re: general defenses to Carmack (World Fuel Litigation)
03/03/15	RND	0.30	Begin research re: limitation of liability under Carmack
03/03/15	PM	0.10	Review article sent from Bob Keach re. CP concerns for key trains.
03/03/15	PM	0.10	Review various ECF notices re. motion for Rule 2004 Examinations.
03/03/15	PM	0.20	Review articles sent from Bob Keach re. recent derailment and composition of Bakken crude.
03/03/15	ALS	0.10	Docket scheduling relating to Red Shield adversary proceeding
03/03/15	MAF	0.80	Review revisions to Trinity settlement agreement (0.7); office conference with R. Keach regarding same (0.1)
03/04/15	MAS	0.30	Review current draft of preference demand letter and email same to Sam Anderson and Tim McKeon re: issue of updating new value analysis, precedent to use, etc.
03/04/15	PM	0.10	Review draft of Motion to Amend Pretrial Order.
03/04/15	RND	6.10	Research re: liability limitation under Carmack (World Fuel Litigation)
03/04/15	TJM	0.20	Edit and revise motion for third amended JPS re comments from Trustee re World Fuel AP

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

03/04/15	TJM	1.30	Draft, edit and revise joint motion to extend settlement deadline re District Court (1.2) and confer Trustee re same (0.1)
03/04/15	TJM	0.20	Confer P McDonald re case status and strategy
03/05/15	TJM	1.10	Review email from P McDonald re scope of discovery demands re inclusion of board minutes (0.1) and review discovery requests to create list of relevant demands (0.9) and respond re same (0.1);
03/05/15	RND	6.00	Continue researching limitation of liability under Carmack
03/05/15	PM	0.20	Email communications with Bob Keach re. statements made by CRP CEO re. safety of oil shipments.
03/05/15	PM	0.10	Email communications with Tim McKeon re. scope of document requests to CPR.
03/05/15	PM	0.60	Draft letter to John McDonald re. CP document production to include board minutes.
03/05/15	MAS	0.20	Email and confer with Tim McKeon re: relevant legal standard to use for new value exception (re: preference demand letters), and whether current analysis from DSI reflects chosen legal standard.
03/06/15	ALS	1.20	Filing of Second Motion to Extend Settlement Deadline and Amendment Clarification Deadline in U.S. District Court cases
03/06/15	RND	2.90	Review case law re: limitation of liability under Carmack (World Fuel Litigation)
03/06/15	TJM	0.60	Finalize and prepare for filing re joint motion to extend settlement deadline re District Court wrongful death cases
03/09/15	TJM	0.10	Email Trustee re motion to continue hearing re Devlar and Slawson re Rule 2004 motions

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

03/09/15	TJM	0.80	Confer with M Fagone re financial analysis re Wheeling's claim for diminution of value of collateral (0.8)
03/09/15	TJM	0.10	Confer M Seidband re preference letters
03/09/15	RND	6.40	Continue researching case law re: limitation of liability under Carmack (World Fuel Litigation)
03/10/15	RND	6.60	Draft memorandum re: limitations of liability under Carmack (World Fuel Litigation)
03/10/15	TJM	0.10	TC w/ D Johnson (Wheeling counsel) re hearing dates on motion to enforce
03/10/15	TJM	0.10	Email Trustee re scheduling re hearing on Wheeling motion to enforce and Trustee's surcharge motion
03/10/15	TJM	0.10	Emails w/ Trustee and counsel for Wheeling re scheduling hearing on Wheeling Motion to Enforce and Trustee Surcharge Motion
03/10/15	ALS	0.20	Docket scheduling relating to deadline to respond to CP's First Set of Interrogatories and Requests for Production of Documents (.1); review letter from T. Thornton attaching CP's First Set of Interrogatories and Requests for Production of Documents (.1)
03/11/15	MAF	0.70	Call with R. Keach and Canadian lawyers regarding status of settlements
03/11/15	TJM	0.10	Review emails b/w M Fagone and F Caruso re scheduling hearing re Wheeling Motion to Enforce and Trustee Surcharge Motion and respond re same
03/11/15	RND	8.20	Continue drafting memorandum re: limitation of liability under Carmack (World Fuel Litigation)
03/11/15	PM	0.20	Review CP discovery requests and email communications with Tim McKeon and Bob Keach re. responses.

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

03/11/15	PM	0.20	Review various articles received from Bob Keach re. rail car derailments and safety issues.
03/11/15	PM	0.20	Meeting with Tim McKeon to discuss status including Wheeling hearing and CO discovery.
03/12/15	TJM	0.10	TC w/ F Caruso re hearing re Wheeling motion to enforce and Trustee surcharge motion
03/12/15	TJM	0.10	Review list of settling parties re email from Trustee
03/12/15	TJM	0.30	Confer with Trustee re filing motion to amend JPS (0.1) and make necessary edits and revisions re same (0.2)
03/12/15	TJM	0.10	Confer w/A Stewart re status of hearings re Motion to Enforce/Surcharge Motion
03/12/15	MAS	0.90	Review Circuit-level caselaw and draft revisions to preference demand letter to incorporate both "Leathers" case and prevailing caselaw elsewhere, and email same to Sam Anderson with comment.
03/12/15	MAS	0.30	Begin compiling recipient address list for preference demand letters.
03/12/15	ALS	0.20	Docket scheduling regarding hearings re: Motion to Enforce Cash Collateral Orders & Motion for Order Authorizing the Recovery of Expenses (.1); office conference with T. McKeon regarding recently scheduled Hearings re: Motion to Enforce Cash Collateral Orders & Motion for Order Authorizing the Recovery of Expenses (.1)
03/12/15	ALS	0.10	Update deadline to notify court of status of settlement discussions and deadline for Plaintiffs to file written clarification of the scope of the requested amendment in wrongful death cases

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

03/13/15	DSA	0.10	Reviewed e-mails from B. Keach concerning issues with status of settling defendants (.1)
03/13/15	TJM	0.10	Emails w/ A Stewart re depo notice re Wheeling motion to enforce
03/13/15	TJM	0.30	Review and respond to email from counsel for Wheeling re record on First Circuit Appeal (0.1) and research re same (0.2)
03/13/15	TJM	0.70	Finalize third amended JPS re filing
03/15/15	TJM	0.40	Listen to audio from status conference re due date for JPO
03/16/15	TJM	0.10	TC w/ counsel for Wheeling re amended JPO and stipulations re Motion to Enforce/Surcharge Motion
03/16/15	TJM	0.40	Confer with M Fagone re proposed amended pretrial order re hearing on Wheeling Motion to Enforce and Trustee Surcharge Motion and strategy re same
03/16/15	TJM	0.20	Email F Caruso re deposition re Motion to Enforce/Surcharge Motion
03/16/15	TJM	0.60	Review CP responses re jurisdictional discovery demands
03/16/15	TJM	0.30	Review file re Wheeling Motion to Enforce and Trustee Surcharge Motion
03/16/15	PM	0.20	Review third Motion to Amend Joint Pretrial Statement.
03/16/15	PM	0.20	Review memo from Tim McKeon re. identity of settling parties.
03/16/15	PM	0.10	Review ECF notices re. amended pretrial statement/order.
03/16/15	MAS	0.20	Confer with Sam Anderson and email Wheeling preference demand letter, along with comment, for review.
03/16/15	MAF	0.40	Office conference with T McKeon re: Wheeling matters

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

03/17/15	MAF	1.10	Review Rail World settlement agreement; lengthy e-mail to R. Keach and others regarding revisions to same
03/17/15	DSA	2.00	Reviewed and made changes to preference demand letter (.5); began reviewing and making changes to second demand letter and e-mailed parties concerning issues with same (.3); reviewed and made changes to Wheeling demand letter and researched issues with insiders and UFTA claims (1.0); e-mailed B. Keach concerning issues with same (.2)
03/17/15	PM	0.10	Review correspondence from CP's counsel re. jurisdictional discovery.
03/17/15	TJM	0.30	Review proposed stipulations re Wheeling Motion to Enforce/Trustee's Surcharge Motion (0.2) and confer M Fagone re same (0.1)
03/17/15	TJM	0.10	Email counsel for Wheeling re confirming 3/25 depo of F Caruso
03/17/15	TJM	0.10	Email F Caruso re confirming 3/25 depo
03/17/15	TJM	0.10	Confer with K Bigelow re preparing responses to CP jurisdictional discovery demands
03/17/15	TJM	1.30	Review federal and local rules re appendix on appeal to First Circuit (0.9) and TC w/ counsel for Wheeling re same (0.4)
03/17/15	TJM	0.10	Review email from F Caruso re scheduling deposition and respond re same
03/17/15	TJM	0.30	TC w/ counsel for Wheeling re amended scheduling order
03/17/15	TJM	0.10	Email M Fagone re TC w/ counsel for Wheeling re amended scheduling order
03/17/15	TJM	0.10	Email counsel for Wheeling re confirming deposition of F Caruso.
03/17/15	TJM	0.20	TC w/ F Caruso re case status and strategy re deposition

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

03/18/15	TJM	0.10	Review email from Trustee re drafting pleading re naming settling parties and respond re same
03/18/15	TJM	0.10	TC w/ counsel for Wheeling re confirming deposition and stipulation re Motion to Enforce
03/18/15	TJM	0.10	Review CP jurisdictional discovery demands and calculate response date re same
03/18/15	TJM	0.10	Review email from F Caruso re confirmation of deposition and respond re same
03/18/15	TJM	1.30	Draft, edit and revise Trustee report re introducing list of settling parties to US District Court
03/18/15	PM	0.10	Meet with Tim McKeon to discuss CP discovery issues.
03/19/15	TJM	0.20	Review Trustee's edits to Trustee's report on settlement status and accept re same
03/19/15	TJM	0.20	Confer with A Stewart re responding to CP jurisdictional discovery demands
03/19/15	DSA	0.50	Reviewed notice of disclosure of settling defendants and e-mails relating thereto (.3); conference with T. McKeon concerning issues with same (.1); reviewed additional e-mails and changes to list made by MMAC (.1)
03/19/15	ALS	0.20	Docket scheduling Amended Joint Pretrial Order in Wheeling & Lake Erie adversary proceeding
03/19/15	ALS	0.20	Update docket scheduling in World Fuel adversary proceeding (.1); email to T. McKeon re clarification of deadlines in Third Amended Pretrial Statement/Pretrial Order (.1)

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

03/20/15	ALS	2.50	Emails from/to R. Keach regarding preparation for filings in U.S. District Court cases (.2); emails from/to T. McKeon regarding filing of report on settlement status (.3); office conferences with T. McKeon re filing of report on settlement status (.2); preparation for filing of report on settlement status (1.3); filing of report on settlement status in all U.S. District Court cases (.5)
03/20/15	MAS	1.50	Perform preference analysis for Wheeling to reflect "Leathers" case definition of new value, format/redact exhibit to demand letter for Wheeling preferences, and email same to Sam Anderson for review with comment.
03/20/15	MAS	1.10	Final revisions and formatting of Wheeling preference demand letter and email same to George Marcus.
03/20/15	TJM	0.10	Confer wiht M Seidband re application of Leathers re "new value" defense
03/20/15	TJM	0.90	Review responses to jurisdictional discovery demands re CP (0.6) and email P McDonald and Trustee re same (0.3)
03/21/15	TJM	0.10	Email counsel for Wheeling re changing start time of deposition for F Caruso
03/21/15	TJM	1.50	Draft, edit and revise responses to CP discovery demands re jurisdiction
03/21/15	TJM	0.30	Review Wheeling motion to enforce re preparation re Wheeling depo of F Caruso
03/23/15	TJM	0.10	Review letter from CP counsel re Trustee's demand for board minutes
03/23/15	TJM	0.10	Email Wheeling counsel re deposition of F Caruso
03/23/15	TJM	1.80	Draft, edit and revise motion to stay proceedings against Irving

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

03/23/15	TJM	0.10	Confer with Trustee re motion to stay proceedings against Irving
03/23/15	TJM	0.30	TC w/ F Caruso re preparation for deposition
03/23/15	PM	0.20	Email communications with Bob Keach and Tim McKeon re. CP responses to jurisdictional discovery requests.
03/23/15	MAF	0.30	Preparations for Caruso deposition in Wheeling contested matters
03/23/15	DSA	0.40	Telephone conference with F. Caruso concerning issues with deposition for Wheeling (.2); reviewed e-mails and orders entered in case relating to settlements (.2)
03/23/15	ALS	0.10	Docket scheduling relating to Order Amending and Restating Consent Order Staying Proceedings Pending Appeal entered by U.S. District Court for the District of Maine
03/24/15	MAF	0.80	Prepare for Caruso deposition in Wheeling matter (0.7); follow up e-mails to and from D. Johnson regarding same (0.1)
03/24/15	MAS	0.20	Compile information for preference letter "master information" sheet and email to Sam Anderson re: ordinary course of business defense.
03/24/15	MAS	0.50	Review summary and supporting spreadsheets to ensure that analysis of preferences incorporates new value using majority, non "Leathers" standard and email Tim McKeon re: same.
03/24/15	PM	0.60	Review and analyze CP responses to discovery requests.
03/24/15	TJM	0.10	Confer with M Seidband re preference demand letters
03/24/15	TJM	0.20	Update info re preference demand list
03/24/15	TJM	2.50	Motion to stay proceedings against Irving

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

03/24/15	TJM	2.80	Review materials and file to prepare for Wheeling deposition of F Caruso (1.2) and confer w/ M Fagone and F Caruso re same (1.6)
03/25/15	TJM	2.90	Draft, edit and revise responses to CPR's jurisdictional discovery demands
03/25/15	TJM	0.10	Confer with M Seidband re preference demand letters
03/25/15	TJM	2.00	Prepare for F Caruso deposition (0.6) and attend re same (1.4)
03/25/15	MAS	5.40	Perform preference review and analysis, create spreadsheet in preparation for demand letters going out, confer with Tim McKeon re: content of exhibits to preference demand letters, and email to Sam Anderson and Tim McKeon re: preference recipients and demand letters.
03/25/15	MAF	1.30	Prepare for and attend Caruso deposition in Wheeling contested matters
03/25/15	ALS	0.10	Office conference with T. McKeon regarding responses to CP's document request
03/26/15	TJM	1.10	Research re use of interrogatories in jurisdictional discovery
03/26/15	TJM	0.40	Review rules governing appendix re First Circuit (0.3) and review prior citations to appendix at BAP (0.1)
03/26/15	PM	0.20	Review article re. CP subsequent remedial measures and email communications with Bob Keach re. same.
03/27/15	TJM	1.00	TC w/ counsel for Wheeling re contents of appendix
03/27/15	TJM	0.10	Review email from Wheeling counsel re follow up to TC re contents of appendix, and respond re same

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

03/27/15	TJM	0.10	Respond to email from J Geller re electronic copies of responses to jurisdictional discovery demands from CPR
03/27/15	TJM	0.70	Research re application of Rule 7033 to jurisdictional discovery
03/30/15	TJM	0.30	Confer with Trustee re motion to say proceedings re Irving (0.1); Edit and revise re same re comments from Trustee (0.2)
03/30/15	TJM	0.20	Email Trustee, S Anderson and M Fagone re upcoming deadlines re Wheeling Motion to Enforce and Trustee Surcharge Motion
03/30/15	TJM	0.40	Finalize motion to stay proceedings re Irving
03/30/15	TJM	1.20	Draft, edit and revise Trustee's initial disclosures re World Fuel
03/30/15	TJM	1.00	Draft, edit and revise responses to CPR's jurisdictional discovery demands
03/30/15	PM	0.10	Email communications with Bob Keach re applicability of TDGR to CP.
03/30/15	PM	0.10	Phone call with Tim McKeon to discuss responses to CP discovery requests and Rule 26 disclosures to WFS entities.
03/31/15	TJM	1.00	Draft, edit and revise responses to CPR's jurisdictional discovery demands
03/31/15	TJM	0.30	Confer with P McDonald re cases status re responses to CPR's jurisdictional discovery demands (0.2) and A Stewart re same (0.1)
03/31/15	TJM	0.10	Email Fred Caruso re request copy of analysis comparisons re Wheeling Enforcement Motion
03/31/15	TJM	0.30	TC w/ counsel for Wheeling re appendix for First Circuit Appeal (0.1) and confer Trustee re same (0.1) and review rule re same (0.1)
03/31/15	TJM	0.10	Email Trustee and S Anderson re contents of appendix re First Circuit appeal

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

03/31/15	ALS	0.40	Office conference with T. McKeon re filing of Consented to Motion for Order Staying Adversary Proceeding Against Irving Oil Limited in World Fuel adversary proceeding (.1); filing and service of Consented to Motion for Order Staying Adversary Proceeding Against Irving Oil Limited in World Fuel adversary proceeding (.3)
04/01/15	DSA	1.30	Conference with B. Keach and others concerning issues with Wheeling hearing and status of matters in case (.8); telephone conference with G. Marcus concerning issues with demand against Wheeling (.2); conference with M. Seidband concerning issues with same (.2); reviewed e-mails and orders entered in case (.1)
04/01/15	MAF	0.20	Meeting with R. Keach, T. McKeon and S. Anderson regarding Wheeling matters
04/01/15	MAS	0.20	Confer with Sam Anderson re: inquiry from counsel to Wheeling in response to preference demand letter and review related emails.
04/01/15	MAS	0.20	Confer with Tim McKeon re: Wheeling preference demand, retrieve Wheeling preference demand letter and email to Mike Fagone.
04/01/15	KQ	0.60	File via ECF the Motion to Withdraw Attorney for M. Fagone in each of the district court cases
04/01/15	TJM	0.10	Email to Irving counsel re Word version of Plan.
04/01/15	TJM	0.70	Confer w/ P McDonald and Trustee re status of case re CPR and responses to discovery demands
04/01/15	TJM	0.10	TC w/ counsel for Irving re request for Word version of as filed plan
04/01/15	TJM	0.40	Review Court deficiency order re motion to stay re Irving (0.1) and confer A Stewart re same (0.1) and TC w/ Court re same (0.2)

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

04/01/15	TJM	0.30	Review Comparison to Wheeling's Stipulation v MMA's Analysis from F Caruso (0.2) and send same to counsel for Wheeling (0.1)
04/01/15	TJM	0.10	Review email from counsel for Wheeling re stipulation to exhibits and email Trustee re same
04/01/15	TJM	3.60	Draft, edit and revise motion to continue hearing re Wheeling Motion to Enforce and Trustee Surcharge Motion
04/01/15	TJM	0.50	Review and revise responses to CPR's jurisdictional discovery demands
04/01/15	PM	0.10	Review ECH notices re. Chapter 11 plan.
04/01/15	PM	0.10	Review deficiency Order on Motion to Stay.
04/01/15	PM	0.10	Review Order on Motion to Stay.
04/01/15	PM	0.80	Meet with Bob Keach and Tim McKeon to discuss responses to CP discovery and Rule 26(a) disclosures.
04/02/15	PM	2.00	Revise responses to CP discovery.
04/02/15	TJM	0.10	Emails w/ P McDonald re responses to CPR's jurisdictional discovery demands
04/02/15	TJM	3.10	Motion requesting continuance of hearing on Wheeling Motion to Enforce and Trustee Surcharge Motion
04/02/15	TJM	1.40	Review and revise initial disclosures re World Fuel
04/02/15	TJM	0.90	Review and revise responses to jurisdictional discovery demands re CPR
04/02/15	TJM	0.50	Research re applicability of 502(d) to superpriority claims
04/02/15	TJM	0.20	TC w/ P McDonald re objection to CPR jurisdictional discovery (0.1) and research re same re confidentiality/protective order (0.1)
04/02/15	ALS	0.10	Meeting with T. McKeon re draft initial disclosures

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

04/03/15	MAS	1.10	Review documents relevant to Wheeling preference demand, clear documents of internal notes and scan flattened versions of documents (some documents not yet in DMS). Draft email to Sam Anderson and Bob Keach re: documents, with notes about other potential documents.
04/03/15	MAS	0.80	Begin drafting complaint for Wheeling preference actions.
04/03/15	MAF	0.20	Review and revise motion to continue hearing on Wheeling matters
04/03/15	TJM	1.80	Draft, edit and revise motion requesting continuance of Hearing re Wheeling motion to enforce and Trustee surcharge motion
04/03/15	TJM	0.10	Confer with K Bigelow re preparing binder/file re First Circuit appeal
04/03/15	PM	0.50	Finalize responses to CP discovery requests and email with Tim McKeon re. same.
04/03/15	PM	1.50	Revise Initial Disclosures to WFS entities.
04/06/15	PM	0.10	Review ECF Notices re. Motion to Stay.
04/06/15	PM	0.10	Review article from Bob Keach re. push for tougher safety measures.
04/06/15	PM	0.20	Email communications with Tim McKeon re. CP discovery responses.
04/06/15	PM	0.20	Review articles sent from Bob Keach re. ND new stabilization requirements and WFS defending claims.
04/06/15	MAS	1.80	Review TSB report and related documentation re: additional counts to 2011 transaction complaint with counts against directors and officers of MMA and Rail World.
04/06/15	MAS	0.20	Review missing addresses for preference demand letters and email DSI re: addresses.

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

04/06/15	MAS	0.30	Draft additional preference demand letter template for preference recipients who do not have a new value defense.
04/06/15	TJM	0.10	Email F Caruso re transcript from 3/25 deposition for review
04/06/15	TJM	0.10	Confer with M Seidband re Wheeling line of credit re potential action re preferences
04/06/15	TJM	0.20	Confer with S Anderson re preferences
04/06/15	TJM	1.10	Review and finalize rule 26(a) initial disclosures re World Fuel re comments from P McDonald
04/06/15	TJM	1.10	Revise and review motion to continue re comments from M Fagone and S Anderson
04/06/15	TJM	1.90	Review , revise and finalize responses to jurisdictional discovery demands and cover letter re same
04/06/15	TJM	0.10	Confer with S Anderson re motion to continue hearing re Wheeling Motion to Enforce and Trustee Surcharge Motion
04/06/15	MAS	0.20	Confer with Sam Anderson and Tim McKeon re: current preference demand issues, including changes for recipients not providing new value, address issues, etc.
04/06/15	DSA	1.30	Reviewed e-mails concerning issues with stipulations for Wheeling hearing (.1); reviewed and made changes to motion to continue Wheeling hearing (.2); reviewed e-mails and e-mailed parties concerning issues with same (.3); reviewed e-mails and e-mailed parties concerning issues with Wheeling hearing (.2); telephone conference with Court concerning issues with Wheeling hearing and e-mailed parties concerning issues with same (.2); reviewed e-mails and conference with associates concerning issues

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

			with information needed for preference demands (.3)
04/07/15	TJM	0.60	Confer with S Anderson re Wheeling motion to enforce and Trustee surcharge motion re hearing date (0.3); TC w/ G Marcus re same (0.1); TC w/ Court re same (0.1); TC w/ D Johnson re same (0.1)
04/07/15	TJM	0.10	Review email from F Caruso re errata sheet re 3/25/15 deposition
04/07/15	TJM	0.30	Confer with S Anderson and A Stewart re motion to continue hearing and extend deadlines re hearing on Wheeling motion to enforce and Trustee surcharge motion
04/07/15	TJM	0.20	Review Second Amended JPO from counsel for Wheeling re continuing hearing re Wheeling motion to enforce and Trustee surcharge motion (0.2)
04/07/15	TJM	0.70	Review responses to discovery demands re WFS Entities
04/07/15	PM	1.20	Review WFSC discovery responses and email communications with Bob Keach and Tim McKeon re. same.
04/07/15	PM	0.10	Review ECF Notices re. status conference and email communications with Bob Keach and Tim McKeon re. inability to attend.
04/07/15	PM	0.10	Meet with Tim McKeon to discuss WFS discovery responses.
04/08/15	PM	0.10	Email communications with Tim McKeon re. deficiencies in WFS discovery responses.
04/08/15	MAS	3.10	Draft Wheeling preference complaint, including review of relevant documents for background on Wheeling line of credit and related issues.
04/08/15	TJM	2.80	Review responses to discovery demands re WFS Entities and compare re same

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

04/08/15	DSA	0.20	Reviewed and made changes to preference demand letter with no new value defense (.2)
04/08/15	ALS	0.30	Docket scheduling of Second Amended Joint Pretrial Order relating to Wheeling adversary proceeding
04/09/15	TJM	0.90	Draft, edit and revise second amended complaint and motion for leave to file re same
04/09/15	TJM	0.20	Review WFS responses to discovery demands
04/09/15	TJM	1.40	Draft settlement demand letter to SMBC re settlement
04/09/15	TJM	0.10	Email counsel for CPR re "meet and confer" re discovery dispute
04/09/15	TJM	0.20	Emails w/ P McDonald re call w/ counsel for CPR re "meet and confer" re discovery dispute
04/09/15	TJM	0.30	Review appellant brief to 1st Cir re Wheeling
04/09/15	TJM	0.10	Confer with Trustee re amended complaint re SMBC
04/09/15	MAS	0.20	Update and review preference demand letter for recipients without new value defense.
04/10/15	MAS	0.10	Draft email to DSI re: additional documentation for Wheeling loan and related preference payments.
04/10/15	MAS	0.50	Confer with Sam Anderson re: supporting documentation for Wheeling demand (potential litigation) following Sam's discussion with counsel to wheeling.
04/10/15	TJM	0.10	Confer with A Cummings re briefing status re 1st Cir appeal
04/10/15	TJM	0.10	Email counsel for CP re "meet and confer" re discovery dispute
04/10/15	TJM	0.20	Review notice from 1st Cir re deadline to file appellee's brief (0.1) and review rule re same (0.1)
04/10/15	TJM	0.10	Email counsel for WFS Entities re failure to provide non-expert initial disclosures

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

04/10/15	TJM	0.10	TC w/ court re adversary proceeding re World Fuel re notice of amended complaint
04/10/15	TJM	0.40	Review transcript of F Caruso 3/25 deposition
04/10/15	TJM	0.10	Email counsel for CPR re scheduling "meet and confer" re discovery dispute
04/10/15	TJM	1.40	Edit and revise second amended complaint re SMBC
04/10/15	TJM	1.20	Edit and revise motion for leave to file second amended complaint
04/10/15	TJM	0.70	Compile summary of WFS Entities' responses to discovery demands
04/10/15	DSA	0.90	Reviewed e-mails and orders entered in case relating to World Fuels (.1); reviewed documents relating to Wheeling demand letter (.3); conference with M. Siedband concerning issues with UFTA and preference claims against Wheeling (.5)
04/13/15	DSA	0.70	Reviewed e-mails and e-mailed parties concerning issues with documents requested by Wheeling (.2); reviewed FRA loan documents in advance of production to Wheeling (.2); conference with M. Siedband concerning issues with documents requested by Wheeling (.1); reviewed e-mails and e-mailed Wheeling concerning issues with preference demand (.2)
04/13/15	TJM	0.30	Email P McDonald re case status re "meet and confer" meetings with WFS and CPR (0.1) and edit and review summary of WFS discovery responses (0.2)
04/13/15	TJM	0.10	Email counsel for CPR re scheduling "meet and confer" re discovery dispute
04/13/15	TJM	1.60	Draft, edit and revise second amended complaint re Keach v. WFS, et al
04/13/15	TJM	0.20	Edit and revise motion for leave to file second amended complaint

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

04/13/15	MAS	1.50	Review additional documentation provided by DSI for Wheeling preference matter and draft email to Sam Anderson re: same with comments.
04/13/15	MAS	0.30	Review and update revised Wheeling preference analysis by DSI to incorporate "Leathers" analysis of new value, and email same to Sam Anderson with comment.
04/13/15	MAS	0.20	Draft final edits to preference demand template and email to Kara Bigelow re: mail merge for demand letters.
04/13/15	PM	0.20	Emails with Tim McKeon re. deficiencies in WFS and CP discovery responses and scheduling met and confer sessions with each.
04/14/15	MAS	0.50	Final review of documents to produce to counsel to Wheeling and draft email to counsel to Wheeling.
04/14/15	MAS	0.10	Create redacted version of Wheeling preference analysis for transmission to counsel to Wheeling and email to Sam Anderson re: same.
04/14/15	MAS	0.90	Create redacted exhibits for preference demand letters (showing transfers, etc.), create new sub folder for preference materials and email Sam Anderson, Tim McKeon, and Kara Bigelow re: same.
04/14/15	MAS	0.20	Draft email to DSI with list of questions re: solvency related to Wheeling preference complaint, elements of bankruptcy and UFTA counts.
04/14/15	TJM	0.50	Review appellant brief re Wheeling re First Circuit
04/14/15	TJM	1.50	Edit and revise Second Amended Complaint motion papers

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

04/14/15	DSA	1.90	Began reviewing and making changes to the complaint against Wheeling (1.2); conference with M. Siedband concerning issues with complaint (.7)
04/15/15	DSA	1.70	Reviewed e-mails concerning issues with preference demand against Wheeling (.2); telephone conference with DSI concerning issues with plan liquidation and issues with Wheeling preference liability (1.2); conference with B. Keach concerning issues with same (.3)
04/15/15	ALS	1.10	Filing and service of Motion for Leave to File Second Amended Complaint with exhibits and notice of hearing in World Fuel adversary proceeding (1.0); office conferences with T. McKeon re filing of Motion for Leave (.1)
04/15/15	ALS	0.10	Docket scheduling re Motion for Leave to File Second Amended Complaint in World Fuel Adversary Proceeding
04/15/15	TJM	1.20	Review Wheeling appellant brief re first circuit appeal
04/15/15	TJM	0.20	Email counsel for wrongful death claimants re motion for leave to file second amended complaint (0.1) and email counsel for official committee of victims re same (0.1)
04/15/15	TJM	1.40	Finalize for filing motion seeking leave to file second amended complaint re comments from P McDonald re Keach v. World Fuel, et al.
04/15/15	MAS	0.30	Confer with Bob Keach and Sam Anderson re: elements of bankruptcy code and UFTA claims against Wheeling, discussion of showing insolvency at various points in time pre-petition.

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

04/15/15	MAS	0.40	Brief research on issue of ISS system and potential treatment as trust funds in bankruptcy re: Wheeling preference complaint and analysis.
04/15/15	MAS	0.50	Teleconference with Fred Caruso and Sam Anderson re: elements of insolvency for Wheeling preference litigation.
04/15/15	PM	2.00	Review and revise Second Amended Complaint and Motion for Leave to File Second Amended Complaint.
04/15/15	PM	0.10	Phone call with Tim McKeon re. CP discovery issues.
04/16/15	PM	0.10	Meet with Tim McKeon to discuss CP discovery issues and meet and confer.
04/16/15	MAS	0.50	Confer with Bob Keach and Sam Anderson, including teleconference with Fred Caruso re: Wheeling preference and UFTA litigation strategy, including discussion of evidentiary issues.
04/16/15	MAS	3.30	Draft additional revisions to 2011 transaction complaint including breaches of fiduciary duty count for company's safety culture and related factual allegations and email same to Bob Keach with comment.
04/16/15	TJM	0.20	TC w/ local counsel for WFS re rule 26 conference and initial disclosures
04/16/15	TJM	0.30	Confer with M Seidband re preference demand letters
04/16/15	TJM	0.70	Prepare for call w/ counsel for T Thornton re discovery issues (0.3); TC w/ T Thornton (0.3); Email P McDonald and Trustee re same (0.1)

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

04/16/15	DSA	1.20	Reviewed e-mails concerning issues with Wheeling preference complaint (.1); telephone conference with B. Keach and DSI concerning issues with preference analysis for Wheeling (.6); telephone conference with F. Caruso concerning issues with same (.3) ; conference with M. Seidband concerning issues with same (.2)
04/17/15	TJM	0.20	Confer with S Anderson re hearing on Wheeling motion to enforce and Trustee surcharge motion
04/17/15	PM	0.20	Review article re. CP views on safety and cause of derailment.
04/17/15	PM	0.10	Review various ECF notices.
04/17/15	PM	0.10	Email communications with Tim McKeon re. CP discovery issues.
04/17/15	PM	0.10	Email communications with Tim McKeon re. continuance of pretrial conference.
04/20/15	PM	0.20	Review operating report.
04/20/15	MAS	3.90	Conduct research into issue of definition of insider under bankruptcy code and UFTA, and draft memo to Sam Anderson re: same.
04/20/15	TJM	0.50	Draft, edit and revise Seventh Consent Motion to continue the hearing and extend deadlines re Rule 2004 examination motions
04/20/15	TJM	0.30	Confer with Trustee re interplay between sections 502 and 503 re Wheeling
04/20/15	WAH	1.10	Drafting, reviewing, and revising motion to seal settlement agreements.
04/21/15	TJM	0.10	Review email from counsel for Slawson and Devlar re continuing hearing on Rule 2004 motions and respond re same
04/21/15	TJM	0.20	Review settlement agreements b/w Trustee and Slawson and Devlar re impact on Rule 2004 motions
04/21/15	TJM	0.40	Review Wheeling First Circuit Appellant brief

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

04/21/15	TJM	0.40	Confer with M Seidband re appellant brief First Circuit re Wheeling
04/21/15	TJM	0.10	Review Wheeling Appellant brief and confer M Seidband re same
04/21/15	TJM	0.10	Confer with M Seidband re preference demand letters
04/21/15	PM	0.20	Review numerous ECF notices re. various filings.
04/21/15	MAS	4.50	Review Wheeling 1st Circuit appeal brief and provide comments to Tim McKeon re: same (includes discussion with Tim McKeon) (.4)
04/21/15	MAS	0.10	Confer with Tim McKeon re: Wheeling's First Circuit brief and review brief with focus on UCC issues and potential responses.
04/22/15	MAS	0.10	Confer with Tim McKeon re: exhibits for preference demand letters and issue of certain preference recipients being included in settlement agreements elsewhere, and thus not proper recipients of demand letters.
04/22/15	MAS	0.10	Confer with Sam Anderson re: updates to Wheeling preference complaint, open issues with DSI insolvency analysis, and need to review caselaw re: insider status.
04/22/15	MAS	0.70	Review Cox Communications pleadings (brief and amicus briefs) sent by Bob Keach re: measuring time of solvency in context of improper dividend cases.
04/22/15	DSA	0.60	Conference with M Siedband concerning issues with UFTA complaint and Wheeling (.3); reviewed e-mails and e-mailed parties concerning issues with changes to Rail World agreement (.3)
04/22/15	TJM	0.10	Email counsel for Wheeling re errata sheet from F Caruso deposition
04/23/15	TJM	0.10	Email counsel for Wheeling re Caruso errata sheet

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

04/23/15	TJM	0.30	Finalize exhibits re preference demand letters
04/24/15	TJM	0.30	TC w/ S Cope re Slawson Rule 2004
04/24/15	TJM	0.30	Confer with K Quirk and A Stewart re Trustee's 506(c) motion re supporting documents re hearing preparation
04/24/15	TJM	0.10	Email Trustee re continuing hearing re Rule 2004 motions
04/24/15	KQ	0.30	Office conference with T. McKeon regarding 506(c) Motion, next steps and documents needed for support 506(c) motion
04/26/15	TJM	0.10	Email counsel for Slawson and Devlar re staying hearing re 2004 motions
04/26/15	TJM	0.90	Draft, edit and revise motion to stay hearing re Rule 2004 motions re Slawson and Devlar
04/26/15	TJM	0.20	Email P McDonald re question re response to discovery demands
04/27/15	TJM	0.20	Confer with A Stewart re exhibits and supporting documents re Trustee's Surcharge Motion
04/27/15	TJM	1.40	Draft, edit and revise First Circuit appellee brief
04/27/15	TJM	3.30	Confer with S Anderson re case history and strategy (0.6); Review documents re S Anderson request for materials (0.4); Confer A Stewart re supporting materials re Surcharge Motion (0.3); Confer K Quirk re supporting materials re Surcharge Motion (0.1); Confer Trustee and S Anderson re case status and strategy (.9); Draft, edit and revise exhibit/witness list (.9); TC F Caruso re 506(c) motion (0.1)
			Motion to enforce
04/27/15	TJM	0.50	Finalize preference demand letters
04/27/15	TJM	0.10	Confer with Trustee re second amended complaint

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

04/27/15	TJM	0.50	Finalize motion to stay hearing re 2004 motions re Devlar/Slawson
04/27/15	TJM	0.10	Confer with A Cummings re preparation for status conference w/ Court
04/27/15	TJM	0.10	Email A Stewart re filing amended consented-to order re motion for leave to file second amended complaint
04/27/15	TJM	0.30	Confer with S Anderson re preparation for hearing re Wheeling Motion to Enforce
04/27/15	TJM	0.10	Confer with S Anderson re preference demand letters
04/27/15	PM	0.10	Email communication with Tim McKeon re. document production to CP.
04/27/15	PM	0.10	Review Motion to Stay Rule 2004 Exams of Slawson and Devlar.
04/27/15	MAS	2.30	Draft revisions to Wheeling UFTA complaint based on discussions with Sam Anderson.
04/27/15	KQ	0.30	Finalize and file the consent motion to stay the hearings on the Rule 2004 examinations of Slawson and Devlar.
04/27/15	KQ	0.20	Prepare and send e-mail service of the consent motion to stay the hearings on the Rule 2004 examinations of Slawson and Devlar
04/27/15	KQ	0.40	Draft and file the Certificate of Service related to the consent motion to stay the hearings on the Rule 2004 examinations of Slawson and Devlar
04/27/15	KQ	0.20	Office conference with A. Stewart regarding preparation for hearing on the 506(c) motion
04/27/15	KQ	2.10	Assist T. McKeon with preparation for upcoming hearing on 506(c) hearing

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

04/27/15	DSA	3.30	Reviewed e-mails and comments to Burkhardt affidavit made by A. Addesky (.2); reviewed e-mails on Rail World release provisions (.2); reviewed and made changes to preference demand letters (.4); conference with T. McKeon concerning issues with changes to preference letter (.1); conference with B. Keach and T. McKeon concerning issues with Wheeling matters (.9); reviewed Wheeling motion and surcharge motion and began reviewing transcripts in relation to Wheeling motion (1.5)
04/27/15	MAS	0.50	Final preparation of preference demand letters and exhibits with Tim McKeon and Kara Bigelow.
04/27/15	DSA	0.20	Conference with T. McKeon concerning issues with Wheeling cash collateral hearing (.2)
04/28/15	DSA	4.10	Reviewed e-mails and e-mailed parties concerning issues with access to settlement agreements for the committee (.2); travel to and from and attended status conferences on MMA proceedings (1.3); telephone conference with D. Johnson concerning issues with Wheeling hearing (.2); telephone conference with D. Johnson concerning issues with hearings on cash collateral and surcharge (.3); reviewed e-mails and e-mailed parties concerning issues with disclosure of settlement agreements (.2); continued reviewing materials and drafting witness outlines for Wheeling hearing (1.9)
04/28/15	KQ	0.20	Obtain and forward to T. McKeon the Trustee's and BSSN's invoices used as exhibits in the first interim fee application in preparation of the upcoming 506(c) hearing.

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

04/28/15	KQ	0.60	Draft Suggestion of Bankruptcy in Keach v. Red Shield and prepare Exh. A to same.
04/28/15	KQ	0.10	E-mail to T. McKeon regarding Suggestion of Bankruptcy in Keach v. Red Shield
04/28/15	KQ	0.30	Obtain copies of Involuntary Petition and Schedules for Red Shield bankruptcy for T. McKeon
04/28/15	PM	0.10	Review ECH notices re. status conference.
04/28/15	TJM	1.70	Review Appellant's opening brief re First Circuit
04/28/15	TJM	1.90	Attend status conference at court
04/28/15	TJM	0.10	TC w/ local counsel for SMBC re consent to motion for leave to file amended complaint
04/28/15	TJM	0.20	Prepare for status conference
04/29/15	TJM	7.20	Review filings from BAP re Wheeling appeal of Travelers Order (2.3); Research cases cited by Wheeling re Appellant Brief (1.6); Draft, edit and revise Appellee Brief (1.4); Review Appellant Brief re First Circuit Appeal re Travelers Brief (1.9)
04/29/15	TJM	0.10	Review stipulations from S Anderson re Wheeling Motion to Enforce (0.1)
04/29/15	DSA	3.20	Telephone conference with F. Caruso concerning issues with Wheeling hearing (.4); e-mailed parties concerning issues with Wheeling stipulation (.3); telephone conference with D. Johnson concerning issues with stipulation for cash collateral hearing (.2); telephone conference with D. Johnson concerning issues with amended scheduling order (.2); status conference with Court concerning issues with same (.5); reviewed and made changes to Wheeling scheduling order after call with Court (.5); telephone conference with F. Caruso concerning issues with status of Wheeling

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

			hearing (.2) ; reviewed and made additional changes to Wheeling pretrial and e-mailed parties concerning issues with same (.9)
04/30/15	KQ	0.10	Telephone call with K. Ford at the USBC - Bangor regarding process for expediting hearing transcripts.
04/30/15	KQ	0.30	E-mail from and to B. Keach regarding transcription of 3.19.14 hearing and arrange for same.
04/30/15	TJM	4.10	Draft, edit and revise First Circuit appellee brief
04/30/15	TJM	0.20	Confer with A Cummings re First Circuit Brief
05/01/15	TJM	0.10	Confer with Trustee re preference demand letter re Flex Leasing
05/01/15	TJM	6.70	Draft, edit and revise first circuit appellee brief
05/01/15	KQ	0.10	E-mail to R. Keach regarding transcription of 3.10.14 emergency hearing
05/01/15	DSA	0.60	Reviewed and made changes to Wheeling pretrial (.4); reviewed e-mails and orders entered in case (.2)
05/03/15	TJM	8.30	Draft, edit and revise appellee brief re First Circuit re Wheeling appeal of Travelers Order
05/04/15	TJM	5.40	TC w/ A Cummings re First Circuit brief (0.1); Revise First Circuit brief re citations to Appendix (1.8); Review cases cited by Wheeling (2.1); Review and prepare documents re finalizing brief for filing (1.4)
05/04/15	TJM	0.10	Email local counsel for SMBC re entering consent to motion for leave to file second amended complaint on docket
05/04/15	RND	0.10	Email correspondence with R. Keach re: brief on Wheeling's Motion to Enforce CC

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

05/04/15	RND	2.10	Review wheeling motion to enforce cash collateral orders (brief on Wheeling CC Motion)
05/04/15	RND	0.50	Begin reviewing transcript of 3/13/14 hearing on 45G decision (brief on Wheeling CC Motion)
05/04/15	RND	3.60	Review initial motions, responses, and supplemental memoranda re: Wheeling's CC Motion (brief on Wheeling's CC Motion)
05/04/15	MAS	0.50	Confer with Sam Anderson re: Wheeling UFTA complaint (includes teleconference with Fred Caruso re: insolvency analysis).
05/04/15	DSA	1.70	Reviewed and made changes to UFTA complaint against Wheeling (1.2); conference with M. Siedband concerning issues with changes to same (.5)
05/05/15	DSA	1.30	Continued reviewing transcripts and papers relating to motion to enforce in relation to briefing issues under the Wheeling motion to enforce (1.0); conference with R. Desai concerning issues with drafting brief relating to Wheeling's motion to enforce cash collateral (.3)
05/05/15	RND	1.80	Review and analyze 3/13/14 hearing on 45G motion and how it affects Wheeling's CC Motion (brief on Wheeling CC Motion)
05/05/15	RND	1.80	Review and analyze Wheeling's arguments in CC Motion and Supplemental Briefing
05/05/15	RND	3.70	Research and Review case law re: effect of 502(d) on allowance of admin claims
05/05/15	RND	0.10	Email correspondence with R. Keach re: brief on Wheeling's motion to enforce CC Orders
05/05/15	TJM	0.10	Email F Caruso re update re hearing on Wheeling motion to enforce and Trustee's Surcharge Motion

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

05/05/15	TJM	0.60	Draft, edit, revise and finalize suggestion of bankruptcy re Red Shield re adversary proceeding
05/05/15	TJM	0.30	Confer with R Desai re collateral estoppel motion re ruling on "Canadian Receivables"
05/05/15	TJM	1.50	Confer w/ A Cummings re finalizing First Circuit brief re filing (0.4); Review edits to First Circuit brief re Trustee (0.4): Legal research re request by Trustee for specific cases cited by Wheeling in brief (0.3); TC w/ Trustee re First Circuit brief (0.4)
05/06/15	TJM	4.20	Confer w/ A Cummings re First Circuit appellee brief re Wheeling appeal of Travelers Order (0.4); Edit and revise brief (3.8);
05/06/15	RND	3.80	Review motion to amend or strike findings of fact re: 45g Order and begin reviewing/analyzing 5/8/14 hearing transcript re: decision on same
05/06/15	RND	2.60	Review initial filings, responses, and supplemental memoranda re: Trustee's 45G Motion (brief on Wheeling CC Motion)
05/06/15	MAS	1.80	Draft revisions to Wheeling complaint.
05/06/15	DSA	0.10	Reviewed e-mails concerning the status of the surcharge motion against Wheeling (.1)
05/07/15	DSA	0.80	Reviewed and made changes to Wheeling complaint after further revisions from M. Siedband (.6); reviewed UFTA provision in relation to Wheeling complaint (.2)
05/07/15	MAS	0.80	Review voicemail from Paul Stewart representing Newgistics (preference recipient), review Newgistics payment schedule and draft email to Bob Keach re: same.

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

05/07/15	RND	8.30	Review/revise Trustee's First Circuit Brief re: Wheeling's interest in Travelers' settlement proceeds
05/07/15	TJM	9.20	Edit, revise, review and finalize First Circuit brief
05/08/15	TJM	0.30	Review response from GH Berlin re preference demand letter (0.1) and review file re same re confirming information in response (0.1) and email DSI re response and questions re response letter (0.1)
05/08/15	TJM	1.10	Edit and revise CP motion to extend time to respond to Amended Complaint (0.6) and confer Trustee re same (0.2); Exchange emails with counsel for CP (0.2) and local counsel for CP (0.1)
05/08/15	RND	3.40	Review and analyze 1/23/14 hearing on Trustee's 45G Motion and 5/8/14 hearing on Motion to Amend findings on 45g Motion (brief on Wheeling's CC Motion)
05/08/15	DSA	0.30	Reviewed motion to lift stay of proceedings filed by wrongful death claimants (.2); reviewed e-mails and e-mailed Sidley concerning issues with CP letter (.1)
05/11/15	RND	6.30	Continue reviewing and analyzing hearing transcripts on 45G Motion and briefing on cash collateral (brief on Wheeling's motion to enforce Cash Collateral)
05/11/15	RND	0.20	Meeting with R. Keach re: drafting brief in opposition to Wheeling's Motion to Enforce CC
05/11/15	TJM	0.60	Confer with M Seidband re preference demand responses (0.1) and create document to track responses and objections (0.5)
05/11/15	TJM	0.20	Review email and listen to vm from counsel for Andersons re preference demand letter (0.1) and respond re same (0.1)

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

05/11/15	TJM	0.10	Review email from counsel for CP re hearing on motion to file under seal, and respond re same (0.1)
05/11/15	TJM	0.30	Review, edit and revise amended NOH re motion to file under seal
05/11/15	PM	0.10	Review various ECF notices re. motion to seal and scheduling CP responsive pleading.
05/12/15	MAS	0.70	Review response letter from creditor Newgistics re: preference demand, review attached documentation, email Bob Keach re: same and draft response to creditor requesting additional information.
05/12/15	MAS	0.60	Review correspondence from creditor MSC Industrial re: preference demand, including supporting documentation (includes analysis of accounting provided by preference recipient).
05/12/15	MAS	0.30	Draft email to Fred Caruso and Matt Farnsworth re: MSC Industrial's response to preference demand.
05/12/15	TJM	0.20	Confer with M Seidband re strategy re replies to responses to preference demand letters
05/12/15	TJM	0.50	Review response to preference demand letter from GH Berlin (0.2) and review file and research re response to arguments made therein (0.3)
05/12/15	RND	6.80	Analyze and outline arguments for brief re: Wheeling's motion to enforce CC Orders
05/12/15	DSA	0.50	Conference with R. Desai concerning issues with Wheeling briefing on receivables (.5)
05/13/15	DSA	0.50	Reviewed e-mails concerning issues with settlement of tie litigation (.1); reviewed sale documents in relation to rights to proceeds of litigation and e-mailed B. Keach concerning issues with settlement of tie

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

			litigation (.2); reviewed e-mails and documents relating to Berlin preference demand (.2)
05/13/15	RND	5.40	Review case law re: collateral estoppel and dicta (brief in opposition to Wheeling's motion to enforce CC)
05/14/15	RND	7.10	Review and analyze testimony re: receivables and arguments made at 1/23/14 hearing re: 45G Motion
05/15/15	RND	7.80	Draft brief in opposition to Wheeling's motion to enforce CC
05/17/15	RND	3.40	Draft brief in support of Trustee's objection to Wheeling's Motion to Enforce CC Orders
05/18/15	RND	8.80	Continue drafting brief in support of Trustee's objection to Wheeling's Motion to Enforce CC Orders
05/18/15	RND	0.80	Research re: applicable statute of limitations under Carmack Amendment (World Fuel Litigation)
05/18/15	RND	0.30	Emails with R. Keach re: applicable statutes of limitation under Carmack Amendment and
05/18/15	TJM	0.50	Review letter from GH Berlin re response to preference demand letter and related research (0.3); TC w/ CFO from GH Berlin re same (0.2)
05/18/15	TJM	0.80	Prepare and finalize acceptance of service re Second Amended Complaint re SMBC (0.2); Confer A Stewart re same (0.1) and email to SMBC re same (0.1); Confer K Bigelow re service of summons and complaint (0.2); Draft cover letter to counsel for SMBC (0.2)

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

05/18/15	ALS	0.20	Review Court's Order Granting Unopposed Motion for Leave to File Second Amended Complaint entered in the World Fuel Services adversary proceeding (.1); office conference with T. McKeon re preparation of summons in light of Order Granting Unopposed Motion for Leave to File Second Amended Complaint (.1)
05/18/15	DSA	0.30	Reviewed e-mails and e-mailed counsel concerning issues with amended complaint hearing (.1); telephone conference with co-counsel concerning issues with settlement of trestle litigation (.2)
05/18/15	KQ	0.40	Prepare Adversary Cover Sheet for the Second Amended Complaint to be filed in Keach v. World Fuel, et al.
05/18/15	KQ	0.20	Finalize and file the Second Amended Complaint in Keach v. World Fuel, et al.
05/19/15	DSA	0.30	Reviewed orders and amended complaint relating to World Fuels litigation (.3)
05/19/15	RND	4.00	Continue drafting brief in support of Trustee's objection to Wheeling's Motion to Enforce CC Orders
05/19/15	RND	0.10	Email correspondence with R. Keach re: Trustee's brief in support of Objection to Wheeling's Motion to Enforce CC Orders
05/19/15	PM	0.20	Review ECF Notices re. motion to expedite hearing on motion to employ agent, amended complaint, motion to approve disclosure statement.
05/21/15	DSA	0.40	Reviewed e-mails and e-mailed parties concerning issues with Wheeling discovery requests (.2); telephone conference with Wheeling concerning issues with settlement agreements (.2)

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

05/22/15	LKZ	0.10	Confer w/B. Keach re: research on proportionate judgment reduction (.1).
05/22/15	MAS	0.40	Review letter from preference recipient re: Fred's Plumbing and Heating, update preference response spreadsheet and email Kara Bigelow for filing.
05/26/15	MAS	0.30	Review letter from counsel to First Union Rail (preference recipient) and email Sam Anderson re: same.
05/26/15	MAS	1.50	Review preference complaint against Wheeling, draft revisions based on trustee's notes, and email trustee re: same.
05/26/15	MAS	0.10	Email counsel to First Union Rail re: deadline to respond to preference complaint.
05/26/15	MAS	0.80	Final review and proofing of preference complaint against Wheeling and assistance with drafting adversary cover sheet.
05/26/15	MAS	0.20	Review email from counsel to Summit Rail Products (preference recipient), update spreadsheet re: responses, and respond to email re: deadline to respond to demand letter.
05/26/15	RND	2.70	Review and revise initial brief in support of Trustee's objection to Wheeling's Motion to Enforce CC Orders
05/26/15	RND	0.30	Prepare and finalize exhibits to Trustee's brief in support of objection to Wheeling's Motion to Enforce CC Orders
05/26/15	LKZ	3.70	Review pleadings related to consent order staying wrongful death actions (.7); confer w/B. Keach re: same (.7); begin draft of response to Committee's motion to delay termination of stay (1.9); confer w/B. Keach re: same (.4).

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

05/26/15	DSA	0.30	Reviewed e-mails and e-mailed parties concerning issues with Wheeling discovery (.2) reviewed changes to Wheeling UFTA complaint (.1)
05/26/15	KQ	0.40	Prepare Adversary Proceeding Cover Sheet in preparation for filing the Complaint upon Wheeling
05/26/15	KQ	0.30	Finalize and file the Complaint against Wheeling
05/26/15	ALS	1.00	Office conference with R. Desai re filing of Trustee's Brief (.2); review Trustee's Brief and exhibits in advance of filing (.2); review Wheeling adversary docket (.1); filing of Brief in Wheeling adversary proceeding (.2); preparation of Certificate of Service re Trustee's Brief (.2); filing of Certificate of Service with respect to Trustee's Brief (.1)
05/26/15	ALS	0.40	Emails to/from M. Thibodeau re Committee's Motion to Stay filed in USDC (.2); email to R. Keach and S. Anderson re Committee's Motion to Stay (.1); docket scheduling re response deadlines to Committee's Motion to Stay (.1)
05/27/15	ALS	0.30	Assist with filing of adversary proceeding against Wheeling
05/27/15	KQ	0.20	Draft letter to G. Marcus forwarding summons and complaint in Keach v. Wheeling and forward same to G. Marcus
05/27/15	KQ	0.30	Prepare and file via ECF the Certificate of Service of the summons and complaint served upon G. Marcus on behalf of Wheeling

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

05/27/15	DSA	1.70	Reviewed brief filed by Wheeling on issues with Canadian receivables (.4); reviewed Trustee's brief relating to same (.3); conference with parties concerning issues with status of responses to preference demands (.5); telephone conference with F. Caruso concerning issues with claims under Canadian plan and issues with Wheeling complaint (.3); reviewed documents and e-mails relating to Wheeling complaint (.2)
05/27/15	LKZ	2.60	Revise response to Committee motion to reimpose Wrongful Death Stay.
05/27/15	TJM	0.50	Review reply brief filed by Wheeling re First Circuit appeal
05/27/15	TJM	0.30	Confer with M Seidband re status of preference actions
05/27/15	MAS	0.50	Follow-up issues from filing of Wheeling preference complaint, including acceptance of service, and creation of litigation file.
05/27/15	MAS	0.10	Draft email to George Marcus re: Wheeling complaint, including copy of complaint and summons.
05/27/15	MAS	0.10	Exchange emails with George Marcus re: Wheeling preference complaint, acceptance of service.
05/27/15	PM	0.20	Review adversary complaint against Wheeling.
05/27/15	TJM	1.00	Review responses to preference demand letters (0.5) and meet w/ S Anderson and M Seidband re same (0.5)
05/28/15	TJM	2.40	Update and review preference response materials and list (0.4); Review and analyze response from Fred's Plumbing (0.7); Review and analyze response from Farrell, Rosenblatt & Russell (0.3); Review and analyze response from GH Berlin (0.3); Research re ordinary course of business defense to preference

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

			action (0.7)
05/28/15	MAS	0.20	Exchange emails with Karla Quirk re: acceptance of service and review acceptance of service.
05/28/15	DSA	0.20	Reviewed e-mails concerning issues motion to lift the stay of wrongful death claims (.1); telephone conference with Wheeling concerning issues with documents in UFTA complaint (.1)
05/28/15	KQ	3.40	Prepare documents in preparation for upcoming oral argument re: CP's motion to withdraw reference
05/28/15	KQ	0.10	E-mail to G. Marcus regarding execution of the Acceptance of Service of the summons and complaint regarding Wheeling.
05/28/15	KQ	0.10	E-mails from and to M. Siedband regarding need for Acceptance of Service of the summons and complaint regarding Wheeling
05/28/15	KQ	0.40	Draft Acceptance of Service related to the summons and complaint served upon G. Marcus on behalf of Wheeling
05/28/15	ALS	4.20	Organization of cases cited in CP's Motion to Withdraw Reference
05/29/15	ALS	0.20	Obtain pleadings related to Wheeling's Motion to Intervene for R. Keach
05/29/15	ALS	2.30	Continue preparation for oral argument with respect to CP's Motion to Withdraw the Reference
05/29/15	KQ	0.80	Continued preparation of documents in preparation of upcoming oral argument regarding CP's Motion to withdraw reference
05/29/15	DSA	0.10	Telephone conference with Wheeling concerning issues with UFTA complaint (.1)
05/29/15	LKZ	1.70	Revise response to Stay Reimposition Motion (1.0); confer w/B. Keach re: same (1.0); review letter re: World Fuel Settlement (.2).

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

05/29/15	MAS	0.30	Review correspondence from counsel to Dead River Company re: preference demand, update preference spreadsheet.
05/29/15	RND	0.30	Review correspondence with potential settling parties
05/29/15	TJM	0.80	Review motion papers re judicial estoppel re motion to enforce
05/29/15	TJM	0.20	Confer with M Seidband re preference demands (0.2)
05/30/15	LKZ	0.20	Review email from B. Keach re: SMBC settlement (.1); respond to same (.1).
05/30/15	DSA	0.10	Reviewed settlement proposal relating to World Fuels and e-mails relating thereto (.1)
06/01/15	KQ	0.20	Revise the Trustee's response to Notice of Stay Termination and Motion to Reinstate to include Certificate of Service
06/01/15	KQ	2.10	Finalize and file via ECF the Trustee's response to notice of stay termination and motion to reinstate in each of the district court cases
06/01/15	KQ	0.10	Telephone call to the court regarding filing of the Trustee's response to notice of stay termination and motion to reinstate
06/01/15	LKZ	6.60	Confer w/B.Keach re: response to Committee motion to reimpose stay (.1) and revise same (.8); review local rules for same (.5); confer w/A.Stewart re: filing and service of same (.2); review pro hac vice motion (.1); review ancillary case dockets (.3) and confer w/K.Quirk re: filing response on same (.1); review forms of settlement agreement (.4); draft SMBC settlement agreement (2.8); confer w/B.Keach re: same (.3) and revise accordingly (.9); draft email to SMBC counsel re: same (.1).

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

06/01/15	ALS	0.70	Assist with filing of Trustee's response to motion to stay, including multiple office conferences with K. Quirk and L. Zahradka
06/01/15	ALS	3.90	Assist M. Siedband with obtaining service related information for defendants named in 2011 transaction complaint
06/01/15	TJM	0.60	Review brief filed by Wheeling re collateral estoppel re motion to enforce
06/01/15	RND	0.30	Email to R. Keach re: Shubert decision discussing bankruptcy court jurisdiction over party filing proof of claim
06/01/15	RND	3.60	Review and analyze Wheeling initial brief in support of Motion to Enforce CC Order; Review case law cited therein and outline potential counter arguments; email same to R. Keach
06/01/15	RND	1.60	Research case law re: recent decisions regarding mandatory and permissive withdrawal of the reference under 157(d)
06/01/15	RND	2.30	Attend oral argument regarding Canadian Pacific's Motion to Withdraw the Reference and the Trustee's Objection to same (World Fuel Litigation)
06/01/15	RND	0.30	Meet with Rachael Becker re: research as to whether an order granting/denying a motion to withdraw the reference is immediately appealable (World Fuel Litigation)
06/01/15	TJM	0.40	Confer with R Desai re hearing on CPR's motion to withdraw the reference
06/01/15	MAS	0.40	Confer with Bob Keach and draft email to Patrick Maxcy re: noteholder entities (2011 transaction complaint).
06/01/15	MAS	0.20	Conference with Angela Stewart on public records searches for noteholder information (address, incorporation, etc.).

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

06/01/15	MAS	2.50	Draft further revisions to 2011 transaction complaint, proofing of draft, and email to Bob Keach with comment.
06/01/15	MAS	0.10	Phone call with Patrick Maxcy re: noteholder and board member contact information.
06/01/15	MAS	0.10	Review and exchange emails with counsel to New Brunswick RR re: preference demand letter.
06/01/15	RB1	1.20	Research for Bob Keach re: motion to withdraw reference.
06/02/15	RB1	5.60	Research for Bob Keach re: motion to withdraw the reference
06/02/15	MAS	0.20	Review defendant information from Angela Stewart re: 2011 transaction complaint and email Bob re: same.
06/02/15	MAS	0.40	Draft additional revisions to 2011 transaction complaint, and email same to Bob Keach for transmission.
06/02/15	TJM	0.50	Review email from CP's counsel re question re document production (0.1) and draft response re same (0.4)
06/02/15	TJM	0.20	Confer R Desai re reply motion to motion re collateral estoppel re Wheeling motion to enforce
06/02/15	ALS	0.10	Email to R. Keach and L. Zahradka attaching Plaintiffs' Response to Motion to Stay Order
06/02/15	ALS	1.30	Assist M. Siedband with obtaining service related information for defendants named in 2011 transaction complaint (1.0); office conferences with M. Siedband re service upon defendants and status of adversary complaint (.3)
06/02/15	LKZ	1.30	Review WD Plaintiffs' Response to Committee's motion to reimpose stay (.7); begin research re: proportionate judgment reduction issues (.6).

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

06/02/15	KQ	0.60	Prepare Adversary Proceeding Cover Sheet for the transaction complaint
06/02/15	KQ	0.10	E-mails from and to L. Zahradka regarding admission pro hac vice in the Maine district court cases
06/02/15	DSA	0.30	Reviewed response to motion to continue stay of wrongful death claims (.3)
06/03/15	DSA	0.70	Reviewed e-mails concerning issues with Wheeling deposition notice (.2); conference with T. McKeon concerning issues with Wheeling deposition notice (.3); reviewed e-mails concerning issues with Wheeling discovery hearing (.2)
06/03/15	LKZ	0.70	Call w/S.Dumnow re: SMBC settlement (.3); confer w/B.Keach re: same (.4).
06/03/15	TJM	0.10	Respond to email from CP's counsel re production of documents re request for documents re jurisdictional discovery
06/03/15	TJM	3.10	Research re support for motion for protective order re Wheeling's 30(b)(6) notice (2.3); Review emails between counsel for Wheeling and S Anderson and the Trustee re 30(b)(6) notice (0.2); Draft, edit and revise motion for protective order (0.6)
06/03/15	TJM	0.30	Confer with S Anderson re response to Wheeling 30(b)(6) notice to Trustee
06/03/15	MAS	0.60	Review documents to produce to Wheeling re: UFTA complaint, and email Angela Stewart re: missing documents.
06/03/15	PM	0.20	Email communications with Tim McKeon re. response to CP document requests.
06/03/15	PM	0.10	Email communications with Tim McKeon re. responses to CP discovery.
06/03/15	RB1	2.10	Draft Memo for Bob Keach re: appealability of motion to withdraw the reference.

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

06/03/15	RND	0.20	Meeting with R. Keach re: reply to Wheeling's brief in support of Motion to Enforce CC Orders
06/03/15	RND	0.30	Meeting with R. Keach and R. Becker re: ability to immediately appeal order denying/granting motion to withdraw the reference (World Fuel Litigation)
06/04/15	RND	0.20	Prepare for call with A. Adessky and R. Clement re: chapter 15 filing
06/04/15	RB1	3.70	Research for Tim McKeon re: discovery of contested matters
06/04/15	PM	0.10	Review Motions to Compel and Motion to Expedite Hearing filed by Wheeling.
06/04/15	PM	0.10	Review Motion to Disband Victim's Committee.
06/04/15	MAS	0.50	Review additional documents from Angela Stewart re: Wheeling UFTA complaint and email Sam Anderson re: same.
06/04/15	TJM	0.10	Confer with Trustee re opposition to Wheeling opposition to motion to seal and motion to expedite
06/04/15	TJM	7.70	Review Wheeling's opposition to motion to seal and motion to expedite (0.4); Confer with summer associate re research re creation of contested matters (0.3); Confer with S Anderson re same (0.2); Research, draft, edit and revise motion in opposition to motion for expedited hearing (6.8)
06/04/15	DSA	0.60	Reviewed e-mails concerning issues with Wheeling discovery motions (.2); conference with T. McKeon concerning issues with Wheeling discovery motion (.2); reviewed motion to compel discovery file by Wheeling (.2)

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

06/04/15	ALS	0.10	Email to R. Keach and S. Anderson re Committee's Omnibus Reply to Objections to Motion to Reimpose Stay
06/05/15	KQ	0.20	File via ECF the Acceptance of Service on behalf of Wheeling related to the summons and complaint in Keach v. Wheeling
06/05/15	TJM	8.00	Confer with A Stewart re objection to motion to compel and motion for expedited hearing (0.1); Draft, edit and revise motion in opposition to motion for expedited hearing (2.1); Research re opposition to motion to compel (1.8); Draft, edit and revise motion in opposition to Wheeling Motion to Compel (4.0)
06/05/15	MAS	1.50	Prepare documents for production to Wheeling re: UFTA complaint.
06/05/15	RND	2.50	Research re: law of the case doctrine and begin drafting reply to wheeling brief re: cc enforcement motion
06/07/15	RND	2.50	Continue drafting reply to Wheeling's brief in support of Motion to Enforce CC Orders
06/07/15	RND	0.10	Email with R. Keach re: draft of reply to Wheeling's brief in support of Motion to Enforce CC Orders
06/07/15	TJM	3.20	Edit and revise motion in opposition to Wheeling motion to compel and expedited hearing
06/07/15	LKZ	0.20	Emails w/B.Keach, S.Gummow re: SMBC settlement agmt status.
06/08/15	LKZ	1.90	Review SMBC markup of settlement agmt (.4); emails w/B.Keach re: same (.2); review further markup of SMBC settlement agmt (.4); emails w/B.Keach re: same (.2); revise agmt accordingly (.7).

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

06/08/15	DSA	3.60	Conference with T. McKeon concerning issues with objection to Wheeling motion to compel (.4); reviewed motion to seal in relation to Wheeling motion to compel (.2); reviewed motion to compel and motion to expedite same (.2); reviewed and made changes to opposition to motion for expedited hearing filed by Wheeling (.7); conference with T. McKeon concerning issues with changes to same (.3); reviewed and made changes to objection to motion to compel (.4); conference with T. McKeon concerning issues with same (.3); conference with R. Desai concerning issues with reply to Wheeling briefing on 45G credits (.2); reviewed and made changes to reply to Wheeling 45G preclusive effects briefing (.6); conference with R. Desai concerning issues with same (.3)
06/08/15	TJM	4.50	Confer with S Anderson re responses/objections (0.4); Edit, revise and finalize objections to Wheeling motion for expedited hearing and motion to compel (4.1)
06/08/15	RND	0.10	Email correspondence with R. Keach re: reply to Wheeling's Brief in support of Motion to Enforce CC Orders
06/08/15	RND	0.50	Meeting with S. Anderson re: Trustee's reply to wheeling brief in support of motion to enforce CC Order (.2); revise reply based on comments from S. Anderson (.3)
06/09/15	RND	0.10	Email correspondence with A. Stewart re: filing of Reply to Wheeling's Brief in Support of Motion to Enforce CC Orders
06/09/15	PM	0.20	Review Objection to Wheeling's Motion to Compel.
06/09/15	PM	0.20	Review Notice of Filing Plan Supplement.

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

06/09/15	PM	0.20	Review decision on CP Motion to Withdraw reference.
06/09/15	MAS	0.50	Review response to demand letter from Summit Railroad Prods and draft brief response thereto (re: preference demand).
06/09/15	TJM	2.70	Prepare for hearing on Wheeling's motion to compel and motion for expedited hearing
06/09/15	DSA	0.40	Reviewed opinion of the District Court in relation to the motion to withdraw the reference (.3); reviewed e-mails and telephone conference with T. McKeon concerning issues with Wheeling briefing for the First Circuit (.1)
06/09/15	ALS	0.50	Telephone conferences and email from R. Keach re transmittal of email to counsel for Settling Defendants re litigation status (.2); preparation of email to counsel for Settling Defendants, including confirmation of service parties re litigation status (.3)
06/10/15	DSA	3.20	Reviewed Wheeling reply brief on Canadian receivables (.4); conference with T. McKeon concerning issues with Wheeling motion to compel and motion to expedite (.5); reviewed materials in advance of motion to compel hearing (.3); travel to and from and attended hearing on Wheeling motion to compel (1.5); reviewed e-mails and e-mailed parties concerning issues with same (.3); telephone conference with T. Trask concerning issues with trestle litigation (.1); reviewed e-mails and e-mailed B. Keach concerning issues with same (.1)
06/10/15	TJM	1.40	Draft, edit and revise motion to stay adversary proceeding as against WFS Entities and SMBC

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

06/10/15	TJM	4.30	Prepare for hearing re Wheeling's motion to compel and motion for expedited hearing (1.7) and confer S Anderson re same (0.5); Attend hearing on Motion for Expedited Hearing (1.6) and confer S Anderson re same (0.5)
06/10/15	RB1	2.00	Review motion to compel and attend hearing.
06/10/15	RND	0.20	Email correspondence with R. Keach and R. Clement re: chapter 15 filings
06/11/15	PM	0.10	Review ECF Notices: continuation of hearing on Wheeling Motion to Compel.
06/11/15	PM	0.20	Review draft motion to stay adversary proceeding against WFS entities and SMBC.
06/11/15	PM	0.20	Review article sent from Bob Keach re. settlement and CPR position and email communications with Bob re. same.
06/11/15	PM	0.20	Review U.S. Trustee's Opposition to Motion to Seal Settlement Agreement Amounts.
06/11/15	PM	0.10	Review press article on settlement status.
06/11/15	TJM	0.10	Respond to email from Andersons re extension of deadline to respond to preference demand letter
06/11/15	TJM	0.20	Review UST's objection to the Trustee's Motion to Seal
06/11/15	TJM	0.50	Review US District Court's order denying CP's motion to withdraw the reference
06/11/15	DSA	0.50	Reviewed e-mail concerning issues with Trestle litigation (.1); reviewed objection to motion to seal filed by the UST and e-mails relating thereto (.2); telephone conference with J. Fischer concerning issues with trestle litigation (.2)

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

06/12/15	ALS	0.30	Emails to R. Keach re Motion for Leave to File an Amended Complaint and Motion for Expedited Hearing filed by Plaintiff's Counsel in U.S. District Court (.1); update pleadings with Motion for Leave to File an Amended Complaint and Motion for Expedited Hearing filed by Plaintiff's Counsel in U.S. District Court (.2)
06/12/15	TJM	0.20	TC w/ J Fischer re Trustee's motion to seal
06/12/15	TJM	0.20	Review UST objection to motion to seal (0.1) and confer Trustee re same (0.1)
06/12/15	TJM	0.30	TC w/ J Fischer re motion to seal
06/12/15	MAS	0.10	Exchange emails with Curt Kimball (First Union Rail) re: further extension of deadline to respond to preference demand letter.
06/16/15	PM	0.20	Review CP's Objection to Motion to Seal Settlements.
06/16/15	PM	0.20	Review article sent from Bob Keach re. CP Opposition to Canadian Approval of Settlement and email communications with Bob re. same.
06/16/15	PM	0.10	Review Limited Objection to Disclosure Statement of Northern Railway and Southern Railway.
06/16/15	PM	0.10	Review Objection to Disclosure Statement of Wheeling and Lake Erie Railway.
06/16/15	TJM	0.60	Confer with R Desai re case status and strategy
06/16/15	TJM	0.30	Review proposed consent motion and FOO re extension of response deadline re motion to seal
06/16/15	TJM	0.60	Review CP's objection to the motion to seal (0.5) and confer Trustee re reply re same (0.1)
06/16/15	TJM	0.10	TC w/ Jeremy Fischer re extension of time for parties to file motion in support of motion to seal

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

06/16/15	TJM	3.30	Draft, edit and revise omnibus reply to objection to motion to seal
06/16/15	TJM	0.10	Review Wheeling's supplemental objection to the Trustee's motion to seal
06/16/15	TJM	0.10	Confer with S Anderson re TC w/ J Fischer re extension of time to file motion in support re motion to seal
06/16/15	DSA	0.60	Conference with T. McKeon concerning issues with support for motion to seal (.1); reviewed objection to seal and related documents filed by CP (.2); reviewed objection to seal filed by Wheeling (.2); reviewed motion to extend deadline for oil producers and e-mails relating thereto (.1)
06/17/15	DSA	0.10	Telephone conference with Wheeling concerning record on appeal (.1)
06/17/15	ALS	0.10	Docket scheduling answer deadline for CP with respect to World Fuel adversary proceeding given the ruling on CP's Motion to Withdraw Reference
06/17/15	ALS	0.10	Email to R. Keach re message received from T. Davidson re Texas and Illinois litigation
06/17/15	TJM	2.40	Draft, edit and revise reply motion re motion to seal
06/17/15	TJM	0.10	Review filing by First Circuit re appeal re Travelers order
06/18/15	TJM	0.10	TC w/ J Fischer re motion to seal
06/18/15	TJM	0.20	TC w/ Jeremy Fischer re motion to seal
06/18/15	TJM	0.60	Review response from The Andersons re preference demand letter
06/18/15	TJM	4.70	Draft, edit and revise omnibus reply to objections to Trustee's Motion to Seal (4.6) and confer Trustee re same (0.1)

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

06/18/15	MAS	0.40	Review ordinary course of business analysis for preference recipients and draft questions for DSI re: same.
06/18/15	MAS	0.10	Exchange emails with Matt Farnsworth regarding ordinary course of business analysis for preferences.
06/19/15	MAS	0.10	Exchange emails with attorney for Summit Railroad re: response to demand letter.
06/19/15	MAS	2.50	Review status of responses to demand letters and draft memo/spreadsheet of status, strategy, and proposed settlement offer (if any) all re: preference demand letters.
06/19/15	TJM	0.10	TC w/ Bankruptcy Court re notice re deal w/ SMBC
06/19/15	TJM	0.20	Confer with Trustee re order staying action in district court and email signature blocks for consenting counsel re same
06/19/15	TJM	0.30	Finalize motion to stay adversary proceeding re WF Entities and SMBC (0.2) and email opposing counsel re same (0.1)
06/19/15	TJM	0.90	Draft, edit, and research re objection to CPR admin claim
06/19/15	TJM	0.40	Prepare Designation form re First Cir appeal
06/19/15	TJM	1.00	Motion to continue hearing (draft, edit and revise consent motion and proposed order re continuing the hearing on Wheeling's motion to compel (0.8) and email counsel for Wheeling re same (0.2)
06/19/15	TJM	0.50	TC w/ counsel for Wheeling re continuing hearing on Motion to Compel (0.2) and send follow up email re same (0.2) and confer Trustee re same (0.1)
06/22/15	TJM	0.10	Email counsel for WF Entities and SMBC re follow up re motion staying adversary proceeding

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

06/22/15	TJM	3.40	Edit and revise reply motion re motion to seal
06/22/15	MAS	0.30	Inquiry into Saratoga and North Creek (preference recipient) address, due to recipient's failure to respond to preference demand.
06/22/15	MAS	0.80	Review response of Helm Financial to preference demand letter, including research into unpaid rent as "new value."
06/22/15	MAS	2.60	Review updated spreadsheet from DSI re: ordinary course analysis for preferences, update internal analysis, retrieve relevant caselaw on new value and ordinary course, and email same to Tim McKeon with comment.
06/22/15	ALS	0.10	Update deadline for Plaintiffs to file Amended Complaint in U.S. District Court case
06/22/15	DSA	1.00	Reviewed e-mails and e-mailed parties concerning issues with preference actions (.1); reviewed e-mails and agreements relating to settlement with insurer (.2); reviewed e-mails and e-mailed parties concerning issues with Wheeling extension (.1); reviewed unit 5017 agreement and e-mailed parties concerning issues with same (.2); reviewed e-mails concerning issues with charges brought in Quebec (.2); telephone conference with J. Dow concerning issues with CP administrative claims (.2)
06/23/15	DSA	0.20	Reviewed e-mails concerning issues with schedule for CP administrative claims hearing (.1); reviewed e-mails relating to amended wrongful death complaint (.1)
06/23/15	ALS	0.20	Update pleadings file with respect to Roy case

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

06/23/15	ALS	0.30	Review Amended Complaint filed in Roy case (.2); email to R. Keach and S. Anderson re same (.1)
06/23/15	MAS	2.50	Draft template preference complaint for preference recipients and email same to Sam Anderson and Tim McKeon.
06/23/15	PM	0.20	Review news reports of CP failure to secure handbrakes.
06/23/15	PM	0.30	Listen to interview of Minister of transport re. potential charges against CP and emails from Bob Keach re. same.
06/23/15	PM	1.10	Review and analyze CP Motion to Dismiss.
06/23/15	TJM	0.90	Review CPR motion to dismiss adversary proceeding
06/24/15	TJM	0.40	Confer with P McDonald re CP's motion to dismiss
06/24/15	PM	0.50	Review and analyze Motion to Dismiss.
06/24/15	PM	0.80	Review prior CP filings in analysis of Motion to Dismiss issues and Order on Motion to Withdraw reference; legal research re. jurisdictional issues.
06/24/15	PM	0.60	Legal research re. jurisdictional issues.
06/24/15	PM	0.40	Meet with Tim McKeon to discuss strategy on Opposition to CP Motion to Dismiss.
06/24/15	PM	0.30	Phone call with Bob Keach re. CP Motion to Dismiss.
06/24/15	RND	0.10	Email with R. Keach re: 6/25 hearing on Wheeling's Motion to Enforce CC Orders
06/24/15	ALS	0.40	Circulate CP's Motion to Dismiss to R. Keach, P. McDonald and T. McKeon (.1); update pleadings file with CP's Motion to Dismiss and Notice of Hearing (.1); docket scheduling CP's Motion to Dismiss (.2)
06/25/15	ALS	0.30	Download summonses issued in Roy case

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

06/25/15	RND	1.80	Travel to Court and attend hearing re: Wheeling's motion to enforce Cash Collateral orders
06/25/15	PM	0.10	Review ECF Notices re. Continuance of CP motion.
06/25/15	PM	0.10	Email communications with Bob Keach and Tim McKeon re. obtaining copy of Canadian Class Certification Order.
06/25/15	PM	1.10	Meet with Bob Keach and Tim McKeon to discuss strategy in responding to CP Motion to Dismiss.
06/25/15	TJM	0.40	Review revisions to motion to stay adversary proceeding re WFS and SMBC re comments from counsel for WFS (0.2) and amend motion and proposed order re same (0.1) and email counsel for SMBC re same (0.1)
06/25/15	TJM	0.70	Review email from Trustee re copy of translated class certification order (0.1) and confer A Stewart re same (0.2) and review file re same (0.3) and email MMAC counsel re same (0.1)
06/25/15	TJM	0.20	Review materials provided by the Trustee re jurisdiction re CPR's motion to dismiss re 12(b)(1)
06/25/15	TJM	0.10	Confer w/ Trustee re CPR motion to dismiss
06/25/15	TJM	1.10	Confer w/ Trustee and P McDonald re CPR motion to dismiss and response re same
06/26/15	TJM	0.20	Research and review Court order re leave to file amended answer re consent to jurisdiction
06/26/15	TJM	0.30	Finalize motion re staying adversary proceeding re WFS and SMBC
06/26/15	TJM	0.10	TC w/ counsel for SMBC re motion to stay proceedings

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

06/26/15	PM	0.50	Review Canadian Pacific annual reports, financial statements re. information regarding contacts with US.
06/26/15	PM	0.10	Review Order on CP Motion to Extend Hearing on Objection to claim.
06/26/15	PM	0.10	Review Order on Motion to Stay Adversary Against Work Fuel.
06/26/15	PM	0.70	Review corporate information on CPR for purposes of Motion to Dismiss.
06/26/15	PM	0.50	Review case law sent from Bob Keach re. filing of proof of claim in a consent to jurisdiction.
06/26/15	KQ	0.20	Finalize and file the Motion to Stay Proceedings regarding WF and SMBC
06/26/15	KQ	0.50	Draft and file the Certificate of Service related to the Motion to Stay Proceedings regarding WF and SMBC
06/29/15	DSA	0.60	Reviewed and made change to preference complaint and e-mailed parties concerning issues with same (.6)
06/29/15	PM	0.10	Review case law on consent to jurisdiction by filing proof of claim.
06/29/15	PM	0.10	Email communications with Bob Keach re. possible Rule 11 letter to CP's counsel re. motion to dismiss.
06/29/15	PM	1.10	Research re. filing POC subjects filer to jurisdiction of the Court.
06/29/15	TJM	0.80	Review cases re objection to CPR motion to dismiss
06/29/15	TJM	0.30	Review omnibus reply motion re motion to seal
06/30/15	PM	0.10	Email communications with Bob Keach re. CPR materials declaring it is the only railway to serve the Bakken.

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

06/30/15	ALS	0.30	Email to R. Keach re Motion for Leave to File Amended Complaint filed in U.S. District Court (.1); update pleadings with Motion for Leave to File Amended Complaint filed in U.S. District Court (.2)
07/01/15	ALS	0.10	Docket scheduling re telephone conference with Judge Torresen on derailment litigation
07/01/15	LKZ	1.80	Research re: NDA (.5); confer w/A.Stewart re: same (.3); draft NDA for same (.8); confer w/B.Keach re: same (.2).
07/01/15	PM	0.10	Email communications with Bob Keach and Tim McKeon re. opposition to CP motion to dismiss.
07/01/15	MAS	1.50	Review and proof 2011 transaction complaint (redline and edits).
07/01/15	MAS	0.20	Retrieve breach of fiduciary duty statute of limitations and email same to Bob Keach with comment.
07/01/15	RND	0.90	Review draft proposed order re: Wheeling's Motion to Enforce CC and revise same
07/01/15	RND	0.30	Emails with R. Keach and D. Johnson re: revisions to proposed order on Wheeling's Motion to Enforce CC
07/01/15	TJM	0.40	Edit and revise consent motion to continue pre trial conference and extend objection deadlines re CP motion to dismiss
07/01/15	TJM	0.20	Review CP proposed motion continuing pre-trial conference (0.1) and email counsel for CP re extension of objection deadline re motion to dismiss (0.1)
07/02/15	TJM	0.50	Finalize omnibus reply to objections to motion to file settlement agreements under seal
07/02/15	TJM	1.40	Edit and revise consent motion to continue pre trial conference and extend objection deadlines re CP motion to dismiss

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

07/02/15	LKZ	1.30	Review Trinity settlement agreement (.3) and draft NDA (.5); confer w/B.Keach re: same (.3); draft email to Trinity counsel re: same (.2).
07/03/15	TJM	0.30	Finalize consent motion re CP re continuing pre-trial conference and extending objection deadline re motion to dismiss
07/06/15	TJM	2.00	Research local rules re Cook County re transfer case file re transfer order (0.6); TC w/ clerks office re Cook County re procedure re transferring case file (0.4); TC w/ K Bigelow re contacting clerks office re Cook County re procedure re transferring case file (0.2); Review and research re procedural history of case re order granting transfer request (0.8)
07/06/15	TJM	0.20	Email counsel for CP re extending deadlines re objection deadline re motion to dismiss (0.1); Review edits and revisions to motion papers by CP counsel (0.1)
07/06/15	LKZ	0.20	Review B.Keach changes.
07/06/15	ALS	0.30	Office conferences (x2) with T. McKeon re transfer of case from Cook County (.2); review pleadings regarding same (.1)
07/07/15	KQ	0.40	Finalize and file via ECF the Trustee's omnibus reply to objections to the motion to seal
07/07/15	KQ	0.60	Prepare and send e-mail and us mail service of the Trustee's omnibus reply to objections to the motion to seal
07/07/15	TJM	0.50	Finalize omnibus reply to objections to motion to seal
07/07/15	TJM	0.50	Prepare for call w/ M Radtke re transfer of case file (0.2); TC w/ M Radtke and Trustee re transfer of case file re Cook County (0.3)

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

07/07/15	TJM	2.00	Review research re response to CP motion to dismiss
07/08/15	TJM	0.10	Email counsel for MNR re response to preference demand letter
07/08/15	TJM	1.40	Draft, edit and revise motion to transfer case file re Cook County
07/08/15	TJM	3.20	Review research re objection to motion to dismiss re CP
07/08/15	RND	0.30	Review proposed order filed re: Wheeling's Motion to Enforce CC Order; emails to D. Johnson re: revisions to same
07/08/15	MAS	0.30	Confer with Karla re: service on defendants and exchange emails with Karla and Bob.
07/08/15	KQ	1.20	Prepare the adversary proceeding cover sheet and draft schedule of defendants related to Keach v. Caisse De Depot Et Placement Du Quebec, et al.
07/08/15	ALS	0.10	Office conference with K. Quirk re filing of adversary complaint re 2011 transaction
07/09/15	TJM	1.30	Draft, edit and revise motion to transfer case file re Cook County
07/09/15	TJM	0.40	Draft, edit and revise opposition to motion to dismiss re CPR
07/10/15	TJM	1.80	Draft, edit and revise opposition to motion to dismiss re CPR
07/10/15	TJM	0.20	Edit and revise motion for order re transfer case re Cook County
07/12/15	DSA	0.30	Reviewed e-mails and e-mailed B. Keach concerning issues with Wheeling motion to dismiss (.2); e-mailed parties concerning issues with preference complaints (.1)
07/13/15	DSA	0.20	Reviewed e-mails concerning issues with preference actions (.2)
07/13/15	TJM	0.20	Finalize motion to transfer case re Cook County

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

07/13/15	TJM	5.80	Draft, edit, revise and research re objection to motion to dismiss re CP
07/14/15	TJM	2.00	Review response to preference demand letter from Northern Maine Rail (0.4); Email DSI re analysis of responses to preference demand letters to Northern Maine Rail and New Brunswick Southern Rail (0.2); Meet w/ M Seidband and S Anderson re preference case strategy (1.4)
07/14/15	TJM	0.60	Confer with M Seidband re objection to Wheeling motion to dismiss
07/14/15	TJM	6.50	Draft, edit and revise opposition to CP motion to dismiss
07/14/15	MAS	1.40	Confer with Sam Anderson and Tim McKeon re: preference settlement strategies and potential litigation strategies.
07/14/15	MAS	1.00	Draft updates to preference complaint to incorporate 502(d) count against parties who filed claims.
07/14/15	MAS	2.50	Initial review of Wheeling's motion to dismiss UFTA complaint (includes conference with Tim McKeon).
07/14/15	PM	0.30	Review numerous ECF notices re. disclosure statement and Chapter 11 plan.
07/14/15	DSA	1.40	Conference with parties concerning issues with settlement of preference actions and status of cases (1.4)
07/14/15	LKZ	0.40	Review revised NDA and redacted settlement agmt and email w/B.Keach re: same (.1); review comments to NDA (.2) and emails w/B.Keach re: same (.1).
07/15/15	PM	0.10	Meet with Tim McKeon to discuss CP Motion to Dismiss strategy.

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

07/15/15	MAS	1.80	Review new value analysis and draft response letters to preference recipients, and email same to Sam Anderson with comment.
07/15/15	TJM	7.90	Draft, edit and revise opposition to motion to dismiss re CP
07/16/15	TJM	5.80	Draft, edit and revise opposition to motion to dismiss re CP
07/16/15	TJM	0.40	Review motion re transfer case from Cook County (0.1) and email Trustee re same (0.1); Prepare exhibits for joint motion (0.1); Email local counsel re joint motion re review (0.1)
07/16/15	DSA	1.40	Reviewed e-mails and e-mailed T. McKeon concerning issues with preference claims for Irving (.1); telephone conference with F. Caruso concerning issues with preference actions and status of case (.5); research concerning look back period for preference actions (.4); e-mailed Trustee concerning issues with look back period for preference actions and status of cases (.2); began reviewing and making changes to counter proposals for various defendants (.2)
07/17/15	LKZ	0.20	Revise NDA (.2) and emails w/B.Keach re: same (.1).
07/17/15	TJM	6.90	Draft, edit and revise opposition to motion to dismiss re CP
07/17/15	TJM	0.70	Edit and revise joint motion re transfer of case re cook county (0.4); Emails w/ local counsel and Trustee re same (0.2); Emails w/ plaintiff's counsel re motion (0.1)
07/17/15	MAS	0.60	Update responses to preference recipients (Dead River, Summit Railroad, NH Bragg) and email/mail responses to same.

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

07/18/15	DSA	0.20	Reviewed e-mails concerning issues with preference demands and issues with plan funding (.2)
07/20/15	DSA	2.90	Reviewed e-mails and e-mailed parties concerning issues with trestle litigation (.2); continued reviewing and making changes to settlement counters for the preference actions (1.1); conference with T. McKeon concerning issues with status of preference settlements (.1); research concerning issues with new value for postpetition lease obligations (.5); conference with M. Seidband concerning issues with First Union preference defenses (.1); telephone conference with F. Caruso concerning issues with Irving preference claims (.8); reviewed proof of claim filed by Irving and telephone conference with F. Caruso concerning same (.2)
07/20/15	MAS	0.20	Review response letter from First Union Rail (Helm Financial) and email same to Sam Anderson (re: preference matters).
07/20/15	MAS	0.10	Exchange emails with Tim McKeon re: preference recovery materials and email Tim copy of responses to various recipients.
07/20/15	MAS	1.20	Draft responses to MSC Industrial, Newgistics, and Modern Track re: preference litigation.
07/20/15	PM	0.10	Email communications with Tim McKeon and Bob Keach re. opposition to CP motion to dismiss.
07/20/15	RND	2.20	Review stipulation to second amended and restated order staying proceedings pending appeal and note parties who have executed stipulation

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

07/20/15	RND	0.20	Review response to CP's motion to withdraw reference for information necessary to respond to CP's motion dismiss
07/20/15	RND	0.10	Email to R. Keach re: status of authorizations to stipulated order amending order staying proceedings
07/20/15	RND	0.10	Email with R. Keach and T. McKeon re: CP's motion to dismiss
07/20/15	TJM	3.70	Draft email counterclaim offers in reply to responses to demand letters (1.8) and confer S Anderson re same (0.1); TC w/ DSI and S Anderson re preference analysis (0.8); Research re agreements w/ debtor re terms (0.6); Finalize email replies re settlement offers (0.3) and send re same (0.1)
07/20/15	TJM	0.10	Email M Radtke re hearing re motion to transfer case re Cook County
07/20/15	TJM	4.50	Edit and review opposition to motion to dismiss re CPR (4.1) Confer Trustee re opposition to motion to dismiss (0.4);
07/21/15	TJM	4.70	Edit, revise and finalize opposition to motion to dismiss re CP motion to dismiss adversary proceeding
07/21/15	TJM	0.90	Draft, edit, revise and finalize Trustee's report re transfer motion re Cook County (0.4); Confer K Quirk re confer w/ Court re filing procedure (0.2); Emails w/ Trustee re report (0.2); Finalize motion re filing (0.1)
07/21/15	TJM	0.30	Review motion to supplement record re First Circuit appeal re transcript from BAP (0.2) and emails w/ counsel for Wheeling and Trustee re same (0.1)

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

07/21/15	RND	0.10	Meeting with R. Keach re: revisions to stipulated order amending order staying proceedings (derailment litigation)
07/21/15	RND	1.80	Review/revise response to CP's motion to dismiss
07/21/15	MAS	0.30	Brief review of UFTA case re: Wheeling preference action.
07/21/15	MAS	0.90	Research into status of Saratoga and North Creek railway and prepare email and letter to Saratoga and North Creek re: preference demand, failure to respond.
07/21/15	MAS	0.80	Review response from Saratoga and North Creek re: preference demand, exchange emails with DSI re: check images, email Sam Anderson re: redactions.
07/21/15	MAS	1.30	Research re: post-petition advances not recognized as new value, and stub-rent calculations for new value purposes, (re: First Union preference demand).
07/21/15	DSA	1.70	Reviewed e-mails concerning issues with preference settlement demands (.1); began reviewing motion to dismiss filed by Wheeling in relation to the UFTA complaint (.7); conference with M. Seidband concerning issues with same (.4); telephone conference with F. Caruso concerning issues with Irving preference actions (.5)
07/21/15	KQ	3.20	Finalize and file via ECF the Joint Motion for Second Amended and Restated Order Modifying Consent Order in each of the twenty derailment litigation cases
07/21/15	KQ	0.50	Finalize and file via ECF the Trustee's opposition to CP's Motion to Dismiss

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

07/22/15	MAS	0.30	Draft partial redactions to bank statements and email same to counsel to Saratoga and North Creek (re: preferences).
07/22/15	MAS	1.80	Draft letter (memorandum form) to counsel to First Union / Helm Financial re: preference demand and email to Sam Anderson for review.
07/22/15	PM	0.10	Review article sent to Bob Keach re. CPR business downturn.
07/22/15	PM	0.40	Review Objection to CP Motion to Dismiss.
07/22/15	TJM	0.70	Research re whether 547 SOL can be extended by agreement
07/22/15	TJM	1.10	Review response from counsel for Berlin re demand re preferential (0.2) and draft response re same (0.8) and send same (0.1)
07/22/15	TJM	0.60	Review preference folder re demand/response re I Railroads
07/23/15	TJM	0.60	Review agreements and documents re preference analysis
07/23/15	MAS	0.30	Review and proof letter to counsel to First Union rail re: preference demand.
07/23/15	MAS	0.20	Review responsive letter from MSC Industrial re: preference demand and exchange emails with MSC Industrial.
07/23/15	MAS	0.30	Review further response and settlement offer from Newgistics and email same to Sam Anderson with comment.
07/23/15	MAS	1.50	Begin review and drafting notes for response to Wheeling MTD (re: Wheeling preference complaint).
07/23/15	KQ	0.10	E-mail from and to J. Pincus regarding the Trustee's objection to CP's Motion to Dismiss
07/23/15	KQ	0.50	Prepare and send service of the objection to CP's Motion to Dismiss

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

07/23/15	KQ	0.40	Draft and file the Certificate of Service related to the objection to CP's Motion to Dismiss
07/23/15	KQ	0.80	Review e-mail service issues related to the objection to CP's Motion to Dismiss
07/23/15	KQ	0.50	Prepare and file the Certificate of Service related to the Trustee's Report on the Status of Case Transfer in two district court cases
07/23/15	KQ	0.20	E-mail from and to Louise Comtois of the Government of Quebec regarding request for copy of CP's Motion to Dismiss
07/23/15	KQ	0.10	E-mail from and to J. Leong from Telus regarding address change for service of notice
07/24/15	KQ	0.20	Multiple e-mails to US District Court forwarding word version of proposed order and Schedule A related to the joint motion amending and restating order staying proceedings
07/24/15	KQ	1.10	Prepare adversary cover sheet and contact list for defendants in preparation for filing complaint
07/24/15	KQ	0.30	Prepare file transfer of solicitation and Ch. 15 documents to be sent to settling defendants counsel
07/24/15	ALS	5.80	Assist R. Keach with organization of materials for oral argument at U.S. Appeals Court for the First Circuit with respect to Wheeling & Lake Erie's appeal
07/24/15	ALS	0.30	Docket scheduling with respect to derailment litigation cases
07/24/15	MAS	3.00	Draft further revisions to 2011 transaction complaint to remove breach of fiduciary duty claims and edit for continuity in light of removal.

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

07/24/15	MAS	0.50	Review email from counsel to First Union / Helm Financial re: preference demand, including prior settlement agreement produced by First Union and draft email to Bob Keach and Sam Anderson with analysis of same.
07/24/15	MAS	0.30	Review further response from NH Bragg (preference recipient) and email Sam Anderson re: same.
07/24/15	MAS	2.00	Continue review and notes for response to motion to dismiss in Wheeling preference action.
07/24/15	RND	0.10	Email to R. Keach re: draft of Trustee's Report on CCAA Proceeding
07/24/15	RND	0.30	Emails with R. Keach and K. Quirk re: sending word versions of the stipulated order and schedule A to the order to District Court
07/24/15	RND	0.30	Further correspondence with Court re: word version of Schedule A to stipulated order amending and restating order staying proceedings
07/24/15	RND	0.20	Correspondence with Court re: sending revised word version of Stipulated Order (derailment litigation)
07/26/15	TJM	1.80	Review First Cir brief re Wheeling
07/27/15	TJM	4.90	Prepare for hearing at the First Circuit re Wheeling re Travelers
07/27/15	MAS	1.50	Final review and proofing, and assistance with filing and service of 2011 transaction complaint.
07/27/15	MAS	0.10	Review correspondence from Summit Railroad re: settlement of preference action.
07/27/15	MAS	0.20	Review email from Saratoga and North Creek (preference recipient) re: check images and account tracing.

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

07/27/15	MAS	5.00	Research and drafting of response to Wheeling motion to dismiss UFTA complaint.
07/27/15	ALS	0.60	Review pleadings (.2); update docket scheduling with respect to derailment litigation (.4)
07/27/15	KQ	0.80	Finalize and file the Complaint related to Caisse de Depot et Placement Du Quebec, et al.
07/27/15	KQ	0.50	Draft a Certificate of Publication related to hearing on the petition for recognition in the Ch. 15 case
07/27/15	KQ	0.10	E-mail from and to M. Siedband regarding counsel to Caisse in preparation of service of summons.
07/27/15	DSA	0.60	Reviewed e-mails and conference with T. McKeon concerning issues with preference settlements (.4); conference with M. Seidband concerning issues with motion to dismiss Wheeling complaint (.2)
07/28/15	DSA	0.90	Reviewed e-mails from P. Maxcy concerning issues with defendants in 2011 complaint (.2); reviewed 2011 transaction complaint (.3); telephone conference with B. Keach concerning issues with motion to dismiss Wheeling (.2); conference with M. Seidband concerning issues with preference settlement (.2)
07/28/15	KQ	3.20	Prepare and send service of Summons and Complaint upon all defendants in the Keach v. Caisse de Depot matter
07/28/15	KQ	2.20	Prepare and file via ECF the Certificate of Service related to the service of the Summons and Complaint of all defendants in the Keach v. Caisse de Depot matter
07/28/15	ALS	0.30	Docket scheduling of deadlines associated with Keach v. Caisse De Depot adversary proceeding

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

07/28/15	MAS	0.10	Draft email to Pierre Legault re: counsel for service of complaint against CDPQ (2011 transaction complaint).
07/28/15	MAS	0.90	Review and analysis of response from NH Bragg (preference recipient) and draft email to Sam Anderson re: same.
07/28/15	MAS	0.10	Draft email to Sam Anderson re: discussion with counsel to Summit Railroad (re: preferences).
07/28/15	MAS	0.10	Exchange correspondence with Saratoga and North Creek railroad.
07/28/15	MAS	4.50	Continue drafting response to Wheeling's MTD, including research (re: UFTA complaint against Wheeling).
07/28/15	MAS	0.20	Phone call with David Banker re: preference action against Summit Railroad.
07/28/15	TJM	0.10	Respond to counterclaim re preferential demand letter (0.1)
07/28/15	TJM	6.30	Travel to and from First Circuit courthouse (4.5) and attend hearing re Wheeling appeal re Travelers (1.8)
07/29/15	TJM	0.70	Review responses to preference demands (0.3) and confer w/ S Anderson re same (0.2); Draft and send counteroffer re settlement offer re GH Berlin (0.2)
07/29/15	TJM	0.40	Draft, edit and revise complaints re preferences
07/29/15	TJM	1.60	Review discovery requests (0.2); draft, edit and revise responses re Interrogatories (0.7); draft, edit and revise responses re Document Requests (0.7)
07/29/15	MAS	3.50	Continue drafting response to Wheeling's MTD, including research (re: UFTA complaint against Wheeling).

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

07/29/15	MAS	3.10	Draft 9019 motion to settle with MSC and Newgistics (preference recipients).
07/29/15	MAS	1.00	Draft motion to expedite for 9019 Motion for MSC and Newgistics (preference recipients).
07/29/15	PM	0.10	Review CP interrogatories.
07/29/15	KQ	0.10	Office conference with M. Siedband regarding filing of 9019 motion and coordination of hearing and service of same.
07/29/15	DSA	0.70	Reviewed e-mails and e-mailed P. Maxcy concerning issues with escrow payments (.2); reviewed e-mails concerning issues with the status of various preference claims (.3); conference with T. McKeon concerning issues with settlement motion for preference actions (.2)
07/30/15	DSA	1.10	Reviewed e-mails concerning issues with settlement of preference claims (.2); reviewed and made changes to motion to expedite preference settlements (.3); reviewed and made changes to settlement motion relating to preference issues (.6)
07/30/15	KQ	1.60	Finalize, file and serve the 9019 Motion and related Motion to Expedite
07/30/15	KQ	0.40	Draft and file the Certificate of Service related to the 9019 Motion and related Motion to Expedite
07/30/15	KQ	0.40	Address service issues related to service of the summons and 2011 complaint and follow up e-mail to B. Keach and M. Seidband regarding same.
07/30/15	ALS	0.90	Review dockets with respect to derailment litigation (.5); docket scheduling with respect to derailment litigation (.4)
07/30/15	MAS	1.10	Review comments from Sam Anderson and update 9019 motion (re: preference recipients).

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

07/30/15	MAS	2.10	Draft notice of hearing and proposed orders for 9019 motion and motion to expedite (re: preferences).
07/30/15	MAS	0.40	Review response from Newgistics (.2) draft counteroffer (re: preferences) (.2)
07/30/15	MAS	1.50	Review, update, and proof all 9019 filings and filing and service (re: preferences).
07/30/15	TJM	0.70	Edit and revise draft complaint re preference claim re Andersons (0.5); Confer K Bigelow re research re each company re corporate information to be included in complaints (0.2)
07/31/15	TJM	1.20	Edit and revise preference complaint re Flex Leasing (0.3); Edit and revise preference complaint re Fred's (0.2); Edit and revise preference complaint re GH Berlin (0.2); Edit and revise preference complaint re Maine Northern (0.3); Edit and revise preference complaint re New Brunswick Rail (0.2)
07/31/15	MAS	2.20	Draft motion to stay Wheeling UFTA adversary pending plan confirmation, including proposed order.
07/31/15	MAS	3.20	Draft settlement agreement for preference recipients and email same to Sam Anderson with comment.
07/31/15	MAS	0.20	Phone call with counsel to Summit Railroad and follow up email, re: preference settlement.
07/31/15	DSA	0.30	Reviewed objection to CP motion to dismiss (.3)
08/03/15	ALS	0.20	Review email from M. Siedband re filing of consent motion to stay Keach v Wheeling adversary proceeding (.1); call to Court re upcoming hearing dates (.1)

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

08/03/15	ALS	0.40	Preparation of certificate of service with respect to Motion to Stay Adversary Proceeding (.1); email to M. Siedband re proposed order on Motion to Stay adversary proceeding (.1); revision to proposed order on consent motion to stay adversary proceeding (.1); filing of consent motion to stay, proposed order and certificate of service with Court (.1)
08/03/15	ALS	0.40	Docket scheduling with respect to derailment litigation cases
08/03/15	DSA	1.70	Reviewed e-mails and e-mailed parties concerning issues with Summit preference settlement (.1); reviewed and made changes to motion to extend deadlines in the Wheeling UFTA proceedings (.3); e-mailed Wheeling concerning issues with same (.1); conference with M. Seidband concerning issues with changes to settlement agreement for preference actions(.2); reviewed additional e-mails concerning issues with Summit preference settlement (.2); reviewed amended wrongful death complaint (.3); reviewed and made changes to settlement agreement template for preference actions (.5)
08/03/15	MAS	2.50	Final drafting/revisions to motion to stay adversary proceeding, hearing date for continued pre-trial conference, and attention to filing.
08/03/15	MAS	0.40	Review and respond to Summit Railroad Products settlement offer.
08/03/15	MAS	0.20	Exchange emails with counsel to Saratoga and North Creek re: potential settlement.

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

08/03/15	MAS	1.00	Finalize template preference complaint and begin preparation of individual complaints and exhibits.
08/03/15	PM	0.10	Email communications with Tim McKeon and Paul Hemming re. CP discovery requests.
08/03/15	RND	0.10	Emails with R. Keach re: Status Report on Grimard Case (Derailment Litigation)
08/03/15	TJM	0.20	Email K Cunningham re preference actions
08/04/15	RND	0.20	Review state court order re: Grimard Case
08/04/15	RND	0.20	Emails with R. Keach and A. Stewart re: Status Report on Grimard Case and filing of same
08/04/15	RND	1.20	Draft Status Report on transfer of Grimard case
08/04/15	MAS	2.00	Continue drafting preference complaints and exhibits.
08/04/15	MAS	0.30	Phone call with Keith Cunningham re: Dead River (preference recipient).
08/04/15	MAS	0.20	Draft email to Bob Keach and Sam Anderson re: Dead River Co. (preference recipient).
08/04/15	ALS	0.50	Office conference with R. Desai re filing of report re transfer of Grimard case (.1); filing of status report in Grimard case and main case (.3); draft certificate of service re status report (.1)
08/05/15	ALS	0.10	Office conference with M. Siedband re filing of preference complaints
08/05/15	DSA	0.60	Reviewed e-mails and e-mailed M. Seidband concerning issues with Dead River preferences (.2); reviewed Dead River preference complaint and conference with M. Seidband concerning issues with same (.4)
08/05/15	MAS	0.30	Phone call with counsel to Modern Track re: preference complaint, and follow up email to Bob and Sam re: same.

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

08/05/15	MAS	0.20	Finalize settlement agreement to preference recipient MSC Industrial and email same to opposing counsel with comment.
08/05/15	MAS	0.20	Finalize settlement agreement to preference recipient Newgistics and email same to opposing counsel with comment.
08/05/15	MAS	0.20	Finalize settlement agreement to preference recipient Summit Railroad and email same to opposing counsel with comment.
08/05/15	MAS	5.50	Finalize all preference complaints and exhibits, includes attention to specific issues related to individual recipients.
08/06/15	MAS	0.10	Email Bobby Bowers re: Helm Financial preference.
08/06/15	MAS	0.20	Confer with Bob, Sam, and Tim re: preference complaints prior to filing.
08/06/15	TJM	3.50	Email GH Berlin re counteroffer re settlement (0.1); Confer w/ S Anderson re complaints (0.1); Confer w/ S Anderson, Trustee and M Seidband re complaints and case strategy (0.3); Update and finalize complaints re preference actions (3.0)
08/06/15	ALS	0.20	Office conference with M. Siedband and T. McKeon re filing of adversary complaints
08/06/15	ALS	3.70	Preparation for and filing of thirteen adversary complaints with U.S. Bankruptcy Court
08/06/15	DSA	0.70	Reviewed e-mails and e-mailed Rail World concerning issues with escrow of funds (.1); conference with B. Keach concerning issues with status of preference actions (.3); reviewed e-mails relating to preference settlements and complaints filed in relation thereto (.3)
08/07/15	KQ	1.90	Prepare service of Complaint and Summons related to preference litigation

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

08/07/15	ALS	0.90	Docket scheduling with respect to preference complaints, including answer deadlines, deadline to file pre-trial scheduling order, deadline for conference of counsel and date of pre-trial conference (.6); review Court dockets and Court's calendar with respect to upcoming deadlines and hearings on adversary complaints (.3)
08/07/15	TJM	1.60	TC w/ counsel for CP re 'meet and confer' re discovery requests (0.2) and confer Trustee re same (0.2); Edit and revise response to CP discovery demands re confirmation (1.2)
08/10/15	TJM	0.10	Confer with Trustee and A Stewart re continuing hearing on CP motion to dismiss and pre trial conference
08/10/15	TJM	0.10	Email Andersons re setting up call to discuss potential settlement (0.1)
08/10/15	MAS	0.10	Confer with Karla on service issues for 2011 complaint
08/10/15	MAS	0.30	Review signed settlement agreement from MSC Industrial and email same to Sam with comment.
08/10/15	MAS	0.30	Review settlement offer from Modern Track Machinery and email Sam Anderson with comment re: same.
08/10/15	PM	0.40	Review Objection to CP Proofs of Claim.
08/10/15	DSA	0.10	Telephone conference with C. Kimball concerning issues with preference action against First Union (.1)
08/10/15	KQ	0.80	Prepare and send service of Summons and Complaint regarding preference litigation
08/10/15	KQ	0.10	E-mail from M. Siedband and to R. Grindrod regarding current contact information for Frank Turner

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

08/10/15	KQ	0.30	E-mail to M. Siedband regarding status of service of the summons and complaint for the 2011 litigation
08/10/15	KQ	0.80	Begin preparing Certificate of Service for each of the 13 preference complaints
08/11/15	KQ	0.10	Office conference with A. Stewart regarding service of summons and preference complaint
08/11/15	KQ	0.40	Draft Acceptance of Service for D. Dandeneau of Weil Gotshal on behalf of Flex Leasing I, LLC
08/11/15	KQ	0.10	E-mail to T. McKeon regarding Acceptance of Service for D. Dandeneau of Weil Gotshal on behalf of Flex Leasing
08/11/15	KQ	1.60	Prepare additional service (Registered Agents and counsel) related to the preference complaints
08/11/15	KQ	3.70	Prepare and file Certificates of Service related to the preference complaints
08/11/15	DSA	0.10	Telephone conference with C. Kimball concerning issues with NH Bragg preference action (.1)
08/11/15	ALS	0.20	Email to R. Keach, P. McDonald and T. McKeon re CP's Reply Memorandum in Support of Motion to Dismiss (.1); update pleadings with CP's Reply Memorandum in Support of Motion to Dismiss (.1)
08/11/15	PM	0.10	Email correspondence with Tim McKeon and CP counsel re. hearing on motion to dismiss.
08/11/15	PM	0.10	Email communications with Court and Bob Keach re. hearing on CP Motion to Dismiss.
08/11/15	PM	0.80	Review GP Reply Memorandum on Motion to Dismiss.
08/11/15	TJM	0.20	Review reply filed by CP re motion to dismiss
08/11/15	TJM	0.10	Review settlement offer from Fred's Plumbing re preference

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

08/11/15	TJM	0.30	TC w/ S Anderson and counsel for The Andersons re settlement discussions re preference action
08/11/15	TJM	0.20	Confer K Quirk re service of preference complaints
08/11/15	TJM	0.40	TC w/ counsel for CP re continuance of hearing on motion to dismiss and pre-trial conference (0.1) and confer A Stewart re same (0.2) and email T Thornton re same (0.1)
08/12/15	TJM	0.20	Review preference materials re Fred's Plumbing (0.1) and email counteroffer to counsel for Fred's re settlement (0.1)
08/12/15	TJM	0.20	Review, edit and revise acceptance of service re Flex Leasing (0.1); Review, edit and revise acceptance of service re Fred's Plumbing (0.1)
08/12/15	ALS	0.20	Email to R. Keach, S. Anderson and T. McKeon re CP's Motion to Dismiss re derailment litigation (.1); update pleadings file with CP's Motion to Dismiss re derailment litigation (.1)
08/12/15	KQ	0.30	Research re: Ames Department Store v. ASM Capital, specific to denial of appeal in preparation for Wheeling objection
08/12/15	KQ	0.10	File via ECF the Acceptance of Service for Debra Dandeneau on behalf of Flex Leasing I, LLC
08/12/15	KQ	0.20	Draft Acceptance of Service for Dennis Morgan on behalf of Fred's Plumbing & Heating, Inc. and forward same to T. McKeon for review.
08/12/15	KQ	4.30	Continued preparation of service related to preference actions
08/12/15	KQ	0.20	Finalize Acceptance of Service and send same to D. Dandeneau on behalf of Flex Leasing to accept service in preference action

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

08/12/15	KQ	0.10	E-mail to D. Morgan regarding Acceptance of Service on behalf of Fred's Plumbing and Heating for the preference action
08/12/15	KQ	0.20	File via ECF the Acceptance of Service of M. Morgan on behalf of Fred's Plumbing & Heating for the preference action
08/12/15	DSA	0.30	Conference with F. Caruso concerning issues with UFTA analysis (.1); reviewed e-mails and conference with T. McKeon concerning issues with preference settlements (.2)
08/13/15	KQ	0.10	E-mail to M. Siedband regarding outstanding service issues related to the 2011 Motion
08/13/15	KQ	0.10	E-mail to T. McKeon regarding service issues related to the preference complaint against New Brunswick Southern Railway
08/13/15	KQ	0.50	Draft Acceptance of Service for Alan Lepene on behalf of Maine Northern Railway Company and New Brunswick Southern Railway Company Limited
08/13/15	KQ	4.60	Continued drafting and filing via ECF the Amended COS related to service of the summons and complaints in the 13 preference cases
08/13/15	ALS	0.20	Assist K. Quirk re service of preference complaints
08/13/15	TJM	1.50	Research re service of process on Canadian company (0.9); Confer K Quirk re same (0.4); Email counsel for New Brunswick re acceptance of service (0.1); TC w/ counsel for New Brunswick Southern (0.1)
08/13/15	MAS	0.20	Work on service issues with Karla Quirk re: 2011 transaction complaint.
08/14/15	PM	0.20	Phone call with Sam Anderson re. call from Ross Bann, counsel for the Andersons (.1); call to Ross Brann (left message) (.1).

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

08/14/15	TJM	0.10	TC w/ counsel for New Brunswick Southern and Maine Northern re acceptance of service re preference actions
08/14/15	ALS	0.20	Update docket scheduling with respect to answer deadline and pre-trial conference for adversary proceeding re Caisse De Depot et Placement Due Quebec et al
08/14/15	KQ	1.10	Service of alias summons upon Frank Turner related to the 2011 Complaint, and preparation and filing of the related Certificate of Service
08/14/15	KQ	0.10	Telephone call with K. Ford at the court to request an Alias Summons for the purpose of re-serving Frank K. Turner
08/14/15	KQ	0.20	Office conference with M. Siedband regarding preference action litigation
08/14/15	KQ	0.10	E-mail to Fred Caruso and Matt Farnsworth regarding preference action litigation
08/14/15	DSA	0.40	Reviewed e-mails concerning issues with preference claims (.1); telephone conference with P. McDonald concerning issues with The Andersons claim (.1)
08/17/15	DSA	0.40	Reviewed e-mails and e-mailed parties concerning issues with preference litigation and issues with taxes for escrow with Rail World (.2); reviewed objection to claims filed by Wheeling (.2)
08/17/15	KQ	0.20	Revision to Acceptance of Service for K. Cunningham on behalf of NBSR and MNRC for the preference action complaint and e-mail to T. McKeon re: same.
08/17/15	TJM	0.20	Review acceptance of service re New Brunswick Southern Rail and Maine Northern Rail (0.1); Email counsel for NBSR and MNR re acceptance of service forms (0.1)

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

08/17/15	TJM	0.10	Confer with Trustee re motion to stay adversary proceeding re FLEX Leasing re preference action
08/18/15	MAS	0.20	Review request from defendant to 2011 transaction complaint to extend answer deadline and exchange emails with Sam Anderson and Tim McKeon.
08/18/15	MAS	0.30	Review redlined settlement agreement from Summit Railroad and email Sam Anderson re: same.
08/18/15	KQ	0.30	Finalize and file the joinder and memorandum of law of R. Keach
08/18/15	KQ	0.20	File via ECF the Acceptance of Service for K. Cunningham on behalf of NBSR and MNRC
08/19/15	TJM	0.10	Review judgment from first circuit re appeal re Wheeling
08/19/15	TJM	0.10	Prepare for hearing re CP motion to dismiss
08/20/15	TJM	4.70	Prepare for hearing re CP motion to dismiss (0.7); Attend hearing re Chapter 15 proceeding re motion to continue and motion to adopt Canadian plan (2.1); Attend hearing re CP motion to dismiss (1.9)
08/20/15	TJM	0.60	Draft, edit and revise motion to continue/extend re Rule 2004 exams
08/20/15	TJM	0.40	Review proposed motion and FOO to continue answer/response deadline re compliant filed in Keach v. Caisee de Depot (0.2); Confer w/ Trustee and S Seidband re same (0.1); Respond to counsel for defendant J Davis re same (0.1)
08/20/15	TJM	0.10	Email S Anderson re summary of settlement negotiations re preference actions
08/20/15	TJM	0.10	TC w/ counsel for GE re continuance of hearing re Rule 2004
08/20/15	TJM	0.20	TC w/ counsel for JPMorgan Chase re preference action (0.1) and email Trustee and S Anderson re same (0.1)

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

08/20/15	TJM	0.20	Confer w/ S Anderson and Trustee re preference action re Andersons and settlement re same (0.2)
08/20/15	TJM	0.90	Draft, edit and revise motion to stay adversary proceeding re Flex
08/20/15	MAS	0.10	Exchange emails with DSI re: W-9 for settling defendants.
08/20/15	MAS	0.10	Email Aubrey re: settlement with MSC Industrial.
08/20/15	PM	1.00	Listened to audio of oral argument and ruling on CP Motion to Dismiss.
08/20/15	DSA	0.60	Reviewed e-mails and e-mailed parties concerning issues with stay of discovery (.1); reviewed changes to settlement agreement made by Summit (.2); reviewed e-mails and e-mailed parties concerning issues with preference settlements (.1); reviewed e-mails and conference with B. Keach concerning issues with Andersons claims (.2)
08/21/15	ALS	0.60	Office conference with T. McKeon re filing of Consented to Motion for Order Staying Adversary Proceeding Against Flex Leasing I, LLC (.1); revision to draft order on Consented to Motion for Order Staying Adversary Proceeding Against Flex Leasing I, LLC (.1); service of Consented to Motion for Order Staying Adversary Proceeding Against Flex Leasing I, LLC (.2); filing of Consented to Motion for Order Staying Adversary Proceeding Against Flex Leasing I, LLC with Court (.2)
08/21/15	MAS	0.30	Brief review of 1st Cir. decision from Wheeling appeal.

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

08/21/15	TJM	0.70	Edit and revise motions to continue admin hearings (0.4); Draft and send emails to opposing counsel re consent to motion (0.3)
08/21/15	TJM	0.10	Confer with K Quirk re organizing exhibits re response to CP discovery demands
08/21/15	TJM	1.20	Edit, revise and finalize motion to stay preference proceeding re Flex (0.9); Revise motion re comments from Trustee (0.1); Emails counsel for Flex re copy of motion (0.2)
08/21/15	TJM	0.30	Review motion to extend/continue re Rule 2004 examinations (0.2); Email counsel for parties re continuing hearing re Rule 2004 motions (0.1)
08/21/15	TJM	0.80	Review preference materials re preparation for meeting w/ S Anderson to discuss same (0.2); Confer w/ S Anderson and Trustee re status of preference claims (0.3); Email counsel for The Andersons re response re question re committee (0.1); Email GH Berlin re acceptance of settlement offer (0.1); Email counsel for Fred's Plumbing re acceptance of settlement offer (0.1)
08/24/15	TJM	0.20	Finalize motion to continue hearing, etc. re CP admin claim application
08/24/15	TJM	0.70	Finalize responses to CP discovery demands
08/24/15	TJM	0.90	Draft, edit and revise motion to continue answer deadline (0.7) and email to GH Berlin re same (0.1); Email counsel for Fred's Plumbing re settlement (0.1)
08/24/15	TJM	0.20	Finalize motions to continue hearings re admin claims re Lexington
08/24/15	TJM	0.20	Finalize motion to continue hearing re Rule 2004 motions
08/24/15	MAS	0.10	Exchange emails with Karla re: service of preference actions.

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

08/24/15	ALS	0.20	Docket scheduling with respect to Caisse De Depot et Placement Du Quebec et al adversary proceeding and preference actions
08/24/15	KQ	0.20	Draft and file the Certificate of Service related to the eighth consent motion to extend the objection deadline and continue hearing on Rule 2004 examinations and fourth consent motion re: Lexington Insurance admin claim
08/24/15	KQ	0.40	Assist in preparation of exhibits for the response to CP's first set of interrogatories
08/24/15	KQ	0.80	Confirm receipt of summons and complaint via Certified Mail Receipts and e-mail to M. Siedband on update as to service regarding same.
08/25/15	PM	0.10	Review numerous ECH notices re. motions to extend hearing dates and Rule 2004 exams.
08/25/15	TJM	0.10	Email counsel for Caisee re extension of time to answer complaint
08/25/15	TJM	0.30	TC w/ counsel for JPMorgan Chase re preference action (0.3)
08/25/15	TJM	0.20	TC counsel for First Union re motion to continue hearing re Admin Claim Application (0.1) Finalize motion re same (0.1)
08/26/15	MAS	1.00	Begin draft of procedures motion for settlement of preference adversary proceedings (includes research on 9019(b) application by bankruptcy courts).
08/26/15	KQ	0.40	Draft the Acceptance of Service for A. Manhart on behalf of JPMorgan Chase (preference action) and forward same to T. McKeon
08/27/15	KQ	0.40	Finalize and file the Motion to Extend Answer Deadline in the adversary matter, Keach v. BWI (GH Berlin Windward)

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

08/27/15	DSA	0.20	Reviewed e-mails concerning issues with document preservation and settlement of preference claims (.2)
08/27/15	MAS	0.50	Continue drafting procedures motion re: preference adversary proceedings.
08/27/15	TJM	0.50	Review motion to extend answer deadline re Caisse de Depot (0.2); Email trustee re same (0.1); emails with opposing counsel re same (0.2)
08/27/15	TJM	0.20	Finalize motion to extend answer deadline re GH Berlin
08/28/15	TJM	0.20	Email Trustee re question of consent motion re answer deadline re Cassie de Dupot (0.1) and email opposing counsel re same (0.1)
08/28/15	KQ	0.30	Draft and file the Certificate of Service related to the motion to extend answer deadline re adversary complaint against BWE, Inc. d/b/a GH Berlin Windward
08/30/15	TJM	0.40	Draft, edit and revise consent motion to extend answer deadline re JPMorgan (0.3); Email opposing counsel re same (0.1)
08/31/15	TJM	0.10	Email counsel for Andersons re settlement agreement
08/31/15	TJM	0.10	Email counsel for GH Berlin re order grating extension of answer deadline (0.1)
08/31/15	MAS	2.80	Continue drafting settlement procedures motion for preference actions.
08/31/15	MAS	1.60	Draft exhibit (spreadsheet for procedures motion re: preference actions).
08/31/15	MAS	0.20	Review and respond to email from Modern Track Machinery (preference recipient) re: potential resolution of claims.
09/01/15	RND	0.10	Email with A. Stewart re: pretrial scheduling order for CP

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

09/01/15	RND	0.80	Call with R. Keach and T. Thornton re: CP Pretrial order
09/01/15	TJM	0.10	Email opposing counsel re payment of settlement (0.1)
09/01/15	ALS	0.20	Emails from/to R. Desai re preparation of draft pretrial scheduling order (.1); review template for pretrial scheduling order (.1)
09/02/15	DSA	0.50	Reviewed e-mails concerning issues with preference settlements (.1); conference with B. Keach concerning issues with CP claims and carve out (.2); reviewed additional e-mails concerning issues with preference settlements (.2)
09/02/15	RND	5.00	Review complaint, CP's motion to dismiss, Trustee's Objection to Motion, and CP's motion to withdraw the reference and draft Joint pre-trial statement/pre-trial order for CP
09/02/15	MAS	0.10	Email Aubrey (BSSN staff) re: MSC settlement.
09/02/15	MAS	0.10	Exchange emails with David Banker re: summit railroad settlement.
09/03/15	MAS	0.20	Review offer email from Saratoga and email Bob and Sam re: same.
09/03/15	MAS	0.20	Email preference recipient Saratoga re: offer to pay over time.
09/03/15	MAS	0.50	Draft motion to stay adversary proceeding against Helm (.4) and email to Curt Kimball (.1)
09/03/15	MAS	0.10	Email Angela and Aubrey re: W-9 for Summit railroad (preference recipient).
09/03/15	MAS	0.20	Review updated settlement with Summit Railroad and email to Aubrey for signature by Bob.
09/03/15	MAS	0.20	Exchange emails with David Banker re: Summit Railroad settlement.

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

09/03/15	MAS	0.10	Phone call to Curt Kimball re: NH Bragg (preference recipient).
09/03/15	MAS	0.10	Phone call with David Michaud re: Saratoga and North Creek (preference recipient).
09/03/15	DSA	0.40	Telephone conference with C. Kimball concerning issues with status of preference actions (.2); reviewed e-mails concerning issues with preference settlements (.2)
09/04/15	ALS	0.10	Docket scheduling deadline to file Answer to CP's Counter Claims and Cross Claim
09/04/15	ALS	0.20	Emails (x2) to R. Keach, P. McDonald and T. McKeon re CP's Answer to Second Amended Complaint
09/04/15	DSA	0.80	Reviewed e-mails concerning issues with preference settlements (.1); reviewed and made changes to motion to settlement preference actions (.6); telephone conference with M. Siedband concerning issues with procedures motion for preferences (.1)
09/04/15	KQ	0.50	Finalize and file the Motion to Extend Deadlines in the adversary proceeding involving JP Morgan
09/04/15	KQ	0.30	Finalize and file the Consented to Motion for Order Extending Deadlines in the adversary proceeding involving NH Bragg
09/04/15	KQ	0.40	Finalize and file the Motion to Stay in the adversary proceeding involving Helm Financial
09/04/15	MAS	0.30	Draft email to Trustee and Sam re: Helm stay motion and NH Bragg settlement offer.
09/04/15	MAS	0.20	Review motion to stay from NH Bragg (preference recipient) and email same to Sam Anderson with comment.
09/04/15	MAS	0.10	Email counsel to NH Bragg (preference recipient) re: settlement offer and motion to stay adversary.

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

09/04/15	MAS	0.30	Update stay motion for preference recipient Helm (.2) and email same to Karla for filing (.1)
09/04/15	MAS	0.60	Draft motion to extend answer deadline for Summit (preference recipient) and email same to opposing counsel with comment.
09/04/15	MAS	0.30	Review comments to 9019 procedures motion and email Sam Anderson re: same.
09/04/15	MAS	0.30	Update motion to extend answer deadline for NH Bragg (preference recipient) and email to Karla for filing.
09/04/15	MAS	0.20	Review updated settlement language from David Banker (re: Summit preference recipient).
09/04/15	MAS	2.20	Draft settlement/stipulated judgment with preference recipient Saratoga and email to Sam Anderson with comment.
09/04/15	MAS	0.40	Phone call with Curt Kimball, counsel to NH Bragg and Helm Financial re: settlements and continuance of answer deadline.
09/04/15	TJM	0.20	Finalize motion extending time to answer complaint re JPMorgan Chase
09/04/15	TJM	0.10	Review answer and counterclaims re CP
09/08/15	TJM	0.50	Review Counterclaims re CP
09/08/15	TJM	0.80	TC w/ counsel for New Brunswick Southern Rail and Maine Northern Rail re extension of answer deadline (0.2); Draft, edit and revise motions to extend answer deadline re Irving entities (0.5); Emails w/ opposing counsel re motions to extend answer deadline (0.1)
09/08/15	TJM	0.30	Draft, edit and revise motion to extend answer deadline re Andersons (0.2) and email opposing counsel re same (0.1)

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

09/08/15	MAS	3.50	Draft proposed order, notice of hearing, and create settlement (form) exhibit, draft revisions to motion, proof all pleadings and file.
09/08/15	MAS	0.50	Draft motion to continue deadlines in preference AP for Summit Railroad Prods and attention to filing.
09/08/15	MAS	0.40	Review settlement email from Modern Track, exchange emails with Bob and Sam, and draft response to opposing counsel.
09/08/15	MAS	0.40	Draft motion to extend deadlines for Modern Track (preference recipient).
09/08/15	MAS	0.10	Exchange emails with counsel to Saratoga (preference recipient) re: status of settlement and extension of answer deadline.
09/08/15	RND	0.10	Email with R. Keach re: CP Joint Pretrial Statement
09/08/15	RND	0.20	Revise CP Pretrial Order
09/08/15	KQ	0.60	Prepare and send service of the objection to CP's 3018 motion
09/08/15	KQ	0.40	Draft and file the Certificate of Service related to the objection to CP's 3018 motion
09/08/15	KQ	0.20	Finalize and file the motion to extend deadlines in the adversary proceeding involving New Brunswick Southern Railway
09/08/15	KQ	0.20	Finalize and file the motion to extend deadlines in the adversary proceeding involving Maine Northern Railway
09/08/15	KQ	0.20	Finalize and file the motion to extend deadlines in the adversary proceeding involving Summit Railroad Products
09/08/15	KQ	0.30	Draft and file the Certificate of Service related to the Motion to Stay in the adversary proceeding of Helm Financial

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

09/08/15	KQ	0.40	Draft and file the Certificates of Service related to the Consent Motion to Extend Time in the adversary proceedings of NH Bragg and JP Morgan Chase
09/08/15	KQ	0.60	Finalize, file and serve the Motion to Extend Answer Deadline in the adversary proceeding against The Andersons
09/08/15	KQ	0.40	Draft and file the Certificate of Service related to the Motion to Extend Answer Deadline in the adversary proceeding against The Andersons
09/08/15	DSA	1.00	Reviewed e-mails concerning issues with settlement of preference claims and procedures motion (.2); reviewed motion to appeal sanction order (.2); reviewed objection to CP 3018 motion (.1); reviewed e-mails and e-mailed parties concerning issues with escrow account for Rail World (.2); conference with M. Siedband concerning issues with preference actions and consented to judgment (.3)
09/09/15	KQ	0.10	File via ECF the Amended Notice of Hearing related to the Trustee's 9019 Procedures Motion related to preference defendants
09/09/15	KQ	0.30	Prepare and send service of Amended Notice of Hearing related to the Trustee's 9019 Procedures Motion related to preference defendants
09/09/15	KQ	0.30	Draft and file the Amended Notice of Hearing related to the Trustee's 9019 Procedures Motion related to preference defendants
09/09/15	KQ	0.20	Draft and file via ECF the Certificate of Service related to the motion to extend deadlines related to preference defendant Saratoga and North Creek Railway

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

09/09/15	KQ	0.30	Finalize and file the motion to extend deadlines related to preference defendant Saratoga and North Creek Railway
09/09/15	KQ	0.20	Draft and file the Certificate of Service related to the Consented to Motion for Order Extending Deadlines related to preference defendant Modern Track Manchinery
09/09/15	KQ	0.30	Finalize and file via ECF the Consented to Motion for Order Extending Deadlines related to preference defendant Modern Track Machinery
09/09/15	KQ	0.60	Draft and file via ECF the Certificate of Service related to the Trustee's 9019 Procedures Motion related to preference defendants
09/09/15	KQ	1.60	Prepare and send service related to the Trustee's 9019 Procedures Motion related to preference defendants
09/09/15	KQ	0.50	Finalize and file via ECF the Trustee's 9019 Procedures Motion related to preference defendants
09/09/15	LKZ	0.90	Revise outline in response to CP motion to compel (.3); begin draft objection (.6).
09/09/15	MAS	0.10	Review signed settlement agreement and internal emails re: same.
09/09/15	MAS	0.20	Review W-9 form for preference settling parties (exchange emails and review form).
09/09/15	MAS	0.50	Draft motion to extend deadlines for Saratoga (re: preference AP) along with proposed order and attention to filing.
09/09/15	MAS	0.60	Draft updates to settlement with Saratoga and exchange emails with opposing counsel re: same (preference recipient).

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

09/09/15	MAS	0.10	Email opposing counsel to MSC (preference recipient) with signed copy of settlement agreement.
09/09/15	PM	0.10	ECF Notices re. Scheduling Order and other matters.
09/09/15	PM	2.10	Review Law Court briefs and email communications with Dan Murphy re. same.
09/09/15	TJM	0.20	TC w/ counsel for Union Tank re objection to CP motion to compel (0.1) and email Trustee re same (0.1)
09/10/15	TJM	0.10	TC w/ counsel for JP Morgan re preference action
09/10/15	TJM	0.10	Review NBSR objection to Plan confirmation
09/10/15	TJM	0.50	Draft, edit, revise and research re answer to CP counterclaims
09/10/15	PM	0.10	Review CP Notice of Appeal re. Canadian decision.
09/10/15	LKZ	6.60	Revise outline for objection to CP motion to compel (.6); research re: same (.9); further draft objection (4.7); call w/counsel to Settling defendant re: objection (.2); emails w/B.Keach (.2) re: same.
09/10/15	KQ	0.80	Draft and file the Certificates of Service related to the motions to extend deadlines for preference actions against Maine Northern Railway, Summit Railroad and New Brunswick Southern Rail
09/10/15	KQ	0.20	File via ECF the Acceptance of Service for A. Manhart on behalf of preference defendant JPMorgan Chase
09/10/15	DSA	0.10	Reviewed e-mails and orders relating to preference cases (.1)

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

09/11/15	LKZ	0.90	Revise objection to CP's Motion to Compel (.6); emails w/counsel to Settling Defendants re: same (.1); confer w/ (.1) and emails w/ (.1) B.Keach re: same.
09/11/15	PM	1.20	Review CP objection to Chapter 11 plan.
09/11/15	TJM	0.60	Draft, edit and revise settlement agreements re GH Berlin (0.3); Fred's Plumbing, (0.2) and Andersons (0.1) re preference actions
09/12/15	DSA	0.10	Reviewed e-mails and orders relating to preference actions (.1)
09/12/15	ALS	1.00	Preparation of deadline/hearing summary chart re preference cases (.1); review dockets for deadlines in preference cases (.3); docket scheduling for preference cases (.6)
09/14/15	ALS	0.00	Email to T. McKeon and M. Siedband re chart of upcoming hearings and deadlines in preference cases
09/14/15	LKZ	2.00	Revise objection to CP motion to compel (1.6); confer w/B.Keach re: same (.1); emails w/K.Quirk re: filing and service of same (.1); review Canada's (.1) and certain Settling Defendants' (.1) joinders to objection.
09/14/15	TJM	2.00	Research re 1109 re appellate standing (1.2); Draft, edit and revise motion to dismiss re CP chapter 15 appeal (0.8)
09/14/15	TJM	2.30	Prepare discovery requests re CPR
09/14/15	TJM	0.20	Confer with R Desai re status hearing re Wheeling surcharge motion (0.1); Email counsel for Wheeling re continuing hearing on surcharge motion (0.1)
09/14/15	PM	0.10	Email communications from Bob Keach re. issues raised by CP Counterclaim.
09/14/15	MAS	0.10	Review preference adversary proceeding deadlines and email Angela re: same.

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

09/15/15	PM	0.40	Review CP Answer, Counterclaim and Crossclaim.
09/15/15	TJM	4.80	Draft, edit and revise motion to dismiss re CP chapter 15 appeal
09/15/15	DSA	0.20	Reviewed Committee stipulation (.1); reviewed response of defendants to CP motion to compel (.1)
09/16/15	DSA	0.30	Telephone conference with F. Caruso concerning issues with Wheeling obligations (.1); reviewed e-mails and e-mailed parties concerning issues with Wheeling document request (.2)
09/16/15	ALS	0.20	Email to M. Paione at U.S. Bankruptcy Court re upcoming hearings in Wheeling adversary case (.1); office conference with T. McKeon re upcoming hearings in Wheeling adversary case (.1)
09/16/15	TJM	0.40	Draft, edit and revise motion to continue status hearing re Wheeling adversary proceeding
09/17/15	TJM	6.30	Draft, edit and revise motion for court to approve and authorize stipulation re production of settlement agreements to the Committee (2.8); Draft, edit and revise motion for expedited hearing re same (1.2); Draft, edit and revise NOH re same (0.2); Finalize motion papers and stipulation for filing (2.1)
09/17/15	TJM	3.10	Draft, edit and revise motion to dismiss CP appeal re chapter 15 order recognizing Sanction Order
09/18/15	TJM	1.00	Finalize settlement agreements re Fred's Plumbing (0.2), Andersons (0.3), and GH Berlin (0.3) and email counsel re same (0.2)
09/18/15	PM	0.70	Review materials filed in support of amended plan of liquidation.

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

09/18/15	ALS	0.20	Email to M. Paione re agreed request to continue status conference on surcharge motion (.1); office conference with T. McKeon re continuance of status conference on surcharge motion (.1)
09/18/15	ALS	0.10	Update docket scheduling re status conference on surcharge motion
09/19/15	DSA	0.30	Reviewed motion to dismiss adversary for 2011 transaction filed by various defendants (.3)
09/21/15	DSA	0.30	Reviewed motion to dismiss 2011 transaction complaint filed by Davis (.2); reviewed e-mails and e-mailed parties concerning issues with waiver of claims for preference defendants (.1)
09/21/15	TJM	0.20	Email counsel for JPMorgan Chase re settlement negotiations
09/21/15	TJM	0.40	Review emails from counsel for Fred's Plumbing re settlement agreement (0.1); Review settlement agreement re Fred's Plumbing (0.2); Email S Anderson re question re settlement agreement re comment from counsel for Fred's (0.1)
09/22/15	TJM	1.00	Review settlement agreement w/ Fred's Plumbing re question from S Andersons (0.2); Draft, edit, revise and finalize consent motion extending deadlines (0.7) and email counsel for Fred's re same (0.1)
09/22/15	PM	0.20	Review press article re. confirmation hearing and CP positions.
09/22/15	PM	0.20	Review multiple ECF Notices in Support of Plan Confirmation Motion.
09/22/15	LKZ	1.60	Review CP reply in support of motion to compel (.7); confer w/A.Cummings re: hearing notebook for same (.1); review revised GA settlement Agmt (.7) and emails w/Dentons re: same (.1).

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

09/22/15	ALS	0.30	Filing of motion to continue deadlines in Fred's Plumbing adversary proceeding (.2); preparation of certificate of service with respect to motion to continue deadlines in Fred's Plumbing adversary proceeding (.1)
09/22/15	DSA	0.30	Reviewed e-mails and e-mailed Wheeling concerning issues with surcharge motion (.2); reviewed e-mails relating to preference settlements (.1)
09/23/15	PM	0.60	Review CP Reply to Trustee's Memorandum of Law in Support of Confirmation.
09/23/15	PM	0.20	Review revised Order on Confirmation.
09/24/15	PM	0.20	Review CP Objection to Declarations in support of Plan Confirmation.
09/24/15	PM	0.10	Phone call with Tim McKeon re. answer to CO Counterclaim.
09/24/15	PM	0.30	Review Answer and Affirmative Defenses to CP Counterclaims.
09/24/15	TJM	0.30	Finalize answer to CP counterclaims
09/24/15	TJM	0.20	TC w/ counsel for CP re continuing hearing (0.1) and confer Trustee (0.1)
09/24/15	TJM	0.10	Confer with P McDonald re Keach v. World Fuel re answer to CP Counterclaims
09/24/15	LKZ	2.80	Confer w/B.Keach re: Carmack claims (.3); review memos re: same (.7); research re: same (.7); begin update of memo as per same (1.1).
09/24/15	KQ	0.40	Finalize, file and serve the Trustee's Answer to CP's Counterclaims
09/24/15	KQ	0.40	Draft and file the Certificate of Service related to the Trustee's Answer to CP Counterclaims
09/25/15	LKZ	5.90	Research re: Carmack claims (3.1), update memo re: same (2.6); confer w/B.Keach re: same (.2).

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

09/25/15	ALS	0.30	Update docket scheduling in Fred's Plumbing adversary proceeding (.2); update summary of deadlines in preference actions (.1)
09/28/15	ALS	0.10	Office conference with T. McKeon re upcoming deadlines in Caisse de Depot adversary proceeding
09/28/15	TJM	0.20	Emails w/ opposing counsel in Keach v. Cassie de Dupot re PTO
09/28/15	TJM	0.20	TC w/ A Stewart re Keach v. Casse de Dupot case status (0.1); Review email from MCM and respond re same (0.1)
09/29/15	ALS	0.10	Docket scheduling re motions to dismiss in Caisse De Depot adversary proceeding
09/30/15	LKZ	0.10	Emails w/counsel to D&Os re: GA settlement agreement.
09/30/15	TJM	0.50	Cassie de Dupot - Confer with M Seidband re case status (0.2); Confer M Seidband re case status and strategy (0.3)
09/30/15	TJM	1.10	Draft emails to admin claim claimants re continuance of hearing and extension of deadlines (0.3); Draft, edit and revise 4th consent motion to continue hearing and extend deadlines re WFS et al (0.3); Draft, edit and revise 4th consent motion to continue hearing and extend deadlines re CP (0.2); Draft, edit and revise 4th consent motion to continue hearing and extend deadlines re Lexington (0.2); Confer Trustee re same (0.1)
09/30/15	MAS	0.20	Review email from Saratoga and North Creek re: settlement and exchange emails with counsel to Saratoga.

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

10/01/15	TJM	0.60	Finalize consent motion to continue admin hearing re Lexington (0.1) and email opposing counsel re same (0.1); Finalize consent motion to continue admin hearing re WFS et al (0.4)
10/01/15	TJM	0.20	Email counsel for Flex re case status
10/01/15	ALS	0.20	Emails from/to T. McKeon re Flex Leasing adversary proceeding and upcoming deadlines
10/01/15	DSA	0.10	Reviewed e-mails relating to the status of the preference actions (.1)
10/02/15	ALS	0.20	Docket scheduling in Caisse de Depot adversary proceeding (.1); office conference with T. McKeon re upcoming deadlines in Caisse de Depot adversary proceeding (.1)
10/02/15	LKZ	0.60	Review Dentons comments to GA Settlement Agmt (.3); review side letter re: funding costs for criminal defense of D&Os (.2); draft email to B.Keach re: same (.1).
10/02/15	KQ	0.20	Service of the Court's notice to reschedule hearings on storage motion and motion to compromise with certain preference defendants
10/02/15	TJM	0.10	Email S Anderson re status of preference actions against NBSR and MNR (0.1)
10/02/15	TJM	0.50	Draft PTO re Keach v. Cassie de Dupot
10/02/15	TJM	0.40	Draft language re consolidation of contested matters in to adversary proceeding re JPO re CP
10/03/15	LKZ	0.20	Email w/B.Keach re: GA settlement agreement.
10/05/15	LKZ	0.50	Revise D&O letter Agmt re: criminal costs (.2), GA settlement agreement (.1); confer w/B.Keach re: same (.1) and emails w/Dentons re: same (.1).
10/05/15	MAS	0.10	Exchange correspondence with counsel to Summit regarding status of settlement (preference action).

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

10/05/15	MAS	0.20	Review proposed settlement from NH Bragg and exchange correspondence with counsel to NH Bragg (preference action).
10/05/15	MAS	3.00	Continue research and drafting for respond to Wheeling's motion to dismiss (UFTA complaint).
10/06/15	MAS	0.70	Review and update settlement with Summit Railroad and create redline to show changes; email same to opposing counsel with note (preference action).
10/06/15	MAS	0.30	Finalize W-9 and email to Summit, with note on settlement approval and finalization (preference action).
10/06/15	MAS	0.50	Draft motion to extend deadlines in Summit Railroad preference action.
10/06/15	MAS	2.90	Continue drafting response to Wheeling's motion to dismiss in UFTA adversary proceeding.
10/06/15	TJM	1.10	Review proposed pre-trial order re Keach v. CP (0.6) and confer Trustee re same (0.1); Edit and revise joint pretrial order (0.3) and email CP counsel re same (0.1)
10/06/15	TJM	0.10	Email opposing counsel re status of preference actions
10/06/15	TJM	0.30	Review documents from Trustee re motion to enforce re violation of release agreements
10/06/15	TJM	0.30	Confer Trustee re CP pretrial order and motion to enforce re Chapt 15
10/06/15	LKZ	0.90	Various calls w/parties to the GA settlement agreement (.2) and emails w/B.Keach re: same (.1); calls w/Dentons re: letter agreement (.1)(.3); emails w/B.Keach re: same (.2).

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

10/07/15	LKZ	4.50	Emails w/B.Keach re: status of side letter w/D&Os (.2); calls w/counsel to D&Os re:L same (.4)(.2)(.3); revise GA settlement agreement accordingly (.2); emails w/counsel to D&Os (.2) and GA (.2) re: same; draft 9019 motion re: same (1.9), FOO (.2); emails w/parties re: same (.3); revise same (.4).
10/07/15	KQ	0.50	Finalize, file and serve the Second Consented to Motion for Order Extending Deadlines in the adversary proceeding involving Summit Railroad Products
10/07/15	BBC	0.40	Research relating to CARMACK claims.
10/07/15	MAS	0.10	Email Bob, Sam, and Tim re: impending deadline for response to Wheeling's motion to dismiss and possible extension.
10/07/15	MAS	0.10	Email counsel to Wheeling re: extension of response deadlines for UFTA motion to dismiss.
10/07/15	MAS	0.10	Email Karla re: filing of motion to extend deadlines in Summit Railroad preference adversary.
10/07/15	MAS	0.20	Review check received from Saratoga and email counsel to Saratoga re: impending deadline to file answer and potential extension of answer.
10/07/15	MAS	0.10	Phone call to Wheeling's counsel re: extension of deadlines for UFTA motion to dismiss.
10/07/15	MAS	5.00	Continue drafting response to Wheeling's motion to dismiss Wheeling UFTA complaint (includes research).
10/08/15	MAS	0.20	Review revised settlement offer from NH Bragg and response regarding deadline to answer complaint and settlement authority.
10/08/15	MAS	0.40	Draft motion to extend deadlines in Wheeling UFTA complaint and attention to filing.

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

10/08/15	MAS	0.40	Draft motion to extend deadlines in Saratoga preference complaint and attention to filing.
10/08/15	MAS	0.20	Review court's order granting motion for authority to settle preference adversary proceedings.
10/08/15	MAS	0.40	Draft motion to extend deadlines in preference adversary for NH Bragg and attention to filing.
10/08/15	MAS	3.50	Continue research and drafting of response to motion to dismiss Wheeling UFTA complaint.
10/08/15	TJM	1.50	Draft, edit and revise motion to enforce Plan's third party release re Zurich
10/08/15	DSA	0.10	Reviewed e-mails concerning issues with preference settlements (.1)
10/08/15	LKZ	2.90	Revise GA 9019 motion (.2), emergency motion (.1); assemble exhibits for same (.3); finalize letter agreement w/D&Os (.3); finalize settlement agreement (.6); various calls w/parties to settlement agreement re: same (.8); attention to filing 9019 motion (.3); draft NOH (.3).
10/08/15	KQ	0.80	Finalize, file and serve the 2nd Motion to Stay Pending Plan Confirmation related to the Wheeling (adversary) UFTA complaint
10/08/15	KQ	0.60	Finalize, file and serve the 2nd Motion to Extend Deadlines related to the preference action involving Saratoga and North Creek Railway
10/09/15	LKZ	0.30	Circulate confirmation order, 9019 order for GA settlement to parties with request for signature pages.
10/09/15	ALS	0.30	Update docket scheduling re Summit Railroad Products adversary proceeding

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

10/09/15	ALS	0.30	Update docket scheduling in NH Bragg & Sons, Saratoga and North Creek and Wheeling adversary proceedings
10/09/15	TJM	2.30	Edit and revise motion to enforce re Zurich
10/09/15	MAS	0.40	Update settlement agreement for Modern Track and email same to counsel with comment and copy of settlement authority order (preference action).
10/09/15	MAS	0.10	Exchange emails with counsel to Saratoga re: extended deadlines in preference adversary proceeding.
10/09/15	MAS	3.00	Continue drafting response to Wheeling's motion to dismiss UFTA complaint, including research.
10/09/15	PM	0.10	Phone call with Tim McKeon re: plan confirmation and continued litigation with CP
10/10/15	TJM	2.80	Draft, edit and revise motion to enforce Plan re Zurich
10/12/15	TJM	1.10	Draft, edit and revise joint pretrial order re Keach v. JPMorgan
10/12/15	TJM	2.30	Draft, edit and revise motion to enforce re Plan re Zurich
10/12/15	DSA	0.10	Reviewed e-mails relating to confirmation and preference actions (.1)
10/13/15	KQ	0.20	Finalize and file the Joint Pretrial Statement/Pretrial Order related to the preference action involving JPMorgan Chase
10/13/15	KQ	0.20	Draft and file the Certificate of Service related to the 2nd Motion to Extend Deadlines in the preference action related to the Saratoga and North Creek Railway
10/13/15	KQ	0.20	Draft and file the Certificate of Service related to the 2nd Motion to Extend Deadlines in the preference action related to NH Bragg & Sons

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

10/13/15	DSA	0.30	Reviewed e-mails relating to preference settlements (.1); reviewed pretrial for Chase and e-mails relating thereto (.2)
10/13/15	TJM	0.40	Email to counsel for JPMorgan re Pretrial Order (0.1) and confer w/ Trustee re Pretrial Order (0.1) and TC w/ counsel for JPMorgan (0.1); Finalize pretrial order (0.1)
10/13/15	TJM	3.00	Draft, edit, revise and finalize FOO re motion to enforce (0.5); Edit, revise and finalize motion to enforce re Zurich re comments from Trustee (2.3) and confer Trustee re same (0.2);
10/13/15	TJM	0.10	TC w/ counsel for NMSR and MNR re preference actions
10/13/15	MAS	0.10	Review and respond to email from Summit Railroad re: settlement and tax forms.
10/13/15	MAS	6.00	Continue drafting response to Wheeling's MTD in UFTA litigation.
10/14/15	MAS	7.10	Complete drafting first draft of response to Wheeling's MTD UFTA complaint and email to Bob with comment.
10/14/15	MAS	0.20	Confer with Bob Keach re: complaint to determine Wheeling's lien rights.
10/14/15	MAS	0.30	Review amended complaint in 13-1033 in preparation for possible motion for summary judgment on extent of Wheeling's security interest.
10/14/15	TJM	1.50	Draft, edit and revise motion to extend deadlines re adversary proceeding pending settlement re Andersons (0.9); same re Fred's Plumbing (0.3); same re GH Berlin (0.3)

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

10/14/15	TJM	0.50	Confer Trustee re pretrial order re CP (0.1); TC w/ local counsel for CP re pretrial order (0.1); Finalize pretrial order for filing (0.2); Confer w/ K Quirk re status of hearing re objection to CP proof of claim (0.1)
10/14/15	TJM	0.80	Draft, edit and revise joint pretrial statements re MNR (0.1) and NBSR (0.2) and email counsel re same (0.1); TC w/ counsel for MNR and NBSR re pretrial order (0.1); Finalize JPOs for filing (0.3)
10/14/15	TJM	0.40	Draft, edit and revise notice of dismissal re Rule 41(a)(1)(A) re Flex Leasing (0.3) and email Trustee re same (0.1)
10/14/15	KQ	0.20	Finalize and file the Joint Pretrial Statement in the adversary proceeding involving New Brunswick Southern Railway
10/14/15	KQ	0.40	Draft Amended Notice of Hearing related the trustee's motion to enter into an agreement with Earl W. Noyes
10/14/15	KQ	0.30	Finalize and file the Trustee's request for entry of Confirmation Order by the District Court and telephone call with the district court regarding same.
10/14/15	KQ	0.30	File via ECF the Joint Pretrial Statement / Pretrial Order in MMA and in Keach v. World Fuel
10/15/15	KQ	0.30	Finalize and file the pretrial order in the adversary proceeding involving Maine Northern Railway
10/15/15	TJM	0.40	Finalize motion to extend deadlines re GH Berlin for filing (0.1); Finalize motion to extend deadlines re Fred's Plumbing (0.1); Email counsel for Andersons re motion to extend deadlines (0.1); Finalize motion to extend deadlines re Andersons (0.1)

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

10/15/15	TJM	0.40	TC w/ F Carusu re preference actions re Irving Railroads (0.4)
10/15/15	MAS	5.50	Review all relevant pleadings, including 13-1033 complaint, motion to intervene in World Fuel litigation, response, and reply, and initial review of documents relevant to motion to intervene, in preparation for motion for summary judgment on Wheeling's security interest.
10/16/15	MAS	0.10	Exchange emails with Jay Geller re: Keach v. Caisse adversary proceeding.
10/16/15	MAS	5.50	Begin drafting motion for summary judgment re: Wheeling security interest (includes research).
10/16/15	MAS	0.50	Confer with Bob Keach re: motion for summary judgment re: Wheeling's security interest in settlement proceeds.
10/18/15	MAS	6.00	Continue drafting motion for summary judgment re: Wheeling security interest (includes research).
10/19/15	MAS	0.60	Phone call with Jay Geller re: MMA adversary proceedings, scheduling, etc.
10/19/15	MAS	0.40	Draft status email to Bob Keach and Tim McKeon re: Keach v. Caisse and Wheeling MSJ.
10/19/15	MAS	0.40	Exchange numerous emails with opposing counsel in Keach v. Caisse.
10/19/15	MAS	0.80	Create inventory of documents to provide to Wheeling re: Keach v. Caisse.
10/19/15	MAS	0.10	Draft email to counsel to Wheeling re: documents to provide.
10/19/15	MAS	5.00	Continue drafting motion for summary judgment re: Wheeling claims, including statement of facts and memorandum of law (includes research).

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

10/19/15	MAS	0.30	Confer with trustee and Tim McKeon re: Wheeling claims, Caisse AP and other adversary proceedings.
10/19/15	TJM	1.60	Prepare for pretrial conferences re preferences and adversary proceedings (1.2) and confer Trustee re same (0.4)
10/19/15	TJM	0.50	Confer w/ Trustee re motion to transfer CP case from Texas to Maine (0.4); Confer Trustee re pre-trial conference re Wheeling v. Keach (0.1)
10/19/15	LKZ	0.40	Confer w/B.Keach re: motion to transfer civil actions.
10/20/15	LKZ	1.80	Draft motion to transfer venue (.8), research re: same (.8), emails w/B,Keach re: same (.1)x2.
10/20/15	ALS	0.10	Email to L. Zahradka re Texas derailment litigation
10/20/15	TJM	0.70	Participate in court call with Maine District Court re motion to hold CP in contempt (0.6) and email the Trustee updates re same (0.1)
10/20/15	TJM	0.50	Confer M Seidband re motion to dismiss re Wheeling v Keach and case strategy (0.5)
10/20/15	TJM	2.30	Prepare for court (0.5) and attend re same re pretrial hearings (1.8)
10/20/15	MAS	0.50	Confer with Tim McKeon re: motion to dismiss and case strategy (motion for summary judgment).
10/20/15	MAS	0.10	Exchange emails with Tim McKeon re: logistics of litigation/scheduling.
10/20/15	MAS	7.50	Continue drafting motion for summary judgment re: Wheeling claims, including statement of facts and memorandum of law (includes research).

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

10/21/15	MAS	0.20	Review email from Modern Track, review settlement agreement, and email Sam re: issue of release (preference litigation).
10/21/15	MAS	0.10	Exchange emails with Andrew Helman and Karla Quirk re: documents to provide for Keach v. Caisse.
10/21/15	MAS	6.50	Continue drafting motion for summary judgment re: Wheeling claims, including statement of facts and memorandum of law (includes research).
10/21/15	PM	0.20	Review Pretrial Scheduling Order.
10/21/15	TJM	2.40	Research re Keach v. JPMorgan re potential conflict (1.7); Confer A Stewart re same (0.1); Confer B Colwell re same (0.1); Email Trustee re same (0.1); TC w/ M Klass re same (0.2); TC w/ D Solely re same (0.1); TC w/ G Israel re same (0.1)
10/21/15	TJM	0.10	TC w/ counsel for Wheeling re status conference
10/21/15	ALS	0.40	Review Court dockets from Texas derailment litigation cases (.3); email to L. Zahradka re Texas derailment litigation cases (.1)
10/21/15	LKZ	1.50	Revise motion to transfer venue (.5) and confer w/B.Keach re: same (.5); confer w/B.Keach re: other litigation matters (.5).
10/22/15	LKZ	5.10	Revise motion to transfer venue (3.5); research re: same (1.0); confer w/B.Keach re: same (.1); draft FOO for same (.3); emails w/K.Quirk re: NOH for same (.1); emails w/B.Keach re: same (.1).
10/22/15	TJM	0.30	TC w/ counsel for CP re briefing schedule re right to jury trial (0.2) and confer Trustee re same (0.1)

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

10/22/15	TJM	2.00	Draft, edit and revise scheduling order re Wheeling re summary judgment (0.6); Confer M Seidband re case status (0.4); Draft, edit and revise amended pretrial order re discovery deadlines (0.8) and email Trustee re same (0.1) and email G Marcus re same (0.1)
10/22/15	TJM	0.20	Revise briefing scheduling order re CP motion for jury trial (0.1) and email counsel for CP re same (0.1)
10/22/15	MAS	0.10	Email counsel to Modern Track re: settlement agreement.
10/22/15	MAS	4.50	Continue drafting motion for summary judgment re: Wheeling claims, including statement of facts and memorandum of law (includes research).
10/23/15	MAS	0.20	Review proposed scheduling orders from Tim McKeon and provide comments.
10/23/15	MAS	3.50	Complete initial drafting of motion for summary judgment re: Wheeling claims, including statement of facts and memorandum of law (includes research).
10/23/15	MAS	0.20	Confer with Bob Keach re: motions to dismiss and motion for summary judgment.
10/23/15	MAS	0.50	Retrieve and review additional documents to provide Wheeling in Keach v. Caisse.
10/23/15	MAS	0.10	Email A Stewart re: Summation.
10/23/15	TJM	0.20	Email counsel for Wheeling re amended pretrial order re Wheeling v. Keach (0.1); Review email from opposing counsel and respond re same (0.1)
10/23/15	TJM	0.50	Keach v. Cassie - draft, edit and finalize proposed order extending deadlines (0.5)
10/23/15	TJM	0.70	Keach v. Wheeling - draft, edit and finalize proposed order extending deadlines

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

10/23/15	TJM	0.90	Edit and revise proposed briefing schedule re CP right to jury trial (0.6); Emails w/ counsel for CP re same (0.3)
10/23/15	LKZ	2.40	Revise motion to transfer venue (1.3), FOO (.2); confer w/B.Keach re: same (.2); email w/J.Sternklar re: same (.1); confer w/A.Stewart re: filing same (.2); draft letter to Bankruptcy Court Clerk re: 157(b)(5) motion (.4).
10/23/15	KQ	0.20	Finalize and file the proposed order granting request to extend deadlines in the Keach v. Caisse De Depot adversary proceeding
10/23/15	KQ	0.20	Finalize and file the proposed order granting request to extend deadlines and continue hearing in the Keach v. Wheeling adversary proceeding
10/23/15	KQ	0.10	File via ECF the proposed briefing schedule setting deadlines and a hearing date on CP's motion for a jury trial
10/23/15	ALS	0.30	Compile documents relating to 2011 transaction complaint for M. Siedband
10/24/15	MAS	4.50	Review Frank Turner's motion to dismiss 2011 transaction complaint, compile notes, and conduct preliminary research in preparation for objection to MTD.
10/26/15	TJM	0.20	Review edits/revisions to fourth amended pretrial statement from counsel for Wheeling (0.1) and email Trustee re same (0.1)
10/26/15	LKZ	0.40	Review J.Sternklar comments to motion to transfer (.2); confer w/B.Keach re: same (.2).

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

10/27/15	LKZ	0.50	Emails w/B.Keach re: motion to transfer (.1); revise motion to transfer accordingly (.1); review filing version of same (.1); emails w/B.Keach, T.McKeon re: 2004 deadlines (.1) and call w/counsel to settling defendant re: same (.1).
10/27/15	KQ	0.20	Office conference with M. Siedband regarding document production to Marcus Clegg related to the 2011 complaint (Casse de Depot, et al), and follow up e-mail to Andrew Helman regarding same.
10/27/15	KQ	0.10	Finalize and file the proposed fourth amended joint pretrial order in Wheeling v. Keach
10/27/15	TJM	1.40	TC w/ counsel for Wheeling re Pretrial Order (0.2) and confer M Seidband re same (0.3) and email Trustee re same (0.2); Confer w/ Trustee re pretrial order (0.2); Revise pretrial order re no consent (0.5)
10/27/15	MAS	0.50	Exchange emails with Andrew Helman and compile documents for informal production to Wheeling (re: UFTA complaint).
10/27/15	MAS	0.50	Review CP tariff documents for possible inclusion with motion for summary judgment as to Wheeling's security interest.
10/27/15	MAS	2.50	Review additional caselaw and draft updates to motion for summary judgment (memo and SUMF) re: Wheeling's security interest.
10/27/15	MAS	0.10	Exchange emails with counsel to NH Bragg (preference recipient) re: settlement.
10/27/15	MAS	1.10	Review RJK updates to motion for summary judgment and begin drafting revisions.
10/28/15	MAS	2.80	Draft updates to memo for motion for summary judgment (re: Wheeling security interest) and email same to RJK with comment.

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

10/28/15	MAS	0.80	Draft updates to SUMF for motion for summary judgment (re: Wheeling security interest), including retrieval of documents re: personal injury actions.
10/28/15	MAS	1.50	Revise SUMF to include information on personal injury actions (Quebec class action and Cook County matters) and draft stand-alone motion for summary judgment (re: Wheeling security interest).
10/28/15	TJM	0.50	Keach v. JPMorgan - Draft, edit and revise initial disclosures
10/28/15	TJM	0.20	Respond to email from M Seidband re question re Wheeling v. Keach (0.2)
10/28/15	KQ	0.80	Finalize, file and serve the Trustee's motion to transfer the Texas cases
10/28/15	KQ	0.40	Draft and file the Certificate of Service related to the Trustee's motion to transfer the Texas cases
10/28/15	ALS	0.30	Email to M. Siedband attaching Fourth Amended Class Action Complaint (.1); review email from M. Siedband re documents needed for motion for summary judgment filing (.2)
10/29/15	ALS	0.30	Emails from/to M. Siedband re preparation for filing motion for summary judgment and exhibits referenced in affidavit
10/29/15	ALS	3.00	Review scheduling orders to determine upcoming case deadlines (1.6); begin docket scheduling re scheduling orders entered in preference actions (1.4)
10/29/15	MAS	2.50	Draft updates to motion, SUMF, and memo for motion for summary judgment (re: Wheeling's security interest) and email same to paralegals for preparation.

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

10/29/15	MAS	0.60	Draft supporting RJK affidavit for motion for summary judgment re: Wheeling security interest.
10/29/15	MAS	0.30	Draft updates to settlement agreement with Modern Track and exchange emails with opposing counsel.
10/29/15	MAS	0.40	Draft settlement agreement for NH Bragg and email opposing counsel re: same.
10/30/15	MAS	6.80	Draft complete revisions to all pleadings, create proposed order, and attention to filing of motion for summary judgment re: Wheeling security interest (after hours filing).
10/30/15	ALS	4.90	Organization of exhibits to Affidavit of Robert J. Keach in Support of Motion for Summary Judgment (2.3); assist M. Siedband with preparation for filing of motion for summary judgment, memorandum of law, statement of undisputed material facts and affidavit (2.0) filing of motion for summary judgment, memorandum of law in support of motion for summary judgment, statement of undisputed material facts, proposed order and affidavit with Court (.6)

Total	10	1899.00	

12 Plan and Disclosure Statement

Date	ATTY	Hours	
10/22/14	DSA	0.10	Reviewed e-mails from M. Fagone concerning issues with plan terms (.1)
10/29/14	MAF	0.50	Review trustee's memo on third party releases and certain supporting authorities
11/07/14	WAH	1.50	Reviewing and revising MMA disclosure statement.

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

11/11/14	WAH	3.60	Drafting, reviewing, and revising MMA plan of liquidation.
11/12/14	WAH	3.10	Drafting, reviewing, and revising MMA plan of liquidation.
11/13/14	WAH	3.80	Drafting, reviewing, and revising MMA plan of liquidation.
11/14/14	WAH	4.60	Drafting, reviewing, and revising plan of liquidation.
11/17/14	WAH	8.90	Drafting, reviewing, and revising plan of liquidation.
11/18/14	WAH	7.40	Drafting, reviewing, and revising plan of liquidation.
11/19/14	WAH	7.70	Drafting, reviewing, and revising plan of liquidation.
11/20/14	WAH	6.60	Drafting, reviewing, and revising plan of liquidation.
11/21/14	WAH	5.60	Drafting, reviewing, and revising plan of liquidation (3.9); drafting motion to extend deadline for plan moratorium (1.7).
11/25/14	MAF	0.10	E-mail from and to J. Steen regarding asset allocation
11/26/14	ALS	0.70	Preparation of certificate of service relating to the Consent Motion of the Trustee to Extend the Plan Moratorium Period (.3); filing and service of the Consent Motion of the Trustee to Extend the Plan Moratorium Period (.4)
12/04/14	ALS	0.10	Email to R. Keach attaching disclosure statement and joint chapter 11 plan filed New England Compounding case
12/04/14	WAH	1.30	Reviewing recently filed mass tort plan of reorganization and disclosure statement in connection with drafting plan and disclosure statement for MMA.

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

12/12/14	WAH	2.50	Meeting with B. Keach re plan and disclosure statement (.3); drafting, reviewing, and revising same (2.2).
12/14/14	WAH	4.50	Drafting, reviewing, and revising plan of liquidation and disclosure statement.
12/22/14	WAH	2.20	Meeting with M. Fagone re settlement agreements and plan (.3); reviewing same (1.89).
12/22/14	MAF	0.30	Meeting with W. Hueske regarding plan structure and settlement agreements
12/23/14	WAH	1.80	Reviewing settlement agreements in connection with drafting plan and DS.
12/24/14	WAH	2.60	Reviewing settlement agreements in connection with drafting plan and DS.
01/07/15	RND	4.30	Review and comment on CCAA Plan
01/07/15	RND	0.30	Meeting with R. Keach re: CCAA Plan and comments/edits to same
01/08/15	RND	0.10	Meeting with R. Keach re: revisions to plan settlement agreement
01/08/15	RND	0.40	Revise Plan settlement agreement to incorporate RJK changes
01/09/15	RND	5.30	Review and revise draft Plan
01/12/15	RND	0.90	Review/revise latest version of Plan
01/14/15	ALS	0.10	Docket scheduling regarding continued plan moratorium period
01/14/15	DSA	0.40	Telephone conference with J. Fischer concerning issues with settlements in plan (.2); reviewed and made changes to landlord waiver (.2)
01/16/15	MAF	0.50	Call with Canadians and King & Spalding (Marathon counsel) regarding comments on draft CCAA plan
01/16/15	MAF	0.50	Call with King & Spalding regarding CCAA plan
01/19/15	DSA	0.60	Began reviewing draft plan of reorganization (.6)

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

01/20/15	MAS	0.90	Draft revisions to 2011 transaction complaint and email to Will Hueske for background content for disclosure statement.
01/20/15	RND	0.10	Email R. Keach re: draft settlement agreements in connection with Plan
01/20/15	WAH	2.50	Drafting, reviewing, and revising disclosure statement.
01/21/15	WAH	2.20	Drafting, reviewing, and revising disclosure statement.
01/22/15	WAH	4.80	Drafting, reviewing, and revising disclosure statement.
01/23/15	WAH	6.80	Drafting, reviewing, and revising disclosure statement.
02/19/15	WAH	7.10	Drafting, reviewing, and revising disclosure statement motion, special disclosure statement, and chapter 15 documents.
02/20/15	WAH	6.60	Drafting, reviewing, and revising disclosure statement motion, special disclosure statement, chapter 15 petition, and related documents.
02/23/15	WAH	3.80	Drafting, reviewing, and revising disclosure statement motion and solicitation procedures (3.8)
02/23/15	TJM	0.20	Review email from Trustee re inclusion of judgment reduction provision in Plan (.1) and confer Trustee re same (.1)
02/23/15	TJM	1.90	Research re Illinois Joint Tortfeasor Contribution Action and confer Trustee re same
02/24/15	WAH	6.60	Researching Code and contractual impairment (1.9); drafting, reviewing, and revising disclosure statement motion and solicitation procedures (4.7).

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

02/25/15	WAH	7.30	Drafting, reviewing, and revising disclosure statement motion and solicitation materials (5.1); researching Code and contractual impairment (2.2).
02/26/15	WAH	8.50	Drafting, reviewing, and revising disclosure statement motion and solicitation materials (3.4); special disclosure statement (2.8); researching Code and contractual impairment (2.3).
02/27/15	WAH	8.50	Drafting, reviewing, and revising disclosure statement motion and solicitation documents (3.4), WD Trust (1.2), special disclosure statement for WD claimants (2.1), and researching Code and contractual impairment (1.8).
02/28/15	WAH	5.90	Drafting, reviewing, and revising special disclosure statement for WD claimants, and WD Trust agreement.
03/02/15	WAH	0.80	Drafting, reviewing, and revising "special" disclosure statement.
03/02/15	WAH	2.50	Researching, drafting, reviewing, and revising memo re plan, Code, and contractual impairment of claims.
03/02/15	WAH	2.60	Drafting, reviewing, and revising WD Trust agreement.
03/02/15	ALS	0.10	Office conference with R. Keach regarding Plan Support and Settlement Agreement
03/03/15	WAH	2.10	Researching, drafting, reviewing, and revising memo re impairment via Code, plan, or agreement.
03/03/15	WAH	4.30	Drafting, reviewing, and revising WD Trust agreement.
03/03/15	RND	0.10	Meeting with R. Keach re: review/revising plan support agreements
03/03/15	RND	3.00	Review and revise plan settlement agreement

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

03/04/15	WAH	2.40	Researching, drafting, reviewing, and revising memorandum on various forms of impairment under the Bankruptcy Code.
03/04/15	WAH	4.80	Drafting, reviewing, and revising WD Trust agreement.
03/05/15	WAH	2.70	Drafting, reviewing, and revising WD Trust Agreement and corresponding with B. Keach re same.
03/11/15	WAH	1.70	Drafting, reviewing, and revising chapter 15 petition and related documents.
03/18/15	DSA	0.20	Reviewed e-mails concerning issues with changes to plan and CIT settlement (.1); reviewed e-mails relating to motion concerning settling defendants (.1)
03/23/15	DSA	0.30	Conference with B. Keach and M. Fagone concerning issues with plan and disclosure statement and status of issues in case (.3)
03/24/15	WAH	12.10	Drafting, reviewing, and revising disclosure statement for plan of liquidation and CCAA plan.
03/25/15	WAH	11.70	Drafting, reviewing, and revising disclosure statement for plan of liquidation and CCAA plan.
03/30/15	WAH	5.20	Drafting, reviewing, and revising disclosure statement and plan of liquidation, corresponding with B. Keach re same.
03/30/15	RND	2.30	Draft Proposed D.S. Approval Order
03/30/15	ALS	0.30	Email to R. Desai attaching samples of proposed order re disclosure statement (.2); office conference with R. Desai re draft of proposed order re disclosure statement (.1)

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

03/30/15	ALS	0.20	Telephone call to L. Stocker at U.S. Bankruptcy Court regarding upcoming hearing dates (.1); email to R. Keach and W. Hueske re potential disclosure statement hearing dates (.1)
03/30/15	ALS	0.10	Emails from/to R. Keach re filing of plan and disclosure statement
03/31/15	ALS	0.10	Office conference with W. Hueske re filing of plan and disclosure statement
03/31/15	ALS	6.80	Revisions to and filing of plan and disclosure statement
03/31/15	MAF	1.40	Review and revise disclosure statement; e-mail to R. Keach regarding same
03/31/15	DSA	0.20	Reviewed e-mails concerning issues with changes to disclosure statement (.2)
03/31/15	RND	7.60	Review and revise MMA Plan
03/31/15	RND	0.10	Email with A. Stewart and W. Hueske re: proposed Disclosure Statement Approval Order
03/31/15	WAH	12.80	Drafting, reviewing, and revising disclosure statement and plan of liquidation, preparing same for filing, corresponding with B. Keach re same, and preparing exhibits to same.
04/01/15	WAH	3.40	Drafting, reviewing, and revising motion to file settlement agreements under seal.
04/01/15	DSA	0.10	Reviewed e-mails concerning the filing of the plan and disclosure statement (.1)
04/01/15	ALS	1.60	Preparation for filing and service of Notice of Disclosure Statement Hearing
04/01/15	ALS	0.10	Docket scheduling relating to Disclosure Statement hearing and objection deadline
04/02/15	ALS	0.10	Emails to/from K. Ford at U.S. Bankruptcy Court re service of Notice of Disclosure Statement Hearing
04/02/15	ALS	0.60	Service of Notice of Hearing re Disclosure Statement

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

04/02/15	WAH	2.30	Drafting, reviewing, and revising motion to file settlement agreements under seal.
04/03/15	ALS	0.70	Preparation of certificate of service relating to Notice of Hearing on Disclosure Statement (.4); office conference with W. Hueske re same (.1); transmit Notice of Hearing on Disclosure Statement upon email distribution list (.2)
04/03/15	DSA	0.30	Reviewed e-mails and e-mailed parties concerning issues with plan injunction and enforcement (.3)
04/07/15	WAH	2.60	Drafting, reviewing, and revising motion for solicitation procedures and related documents.
04/07/15	WAH	1.80	Drafting, reviewing, and revising motion to file settlement agreements under seal.
04/07/15	RND	0.10	Email with R. Keach re: amendments to plan
04/08/15	WAH	4.40	Drafting, reviewing, and revising motion for solicitation procedures and related documents.
04/13/15	ALS	0.60	Office conference with R. Keach re Judge Cary's availability for disclosure statement hearing (.1); emails to/from M. Paione at U.S. Bankruptcy Court re Judge Cary's availability for disclosure statement hearing (.2); emails to R. Keach re new date for disclosure statement hearing (.1); review calendar of upcoming hearings (.2)
04/14/15	ALS	0.10	Reply email to R. Keach re continued hearing on disclosure statement
04/14/15	ALS	0.30	Office conference with R. Keach and K. Quirk re publication of disclosure statement notice
04/14/15	KQ	0.30	Re-send Notice of Hearing related to the disclosure statement to parties where original notice was returned by post office for invalid addresses.

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

04/14/15	KQ	0.30	Office conference with B. Keach and A. Stewart tasks going forward and need for the notice of the plan in certain newspapers
04/15/15	KQ	0.60	E-mails to 5 print journals regarding quote for printing the Notice of Filing of the Plan
04/15/15	KQ	0.30	Multiple e-mails to and from various newspapers regarding publication of Notice of Filing of the Plan
04/15/15	LKZ	3.60	Review disclosure statement and Third Party Release Memo
04/15/15	ALS	0.10	Reply email to M. Paione re filing and serving a new hearing notice re disclosure statement
04/15/15	WAH	3.10	Drafting, reviewing, and revising notice of DS order, solicitation procedures motion, and related documents.
04/15/15	WAH	0.80	Attend (partial) conference call with S. Anderson, F. Caruso, M. Farnsworth re liquidation analysis.
04/16/15	WAH	2.20	Drafting, reviewing, and revising notice of DS order, motion for solicitation procedures, and related documents.
04/16/15	ALS	0.40	Emails from/to R. Keach re filing and service of Amended Notice of Hearing re Disclosure Statement (.1); office conference with W. Hueske re filing of Amended Notice of Hearing re Disclosure Statement with Court (.1); filing of Amended Notice of Hearing with Court (.2)
04/16/15	ALS	0.10	Docket scheduling relating to hearing and objection deadline with respect to Disclosure Statement
04/16/15	ALS	0.30	Review publications used for Bar Date Notice (.2); email to R. Keach re publication of disclosure statement notice (.1)

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

04/16/15	LKZ	0.60	Review Third Party Release Memo
04/16/15	KQ	0.10	Re-serve to updated address the Notice of Hearing regarding Disclosure Statement to Dakota Petroleum Transport Solutions LLC
04/16/15	KQ	0.40	Review service of Bar Date Motion in preparation for service of the Amended Notice of Hearing on the Disclosure Statement
04/16/15	KQ	0.10	E-mail from and to Bangor Daily News regarding publication of Notice of Plan.
04/16/15	KQ	0.10	E-mail to Bangor Daily News regarding publication of Notice of Plan
04/17/15	KQ	4.30	Prepare and send service related to the Amended Notice of Hearing on the Disclosure Statement
04/17/15	ALS	2.80	Service of Amended Notice of Hearing with respect to the Disclosure Statement upon creditor matrix and email distribution list
04/17/15	WAH	4.80	Drafting, reviewing, and revising notice of DS order, motion for solicitation procedures, and related documents.
04/20/15	WAH	1.80	Drafting, reviewing, and revising solicitation procedures motion and related documents.
04/20/15	ALS	0.20	Email to M. Troy and R. Keach re Plan and Disclosure Statement (.1); office conference with R. Keach re M. Troy's request for Plan and Disclosure Statement (.1)
04/20/15	ALS	0.40	Draft certificate of service re amended notice of hearing re disclosure statement (.3); filing certificate of service with Court (.1)
04/20/15	ALS	0.10	Emails from/to W. Hueske re publication of disclosure statement hearing notice

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

04/20/15	LKZ	6.50	Confer w/ B. Keach re: confirmation brief (.4); research re: same (1.5); review recent decision re: due process to claimholders i/c/w same (3.6); begin draft brief (1.2).
04/21/15	DSA	1.00	Reviewed objection to disclosure statement (.2); reviewed e-mails concerning issues with objections to plan and disclosure statement (.1); telephone conference with F. Caruso concerning issues with liquidation analysis (.7)
04/21/15	KQ	0.10	E-mail to Wall Street Journal regarding quote for publicizing the Notice of the Filing of the Plan
04/21/15	KQ	0.50	Draft Notice of Hearing related to the Motion to File Settlement Agreements Under Seal
04/21/15	KQ	0.60	Finalize and file via ECF the Motion to File Settlement Agreements Under Seal
04/21/15	KQ	0.80	Draft and file via ECF the Certificate of Service related to the Motion to File Settlement Agreements Under Seal
04/21/15	KQ	0.70	Prepare and send e-mail and us mail service of the Motion to File Settlement Agreements Under Seal
04/21/15	KQ	0.10	E-mail to Andrew Addesky regarding the Notice of the Filing of the Plan to be printed in the Wall Street Journal
04/21/15	PM	0.30	Review objection to disclosure statement filed by Marie Barbara Bourgoïn.
04/22/15	WAH	1.80	Drafting, reviewing, and revising motion for approval of solicitation procedures.
04/22/15	KQ	0.10	E-mail to B. Keach regarding price quotes for printing the Notice of the Filing of a Plan in the Wall Street Journal, Bangor Daily News and Portland Press Herald

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

04/22/15	KQ	0.10	E-mails to and from the Bangor Daily News and Wall Street Journal regarding pricing for printing the Notice of Filing of Plan
04/22/15	LKZ	2.00	Review local rules re: confirmation requirements, etc. (1.6); update case calendar (.4).
04/23/15	LKZ	5.50	Review draft solicitation procedures motion (.8); review local rules re: same (.5); revise motion (2.3); begin revising proposed order (.8); confer w/ B. Keach re: same (two meetings) (.4) (.7).
04/24/15	LKZ	5.80	Further revise solicitation motion (1.3); draft email to B. Keach re: same (.5); further revise Proposed Order (2.5); confer w/W.Hueske re: questions for same (.3); review local rules re: motion and order (.4); review forms for same (.8).
04/24/15	WAH	1.10	Drafting, reviewing, and revising notice of disclosure statement approval.
04/27/15	RND	0.60	Meeting with R. Keach and L. Zahradka re: MMA Plan and Disclosure statement and CP's objection to same
04/27/15	LKZ	4.70	Prep for (.2) and o/c w/B. Keach (.2) re: draft solicitation procs motion and order; review CP letter re: DS objection (.4) and confer w/B. Keach re: same (.4); review plan in connection with same (1.2); review Canadian plan re: same (1.8); confer w/B. Keach re: same (.5).
04/27/15	KQ	0.50	Draft and file via ECF the Supplemental COS related to the Notice of Hearing for the Trustee's Plan and Disclosure Statement

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

04/28/15	LKZ	1.60	Review and revise draft notice of approval of disclosure statement (.6); review forms of ballot (.4); review and begin revision of notice of DS for Derailment claims (.6).
04/28/15	ALS	0.30	Office conference with L. Zahradka regarding ballot form(.1); email to L. Zahradka attaching ballot forms (.2)
04/29/15	LKZ	4.10	Continue review of DS notice for Derailment Claims (.6); draft ballot for Derailment WD Claimants (.7), Derailment Moral Damages and Personal Injury Claimants (.5), and other Impaired Voting Claimants (.8); draft notice of non-voting status (unimpaired) (.8) and notice of non-voting status (impaired) (.4); draft email to B. Keach re: status of solicitation docs (.3).
04/30/15	LKZ	3.90	Review Exide confirmation hearing notice (.2); assemble solicitation docs package for B. Keach (.5); confer w/B. Keach re: same (.7); revise Derailment Claims Notice (1.1), certain ballots (.5), motion (.3), order (.2) as per discussion; confer w/B. Keach re: revised packet and filing timing (.4).
04/30/15	KQ	2.30	Prepare U.S. mail and e-mail service lists for parties in MMAC
05/01/15	KQ	3.40	Continued to prepare U.S. mail and e-mail service lists for parties in MMAC
05/04/15	KQ	0.30	Update the matrix via ECF regarding mail returned by the US Post Office due to non-deliverable address and re-serve the Amended Notice of Hearing
05/04/15	DSA	0.30	Reviewed liquidation analysis from F. Caruso (.3)

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

05/04/15	LKZ	2.50	Revise solicitation procedure motion (.6) and exhibits (.9); confer w/B. Keach re: same (.3), (.2), translation issues (.2), service issues (.3).
05/04/15	ALS	0.40	Telephone conference with Mary-Ellen at U.S. Bankruptcy Court re possible confirmation hearing dates (.2); emails to/from R. Keach and L. Zahradka re confirmation hearing date (.2)
05/05/15	ALS	0.60	Service of Amended Notice of Hearing re Disclosure Statement upon email and first class mail parties
05/05/15	ALS	0.20	Emails from/to Mary-Ellen re confirmation hearing date (.1); email to R. Keach re confirmation hearing (.1)
05/05/15	LKZ	2.90	Update confirmation schedule (.4); emails w/B. Keach re: same (.2); update solicitation docs for new confirmation hearing date (.9); draft email to Prime Clerk re: solicitation package (.2); confer w/B. Keach re: same (.8); confer w/R. Desai re: various Wheeling Adv. Proc (.4).
05/05/15	DSA	0.60	Began reviewing disclosure statement (.6)
05/05/15	KQ	2.60	Prepare service of the Amended Notice of Hearing related to the Disclosure Statement
05/06/15	KQ	3.70	Assist in preparation of service list for notice of confirmation hearings and related pleadings
05/06/15	KQ	0.10	Office conference with A. Stewart regarding Canadian and US service lists in preparation of mailing of solicitation packages
05/06/15	DSA	1.30	Continued reviewing disclosure statement (1.3)

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

05/07/15	ALS	0.30	Draft certificate of service with respect to the Amended Notice of Hearing re Disclosure Statement (.2); file certificate of service with respect to the Amended Notice of Hearing re Disclosure Statement with Court (.1)
05/11/15	LKZ	3.00	Revise solicitation procs motion (.6), order (.4) and exhibits (.6); confer w/A. Stewart re: same (.2), (.2); review Prime Clerk comments to DS (.3) and confer w/B. Keach (.5) and Prime Clerk (.2) re: same.
05/12/15	DSA	0.10	Reviewed e-mails and e-mailed parties concerning issues with CP objection to DS (.1)
05/14/15	RND	0.30	Call with S. Travitsky and R. Keach re: voting deadline
05/15/15	RND	0.20	Email correspondence with Monitor re: voting deadline for U.S. Plan
05/15/15	LKZ	2.30	Prep for (.4) and call w/ (1.1) Monitor, Settling Defendant counsel re: notice of various plan documents; revise solicitation procedures packet for B. Keach review (.8).
05/16/15	LKZ	0.90	Emails w/B. Keach re: Canadian counsel review of solicitation procedures motion exhibits (.4); draft email to G.Kandestin re: same (.5).
05/16/15	LKZ	0.30	Follow-up emails w/G.Kandestin re: solicitation procs motion exhibits (.2); emails w/B. Keach re: same (.1).
05/17/15	LKZ	0.30	Emails w/G.Kandestin re: updated versions of exhibits to solicitation procs. motion.
05/18/15	LKZ	2.50	Revise solicitation procs motion per B. Keach comments (.4); confer w/B. Keach re: same (.2); emails w/G.Kandestin re: French translation of exhibits (.3); review and revise exhibits to Derailment Claims Notice (.3); review notice of motion (.2); confer w/A. Stewart re: filing and

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

			service (.4); review compiled motion for filing (.4); review as-filed version (.2); revise solicitation to-do list (.1).
05/18/15	DSA	0.30	Began reviewing motion to approve the disclosure statement (.3)
05/18/15	ALS	3.30	Filing and service of Solicitation Procedures Motion
05/19/15	DSA	0.30	Completed review of motion to approve disclosure statement (.3)
05/19/15	KQ	0.50	Prepare additional service regarding the Solicitation Procedures Motion
05/19/15	LKZ	1.50	Confer w/B. Keach re: document prep in advance of DS hearing (.2); review solicitation procs motion (.3), plan (.3) re: same; draft email to B. Keach re: same (.2); review cert. of service re: solicitation procs motion (.1); review summary of New England Compounding confirmation hearing w/r/t MMA plan confirmation issues (.2); confer w/B. Keach re: same (.1); emails w/A. Stewart re: same (.1).
05/19/15	MAS	6.50	Travel to and attendance at confirmation hearing in New England Compounding Pharmacy, for analysis of court's treatment of third party release provisions in similar liquidating chapter 11 case.
05/19/15	MAS	1.00	Draft notes of hearing and analysis from confirmation hearing in New England Compounding Pharmacy (ch. 11 case similar to MMA) to Bob Keach, Roma Desai, and Lindsay Zahradka, with special emphasis on notice, due process, and 3rd party release provisions and court's treatment and concerns.

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

05/20/15	LKZ	0.70	Confer w/B. Keach re: NE Compounding Confirmation hearing (.2); confer w/G.Kandestin re: French translations of solicitation exhibits (.2) and emails re: same (.1); confer w/A. Stewart re: Trib proportionate judgment reduction issue (.1) and research re: same (.1).
05/21/15	LKZ	0.50	Confer w/B. Keach re: Trib confirmation decision, order revising bar date (.1); begin review of same (.2); confer w/A. Stewart re: confirmation version of plan (.2).
05/21/15	KQ	0.80	Draft Certificate of Service related to the Trustee's Motion to Approve Disclosure Statement
05/22/15	KQ	1.00	Prepare and send additional service of the solicitation procedures motion
05/26/15	KQ	4.80	Prepare service list related to parties who have filed claims
05/26/15	LKZ	0.20	Emails w/Kugler Kandestin re: French translations of solicitation procs docs.
05/27/15	LKZ	0.60	Review of French translations of exhibits to solicitation procs motion (.4); emails w/Canadian Counsel (.1), B. Keach re: same (.1).
05/27/15	DSA	0.40	Reviewed documents filed in connection with plan solicitation materials (.4)
05/28/15	TJM	0.10	Listen to voicemail from counsel for Shell re questions re Plan
05/29/15	KQ	0.20	Prepare and send service of solicitation package to Canadian party
06/01/15	LKZ	0.30	Review plan re: plan supplement filing deadline (.1); confer w/B.Keach re: same (.2).

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

06/02/15	LKZ	3.30	Begin revised draft of plan (1.7); emails w/R.Keach, A.Cummings re: same (.2); begin draft of plan supplement (.9); draft email to R.Keach re: same (.3); confer w/A.Stewart re; service of same (.2)
06/02/15	ALS	0.40	Office conference with L. Zahradka re filing/service of plan supplement (.2); emails from/to L. Zahradka re filing/service of plan supplement, amended disclosure statement and amended plan (.2)
06/03/15	LKZ	4.30	Proportionate judgment reduction research (2.6); revise plan supp (.6); confer w/A.Stewart (.2), B.Keach (.4) re: same; review draft solicitation agent website (.5).
06/03/15	RND	0.20	Meeting with R. Keach and R. Becker re: ability to separately classify claims based on claim being governed by foreign law
06/03/15	RND	8.70	Continue drafting structured dismissal motion
06/03/15	RB1	4.30	Research re: classification of foreign unsecured creditors.
06/04/15	RB1	1.30	Draft Memo for Bob Keach re: classification of claims
06/04/15	LKZ	6.50	Call w/Prime Clerk re: solicitation website (.2); revise WD Trust Agmt (4.1); confer w/J.Sternklar re: same (.4); confer w/B.Keach re: same (.5); further revise WD trust agmt (1.1); emails w/j.Sternklar re: same (.2).
06/05/15	LKZ	4.00	Review J.Sternklar comments to WD trust agmt (.6); emails (.4) and call (.2) w/B.Keach re: same; call w/N.Toner re: same (.2); revise accordingly (1.8); revise plan supplement (.4); emails w/Prime Clerk re: solicitation website (.2); revise plan (.2).

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

06/05/15	ALS	0.50	Filing of Plan Supplement with Court (.2); revision to exhibit to Plan Supplement (.1); emails from/to L. Zahradka re filing of Plan Supplement (.2)
06/05/15	ALS	0.40	Office conference with L. Zahradka re revision to first amended plan (.1); telephone conference with R. Desai re revision to first amended plan (.1); review plan and disclosure statement (.2)
06/05/15	RB1	6.10	Draft memo for Bob Keach re: classification of claims
06/05/15	RND	4.70	Review/revise structured dismissal motions and related orders and prepare claims schedules for same
06/06/15	LKZ	0.20	Emails w/B.Keach re: notice issues for solicitation packages.
06/08/15	LKZ	1.10	Confer w/B.Keach re: revisions to confirmation notice, derailment claims conf notice (.2); revise same for notice issues (.2); revise same for WD Trust agmt modifications (.3); revise plan per same (.3); emails w/B.Keach re: revised plan (.1).
06/08/15	DSA	0.80	Continued reviewing disclosure statement and related filings (.8)
06/08/15	RB1	4.80	Research for Bob Keach re; classification of claims.
06/09/15	RB1	1.10	Continue drafting Classification of claims memo for Bob Keach.
06/09/15	DSA	1.20	Continued reviewing the disclosure statement, plan and related filings (1.2)
06/09/15	ALS	0.20	Emails from/to L. Zahradka re amended plan filed in CCAA (.1); update pleadings with amended plan filed in CCAA (.1)
06/10/15	ALS	0.10	Office conference with T. McKeon re disclosure statement hearing

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

06/11/15	ALS	0.30	Emails from/to R. Desai re procedures for service of solicitation motion (.1); review certificate of service and emails re service of solicitation motion (.2)
06/11/15	LKZ	2.00	Draft proportionate judgment reduction provision for confirmation order (1.4); review WorldCom decision (.2), Tribune plan (.2); conference w/B.Keach re: same (.2).
06/11/15	RB1	2.00	Research re: Third Pary Releases
06/12/15	RB1	4.40	Research for Lindsay Zahradka re: settlement provisions.
06/12/15	LKZ	2.60	Review article on recent decisions regarding 3rd party releases (.2); confer w/B.Keach re: case status (.4); revise Disclosure Statement (2.0).
06/12/15	DSA	0.20	Reviewed e-mails and e-mailed parties concerning issues with disclosure of settlement agreements and service of disclosure statement (.2)
06/14/15	LKZ	2.30	Revise plan.
06/15/15	LKZ	8.00	Further revise plan (2.4); confer w/B.Keach re: same (1.1); revise plan exhibits (.8); begin conforming of DS to plan revisions (3.6).
06/15/15	DSA	0.30	Reviewed e-mails concerning issues with disclosure of confidential settlement information (.2); telephone conference with A. Stewart concerning issues with service of the disclosure statement (.1)
06/15/15	ALS	0.20	Email to S. Anderson re transmittal of plan and disclosure statement (.1); telephone conference with S. Anderson re same (.1)

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

06/15/15	ALS	0.70	Review email from L. Zahradka requesting update to litigation status for inclusion in amended plan (.1); preparation of status summary re current litigation (.4); review litigation summary included in plan (.2)
06/15/15	MAS	0.40	Draft language for disclosure statement re: UFTA complaint against Wheeling and email same to Lindsay Zahradka.
06/16/15	TJM	0.10	Review limited objection to disclosure statement filed by Irving Railroad
06/16/15	ALS	0.40	Emails from/to L. Zahradka re timing of filing amended Plan (.2); office conferences with K. Quirk and L. Zahradka re filing of amended Plan (.2)
06/16/15	ALS	1.40	Emails from/to L. Zahradka re litigation status for amended disclosure statement (.6); review status of litigation cases (.8)
06/16/15	LKZ	8.70	Review objections filed to disclosure statement (1.9); begin draft of response to same (2.1); research re: same (1.7); confer w/B.Keach re: further revised plan (.4); further revise disclosure statement (2.6).
06/17/15	LKZ	3.20	Further revise plan (.2) and emails w/B.Keach re: same (.1); further revise disclosure statement (2.9).
06/18/15	LKZ	4.20	Review constituent plan comments (1.1) and confer w/B.Keach re: same (.3); revise plan accordingly (2.5); emails w/B.Keach re: additional plan comments (.2); emails w/A.Stewart re: adjournment of DS hearing (.1).

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

06/18/15	ALS	1.00	Review emails from L. Zahradka re continuance of disclosure statement hearing (.3); draft amended notice of hearing re disclosure statement hearing (.2); email to M. Paione re continuance of disclosure statement hearing (.1); email to L. Zahradka re service on continued disclosure statement hearing (.3); email to K. Quirk re follow up on service for continuance of disclosure statement hearing (.1)
06/19/15	ALS	0.50	Emails to L. Zahradka and K. Quirk re continuance of disclosure hearing (.2); telephone conference with K. Quirk re email distribution list in light of continued hearing on disclosure statement (.1); review email distribution list for service purposes (.2)
06/19/15	LKZ	3.30	Revise notice of adjournment of DS hearing (.1.1); confer w/K.Quirk (.4), B.Keach (.2), Chambers (.1) re: same; supervise filing of same (.4); confer w/B.Keach re: same (.2); confer w/B.Keach re: case status (.9).
06/19/15	DSA	1.10	Reviewed objection to the disclosure statement filed by Irving Railroads (.2); reviewed CP objection to the disclosure statement (.5); reviewed e-mails and e-mailed parties concerning issues with preference defense (.3); telephone conference with counsel for Irving concerning issues with disclosure statement hearing and e-mailed Trustee concerning same (.1)
06/22/15	LKZ	0.50	Review emails re: plan revision status (.2); emails w/B.Keach re: status of DS objections, reply (.1); confer w/B.Keach re: revised plan (.2).

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

06/22/15	KQ	0.10	Telephone call to G. Kurr's office regarding continuation of hearing on disclosure statement
06/25/15	LKZ	5.30	Review additional plan comments from constituents (.7); confer w/B.Keach re: same (.3); further revise plan (1.2); review Tronox decision re: plan revisions (.8); further revise DS, including review of and draft summary of liquidation analysis (2.3)
06/26/15	LKZ	3.10	Review revised liquidation analysis (.5) and emails w/B.Keach re; same (.2); review revised PRJ language for confirmation order (.4); further revise plan (.8), Disclosure Statement (.9); confer w/B.Keach re: revisions to plan (.3).
06/29/15	LKZ	2.90	Revise DS objection/response chart (1.4) and confer w/S.Anderson re: same (.2); revise Derailment Claims Notice to conform to DS revisions (.4); confer w/S.Anderson re: Irving DS objection (.2) and research re: same (.7).
06/29/15	DSA	0.20	Reviewed summary of objections to disclosure statement (.2)
06/30/15	LKZ	0.10	Emails w/B.Keach re: XL settlement agreement attached to plan.
07/01/15	LKZ	2.70	Confer w/Prime Clerk re: solicitation timeline (.2); draft email to B.Keach re: same (.2); emails w/A.Stewart re: service list (.2); draft list of outstanding confirmation-related items (.3); confer w/B.Keach re: claims analysis for solicitation packages (.4); follow-up w/A.Stewart (.5) re: same; revise schedule of Released Parties (.5) and confer w/B.Keach re: same (.4).

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

07/01/15	ALS	1.20	Office conference with L. Zahradka re service of solicitation packages upon creditors and upcoming filings (.5); review claims analysis and plan documents re claims classification (.7)
07/02/15	ALS	0.10	Office conference with K. Quirk re filing of amended plan and disclosure statement
07/02/15	LKZ	1.00	Revise plan (.3) and disclosure statement (.3); confer w/B.Keach re: plan revisions (.4).
07/06/15	LKZ	9.70	Review FRA changes to DS (.3) and revise DS accordingly (.4); conform plan to DS changes (.3); emails w/B.Keach re: same (.2); further revise DS (6.1) and conform plan to same (1.7); confer w/B.Keach re: DS revisions (.3) and resolution of various DS objections (.4).
07/06/15	ALS	0.30	Office conference with L. Zahradka re liquidating plans (.1); emails from/to L. Zahradka re liquidating plans (.2)
07/06/15	TJM	1.20	Respond to emails from L. Zahradka re information re disclosure statement
07/06/15	MAS	0.30	Draft language for disclosure statement re: 2011 transaction complaint / lawsuit.
07/06/15	RND	1.30	Review email from L. Zahradka re: amended disclosure statement (.1); review Wheeling adversary pleadings and draft update on Wheeling adversary for amended disclosure statement (1.2)
07/06/15	RND	0.20	Emails with L. Zahradka re: amending Disclosure Statement
07/07/15	PM	0.40	Review ECH notices re. amended disclosure statement and amended Chapter 11 plan.
07/07/15	ALS	0.10	Review email from R. Keach re publication notice of confirmation hearing
07/07/15	ALS	3.50	Filing of First Amended Plan and First Amended Disclosure Statement

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

07/07/15	ALS	0.10	Email to R. Keach and L. Zahradka re UST's Objection to Disclosure Statement
07/07/15	LKZ	8.70	Further revise DS (2.1); emails w/B.Keach re: same (.2); emails w.A.Stewart re: filing revised DS and plan (.2); review further B.Keach DS revisions (1.1), confer w/B.Keach re: same (.4), further revise DS (1.9) and conform plan (1.4); prepare clean and redlined plan and DS for filing (.5); supervise filing of same (.4); begin revision of WD Trust Agmt to conform to plan changes (.5)./
07/07/15	DSA	0.10	Reviewed e-mails concerning issues with amendments to the disclosure statement (.1)
07/08/15	DSA	0.30	Reviewed objection to the disclosure statement filed by the UST (.3)
07/08/15	KQ	0.40	Office conference with B. Keach, L. Zahradka and A. Stewart regarding the timing related to the publication notice
07/08/15	LKZ	9.70	Prep for (.3) and meet (.4) w/B.Keach, A.Stewart, K.Quirk re: publication notice for confirmation; revise DS order (.5), exhibits (.6) for revised confirmation hearing timeline, DS revisions; draft notice of filing revised Derailment Claims Notice (.5) and supervise filing same (.4); revise WD Trust Agmt (1.1); draft notice of filing same (.5); supervise filing same (.3); review UST DS objection (.8); confer w/B.Keach re: same (.3); draft DS reply (3.7); confer w/B.Keach re: same (.3).
07/08/15	ALS	0.40	Office conference with R. Keach, L. Zahradka and K. Quirk re publication notice

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

07/08/15	ALS	0.30	Email to R. Keach and L. Zahradka re service of First Amended Plan and Disclosure Statement (.2); review email service list categories (.1)
07/08/15	ALS	0.40	Filing of revised exhibits to plan supplement (.2); emails from/to L. Zahradka re filing of revised exhibits to plan supplement (.2)
07/08/15	ALS	0.40	Filing of amended derailment claims notice (.3); emails from/to L. Zahradka re filing of derailment claims notice (.1)
07/09/15	ALS	0.30	Emails from/to L. Zahradka re NECP confirmation brief (.1); review NECP docket (.2)
07/09/15	ALS	5.40	Continue work on service lists for solicitation packages
07/09/15	LKZ	4.10	Call w/UST re: DS objection (.8); confer w/B.Keach re: same (.4); revise DS objection summary and reply chart accordingly (1.5); emails w/K.Quirk re: quotes for publication notice (.3); emails w/B.Keach (.2), K&E (.5) re: WFS DS comments, Canada DS comments (.2); emails w/A.Stewart re: service list for solicitation (.2).
07/09/15	KQ	0.10	Draft e-mail to R. Keach, L. Zahradka and A. Stewart regarding quotes received for printing of publication notice
07/09/15	KQ	0.30	File via ECF the Certificates of Service for the Amended Chapter 11 Plan, Amended Disclosure Statement, and Notice of Filing Revised Exhibits for each
07/09/15	KQ	0.40	Draft Certificates of Service for the Amended Chapter 11 Plan, Amended Disclosure Statement, and Notice of Filing Revised Exhibits for each

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

07/10/15	KQ	0.10	E-mail to B. Keach, L. Zahradka and A. Stewart regarding quote from the Bangor Daily News for the printing of the publication notice
07/10/15	ALS	3.00	Finalize service lists for transmittal to Prime Clerk (2.6); emails from/to R. Keach re update to service list (.1); emails to/from S. Travitsky re CCAA allowed late filed claims (.1); emails (x2) to L. Zahradka and K. Quirk re service lists for Prime Clerk (.2)
07/13/15	DSA	0.50	Telephone conference with counsel for Irving concerning issues with objections to the disclosure statement (.5)
07/13/15	LKZ	9.80	Revise response to DS objections (5.6) and research in connection with same (2.9); confer w/B.Keach (.4), S.Anderson (.2) re: same; call w/counsel to Irving Railroads re: DS objection (.3); confer w/K.Quirk re: deadlines for submission of notice for publication i/c/w same (.4)
07/14/15	LKZ	8.60	Further revise DS reply (4.5), chart summarizing objections (.6); review additional objections filed (.4) and summarize same (.2); revise reply accordingly (.4); emails w/B.Keach re: same (.1); revise DS for additional constituent comments (.4); conform plan accordingly (.2) ; draft email to B.Keach re: outstanding DS comments (.2); various emails w/K.Quirk (.3), B.Keach (.2) re: alternative confirmation hearing dates, publication deadlines; call w/Canadian Counsel re: French translations of various solicitation procedures docs (.3); begin prep for DS hearing (.3); emails w/Prime Clerk re: status of solicitation docs and service list (.2); call w/S.Anderson

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

07/14/15	DSA	1.20	re: status of DS objections (.3). Reviewed response of GE to various motions relating to disclosure of settlements (.1); reviewed response to same filed by Slawson and others (.2); reviewed redline of amended plan (.3); reviewed limited objection to DS filed by the committee (.3); reviewed response to DS filed Irving (.2); reviewed e-mails and orders entered in case (.1)
07/14/15	KQ	0.20	Multiple telephone calls with the court regarding scheduling possible change in date for the confirmation hearing and e-mail to L. Zahradka regarding same.
07/15/15	KQ	0.70	Finalize, file via ECF and serve the Trustee's reply in support of the Disclosure Statement
07/15/15	KQ	0.40	Draft and file via ECF the Certificate of Service related to the Trustee's reply in support of the Disclosure Statement
07/15/15	KQ	0.10	E-mails from and to L. Zahradka regarding revisions to schedule for publication notice
07/15/15	DSA	4.60	Reviewed joinder to motion to seal filed by Trinity (.1); reviewed e-mails and e-mailed parties concerning issues with 1171 claims and DS (.2); reviewed objection to motion to seal filed by the committee (.2); completed review of objection to the DS filed by Irving Railroads (.2); reviewed objection to motion to disband file by the UST (.2); travel to and from and attended DS hearing (3.8); reviewed e-mails and orders entered in case (.2)

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

07/15/15	LKZ	12.10	Prep for (.6) and meet w/B.Keach (.2) re: DS reply; further revise same (.4); finalize same for filing (.2); assemble exhibits therefor (.3); supervise filing of same (.2); further revise DS for constituent comments (1.5) and confer w/B.Keach re: same (.3); prepare and print redlines for DS hearing (.7); assemble revised exhibits for revised DS Order (1.6); prepare for (.9), travel to (.3), attend (3.5) and travel from (.3) DS hearing; further revise DS order (.4), publication notices of confirmation (.5) for revised confirmation hearing timeline; draft status email to B.Keach re: status of various solicitation docs (.2).
07/15/15	MAS	0.10	Exchange emails with Lindsay Zahradka re: revisions to DS to incorporate Wheeling's motion to dismiss UFTA litigation.
07/15/15	PM	0.10	Review omnibus response to objections to disclosure statement.
07/16/15	LKZ	4.80	Revise DS order (.2) and exhibits (.4); revise DS (.4) and Plan (.1); review filing versions of all (.4) and supervising filing of same (.4); run redlines of plan and DS for various constituents (.3); various emails w/Prime Clerk re: solicitation docs (.4); draft status email to B.Keach re: same (.2); revise publication versions of confirmation hearing notices (.4) and emails w/K.Quirk re: same (.2); call w/B.Keach re: proposed order (.2); emails w/UST re: same (.2); emails w/K.Quirk re: filing redline of same (.4); call w/K.Quirk re: same (.4); emails w/Prime Clerk re: status of solicitation docs (.2).
07/16/15	DSA	0.20	Reviewed orders and filings relating to disclosure statement and changes to same (.2)

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

07/16/15	KQ	4.80	Finalize, file and serve the Revised Amended Plan, Revised Amended Disclosure Statement, Amended Notice of Hearing, revised Proposed Order and red line of revised proposed order
07/17/15	KQ	0.20	Office conference with L. Zahradka regarding parties receiving solicitation packages
07/17/15	KQ	0.30	Determine cross-references of parties on CCAA lists to existing matrix or other notice lists
07/17/15	KQ	0.50	Revision to schedule of MMA Class Breakdown for Counsel
07/17/15	KQ	0.40	Finalize and file the Certificate of Service related to the Revised Amended Plan and Revised Amended Disclosure Statement, Proposed Order, Amended Hearing Notice (Motion to Disband) and redline version of proposed order related to the revised amended plan and disclosure statement
07/17/15	LKZ	5.50	Various emails w/Prime Clerk re: solicitation docs (.6); emails w/N.Hull re: revisions to publication notice (.2); review various service spreadsheets i/c/w Prime Clerk solicitation questions (1.2); emails w/K.Quirk re: same (.3); confer w/B.Keach re: same (.3); review bar date order for same (.2); review plan docs for distribution timing analysis (.9); draft email to S.Anderson re: same (.3); revise various solicitation docs I/c/w entry of DS order (.6); review entered version of DS order (.3) and emails w/B.Keach re: same (.2); confer w/S.Anderson re: plan distribution timing (.4).
07/17/15	BBC	0.20	Review emails from L Zahradka re: plan distribution timing.
07/18/15	LKZ	0.80	Review draft solicitation docs from Prime Clerk.

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

07/19/15	LKZ	0.80	Review emails re: status of Chapter 15 petition, motion.
07/20/15	LKZ	2.70	Update conf hrg timeline (.2); review revised solicitation docs (.6); review solicitation deadlines to confirm all calendared (.3); various emails w/VD re: status of chapter 15 docs (.6) and call w/R.Clement re: same (.2); emails w/Prime Clerk re: same (.5); confer (.1) and emails (.2) w/B.Keach re: same.
07/20/15	KQ	2.80	Final preparations and e-mails to and from NiwriMedia, Wall Street Journal, Bangor Daily News and Portland Press Herald regarding publication notice
07/20/15	KQ	0.30	Multiple e-mails from and to L. Zahradka and C. Pullo (Prime Clerk) regarding solicitation packages
07/20/15	KQ	0.60	Facilitate wire payment to the Wall Street Journal for the publication notice
07/20/15	KQ	0.30	Docket calendaring related to the disclosure hearing notice
07/20/15	KQ	0.10	E-mail to L. Comtois (Gov't of Quebec) regarding the order approving the disclosure statement
07/21/15	KQ	0.10	E-mail to Madame Comtois of the Government of Quebec verifying the correct address for mailing of the ballot
07/21/15	KQ	0.10	E-mails to and from newspapers regarding publication notice
07/21/15	KQ	0.10	E-mail from Louis Comtois, Government of Quebec, regarding solicitation package
07/21/15	LKZ	0.60	Emails w/Prime Clerk re: status of solicitation packets (.4); emails w/VD re: status of chapter 15 document supplement (.2).

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

07/22/15	LKZ	1.10	Update confirmation hearing notice, derailment claims notice for filing (.2); confer w/K.Quirk re: same (.3); emails w/Prime Clerk re: status of solicitation docs (.4); emails w/K.Quirk re: affidavit of publication for conf hrg notice (.2).
07/22/15	KQ	0.10	E-mail from and to NiwriMedia regarding proof of publication
07/22/15	KQ	0.10	E-mail from and to L. Zahradka regarding Affidavit of Publication for the publication notices
07/22/15	KQ	0.60	Follow up on publication of the confirmation hearing notice and draft Certificate of Publication
07/23/15	KQ	0.10	Telephone call with Marlene from NiwriMedia regarding tear sheets for publication notice
07/23/15	LKZ	0.50	Confer w/A.Stewart re: solicitation status, next steps (.3); emails w/Prime Clerk re: same (.2).
07/24/15	LKZ	1.30	Emails w/B.Keach re: status of solicitation docs (.3) draft email to counsel to settling defendants re: same (.5); review documents for same email (.4); confer w/K.Quirk re: file transfer (.2).
07/24/15	KQ	0.20	E-mails to and from the Portland Press Herald, Bangor Daily News and NiwriMedia regarding proofs of publication
07/24/15	KQ	0.10	E-mail from and to L. Zahradka regarding the affidavit of publication
07/27/15	KQ	0.10	Revisions to Certificate of Publication and e-mail to L. Zahradka regarding same.
07/27/15	KQ	0.80	Revisions to the Certificate of Publication

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

07/27/15	LKZ	1.40	Confer w/Prime Clerk re: affidavit of service for solicitation packets (.1); review certification of publication (.1); emails w/A.Stewart, K.Quirk re: filing same (.2); review English translation of CCAA Sanction Order (1.0).
07/28/15	LKZ	0.60	Emails w/Prime Clerk re: voting rules (.2); call w/Prime Clerk re: AoS (.1); confer w/A.Stewart re: same (.2); emails w/B.Keach re: same (.1).
07/28/15	KQ	0.10	E-mail from and to Marlene @ NiwriMedia regarding affidavits of publication for the Canadian papers
07/29/15	KQ	0.10	E-mail to F. Caruso to facilitate payment of invoice from NiwriMedia and reimbursement to IOLTA account for wire to WSJ.
07/29/15	KQ	0.10	Respond to party in US who received a ballot in French and e-mail to C. Pullo to facilitate his receiving an English version
07/29/15	KQ	0.20	Facilitate payment to NiwriMedia and reimbursement to IOLTA for WSJ
07/29/15	LKZ	0.30	Emails w/Prime Clerk re: redaction of AoS (.1); redact same (.1); emails w/K.Quirk re: filing AoSs (.1).
07/31/15	LKZ	0.70	Review solicitation affidavits of service from Prime Clerk (.3); draft email to Prime Clerk re: revisions to same (.2); confer w/K.Quirk re: same (.1); confer w/M.Siedband re: confirmation timeline, progress (.1).
08/03/15	LKZ	0.10	Review revised AoS re: solicitation docs and emails w/A.Stewart re: same.

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

08/04/15	LKZ	0.80	Confer w/A.Stewart re: filing AoSs (.1); call w/Prime Clerk re: same (.1); emails w/Verrill Dana re: same (.2); confer w/A.Cummings re: French-speaking claimant with solicitation question (.1); email w/J.Cuttler re: same (.1); call w/claimant re: same (.2).
08/06/15	LKZ	1.20	Review Irish Bank chapter 15 decision (.4); call w/K&E re: proposed revisions to WFS Released Party schedule (.2); review proposed revisions (.2); emails (.1) and confer (.2) w/B.Keach re: same; call w/K&E re: same (.1).
08/07/15	LKZ	0.20	Call w/Prime Clerk re: tabulation of votes.
08/07/15	KQ	0.30	Follow up regarding wire for payment of publication notice
08/10/15	LKZ	1.80	Emails w/B.Sleeper re: word versions of ballots (.2); emails w/Prime Clerk re: voting tabulation status (.2); analysis i/c/w rejecting ballot (.7); confer w/K.Quirk & A. Stewart re: Bourgoin PoC (.2); confer w/B.Keach re: ballot for same (.2); confer w/B.Keach re: confirmation timeline, order, brief in support (.3).
08/10/15	ALS	0.70	Office conference with R. Keach and L. Zahradka re draft declarations in support of plan (.2); obtain declarations filed in support of plan in New England Compounding Pharmacy case (.5)
08/11/15	LKZ	0.20	Review letter from subrogated insurer (.1); emails w/K.Quirk re: same (.1).
08/12/15	LKZ	1.30	Emails w/K.Quirk re: subrogated insurer ballot (.1); draft confirmation order (.9); review NECP confirmation order i/c/w same (.3).

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

08/12/15	KQ	0.10	E-mail to F. Caruso regarding invoices from the Portland Press Herald and Bangor Daily News for printing of publication notice
08/13/15	LKZ	7.20	Revise letter to claim holder re: re-sending ballot (.2); emails w/Prime Clerk (.1), B.Keach re: same (.1); further draft confirmation order (4.7) and additional research re: same (2.1).
08/14/15	LKZ	2.50	Call w/J.Gott (K&E) re: chapter 15 recognition hearing timing (.1); further draft confirmation order (2.2); confer w/B.Keach re: same (.2).
08/14/15	MAS	0.10	Confer with Lindsay Z. re: settlement with Helm Financial / First Union Rail and email Lindsay settlement agreement.
08/15/15	LKZ	0.70	Revise draft confirmation order.
08/17/15	LKZ	0.90	Confer w/B.Keach re: confirmation order (.2); call and emails w/claimant re ballot questions (.3); review ballot (.1), disclosure statement order (.2) re: same; call w/Prime Clerk (2). and confer w./B.Keach (.1)
08/18/15	LKZ	3.20	Begin draft of confirmation brief (2.7); research i/c/w same (.5).
08/18/15	KQ	0.20	E-mails from and to L. Zahradka regarding FRA consent motion
08/18/15	MAS	2.80	Final review and edits to chapter 15 brief, assemble and format exhibits (including excerpt of transcript).
08/19/15	KQ	0.50	Review package from NiwriMedia containing copies of Canadian papers and Affidavit from the Montreal Gazette and e-mails to Marlene @Niwri and L. Zahradka regarding missing Affidavits related to the publication notice.

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

08/19/15	LKZ	3.40	Further draft confirmation brief (1.0); research re: same (.7); emails w/Prime Clerk re: declaration in support of confirmation (.2); confer w/K.Quirk re: certification of publication for confirmation hearing notice (.2); review emails w/B.Keach re: confirmation order (.1); review filed version of reply in support of chapter 15 motion (1.2).
08/20/15	LKZ	4.70	Revise confirmation brief (4.7).
08/21/15	LKZ	2.80	Review solicitation matrix (.1) and call w/counsel to CIT re: voting (.1); review CIT PoCs (.4), settlement agmt (.3) re: question re: voting; draft email to B.Keach re: same (.1); confer w/B.Keach re: same (.1); follow-up call w/counsel to CIT re: same (.1); revise confirmation brief (1.6).
08/21/15	TJM	0.20	TC w/ counsel for CIT re Flex preference and plan voting
08/24/15	LKZ	6.40	Revise confirmation brief (4.5); research re: same (1.9).
08/25/15	LKZ	4.40	Review proof of publication for filing (.2); emails w/K.Quirk re: same (.1); revise confirmation brief (4.1).
08/25/15	KQ	0.10	E-mail to L. Zahradka regarding Certificate of Publication
08/25/15	RND	0.10	Email with A. Adessky re: MMA Canada's ballot for Plan acceptance
08/26/15	TJM	1.20	Finalize responses to CP discovery demands re plan (1.1) and email counsel for CP re same (0.1)
08/26/15	LKZ	3.90	Emails w/K.Quirk re: proof of publication (.1); review filing version of same (.1); proofread confirmation brief (3.2); draft email to B.Keach re: same (.2); review entered order enforcing plan sanction order

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

			(.3).
08/28/15	LKZ	0.20	Review email from Settling Defendant re: ballots submitted.
08/28/15	DSA	0.10	Reviewed motion to allow voting of claims filed by CP (.1)
08/31/15	KQ	0.20	E-mail from/to L. Zahradka regarding possible need for transcript of Disclosure Statement hearing and call to transcription service regarding same.
08/31/15	LKZ	3.70	Review CP 3018 motion (.3); review sale order (.1), plan (.2), DS (.1) re: same; review form 3018 objections (.2) and research re: same (.9); begin draft of objection to same (1.4); review rejecting ballots received (.1), proxies for claimants having submitted ballots (.1), and emails w/B.Keach re: same (.1).
09/01/15	LKZ	4.60	Further draft objection to CP 3018 motion (4.5); emails w/B.Keach re: same (.1).
09/01/15	DSA	0.30	Reviewed e-mails concerning issues with confirmation of plan memorandum (.1); reviewed e-mails and e-mailed parties concerning issues with motion to disband the committee (.2)
09/02/15	LKZ	5.10	Emails w/counsel to FRA re: 3018 consent motion status (.2); emails w/Prime Clerk re: status of Class 13 ballots (.1); confer w/B.Keach re: same (.1); review and summarize declarations in support of NECP plan confirmation (1.8); draft Caruso declaration in support of confirmation (.7); draft form declaration for non-insurer Released Parties (1.1) and insurer released parties (.4) in support of confirmation; adapt former for GERSCO (.7).

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

09/03/15	LKZ	3.70	Confer w/B.Keach re: status of docs in support of confirmation (.4); emails w/FRA re: ballot for same (.1); revise confirmation order (.8) and emails w/B.Keach re: same (.2); draft motion to seal various declarations in support of confirmation (1.2); research re: confirmation brief (1.0).
09/04/15	LKZ	6.70	Review CP motion to compel disclosure of settlement agreements (.5); draft outline for objection to same (1.9); research re: same (2.9); begin draft objection to same (1.4).
09/07/15	LKZ	0.20	Emails w/B.Keach re: CP 3018 objection.
09/08/15	LKZ	4.50	Revise objection to CP 3018 motion (1.3); emails w/B.Keach (.3), Prime Clerk (.2) re: same; review filing version of same (.9); emails w/.Quirk re: filing and service of same (.3); review cases from B.Keach re: solicitation issues (.6); call w/counsel to creditor re: submission of ballot (.3) and emails w/counsel re: same (.3); confer w/B.Keach re: CP notice of appeal of enforcement order (.3).
09/09/15	LKZ	7.10	Review ballot progress (.8); emails w/A.Cummings re: declarations in support of confirmation (.2); prep for CP 3018 hearing (.5); revise confirmation brief (1.4); travel to (.3), attend (1.4), and travel from (.3) hearing re: 3018 motion; call w/XL Insurance re: confirmation and next steps (.9); confer w/B.Keach re: same (.5); review forms of sale order re: 363(m) provisions for confirmation order (.4); draft email to B.Keach re: same (.4).
09/09/15	DSA	0.20	Reviewed objection to plan filed by the UST (.2)

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

09/10/15	DSA	0.10	Reviewed objection to plan filed by Wheeling (.1)
09/10/15	ALS	0.20	Office conference with L. Zahradka re declarations in support of plan confirmation (.1); review electronic documents for information relating to same (.1)
09/10/15	LKZ	4.00	Revise confirmation order (.4); revise CIT (.7), GERSCO (.3) and Irving (.4) declarations in support of confirmation; call (.1) and emails (.2) w/B.Keach re: same; emails w/counsel to CIT (.1), GERSCO (.2) re: same; review objections to confirmation (1.6).
09/10/15	KQ	3.00	Obtain from the docket the objections to confirmation of the plan and e-mail to/from L. Zahradka regarding same.
09/10/15	MAS	0.10	Exchange emails with Lindsay Zahradka re: presentation of affidavits in support of plan/DS, as opposed to live testimony.
09/11/15	LKZ	9.10	Draft outline for response to CP confirmation objection (1.0); revise objection to CP motion to compel (.9); revise confirmation brief to respond to objections of Irving RRs (.8), Wheeling (.9), CP (1.9); draft email to B.Keach re: same (.2); emails w/constituents re: draft confirmation order (.6); revise various declarations in support of confirmation (2.8).
09/11/15	DSA	0.50	Reviewed objection to plan filed by CP (.3); reviewed e-mails and orders relating to preference actions (.2)
09/14/15	LKZ	3.60	Review ballot issues (.2); review Prime Clerk voting results (.2) and emails w/B.Keach re: same (.1); review GERSCO comments to confirmation order (.4) and revise order accordingly (.6); confer w/B.Keach re: same (.1); review list of unclassified ballots (.2),

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

			review service list I/c/w analysis of same (.5), emails w/Prime Clerk re: same (.2); review GERSCO (.5) and CIT (.5) comments to draft declarations; confer w/B.Keach re: same (.1).
09/15/15	LKZ	4.20	Revise Caruso declaration in support of confirmation (1.9); call w/F.Caruso re: same (.2); emails w/B.Keach re same (.3); review Monitor's 20th report (.3) and draft Adessky declaration in support of confirmation based on same (1.2); review Irving comments to confirmation order (.2) and emails w/B.Keach re: same (.1).
09/16/15	LKZ	11.30	Revise confirmation order (2.0); emails w/ B Keach re: confirmation (.3), confer w/B.Keach re: same (.6); revise form declaration for Settling Defendants (.8); draft email to Settling Defendants re: declarations in support (.3) and various calls w/counsel to same (.6); emails w/B.Keach re: Caruso (.2), Adessky (.2) declarations and emails w/declarants re: same (.3); review Prime Clerk voting certification (.4) and emails w/B.Keach re: same (.2); further revise confirmation brief (3.0) and substantial research I/c/w same (1.1); review revised version of Adessky declaration (.3).
09/16/15	MAS	0.20	Retrieve Wheeling line of credit and email same to Fred Caruso (DSI).
09/17/15	RND	4.80	Review/revise memorandum in support and reply to objections to confirmation of Plan and finalize for filing

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

09/17/15	LKZ	12.60	Further revise confirmation order (.7), brief (5.4); research in connection with brief revision (1.1); emails w/various constituents re: revised confirmation order (.4); revise table of authorities for brief (1.2), update internal cross-references (.8) and references to declarations (.6); review filing version of same (.4); revise Caruso declaration (.4), confer w/F.Caruso re: same (.2), and review filing version of same (.2); revise Keach declaration (.4) and review filing version of same (.1); review filing version of Adessky declaration (.2) and confirmation order (.5).
09/17/15	KQ	0.20	Obtain from docket and forward to L. Zahradka the replies to the Trustee's Plan of Liquidation
09/17/15	KQ	1.30	Revision to Table of Authorities for the Brief in Support of Confirmation
09/17/15	DSA	0.30	Telephone conference with F. Caruso concerning issues with plan payments (.3)
09/17/15	ALS	3.20	Review and summarize Class 12 Ballots submitted by claimants
09/17/15	ALS	4.60	Filing and service of brief in support of confirmation and declarations in support of confirmation with Court
09/18/15	ALS	0.40	Emails to/from K. Quirk re service of brief, proposed confirmation order and declarations in support of confirmation (.2); review draft certificate of service re same (.2)
09/18/15	ALS	0.10	Email to P. Benoit attaching proposed confirmation order
09/18/15	ALS	0.20	Emails from/to L. Zahradka re preparation for confirmation hearing

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

09/18/15	ALS	0.30	Review docket for Energy Future Holdings Corp. case (.2); email to R. Keach re Order Authorizing Debtors to Enter Into and Perform Under Plan Support Agreement (.1)
09/18/15	ALS	1.20	Review additional Class 12 ballots (1.1); office conference with R. Keach re same (.1)
09/18/15	DSA	0.20	Reviewed affidavits in support of confirmation (.2)
09/18/15	KQ	0.50	Prepare index of documents for hearing binder in preparation of confirmation hearing
09/18/15	KQ	2.20	Prepare service of 9 pleadings related to the plan of liquidation and stipulation concerning production of settlement agreements
09/18/15	KQ	0.60	Draft Certificate of Service related to 9 pleadings related to the plan of liquidation and stipulation concerning production of settlement agreements
09/18/15	KQ	0.10	Finalize and file the Certificate of Service related to the 9 pleadings related to the plan of liquidation and stipulation concerning production of settlement agreements
09/18/15	LKZ	6.00	Revise confirmation order (.7); review recent relevant decisions re: standing (.9); begin prep for confirmation hearing (.7) and confer w/A.Stewart re: declaration filings (.3), A.Cummings, (.2)K/Quirk re: hearing binders (.2), K.Bigelow re: docket reference check (.3), C.Bertsch re: source binder (.4); review relevant cases (1.7) and create index of cases binder (.2); confer w/B.Keach (.4), Prime Clerk (.2) re: ballot issue.
09/19/15	DSA	0.30	Reviewed affidavit in support of confirmation of F. Caruso (.2); reviewed Monitor's affidavit in support of confirmation (.1)

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

09/21/15	DSA	0.40	Reviewed memorandum of law in support of confirmation (.4)
09/21/15	LKZ	9.00	Confer w/B.Keach re: confirmation hearing prep (.4); coordinate binder of cases (.4); emails w/K.Quirk re: pleading binder prep (.3); review XL declaration (.3) and emails w/B.Keach re: same (.1); draft chart of confirmation requirements and citations to evidence (3.1) and emails w/B.Keach re: same (.2); emails w/various settling defendants re: status of decls in support of confirmation (.6); review various declarations in support of confirmation from various Settling Defendants (.3.6)
09/21/15	KQ	2.80	Begin preparation of binders for upcoming confirmation hearing
09/21/15	KQ	1.10	Revisions to hearing binder for upcoming confirmation hearing
09/22/15	LKZ	7.70	Review various Settling Defendant Declarations (2.4), various emails (.8) and calls (.2)x3 with counsel to Settling Defendants re: same; update tracker for Settling Defendant Declarations (.1)x5; assemble execution versions of same (.8); emails w/B.Keach re: status of same (.3), emails w/ A Stewart re: filing same (.3); review constituent comments to confirmation order (.3); revise order per constituent (.6), B.Keach comments (1.1)
09/22/15	ALS	1.40	Filing of declarations in support of confirmation (1.3); emails from/to L. Zahradka re filing of declarations in support of confirmation (.1)
09/22/15	ALS	0.40	Draft certificate of service re filing of declarations in support of confirmation

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

09/22/15	ALS	0.20	Preparation for confirmation hearing, including review of emails from/to L. Zahradka and K. Quirk re preparation of reference materials
09/23/15	ALS	7.70	Preparation for confirmation hearing, including organization of settlement agreements and declarations, service of declarations upon email distribution list, filing additional declarations in support of confirmation, coordinating transmittal of documents to Court
09/23/15	LKZ	9.90	Emails w/counsel to various Settling Defendants re: revised declarations (.8); filing of same (.8); revise chart of confirmation requirements (.7); draft chart of citations to Settling Defendant declarations (1.6); revise confirmation order (1.1) and review filing version of same (.8); review binder of cases cited in confirmation brief (.4); revise WD Trust Agreement (.4); draft supplemental Adessky decl. in support of confirmation (.2); conference (.2) and emails (.8) w/B.Keach re: above; calls w/counsel to GERSCO re: various comments to confirmation order (1.2); review CP objection to submission of declarations in support of confirmation (.3); substantial prep for confirmation hearing (.6).
09/23/15	KQ	4.50	Prepare documents to be used at confirmation hearing
09/23/15	TJM	2.80	Confer with Trustee re preparation for Confirmation Hearing (0.2) and prepare re same (2.6)
09/24/15	TJM	4.10	Prepare for confirmation hearing (0.4) and attend re same (3.7)

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

09/24/15	KQ	1.50	Prepare and transmit materials for the confirmation hearing to/from the courthouse
09/24/15	LKZ	5.70	Prep for (.3), travel to (.3), attend (3.4), travel from (.3), follow-up from (1.4) confirmation hearing.
09/24/15	ALS	1.60	Transmit documents to Bankruptcy Court in advance of confirmation hearing (.8); obtain documents from U.S. Bankruptcy Court after confirmation hearing (.8)
09/24/15	ALS	0.30	Telephone conference with C. Gonzalez at Wheeling (.1); emails to C. Gonzalez at Wheeling re service of declarations and proposed confirmation order (.2)
09/30/15	LKZ	0.40	Emails w/B.Keach re: revised confirmation order (.2); review constituent emails re: same (.2).
10/01/15	LKZ	0.70	Call w/constituents re: status of confirmation (.5); emails w/B.Keach re: same (.2).
10/01/15	ALS	0.20	Email to R. Keach attaching as-filed version of amended plan (.1); email to L. Zahradka re same (.1)
10/02/15	DSA	0.10	Reviewed e-mails concerning issues with confirmation hearing (.1)
10/02/15	LKZ	1.80	Calls w/B.Keach re: confirmation (.1)x3, call with various constituents (.4) re: confirmation hearing adjournment; draft email to counsel to settling defendants re: same (.4); draft notice of adjournment of confirmation hearing (.5) and attention to filing same (.2).
10/02/15	KQ	0.40	File and serve the notice of adjourning the confirmation hearing
10/02/15	KQ	0.30	Draft and file the Certificate of Service related to the notice of adjourning the confirmation hearing

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

10/02/15	KQ	0.10	E-mails to/from the Court and L. Zahradka regarding change of date for adjourning the confirmation hearing
10/05/15	LKZ	0.60	Confer w/B.Keach re: revisions to confirmation order, status of confirmation objection resolution.
10/06/15	LKZ	1.50	Revise confirmation order (1.0); emails w/B.Keach re: same (.3); review CP objection to submission of confirmation declarations (.2).
10/07/15	LKZ	2.80	Revise confirmation order (2.3); emails w/(.3) and confer w/(.2) B.Keach re: same.
10/07/15	KQ	0.40	Finalize and file the proposed order (and red-line version) related to the Trustee's revised first amended plan
10/07/15	ALS	0.10	Email to L. Zahradka attaching the Motion to Vary the Order Approving the Amended CCAA Plan
10/08/15	ALS	0.80	Filing of revised proposed confirmation order (.4); conferences (x2) with L. Zahradka re revised proposed confirmation order (.2); service of revised proposed confirmation order (.2)
10/08/15	LKZ	3.00	Further revise confirmation order (1.7); confer w/A.Cummings re: confirmation hearing prep (.4); prepare for confirmation hearing (8).
10/09/15	LKZ	2.40	Prep for (.5), travel to (.3), attend (.7), travel from (.3) and follow-up from (.4) confirmation hearing; confer w/B.Keach re: request for entry of confirmation order by district court (.2).
10/09/15	ALS	0.60	Assist L. Zahradka with compare/redline of proposed confirmation order (.3); telephone conference with L. Zahradka re filing of revised proposed confirmation order (.1); emails to L. Zahradka re revised proposed confirmation order (.2)

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

10/09/15	ALS	0.10	Email to R. Keach, L. Zahradka attaching Order Confirming Plan
10/09/15	DSA	0.20	Reviewed e-mails relating to preference settlements and confirmation (.2)
10/11/15	LKZ	0.20	Emails w/counsel to Settling Defendants re: plan consummation timeline.
10/13/15	LKZ	7.00	Emails w/various parties re: post-confirmation issues (.4); research for (1.9) and draft (3.9) request for entry of confirmation order by district court; draft FOOs for same (.4); revise request as per B.Keach comments (.4).
10/13/15	KQ	0.40	Finalize and file the Motion to Enforce Plan Injunction
10/13/15	KQ	0.40	Draft and file via ECF the Certificate of Service related to the Motion to Enforce Plan Injunction
10/13/15	KQ	0.20	Prepare and send e-mail service of the Motion to Enforce Plan Injunction
10/14/15	KQ	0.20	File the confirmed version of the Trustee's Revised First Amended Plan of Liquidation dated July 15, 2015
10/14/15	LKZ	1.40	Revise request to district court to enter confirmation order (1.0) and FOO for same (.2); revise execution version of GA settlement agreement (.2).
10/15/15	LKZ	0.30	Emails w/constituents re: plan, confirmation order redlines.
10/16/15	LKZ	0.10	Emails w/ counsel to D&Os re: execution version of GA settlement agmt.
10/19/15	LKZ	1.00	Prep for (.1) and call w/District Court re: 9033 request (.9).

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

10/21/15	LKZ	0.80	Call w/R.Haines re: conference call w/district court re: confirmation order (.3); review docket re: same (.2); confer w/A.Stewart re: same (.3).
10/22/15	LKZ	0.20	Emails w/B.Keach re: confirmation order redline (.1); confer w/B.Keach re: settling defendant questions on plan effective date timing (.1).
10/23/15	LKZ	3.10	Read B.Keach memo to Canadian Counsel re: finality of confirmation order (.2), emails w/counsel to Settling Defendants re: same (.1); review plan (1.0), confirmation order (.8), WD Trust agmt (.5) for deadlines/timing issues and draft timeline of same (.4); emails w/B.Keach re: same (.1).
10/28/15	LKZ	0.30	Emails w/counsel to settling defendants re: memo re: next steps.

Total 12		889.60	

14 Other

Date	ATTY	Hours	
10/09/14	MAF	0.90	Review insurance policies as part of potential settlement
11/14/14	MAF	1.00	Meeting with R. Keach regarding XL and Rail World settlement agreements
11/21/14	MAF	0.20	E-mails from and to M. Troy (FRA counsel); e-mail from D. Dandeneau (CIT counsel)
01/12/15	RND	0.80	Draft Trustee's reports (2) on CCAA proceedings re: Monitor's motion to extend stay in Canadian Case and Order on same
01/14/15	RND	0.20	Meeting with A. Stewart re: chapter 15 docket in Nortel case and email to R. Keach re: same
01/20/15	RND	0.10	Emails with A. Cummings re: chapter 15 filings

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

01/20/15	ALS	2.00	Office conferences (x2) with R. Desai regarding Chapter 15 research (.2); obtain various Chapter 15 pleadings per R. Desai's request (1.8)
02/02/15	RND	2.30	Review chapter 15 dockets of various cases to determine appropriate pleadings to be filed in MMA chapter 15 case
02/03/15	RND	4.70	Continue research/review of pleadings necessary to file chapter 15 case
02/05/15	RND	2.40	Review/Research re: pleadings necessary for chapter 15 filing and petition
02/12/15	RND	0.10	Email with R. Keach re: chapter 15 petition and related filings
02/12/15	WAH	3.80	Drafting, reviewing, and revising chapter 15 petition and affidavit for MMA Canada.
02/13/15	WAH	4.40	Drafting, reviewing, and revising chapter 15 petition and affidavit for MMA Canada.
02/17/15	WAH	5.50	Drafting, reviewing, and revising chapter 15 petition, order, and related documents.
02/18/15	WAH	5.80	Drafting, reviewing, and revising chapter 15 petition, order, and related documents.
02/23/15	WAH	3.20	Drafting, reviewing, and revising chapter 15 affidavit and related documents (3.2).
03/05/15	WAH	2.50	Drafting, reviewing, and revising chapter 15 documents.
03/06/15	WAH	2.30	Drafting, reviewing, and revising chapter 15 filing documents.
03/09/15	WAH	2.40	Drafting, reviewing, and revising chapter 15 petition and related documents.
03/31/15	RND	2.20	Draft memorandum in support of chapter 15 petition
03/31/15	RND	0.70	Review case law re: verified petition for recognition of foreign proceeding

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

04/01/15	RND	4.40	Review verified petitions filed in chapter 15 cases and begin drafting verified petition for MMAC
04/02/15	RND	4.90	Continue drafting chapter 15 verified petition
04/03/15	RND	1.90	Continue drafting chapter 15 verified petition
04/07/15	RND	4.20	Draft verified chapter 15 petition
04/07/15	RND	2.80	Draft memorandum in support of verified chapter 15 petition
04/07/15	RND	0.30	Meeting with A. Stewart re: chapter 15 petition and Rule 1007 statements
04/07/15	ALS	0.90	Meeting with R. Desai re preparation of Chapter 15 petition and related pleadings (.3); preparation of draft petition and corporate ownership statement (.4); review litigation proceedings relating to MMAC (.2)
04/08/15	ALS	0.30	Office conference with R. Desai re chapter 15 pleadings (.1); revisions to chapter 15 petition and corporate disclosure statement (.2)
04/08/15	RND	1.50	Research re: affidavits filed in support of chapter 15 petition; draft affidavit in support chapter 15 petition
04/08/15	RND	5.40	Continue drafting memorandum in support of chapter 15 petition
04/08/15	RND	0.10	Meeting with A. Stewart re: chapter 15 petition
04/09/15	RND	1.30	Review/revise verified chapter 15 petition
04/09/15	RND	0.80	Review/revise memorandum in support of chapter 15 petition
04/15/15	RND	0.20	Meeting with R. Keach re: chapter 15 petition
04/16/15	RND	5.20	Review/Review chapter 15 petition and related documents based on R. Keach comments

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

04/17/15	RND	2.80	Further review/revise chapter 15 petition and memorandum of law in support of petition
04/17/15	RND	0.70	Revise Declaration in Support of Chapter 15 Petition based on R. Keach's comments
04/17/15	RND	1.40	Review notice requirements re: chapter 15 petition and begin drafting motion re: form and manner of notice
04/24/15	RND	0.10	Email correspondence with R. Keach re: chapter 15 pleadings
04/24/15	RND	2.90	Review service requirements for notice of chapter 15 petition; draft motion re: notice of same
04/24/15	ALS	0.20	Office conference with R. Desai re notice provision for Ch. 15 filing
04/27/15	RND	0.10	Email with L. Zahradka re: chapter 15 filing
05/05/15	ALS	0.90	Emails from/to R. Keach re translation of Order from CCAA proceedings (.1); translation of Order from CCAA proceedings (.8)
05/07/15	RND	0.50	Review/revise chapter 15 pleadings based on comments/edits from R. Keach
05/08/15	RND	0.40	Continue reviewing/revising chapter 15 pleadings based on R. Keach's comments/edits
05/08/15	RND	0.10	Email correspondence with R. Keach re: draft chapter 15 pleadings
05/08/15	ALS	0.30	Assist R. Desai with compilation chapter 15 pleadings
05/13/15	RND	0.70	Call with R. Keach, A. Adessky, and R. Clement re: chapter 15 filing
05/20/15	RND	0.30	Meeting with R. Keach re: drafting of motion to seek enforcement of sanction order in chapter 15 case
05/22/15	DSA	0.60	Began reviewing Canadian plan and related filings (.6)
05/26/15	DSA	0.60	Continued reviewing the Canadian plan (.3); reviewed monitor's report of plan (.3)

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

05/29/15	RND	0.10	Review email correspondence with R. Keach and A. Adessky re: call to discuss chapter 15 filings
06/04/15	RND	0.10	Email correspondence with R. Clement re: revised Rule 1007 List for chapter 15 filing
06/04/15	RND	1.50	Call with A. Adessky and R. Clement re: chapter 15 filings and timing of filings.
06/08/15	RND	5.20	Draft motion and memorandum re: enforcement and recognition of Plan Sanction Order
06/09/15	RND	3.70	Continue drafting motion and memo re: enforcement and recognition of Plan Sanction Order
06/10/15	RND	3.40	Continue drafting motion and memo re: enforcement/recognition of Plan Sanction Order
06/11/15	RND	5.50	Continue drafting/revising Motion and Memo re: enforcement/recognition of Plan Sanction Order
06/11/15	RND	0.30	Call with R. Clement re: chapter 15 filing
06/11/15	RND	0.50	Review case law re: eligibility of railroad to file chapter 15
06/11/15	RND	0.30	Review/respond to R. Clement email re: notice provisions for chapter 15 filings
06/11/15	RND	0.10	Email correspondence with R. Keach and R. Clement re: call to discuss chapter 15 filings
06/11/15	RND	0.10	Review emails from Monitor re: timing of chapter 15 filings
06/11/15	RND	0.20	Email correspondence with R. Keach and R. Clement re: railroad's eligibility to file under CCAA
06/11/15	TJM	0.20	Review email from UST re disclosure statement and respond re same (0.1) and email Trustee re same (0.1)

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

06/12/15	RND	2.20	Finish drafting motion and memo re: enforcement/recognition of Plan Sanction Order and draft proposed order re: same
06/12/15	RND	0.60	Revise motion, memo, and order re: enforcement/recognition of Plan Sanction Order
06/12/15	ALS	0.40	Assist R. Desai re preparation of draft order re Motion for Entry of an Order Recognizing and Enforcing Plan Sanction Order
06/16/15	CBB	1.00	Research re: Civil Code of Quebec in English.
06/18/15	RND	0.30	Call with A. Adessky and R. Clement re: questions about chapter 15 filings
06/18/15	RND	0.10	Follow up call with R. Clement re: chapter 15 filing timeline and related questions
06/19/15	RND	2.10	Call with R. Clement and A. Adessky re: chapter 15 petition and related filings and timing of same
06/23/15	RND	0.20	Meeting with R. Keach re: chapter 15 filings and email with R. Clement re: same
06/23/15	RND	0.20	Follow up emails with R. Keach and R. Clement re: chapter 15 filings
07/08/15	RND	0.20	Meeting with R. Keach re: chapter 15 petition; email same to R. Keach
07/09/15	RND	0.10	Email from/to R. Clement re: chapter 15 filings
07/09/15	RND	0.30	Review emails from R. Clement re: chapter 15 filings and revisions to same
07/10/15	RND	0.20	Emails to R. Keach re: questions about chapter 15 filings
07/11/15	RND	0.30	Emails with R. Clement re: revisions to chapter 15 pleadings and questions re: same
07/13/15	RND	0.20	Meeting with K. Quirk and email with R. Clement re: service list for chapter 15 pleadings

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

07/14/15	RND	0.10	Email with R. Keach re: revisions/comments to draft of Trustee's report
07/17/15	LKZ	0.60	Call w/Monitor re: Chapter 15 petition (.6)
07/20/15	LKZ	0.80	Review service paragraph for chapter 15 petition (.2); emails w/N.Hull re: same (.2); emails w/Prime Clerk re: service of same (.4)
07/20/15	RND	0.10	Meeting with R. Keach re: eligibility of debtor to file chapter 15 and timing of when eligibility is determined
07/20/15	RND	0.60	Research cases re: debtor eligibility and determination of such eligibility
07/20/15	RND	0.40	Research re: eligibility of debtor at time of filing
07/21/15	LKZ	1.20	Review filed versions of chapter 15 docs (1.1); emails w/ K.Quirk re: calendaring same (.1)
07/21/15	DSA	0.20	Reviewed chapter 15 filings (.2)
08/03/15	DSA	0.40	Continued reviewing sanctions order entered in Canadian case (.4)
08/06/15	RND	0.70	Review IBRC decision regarding granting recognition of chapter 15 verified petition
08/10/15	RND	0.70	Meeting with R. Keach and M. Siedband re: joinder to chapter 15 petition and motion for recognition of sanction order
08/11/15	MAS	9.50	Begin drafting joinder pleading, including extensive research, re: chapter 15 case of MMA Canada.
08/12/15	MAS	3.20	Complete drafting of joinder re: chapter 15 case of MMA Canada.
08/13/15	ALS	0.40	Circulate pleadings filed by UST in Chapter 15 case to R. Keach and R. Desai (.2); update pleadings for Chapter 15 case (.2)
08/13/15	DSA	0.20	Reviewed motion to continue chapter 15 hearing filed by the UST (.2)

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

08/14/15	MAS	6.50	Draft extensive updates to joinder motion (chapter 15) in light of CP's objection and UST's motion to continue, including additional research on standing, appeals of foreign orders, and related concepts.
08/17/15	MAS	10.20	Draft extensive updates and revisions to chapter 15 brief.
08/17/15	JAL	5.60	Research re applicability of collateral estoppel and res judicata principles to foreign judgments.
08/17/15	LKZ	2.10	Research re: brief in support of chapter 15 pleadings (2.1).
08/18/15	LKZ	2.90	Revise reply in support of chapter 15 petition (1.8); emails w/various constituents re: same (.5); filing of same (.4); emails w/constituents re: filed version of same (.2)
08/18/15	TJM	1.00	Edit and review motion in support of Chapter 15 petition
08/19/15	MAS	2.00	Update caselaw binders for tomorrow's hearing on chapter 15 petition of MMAC, includes search for "Continental Colors" docket and decisions.
08/19/15	RND	3.00	Dinner meeting with A. Adessky, R. Keach, et al. re: hearing on chapter 15 petition
08/19/15	KQ	2.20	Assist Trustee with preparation for Ch. 15 hearings
08/19/15	ALS	5.30	Assist R. Keach with preparation for Ch. 15 hearing, including organization of cases cited in Trustee's brief
08/20/15	LKZ	3.20	Travel to (.2), attend (2.8) and travel from (.2) hearing on chapter 15 recognition and enforcement
08/20/15	MAS	3.00	Prepare for and attend chapter 15 recognition hearing.

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

08/21/15	ALS	0.10	Update pleadings with Ch. 15 Order Granting Recognition
09/02/15	RND	0.10	Email with R. Keach re: CP Pretrial Statement
09/16/15	TJM	2.50	Draft, edit and revise motion to dismiss CP chapter 15 appeal
09/18/15	TJM	5.40	Draft, edit and revise motion to dismiss re CP chapter 15 appeal
09/18/15	CBB	2.90	Online legal research re: confirmation.
09/20/15	TJM	1.10	Edit and revise motion to dismiss CP chapter 15 appeal
09/20/15	TJM	0.50	Research re standing to file motion to dismiss in CP appeal re Chapter 15
09/21/15	TJM	2.50	Draft, edit and revise answer to CP counterclaim and affirmative defenses
09/21/15	TJM	5.00	Edit and revise motion to dismiss CP appeal re Chapter 15
09/22/15	TJM	5.10	Draft, edit and revise motion to intervene re chapter 15 CP appeal
09/26/15	TJM	0.60	Edit and revise motion to intervene re CP Chapter 15 appeal
09/27/15	TJM	0.70	Edit and revise motion to intervene re Chapter 15 CP appeal
10/13/15	TJM	0.10	TC w/ counsel for CP re status of chapter 15 appeal
10/13/15	RND	0.70	Draft CCAA report for chapter 11 and 15 cases and finalize for filing
Total 14		217.30	

21

Tax Issues

Date	ATTY	Hours	
01/29/15	TJM	0.20	Review file re Court Order re 45G Tax credit sale

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

01/30/15	NAT	0.40	Review the tax reporting rules for reporting of distributions from Wrongful Death Trust to Canadian recipients.
02/02/15	NAT	1.60	Telephone call with Bob Keach about the formation and funding of the Wrongful Death Trust; research the tax characteristics of the trust and the reporting requirements for distributions from the trust.
02/09/15	NAT	0.40	Review the withholding rules for distributions from US person (estate) to non-resident beneficiaries.
02/10/15	NAT	0.70	Meetings with Steve Gerlach to discuss the section 1441 withholding requirements (.4); application of these rules to the funding of the wrongful death trust; meeting with Bob Keach about same (.3).
02/10/15	SRG	1.50	Meetings with Nelson Toner re flow through tax issues on liquidating trust (.4). Review scope of taxable income in wrongful death suits. Review section 1441 definitions of income (1.1).
02/13/15	SRG	2.10	Research and draft short memo re applicability of withholding requirements on wrongful death payments.
02/14/15	NAT	0.30	Review Steve Gerlach's analysis about the application of the withholding rules to the formation of and distributions from the wrongful death trust.
02/18/15	NAT	0.30	Call with Bob Keach about preliminary answer about need for withholding to fund the wrongful death trust.
02/19/15	NAT	1.10	Draft tax memo concerning the funding of the Wrongful Death Trust and any withholding on the distribution of its assets.

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

02/20/15	NAT	0.50	Conference call w/ Trustee to discuss the need for withholding on payments from the Wrongful Death Trust.
02/27/15	NAT	1.40	Finish the tax memo with regard to tax withholding on the formation of and distributions from Wrongful Death Trust.
03/02/15	NAT	0.30	Finalize the tax memo about withholding and send to Bob Keach.
03/25/15	NAT	1.10	Review the questions for the conference call; conference call about the movement of funds from the defendants to the WD trust to the claimants.
03/26/15	DSA	0.10	Telephone conference with F. Caruso concerning issues with tax claims and e-mailed Camden National concerning same (.1)
03/27/15	DSA	0.30	Telephone conference with F. Caruso concerning issues with tax obligations for Milo (.3)
03/28/15	DSA	0.10	Reviewed e-mails and e-mailed parties concerning issues with Milo taxes (.1)
03/30/15	RJC	1.10	Communication and call with Fred Caruso regarding tax matters; follow ups regarding same.
03/31/15	DSA	0.10	Telephone conference with F. Caruso concerning issues with Milo taxes (.1)
04/03/15	RJC	1.10	Communications and follow up regarding discussions with Fred Caruso concerning property taxes in Milo, the Derby facility and related matters.
04/07/15	NAT	0.60	Answer questions from Travis Chalmers concerning the US tax status of the WD trust.

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

04/08/15	NAT	1.80	Review the draft facts and questions for the conference call with Revenue Canada, the Monitor and Canadian attorneys; conference call w/ RJC and Revenue Canada, Monitor and CA attorneys.
04/08/15	RJC	0.40	Call w/ Nelson Toner re transfer and property tax issues
04/10/15	NAT	0.70	Review the latest draft of the facts and tax questions from Travis Chalmers; give comments to Travis about the document.
04/10/15	DSA	0.20	Telephone conference with R. Crawford concerning issues with Milo taxes (.2)
04/22/15	RJC	0.10	Call from and to Fred Caruso re tax issue in Milo
04/26/15	RJC	0.10	Call from and to Fred Caruso re tax matters
05/06/15	RJC	0.50	Communications re fiscal year issues and confirmations; follow ups re same
05/07/15	RJC	0.90	Summary of fiscal year confirmations; email with Fred Caruso re same; email re follow up work to verify property tax status in non July 1 start date fiscal year communities
05/08/15	RJC	0.60	Communications regarding tax year status to input in tax prorating model; follow ups re same with M. Libby
05/14/15	RJC	0.10	Communications regarding update on Milo property tax issues
06/05/15	NAT	0.70	Answer Bob Keach's questions about the use of Delaware statutory trust for WD trust (.5); call with Lindsay Zahadka about reference for Delaware law (.2).
07/31/15	DSA	0.10	Reviewed e-mails relating to tax obligations to the State (.1)
08/03/15	DSA	0.20	Reviewed e-mails concerning issues with estate tax liability (.2)

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

Total 21 21.70

ATTORNEY / PARALEGAL SUMMARY

01 Asset Analysis and Recovery

Name	Hours	Rate	Amount
MICHAEL SIEBAND	80.70	195.00	15,736.50
MICHAEL SIEBAND	30.50	200.00	6,100.00
SAM ANDERSON	0.20	365.00	73.00
TIMOTHY MCKEON	1.10	200.00	220.00

Total 01	112.50		22,129.50

02 Asset Disposition

Name	Hours	Rate	Amount
ANGELA STEWART	0.60	185.00	111.00
DANIEL CHALABY	0.50	165.00	82.50
KARLA QUIRK	1.50	155.00	232.50
KATHERINE JOYCE	0.90	255.00	229.50
LINDSAY ZAHRADKA	0.40	205.00	82.00
MICHAEL FAGONE	0.30	385.00	115.50
MICHAEL FAGONE	0.20	390.00	78.00
ROMA DESAI	10.90	205.00	2,234.50
SAM ANDERSON	1.00	365.00	365.00
SAM ANDERSON	7.80	370.00	2,886.00
TIMOTHY MCKEON	0.80	200.00	160.00
WILL HUESKE	4.70	200.00	940.00
WILL HUESKE	1.30	205.00	266.50

Total 02	30.90		7,783.00

03 Business Operations

Name	Hours	Rate	Amount
DANIEL CHALABY	0.50	165.00	82.50

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

KATHERINE JOYCE	9.60	250.00	2,400.00
KATHERINE JOYCE	1.20	255.00	306.00
SAM ANDERSON	2.60	365.00	949.00
SAM ANDERSON	2.10	370.00	777.00
TIMOTHY MCKEON	0.40	200.00	80.00
WILL HUESKE	0.70	200.00	140.00
WILL HUESKE	1.00	205.00	205.00

Total 03	18.10		4,939.50

04 Case Administration

Name	Hours	Rate	Amount
ANGELA STEWART	25.30	180.00	4,554.00
ANGELA STEWART	186.10	185.00	34,428.50
BODIE COLWELL	1.40	195.00	273.00
BODIE COLWELL	2.40	200.00	480.00
KARLA QUIRK	1.90	150.00	285.00
KARLA QUIRK	68.60	155.00	10,633.00
KATHERINE JOYCE	3.00	250.00	750.00
LINDSAY ZAHRAKKA	45.60	205.00	9,348.00
MICHAEL FAGONE	1.00	385.00	385.00
MICHAEL FAGONE	1.50	390.00	585.00
MICHAEL SIEDBAND	1.90	200.00	380.00
PAUL MCDONALD	1.00	375.00	375.00
ROMA DESAI	27.00	205.00	5,535.00
SAM ANDERSON	14.20	365.00	5,183.00
SAM ANDERSON	28.60	370.00	10,582.00
TIMOTHY MCKEON	1.70	195.00	331.50
TIMOTHY MCKEON	40.00	200.00	8,000.00
WILL HUESKE	1.00	205.00	205.00

Total 04	452.20		92,313.00

05 Claims Administration and Objections

Name	Hours	Rate	Amount
------	-------	------	--------

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

ANGELA STEWART	3.50	180.00	630.00
ANGELA STEWART	15.30	185.00	2,830.50
CHRISTINE B. BERTSCH	0.40	90.00	36.00
KARLA QUIRK	12.50	150.00	1,875.00
KARLA QUIRK	18.80	155.00	2,914.00
LINDSAY ZAHRADKA	108.30	205.00	22,201.50
MICHAEL BOSSE	0.80	290.00	232.00
MICHAEL FAGONE	1.30	385.00	500.50
MICHAEL FAGONE	1.10	390.00	429.00
MICHAEL SIEDBAND	1.80	200.00	360.00
ROMA DESAI	0.30	205.00	61.50
SAM ANDERSON	10.70	365.00	3,905.50
SAM ANDERSON	8.40	370.00	3,108.00
TIMOTHY MCKEON	18.40	195.00	3,588.00
TIMOTHY MCKEON	93.20	200.00	18,640.00
WILL HUESKE	27.70	205.00	5,678.50
	-----		-----
Total 05	322.50		66,990.00

06 Employee Benefits/Pensions

Name	Hours	Rate	Amount
MATTHEW TARASEVICH	0.80	275.00	220.00
MATTHEW TARASEVICH	0.20	280.00	56.00
SAM ANDERSON	3.30	365.00	1,204.50
SAM ANDERSON	2.70	370.00	999.00
	-----		-----
Total 06	7.00		2,479.50

07 Fee/Employment Applications

Name	Hours	Rate	Amount
ANGELA STEWART	8.80	180.00	1,584.00
ANGELA STEWART	7.30	185.00	1,350.50
BODIE COLWELL	49.50	195.00	9,652.50
BODIE COLWELL	56.20	200.00	11,240.00
KARLA QUIRK	22.40	150.00	3,360.00

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

KARLA QUIRK	11.50	155.00	1,782.50
LINDSAY ZAHRADKA	21.40	205.00	4,387.00
MICHAEL FAGONE	0.50	385.00	192.50
MICHAEL SIEDBAND	4.70	200.00	940.00
ROMA DESAI	0.10	200.00	20.00
ROMA DESAI	4.70	205.00	963.50
SAM ANDERSON	13.20	365.00	4,818.00
SAM ANDERSON	0.70	370.00	259.00
TIMOTHY MCKEON	0.10	200.00	20.00
WILL HUESKE	0.80	200.00	160.00

Total 07	201.90		40,729.50

09 Financing

Name	Hours	Rate	Amount
SAM ANDERSON	0.40	370.00	148.00

Total 09	0.40		148.00

10 Litgation

Name	Hours	Rate	Amount
ANGELA STEWART	17.60	180.00	3,168.00
ANGELA STEWART	64.40	185.00	11,914.00
BODIE COLWELL	0.40	200.00	80.00
KARLA QUIRK	8.70	150.00	1,305.00
KARLA QUIRK	81.20	155.00	12,586.00
LINDSAY ZAHRADKA	65.70	205.00	13,468.50
MICHAEL FAGONE	60.50	385.00	23,292.50
MICHAEL FAGONE	32.40	390.00	12,636.00
MICHAEL SIEDBAND	7.10	195.00	1,384.50
MICHAEL SIEDBAND	311.00	200.00	62,200.00
PAUL MCDONALD	66.80	370.00	24,716.00
PAUL MCDONALD	81.00	375.00	30,375.00
RACHAEL BECKER	14.60	160.00	2,336.00
ROMA DESAI	70.60	200.00	14,120.00

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

ROMA DESAI	304.90	205.00	62,504.50
SAM ANDERSON	17.90	365.00	6,533.50
SAM ANDERSON	72.10	370.00	26,677.00
TIMOTHY MCKEON	145.20	195.00	28,314.00
TIMOTHY MCKEON	475.80	200.00	95,160.00
WILL HUESKE	1.10	205.00	225.50
	-----		-----
Total 10	1899.00		432,996.00

12 Plan and Disclosure Statement

Name	Hours	Rate	Amount
ANGELA STEWART	0.80	180.00	144.00
ANGELA STEWART	67.20	185.00	12,432.00
BODIE COLWELL	0.20	200.00	40.00
KARLA QUIRK	67.30	155.00	10,431.50
LINDSAY ZAHRADKA	402.10	205.00	82,430.50
MICHAEL FAGONE	0.90	385.00	346.50
MICHAEL FAGONE	2.40	390.00	936.00
MICHAEL SIEDBAND	12.40	200.00	2,480.00
PAUL MCDONALD	0.80	375.00	300.00
RACHAEL BECKER	24.00	160.00	3,840.00
ROMA DESAI	45.70	205.00	9,368.50
SAM ANDERSON	0.10	365.00	36.50
SAM ANDERSON	19.80	370.00	7,326.00
TIMOTHY MCKEON	11.80	200.00	2,360.00
WILL HUESKE	67.70	200.00	13,540.00
WILL HUESKE	166.40	205.00	34,112.00
	-----		-----
Total 12	889.60		180,123.50

14 Other

Name	Hours	Rate	Amount
ANGELA STEWART	10.80	185.00	1,998.00
CHRISTINE B. BERTSCH	3.90	90.00	351.00
JESSICA LEWIS	5.60	250.00	1,400.00

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

KARLA QUIRK	2.20	155.00	341.00
LINDSAY ZAHRADKA	10.80	205.00	2,214.00
MICHAEL FAGONE	2.10	385.00	808.50
MICHAEL SIEDBAND	34.40	200.00	6,880.00
ROMA DESAI	90.90	205.00	18,634.50
SAM ANDERSON	2.00	370.00	740.00
TIMOTHY MCKEON	24.70	200.00	4,940.00
WILL HUESKE	29.90	205.00	6,129.50

Total 14	217.30		44,436.50

21 Tax Issues

Name	Hours	Rate	Amount
NELSON A TONER	11.90	360.00	4,284.00
ROBERT J. CRAWFORD	4.90	290.00	1,421.00
SAM ANDERSON	1.10	370.00	407.00
STEVEN GERLACH	3.60	280.00	1,008.00
TIMOTHY MCKEON	0.20	200.00	40.00

Total 21	21.70		7,160.00

TOTAL FEES

\$902,228.00

COST SUMMARY

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

-----COST CODE SUMMARY-----		
-----COST CODE-----		AMOUNT
10	RECORDING FEE	62.00
11	FILING FEE	5526.00
16	TRANSCRIPT COST	761.05
2	CERTIFIED COPY	6.96
26	CERTIFIED MAIL	33.50
30	POSTAGE	1824.00
37	FEDERAL EXPRESS	2117.36
40	MISCELLANEOUS	39.62
45	SECRETARY OVERTIME	343.70
47	STAFF OVERTIME	29.26
5	TRAVEL EXPENSE	799.86
62	MEALS	14.40
8	BANKRUPCY COURT	54.00

COST DETAIL

FEDERAL EXPRESS - PAID TO: FEDERAL EXPRESS CORPORATION	21.31
FEDERAL EXPRESS - PAID TO: FEDERAL EXPRESS CORPORATION	25.31
FEDERAL EXPRESS - PAID TO: FEDERAL EXPRESS CORPORATION	21.31
FEDERAL EXPRESS - PAID TO: FEDERAL EXPRESS CORPORATION	28.96
FEDERAL EXPRESS - PAID TO: FEDERAL EXPRESS CORPORATION	61.48
FEDERAL EXPRESS - PAID TO: FEDERAL EXPRESS CORPORATION	38.76
FEDERAL EXPRESS - PAID TO: FEDERAL EXPRESS CORPORATION	38.76

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

FEDERAL EXPRESS - PAID TO: FEDERAL EXPRESS CORPORATION	38.76
FEDERAL EXPRESS - PAID TO: FEDERAL EXPRESS CORPORATION	38.76
FEDERAL EXPRESS - PAID TO: FEDERAL EXPRESS CORPORATION	38.76
FEDERAL EXPRESS - PAID TO: FEDERAL EXPRESS CORPORATION	21.31
FEDERAL EXPRESS - PAID TO: FEDERAL EXPRESS CORPORATION	28.96
FEDERAL EXPRESS - PAID TO: FEDERAL EXPRESS CORPORATION	21.31
FEDERAL EXPRESS - PAID TO: FEDERAL EXPRESS CORPORATION	25.31
TRAVEL EXPENSE - PAID TO: MICHAEL A FAGONE	164.58
SECRETARY OVERTIME	143.23
STAFF OVERTIME	29.26
TRAVEL EXPENSE - PAID TO: DAVID S. ANDERSON	148.13
TRAVEL EXPENSE - PAID TO: TIMOTHY MCKEON	18.75
FEDERAL EXPRESS - PAID TO: FEDERAL EXPRESS CORPORATION	21.31
FEDERAL EXPRESS - PAID TO: FEDERAL EXPRESS CORPORATION	18.54
FEDERAL EXPRESS - PAID TO: FEDERAL EXPRESS CORPORATION	25.31
FEDERAL EXPRESS - PAID TO: FEDERAL EXPRESS CORPORATION	33.19
FEDERAL EXPRESS - PAID TO: FEDERAL EXPRESS CORPORATION	25.31
FEDERAL EXPRESS - PAID TO: FEDERAL EXPRESS CORPORATION	21.97
FEDERAL EXPRESS - PAID TO: FEDERAL EXPRESS CORPORATION	16.34
FEDERAL EXPRESS - PAID TO: FEDERAL EXPRESS CORPORATION	21.97

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

FEDERAL EXPRESS - PAID TO: FEDERAL EXPRESS CORPORATION	21.97
FEDERAL EXPRESS - PAID TO: FEDERAL EXPRESS CORPORATION	23.53
TRAVEL EXPENSE - PAID TO: DAVID S. ANDERSON	149.16
POSTAGE	1824.00
FEDERAL EXPRESS - PAID TO: FEDERAL EXPRESS CORPORATION	13.55
TRAVEL EXPENSE - PAID TO: TIMOTHY MCKEON	147.36
FEDERAL EXPRESS - PAID TO: FEDERAL EXPRESS CORPORATION	13.55
FEDERAL EXPRESS - PAID TO: FEDERAL EXPRESS CORPORATION	13.55
FEDERAL EXPRESS - PAID TO: FEDERAL EXPRESS CORPORATION	21.77
FEDERAL EXPRESS - PAID TO: FEDERAL EXPRESS CORPORATION	21.77
FEDERAL EXPRESS - PAID TO: FEDERAL EXPRESS CORPORATION	16.19
FEDERAL EXPRESS - PAID TO: FEDERAL EXPRESS CORPORATION	23.32
FEDERAL EXPRESS - PAID TO: FEDERAL EXPRESS CORPORATION	23.32
FEDERAL EXPRESS - PAID TO: FEDERAL EXPRESS CORPORATION	23.32
FEDERAL EXPRESS - PAID TO: FEDERAL EXPRESS CORPORATION	13.55
FEDERAL EXPRESS - PAID TO: FEDERAL EXPRESS CORPORATION	23.32
RECORDING FEE - PAID TO: PISCATAQUIS COUNTY REG OF DEED	22.00
MISCELLANEOUS - PAID TO: BUSINESSCARD SERVICES	37.00
SECRETARY OVERTIME	99.00
FEDERAL EXPRESS - PAID TO: FEDERAL EXPRESS CORPORATION	22.13

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

FEDERAL EXPRESS - PAID TO: FEDERAL EXPRESS CORPORATION	21.37
RECORDING FEE - PAID TO: PISCATAQUIS COUNTY REG OF DEED	40.00
FEDERAL EXPRESS - PAID TO: FEDERAL EXPRESS CORPORATION	30.89
FEDERAL EXPRESS - PAID TO: FEDERAL EXPRESS CORPORATION	17.32
FEDERAL EXPRESS - PAID TO: FEDERAL EXPRESS CORPORATION	15.61
FEDERAL EXPRESS - PAID TO: FEDERAL EXPRESS CORPORATION	41.92
CERTIFIED MAIL - PAID TO: GENERAL COURIER	6.70
CERTIFIED MAIL - PAID TO: GENERAL COURIER	6.70
FEDERAL EXPRESS - PAID TO: FEDERAL EXPRESS CORPORATION	22.46
SECRETARY OVERTIME	49.50
TRANSCRIPT COST - PAID TO: ESCRIBE	60.00
FEDERAL EXPRESS - PAID TO: FEDERAL EXPRESS CORPORATION	68.20
FEDERAL EXPRESS - PAID TO: FEDERAL EXPRESS CORPORATION	41.04
FEDERAL EXPRESS - PAID TO: FEDERAL EXPRESS CORPORATION	68.20
FEDERAL EXPRESS - PAID TO: FEDERAL EXPRESS CORPORATION	55.48
FEDERAL EXPRESS - PAID TO: FEDERAL EXPRESS CORPORATION	36.02
FEDERAL EXPRESS - PAID TO: FEDERAL EXPRESS CORPORATION	20.71
FEDERAL EXPRESS - PAID TO: FEDERAL EXPRESS CORPORATION	32.46
FEDERAL EXPRESS - PAID TO: FEDERAL EXPRESS CORPORATION	25.78

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

FEDERAL EXPRESS - PAID TO: FEDERAL EXPRESS CORPORATION	12.59
TRAVEL EXPENSE - PAID TO: MICHAEL A. SIEDBAND	171.88
FEDERAL EXPRESS - PAID TO: FEDERAL EXPRESS CORPORATION	24.14
FEDERAL EXPRESS - PAID TO: FEDERAL EXPRESS CORPORATION	36.02
TRANSCRIPT COST - PAID TO: BUSINESSCARD SERVICES	429.00
TRANSCRIPT COST - PAID TO: DUVERNAY REPORTING INC	225.25
FEDERAL EXPRESS - PAID TO: FEDERAL EXPRESS CORPORATION	41.55
TRANSCRIPT COST - PAID TO: DENNIS R. FORD RPR	46.80
FILING FEE - PAID TO: BUSINESSCARD SERVICES	350.00
Filing of Complaint	
FILING FEE - PAID TO: BUSINESSCARD SERVICES	100.00
Certification for Admission	
FEDERAL EXPRESS - PAID TO: FEDERAL EXPRESS CORPORATION	36.59
FEDERAL EXPRESS - PAID TO: FEDERAL EXPRESS CORPORATION	38.50
FEDERAL EXPRESS - PAID TO: FEDERAL EXPRESS CORPORATION	14.07
FEDERAL EXPRESS - PAID TO: FEDERAL EXPRESS CORPORATION	27.40
CERTIFIED MAIL - PAID TO: GENERAL COURIER	6.70
FILING FEE - PAID TO: BUSINESSCARD SERVICES	176.00
Motion to Abandon	
FEDERAL EXPRESS - PAID TO: FEDERAL EXPRESS CORPORATION	21.60
FEDERAL EXPRESS - PAID TO: FEDERAL EXPRESS CORPORATION	17.83
FEDERAL EXPRESS - PAID TO: FEDERAL EXPRESS CORPORATION	26.70

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

CERTIFIED COPY - PAID TO: KARLA M. QUIRK	6.96
FEDERAL EXPRESS - PAID TO: FEDERAL EXPRESS CORPORATION	30.71
CERTIFIED MAIL - PAID TO: GENERAL COURIER	6.70
CERTIFIED MAIL - PAID TO: GENERAL COURIER	6.70
FILING FEE - PAID TO: BUSINESSCARD SERVICES Complaint (15-01014)	350.00
MISCELLANEOUS - PAID TO: BUSINESSCARD SERVICES CA Search Fees	2.62
FILING FEE - PAID TO: BUSINESSCARD SERVICES Courts/USBC-ME	4550.00
FEDERAL EXPRESS - PAID TO: FEDERAL EXPRESS CORPORATION	35.27
FEDERAL EXPRESS - PAID TO: FEDERAL EXPRESS CORPORATION	18.21
FEDERAL EXPRESS - PAID TO: FEDERAL EXPRESS CORPORATION	38.48
FEDERAL EXPRESS - PAID TO: FEDERAL EXPRESS CORPORATION	22.92
FEDERAL EXPRESS - PAID TO: FEDERAL EXPRESS CORPORATION	27.97
FEDERAL EXPRESS - PAID TO: FEDERAL EXPRESS CORPORATION	27.97
FEDERAL EXPRESS - PAID TO: FEDERAL EXPRESS CORPORATION	47.77
FEDERAL EXPRESS - PAID TO: FEDERAL EXPRESS CORPORATION	62.06
FEDERAL EXPRESS - PAID TO: FEDERAL EXPRESS CORPORATION	78.50
MEALS - PAID TO: LINDSAY K. ZAHRADKA	14.40
SECRETARY OVERTIME	51.97
BANKRUPTCY COURT - PAID TO: U.S. BANKRUPTCY COURT	54.00
FEDERAL EXPRESS - PAID TO: FEDERAL EXPRESS CORPORATION	25.21

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

November 6, 2015 Invoice# 3489178
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

TOTAL EXPENSES	\$11,611.71
TOTAL FEES PLUS EXPENSES	\$913,839.71

Exhibit B

BIOGRAPHIES OF BSSN PROFESSIONALS AND PARAPROFESSIONALS

D. SAM ANDERSON

Sam Anderson is a co-chair of the firm's Business Restructuring and Insolvency Practice Group. Sam's practice focuses primarily on representing debtors in Chapter 11 reorganization proceedings. Sam's practice has focused most recently on representing real estate holding companies in chapter 11, including debtors in single asset real estate cases, and representing companies in the hospitality industry through reorganizations and asset sales. Additionally, Sam has considerable recent experience working on individual Chapter 11 reorganizations. He has extensive experience representing creditors in Chapter 11 proceedings, including representing landlords as creditors in these proceedings.

Sam has a wide range of experience in representing clients in pre-bankruptcy and bankruptcy related matters, including representing clients in valuation disputes, preference litigation, fraudulent transfer litigation, stay relief, assets sales under the Bankruptcy Code, plan confirmation and other matters arising under bankruptcy law.

He also has experience representing plaintiffs and defendants in commercial litigation in both state and federal courts. Sam was previously employed at firms in Philadelphia, Pennsylvania and Portland, Maine. He is recognized by Chambers USA and Best Lawyers in America.

MICHAEL BOSSE

Mike Bosse is chair of Bernstein Shur's Construction Practice Group and a member of the Litigation Group. Mike represents contractors, subcontractors, suppliers, developers and owners in various phases of construction projects. Mike has represented entities and individuals in project inception, contract negotiation, claims and litigation. Mike also represents various professionals, including design professionals, at state licensing boards. Mike litigates construction matters in state court, federal court, private arbitrations and arbitrations with the American Arbitration Association. Mike is a frequent lecturer to the construction industry in Maine and has clients throughout New England.

ROBERT J. CRAWFORD

Robert J. Crawford, Esq. was a member of the firm's Municipal and Regulatory Practice Group and co-chair of the Property Tax and Valuation Team. He was the Maine Representative for the National Association of Property Tax Attorneys. Crawford counsels municipalities, individuals and businesses in complex property tax valuation, property taxation, property tax assessment and appeals, tax collection, tax lien procedures and related matters in bankruptcy proceedings. He assisted the firm's private energy clients with property tax and valuation issues related to economics, operations and development of thermal, hydroelectric and wind electrical generation facilities. He appeared regularly before the Maine State Board of Property Tax Review, local assessment review boards and in Maine's many courts. Crawford is recognized by *Best Lawyers in America* for his municipal work.

MICHAEL FAGONE

Mike Fagone was a shareholder and member of the Business Restructuring and Insolvency Practice Group, and is one of a handful of lawyers in northern New England certified in business bankruptcy by the American Board of Certification. Chambers USA has recognized Mike as one of the top bankruptcy lawyers in Maine. He is also AV-rated by Martindale-Hubbell. Mike represented debtors, secured creditors, creditors' committees, purchasers and other interested parties in Chapter 11 and Chapter 7 cases. Additionally, he represented clients in a wide range of commercial litigation in federal and state courts.

KATHERINE JOYCE

Katherine Joyce is a member of the Energy and Environmental Practice Group at Bernstein Shur. She focuses her practice in environmental permitting and compliance, particularly as it pertains to power generation facilities, large-scale commercial development, real estate remediation, solid waste, water, and air pollution issues, including existing and developing regulation of greenhouse gas emissions. Kat is also an active member of the firm's "Green Team" which provides clients with the full range of legal services necessary to accomplish small and large-scale "green" development projects. Kat also serves in the firm's Wind Energy Group, focusing on the permitting elements of wind developments.

Kat represents clients in various matters involving federal and state agencies, including the Department of Energy, the Department of Justice, the Environmental Protection Agency, and the Maine Department of Environmental Protection. She has obtained, transferred and amended state and federal permits on behalf of large power generating facilities. She is experienced in coordinating complex due diligence efforts, permit applications, permit transfers, and negotiating resolution of significant compliance issues.

PAUL MCDONALD

Paul McDonald is a shareholder and the chair of the Litigation Practice Group. Paul concentrates his practice in complex commercial and business litigation matters. He has tried cases to judges, juries, administrative appeal panels and arbitrators in Maine and across the country. Paul is recognized as a leading commercial litigator by Chambers USA, Best Lawyers in America, and Super Lawyers, and is rated AV-rated by Martindale-Hubbell. As Chambers USA put it in its 2009 Edition of America's Leading Business Lawyers, "His effectiveness in court is due to his careful preparation, thorough due diligence and presentation skills."

Paul is a frequent presenter at legal and business seminars and is the co-author of a Bernstein Shur's monthly Commercial and Business Litigation Newsletter. In 2010, Paul was awarded the Vincent L. McKusick Award by the Maine State Bar Association, which honors the author of the best article published in the Maine Bar Journal that year, for his article entitled Recovery of Lost Profits Damages; All Is Not Lost.

MATTHEW TARASEVICH

Matthew Tarasevich is co-chair of Bernstein Shur's Labor and Employment Law Practice Group, and a member of the Municipal and Regulatory Practice Group and Litigation Group. He provides counsel to the firm's public and private sector clients on employment, labor and

personnel matters. Matt represents clients in all areas of labor and employment litigation in the Maine state and federal courts, as well as at the administrative agency level, including the Maine Human Rights Commission and the Maine Labor Relations Board.

NELSON A. TONER

Nelson Toner is a member of Bernstein Shur's Trusts and Estates, Real Estate, and Business Law Practice Groups. Nelson's practice focuses on international, federal and state tax planning, business succession planning, and estate planning. He counsels clients on the tax consequences of sophisticated transactions, such as mergers and acquisitions, tax-free exchanges, reorganizations, and municipal and private activity bond financing.

JESSICA A. LEWIS

Jessica A. Lewis is a member of Bernstein Shur's Business Restructuring and Insolvency Practice Group. She represents debtors, secured creditors, unsecured creditors, parties to executory contracts, preference defendants, claim objection litigants, and prospective acquirers of distressed companies and their assets in Chapter 11 cases of regional and national significance, including: the Debtors *In re Red Shield Environmental, LLC*; employees holding ERISA claims in *In re New Century Holdings, Inc.*; and a trademark licensor in *In re Hartmarx Corporation*.

Prior to joining Bernstein Shur, Jessica was previously employed at firms in Portland, ME and Pittsburgh, PA. She was a high school English teacher prior to attending law school.

BODIE COLWELL

Bodie B. Colwell is a member of Bernstein Shur's Business Restructuring and Insolvency Practice Group. Her practice focuses on bankruptcy and business reorganization, preference litigation, debt restructuring and general Chapter 11 bankruptcies.

Bodie serves as the coach of the teams representing the University of Maine School of Law at the Duberstein Moot Court Competition. Additionally, Bodie is a volunteer editor for the American Bankruptcy Institute Volo Project and is a certified mediator. Bodie earned her law degree *cum laude* from the University of Maine School of Law. She earned her BA from the University of Southern Maine, where she was president of the USM Political Science Student Association and a member of the *Pi Sigma Alpha* National Political Science Honor Society.

ROMA DESAI

Roma N. Desai is a member of Bernstein Shur's Business Restructuring and Insolvency Practice Group. Her practice focuses on commercial bankruptcy and business reorganization.

Prior to joining Bernstein Shur, Roma served as a federal law clerk for the Honorable J. Michael Deasy and the Honorable Mark W. Vaughn of the U.S. Bankruptcy Court for the District of New Hampshire. She has also worked for multiple New York City law firms, representing clients in commercial and corporate bankruptcy issues.

Roma earned her JD from Washington University in St. Louis School of Law, where she completed an externship with the enforcement division of the U.S. Securities and Exchange

Commission. She is admitted to practice law in New York, the U.S. District Court for Eastern District of New York, the U.S. District Court for Southern District of New York the state of Maine and the U.S. District Court of Maine

STEPHEN GERLACH

Steve is the Team Leader of the Health Care Industry Group, a member of the Labor and Employment Practice Group and an adjunct member of the Business Law Practice Group. He represents health care entities, businesses, nonprofits and individual clients in matters of executive compensation, employee benefits, the Affordable Care Act and ERISA.

WILL A. HUESKE

Will Hueske was a member of Bernstein Shur's Business Restructuring and Insolvency Practice Group. His practice focused on business finance and restructuring proceedings including Chapter 11, out-of-court workouts, asset sales and acquisition, and bankruptcy related litigation. Will has authored or contributed to journal and news articles and legal treatises on a variety of topics related to bankruptcy and corporate finance.

TIMOTHY MCKEON

Tim McKeon is a member of Bernstein Shur's Business Restructuring and Insolvency Practice Group. His practice focuses on business finance and restructuring proceedings, including Chapter 11, asset sales and acquisition, and bankruptcy related litigation.

Prior to joining Bernstein Shur, Tim was an associate at Davidoff Hutcher & Citron LLP in New York, New York. While there, he focused on bankruptcy, commercial litigation, general corporate matters and government relations. During law school, Tim was a judicial intern for Hon. Carla E. Craig, U.S. Bankruptcy Chief Judge, E.D.N.Y. and Hon. Robert E. Grossman, U.S. Bankruptcy Judge, E.D.N.Y.

Tim earned his JD from Brooklyn Law School and his BA from the College of the Holy Cross, where he was a member of the Phi Sigma Tau Honor Society.

MICHAEL SIEDBAND

Michael is a member of the firm's Business Restructuring and Insolvency Practice Group. His practice focuses on business restructuring and insolvency proceedings, including chapter 11 reorganizations, asset sales and acquisitions, and bankruptcy-related litigation

Prior to joining Bernstein Shur, Michael served for two years as a law clerk to the Hon. Bruce A. Harwood and the Hon. J. Michael Deasy of the U.S. Bankruptcy Court for the District of New Hampshire. Prior to his clerkship, he was an associate at Looney & Grossman, LLP in Boston, Massachusetts, where he focused on bankruptcy, restructuring and commercial litigation. Michael has been ranked by Super Lawyers as a rising star in Bankruptcy & Creditor/Debtor Rights

Michael earned his JD from Boston College, where he was managing editor and staff writer for the Uniform Commercial Code Reporter-Digest. He earned his BS from Boston

University, magna cum laude. Michael was a varsity rower in college and a member of the US National Team for rowing at the 2003 Pan-Am Games.

LINDSAY ZAHRADKA

Lindsay is a member of Bernstein Shur's Business Restructuring and Insolvency Practice Group. In her practice, Lindsay assists a broad array of corporate clients in matters including chapter 11 reorganizations, asset sales and acquisitions and bankruptcy-related litigation.

Prior to joining Bernstein Shur, Lindsay worked as an associate with Akin Gump in New York, where she focused on financial restructuring matters. She advised borrowers, debtors, official committees of unsecured creditors, lenders, and ad-hoc groups of bondholders in connection with pre-filing negotiations and chapter 11 proceedings.

RACHAEL BECKER

Rachael Becker was a summer law clerk at Bernstein Shur. Currently, she is in her third year at Boston University School of Law. Rachael holds a BA from Harvard College.

DANIEL A. CHALABY

Daniel Chalaby has been a real estate paralegal at Bernstein Shur since 2005. Before joining the firm, he was a professional land surveyor or land survey technician for 12 years and a title abstractor for 5 years. He is licensed as a land surveyor in the State of Maine and received his Bachelor of Arts degree from the University of Maine at Farmington.

KARLA QUIRK

Karla Quirk is a paralegal in the Business Restructuring and Insolvency Practice Group. Karla served as a legal assistant at Bernstein Shur before being promoted to paralegal in 2012. She was previously employed at Verrill & Dana, LLP where she worked as a paralegal.

ANGELA STEWART

Angela is a paralegal in the Business Restructuring and Insolvency Practice Group. Angela has worked as a paralegal since 1997. She holds a BA in Public Management from the University of Maine.

CHRISTINE B. BERTSCH

Christine Bertsch has been the law librarian for Bernstein Shur since 1993. Her background includes academic and public library work experience at the University of Maine at Presque Isle, Dyer Library Association, and the Fountaindale Public Library District. She holds a master's degree in library science from the University of Denver, 1977, and a BA degree from Illinois State University.

UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT
DISTRICT OF MAINE

In re:

MONTREAL MAINE & ATLANTIC
RAILWAY, LTD.

Debtor.

Bk. No. 13-10670
Chapter 11

ORDER GRANTING THIRD INTERIM APPLICATION FOR COMPENSATION AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES FOR BERNSTEIN, SHUR, SAWYER & NELSON, P.A., AS COUNSEL TO THE TRUSTEE, ROBERT J. KEACH, FOR THE PERIOD FROM OCTOBER 1, 2014 THROUGH OCTOBER 31, 2015

This matter having come before the Court on the Third Interim Application for Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses for Bernstein, Shur, Sawyer & Nelson, P.A., as Counsel to the Trustee, Robert J. Keach, for the Period from October 1, 2014 Through October 31, 2015 (the "Fee Application"), and after proper notice to all creditors and other parties-in-interest, the Court having independently reviewed the Fee Application, it is hereby **ORDERED**, **ADJUDGED**, and **DECREED** as follows:

1. The Fee Application is granted.¹
2. In relation to the Compensation Period and, pursuant to 11 U.S.C. § 331, Bernstein, Shur, Sawyer & Nelson, P.A. ("BSSN") is allowed compensation for services to the Trustee in the aggregate amount of **\$913,839.71**, including professional fees in the amount of \$902,228.00 and reimbursement of expenses in the amount of \$11,611.71.

¹ Capitalized terms not otherwise defined herein shall have the meaning ascribed to them in the Fee Application.

3. The Fees and expenses for the Compensation Period are hereby awarded on an interim basis in accordance with the applicable sections of the Bankruptcy Code, the Federal Rules of Bankruptcy Procedure, and this Court's local rules.

Dated:

The Honorable Peter G. Cary
Chief Judge, United States Bankruptcy Court

**UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT
DISTRICT OF MAINE**

In re:

MONTREAL MAINE & ATLANTIC
RAILWAY, LTD.

Debtor.

Bk. No. 13-10670
Chapter 11

NOTICE OF HEARING

Bernstein, Shur, Sawyer & Nelson, P.A. (“BSSN”), counsel to Robert J. Keach, the duly appointed Chapter 11 trustee (the “Trustee”) of the bankruptcy estate of Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway, Ltd. (the “Debtor”), has filed a Third Interim Application for Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses for Bernstein, Shur, Sawyer & Nelson, P.A., as Counsel to the Trustee, Robert J. Keach, for the Period from October 1, 2014 Through October 31, 2015 (the “Application”). A hearing on the Application is set to take place at the United States Bankruptcy Court, 537 Congress Street, Portland, Maine on **December 8, 2015 at 9:00 a.m.** (the “Hearing”).

By the Application, BSSN seeks a total amount of \$913,839.71, which includes \$902,228.00 for compensation of professional fees and \$11,611.71 for reimbursement of expenses incurred with respect to services rendered on behalf of the Trustee during the period October 1, 2014 through October 31, 2015 (the “Compensation Period”). BSSN seeks an order authorizing and approving this compensation for fees and expenses incurred during the Compensation Period on an interim basis. The Application is an interim fee application.

On May 12, 2014, BSSN filed the First Interim Fee Application for Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses for Bernstein, Shur, Sawyer & Nelson, P.A., as Counsel to the Trustee, Robert J. Keach, for the Period of August 21, 2013 Through April 30, 2014 [Docket No. 870] (the “First Fee Application”). With respect to the First Fee Application, the Court awarded BSSN fees in the amount of \$1,019,528.40 and expenses in the amount of \$28,169.42 for the period of August 21, 2013 through April 30, 2014.

On October 24, 2014, BSSN filed the Second Interim Application for Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses for Bernstein, Shur, Sawyer & Nelson, P.A. as Counsel to the Trustee, Robert J. Keach, for the Period of May 1, 2014 Through September 30, 2014 [Docket No. 1169] (the “Second Fee Application”). With respect to the Second Fee Application, the Court awarded BSSN fees in the amount of \$282,287.50 and expenses in the amount of \$4,260.58 for the period of May 1, 2014 through September 30, 2014.

Your rights may be affected. You should read these papers carefully and discuss them with your attorney, if you have one in this bankruptcy case. If you do not have an attorney, you may wish to consult one.

If you do not want the court to approve the Application, or if you want the court to consider your views on the Application, then on or before **December 1, 2015**, you or your attorney must file with the court a written response explaining your position. If you are not able to access the CM/ECF Filing System, your response should be served upon the Court at:

Alec Leddy, Clerk
United States Bankruptcy Court
202 Harlow Street
Bangor, Maine 04401

-and-

Sam Anderson, Esq.
Bernstein, Shur, Sawyer & Nelson, P.A.
100 Middle St., PO Box 9729
Portland, Maine 04104-5029

If you have to mail your response to the Court for filing, you must mail it early enough so that the Court will receive it on or before the date stated above.

If you or your attorney do not take these steps, the Court may decide that you do not oppose the relief sought in the Application and may enter an order granting that relief.

DATED: November 9, 2015

**BERNSTEIN, SHUR, SAWYER &
NELSON, P.A.**

/s/ Sam Anderson

Sam Anderson, Esq.
BERNSTEIN, SHUR, SAWYER &
NELSON, P.A.
100 Middle Street
P.O. Box 9729
Portland, Maine 04104-5029
Telephone: (207) 774-1200
Facsimile: (207) 774-1127