

UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT
DISTRICT OF MAINE

In re:

MONTREAL MAINE & ATLANTIC
RAILWAY, LTD.

Debtor.

Bk. No. 13-10670
Chapter 11

**FIRST INTERIM APPLICATION FOR COMPENSATION AND REIMBURSEMENT
OF EXPENSES FOR BERNSTEIN, SHUR, SAWYER & NELSON, P.A., AS COUNSEL
TO ROBERT J. KEACH, ESTATE REPRESENTATIVE, FOR THE PERIOD
DECEMBER 23, 2015 THROUGH AND INCLUDING JUNE 30, 2016**

Name of Applicant:	Bernstein, Shur, Sawyer & Nelson, P.A.
Authorized to Provide Professional Services as:	Counsel to Robert J. Keach, estate representative of Debtor's post-effective date estate
Petition Date:	August 7, 2013
Date of Retention:	August 28, 2013 <u>nunc pro tunc</u> to August 21, 2013*
Period for Which Compensation and Reimbursement is Sought:	December 23, 2015 through and including June 30, 2016
Total Amount of Compensation sought as actual, reasonable and necessary:	\$287,871.50
Total Amount of Expenses sought as actual, reasonable and necessary:	\$2,767.21
Total Fees and Expenses Requested During Compensation Period:	\$290,634.71

This is an Interim Application.

* Bernstein, Shur, Sawyer & Nelson, P.A. ("BSSN") was retained on this date as counsel to Robert J. Keach in his capacity as chapter 11 trustee for the Debtor's estate. In his capacity of estate representative of the post-effective date estate of the Debtor (the "Estate Representative"), pursuant to the terms of the *Trustee's Revised First Amended Chapter 11 Plan of Liquidation, Dated July 15, 2015 (As Amended on October 8, 2015)* [D.E. 1822] (the "Plan"), Mr. Keach selected BSSN as counsel on the Effective Date (as defined in the Plan).

COMPENSATION BY PROFESSIONAL DURING COMPENSATION PERIOD

	Department and Year Admitted[†]	Total Billed Hours[‡]	Hourly Billing Rate	Total Compensation
Shareholders				
Sam Anderson	BRI–2000	0.5	\$370.00	\$185.00
		20.6	\$405.00	\$8,343.00
Katherine Joyce	EEP–2003	2.0	\$280.00	\$560.00
Paul McDonald	LPG–1987	12.4	\$415.00	\$5,146.00
Eben Albert	LPG–2008	0.3	\$240.00	\$72.00
Senior Counsel				
Jessica Lewis	BRI–2006	43.4	\$275.00	\$11,935.00
Associates				
Bodie Colwell	BRI–2011	3.5	\$220.00	\$770.00
Roma Desai	BRI–2009	177.4	\$225.00	\$39,915.00
Timothy McKeon	BRI–2012	2.1	\$200.00	\$420.00
		288.4	\$220.00	\$63,448.00
Michael Siedband	BRI–2009	0.7	\$200.00	\$140.00
		34.9	\$220.00	\$7,678.00
Lindsay Zahradka	BRI–2011	0.2	\$205.00	\$41.00
		391.7	\$225.00	\$88,132.50
Paralegals				
Peter Nichols	LPG	18.9	\$180.00	\$3,402.00
Karla Quirk	BRI	149.9	\$170.00	\$25,483.00
Angela Stewart	BRI	153.6	\$205.00	\$31,488.00
Librarian				
Christine B. Bertsch		6.2	\$115.00	\$713.00
TOTAL			1,306.7	\$287,871.50
Blended hourly rate (excluding paralegal time): \$264.29 Blended hourly rate for paraprofessionals only [§] : \$185.00				

[†] BLPG – Business Law Practice Group; BRI – Business Restructuring and Insolvency; LPG – Litigation and Dispute Resolution; EEP—Energy and Environmental Practice Group. A brief biography of each professional who has rendered services in connection with the fees and expenses herein is set forth on **Exhibit B**.

[‡] The Compensation Period covers calendar years 2015 and 2016. As BSSN implemented an ordinary course rate increase for 2016, to the extent any timekeeper billed time during 2015 and 2016, both their rates and any associated time are reflected.

[§] Does not include librarian; blended hourly rate for paraprofessionals and librarian is \$167.50.

COMPENSATION BY PROJECT CATEGORY DURING COMPENSATION PERIOD

PROJECT CODE	PROJECT DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT
1	Asset Analysis and Recovery	0.1	\$40.50
3	Business Operations	0.8	\$198.00
4	Case Administration	57.8	\$12,042.50
5	Claims Administration and Objections	230.0	\$49,499.00
7	Fee/Employment Applications	71.4	\$15,809.00
8	Fee/Employment Objections	0.4	\$97.00
10	Litigation	921.5	\$204,737.50
12	Plan and Disclosure Statement	24.3	\$5,353.50
14	Other	0.3	\$72.00
21	Tax Issues	0.1	\$22.50
TOTAL		1,306.7	\$287,871.50

EXPENSE SUMMARY FOR COMPENSATION PERIOD

EXPENSE CATEGORY	AMOUNT
Filing Fees	\$200.00
Sheriffs' Fees	\$230.15
Transcripts	\$233.49
Outside Photocopies	\$9.00
Federal Express	\$412.57
Miscellaneous	\$1,682.00
Total Charges & Disbursements	\$2,761.21

**UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT
DISTRICT OF MAINE**

In re:

MONTREAL MAINE & ATLANTIC
RAILWAY, LTD.

Debtor.

Bk. No. 13-10670

Chapter 11

**FIRST INTERIM APPLICATION FOR COMPENSATION AND REIMBURSEMENT
OF EXPENSES FOR BERNSTEIN, SHUR, SAWYER & NELSON, P.A., AS COUNSEL
TO ROBERT J. KEACH, ESTATE REPRESENTATIVE, FOR THE PERIOD
DECEMBER 23, 2015 THROUGH AND INCLUDING JUNE 30, 2016**

Bernstein, Shur, Sawyer & Nelson, P.A. ("BSSN"), counsel to Robert J. Keach, the estate representative (the "Estate Representative") of the post-effective date estate of Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway, Ltd. ("MMA" or the "Debtor"),¹ submits this first application (the "Fee Application") seeking compensation for professional services and reimbursement of expenses on an interim basis for the period from December 23, 2015 through and including June 30, 2016 (the "Compensation Period"). In support of the Fee Application, BSSN states as follows:

JURISDICTION AND VENUE

1. This Court has jurisdiction over this matter pursuant to 28 U.S.C. §§ 157 and 1334. Venue is proper pursuant to 28 U.S.C. §§ 1408 and 1409. This matter is a core proceeding pursuant to 28 U.S.C. §157(b)(2). The statutory predicates for the relief sought herein are sections 327(a) and 330 of the Bankruptcy Code, Federal Rule of Bankruptcy Procedure 2016(a), and Rule 2016-1 of the local rules of this Court (the "Local Rules").

¹ In accordance with the Trustee's confirmed chapter 11 plan (the "Plan"), Robert J. Keach became the Estate Representative of the post-effective date estate of MMA on the effective date of the Plan, December 22, 2015. See Plan, § 6.1(a).

BACKGROUND

2. On August 7, 2013 (the “Petition Date”), the Debtor filed a voluntary petition for relief under chapter 11 of 11 U.S.C. § 101 et seq. (the “Bankruptcy Code”) in the United States Bankruptcy Court for the District of Maine (the “Bankruptcy Court”). On August 21, 2013, the United States Trustee (the “U.S. Trustee”) appointed Robert J. Keach as chapter 11 trustee (the “Trustee”) to serve in the Debtor’s chapter 11 case (the “Case”) pursuant to 11 U.S.C. § 1163.

3. On August 21, 2013, the Trustee filed his *Application for Order, Pursuant to Sections 327 and 328 of the Bankruptcy Code, Authorizing the Employment of Bernstein, Shur, Sawyer & Nelson, P.A., as Attorneys for the Trustee* [Docket No. 74] (the “Retention Application”). Thereafter, on August 28, 2013, the Court entered an order authorizing the employment of BSSN as counsel to the Trustee pursuant to sections 327 and 328 of the Bankruptcy Code [Docket No. 107] (the “Retention Order”).

4. As set forth in the Retention Order, BSSN was authorized to, inter alia, “[advise] the Trustee with respect to his powers and duties in the Trustee’s continued management and operation of the Debtor’s business and property,” “[take] all necessary action to protect and preserve the Debtor’s estate,” and “[perform] all other necessary legal services and providing all other necessary legal advice to the Trustee in connection with the Case.” *See Retention Order*, at 2–3. The Retention Order further provides that BSSN shall receive compensation on an hourly basis and in accordance with the applicable provisions of the Bankruptcy Code, the Federal Rules of Bankruptcy Procedure, the Local Rules, the United States Trustee Guidelines for Reviewing Applications for Compensation & Reimbursement of Expenses filed under 11 U.S.C. § 330 (the “UST Guidelines”), and any applicable orders of the Court. *See Retention Order*, at 1; *see also Retention Application*, ¶¶ 13–14.

5. On October 9, 2015, this Court entered the *Order Confirming Trustee's Revised First Amended Plan of Liquidation Dated July 15, 2015 and Authorizing and Directing Certain Actions in Connection Therewith* [D.E. 1801] (the "Confirmation Order"), which, among other things, confirmed the *Trustee's Revised First Amended Plan of Liquidation Dated July 15, 2015 (As Amended on October 8, 2015)* [D.E. 1822] (the "Plan").

6. The effective date of the Plan occurred on December 22, 2015 (the "Effective Date").

7. Pursuant to the Plan, *inter alia*: (a) the Estate Representative was entitled to retain professionals in the ordinary course of business and without further order of the Court, including any professionals previously retained by the Trustee; and (b) the Estate Representative's professionals must file fee applications for approval by the Court. *See* Plan at § 6.2(d).

8. On the Effective Date, the Estate Representative retained BSSN.

9. Since the Effective Date and throughout the Compensation Period, BSSN has worked with the Estate Representative to meet the challenges presented by this Case in a manner beneficial to the post-effective date estate of the Debtor (the "Post-Effective Date Estate") and the creditors of the Debtor's estate. The following discussion and materials annexed hereto cover the major categories of services for which allowance of compensation is sought.

COMPENSATION AND REIMBURSEMENT REQUEST

10. BSSN seeks allowance of compensation for professional services in the amount of \$287,871.50 and reimbursement of expenses incurred in rendering such services in the amount of \$2,761.21. Pursuant to Rule 2016(a) of the Federal Rules of Bankruptcy Procedure and Local Rule 2016-1(a)(3)(i), a detailed statement of professional services provided by BSSN to the Estate Representative during the Compensation Period (the "Billing Statement") is set forth on **Exhibit A**, annexed hereto and incorporated herein by reference. BSSN has carefully reviewed

the Billing Statement on a line-by-line basis to ensure that services have been billed under the correct fee category.²

11. Pursuant to Local Rule 2016-1(a)(3)(iv), a detailed statement setting forth billing rates, total hours billed, and total amounts billed for each professional and paraprofessional at BSSN during the Compensation Period and associated expenses incurred is contained in the tables located at the beginning of this Fee Application.

12. Other than an agreement between BSSN and the Estate Representative for the sharing of compensation with the Estate Representative as a shareholder of BSSN, no agreement or understanding exists between BSSN and any other entity for the sharing of compensation sought by this Fee Application. In addition, no payments have been made or promised to BSSN for services rendered or to be rendered in connection with the Case, except as set forth in the Retention Application and detailed in this Fee Application.

13. BSSN has substantial expertise in such areas as business restructuring and bankruptcy, energy and environmental law, and litigation and dispute resolution. Pursuant to Local Rule 2016-1(a)(3)(v), a brief biography of each BSSN professional and paraprofessional who has rendered services in connection with the fees and expenses described herein is set forth on **Exhibit B**, annexed hereto and incorporated herein by reference.

14. This Fee Application is BSSN's first application to this Court in this Case as counsel to the Estate Representative for compensation for professional services and reimbursement of expenses pursuant to sections 328 and 331 of the Bankruptcy Code, Rule 2016 of the Federal Rules of Bankruptcy Procedure, and Rule 2016-1 of the Local Rules. As required

² BSSN implemented twenty-two (22) task codes for specific categories of work to permit a more detailed analysis of the fees incurred. Given the multitude of attorneys and professionals involved and the number of task codes, inconsistencies are inevitable despite BSSN's best efforts to ensure that work on a specific topic is billed to a single task code.

by paragraph (b)(v) of the UST Guidelines, the Estate Representative has been given the opportunity to review this Fee Application and has approved the requested amount.

SUMMARY OF SERVICES

15. BSSN serves as legal counsel to the Estate Representative with respect to all bankruptcy matters that arise in or relate to the administration of the Debtor's Post-Effective Date Estate. In rendering professional services to the Estate Representative, BSSN's legal team includes professionals with extensive experience in bankruptcy, real estate, and litigation practices, among others. BSSN professionals have worked closely with the Estate Representative and his other professionals to coordinate assignments in order to maximize efficiency and avoid any duplication of effort.

16. All of the services for which BSSN requests compensation herein were rendered on behalf of the Estate Representative in connection with this Case, and all the time described on the attached exhibits represents the actual amount of time spent by BSSN professionals who rendered the described services.

17. BSSN does not wish to burden the Court with an overly detailed recitation of each and every matter with respect to which it has rendered services during the Compensation Period. Accordingly, this Fee Application is intended to serve as a summary description of the more significant services rendered by BSSN, and to highlight the benefits which have been conferred upon the creditors of the Debtor's estate as a result of BSSN's efforts. The following section provides an overview of certain of the significant services rendered by BSSN during the Compensation Period, organized by project category.³

³ The examples given under each task code or project category are not all-inclusive; **Exhibit A** contains comprehensive details for each code and category.

A. Case Administration

This project category includes services related to time spent assisting in the efficient administration of the Debtor's Post-Effective Date Estate. During the Compensation Period, services rendered by BSSN under this project category included:

- (a) Internal discussions and conferences with the Estate Representative regarding case strategy;
- (b) Miscellaneous filings and organization of documents, including ECF filings, affidavits of service, and communication with the Bankruptcy Court; and
- (c) Docketing case deadlines.

BSSN spent 57.8 hours on this project category resulting in \$12,042.50 in associated fees.

B. Claims Administration and Objections

This project category includes services related to claims administration and objections. During the Compensation Period, services rendered by BSSN professionals under this project category included:

- i. Analysis of the Debtor's claims register;
- ii. Motion practice regarding certain motions for allowance of administrative claims;
- iii. Preparation for, defense of and taking of depositions; document review and production; evidentiary hearing preparation and attendance; and post-trial briefing regarding certain claims objections; and
- iv. Analysis regarding and opposition to certain motions for leave to late file claims.

BSSN spent 230.0 hours on this project category resulting in \$49,499.00 in associated fees.

C. Fee/Employment Applications

This project category includes services related to the preparation and prosecution of final fee applications for the Trustee and his professionals. During the Compensation Period, BSSN

prepared, filed and served the fee applications of, *inter alia*, the Trustee [D.E. 2044], BSSN [D.E. 1958], Development Specialists, Inc. [D.E. 1977], Baker Newman & Noyes, LLC [D.E. 1991], and Kugler Kandestin, LLP [D.E. 1988]. BSSN spent 71.4 hours on this project category resulting in \$15,809.00 in associated fees.

D. Litigation

This project category relates to time spent conducting legal research, drafting and filing various motions and pleadings, and the initiation of, as well as defense against, certain adversary proceedings, and time for related court appearances. During the Compensation Period, services rendered by BSSN under this project category include:

- i. Research relating to claims under the Carmack Amendment;
- ii. Preparation for and attendance at hearing on motion to dismiss certain avoidance actions brought by the Trustee (UFTA complaint against Wheeling & Lake Erie Railway Company (“Wheeling”) and 2011 Transaction Complaint);
- iii. Research for and drafting of a motion to transfer certain Derailment-related personal injury tort and wrongful death claims to the United States Court for the District of Maine (the “District Court”) and responsive pleadings;
- iv. Defend against and oversee extensive discovery by Wheeling; research for, strategic discussion of, analysis regarding, and draft reply in response to Wheeling’s objection to Trustee’s motion for summary judgment; preparation for and attendance at hearing on Trustee’s motion to dismiss.
- v. Respond to Wheeling’s motion strike expert designation (including through additional disclosures) and court appearances related to same.
- vi. Docketing of various deadlines related to the above; and
- vii. Document review and production in connection with Wheeling’s document requests.

BSSN spent 921.5 hours on this project category resulting in \$204,737.50 in associated fees.

ACTUAL AND NECESSARY DISBURSEMENTS

18. As set forth on **Exhibit A** attached hereto, BSSN has disbursed \$2,793.27 as expenses incurred in providing professional services during the Compensation Period. The expenses incurred arise from, *inter alia*, Federal Express charges, filing and services fees, and transcripts. These expenses represent the out-of-pocket disbursements incurred during the regular course of the provision of legal services.

THE REQUESTED COMPENSATION AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES SHOULD BE ALLOWED ON AN INTERIM BASIS

19. Pursuant to section 330 of the Bankruptcy Code, the Court may award professionals “reasonable compensation for actual, necessary services.” 11 U.S.C. § 330(a)(1)(A). In evaluating the amount of reasonable compensation to be awarded, the Court should consider:

the nature, the extent, and the value of such services, taking into account all relevant factors including:

- (A) the time spent on such services;
- (B) the rates charged for such services;
- (C) whether the services were necessary to the administration of, or beneficial at the time at which the service was rendered toward the completion of, a case under this title;
- (D) whether the services were performed within a reasonable amount of time commensurate with the complexity, importance, and nature of the problem, issue, or task addressed;
- (E) with respect to a professional person, whether the person is board certified or otherwise has demonstrated skill and experience in the bankruptcy field; and
- (F) whether the compensation is reasonable based on the customary compensation charged by comparably skilled practitioners in cases other than cases under this title.

11 U.S.C. §§ 330(a)(3)(A–F).

20. BSSN submits that the services for which it seeks compensation in this Fee Application were necessary for and beneficial to the Post-Effective Date Estate. The services rendered by BSSN were performed economically, effectively, and efficiently. Accordingly, the compensation requested herein is reasonable in light of the nature, extent, and value of such services to the Debtor.

21. The work conducted was carefully assigned to appropriate professionals or paraprofessionals according to the experience and level of expertise required for each particular task. Whenever possible and where appropriate, BSSN sought to minimize the costs of its services by utilizing associates and paraprofessionals.

22. In sum, the services rendered by BSSN were necessary and beneficial to the Post-Effective Date Estate and such services were consistently performed in a timely manner, commensurate with the complexity and nature of the issues involved. Accordingly, approval of compensation sought herein is warranted.

[remainder of page intentionally left blank]

CONCLUSION

WHEREFORE, BSSN respectfully requests that the Court enter an order: (a) approving on an interim basis, pursuant to 11 U.S.C. § 330, \$290,638.71 in fees and expenses for BSSN in its capacity as counsel to the Estate Representative during the Compensation Period, consisting of (i) compensation for services rendered in the amount of \$287,871.50 and (ii) reimbursement of expenses in the amount of \$2,767.21; and (b) granting such other and further relief as the Court deems just and proper.

DATED: August 1, 2016

BERNSTEIN, SHUR, SAWYER & NELSON

By:

/s/ Sam Anderson

Sam Anderson, Esq.

Lindsay K. Zahradka, Esq. (admitted *pro hac vice*)

100 Middle Street

P.O. Box 9729

Portland, ME 04104

Telephone: (207) 774-1200

Facsimile: (207) 774-1127

E-mail: sanderson@bernsteinshur.com

lzahradka@bernsteinshur.com

*Counsel for Robert J. Keach, Estate Representative
of the Post-Effective Date Estate of Montreal Maine
& Atlantic Railway, Ltd.*



Bernstein Shur
Counselors at Law
I.D. #01-0378211

100 Middle Street
P.O. Box 9729
Portland, Maine 04104-5029
(207) 774-1200

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

Fees for Professional Services 12/28/15 Through 06/30/16	\$287,871.50
Expenses 12/28/15 Through 06/30/16	\$2,767.21

Total This Invoice	\$290,638.71

----- S E R V I C E S S U M M A R Y -----

Admin			
CHRISTINE B. BERTSCH	6.20	115.00	\$713.00
TOTAL FOR Admin	6.20	115.00	\$713.00
Associate			
ROMA DESAI	177.40	225.00	\$39,915.00
TIMOTHY MCKEON	290.50	219.86	\$63,868.00
LINDSAY ZAHRADKA	391.90	224.99	\$88,173.50
TOTAL FOR Associate	859.80	223.26	191,956.50
Inactive			
BODIE COLWELL	3.50	220.00	\$770.00
MICHAEL SIEDBAND	35.60	219.61	\$7,818.00
TOTAL FOR Inactive	39.10	219.64	\$8,588.00
Of Counsel			
JESSICA LEWIS	43.40	275.00	\$11,935.00
TOTAL FOR Of Counsel	43.40	275.00	\$11,935.00
Paralegal			
PETER NICHOLS	18.90	180.00	\$3,402.00
KARLA QUIRK	149.90	170.00	\$25,483.00
ANGELA STEWART	153.60	205.00	\$31,488.00
TOTAL FOR Paralegal	322.40	187.26	\$60,373.00

Please return the enclosed REMITTANCE COPY with your payment to ensure proper credit to your account.

Sal Shareholder

EBEN ALBERT	0.30	240.00	\$72.00
TOTAL FOR Sal Shareholder	0.30	240.00	\$72.00

Shareholder

SAM ANDERSON	21.10	404.17	\$8,528.00
KATHERINE JOYCE	2.00	280.00	\$560.00
PAUL MCDONALD	12.40	415.00	\$5,146.00
TOTAL FOR Shareholder	35.50	400.96	\$14,234.00

Bernstein Shur

Counselors at Law
I.D. #01-0378211

100 Middle Street
P.O. Box 9729
Portland, Maine 04104-5029
(207) 774-1200

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

01 Asset Analysis and Recovery

Date	ATTY	Hours	
02/10/16	DSA	0.10	Reviewed e-mails and e-mailed co-counsel concerning issues with status of trestle litigation (.1).

Total 01		0.10	

03 Business Operations

Date	ATTY	Hours	
05/05/16	LKZ	0.10	Review emails re: sale of Derby property.
06/22/16	LKZ	0.60	Review email re: Derby acquisition emails, docs (.5) and emails w/B.Keach re: same (.1).
06/22/16	DSA	0.10	Reviewed e-mails concerning issues with transfer of Derby facility to the town (.1)

Total 03		0.80	

04 Case Administration

Date	ATTY	Hours	
01/04/16	KQ	1.10	Obtain from the docket pleadings to transmit to Monitor
01/11/16	ALS	0.10	Update docket scheduling re Consent Motion for Entry of an Order Authorizing Rejection of Lease Agreements with Caterpillar Financial Services Corporation
01/11/16	ALS	0.10	Update docket scheduling re First Interim Fee Application of Paul Hastings LLP
01/11/16	ALS	0.20	Update docket scheduling re Motion to File Claim After Claims Bar Date Filed by Tafisa Canada Inc. and Motion to File Claim After Claims Bar Date filed by Jacques Laprise, Steven Halle, Gessner Blenkhorn, Suzanne Chauvin, Isabelle Beaudry
01/12/16	DSA	0.60	Reviewed e-mails and e-mailed parties concerning issues with charge from the State concerning the tie pile (.2); telephone conference with F. Caruso concerning issues with Wheeling claims (.2); reviewed e-mails

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

			and e-mailed Trustee concerning issues with Wheeling payments (.2)
01/12/16	RND	0.10	Meeting and email with S. Anderson re: Order granting motion to abandon Tie File
01/14/16	ALS	0.10	Docket scheduling re continued hearing re: Motion to Reconsider
01/20/16	ALS	0.30	Update service list
01/21/16	ALS	0.10	Docket scheduling re Second Interim and Final Fee Application of Covington & Burling
01/22/16	ALS	0.20	Emails from/to L. Zahradka re inquiry by Tr Veilleux
01/22/16	KQ	1.00	Obtain from the docket pleadings requested by the Monitor and transmit same.
01/25/16	KQ	0.10	Change of address due to returned envelope for creditor New England Independent Transmissions
01/26/16	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alert
01/27/16	ALS	0.20	Docket scheduling re hearing re: Amended (Corrected) Motion to File Claim After Claims Bar Date Filed by Tafisa Canada Inc. (.1); Amended (Corrected) Motion to File Claim After Claims Bar Date Filed by Tafisa Canada Inc. (.1)
01/27/16	ALS	0.20	Update master service list
01/27/16	KQ	0.40	Respond to request by creditor to re-forward service of pleadings.
01/28/16	KQ	1.20	Obtain from the docket pleadings in preparation for transmittal to the Monitor
01/28/16	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alerts
01/29/16	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alerts
02/01/16	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alerts
02/01/16	DSA	0.10	Reviewed orders entered in case relating to Irving and Wheeling (.1)
02/01/16	RND	0.10	Review email with R. Keach re: CP subsidiaries

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

02/04/16	KQ	0.50	Prepare request for copy of transcripts of hearing on Disclosure Statement and e-mail same to USBC
02/08/16	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alerts
02/10/16	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alert
02/10/16	ALS	0.30	Emails from/to L. Zahradka re GERSCO settlement agreement (.1); review electronic files re same (.2)
02/10/16	DSA	0.10	Reviewed e-mails concerning issues with CP litigation (.1).
02/11/16	PM	0.10	Review press report of continued ramifications of derailment in Lac Megantic.
02/12/16	RND	0.10	Meeting with R. Keach re: research re: indemnity claims
02/12/16	ALS	0.10	Update docket scheduling re Wheeling's Motion to Enforce Payment of Allowed Administrative Claim
02/12/16	ALS	0.10	Email to M. Paione re scheduling of hearing on 506c motion
02/12/16	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alert
02/12/16	ALS	0.10	Docket scheduling re Application for Compensation filed by Molleur Law Office
02/15/16	LKZ	1.00	Substantial emails w/various parties re: status of open items.
02/16/16	ALS	0.20	Emails from/to J. Smith re docket scheduling hearings and deadlines in case
02/16/16	ALS	0.10	Docket scheduling re Second Interim and Final Application of Paul Hastings LLP
02/16/16	ALS	0.10	Review email from L. Zahradka re filing of status report
02/17/16	LKZ	0.40	Review upcoming deadlines (.2); call w/MMA creditor re: pleadings received (.2).
02/18/16	LKZ	0.20	Review upcoming deadlines.
02/18/16	ALS	0.20	Review docket for upcoming hearings and response deadlines

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

02/19/16	ALS	0.20	Review email from L. Zahradka re update to docket scheduling (.1); update docket scheduling re Court's Order on Trustee's Objection to Claim 242,243,257,259 of New Brunswick Southern Railway Company Limited and Maine Northern Railway Company (.1)
02/19/16	ALS	0.40	Emails from/to L. Zahradka re Rail Funding Agreements (.2); review documents with respect to Rail Funding Agreements (.2)
02/19/16	LKZ	0.10	Review upcoming case deadlines and emails w/B.Keach re: same.
02/22/16	ALS	0.20	Office conference with T. McKeon re executory contracts (.1); email to R. Keach and T. McKeon attaching management agreement (.1)
02/22/16	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alert
02/22/16	ALS	0.60	Docket scheduling re Application for Compensation filed by Molleur Law Office, Third Interim Fee Application of Verrill Dana LLP, Objection Deadlines re: Final fee Applications of BSSN, DSI, Kugler Kandestin, BNN, Shaw Fishman and Prime Clerk, hearings and response deadlines re Claims Objections
02/22/16	ALS	0.10	Docket scheduling re extended deadline for Trustee to file his final fee application
02/22/16	ALS	0.30	Update docket scheduling re claims objections
02/22/16	TJM	0.10	Confer A Stewart re Rail World Management Agreement
02/23/16	ALS	0.20	Update docket scheduling re Wheeling litigation
02/23/16	ALS	0.10	Update docket scheduling re preference cases
02/23/16	ALS	0.30	Update docket scheduling re claims objections
02/23/16	ALS	0.10	Docket scheduling re Estate Representative's Deadline to file Objection to Bangor Savings Bank's Claim

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

02/23/16	ALS	0.20	Update docket scheduling re applications for administrative expenses
02/23/16	ALS	0.20	Emails from/to K. Quirk re inquiry from recipient on email distribution list
02/24/16	ALS	0.20	Update docket scheduling re claims objections
02/24/16	ALS	0.20	Update docket scheduling re Wheeling litigation
02/24/16	ALS	0.60	Review docket for upcoming hearings and objection deadlines (.3); confirm docket scheduling is complete for same (.3)
02/26/16	ALS	0.10	Update docket scheduling re Applications for Allowance and Payment of Administrative Expenses
02/26/16	ALS	0.10	Docket scheduling deadline to file Notice of Appeal re: Court's Order Sustaining in Part and Overruling in Part Trustee's Objection to Proofs of Claim filed by NBSR and MNR
02/26/16	DSA	0.10	Reviewed filings entered in case (.1)
02/26/16	TJM	0.20	Check status re withdrawal of applications for admin expenses re Settling Parties
02/29/16	TJM	0.10	Email local counsel for First Union re withdrawal of admin application (0.1)
02/29/16	ALS	0.10	Update docket scheduling re Applications for Allowance and Payment of Administrative Expenses
03/02/16	ALS	0.20	Docket scheduling re Objection to Proof of Claim Filed by Bangor Savings Bank on the Basis that Such Claim is Unenforceable Against the Debtor
03/03/16	LKZ	0.40	Review emails re case status.
03/03/16	KQ	2.90	Obtain pleadings from the docket in preparation for transmittal to the Monitor
03/04/16	KQ	0.50	Attention to mail returned from the U.S. Post office as undeliverable and update creditor matrix where possible

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

03/04/16	LKZ	0.20	Review emails re: case status.
03/05/16	LKZ	0.10	Review case emails
03/07/16	KQ	0.40	Complete download of pleadings for transmittal to the Monitor and e-mail to S. Bourguine at Richter regarding same.
03/07/16	LKZ	0.30	Review case emails.
03/08/16	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alert
03/09/16	LKZ	0.90	Review case emails.
03/10/16	LKZ	0.90	Review case emails.
03/10/16	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alert
03/11/16	ALS	0.20	Docket scheduling re Appellant Designation re Appeal on Order Concerning Claims
03/11/16	ALS	0.10	Docket scheduling re Trustee's Final Fee Application
03/11/16	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alert
03/11/16	DSA	0.10	Reviewed e-mails and e-mailed parties concerning issues with operation of Derby facility (.1).
03/14/16	DSA	0.10	Conference with L. Zahradka concerning issues with Derby facility (.1).
03/14/16	KAJ	0.60	Calls with Attorney Zahradka regarding alleged scrapping operations and notice of termination for stormwater general permit (.3)(.2); analysis re: same (.1)
03/14/16	KQ	0.10	E-mail from and to Matt Farnsworth at DSI regarding the MMA escrow account
03/14/16	ALS	0.20	Email to R. Keach and T. McKeon re CP's Notice regarding Statement for March 22, 2016 Status Conference (.1); update pleadings with CP's Notice regarding Statement for March 22, 2016 Status Conference (.1)

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

03/14/16	LKZ	2.70	Confer w/A.Cummings (.2), K.Quirk (.2), A.Stewart (.2) re: upcoming case deadlines, filings; analysis re: same (1.1); call w/ME DEP re: permit issue (.2); confer w/K.Joyce (.2), S.Anderson (.1), F.Caruso (.3) re: environmental issue; confer w/R.Desai re: background for Carmack complaint (.2).
03/15/16	LKZ	1.00	Calls w/K.Joyce re: environmental issue (.3); fill out permit for termination (.2) and emails w/F.Caruso (.2), B.Keach (.1) & K.Joyce (.2) re: same.
03/15/16	ALS	0.20	Update docket scheduling re Third Omnibus Claim Objection as it pertains to Telus's claim
03/15/16	KAJ	0.70	Call with DEP staff regarding notice of termination and scrapping activities conducted in the fall of 2015 (.3); correspond with Attorney Zahradka regarding same (.2); read email from Mr. Caruso to prevent future scrapping (.2); analysis re: same (.1).
03/16/16	KAJ	0.30	Call with DEP to confirm no ongoing scrapping operation.
03/16/16	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alert
03/16/16	LKZ	0.50	Draft status update of various matters for B.Keach.
03/17/16	LKZ	2.60	Emails w/FRA re: remittance of remainder of carve-out (.2) and analysis re: same (1.8); call w/F.Caruso re: same (.6).
03/17/16	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alert
03/18/16	LKZ	2.10	Confer w/B.Keach re: status update (.1); emails w/K.Joyce re: termination of use permit (.1); review upcoming deadlines and pending pleadings (1.1) and confer w/B.Keach re: same (.8)
03/21/16	LKZ	0.40	Analysis re: FRA Carve-Out.

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

03/21/16	ALS	0.20	Update docket scheduling re First Union Rail's Application for Allowance and Payment of Administrative Expenses
03/21/16	ALS	0.20	Update press file with news alert (.1); email article to R. Keach (.1)
03/22/16	ALS	0.10	Update docket scheduling re deadline for parties to file supplemental pleadings re: CP's Motion for Jury Trial
03/22/16	ALS	0.20	Emails from/to J. Smith re docket scheduling upcoming hearings and objection deadlines
03/22/16	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alert
03/22/16	KAJ	0.40	Correspond with Ms. Wood at DEP regarding activities on Derby site (.2); submit Notice of Termination (.2)
03/22/16	LKZ	0.50	Review upcoming deadlines (.4) and update B.Keach re: same (.1)
03/23/16	LKZ	0.50	Review upcoming deadlines (.3) and emails w/A.Stewart re: same (.2).
03/24/16	LKZ	0.10	Review upcoming deadlines.
03/24/16	ALS	0.20	Review and reply to email from S. Anderson re settlement agreement with D&O carriers
03/24/16	ALS	0.30	Update docket scheduling re hearing on claims objections
03/24/16	ALS	0.30	Review Court calendar for upcoming hearings and deadlines for main case
03/24/16	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alerts
03/25/16	ALS	0.40	Email to T. McKéon re 506(c) motion (.1); review files for materials supporting 506(c) motion (.3)
03/25/16	KQ	1.10	Obtain from the docket pleadings to send to the Monitor
03/25/16	LKZ	0.10	Call w/A.Stewart re: status of pending matters.

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

03/28/16	LKZ	1.20	Review various orders entered (.5) and emails w/A.Cummings re: same (.2); emails w/B.Keach re: same (.2); review calendared deadlines (.2) and emails w/A.Stewart re: same (.1).
03/29/16	LKZ	0.20	Review upcoming deadlines.
03/29/16	KQ	0.90	Obtain from the docket MMA pleadings for transmittal to the Monitor and e-mail to S. Bourgine @ Richter regarding same.
03/29/16	ALS	0.20	Update docket scheduling based on orders approving final fee applications and claims objections
03/30/16	ALS	0.10	Docket scheduling re appellant designation
03/30/16	ALS	0.10	Update docket scheduling re hearings on fee applications
03/30/16	ALS	0.20	Email to M. Paione re hearing on motion for summary judgment in Wheeling adversary case (.1); emails from/to T. McKeon re hearing on motion for summary judgment in Wheeling adversary case (.1)
03/31/16	ALS	0.20	Update docket scheduling re Amended Objection to Proof of Claim Filed by Fred's Plumbing and Heating, Inc. on the Basis that Certain of the Amounts Asserted in Such Claim are Unenforceable Under the Bankruptcy
03/31/16	LKZ	0.10	Review upcoming deadlines.
04/01/16	KQ	0.10	Finalize and file the Certificate of Service related to the reply in support of the objection to Center Beam's claim
04/05/16	DSA	0.10	Reviewed e-mails and orders entered in case (.1)
04/05/16	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alert
04/11/16	KQ	0.20	Finalize and file the Motion to Extend Time to File the Final Decree
04/11/16	KQ	0.20	Update creditor matrix with change of address for creditor MD-UN

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

04/12/16	KQ	0.20	Draft and file via ECF the Certificate of Service related to the motion to extend time to file the final account and application for final decree
04/12/16	DSA	0.10	Reviewed e-mails and orders entered in case (.1)
04/12/16	ALS	0.20	Review docket for scheduling purposes
04/13/16	KQ	0.80	Obtain from the docket the most recent pleadings and transmit the same to the Monitor.
04/14/16	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alert
04/18/16	DSA	0.10	Reviewed monthly operating reports (.1)
04/19/16	ALS	0.10	Transmit Affidavit of Robert J. Keach to A. Bayus
04/20/16	ALS	0.30	Emails from/to L. Zahradka and K. Quirk re Currie and Durant Termination Letters
04/22/16	ALS	0.10	Update docket scheduling re Application for Administrative Expenses filed by Creditor XL Mechanical & Energy Management Services
04/22/16	ALS	0.20	Docket scheduling re Omnibus Notice of Hearing for (A) Estate Representative's Objection to Administrative Claim Application of Jeffrey C. Durant and (B) Estate Representative's Objection to Administrative Claim Application of Stephen C. Currie
04/22/16	ALS	0.10	Docket scheduling re Motion for Relief from Judgment and Reconsideration of Claim Trustees Third Omnibus Objection to Proofs of Claim That Will be Satisfied Under the CCAA Plan
04/25/16	ALS	0.10	Update docket scheduling
04/25/16	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alert
04/26/16	KQ	3.20	Prepare pleadings from the docket for transmittal to the Monitor

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

04/27/16	ALS	0.30	Review Court docket for docket scheduling purposes
05/03/16	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alert
05/04/16	ALS	0.20	Review docket and update docket scheduling
05/04/16	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alert
05/05/16	ALS	0.10	Emails to/from L. Zahradka re electronic storage agreement
05/09/16	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alert
05/10/16	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alert
05/11/16	ALS	0.10	Update file with news alert
05/12/16	ALS	0.10	Update docket scheduling re Motion for Relief from Judgment and Reconsideration of Claim Trustees Third Omnibus Objection to Proofs of Claim That Will be Satisfied Under the CCAA Plan
05/16/16	KQ	0.10	E-mail from and to M. Farnsworth at DSI regarding MMA escrow account
05/16/16	KQ	1.50	Download pleadings for transmission to the Monitor
05/18/16	DSA	0.10	Reviewed recently filed pleadings
05/21/16	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alert
05/21/16	ALS	0.10	Update docket scheduling re Preliminary Hearing re: Surcharge Motion
05/23/16	ALS	0.10	Review docket and update calendar re hearing on Estate Representative's Objection to Administrative Claim Application of Jeffrey Durant
05/24/16	ALS	0.10	Update docket scheduling re continued hearing on Objection to Bangor Savings Bank's Proof of Claim
05/24/16	DSA	0.10	Reviewed orders entered in case (.1)
05/25/16	ALS	0.30	Translation of CCAA Court order for R. Keach
05/26/16	RND	0.20	Review L. Zahradka's email summary of Carmack Litigation and provide comments/edits to same

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

05/27/16	ALS	0.30	Review Court docket for upcoming hearings and objection/response deadlines
05/31/16	ALS	0.30	Email to T. McKeon re Order on Motion for a Fourteenth Order Extending the Stay Period and for Approval of Professional Fees (.1); review CCAA pleadings (.2)
05/31/16	LKZ	0.20	Review CCAA order re: extension of stay (.1); call w/A.Bayus re: same and emails w/B.Keach re: same (.1).
06/01/16	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alert
06/02/16	ALS	0.10	Review email from T. McKeon re monthly operating report
06/06/16	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alert
06/06/16	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alerts
06/06/16	ALS	0.30	Review Court docket for upcoming hearings/response deadlines for docket scheduling purposes
06/07/16	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alert
06/08/16	KQ	0.10	E-mail from and to K. Byers at DSI regarding MMA escrow account
06/08/16	KQ	1.60	Prepare pleadings for transmission to the Monitor
06/13/16	ALS	0.10	Review Court docket for upcoming hearings/response deadlines
06/17/16	KQ	0.30	Finalize and file the withdrawal as attorney for record for M. Siedband
06/21/16	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alerts
06/22/16	ALS	0.20	Emails to/from T. McKeon re Evidox hosting site
06/22/16	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alert
06/23/16	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alerts
06/24/16	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alert
06/27/16	ALS	0.10	Update press file with news alert
06/27/16	ALS	0.10	Emails from/to T. McKeon re preparation for upcoming filings

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

06/27/16	ALS	0.20	Review docket for upcoming hearings/response deadlines
06/30/16	ALS	0.20	Docket scheduling re Motion to Expedite Hearing & Motion of Family Members for Order: (I) Enforcing Confirmed Chapter 11 Plan; (II) Holding Contemnors in Civil Contempt
Total 04		57.80	

05 Claims Administration and Objections

Date	ATTY	Hours	
01/04/16	ALS	0.50	Multiple revisions to claims list in advance of meeting with L. Zahradka
01/04/16	ALS	1.00	Review claims register
01/04/16	ALS	0.30	Meeting with L. Zahradka re claims review project
01/04/16	LKZ	1.50	Emails w/A.Stewart re: claims review (.2); confer w/ A. Stewart regarding same (.3); call w/F.Caruso re: same (.2); begin review of claims register (.8).
01/05/16	LKZ	6.20	Review of claims register (5.1); review of plan and DS I/c/w same (.5); draft email to B.Keach re: same (.2); confer w/ (.2) and emails w/ (.2) A.Stewart re: same.
01/05/16	ALS	1.20	Revisions to claims spreadsheet per L. Zahradka's request (.3); emails from/to L. Zahradka re revisions to claims spreadsheet (.2); review assigned claims (.7)
01/06/16	ALS	1.30	Office conference with L. Zahradka and K. Quirk re claims review (.3); emails from/to L. Zahradka re claims review questions (.1); continue review of filed claims (.9)
01/06/16	ALS	0.20	Continue review of claims
01/06/16	LKZ	0.40	Confer w/A.Stewart & K.Quirk re: claims review status (0.3); follow-up e-mails re: same (0.1)

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

01/06/16	KQ	0.30	Office conference with L. Zahradka and A. Stewart regarding review of claims submitted
01/08/16	LKZ	0.40	Emails w/M.Toups re: continuing motions to late file claims (.2); emails w/B.Keach (.1), K.Quirk (.1) re: same.
01/08/16	ALS	1.40	Emails to/from L. Zahradka re claims review (.2); review assigned claims (1.2)
01/11/16	ALS	0.30	Office conference with K. Quirk re claims list and claims review project (.2); email to K. Quirk re date of bar deadline (.1)
01/11/16	ALS	0.20	Emails from/to K. Quirk re agreed request to continue hearings on motions on late filed claims
01/11/16	LKZ	0.40	Emails w/Toups re: motions to late file claims (.2); emails w/K.Quirk re: same (.1); confer w/B.Keach re: same (.1).
01/11/16	KQ	0.10	Enter onto the docket the Agreed Request to Continuance related to the hearings on the motion to file late claims by Tafisa Canada and creditors Beaudry, Chauvin, Blenkhorn, Halle and Laprise.
01/12/16	KQ	2.50	Conduct review of Proof of Claims ahead of preparation of claim objections
01/12/16	ALS	0.40	Continue work on claims review
01/13/16	KQ	0.80	Continued review of claims submitted in MMA to prepare for claims objections
01/14/16	KQ	2.70	Continued review of claims submitted in MMA for preparation of claims objections
01/27/16	KQ	0.20	E-mail to and from L. Zahradka regarding claims MMA claim review.
01/27/16	KQ	2.10	Continued review of proofs of claim
01/27/16	LKZ	0.20	Emails w/K.Quirk re: claims review issues.

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

01/28/16	ALS	0.20	Emails from/to J. Smith re Amended Motion (and Corrected) for Extension of Time to File Proof of Claims filed by counsel for Isabelle Beaudry, Gessner Blenkhorn, Steven Halle, Jacques Laprise, and Tafisa Canada Inc.
01/29/16	LKZ	1.00	Confer w/B.Keach re: late filed claims motions (.5); draft consensual order re: same (.4); emails w/B.Keach re: same (.1).
02/01/16	LKZ	0.50	Emails w/B.Keach re: consensual order to certain motions to late file claims (.1); emails w/opposing counsel re: same (.2); prep for hearing on same (.2).
02/01/16	ALS	0.20	Filing of consent order re Beaudry Motion to Allow Late Filed Claims
02/02/16	DSA	0.10	Reviewed motion relating to filing POCs after the bar date (.1)
02/02/16	LKZ	1.30	Travel to (.5), prep for (.2), attend (.3), travel from (.2) hearing on motions to late file claims; emails w/B.Keach & M.Toups re: same (.1).
02/04/16	LKZ	0.30	Prep for 2/5 hearing on MN/NB Railways ruling (.1) and confer w/B.Keach re: same (.1); confer w/K.Quirk re: claims review (.1).
02/04/16	KQ	0.30	Prepare for (.2) and attend (.1) office conference with L. Zahradka regarding review of MMA claims
02/05/16	LKZ	2.00	Travel to (.5), prep for (.2), attend (.6), travel from (.2) oral ruling on MN/NB RRs claim objection; confer w/B.Keach re: same (.2); emails w/F.Caruso re: same (.2); emails w/A.Cummings re: transcript for same (.1).

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

02/08/16	LKZ	0.80	Review analysis re: MN/NB Claim amounts (.2); review exhibits from trial re: invoice (.1); emails w/F.Caruso (.1), A.Lepene (.1) re: same; draft stip re: amount of claims (.2); draft analysis for setoff (.1).
02/08/16	ALS	0.10	Docket scheduling deadline to file Notice of Appeal re Trustee's Objection to Claim 242,243,257,259 of New Brunswick Southern Railway Company Limited and Maine Northern Railway Company Limited
02/08/16	ALS	0.10	Docket scheduling deadline for parties to file a stipulated order or joint pretrial scheduling order setting forth deadlines for further proceedings re Trustee's Objection to Irving Claims
02/08/16	ALS	0.10	Emails from/to L. Zahradka re CCAA claims
02/09/16	ALS	1.30	Complete claims review
02/09/16	ALS	0.30	Office conference with K. Quirk re claims objections and preparation of schedule of WD claims
02/09/16	LKZ	6.90	Emails (.1) and call w/A.Lepene re: stip for MN/NB RRs (.2); confer w/B.Keach re: same (.5); draft pretrial status report (1.0), research re: same (.5) and emails w/B.Keach re: same (.2); revise same (.1); review claims register (2.1) and review claims analysis from A.Stewart and K.Quirk (2.0); draft email to B.Keach re: same (.2).
02/09/16	KQ	3.20	Begin preparation of exhibits of omnibus claim objections
02/10/16	KQ	3.10	Continued preparation of exhibits related to the omnibus claim objections
02/10/16	LKZ	4.80	Revise claim analysis (3.1); several emails w/B.Keach re: same (.5) and substantial revisions to same (1.2).

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

02/10/16	ALS	0.20	Review emails from R. Keach and L. Zahradka re claims
02/10/16	ALS	0.20	Office conference with K. Quirk re service of claims objections
02/10/16	DSA	0.40	Reviewed e-mails and conference with LZ concerning issues with BSB debt (.2); reviewed additional e-mails and conference with LZ concerning issues with BSB claims (.2).
02/11/16	DSA	0.10	Reviewed e-mails from parties concerning issues with amount of BSB claims and collateral for claims (.1)
02/11/16	LKZ	3.90	Emails w/K.Quirk re: exhibits for omnibus claims objections (.2) and analysis I/c/ therewith (.5); draft first omnibus claims objection (1.2) and review exhibits therefor (.4); emails w/B.Keach re: same (.2); emails w/A.Lepene re: pre-trial status report (.1); draft second (.4), third (.4), fourth (.2) omnibus claims objections and emails w/B.Keach re: same (.1); revise same (.2).
02/11/16	KQ	4.00	Continued preparation of exhibits for the omnibus claims objection
02/12/16	KQ	0.10	Office conference with L. Zahradka regarding preparation of notices and proposed orders for omnibus claim objections
02/12/16	KQ	1.30	Draft notices for first omnibus objection related to duplicative, late filed and noncompliant claims
02/12/16	LKZ	1.80	Revise fourth omnibus claim objection (.3); draft fifth and sixth omnibus claims objections (.3); revise second and third omnibus claims objection (.3); confer w/K.Quirk re: notices for same (.3) and emails w/K.Quirk re: same (.2); draft FOO for first omnibus claims objection (.2); confer

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

			w/B.Keach re: service for same (.2).
02/12/16	DSA	0.20	Reviewed e-mails and filings relating to Wheeling administrative claims and wrongful death claims (.2)
02/16/16	DSA	0.10	Reviewed e-mails relating to fee applications and extension of deadlines (.1).
02/16/16	DSA	0.10	Reviewed motion relating to Irving Railroad claims
02/16/16	DSA	0.10	Reviewed e-mails relating to fee applications and extension of deadlines (.1).
02/16/16	LKZ	3.50	Revise NOH for omnibus claims objections (.4); revise exhibits to omnibus claims objections to include page references (.8); emails w/K.Quirk re: creation of exhibits (.2) and confer w/K.Quirk re: same (.2); emails (.2) and call (.2) w/A.Lepene re: pre-trial status report; emails w/B.Keach re: same (.2); revisions to status report (.5); research re: service of omnibus claims objections (.7) and email w/K.Quirk re: same (.1).
02/16/16	KQ	4.50	Continued preparation of exhibits, proposed orders and notices for omnibus claims objections
02/16/16	KQ	0.20	Finalize and file the Status Report and Request for Judgment Regarding Trustees Objection to Proofs of Claim Filed by New Brunswick Southern Railway Company Limited and Maine Northern Railway Company
02/16/16	KQ	0.30	Draft and file the Certificate of Service related to the Status Report and Request for Judgment Regarding Trustees Objection to Proofs of Claim Filed by New Brunswick Southern Railway Company Limited and Maine Northern Railway Company

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

02/17/16	KQ	2.20	Continued preparation of exhibits for omnibus claims objections
02/17/16	KQ	2.30	Finalize and file via ECF the omnibus claims objections
02/17/16	KQ	2.50	Begin preparation of service of the omnibus claims objections
02/17/16	LKZ	3.20	Draft response to MN/NB RRs' status report (.2); emails w/B.Keach re: same (.1) and K.Quirk re: same (.1); revise NOHs and FOOs for omnibus claims objections (.8); review exhibits to omnibus claims objections (.2) and emails (.2) and various conferences (.2) w/K.Quirk re: filing and service of same; draft objection to claims improperly asserted to be secured (1.4).
02/17/16	DSA	0.30	Reviewed filings relating to claims of Irving Railroads (.1); reviewed certain claims objections filings (.2)
02/17/16	ALS	0.40	Filing of Trustees Response to New Brunswick Southern Railway Company Limited and Maine Northern Railway Companys Status Report and Request for Judgment (.2); preparation and filing of Certificate of Service re same (.2)
02/18/16	LKZ	5.10	Analysis re: MDOT asserted secured claim (.5) and draft objection to same (.5); analysis re: ME dept of revenue claim (.4) and emails w/B.Keach re: same (.2); draft objection to Sainte-Hyacinthe Claim (.8); draft objection to Mont-Saint-Gregoire claim (1.1); draft objection to Sherbrooke claim (.9); draft objection to Progress Rail Leasing Claim (.7).
02/18/16	KQ	1.40	Prepare and send service of the Omnibus claims objections

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

02/19/16	KQ	6.10	Revise, Finalize and file via ECF the claim objections for MDOT, Progress Rail, CS Des Sommets, Discover and Senaca Railroad
02/19/16	LKZ	6.00	Draft objections to various claims (5.5); confer w/K.Quirk re: filing and serving same (.3); revise NOHs for claim objections (.2).
02/19/16	ALS	0.10	Docket scheduling re Status Conference re Trustee's Objection to Claim 242,243,257,259 of New Brunswick Southern Railway Company Limited and Maine Northern Railway Company Limited
02/21/16	DSA	0.10	Reviewed e-mails concerning issues with BSB obligations (.1)
02/22/16	DSA	0.50	Reviewed e-mails concerning issues with BSB claims (.1); reviewed e-mails and conference with LZ concerning issues with claims objections (.2); reviewed claims objections (.2)
02/22/16	LKZ	5.90	Call w/F.Caruso re: municipality claims (.2); revise claims objections accordingly (.6); emails w/K.Quirk re: filing same (.2); call w/counsel to BSB re: claim (.1); draft consent motion to extend objection deadline to same (.4); emails w/K.Quirk re: filing same (.1); draft various additional claims objections (4.1); call w/F.Caruso re: claims objections (.2).
02/22/16	KQ	2.60	Finalize and file the claim objections for Mont-Saint-Gregoir, Sainte-Hyacinthe, Stukely-Sud, Ville de Sherbrook, Sainte-Brigide-D'Iberville, Aetna, Donohue Railroad Equipment and Candian National Railway

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

02/22/16	KQ	0.20	Finalize and file the consent motion to extend deadline for R. Keach to file objection to claim filed by Bangor Savings Bank.
02/22/16	KQ	0.20	Prepare and send e-mail service of the consent motion to extend deadline for R. Keach to file objection to claim filed by Bangor Savings Bank.
02/22/16	KQ	0.30	Draft and file the Certificate of Service related to the consent motion to extend deadline for R. Keach to file objection to claim filed by Bangor Savings Bank.
02/22/16	TJM	0.70	Email counsels for parties re administrative claims
02/23/16	KQ	2.00	Prepare and send US Mail service of the 14 individual claim objections filed via ECF
02/23/16	KQ	2.10	Draft the Certificate of Service related to the service of the 14 individual claim objections filed via ECF
02/23/16	KQ	0.20	Finalize and file the Certificate of Service related to 14 individual claim objections
02/23/16	KQ	0.10	Draft Notice of Hearing related to amended claim objection related to Centerbeam's proof of claim
02/23/16	KQ	0.60	Draft Certificate of Service related to the six omnibus claim objections
02/23/16	KQ	0.10	Respond to creditor inquiry regarding the consent motion to extend the deadline for the Trustee to object to the claim filed by Bangor Savings Bank
02/23/16	LKZ	3.20	Confer w/K.Quirk re: service of claims objections (.1); review CoS for same (.1); call w/counsel to Centerbeam re: claim objection (.1); analysis re: same (.5) and draft email to B.Keach re: same (.2); draft amended objection

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

			re: same (1.6), FOO (.1), revise NOH (.1); prep for status conference on MN/NB RRs claim objection (.3); call w/F.Caruso re: Centerbeam claim (.1).
02/23/16	DSA	0.20	Telephone conference with creditor concerning issues with claims objections (.2)
02/24/16	LKZ	1.90	Revise CoS for omnibus claims objections (.1); finalize Centerbeam claim objection (.2) and emails w/K.Quirk re: filing same (.1); prep for (.3), travel to (.2) attend (.6), travel from (.2) status conference on MN/NB RRs claim objection; confer w/A.Lepene re: same (.1); draft email to B.Keach re: same (.1).
02/24/16	KQ	0.10	E-mail to L. Zahradka regarding review of the Certificate of Service related to the omnibus claim objections
02/24/16	KQ	0.50	Finalize and file via ECF the amended objection to proof of claim filed by Center Beam Flatcar Company
02/24/16	KQ	0.60	Draft and file the Certificate of Service for the amended objection to proof of claim filed by Center Beam Flatcar Company
02/25/16	LKZ	2.70	Draft objection to BSB claim (1.6); confer w/S.Anderson re: BSB claim objection (.3); research re: same (1.0).
02/25/16	DSA	0.40	Reviewed response to claims objections (.1); conference with LZ concerning issues with BSB claims (.3)
02/25/16	TJM	0.10	TC w/ counsel for CIT re withdrawal of Admin application
02/26/16	ALS	0.40	Review and reply to emails from L. Zahradka re Bangor Savings Bank documents (.2); review electronic file re documents relating to Bangor Savings Bank (.2)

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

02/26/16	ALS	0.30	Office conference with K. Quirk re Amended Schedule C to First Omnibus Claim Objection
02/26/16	LKZ	1.70	Call w/K.Quirk re: revisions to exhibit to omnibus claims objection (.2); draft notice for same (.2); revise exhibit (.3) and confer w/K.Quirk re: filing and service of same (.1); call w/B.Hochman re: BSB payments received (.1) and review email re: same (.1); research and analysis re: objection to BSB claim (.7).
02/26/16	KQ	0.10	Review response by Fred's Plumbing & Heating to first omnibus claim objection and forward same to L. Zahradka
02/26/16	KQ	0.60	Research to determine discrepancies in Schedule C of the First Omnibus Claim Objection and office conference with L. Zahradka regarding same.
02/26/16	KQ	0.50	Revisions to Schedule C of the First Omnibus Claim Objection
02/26/16	KQ	0.50	Prepare Amended Schedule C to the First Omnibus Claim Objection
02/29/16	LKZ	1.50	Call w/F.Caruso re: Fred's Plumbing claim (.2); call w/counsel to Fred's Plumbing re: same (.1); revise notice of filing revised exhibits to First Omnibus Claim Objection (.2) and emails w/K.Quirk re: same (.1); revise BSB claim objection (.9).
02/29/16	DSA	0.10	Reviewed orders in case relating to claims objections (.1)
03/01/16	LKZ	1.10	Further revise BSB claim objection (.9) and emails w/K.Quirk re: filing same (.1); call w/counsel to BSB re: same (.1).
03/01/16	KQ	0.50	Amend Schedule C and D to First Omnibus Claim Objection and forward same to L. Zahradka

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

03/01/16	KQ	0.40	Draft Notice of Hearing related to the objection to Bangor Savings Bank's claim
03/01/16	KQ	0.30	Finalize and file the objection to Bangor Savings Bank's Proof of Claim
03/02/16	LKZ	0.70	Confer w./K.Quirk re: revised FOO and schedules to omni claim objection (.3); review revised versions of same (.2); emails w/A.Stewart re: filing same (.1); confer w/J.Lewis re: motion for leave to file interlocutory appeal (.1).
03/02/16	JAL	0.10	Conference with LKZ re motion for leave to file interlocutory appeal.
03/02/16	ALS	0.50	Filing of Notice of Revised Form of Order and Revised Schedules C and D to Trustee's First Omnibus Claims Objections (.2); revisions to exhibits to of Revised Form of Order to Trustee's First Omnibus Claims Objections (.2); office conferences with L. Zahradka re Revised Form of Order and Revised Schedules C and D to Trustee's First Omnibus Claims Objections (.1)
03/07/16	JAL	3.40	Researched standards for leave to appeal re appeal of order on 1171(b) claims.
03/07/16	JAL	2.80	Began drafting motion for leave to appeal order re 1171(b) claims.
03/07/16	TJM	0.20	Review status of First Union admin application (0.1) and email C Kimball re same (0.1)
03/08/16	JAL	6.40	Continued drafting motion for leave to appeal order re 1171(b) claims.
03/08/16	DSA	0.10	Reviewed objection to BSB claims (.1).
03/09/16	JAL	3.80	Finished drafting motion for leave to appeal order on 1171(b) claims.
03/09/16	KQ	0.10	E-mail to L. Zahradka regarding call from Securo Vision and their request as to how to fix claim so it is accepted

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

03/10/16	KQ	0.10	Respond to e-mail from L. Zahradka regarding claim filed by Securo Vision
03/10/16	JAL	4.20	Revised and finalized motion for leave to file interlocutory appeal.
03/10/16	DSA	0.10	Reviewed filings related to appeal of Irving RR decision (.1)
03/10/16	ALS	0.60	Filing of Notice of Appeal and Motion for Leave to Appeal with Court (.4); preparation and filing of Certificate of Service re filing of Notice of Appeal and Motion for Leave to Appeal (.2)
03/10/16	ALS	0.10	Email to A. Cummings re filing fee for Notice of Appeal
03/11/16	TJM	0.10	Email counsel for First Union re withdrawal of admin application (0.1)
03/14/16	TJM	0.10	Email counsel for First Union re withdrawal of admin application (0.1)
03/14/16	KQ	0.10	Telephone call with creditor Securo Vision regarding steps for amending their proof of claim
03/14/16	LKZ	1.10	Call w/counsel to Telus re: extension of response deadline for claim objection (.1); emails w/B.Keach (.1), Telus counsel (.1) re: same; emails w/K.Quirk re: response to Securo Vision claim objection inquiry (.1); draft amended NOH for Telus claim objection (.1) and emails w/K.Quirk re: same (.1); review motion for leave for interlocutory appeal of order on MN/NB RRs claim (.4) and review BAP rules in connection with same (.1).
03/15/16	LKZ	1.10	Revise notice of rescheduled hearing on Telus claim objection (.1) and emails w/counsel to Telus re: same (.1); analysis re: GNP claim objection (.8) ; confer w/A.Cummings re: procedure for appeal of MN/NB RRs claim (.1).

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

03/15/16	KQ	0.20	Finalize and file the Amended Notice of Hearing related to the 3rd Omnibus Claim Objection only as to Telus Communications
03/15/16	KQ	0.20	Prepare and send U.S. Mail service of the Amended Notice of Hearing related to the 3rd Omnibus Claim Objection only as to Telus Communications
03/15/16	KQ	0.30	Draft and file via ECF Amended Notice of Hearing related to the 3rd Omnibus Claim Objection only as to Telus Communications
03/15/16	DSA	0.10	Reviewed e-mails concerning issues with continuing claims objections (.1)
03/15/16	ALS	0.40	Emails from/to L. Zahradka re GNP proof of claim re Troester litigation (.2); review pleadings relating to Troester litigation (.2)
03/15/16	TJM	0.10	Respond to email from local counsel for First Union re withdrawal of admin application
03/16/16	ALS	0.40	Review pleadings relating to Troester litigation and related documents in connection with GNP claim
03/16/16	ALS	0.20	Office conference with L. Zahradka re GNP Trustee's Motion for Allowance and Payment of Administrative Claims (.1); email to L. Zahradka re GNP Trustee's Motion for Allowance and Payment of Administrative Claims (.1)
03/16/16	KQ	0.60	Draft Notice of Hearing and Proposed Order related to the Amended Objection to GNP claim
03/16/16	DSA	0.10	Telephone conference with creditor concerning issues with claims objection (.1)
03/16/16	LKZ	2.50	Calls w/counsel to GNP re: claim objection (.4); emails w/same (.2); analysis re: same (1.0) and confer w/A.Stewart re: same (.1); draft amended objection re: same (.8).

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

03/17/16	LKZ	0.40	Emails w/F.Caruso re: Progress Rail claim objection (.2) and call w/CMQ re: same (.2).
03/17/16	KQ	0.30	Revision to proposed order and Notice of Hearing for the objection to claim filed by GNP
03/18/16	KQ	0.20	Finalize and file the Sixth Consent Motion to Continue Hearing on Application for Administrative Expenses and to Extend Related Deadlines
03/18/16	LKZ	1.30	Emails w/CMQ re: Progress Rail claim (.1) and emails w/counsel to Progress Rail re: same (.1); confer w/B.Keach re: MN/NB RRs claim decision appeal (.2) and analysis re: same (.9).
03/18/16	TJM	1.00	TC w/ counsel for First Union re admin claim releases (0.3); Draft, edit and finalize motion to continue hearing re admin claim application (0.6) and email Trustee re same (0.1)
03/21/16	LKZ	0.10	Emails w/A.Cummings re: claims objection response tracking chart.
03/21/16	ALS	0.20	Emails from/to L. Zahradka re upcoming deadlines re motion for leave to appeal with respect to MN/NB Railroad
03/21/16	ALS	0.20	Email to R. Keach and L. Zahradka re proof of claim filed by Securo-Vision (.1); update proof of claims file with Securo-Vision claim (.1)
03/21/16	ALS	0.40	Update docket scheduling re MN/NB RR appeal (.2); review docket relating to appeal (.2)
03/21/16	ALS	0.20	Emails to/from L. Zahradka re MN/NB RR appeal and related deadlines
03/22/16	LKZ	0.40	Review claims objection response deadlines (.3) and emails w/B.Keach re: same (.1).

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

03/24/16	LKZ	0.90	Draft revised FOO (.2), revised schedule (.2), notice of filing (.2) re: third omnibus claims objection; call (.2) and emails (.1) w/counsel to GNP re: same.
03/24/16	ALS	0.10	Email to L. Zahradka re Response to application for leave to appeal filed by Maine Northern Railway Company and New Brunswick Southern Railway Company Limited
03/24/16	KQ	0.30	Finalize and file the Notice of Filing Revised Exhibit to Third Omnibus Objection
03/28/16	DSA	0.10	Reviewed responses to objection to claims (.1)
03/28/16	TJM	0.30	Review email from counsel for CIT re withdrawal of proof of claim (0.1) and email Trustee re same (0.1) and email counsel for CIT re same (0.1)
03/29/16	DSA	0.10	Reviewed orders entered on claims objections
03/29/16	LKZ	1.10	Review order granting leave to appeal MN/NB RRs order (.2) and emails w/A.Cummings, A.Stewart re: same (.1); begin draft of designation of record on appeal (.8).
03/30/16	PM	0.10	Review BAP Order granting leave to appeal.
03/30/16	LKZ	3.20	Revise objection to Fred's Plumbing claim (.9); review Centerbeam response to claim objection (.2) and research for reply in support of CB claim objection (2.1).
03/30/16	DSA	0.20	Reviewed decision on appeal of Irving railroad claims
03/30/16	KQ	0.30	Finalize and file the Amended Objection to Proof of Claim Filed by Fred's Plumbing and Heating, Inc
03/30/16	KQ	0.30	Draft and file via ECF the Certificate of Service related to the Amended Objection to Proof of Claim Filed by Fred's Plumbing and Heating, Inc

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

03/31/16	DSA	0.10	Reviewed response to objection of BSB claim (.1)
03/31/16	LKZ	1.10	Continue research for reply in support of CB claim objection (.7); confer w/B.Keach re: same (.2); emails w/counsel to CB re: same (.2).
04/01/16	LKZ	7.20	Research for and draft reply in support of Centerbeam claim objection (6.7); analysis in connection with BSB claim objection (.5).
04/01/16	KQ	1.00	Research parties to receive service of (4.5) and draft Certificate of Service related to the reply in support of the objection to claim submitted by Center Beam (.3); follow-up e-mails with L. Zahradka re: same (.1).
04/01/16	KQ	1.00	Finalize and file via ECF the reply in support of the objection to Center Beam's claim (.4); effect service of same (.2) and analysis re: same (.4).
04/01/16	CBB	0.30	Legal research for L. Zahradka in connection with claims objection.
04/01/16	DSA	0.10	Conference with L. Zahradka concerning issues with claims objections (.1)
04/04/16	DSA	0.10	Reviewed reply to objection to claims of Center Beam.
04/04/16	LKZ	4.00	Prep for 4/5 hearing on claims objection (3.5); analysis for A.Adessky re: certain CCAA claims (.5).
04/05/16	LKZ	3.10	Prep for (.5), travel to (.5), attend (.8), travel from (.2), follow-up re: (.2) claims objection hearing; review withdrawal of GNP admin claim application (.1) and emails w/counsel re: same (.1); analysis in connection with Plaintiffs' lawyers questions about claims objections (.4); draft revised FOO for Telus claim objection (.3).

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

04/05/16	ALS	0.20	Emails from/to K. Quirk re filing of revised form of order re Trustee's Omnibus Claim Objections
04/06/16	ALS	0.40	Filing of Notice of Second Order Sustaining Third Omnibus Objection with Court (.1); preparation of certificate of service re same (.1); email to P. Amend attaching same (.1); filing of certificate of service with Court (.1)
04/06/16	ALS	0.10	Review emails from/to L. Zahradka re withdrawal of GNP's motion for payment of admin claim
04/07/16	ALS	0.20	Emails from/to L. Zahradka re order on Wheeling's Motion to Enforce Payment of Allowed Administrative Claim
04/14/16	KQ	2.20	Update claims objection schedule to reflect orders that have been entered sustaining claims objections
04/14/16	LKZ	2.10	Review claims register for objection to admin claims (.8), emails w/K.Quirk re: updating claims analysis for orders entered (.2); emails w/B.Keach re: admin claims objections (.2); prep for (.3) and calls w/admin claimants re: same (.2); draft email (.2) and letter (.2) to admin claimants re: hearing on applications.
04/15/16	LKZ	0.50	Review claims register for admin claims for objection.
04/15/16	KQ	1.80	Update claims schedules to reflect claims disallowed by court order
04/19/16	KQ	0.90	Revisions to claim analysis to reflect docket numbers for orders entered by the court on the omnibus objections to claims

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

04/19/16	LKZ	3.60	Draft objection to Durant admin claim application (1.7) and fact research re: same (.5); draft objection to Currie admin claim application (.5) and fact research re: same (.5); review motion for relief from judgment by Derailment plaintiffs (.2) and emails w/B.Keach re: same (.2).
04/20/16	LKZ	1.80	Revise objection to Durant admin claim (.9); revise objection to Currie admin claim (.7); emails w/K.Quirk re: filing same (.2).
04/20/16	RND	1.00	Review union documents, sale motion, and other orders in relation to whether CBA had been assumed/rejected (Durant Admin Claim)
04/20/16	KQ	0.50	Obtain employee records for Durant and Currie in preparation for filing objection to administrative claim objections
04/20/16	KQ	0.40	Prepare and send mail service of the objections to the administrative claim objections filed by Durant and Currie
04/20/16	KQ	0.40	Draft and file via ECF the Certificate of Service related to the service of the objections to the administrative claim objections filed by Durant and Currie
04/20/16	KQ	0.50	Finalize and file the objections to administrative claims filed by Durant and Currie
04/20/16	DSA	0.10	Reviewed claim objections filed by the debtor
04/20/16	ALS	0.30	Emails from/to L. Zahradka and R. Desai re CBA Assumption in connection with Durant & Currie claims objections
04/22/16	KQ	0.10	E-mail from the court and to L. Zahradka regarding hearing date for the objections to the administrative claims submitted by Currie and Durant

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

04/22/16	KQ	0.20	File via ECF the omnibus notice of hearing for the objections to administrative claims filed by J. Durant and S. Currie
04/22/16	LKZ	1.10	Draft NOH for admin claims objections (.2) and emails w/K.Quirk re: filing and serving same (.2); review upcoming deadlines for claims objections (.2); analysis re. property damage claims for A.Adessky (.5).
04/25/16	LKZ	0.90	Emails w/A.Adessky re: CCAA claims issues (.2); review Fred's Plumbing response to claims objection (.2); emails w/F.Caruso re: same (.2) and draft notice of withdrawal of objection re: same (.3).
04/25/16	KQ	0.20	Prepare and send U.S. Mail service of the omnibus notice of hearing related to the administrative claims filed by Durant and Currie
04/25/16	KQ	0.40	Draft and file the Certificate of Service related to the U.S. Mail service of the omnibus notice of hearing related to the administrative claims filed by Durant and Currie
04/25/16	DSA	0.10	Reviewed reply to objection to claim filed by Fred's Heating.
04/26/16	KQ	0.10	Finalize and file via ECF the notice of withdrawal of the amended objection to the proof of claim submitted by Fred's Plumbing and Heating, Inc.
04/26/16	KQ	0.30	Draft and file via ECF the Certificate of Service related to the notice of withdrawal of the amended objection to the proof of claim submitted by Fred's Plumbing and Heating, Inc.

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

04/26/16	LKZ	0.10	Finalize notice of withdrawal re: objection to Fred's Plumbing claim and emails w/K.Quirk re: filing same.
04/27/16	LKZ	3.80	Draft objection to plaintiffs' motion for relief from judgment (1.9); research re: same (1.9).
04/27/16	DSA	0.10	Reviewed withdrawal of objections to claims.
05/02/16	LKZ	0.70	Revise objection to plaintiffs' motion for relief from judgment from omnibus claims objection order (.6); emails w/B.Keach re: same (.1).
05/03/16	LKZ	0.20	Finalize objection to motion for relief from judgment for filing and emails w/K.Quirk re: same (.1); emails w/J.Sternklar, A.Adessky re: same (.1).
05/03/16	KQ	0.30	Finalize and file the objection to Plaintiff's Motion for Relief from Judgment on Omni claims objections
05/03/16	KQ	0.30	Draft and file via ECF the objection to Plaintiff's motion for relief from judgment on omnibus claims objections
05/11/16	ALS	0.20	Review emails from/to L. Zahradka re continuance of hearing on motion for relief from judgment
05/11/16	KQ	0.20	Docket Agreed Request to Continue regarding motion for relief from judgment
05/16/16	LKZ	0.20	Emails w/B.Keach re: BSB claim objection (.1); emails w/counsel to BSB re: same (.1).
05/17/16	LKZ	0.20	Call w/counsel to BSB re: 5/23 hearing (.1); emails w/B.Keach re: same (.1).
05/18/16	LKZ	0.70	Call w/F.Caruso re: BSB claim (.3); call w/counsel to BSB re: same (.2), emails w/B.Keach re: same (.2).
05/19/16	LKZ	1.70	Confer w/B.Keach re: BSB claim (.8); analysis re: same (.9).

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

05/19/16	KQ	0.10	Telephone call to the court regarding hearing on MMA's objections to admin claims filed by Currie and Durant and e-mail to L. Zahradka regarding same
05/20/16	LKZ	1.80	Draft FOO for Currie Admin Claim Objection (.1); draft FOO for Durant Admin Claim Objection (.1); emails w/K.Quirk re: same (.1); prep for (.6) and meeting with (.7) BSB re: claim objection; emails w/B.Keach, F.Caruso re: same (.2).
05/20/16	KQ	0.10	Telephone call with court and office conference with L. Zahradka regarding Chambers request for proposed orders related to the objection to admin claim applications for Durant and Currie
05/20/16	KQ	0.20	File via Ecf the proposed orders related to the administrative claims filed by Durant and Currie
05/20/16	ALS	0.60	Emails from/to L. Zahradka re upcoming hearing on Objection to Proof of Claim Filed by Bangor Savings Bank on the Basis that Such Claim is Unenforceable Against the Debtor (.2); office conference with L. Zahradka re preparation for upcoming hearing on BSB claim (.1); search electronic files per L. Zahradka's request re objection to BSB's claim (.3)
05/20/16	DSA	0.10	Reviewed orders relating to objections to claims (.1)
05/25/16	ALS	0.30	Emails to/from R. Keach re call from D. Rouse with respect to claim of G. Bisson (.2); office conference with K. Quirk re same (.1)
05/26/16	LKZ	0.90	Revise MMA claims analysis (.4); substantial emails w/F.Caruso, B.Keach re: same (.4); call w/counsel to BSB re: same (.1).

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

05/26/16	KQ	0.10	E-mail from and to L Zahradka regarding status of claim objections for CS Des Sommets and Municipalite de St Gregoir.
06/14/16	ALS	0.20	Review claims filed by S. Nadeau per R. Keach's request
06/15/16	LKZ	0.20	Emails w/Counsel to BSB re: progress on settlement discussions (.1); review upcoming deadlines re: same (.1).
06/20/16	LKZ	0.10	Emails w/counsel to BSB re: calculation of BSB claim.
06/21/16	LKZ	0.10	Review claims diligence from counsel to BSB.
06/24/16	LKZ	0.20	Confer w/F.Caruso re: BSB claim settlement proposal.
06/28/16	LKZ	0.30	Emails w/B.Keach re: BSB claim settlement (.1); analysis re: same (.1); draft FOO for same (.1).
Total 05		----- 230.00	

07 Fee/Employment Applications

Date	ATTY	Hours	
01/08/16	DSA	0.20	Reviewed invoices for legal expenses for trestle litigation and e-mailed Trustee concerning fees (.2)
01/14/16	RND	0.10	Email with M. Baxter re: Covington Final Fee Application
01/15/16	RND	0.10	Further email with M. Baxter re: Covington Final Fee Application and proposed order re: same
01/15/16	ALS	0.10	Review email from R. Desai re proposed order on Covington Final Fee Application
01/15/16	ALS	0.10	Office conference with R. Desai re filing of Covington's final fee application
01/15/16	ALS	0.40	Preparation of notice of hearing with respect to Covington's final fee application

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

01/19/16	ALS	0.50	Telephone conference with R. Desai re draft notice of hearing on fee application of Covington & Burling (.1); revision to draft notice of hearing on fee application of Covington & Burling (.1); emails to S. Anderson re filing of Covington fee application (.1); coordinate service of Covington fee application with K. Quirk (.2)
01/19/16	KQ	1.10	Prepare service of the final fee application of Covington & Burling
01/19/16	RND	0.20	Email with A. Stewart re: Covington Final Fee Application (.1); and call with A. Stewart re: same (.1)
01/19/16	RND	0.20	Review/revise hearing notice re: Covington Final Fee App and emails with A. Stewart and S. Anderson re: same
01/20/16	RND	0.10	Emails with K. Quirk and S. Anderson re: filing of Covington Final Fee Application; Email with M. Baxter re: same
01/20/16	KQ	0.30	Finalize and file via ECF the second interim and final fee application of Covington & Burling
01/20/16	KQ	0.40	Prepare and send electronic mail service of the second interim and final fee application of Covington & Burling
01/20/16	KQ	0.50	Draft and file the Certificate of Service related to the second interim and final fee application of Covington & Burling
01/20/16	KQ	1.30	Attention to the U.S. mail service of the second interim and final fee application of Covington & Burling
01/20/16	ALS	0.20	Review email from S. Anderson re filing of Covington fee application (.1); office conference with K. Quirk re same (.1)

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

01/20/16	DSA	0.30	Reviewed Covington final fee application and e-mailed parties concerning issues with filing (.1); reviewed e-mails and telephone conference with UST concerning issues with fees for professionals (.2)
01/21/16	DSA	0.10	Reviewed e-mails concerning issues with Covington fee application (.1).
01/21/16	RND	0.10	Emails with M. Baxter re: telephonic appearance for hearing on fee application
01/22/16	DSA	0.20	Telephone conference with Covington concerning issues with fee application (.2)
01/25/16	DSA	0.20	Reviewed e-mails and e-mailed UST concerning issues with Covington fees (.1); e-mailed Covington concerning issue with same (.1).
01/25/16	DSA	0.10	Reviewed e-mails and e-mailed UST concerning issues with Covington fees (.1); e-mailed Covington concerning issue with same (.1).
01/26/16	DSA	0.10	Reviewed e-mails concerning issues with filing final fee application (.1)
01/26/16	ALS	0.10	Email to R. Keach re filing of final fee application
01/27/16	DSA	0.20	Reviewed e-mails and e-mailed parties concerning issues with Covington fee application (.2)
02/02/16	ALS	0.20	Filing of revised proposed order re SSG fee application (.1); email to R. Desai re filing of revised proposed order re SSG fee application (.1)
02/04/16	ALS	0.20	Review email from L. Zahradka re final fee applications (.1); office conference with L. Zahradka re final fee applications (.1)

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

02/08/16	ALS	0.80	Office conference with L. Zahradka re filing of final fee applications (.2); preparation of chart for L. Zahradka summarizing fee applications filed by Trustee's professionals on an interim basis (.6)
02/08/16	ALS	0.20	Review and respond to email from L. Zahradka re final fee application for Shaw Fishman
02/08/16	LKZ	4.70	Review plan for fee app deadlines (.6) and draft email to B.Keach re: same (.4); confer w/A.Stewart re: same (.2) and review email summarizing fee app status (.3); emails w/Trustee professionals re: 2/19 filing deadline (.4); confer w/B.Keach (.2), R.Desai (.1) re: same; review November BSSN pro forma for confidentiality issues (1.4); review December BSSN pro forma for confidentiality issues(1.1).
02/08/16	RND	0.10	Meeting with L. Zahradka re: final fee applications
02/09/16	RND	0.10	Email with M. Irish re: BNN Final Fee Application
02/09/16	RND	0.10	Email with D. Doyle re: Shaw Fishman final fee application
02/09/16	RND	2.10	Draft BNN Fourth Interim and Final Fee App
02/09/16	LKZ	2.00	Review Trustee November and December pro forma for confidentiality issues (1.3); review BSSN and Trustee third interim fee app i/c/w same (.4); confer w/B.Keach re: same (.1); review UST guidelines re: same (.2).
02/10/16	LKZ	0.80	Begin draft of BSSN final fee app.
02/10/16	RND	1.70	Continue drafting BNN Fee Application
02/10/16	RND	0.10	Emails with M. Irish re: BNN fees/expenses paid to date
02/10/16	RND	0.10	Email with L. Zahradka re: draft of BSSN Fee application

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

02/11/16	MAS	0.50	Draft summary of 56(d) dispute for final fee app.
02/11/16	LKZ	4.50	Further draft BSSN final fee app (2.9); confer w/B.Keach re: RJK fee app (.2); review prior BSSN fee apps I/c/w final fee app (.5); draft spreadsheet calculating fee amounts from invoice (.5); draft FOO for final fee app (.2) and review forms I/c/w same (.2).
02/11/16	ALS	0.20	Office conference with L. Zahradka re filing of second and final fee application for Bernstein Shur (.1); email to L. Zahradka re filing of second and final fee application for Bernstein Shur (.1)
02/12/16	LKZ	5.50	Review emails w/Verrill Dana re: motion to limit notice on final fee apps (.1); emails w/B.Keach re: BSSN fee app (.1); revise same (.1); draft motion to limit notice on service of final fee apps (.5) and FOO (.1); emails w/K.Quirk re: NOH for same (.1) and emails w/B.Keach re: same (.1); draft RJK fee app (4.3) and emails w/B.Keach re: same (.1).
02/12/16	KQ	0.10	Office conference with L. Zahradka regarding preparation of notices and proposed orders for fee applications
02/12/16	KQ	0.20	File via ECF the Motion to Limit Notice for Final Fee Applications
02/12/16	KQ	0.50	Draft Notice of Hearing related to the fourth and final fee application of BSSN
02/12/16	KQ	0.30	Prepare and serve e-mail service of the motion to limit notice of final fee applications
02/12/16	KQ	0.20	Draft and file the Certificate of Service related to the motion to limit notice of final fee applications

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

02/12/16	RND	0.10	Email with Shaw Fishman re: final fee application
02/13/16	LKZ	0.30	Emails w/B.Keach re: RJK final fee app:
02/16/16	LKZ	2.90	Prepare filing version of BSSN fee app (.1); draft consent motion to extend ddl to file RJK fee app (.2) and FOO (.1) and emails w/B.Keach (.1), K.Quirk (.1) re: same; draft DSI fee app (1.6) and FOO (.2) and emails w/F.Caruso re: same (.1); emails w/A.Stewart re: filing fee apps (.1); review audio from prior fee app hearing (.2) and emails w/Kugler Kandestin re: same (.1).
02/16/16	KQ	0.40	Finalize, file and serve the consent motion and related Certificate of Service extending the deadline for R. Keach to file his final fee application
02/16/16	KQ	0.50	Draft Notice of Hearing related to the Trustee's Fourth and Final Fee Application
02/16/16	KQ	0.40	Draft Notice of Hearing for Fourth and Final Fee Application of R. Keach
02/16/16	RND	0.10	Emails with M. Irish re: BNN Final Fee Application
02/16/16	RND	0.20	Emails with M. Baxter and call with A. Stewart re: revised proposed order re: Covington's Final Fee Application and telephonic appearance for hearing re: same
02/16/16	ALS	0.20	Telephone conference with R. Desai re upcoming hearing on Covington & Burling's Second Interim and Final Fee Application
02/16/16	ALS	0.50	Filing of Final Fee Application of Bernstein Shur
02/16/16	ALS	0.20	Emails from/to L. Zahradka re filing of final fee applications
02/16/16	ALS	0.10	Docket scheduling re final fee application of Bernstein Shur

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

02/17/16	ALS	0.10	Telephone conference with M. Paione at U.S. Bankruptcy Court re telephonic appearance by representative for Covington and Burling with respect to their final fee application
02/17/16	ALS	0.60	Revision to notice of hearing on DSI's final fee application (.1); email to L. Zahradka re same (.1); filing of DSI's final fee application (.4)
02/17/16	DSA	0.10	Reviewed e-mails relating to the fee applications of various professionals (.1)
02/17/16	RND	0.10	Email with M. Irish re: BNN review of final fee application
02/17/16	RND	0.10	Email with S. Morrell and M. Baxter re: UST's consent to revised proposed order and hearing on Covington's Final Fee Application
02/17/16	RND	0.10	Emails with D. Doyle re: Shaw Fishman's Final Fee Application
02/17/16	RND	1.30	Draft/Revise BNN Final Fee Application
02/17/16	LKZ	3.40	Revise NOH for BSSN fee app (.2); review Prime Clerk fee app (.5), draft NOH (.1) and emails w/Prime Clerk re: same (.1); call w/Prime Clerk re: same (.3); finalize DSI fee application for filing (.1) and emails w/A.Stewart re: filing same (.1); emails (.1) and call (.1) w/KK re: final fee app; draft same (1.8).
02/18/16	LKZ	0.70	Revise Kugler Kandestin fee app and FOO per invoice revisions (.2); emails w/Kugler Kandestin re: same (.1); review filing version of same (.1); emails w/A.Stewart re: filing same (.1); emails w/R.Desai re: Shaw Fishman final fee app (.1); emails w/Prime Clerk re: revised fee app (.1).

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

02/18/16	RND	1.00	Review/redline Shaw Fishman's Final Fee Application (.8) and email with R. Keach and D. Doyle re: same (.2)
02/18/16	ALS	0.50	Filing of Final Application for Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses for Kugler Kandestin LLP(.4); emails from/to L. Zahradka re service of same (.1)
02/19/16	ALS	0.50	Emails from/to R. Desai re filing of Baker Newman & Noyes' Final Fee Application (.1); filing of Baker Newman & Noyes' Final Fee Application (.4)
02/19/16	ALS	0.40	Filing of Final Application for Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses for Shaw Fishman Glantz & Towbin LLC
02/19/16	ALS	0.40	Filing of Final Application for Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses for Prime Clerk LLC
02/19/16	DSA	0.10	Reviewed fee applications filed by various professionals (.1)
02/19/16	RND	0.10	Further email with M. Irish re: finalized version of BNN fee application
02/19/16	RND	0.10	Emails with D. Doyle re: finalized fee application of Shaw Fishman
02/19/16	LKZ	0.50	Review revised Prime Clerk fee app (.2) and emails w/Prime Clerk re: same (.1); emails w/A.Stewart re: filing same (.1) and COSs for same (.1)
02/22/16	RND	0.20	Emails with M. Baxter re: Covington's Final Fee Application
02/22/16	RND	0.10	Email with Shaw Fishman re: Final Fee Application
02/22/16	RND	0.10	Email with BNN re: Final Fee Application and hearing re: same

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

02/22/16	ALS	0.20	Email to R. Desai attaching Order Approving Final Fee Application of Covington & Burling (.1); office conference with R. Desai re status of hearing on Final Fee Application of Covington & Burling (.1)
02/24/16	ALS	0.80	Preparation and filing of certificates of service with respect to final fee applications filed on behalf of Trustee's professionals
02/25/16	LKZ	0.70	Revise RJK fee app (.6) and emails w/B.Keach re: same (.1).
02/26/16	LKZ	1.10	Revise RJK fee app (.7), FOO (.1) and confer w/A.Cummings re: various revisions to same (.3).
02/29/16	RND	0.20	Review Covington Final Fee Application and email with M. Baxter re: outstanding amounts to be paid pursuant to final application
03/02/16	LKZ	0.70	Revise RJK fee app (.3), exhibits (.2); emails w/B.Keach (.1), A.Stewart (.1) re: same.
03/02/16	ALS	0.20	Emails from/to K. Quirk re status of Trustee's final fee application (.1); office conference with L. Zahradka re status of Trustee's final fee application (.1)
03/04/16	RND	0.10	Email with M. Baxter confirming unpaid balance owed to Covington
03/07/16	ALS	0.10	Emails from/to K. Quirk re filing of Trustee's final fee application
03/08/16	ALS	0.10	Emails from/to K. Quirk re status of filing Trustee's final fee application
03/08/16	ALS	0.70	Filing of Trustee's final fee application with Court
03/08/16	ALS	0.40	Revision to Trustee's final fee application (.3); telephone conference with R. Keach re revision to final fee application (.1)

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

03/08/16	DSA	0.10	Reviewed application for compensation filed by the Trustee (.1).
03/08/16	KQ	0.30	File via ECF the fourth and final fee application of R. Keach
03/08/16	KQ	0.30	Draft and file the Certificate of Service related to the fourth and final fee application of R. Keach
03/14/16	LKZ	1.50	Review January BSSN pro forma for confidentiality issues (1.0); review BSSN February pro forma for confidentiality issues (.5).
03/21/16	LKZ	0.60	Emails w/professionals re: final fee app deadlines (.5) and confer w/A.Cummings re: wires for same (.1).
03/21/16	RND	0.10	Email with BNN re: status of final fee application
03/21/16	RND	0.10	Email with Shaw Fishman re: status of final fee application
03/21/16	DSA	0.20	Reviewed orders relating to professional compensation entered in case
03/22/16	LKZ	0.40	Begin review of BSSN February invoice for confidentiality issues
03/23/16	RND	0.10	Emails with L. Zahradka re: amounts owed to Shaw Fishman, Covington, and BNN pursuant to final fee applications
03/28/16	RND	0.20	Emails with Shaw Fishman and BNN re: order approving final fee applications
03/29/16	LKZ	0.40	Emails w/professionals re: approval of final fee apps.
03/29/16	DSA	0.10	Reviewed orders entered relating to fee applications
03/30/16	KQ	0.10	Telephone call to the court regarding the order for the DSI fee application and follow-up e-mail to L. Zahradka regarding same.

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

03/30/16	LKZ	0.30	Review disbursement information for professional fee apps (.1); confer w/K.Quirk re: DSI fee order (.1); emails w/B.Keach re: same (.1).
03/31/16	DSA	0.10	Reviewed orders relating to fee applications entered in case (.1)
04/13/16	ALS	0.20	Email to J. Lewis re orders approving fee applications
04/13/16	LKZ	1.70	Review BSSN February pro forma for confidentiality issues.
04/20/16	LKZ	0.40	Review BSSN March invoice for confidentiality issues.
05/06/16	LKZ	1.20	Review BSSN March invoice for confidentiality issues (1.0); begin review of RJK March invoice for confidentiality issues (.2).
05/13/16	LKZ	0.60	Review RJK February, Mar invoices for privilege issues.
05/16/16	LKZ	1.40	Review RJK April invoices for privilege issues (.2); review BSSN April invoices for privilege issues (1.2).
05/16/16	ALS	0.10	Emails from/to L. Zahradka re BSSN invoice
06/07/16	LKZ	0.70	Emails w/B.Keach re: BSSN/estate rep fee apps (.1) and analysis re: same (.1); review BSSN (.3), RJK (.2) May invoices for privilege issues.
06/08/16	LKZ	0.60	Begin draft of BSSN fee app.
06/10/16	LKZ	1.00	Review invoices for BSSN fee app (.2); revise fee app accordingly (.7); emails w/K.Quirk re: NOH and FOO for same (.1).
06/14/16	KQ	0.70	Draft Notice of Hearing and Proposed Order related to the First Application for Compensation for BSSN as counsel for the Estate Representative

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

06/14/16	LKZ	0.80	Revise BSSN fee app (.3); revise NOH (.1), FOO (.1) for same; emails w/B.Keach re: same (.1); emails w/K.Quirk re: same (.1); confer w/M.Siedband re: same (.1).
06/14/16	LKZ	0.20	Revise BSSN fee app (.1) and emails w/K.Quirk re: same (.1).
06/16/16	LKZ	0.70	Revise BSSN fee app (.5); emails w/B.Keach re: same (.1); emails w/F.Caruso re: DSI fee app (.1).
06/21/16	LKZ	0.50	Begin draft of DSI fee app.
06/22/16	LKZ	0.40	Revise DSI fee app.
06/24/16	KQ	0.50	Finalize for filing DSI's first fee application (Estate Rep)
06/24/16	LKZ	0.60	Revise DSI fee app (.4) and emails w/F.Caruso re: same (.1); confer w/K.Quirk (.1) re: filing same.
06/28/16	LKZ	0.10	Emails w/B.Keach re: BSSN fee app.
Total 07		71.40	

08 Fee/Employment Objections

Date	ATTY	Hours	
12/30/15	DSA	0.10	Conference with T. McKeon concerning issues with objection to Committee fee application (.1)
12/30/15	TJM	0.30	Emails w/ UST re Paul Hastings fee app (0.2) and email Trustee re same (0.1)
Total 08		0.40	

10 Litigation

Date	ATTY	Hours	
12/28/15	TJM	0.20	Review email from counsel for Wheeling re discovery (0.2)
12/29/15	TJM	1.10	Draft response to Wheeling discovery dispute

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

12/29/15	DSA	0.10	Reviewed orders to show cause for dismissal of various cases (.1)
12/29/15	MAS	0.40	Review orders to show cause re: failure to contact court re: hearings and exchange emails with Bob Keach re: same.
12/30/15	MAS	0.30	Attention to scheduling issues for various motions to dismiss (Wheeling UFTA and 2011 transaction litigation).
12/30/15	TJM	0.50	Finalize response to Wheeling discovery dispute (0.4) and email Trustee re same (0.1)
12/31/15	DSA	0.30	Reviewed motions to file second amended complaints filed by plaintiffs (.1); reviewed motion for good faith finding filed by plaintiffs (.1); reviewed motion to extend deadlines for motion to dismiss filed by plaintiffs (.1)
01/04/16	DSA	0.20	Reviewed orders to show cause and e-mailed Tim McKeon concerning issues with hearings on same (.1); reviewed e-mails concerning issues with status conference concerning CP litigation (.1)
01/04/16	ALS	0.10	Email to K. Quirk re update to docket scheduling in Caisse De Depot adversary proceeding
01/04/16	ALS	0.10	Email to K. Quirk re update to docket scheduling in Wheeling adversary proceeding
01/04/16	MAS	0.40	Confer with Tim McKeon re: forthcoming motion to compel from Wheeling re: 56(d) discovery dispute.
01/04/16	MAS	0.10	Exchange emails with opposing parties and court re: scheduling of hearing on motions to dismiss.

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

01/04/16	LKZ	1.50	Review Roy motion for misc. relief and related pleadings (.5) and emails w/B.Keach re: same (.1); research i/c/w same (.2); review pleadings in connection w/ status conference for response to CP motion to dismiss (.5); emails w/B.Keach re: same (.1); call w/criminal counsel to Grindrod re: various expenses (.1).
01/04/16	TJM	0.10	Review email from S Anderson re scheduling re Keach v Cassie, et al and respond re same (0.1)
01/04/16	TJM	1.00	Draft, edit and revise amended pretrial order re extending discovery re NMR and NBSR
01/04/16	TJM	0.30	TC w/ counsel for CP re extension of deadline to respond to discovery (0.1) and email Trustee re same (0.1); Email counsel for CP re extension of discovery deadlines (0.1)
01/04/16	TJM	0.50	Review email from counsel for Wheeling re discovery (0.1); Confer M Seidband re case status and strategy re discovery dispute (0.4)
01/05/16	TJM	0.10	Email A Stewart re updated deadline for CP to respond to discovery (0.1)
01/05/16	TJM	1.60	Review motion to compel re Wheeling (0.3) and research re same re production of documents re availability of inspection (0.8); Confer M Seidband re same (0.5)
01/05/16	ALS	0.10	Update docket scheduling re deadline for CP to respond to discovery demands
01/06/16	ALS	0.30	Docket scheduling re Wheeling's Compel and Motion to Expedite Hearing (.1); update pleadings with Wheeling's Motion to Compel and Motion to Expedite (.1); email to R. Keach and T. McKeon re Motion to Compel and Motion to Expedite filed by Wheeling (.1)

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

01/06/16	DSA	0.50	Reviewed e-mails and e-mailed parties concerning issues with settlement of leaking tie litigation (.3); reviewed motion to compel filed by Wheeling (.1); telephone conference with F. Caruso concerning issues with tie litigation (.1)
01/06/16	LKZ	2.60	Emails w/B.Keach re: 1/7 status conference re: various litigation matters (.3); prep for same (2.2); call w/B.Keach re: same (.1).
01/06/16	RND	4.50	Review facts related to CP's involvement of derailment in preparation to draft Carmack Complaint
01/06/16	TJM	0.10	Review email from L Zahradka re court call re CP in District Court and respond re same (0.1)
01/07/16	TJM	3.70	Research re response to Wheeling motion to compel (1.3); Draft, edit and revise response to Wheeling Motion to Compel (1.0); Confer E Albert re same (0.5); Confer M Seidband re same (0.9)
01/07/16	TJM	0.40	Confer R Desai re case status re Wheeling v. Keach (0.4)
01/07/16	RND	5.40	Continue reviewing file re: facts/circumstances re: Carmack liability
01/07/16	PM	0.10	Email communications with Tim McKeon re. Joint rate agreement.
01/07/16	MAS	0.90	Confer with Tim McKeon re: motion to compel filed by Wheeling and potential strategy for response and emergency hearing scheduled for next week.
01/07/16	LKZ	1.10	Telephonic status conference w/J.Nivison re: motion to amend complaint and response deadline to CP motion to dismiss (.8); draft email summary to B.Keach re: same (.2); review order and docket entries re: same (.1).

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

01/07/16	DSA	0.20	Reviewed motion to expedite motion to compel filed by Wheeling (.1); reviewed orders entered in relation to CP litigation (.1)
01/07/16	BBC	0.70	Review Wheeling & Lake Erie's Motion to Compel Production of Documents.
01/08/16	DSA	0.20	Telephone conferences with co-counsel concerning issues with trestle litigation (.2).
01/08/16	ALS	0.20	Review and respond to email from L. Zahradka re status conference relating to derailment litigation
01/08/16	ALS	0.60	Review order relating to status conference relating to derailment litigation (.2); update docket scheduling relating to derailment litigation (.3); email to K. Quirk re deadline updates in derailment litigation (.1)
01/08/16	KQ	0.10	Respond to Bankruptcy Court clerk regarding Keach v. Helm Financial and e-mail to M. Siedband regarding same.
01/08/16	MAS	0.10	Analysis re: dismissal of Keach v. Helm Financial adversary proceeding.
01/08/16	PM	0.30	Review CP Reply Brief on Motion for Jury Trial.
01/08/16	RND	4.30	Review claims information under Carmack and begin drafting Carmack Complaint
01/08/16	TJM	3.10	Draft, edit and revise objection to Wheeling motion to compel
01/09/16	TJM	2.20	Draft, edit and revise objection to motion to compel re Wheeling
01/10/16	TJM	3.20	Draft, edit and revise objection to motion to compel re Wheeling (3.1) and email Trustee re same (0.1)
01/11/16	TJM	0.80	Email Trustee re hearing on Wheeling motion to compel (0.2); Prepare for hearing on Wheeling motion to compel (0.7)

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

01/11/16	RND	5.00	Draft Carmack Complaint
01/11/16	RND	1.90	Review CP Canadian Federal Court of Appeal decision
01/11/16	MAS	0.40	Revise, proof, and analysis re: objection to Wheeling's motion to compel discovery.
01/11/16	KQ	0.30	File via ECF the Trustee's Objection to Wheeling & Lake Erie Railway Co.'s Motion to Compel Production of Documents
01/11/16	KQ	0.40	Draft and file via ECF the Certificate of Service related to the Trustee's Objection to Wheeling & Lake Erie Railway Co.'s Motion to Compel Production of Documents
01/11/16	ALS	0.10	Emails from/to T. McKeon re objection to motion to compel filed in Wheeling adversary case
01/11/16	ALS	0.30	Office conference with R. Desai re Carmack complaint
01/11/16	ALS	0.30	Update docket scheduling with respect to preference actions
01/11/16	DSA	0.70	Reviewed filings relating to status of appeals as a result of the effective date (.1); reviewed response to motion to compel filed by Wheeling (.2); telephone conference with F. Caruso concerning preference action issues (.3); conference with B. Colwell concerning issues with same (.1)
01/11/16	BBC	0.20	Conference with Sam Anderson re: information on preference actions for Fred Caruso (.1); follow-up e-mails regarding same (.1)
01/11/16	BBC	1.70	Draft chart of preference actions and status of preference actions for Fred Caruso.
01/12/16	BBC	0.50	Continue drafting chart of preference actions and status of preference actions for Fred Caruso.

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

01/12/16	ALS	0.50	Office conference with R. Desai re Carmack complaint (.3); review SEDAR and EDGAR filings relating to Canadian Pacific and its subsidiaries (.2)
01/12/16	ALS	0.70	Review email from T. McKeon re document review by Wheeling (.1); office conference with L. Zahradka re boxes located at Noyes storage facility (.3); review emails from/to L. Zahradka re Wheeling review of documents (.1); emails to/from K. Quirk re Noyes storage facility (.1); review email from R. Keach re Noyes storage facility (.1)
01/12/16	ALS	0.10	Docket scheduling re Order on Motion to Compel re Wheeling adversary proceeding
01/12/16	ALS	0.40	Emails to T. McKeon re communication to counsel to settling defendants (.2); assist T. McKeon re communication to counsel to settling defendants (.2)
01/12/16	KQ	0.60	Office conference with L. Zahradka and A. Stewart Wheeling's review of MMA documents currently in storage (0.3) and follow-up regarding same (0.3).
01/12/16	LKZ	1.70	Emails w/F.Caruso, BSSN team re: Wheeling access to stored documents (.4); confer w/B.Keach, T.McKeon re: same (.6); confer w/A.Stewart, K.Quirk re: same (.3); emails w/Wheeling re: same (.2); follow-up emails w/B.Keach, T.McKeon re: same (.2).
01/12/16	RND	1.90	Review incorporation status and principal place of business for each named defendant and continue drafting Carmack Complaint
01/12/16	TJM	0.20	Confer w/ B Colwell re preference action summary sheet

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

01/12/16	TJM	2.10	Prepare for hearing re Wheeling motion to compel (0.8); Travel to and from Court (0.6); Attend Court re Motion to Compel (0.7)
01/12/16	TJM	4.90	Email to Helman (0.1) Email to Trustee (0.1); Confer w/ client team re Court Order re motion to compel (0.7); Confer w/ client team re production of documents (0.8); Confer Trustee re motion for reconsideration (0.4); Email Settling Parties re order re motion to compel (0.3); Draft, edit and revise motion for reconsideration (2.5)
01/13/16	TJM	7.80	Edit and revise motion papers re motion for reconsideration re Order re Wheeling motion to compel, and related motion for emergency hearing (7.5); TC w/ counsel for QRP, et al re motion for reconsideration (0.2); TC w/ counsel for CIT re motion for reconsideration (0.1)
01/13/16	TJM	0.20	Review email from counsel for Irving railroads re discovery deadlines (0.1) and respond re same (0.1)
01/13/16	LKZ	4.90	Prep for (.4), travel to (.5), and supervise (2.8) Wheeling review of stored documents; travel from same (.4) and confer w/B.Keach re: same (.5); update A.Stewart & K.Quirk re: same (.3).
01/13/16	KQ	0.60	Preparation of exhibit to be used in motion to reconsider related to Wheeling v Keach
01/13/16	KQ	0.50	Assist in preparation of exhibit for motion to reconsider in Wheeling v. Keach
01/13/16	KQ	0.40	Document search to locate Complaint in MMA v. Appalachian Timber Service requested by S. Anderson
01/13/16	KQ	1.20	Process documents for Wheeling's review of MMA documents located at storage facility

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

01/13/16	ALS	0.20	Emails from/to L. Zahradka re Wheeling review of documents at storage facility
01/13/16	ALS	0.20	Telephone calls to/from M. Paione at U.S. Bankruptcy Court re Judge Cary's availability on motion for reconsideration and motion for emergency hearing
01/13/16	ALS	0.20	Emails to/from T. McKeon re hearing on motion for reconsideration and motion for emergency hearing
01/13/16	ALS	0.40	Filing of motion for reconsideration, motion for emergency hearing, notice of hearing and amended notice of hearing with Court
01/13/16	ALS	0.30	Preparation and filing of certificate of service re motion for reconsideration, motion for emergency hearing, notice of hearing and amended notice of hearing
01/13/16	ALS	0.20	Docket scheduling re motion for reconsideration and motion for emergency hearing
01/13/16	ALS	0.30	Office conference with R. Keach re filing of motion for reconsideration and motion for emergency hearing (.1); telephone conference with L. Zahradka re filing of motion for reconsideration and motion for emergency hearing (.1); email to L. Zahradka attaching motion for reconsideration and motion for emergency hearing (.1)
01/13/16	ALS	0.20	Emails to/from T. McKeon re service of motion for reconsideration and motion for emergency hearing
01/13/16	ALS	2.90	Work on processing documents for review in response to Wheeling's document request
01/13/16	BBC	0.20	Draft email to Fred Caruso re: status of preference actions.

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

01/13/16	DSA	0.50	Reviewed e-mails and e-mailed parties concerning issues with status of preference cases (.2); reviewed and made changes to settlement agreement for Timber Services litigation (.3)
01/14/16	DSA	0.40	Reviewed filings relating to issues with Wheeling discovery (.3); reviewed e-mails and e-mailed F. Caruso concerning issues with preference exposure (.1)
01/14/16	ALS	0.20	Office conference with R. Keach and T. McKeon re Wheeling discovery requests and hearing on motion for reconsideration
01/14/16	ALS	3.60	Work on discovery with respect to Wheeling's request for production of documents
01/14/16	LKZ	1.50	Confer w/B.Keach re: hearing on motion to reconsider discovery order (.2); draft objection to motion for good faith finding (1.3).
01/14/16	TJM	5.30	TC w/ counsel for QEP et al (0.2); Prepare for hearing re motion to reconsider (0.8) and attend re same (2.0) and travel to and from court (0.5); TC w/ counsel for Wheeling re protective order (0.1); Draft, edit and revise confidentiality agreement and amended order re motion to compel (1.7)
01/15/16	TJM	3.40	Draft, edit and revise amended order re motion to compel and confidentiality agreement re Wheeling
01/15/16	LKZ	0.70	Confer w/A.Cummings re: document production to Wheeling (.1) and emails w/T.McKeon re: same (.1); revise objection to motion for good faith finding (.5).
01/15/16	ALS	1.30	Continue work on discovery with respect to Wheeling's request for production of documents

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

01/15/16	ALS	0.20	Emails to R. Keach re Response to CP's Amended Motion to Dismiss filed in the Grimard and Roy derailment cases (.1); update pleadings with Responses to CP's Amended Motion to Dismiss (.1)
01/15/16	DSA	0.10	Reviewed orders entered in case relating to Wheeling discovery (.1)
01/19/16	DSA	0.30	Reviewed e-mails and e-mailed F. Caruso concerning issues with preference settlements (.2); reviewed filings relating to CP litigation (.1)
01/19/16	BBC	0.20	Review email from Fred Caruso re: preferences.
01/19/16	ALS	2.80	Continue work on discovery per Wheeling's document request
01/19/16	LKZ	10.40	Revise objection to motion for good faith finding (1.6); confer w/B.Keach re: same (.3)(.3); revise same (2.5); confer w/B.Keach re: motion to transfer oral argument (.5); review pleadings and cases cited in prep for same (.7); draft outline for oral argument (1.1); prep for oral argument (3.4).
01/19/16	KQ	0.20	File via ECF the Amended Joint Pretrial Orders in the adversary matters involving New Brunswick Southern Railway and Maine Northern Railway
01/19/16	KQ	0.20	Finalize and file the Trustee's response to the motion to find that settlement with defendants was made in good faith
01/19/16	TJM	0.10	Respond to Trustee's email re CP document production deadline
01/19/16	TJM	0.30	Finalize amended JPS re MNR and NBSR for filing (0.3)

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

01/19/16	TJM	3.10	Edit and revise Wheeling confidentiality agreement (1.7); TC w/ counsel for Irving re confidentiality agreement (0.4); Emails w/ counsel for Wheeling re confidentiality agreements (0.3); Confer Trustee re confidentiality agreement (0.3); Review edits to confidentiality agreement re Wheeling (0.4)
01/19/16	TJM	0.20	Review and respond to email from S Anderson re settlement preferences (0.1); Confer B Colwell re preference analysis (0.1)
01/20/16	TJM	5.20	Compare exhibit b to confidentiality agreement proposed by Wheeling (0.1); TC w/ counsel for Irving re confidentiality agreement (0.4); TC w/ Trustee and counsel for Irving re confidentiality agreement (0.2); Confer Trustee re confidentiality agreement (0.1); Edit, revise and finalize confidentiality agreement (3.8); Confer w/ A Stewart re document production (0.6)
01/20/16	KQ	0.20	File via ECF the Pro Hac Vice for L. Zahradka in the District Court for cases 15-mc-00356 and 15-mc-00355
01/20/16	KQ	0.30	Prepare for filing via ECF the amended proposed order related to the Motion to Compel
01/20/16	KQ	0.20	Finalize and file via ECF the amended proposed order regarding Wheeling's motion to compel production of documents
01/20/16	LKZ	5.30	Prep for motion to transfer arg (1.8); travel to hearing (.2), attend hearing (2.0), travel from hearing (.2); confer w/B.Keach re: same (.8); review docket entries re: same (.1) and emails w/B.Keach & J.Sternklar re: same (.1); call w/M.Linder (Sidley) re: same (.1).

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

01/20/16	PM	0.60	Email communications with Bob Keach and Tim McKeon re. CP responses to MMAR discovery (.2); review and analyze CP discovery to MMAR (.3) and email to Bob and Tim re. same (.1).
01/20/16	ALS	2.90	Continue work on document production re Wheeling's motion to compel
01/20/16	ALS	0.10	Telephone conference with M. Paione and T. McKeon re Judge Cary's availability re further hearing on Wheeling's Motion to Compel
01/20/16	DSA	0.10	Reviewed response relating to good faith finding filed by plaintiffs (.1).
01/21/16	DSA	0.10	Reviewed e-mails concerning discovery deadlines in the Irving cases (.1).
01/21/16	ALS	0.10	Email to M. Paione re proposed order on Wheeling's Motion to Compel
01/21/16	ALS	0.10	Docket scheduling deadline to file stipulations of dismissal in derailment litigation
01/21/16	ALS	0.40	Docket scheduling in New Brunswick Southern Railway and Maine Northern Railway adversary proceedings
01/21/16	ALS	0.50	Review Amended Order Granting Wheeling & Lake Erie Railway Co.'s Motion to Compel Production of Documents (.3); docket scheduling deadlines contained in Amended Order Granting Wheeling & Lake Erie Railway Co.'s Motion to Compel Production of Documents (.2)
01/21/16	ALS	2.70	Continue work on document production with respect to Wheeling's Motion to Compel
01/22/16	ALS	2.20	Continue work on document production re Wheeling's motion to compel
01/22/16	LKZ	0.50	Review orders from District Court on Motions to Transfer (.3); emails w/B.Keach re: same (.2).

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

01/25/16	LKZ	0.60	Review upcoming adv. proc. deadlines (.3); emails w/A.Helman re: document production (.3).
01/25/16	KQ	0.70	Office conference with A. Stewart regarding storage boxes to be provided for review to Plaintiff's counsel in Wheeling v. Keach (.1); coordinate retrieval of documents from storage facility (.6)
01/25/16	PM	0.10	Email communications with Bob Keach and Aubrey Cummings re. CP Discovery Requests.
01/25/16	ALS	3.40	Continue work on document production re Wheeling's motion to compel
01/25/16	ALS	0.10	Office conference with K. Quirk re delivery of boxes from Noyes storage facility for Wheeling's review
01/25/16	DSA	0.10	Reviewed e-mails concerning issues with Wheeling claims (.1)
01/26/16	ALS	0.30	Email to R. Keach and T. McKeon re parameters of search for discovery with respect to Wheeling's Motion to Compel
01/26/16	ALS	3.20	Continue work on document production with respect to Wheeling's Motion to Compel
01/26/16	ALS	0.10	Review show cause order entered in Saratoga and North Creek Railway adversary proceeding
01/26/16	LKZ	0.70	Emails re: delivery of boxes for Wheeling review.
01/27/16	LKZ	4.00	Review order re: supplemental memo in support of motions to transfer (.1) and confer w/B.Keach re: same (.2); draft memo and emails w/B.Keach re: same (1.6); review status report to First Circuit on motion to dismiss appeal (.1) and confer w/B.Keach re: same (.1); draft statement in support of motion to dismiss appeal (.4) and review subsequent judgment re: same (.1); emails w/B.Keach re: same (.1); review upcoming

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

			deadlines (.3); emails w/Wheeling re: document production review (.1); revise supplemental memo to district court in support of motion to transfer (.9).
01/27/16	PM	0.20	Email and phone calls with Tim McKeon re. timetable for CP discovery responses and demands.
01/27/16	MAS	0.80	Draft motion to continue Saratoga preference adversary for an additional three months.
01/27/16	MAS	0.20	Exchange emails with counsel to Saratoga (preference recipient) re: continuance of answer deadline.
01/27/16	MAS	1.20	Prepare for hearing on motions to dismiss in 2011 transaction and Wheeling UFTA adversaries.
01/27/16	ALS	0.20	Docket scheduling deadline re briefing schedule in derailment litigation
01/27/16	ALS	0.10	Docket scheduling re deadline for Plaintiff to file an appropriate pleading or motion to show cause why the complaint should not be dismissed with prejudice in Saratoga and North Creek Railway adversary proceeding
01/27/16	ALS	3.80	Continue work on document production with respect to Wheeling's Motion to Compel
01/27/16	DSA	0.10	Reviewed order to show cause in preference action (.1).
01/27/16	TJM	0.70	TC and emails w/ counsel for CP re deadline to respond to discovery requests (0.3) and email Trustee re same (0.1) and review CP discovery demands (0.3)
01/27/16	TJM	1.10	Draft, edit and revise motions to withdraw 2004 examination motions
01/27/16	TJM	0.20	Draft, edit and revise notice of dismissal of AP against Andersons (0.2)
01/27/16	TJM	0.10	Email M Linder re withdrawing 2004 motion

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

01/28/16	TJM	3.10	Confer A Stewart re document production re Wheeling (0.4); Document review (2.7)
01/28/16	TJM	0.20	Respond to emails from counsel for CP re deadline to respond to discovery (0.2)
01/28/16	RND	3.50	Draft Carmack Complaint
01/28/16	DSA	0.10	Reviewed orders entered by the First Circuit in relation to appeals (.1)
01/28/16	ALS	3.20	Continue to work on document production with respect to Wheeling's motion to compel (2.8); meet with F. McKeon re document review (.4)
01/28/16	MAS	5.50	Prepare for and appear at hearing on motions to dismiss (2011 transaction adversary and Wheeling UFTA adversary).
01/28/16	MAS	0.20	Attention to filing of motion to continue deadlines in Saratoga preference adversary.
01/28/16	LKZ	1.40	Confer w/B.Keach re: supplemental memo in support of motion to transfer (.1); revise same (.4); review Sternklar memo in support (.2) and confer w/B.Keach re: same (.1); confer w/B.Keach re: motion to dismiss hearing (.3); emails w/A.Helman re: Wheeling document review (.3).
01/28/16	KQ	0.10	Finalize and file via ECF the 3rd motion to extend deadlines in the adversary proceeding Keach v. Saratoga and North Creek Railway
01/28/16	KQ	0.10	Finalize and file via ECF the Certificate of Service related to the 3rd motion to extend deadlines in the adversary proceeding Keach v. Saratoga and North Creek Railway
01/28/16	KQ	0.40	Review multiple e-mails regarding preparation for Wheeling's review of MMA docs
01/29/16	KQ	0.70	Finalize and file the Trustee's supplemental memorandum in support of the motion to transfer TX cases
01/29/16	KQ	3.00	Assist with Wheeling document review

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

01/29/16	KQ	0.30	Prepare and send E-mail service of the Trustee's supplemental memorandum in support of the motion to transfer TX cases
01/29/16	LKZ	4.20	Finalize supplemental memo in support of motion to transfer (.2) and confer w/B.Keach (.2), K.Quirk (.1) re: filing same; review revised memo from plaintiffs (.2) and confer w/B.Keach re: same (.1); attend A.Helman's doc review (1.6); confer w/B.Keach re: 2004 research (.2) and research same (1.6)
01/29/16	PM	1.20	Review and analyze CP Responses to Discovery Requests (1.0); email communications with Bob Keach and Tim McKeon re. CP discovery responses (.2).
01/29/16	ALS	0.20	Update docket scheduling in Saratoga and North Creek Railway adversary proceeding
01/29/16	ALS	1.50	Office conference with T. McKeon re review of documents in response to Wheeling's Motion to Compel (.2); review documents in response to Wheeling's Motion to Compel (.3); emails from/to L. Zahradka, T. McKeon re Wheeling's review of documents from Noyes storage and schedule re same (.3); continue work on document production re Wheeling's motion to compel (.7)
01/29/16	ALS	0.20	Filing of Notice of Dismissal in The Andersons adversary proceeding (.1); preparation of certificate of service re notice of dismissal in The Andersons adversary proceeding (.1)
01/29/16	DSA	0.20	Reviewed e-mails concerning issues with status of preference payments (.2)
01/29/16	CBB	0.80	Assist L. Zahradka w/ legal research re: Bankruptcy Rule 2004

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

01/29/16	RND	4.20	Review case file re: claims against CP and draft Carmack Complaint
01/29/16	TJM	0.20	Review and updated notice of dismissal re Keach v. Andersons (0.1) and email counsel for Andersons re same (0.1)
01/29/16	TJM	5.90	Document review re Wheeling
01/29/16	TJM	0.10	Edit and revise Amended JPO re Wheeling
01/30/16	TJM	0.90	Draft, edit and revise notice of withdrawal of Rule 2004 motions
01/30/16	DSA	0.10	Reviewed motion for payment of claim filed by Wheeling (.1)
02/01/16	ALS	0.30	Review Order Granting Third Consented to Motion for Order Extending Deadlines entered in Saratoga and North Creek Railway, LLC case (.1); update docket scheduling re Order Granting Third Consented to Motion for Order Extending Deadlines entered in Saratoga and North Creek Railway, LLC case (.2)
02/01/16	ALS	4.60	Continue work on Wheeling document production
02/01/16	LKZ	2.10	Emails w/A.Helman (.1), K.Quirk (.1) re: doc review; emails (.1) and confer (.2) w/B.Keach re: response to CP motion to compel; analysis I/c/w same (1.6).
02/01/16	KQ	3.00	Assist with Wheeling document review
02/01/16	TJM	0.90	TC w/ counsel for CP re hearing on jury trial (0.1) and confer Trustee re same (0.1) and prepare for hearing (0.7)
02/01/16	TJM	0.70	Finalize and file withdrawal of 2004 motions
02/01/16	TJM	0.30	Email counsel for Wheeling re discovery and production of documents (0.3)
02/01/16	TJM	2.20	Review document production re Wheeling discovery
02/02/16	TJM	0.40	Confer A. Stewart re discovery re Wheeling (0.1) and review re same (0.3).

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

02/02/16	TJM	0.90	Travel to and from court (0.5) and attend hearing re jury trial (0.4)
02/02/16	RPN	0.50	Work on matters relating to subpoena service on CP subsidiaries
02/02/16	KQ	3.10	Assist with review of document production to Wheeling
02/02/16	LKZ	1.00	Review motion for extension of time re: motion for good faith finding (.1) and emails w/B.Keach re: same (.1); emails w/T.McKeon, K.Quirk, A.Helman re: doc review and production (.6); review motion to compel (.2).
02/02/16	LKZ	0.20	Emails w/B.Keach re: settling defendants' stipulated dismissal of actions against settling defendants.
02/02/16	PM	0.40	Prepare information for subpoenas to CP subsidiaries and email to Peter Nichols re: same.
02/02/16	ALS	2.10	Supervise A. Helman's document review with respect to Wheeling's motion to compel
02/02/16	ALS	0.10	Office conference with R. Keach and T. McKeon re document production with respect to Wheeling's Motion to Compel
02/02/16	ALS	0.10	Docket scheduling re deadline for parties to submit agreed to form of order re: Motion for Jury Trial
02/02/16	ALS	2.20	Continue work on Wheeling document production
02/03/16	ALS	2.80	Office conferences (x2) with T. McKeon re Wheeling discovery (.2); review emails from R. Keach, T. McKeon and A. Helman re Wheeling discovery (.1); emails to/from D. Fouquette (BSSN/IT) re discovery (.1); continue work on Wheeling discovery (2.2)

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

02/03/16	ALS	0.30	Update docket scheduling in derailment litigation (.2); office conference with K. Quirk re docket scheduling in derailment litigation (.1)
02/03/16	DSA	0.10	Reviewed e-mails and filings relating to scheduling of various matters and CP's motion to exceed page limits (.1)
02/03/16	MAS	0.20	Retrieve order granting continuance and email same to opposing counsel with comments.
02/03/16	LKZ	6.80	Monitor Wheeling doc review (5.0) and confer w/T.McKeon (.1), K.Quirk (.1), A.Stewart (.1) re: same; begin draft of background section for objection to Wheeling motion to compel (1.5).
02/03/16	KQ	1.40	Prepare documents to be produced to Wheeling and forward same to A. Helman
02/03/16	RPN	5.00	Research corporate background on CP subsidiaries (1.1); draft letters (.5); document requests (1.3), and subpoenas (1.2) to Soo Line Railroad Company, Delaware & Hudson, Dakota Minnesota, Aroostook River, International Railway, and Houlton Branch; research and locate process servers (.2), telephone calls to same (.2); draft and review e-mail correspondence concerning pending discovery matters (.5)
02/03/16	TJM	2.40	Doc review re Wheeling discovery production
02/03/16	TJM	1.10	Emails w/ counsel for Wheeling re discovery (0.5) and confer A Stewart re same re production (0.4) and Trustee re same (0.2)
02/04/16	RPN	2.00	Draft letter to CP subsidiaries to accompany subpoenas (.2); prepare package of discovery materials for attorney review (.5); draft and review e-mail with Timothy McKeon concerning pending discovery matters (.2); revise

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

			subpoenas and document requests (1.1).
02/04/16	TJM	3.70	Review documents re production to Wheeling
02/04/16	TJM	1.50	Confer A Stewart re Wheeling document production (0.1); Edit and revise proposed PTO (1.4).
02/04/16	TJM	0.40	Review subpoenas and discovery demands to be served on CP subsidiaries (0.4)
02/04/16	KQ	0.80	Prepare documents to be produced to Wheeling and forward same to A. Helman
02/04/16	LKZ	4.60	Review CP response to supplemental memo (1.1); emails w/B.Keach re: same (.1); review Plaintiffs' reply memo (.1) and emails w/B.Keach re: same (.1); emails w/K.Quirk re: same (.1); further draft objection to CP motion to compel (4.1).
02/04/16	PM	0.10	Email communications with Tim McKeon and Peter Nichols re. CP subsidiary subpoenas.
02/04/16	ALS	4.40	Continue work on document production with respect to Wheeling's Motion to Compel
02/04/16	ALS	0.20	Emails from/to T. McKeon re review of emails in response to Wheeling's motion to compel
02/05/16	ALS	5.80	Continue work on document production with respect to Wheeling's motion to compel
02/05/16	PM	1.40	Review and revise subpoena package and accompanying correspondence to Soo Line RR (.5); review article sent from Bob Keach re. CP rail collision (.1); revise CP subsidiary subpoenas and email communications with Peter Nichols re. same (.6); email communications from Tim McKeon and Tim Thornton re. Order on Jury Trial (.2).
02/05/16	RND	3.50	Continue drafting Carmack Complaint against CP

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

02/05/16	LKZ	1.70	Further draft objection to Wheeling motion to compel (.8) and research re: same (.2); emails w/A.Helman re: Wheeling doc production status (.1) and emails w/K.Quirk re: same (.1); draft reply in support of motion to amend complaint (.4); review Plaintiffs' memo in reply re: motion to transfer (.1)
02/05/16	KQ	0.30	Finalize and file the Trustee's Response in Connection with the Motion for Leave to File Second Amended Complaint
02/05/16	RPN	3.00	Draft and review e-mail with Attorney Paul McDonald concerning subpoena service on CP subsidiaries (.2) , review and revise subpoenas (.9), cover letters (.4), and document requests (1.5)
02/05/16	TJM	1.00	Draft, edit and revise proposed consent order re CP motion for jury trial (0.8) and email counsel for CP re same (0.2)
02/05/16	TJM	2.00	Confer A Stewart re Wheeling document production (0.2); Review document production re Wheeling discovery (1.8)
02/08/16	TJM	0.20	Finalize notice of dismissal of Flex Leasing adversary proceeding
02/08/16	TJM	0.50	Review and sign subpoenas re CP
02/08/16	TJM	0.10	Confer R Desai re Carmark claims
02/08/16	TJM	0.80	Draft, edit and revise stipulation dismissing Rule 2004 examination re: Stawson (0.4) and Devlar (0.2) and emails w/ opposing counsel re same (0.2)
02/08/16	TJM	2.10	Confer A Stewart re Wheeling discovery (0.1) and Trustee re same (0.2); Review documents produced to Wheeling (1.8)

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

02/08/16	RPN	4.70	Review and revise subpoenas, document requests, and cover letters (2.4); draft and review e-mail with Tim McKeon (.2); finalize discovery materials to CP subsidiaries (.9); telephone calls and e-mail with WeServe Maine, Metro-Legal Service, and process server in New York City (.5); compile and scan packages for service (.4);, finalize packages of materials for service on CP subsidiaries (.3).
02/08/16	LKZ	0.80	Confer w/T.McKeon re: doc production to CP (.1); emails w/B.Keach (.2) re: same; call (.1) and emails (.1) to counsel to CP re: same; emails w/counsel to plaintiffs (.1), settling defendants (.1) re: dismissal of settling defendants; emails w/B.Keach, T.McKeon re: same (.1) .
02/08/16	RND	0.80	Revise Carmack Complaint
02/08/16	ALS	0.10	Emails from/to T. McKeon re filing Notice of Dismissal in Flex Leasing adversary proceeding
02/08/16	ALS	0.20	Obtain pleadings from derailment litigation for R. Keach
02/08/16	ALS	0.50	Docket scheduling re depositions of MMA, Joseph McGonigle, Robert Grindrod, Edward Burkhardt, Chris Caldwell, Central Maine & Quebec Railway and New Brunswick Southern Railway Co. (.4); office conference with R. Keach and T. McKeon re deposition notices (.1)
02/08/16	DSA	0.50	Reviewed e-mails and e-mailed parties concerning issues with settlement of the litigation (.1); reviewed filings relating to motion to transfer personal injury claims relating to CP (.2); reviewed filings concerning issues with amending complaint against CP (.2)

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

02/09/16	DSA	0.10	Reviewed stipulation of dismissal relating to Flex (.1)
02/09/16	ALS	0.20	Office conference with L. Zahradka re Wheeling v. Maine Northern Railway Company case pending in U.S. District Court (.1); email to L. Zahradka re same (.1)
02/09/16	ALS	0.20	Emails from/to T. McKeon and K. Quirk re Wheeling document production
02/09/16	ALS	1.10	Office conference with T. McKeon re supplemental document production with respect to Wheeling (.2); preparation of supplemental document production (.9)
02/09/16	MAS	0.40	Review discovery issues for motion for summary judgment and confer with T. McKeon on response.
02/09/16	LKZ	0.60	Supervise Wheeling document review session (.2); confer w/B.Keach re: CP objection to good faith finding and cross motion for finding that CAD law applies (.2); analysis (.1) and email w/B.Keach re: same (.1).
02/09/16	KQ	0.20	Finalize and file the Notice of Dismissal in the adversary proceeding involving Flex Leasing I, LLC
02/09/16	KQ	0.10	Prepare and send US Mail service of the Notice of Dismissal in the adversary proceeding involving Flex Leasing I, LLC
02/09/16	KQ	0.30	Prepare and file via ECF the Certificate of Service related to the Notice of Dismissal in the adversary proceeding involving Flex Leasing I, LLC
02/09/16	KQ	0.90	Prepare documents to be produced to Wheeling and forward same to A. Helman (.2); prepare documents for return to storage facility (.7)
02/09/16	TJM	0.20	Finalize stipulations withdrawing Rule 2004 requests re Slawson and Devlar

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

02/09/16	TJM	4.40	Review emails b/w Trustee and counsel for Wheeling re discovery (0.3) and confer Trustee re same (0.7); TC w/ Trustee and counsel for Wheeling (0.3); Respond to email and request for additional documents from Wheeling (1.8); Review documents produced to Wheeling (1.3)
02/10/16	TJM	0.20	Finalize stipulations re withdrawing Rule 2004 requests re Slawson nad Devlar
02/10/16	TJM	0.20	Review and respond to email from L Zahradka re Wheeling 506(c) motion
02/10/16	TJM	2.40	Confer A Stewart re Wheeling discovery status (0.1); Emails w/ counsel for Wheeling re Amended JPO (0.2) and Trustee re same (0.1); Review documents provided to Wheeling from storage unit (2.0)
02/10/16	TJM	1.00	Draft, edit, and revise response to CP discovery demands
02/10/16	RPN	0.40	Telephone call with process server (.1); review proofs of service (.1), calendar deadlines for responding (.1); draft and review email correspondence with processes server re: Presque Isle subpoenas (.1).
02/10/16	KQ	0.20	Prepare service related to objection to Wheeling's motion to enforce payment of administrative claim
02/10/16	KQ	0.50	Finalize, file and serve the stipulation to withdrawing the rule 2004 motions with respect to Slawson and Devlar
02/10/16	KQ	0.20	Draft and file the Certificate of Service related to the stipulation to withdraw the rule 2004 motions with respect to Slawson and Devlar

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

02/10/16	LKZ	1.30	Revise objection to Wheeling motion to compel (.8); emails w/T.McKeon (.1), R.Desai (.1), A.Stewart (.1), B.Keach (.1) re: same; emails w/K.Quirk re: filing same (.1).
02/10/16	PM	0.10	Review agreed order re. jury trial.
02/10/16	PM	0.10	Email communications with Tim McKeon re. CP discovery requests.
02/10/16	ALS	0.40	Review documents produced to Wheeling with respect to their motion to compel (.3); office conference with T. McKeon re same (.1)
02/10/16	ALS	0.60	Review docket re status of Trustee's 506(c) Motion (.3); emails from/to L. Zahradka and T. McKeon re same (.2); office conference with T. McKeon re status of 506(c) Motion (.1)
02/10/16	ALS	0.60	Docket scheduling re Response Deadline re: CP's Cross-Motion for an Order Applying Canadian Non-Pecuniary Damage Limitations and CP's Response in Opposition to Motion for Leave to File 2nd Amended Complaint in derailment litigation cases (.3); review derailment litigation dockets for scheduling purposes (.3)
02/11/16	ALS	0.10	Emails from/to T. McKeon re 506c motion
02/11/16	PM	0.10	Email communications with Peter Nichols re. subpoenas on CP subsidiaries.
02/11/16	PM	1.00	Meet with Bob Keach and Tim McKeon to discuss responses to CO discovery requests.
02/11/16	PM	0.30	Review case sent from Bob Keach re. Carmac Amendment claim issues.
02/11/16	RND	2.00	Review WD Trust agreement and related documents in connection with revising Carmack complaint
02/11/16	LKZ	0.20	Emails w/B.Keach re: objection to Wheeling Motion to compel (.1); emails w/K.Quirk re: deadline for same (.1).

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

02/11/16	TJM	0.70	Review file re status of 506(c) motion (0.5) and confer Trustee re same (0.1) and A Stewart re same (0.1)
02/11/16	TJM	6.00	Draft, edit and revise responses to CP discovery demands (5.0); Confer w/ Trustee and P McDonald re same (1.0)
02/12/16	TJM	1.50	Draft, edit and revise notice of dismissal re Irving and SMBC (0.8) and stipulation of dismissal re WF (0.3) and email the Trustee re same (0.1) and email opposing counsels re same (0.3)
02/12/16	TJM	0.70	Review CP's proposed edits to consent order re Jury Trial (0.2) and confer Trustee re same (0.1); Edit and revise CP's draft of proposed order (0.2) and email CP counsel re same (0.1); Respond to email from counsel for CP re proposed order re jury trial (0.1).
02/12/16	TJM	3.30	Draft, edit and revise responses to CP discovery demands
02/12/16	RPN	0.60	Review various Proofs of Service (.3), calendar response deadlines (.2), and draft and review e-mail concerning discovery issues (.1)
02/12/16	LKZ	0.50	Emails w/B.Keach re: stipulated dismissal of settling defendants and confer w/T.McKeon re: same (.1); confer w/B.Keach re: Sternklar motion for good faith finding, motion to dismiss (.4).
02/12/16	RND	0.10	Email with R. Keach and T. Thornton re: Carmack complaint
02/12/16	MAS	1.00	Research in connection with motion to dismiss.
02/12/16	ALS	0.20	Emails to/from T. McKeon re status of service of various subpoenas

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

02/12/16	ALS	0.30	Docket scheduling re in derailment cases re Plaintiffs Preliminary Motion to Find That Settlement with Defendants was made in Good Faith and Plaintiffs Preliminary Motion to Dismiss Released Parties
02/12/16	ALS	0.20	Update docket scheduling re Wheeling's Objection Deadline re: Motion for Summary Judgment and deadline to file Trustee's reply to Wheeling's MSJ Objection
02/12/16	ALS	0.40	Update docket scheduling per amended pre-trial scheduling order entered in Wheeling v. Keach adversary proceeding
02/14/16	DSA	0.10	Reviewed e-mails relating to Wheeling proceedings and schedule (.1)
02/16/16	ALS	0.20	Filing of proposed order re CP's motion for jury trial in World Fuels adversary proceeding
02/16/16	MAS	1.20	Research for Bob Keach (re: pending motions to dismiss).
02/16/16	LKZ	0.20	Emails w/settling defendants re: response to plaintiffs' motion to dismiss (.1) and emails w/B.Keach re: same (.1).
02/16/16	RPN	0.20	Telephone call with processes server (.1), draft and review email correspondence (.1)
02/16/16	TJM	4.30	Draft, edit and revise response to CP discovery
02/16/16	TJM	0.10	Email Trustee re proposed order re CP jury trial motion
02/16/16	TJM	0.90	Draft, edit and revise motions to quash re Wheeling subpoenas
02/17/16	TJM	0.20	Draft, edit and revise notice of status conference re Trustee's 506(c) motion re Wheeling
02/17/16	TJM	1.00	Finalize stipulations of dismissal re WFS, Irving and SMBC

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

02/17/16	TJM	0.70	Edit and revise response to CP discovery demands
02/17/16	PM	2.10	Revise responses to CP discovery requests
02/17/16	ALS	0.20	Telephone conference with M. Paione at U.S. Bankruptcy Court re status conference on 506(c) motion (.1); email to T. McKeon re same (.1)
02/17/16	ALS	0.20	Update docket scheduling re upcoming depositions noticed by Wheeling (.1); office conference with T. McKeon re upcoming depositions (.1); email to T. McKeon re depositions notice by Wheeling (.1)
02/18/16	ALS	0.10	Emails to/from T. McKeon re notice of status conference filed by CP
02/18/16	DSA	0.10	Reviewed e-mails concerning issues with scheduling of CP litigation (.1)
02/18/16	RND	0.90	Research re: accrual of indemnification claims
02/18/16	TJM	0.50	Draft, edit and revise motion for protective order re Wheeling subpoenas
02/18/16	TJM	0.60	Confer A Stewart re notice of status conference re 506(c) (0.2) and prepare notice re same (0.4)
02/18/16	TJM	1.60	Edit, revise and finalize responses to CP discovery demands
02/19/16	TJM	0.10	Email counsel for CP re stipulation of dismissal re WF entities
02/19/16	TJM	0.90	Emails w/ counsel for Wheeling re 506(c) status conference (0.3) and finalize notice (0.6)
02/19/16	TJM	4.70	Draft, edit and revise motion for protective order re Wheeling subpoenas (4.4); TC w/ Verrill & Dana re Wheeling subpoena (0.3)
02/19/16	TJM	0.40	Finalize notice of dismissal re SMBC and Irving (0.2) and confer A Stewart and K Quirk re same (0.2)

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

02/19/16	RND	2.10	Research re: accrual of indemnification claims
02/19/16	MAS	1.80	Research issue of 30(b)(6) subpoenas and provide analysis for Tim McKeon re: same.
02/19/16	KQ	0.10	File via ECF the Notice of Dismissal (Irving and SMBC)
02/19/16	KQ	0.20	Prepare and file via ECF the Certificate of Service related to the Notice of Dismissal (Irving and SMBC)
02/19/16	ALS	0.40	Update docket scheduling in derailment litigation cases re CP's Response in Opposition to Motion for Leave to File 2nd Amended Complaint, Reply Deadline re: CP's Response to Motion to find that settlement with Defendants was made in good faith, etc.
02/19/16	ALS	0.10	Docket scheduling re Status Conference re: CP's Motion for Jury Trial
02/19/16	ALS	0.10	Reply email to M. Paione re scheduling of status conference on 506(c) hearing
02/20/16	DSA	0.10	Reviewed e-mails relating to scheduling of CP litigation (.1)
02/21/16	ALS	0.20	Docket scheduling re response deadlines on motions to dismiss in derailment litigation
02/22/16	DSA	0.20	Telephone conferences with A. Burns concerning issues with information request for CP (.2)
02/22/16	LKZ	0.80	Confer w/S.Anderson re:CP request for CCAA PoCs (.1); review decision on Motion to transfer (.2) and confer w/B.Keach re: same (.1); confer w/B.Keach re: reset deadlines for responses to motions to dismiss (.2); begin draft response to same (.2).
02/22/16	PM	0.10	Email communications with Peter Nichols and Tim McKeon re. service of subpoena on CP subsidiaries.

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

02/22/16	RND	0.50	Review case law re: suits to enforce indemnity provisions (.4) and email to R. Keach re: same (.1)
02/22/16	RPN	0.50	Telephone call and email with process server (.3), telephone calls and email with Attorney Olore's office concerning acceptance of service on CP subsidiaries (.2)
02/22/16	TJM	0.20	Emails w/ counsel for Wheeling re status conference re 506(c)
02/22/16	TJM	0.30	TC w/ J Fischer re Wheeling subpoenas on CMQ (0.2) and email re same (0.1)
02/22/16	TJM	0.80	Emails w/ counsel for Wheeling re 30(b)(6) of MMA
02/22/16	TJM	0.40	Emails w/ counsel for Wheeling re discovery disputes
02/22/16	TJM	0.30	Review and respond to emails from counsel for CP re stipulation of dismissal of WF entities (0.2); Email counsel for WF entities re same (0.1)
02/23/16	TJM	0.20	Review CP responses to discovery subpoenas served on subsidiaries (0.1) and respond to emails from Trustee and P McDonald re same (0.1)
02/23/16	TJM	0.20	TC w/ J Fischer re discovery status re Wheeling v. Keach
02/23/16	TJM	1.00	Review emails b/w Trustee and counsel for Wheeling re discovery and SJM (0.1) and respond to email from Trustee re same (0.2); Review email from counsel for Wheeling and respond re same (0.7)
02/23/16	TJM	0.10	Finalize stipulation re dismissal re WF entities

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

02/23/16	PM	0.70	Review CP and trustee proposed orders on motion for jury trial (.1); review Stipulation of Dismissal re. original parties to adversary proceeding (.3); analyze objections to subpoenas to CP subsidiaries (.2) and email communications with Bob Keach and Tim McKeon re. same (.1).
02/23/16	LKZ	2.60	Review reset deadlines for objections to motions to dismiss (.2); draft chart of same (.3) and emails w/B.Keach re: same (.1); revise objection to motions to dismiss (.9), analysis re: same (.5), emails and calls w/counsel to Plaintiffs re: same (.1); emails w/B.Keach re: same (.1); review motion for clarification re: order on motion to transfer (.2) and emails w/J.Sternklar re: same (.2).
02/23/16	KQ	0.20	Finalize and file the Stipulation of Dismissal related to World Fuel Services
02/23/16	KQ	0.20	Draft and file the Certificate of Service related to the Stipulation of Dismissal related to World Fuel Services
02/23/16	DSA	0.10	Reviewed e-mails concerning issues with Wheeling discovery (.1).
02/23/16	ALS	0.10	Update docket scheduling in derailment litigation re Response Deadlines re: Motions to Dismiss USDC-Maine Derailment Litigation
02/24/16	ALS	0.10	Email to T. McKeon re status of subpoenas
02/24/16	ALS	0.10	Reply email to T. McKeon re status of service of subpoenas
02/24/16	ALS	0.10	Review email from M. Paione at U.S. Bankruptcy Court re status of hearing for 506(c) filed by Trustee
02/24/16	ALS	0.20	Docket scheduling re Response Deadline re: Motion for Clarification of Order on Motions to Transfer filed in derailment litigation

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

02/24/16	DSA	0.20	Telephone conference with T. Shannon concerning issues with status of CP litigation (.2)
02/24/16	KQ	0.30	File via ECF the joinder to Illinois Plaintiffs' motion for clarification of order on the motions to transfer
02/24/16	LKZ	3.20	Call w/C.Nemeth re: response to motion to dismiss (.1); call w/J.Bethony re: motion for clarification on transfer order (.1) and review revised version of same (.2); emails w/B.Keach re: status of response to motion to dismiss (.1); review (.4) and draft objection to (1.8) CP cross-motion for application of CAD law; draft joinder to motion to clarify (.2) and emails w/K.Quirk re: filing same (.1); revise response to CP cross-motion (.1) and emails w/B.Keach re: same (.1).
02/24/16	PM	0.10	Email communications with Tim Thornton and Bob Keach re. discovery objection issues.
02/24/16	TJM	0.10	Respond to email from A Stewart re status of subpoenas on CP subsidiaries
02/25/16	TJM	0.20	Review and respond to emails from counsel for Wheeling re amended PTO (0.2)
02/25/16	RPN	0.10	Telephone call to Attorney Olore's office re : subpoena service
02/25/16	LKZ	4.10	Revise response to motion to dismiss released defendants and supplement w/cross-motion to enforce plan injunctions (2.6); confer w/A.Cummings re: same (.1); emails w/B.Keach re: same (.1) ; emails w/K.Quirk re: service of same (.1); emails w/K.Quirk re: filing response to CP cross-motion for application of CAD law (.1); draft notices of change in status for RJK as estate representative (.3); confer w/A.Stewart re: same (.1); draft FOO

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

			for cross-motion (.2); follow-up emails w/B.Keach re: same (.2) and analysis re: same (.3).
02/25/16	KQ	0.80	Finalize and file the notice of change of status of R. Keach from Trustee to Estate Representative in four District Court matters.
02/25/16	KQ	0.40	Finalize and file the response to CP's Cross-Motion for application of Canadian non-pecuniary damage limitations
02/25/16	ALS	0.20	Review upcoming deadline in derailment litigation (.1); email to L. Zahradka re same (.1)
02/25/16	ALS	0.40	Review and reply to email from L. Zahradka re Texas litigation (.2); review docket for Texas litigation (.2)
02/26/16	ALS	0.10	Docket scheduling in derailment litigation re Reply Deadline re: Response to Cross Motion for an Order Applying Canadian Non-Pecuniary Damage Limitations
02/26/16	ALS	0.20	Docket scheduling in derailment litigation cases re Reply Deadline re: Response in Opposition to Cross Motion for an Order Applying Canadian Non-Pecuniary Damage Limitations and Reply Memorandum in Support of Good Faith Finding Under the Illinois Contribution Act
02/26/16	LKZ	3.00	Revise objection to Wheeling Motion to Enforce (2.7); begin draft of objections to additional motions for good faith findings (.3).
02/27/16	DSA	0.10	Reviewed filings relating to CP litigation (.1)
02/28/16	LKZ	0.30	Emails w/B.Keach re: revisions to various objections.

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

02/29/16	LKZ	5.50	Review B.Keach comments to response to plaintiffs' motion to dismiss (.2); revise same (1.7); revise objection to Wheeling motion to compel (.5); emails w/A.Stewart re: upcoming filings (.2); analysis re: cross-motions to dismiss (1.9) and review of Federal Rules and Local Rules re: same (.5); confer w/R.Desai re: same (.2); call w/Clerk of District Court re: same (.1); confer w/A.Stewart re: same (.2).
02/29/16	ALS	0.30	Office conference with L. Zahradka re transfer of derailment cases (.2); email to L. Zahradka re same (.1)
02/29/16	TJM	0.20	Review email from counsel for Wheeling and respond re same (0.1) and email Trustee re same (0.1)
03/01/16	RPN	1.50	Telephone calls with/to Hugo Olore (.2); telephone call to his legal assistant (.2); draft letter to Attorney Olore (.2); draft Acceptance of Service (.3); prepare package of discovery subpoenas (.2); federal express subpoenas to Attorney Olore (.1); research regarding service of subpoenas (.2); draft email correspondence concerning status of discovery subpoenas (.1).
03/01/16	TJM	3.30	Draft, edit and revise 6th Amended JP re Wheeling v Keach
03/01/16	ALS	0.10	Update docket scheduling re derailment litigation
03/01/16	DSA	0.40	Reviewed e-mails and orders relating to transfer of cases to Maine (.1); reviewed responses to motion to dismiss release parties (.1); reviewed opposition to motion Wheeling motion for payment of claims (.2)

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

03/01/16	LKZ	6.80	Adapt response/ motion to dismiss for each of 39 cases (4.7); draft motions to expedite for 4 cases (1.1); supervise filing of all (.3); confer w/A.Stewart re: same (.2); confer w/K.Quirk re: service of same (.2); emails w/B.Keach re: same (.3).
03/01/16	KQ	0.60	Prepare and send service of the Response of Estate Representative to Plaintiffs Preliminary Motions to Dismiss Released Parties Pursuant to Fed. R. Civ. P. 54(b) and Cross-Motion for Entry of an Order (A) Enforcing the Releases and Injunctions Contained in the Order Adopting the Confirmation Order and Dismissing the Released Parties from the Derailment Actions and (B) Exempting the Released Parties from Compliance with the Local Counsel Requirement
03/01/16	KQ	0.30	Finalize and file the Estate Representative's Objection to Wheeling & Lake Erie Railway Company's Motion to Enforce Payment of Allowed Administrative Claim Pursuant to Order Confirming Trustee's Revised First Amended Plan of Liquidation Dated July 15, 2015 (as Amended on October 8, 2015) and Incorporated Memorandum of Law
03/01/16	KQ	0.60	Draft and file via ECF the Certificate of Service related to the Estate Representative's Objection to Wheeling & Lake Erie Railway Company's Motion to Enforce Payment of Allowed Administrative Claim Pursuant to Order Confirming Trustee's Revised First Amended Plan of Liquidation Dated July 15, 2015 (as Amended on October 8, 2015) and Incorporated Memorandum of Law

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

03/01/16	PM	0.20	Meet with Tim McKeon to discuss status (.1); Email communications with Peter Nichols to discuss service of subpoena on Aroostook River RR, Houlton Branch RR and International RWC (.1).
03/02/16	PM	0.10	Email communications with Peter Nichols re. service of subpoenas.
03/02/16	LKZ	5.40	Confer w/K.Quirk re: cross-motions to enforce and motions to expedite (.7); draft motion to expedite for each (1.6); calls w/J.Stemmler regarding same (.3); draft objections to motions for good faith finding (1.1); emails w/B.Keach re: above (.4); calls w/clerk of District Court re: motions to expedite (.4); confer w/A.Stewart re: remaining cross-motions to be filed (.5); draft update email to B.Keach re: above (.4).
03/02/16	DSA	0.10	Reviewed motion to shortened period in relation to release of parties motions (.1)
03/02/16	ALS	0.80	Review emails from/to L. Zahradka re preparation for derailment litigation to be transferred from Illinois (.3); office conference with L. Zahradka re filings once derailment litigation is transferred from Illinois (.2); review pleadings in preparation for filing once cases are transferred from Illinois (.3)
03/02/16	ALS	0.20	Docket scheduling in derailment litigation re Reply Deadline re: Response to Plaintiffs' Preliminary Motions to Dismiss Released Parties and Cross-Motion for Order Enforcing Releases and Injunctions
03/02/16	ALS	0.30	Service of motions to shorten response and reply period upon notice parties in derailment litigation cases

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

03/02/16	TJM	0.10	Review and respond to email from counsel for Wheeling re amended JPO
03/03/16	RPN	0.40	Telephone call with Hugo Olore (.1); review Acceptance of Service (.1); calendar pending deadlines (.1) draft and review email re: discovery subpoenas(.1)
03/03/16	ALS	0.10	Review upcoming deadlines with respect to responses to subpoenas
03/03/16	DSA	0.10	Reviewed filing relating to district court litigation (.1)
03/04/16	DSA	0.10	Reviewed CP filings relating to good faith findings (.1)
03/04/16	TJM	0.90	Review and respond to email from counsel for Wheeling (0.1); Review proposed edits to amended JPO (0.1) and email Trustee re same (0.1); Edit, revise and finalize 6th amended JPO (0.6)
03/07/16	DSA	0.10	Reviewed e-mails concerning issues with hearing dates in CP et al litigation (.1)
03/07/16	ALS	0.20	Email to R. Keach attaching Amended Complaint filed in Audet derailment litigation (.1); update pleadings re same (.1)
03/07/16	ALS	0.80	Docket scheduling re derailment litigation pending in U.S. District Court for the District of Maine (.5); review dockets for derailment litigation pending in U.S. District Court for the District of Maine (.3)
03/08/16	ALS	0.10	Emails from/to L. Zahradka re status of derailment litigation to be transferred from Illinois
03/08/16	ALS	0.10	Email to R. Keach re First Amended Complaint filed in Boulanger derailment litigation
03/08/16	ALS	0.20	Docket scheduling in Boulanger derailment litigation

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

03/08/16	ALS	0.40	Docket scheduling re Sixth Amended Joint Pretrial Order
03/08/16	DSA	0.10	Reviewed filings relating to Wheeling claims (.1).
03/08/16	KQ	0.10	E-mail from and to K. Ford at the USBC regarding dismissal of the adversary proceeding involving Helm Financial, and e-mail to M. Siedband regarding same.
03/08/16	MAS	0.10	Exchange emails with paralegals re: payment status of preference settlements and potential dismissal of released preference claim.
03/09/16	ALS	0.30	Review emails from L. Zahradka re status of case transfers with respect to derailment litigation, upcoming deadlines and filings
03/10/16	ALS	0.50	Emails from/to L. Zahradka re upcoming deadlines in derailment litigation cases (.1); review Court dockets re derailment litigation cases (.4)
03/10/16	ALS	0.20	Review emails from R. Keach, K. Quirk and L. Zahradka re timing of filing of motions to expedite in derailment litigation
03/10/16	KQ	0.10	E-mail from and to L. Zahradka regarding filing of the cross motions to enforce the plan
03/10/16	KQ	4.70	Revisions to 35 cross motions to enforce the plan and related motions to expedite
03/10/16	PM	0.20	Review docket report and email to Bob Keach and others re. newly filed cases against Canadian Pacific Railway.
03/10/16	RND	6.60	Revise Carmack Complaint
03/10/16	RND	0.20	Review email from R. Keach re: comments/edits to Carmack Complaint

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

03/10/16	TJM	0.90	Review Trustee email re comments to Complaint (0.1); Review file re questions/comments from Trustee re Complaint (0.5) and confer R Desai re same (0.3)
03/11/16	TJM	1.10	Review Wheeling objection to MSJ
03/11/16	RND	6.20	Continue reviewing CP corporate structure and revising Carmack Complaint re: same
03/11/16	LKZ	3.00	Revise motions to expedite (1.9); substantial emails (.5) and calls (.6) w/k. Quirk, A. Cumming re: filing same; service of same.
03/11/16	KQ	6.80	Finalize and file via ECF the cross-motions and related motions to expedite in 35 district court cases
03/11/16	DSA	0.40	Reviewed e-mails relating to the transfer of litigation to Maine for CP (.2); reviewed cross motions to dismiss released parties filed by the Estate Representative (.2).
03/14/16	DSA	1.00	Reviewed opposition to motion for summary judgment filed by Wheeling (.4); reviewed affidavits in support of same (.3). Reviewed orders entered by the district court concerning issues with scheduling of CP matters (.3).
03/14/16	KQ	0.60	Update schedule of district court cases with docket numbers related to the cross-motions, motions to expedite and orders on the motions to expedite
03/14/16	ALS	0.90	Office conference with L. Zahradka re current status of derailment litigation pending in U.S. District Court for the District of Maine (.3); review Court dockets with respect to derailment litigation (.6)
03/14/16	ALS	0.30	Office conference with K. Quirk re transfer of derailment cases from Illinois (.1), review of dockets re same and upcoming deadlines (.2).

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

03/14/16	LKZ	1.90	Emails w/K.Quirk & A.Stewart re: upcoming deadlines in Derailment cases (.3); o/c w/A.Stewart re: same (.3) and analysis re: same (0.3); read EFH decision on post-petition interest issue in connection with objection to Wheeling Motion to Enforce (1.0)
03/14/16	PM	0.20	Review Canadian Pacific statement for March 22, 2016 status conference.
03/14/16	RND	5.90	Continue drafting/revising Carmack complaint
03/14/16	TJM	3.00	Review and outline Wheeling objection to SJM (2.4); Confer E Albert re summary judgment standard (0.6)
03/14/16	TJM	1.80	Review notice filed by CP (0.2) and emails w/Trustee re same (0.2); Draft, edit and revise response re same (1.4)
03/15/16	TJM	2.60	Review Wheeling response to motion for summary judgment (0.4); Draft, edit and revise reply to Wheeling opposition to statement of facts (2.2)
03/15/16	TJM	0.60	Edit, revise and finalize statement in response to CP statement re jury trial status conference
03/15/16	RND	0.30	Review Response to CP's Statement for Status Conference re: Jury Trial
03/15/16	LKZ	2.40	Call w/counsel to Devlar re: deadlines for motions to dismiss released parties (.5); call w/counsel to plaintiffs re: 36th NDIL transferred case (.5); review EFH decision on adequate protection/collateral issue re: pending litigation matters (1.0); review plaintiffs' reply in support of preliminary motion to dismiss (.2) and emails w/B.Keach re: same (.2).

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

03/15/16	ALS	0.30	Update docket scheduling in derailment litigation cases pending in U.S. District Court for the District of Maine
03/15/16	ALS	0.10	Review email from T. McKeon re filing of response to CP's statement re Jury Trial Status Conference
03/15/16	KQ	0.20	Finalize and file the response to CP Statement re Jury Trial Status Conference
03/15/16	KQ	0.30	Draft and file the Certificate of Service related to the response to CP Statement re Jury Trial Status Conference
03/16/16	DSA	0.10	Reviewed filings relating to district court litigation (.1).
03/16/16	ALS	0.20	Update docket scheduling with respect to derailment litigation per L. Zahradka's request
03/16/16	ALS	0.20	Telephone conference with R. Desai re pleadings from class action case (.1); email to R. Desai re pleadings from class action case (.1)
03/16/16	LKZ	0.10	Review CP motion for waiver of pro hac fees.
03/16/16	PM	0.30	Review and analyze issues concerning Wheeling cross motion for summary judgment.
03/16/16	PM	0.10	Email communications with Tim McKeon re. Wheeling cross motion for summary judgment.
03/16/16	RND	8.10	Continue drafting/revising Carmack Complaint
03/16/16	TJM	0.20	TC w/ "counsel" for Irving re preference actions (0.1); Review order re destruction of documents (0.1)
03/16/16	TJM	0.30	Confer A Stewart (0.2) and K Quirk (0.1) re 506(c) discovery issues
03/16/16	TJM	5.40	Draft, edit and revise reply to Wheeling opposition to summary judgment (5.0) and confer M Seidband re same (0.4)

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

03/17/16	TJM	1.20	Draft, edit and revise reply to Wheeling opposition to SJM
03/17/16	TJM	0.90	Review Settlement Agreement w/ First Union (0.8) and email Trustee re same (0.1)
03/17/16	LKZ	2.50	Review responses to cross-motion (.5); draft reply in support of cross-motion (.9); confer w/B.Keach re: same (.4) and revise same (.2); emails w/A.Cummings (.1), K.Quirk (.1) re: filing same; review motions for good faith findings (.2) and upcoming deadlines (.1)
03/17/16	ALS	0.20	Docket scheduling re CP's Motions to Strike filed in the Audet and Boulanger derailment litigation
03/17/16	DSA	0.10	Reviewed e-mails relating to filings in the CP litigation (.1)
03/17/16	KQ	0.70	Obtain docket numbers from filings of the responses to the cross-motions and motions to dismiss for the 35 cases transferred to the district court
03/18/16	KQ	0.40	Obtain from the docket the docket entry numbers for the good faith motions filed in all 35 district court cases
03/18/16	KQ	0.30	Prepare and send e-mail service of the reply in support of cross-motion and exempt local counsel requirement
03/18/16	DSA	0.10	Reviewed filings in CP litigation concerning releasing parties (.1)
03/18/16	ALS	1.40	Filing of Replies in Support of Cross-Motion to Enforce Plan Injunction and Exempt Local Counsel Requirement in derailment cases
03/18/16	ALS	0.20	Telephone conference with L. Zahradka and M. Thibodeau at U.S. District Court re filing of Reply in Support of Cross-Motion to Enforce Plan Injunction in derailment cases

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

03/18/16	ALS	0.50	Docket scheduling in derailment litigation (.2); review dockets for derailment litigation cases for upcoming deadlines (.3)
03/18/16	ALS	0.20	Office conference with A. Cummings and K. Quirk re filing of replies in support of cross-motion in derailment litigation cases
03/18/16	LKZ	0.30	Confer w/A.Cummings, K.Quirk re: filing of responses to plaintiffs' motions to dismiss (.2); status update to B.Keach re: same (.1).
03/18/16	MAS	1.00	Review status of preference adversaries related to potential dismissal and completion of settlements.
03/18/16	TJM	0.60	Review email from counsel for Wheeling (0.1) and review file re same (0.4) and email Trustee re same (0.1)
03/18/16	TJM	5.60	Draft, edit and revise reply to Wheeling opposition to summary judgment
03/19/16	TJM	4.20	Draft, edit and revise reply to Wheeling opposition to SJM
03/20/16	TJM	4.20	Draft, edit and revise reply to Wheeling opposition to SJM
03/21/16	TJM	0.60	Prepare for status conference re CP re jury trial proposed orders
03/21/16	TJM	6.70	Confer Trustee re reply (0.3); Respond to email from counsel for Wheeling (0.3); Draft, edit and revise reply brief (6.1)
03/21/16	ALS	0.50	Review status of preference actions (.3); email to M. Siedband summarizing status of preference actions (.2)
03/21/16	ALS	0.20	Office conferences (x2) with T. McKeon re reply to Wheeling's response to motion for summary judgment
03/21/16	DSA	0.10	Reviewed filings relating to CP litigation
03/22/16	DSA	0.10	Reviewed e-mails concerning issues with answer deadline in CP litigation (.1)

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

03/22/16	ALS	0.40	Office conference with T. McKeon re supplement to Wheeling document production (.2); assist with supplemental production to Wheeling (.2)
03/22/16	LKZ	2.70	Analysis of deadlines re: pending motions to dismiss settling defendants (.3) and emails w/B.Keach re: same (.1); confer w./B.Keach re: research for reply to Wheeling response to MSJ (.5) and research re: same (1.8).
03/22/16	TJM	0.90	Respond to Wheeling discovery requests
03/22/16	TJM	0.30	TC w/ Trustee and counsel for World Fuel re Wheeling SJM
03/22/16	TJM	1.00	Confer w/ Trustee and counsel for CP re 26(f) conference
03/22/16	TJM	5.40	Draft, edit and revise reply motion re summary judgment re Wheeling
03/22/16	TJM	1.30	Travel to and from court (0.6); Attend status conference re Keach v. CP (0.5) and confer Trustee re same (0.1); Email counsel for CP re meeting time (0.1)
03/23/16	TJM	9.50	Draft, edit and revise reply brief papers re summary judgment re Wheeling
03/23/16	LKZ	5.10	Research i/c/w reply in support of MSJ (4.6); confer w/B.Keach re: same (.5).
03/23/16	CBB	0.80	Maine Uniform Commercial Code research.
03/24/16	ALS	0.20	Email to M. Paione re scheduling of hearing on summary judgment motion in Wheeling adversary (.1); office conference with T. McKeon re scheduling hearing in Wheeling adversary (.1)
03/24/16	ALS	0.20	Review L. Zahradka email re upcoming deadlines in derailment litigation cases

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

03/24/16	LKZ	4.60	Continue research for reply in support of MSJ (1.7) and emails w/B.Keach re: same (.2); draft insert for MSJ re: proceeds tracing (1.7) and emails w/B.Keach re: same (.2); confer w/M.Siedband re: same (.1); revise motion for procedural consolidation of WD cases (.4) and confer w/J.Sternklar re: same (.3).
03/24/16	MAS	0.80	Review status of pending preference adversaries and draft notice of dismissal for Helm Financial AP (resolved through release/confirmation).
03/24/16	TJM	8.30	Draft, edit and revise reply statement of facts re summary judgment re Wheeling
03/24/16	TJM	0.60	Review email from Counsel for Wheeling re discovery questions (0.2) and confer A Stewart re same (0.1); analysis re: same (.1) and respond re same (0.2)
03/25/16	TJM	4.50	Draft, edit and revise reply papers re summary judgment re Wheeling
03/25/16	MAS	2.50	Full review of statement of facts including revisions to record, citations and proofing, re: reply to Wheeling objection to MSJ.
03/25/16	MAS	3.00	Full review of brief/reply, including proofing and cite check, re: reply to Wheeling objection to MSJ.
03/25/16	MAS	1.40	Proof updated filing versions of brief/SOF for accuracy and redlines, additional proofing and attention to filing with Roma Desai and Angela Stewart, re: reply to Wheeling objection to MSJ.
03/25/16	RND	4.30	Review/Revise Trustee's Reply to Wheeling's Objection to SMJ
03/25/16	ALS	0.40	Review derailment litigation dockets for scheduling purposes

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

03/25/16	ALS	3.50	Revisions to and filing of Trustee's Reply to Wheeling's Objection and Memo of Law in Opposition to Motion for Summary Judgment and Trustee's Reply Statement of Material Facts in Wheeling adversary case
03/25/16	ALS	0.10	Emails from/to T. McKeon re filing in Wheeling adversary proceeding
03/25/16	ALS	0.10	Emails to R. Keach and T. McKeon re proposed hearing dates on summary judgment motion filed in Wheeling adversary proceeding
03/25/16	DSA	0.10	Reviewed e-mails relating to good faith finding in CP litigation (.1)
03/25/16	KQ	0.60	Finalize, file and serve the dismissal in the adversary proceeding Keach v. Helm Financial
03/25/16	KQ	0.40	Draft and file the Certificate of Service related to the dismissal in the adversary proceeding Keach v. Helm Financial
03/28/16	DSA	0.10	Reviewed response to motion for summary judgment filed by Wheeling (.1)
03/28/16	ALS	0.10	Email to R. Keach re hearing on motion for summary judgment in Wheeling adversary
03/28/16	ALS	0.20	Telephone conference with M. Thibodeau at U.S. District Court re upcoming deadlines in derailment cases (.1); reply email to L. Zahradka re same (.1)
03/28/16	ALS	0.10	Email to M. Paione at U.S. Bankruptcy Court re hearing on summary judgment motion
03/28/16	ALS	0.20	Filing of revised proposed order re CP's Motion for Jury Trial (.1); email to M. Paione re filing of revised proposed order re CP's Motion for Jury Trial (.1)

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

03/28/16	ALS	0.30	Preparation of certificate of service re Trustee's Reply in Support of Motion for Summary Judgment and Reply Statement of Material Facts in Wheeling adversary case (.2); filing of Certificate of Service with Court in Wheeling adversary case (.1)
03/28/16	MAS	0.20	Review status of settlement checks, update spreadsheet and email Aubrey re: clearance of funds.
03/28/16	LKZ	1.20	Review upcoming deadlines (.2) review revised consent order re: procedural consolidation of derailment cases (.3), review revised motion for consolidation (.3); prep for (.2) and call w/Sternklar & Thornton re: same (.2).
03/28/16	TJM	0.20	Confer A Stewart re CP discovery
03/28/16	TJM	1.50	Draft, edit and revise motion staying adversary proceeding re MNR (1.3) and re NBSR (0.1) and email counsel for MNR and NBSR re same (0.1)
03/28/16	TJM	0.50	TC w/ Trustee re proposed order on CP jury trial (0.1) and email counsel for CP re same (0.1); Review email from counsel for CP re jury trial order and review re same (0.1); Email counsel for CP re filing proposed order (0.1); Review and finalize proposed consented-to order (0.1)
03/29/16	TJM	0.30	Draft search terms for CP discovery
03/29/16	TJM	0.10	Review Wheeling 506(c) discovery requests
03/29/16	TJM	1.90	Review Reply brief re summary judgment re Wheeling (0.8); Emails w/ Trustee re discovery question (0.3); Emails w/ counsel for Wheeling re discovery (0.6); Confer A Stewart re discovery (0.2)

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

03/29/16	LKZ	0.30	Review revised motion for procedural consolidation and FOO (.2) and emails w/counsel re: same (.1).
03/29/16	MAS	0.50	Draft notice of dismissal for Saratoga and North Creek preference AP and attention to filing.
03/29/16	PM	0.10	Review CP document request.
03/29/16	PM	0.10	Review Order on CP Motion for Jury Trial.
03/29/16	ALS	0.20	Emails from/to T. McKeon re hearing on summary judgment motion in Wheeling adversary
03/29/16	ALS	0.20	Email to R. Keach and T. McKeon attaching Order on CP's Motion for Jury Trial (.1) review Order on CP's Motion for Jury Trial (.1)
03/30/16	ALS	0.30	Update docket scheduling with respect to preference actions
03/30/16	ALS	0.70	Update docket scheduling re derailment litigation cases pending in U.S. District Court
03/30/16	KQ	0.40	Finalize, file and serve the dismissal of the adversary proceeding involving Saratoga and Northcreek Railway
03/30/16	KQ	0.30	Draft and file the Certificate of Service related to the dismissal of the adversary proceeding involving Saratoga and Northcreek Railway
03/30/16	DSA	0.10	Reviewed filings in district court litigation
03/30/16	MAS	0.20	Review notice of dismissal as filed and email same to opposing counsel.
03/30/16	LKZ	0.30	Review final versions of motion for procedural consolidation.
03/30/16	TJM	0.10	Confer M Seidband re Wheeling discovery
03/30/16	TJM	0.10	Review CP second request for documents
03/30/16	TJM	0.40	Confer Trustee re Wheeling summary judgment reply and case status (0.4)

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

03/30/16	TJM	0.70	Review email and file re discovery re Wheeling (0.3) and confer A Stewart re same (0.4)
03/30/16	TJM	0.90	Review CP discovery requests (0.4) and prepare list of search terms re electronic discovery (0.2); Review JPO re discovery deadlines (0.1); Confer A Stewart re discovery search/production (0.2)
03/30/16	TJM	0.10	Email counsel for Wheeling re notice hearing re summary judgment re hearing
03/31/16	TJM	0.30	Confer R Desai re Carmack complaint
03/31/16	TJM	3.80	Draft, edit and revise expert designation re 506(c) (0.5) and email F Caruso re same (0.1); Review research re 506(c) (3.2)
03/31/16	TJM	0.70	Respond to email from counsel for Wheeling re scheduling hearing re SJM (0.1); Draft hearing notice re summary judgment motion (0.6)
03/31/16	RND	0.10	Review CP Disallowance Notice re: World Fuels' Notice of Carmack Claim
03/31/16	RND	0.10	Email with R. Keach re: Irving Oil's and World Fuels' Notice of Carmack Claim
03/31/16	RND	0.40	Call and email with J. Wetch re: Carmack Complaint
03/31/16	ALS	0.10	Docket scheduling re Hearing re: Trustee's Motion for Summary Judgment
04/01/16	ALS	0.30	Telephone conference with e-discovery processor re: CP doc requests (.2); office conference with T. McKeon re processing of discovery (.1)
04/01/16	ALS	0.40	Review outstanding discovery requests
04/01/16	DSA	0.10	Reviewed e-mails concerning orders relating to CP litigation (.1).
04/01/16	RND	0.20	Further emails with J. Wetch re: call to discuss Carmack Complaint

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

04/01/16	RND	4.90	Research re: attachment issues under Carmack amendment
04/01/16	LKZ	0.50	Review Wheeling reply in support of motion to enforce.
04/01/16	PM	0.10	Review CP document request.
04/01/16	PM	0.30	Review decision sent from Bob Keach re. personal jurisdiction issues.
04/01/16	TJM	1.50	TC w/ F Caruso and Trustee re 506(c) motion and expert designation (0.4); Finalize expert designation (0.3); Email same to counsel for Wheeling re:same (0.1); Review email response from counsel for Wheeling (0.2) and review PTO re same re expert disclosure (0.2) and respond to email re: same (0.3)
04/01/16	TJM	0.40	Confer A Stewart re discovery re CP (0.3); Email Trustee re search terms re CP electronic discovery (0.1)
04/04/16	TJM	0.30	Review email from counsel for Wheeling expert disclosure (0.1) and respond re same (0.2)
04/04/16	LKZ	1.20	Continue draft of designation of record and statement of issues on appeal for MN/NB Railroad's claim objection.
04/04/16	RND	4.40	Substantial research re: attachment issues under North Dakota law.
04/04/16	RND	1.70	Revise Carmack Complaint
04/04/16	RND	0.60	Meeting with R. Keach re: Carmack complaint and call with J. Wetch re: same
04/04/16	DSA	0.10	Review reply of Wheeling to surcharge claims.
04/04/16	ALS	0.10	Office conference with T. McKeon re expert designation in Wheeling adversary proceeding
04/04/16	ALS	0.20	Emails from/to L. Zahradka re designation of record for appeal for MN/NB Railroads claim objection
04/05/16	ALS	0.20	Email to R. Keach and T. McKeon re discovery requests

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

04/05/16	ALS	0.20	Office conference with R. Desai re Carmack notice (.1); review email from R. Keach re Carmack notice (.1)
04/05/16	RND	0.50	Revise Carmack Complaint
04/05/16	RND	0.80	Research re: prosecution of claims under Carmack Amendment
04/05/16	RND	0.10	Email with R. Keach and J. Wetch re: final draft of Carmack Complaint
04/05/16	LKZ	0.60	Revise pro hac for Carmack litigation (.1); review upcoming litigation deadlines (.3); revise designation of issues on appeal for MN/NB RRs claim objection (.2).
04/05/16	TJM	0.20	Confer R Desai re Carmack complaint (0.2)
04/05/16	TJM	2.70	Draft, edit and revise expert disclosure re 506(c) claim (2.4) and confer Trustee re same (0.3)
04/05/16	TJM	0.50	Attend hearing re Wheeling motion to enforce
04/06/16	TJM	1.90	TC w/ F Caruso re disclosure re 506(c) litigation (0.6); Emails w/ Trustee re same (0.3); Edit and revise disclosure (0.9); Email K Bigelow re request to prepare discovery response forms (0.1)
04/06/16	LKZ	2.40	Continue draft designation of record on appeal and statement of issues re: MN/NB Railroads claim objection (.6); emails w/B.Keach (.2), A.Cummings (.1) re: same; track entry of orders and judgments dismissing released parties (1.3) and emails w/B.Keach re: same (.2).
04/06/16	MAS	0.30	Review and revise pro hac vice materials for North Dakota litigation (Carmack Complaint).
04/06/16	ALS	0.10	Docket scheduling re Telephone Conference in Derailment Litigation Cases

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

04/06/16	DSA	0.30	Reviewed filings relating to change in hearing dates for CP litigation (.2); reviewed decision to dismiss released parties from litigation (.1)
04/07/16	DSA	0.10	Reviewed motion for stay pending appeal of Irving railroads matter (.1)
04/07/16	ALS	0.20	Office conference with T. McKeon re discovery
04/07/16	ALS	0.40	Filing of Consent Motions to Stay Adversary Cases with respect to New Brunswick Southern Railway Company Limited and Maine Northern Railway Company (.2); preparation of certificates of service re same (.2)
04/07/16	LKZ	1.00	Confer w/B.Keach re: orders dismissing released parties (.2) and review same (.2); several calls w/counsel to various settling parties re: same (.6).
04/07/16	RND	0.10	Email with J. Whatley re: Carmack Assignment
04/07/16	TJM	0.20	Edit and revise expert disclosure re 506(c) litigation
04/07/16	TJM	0.60	Draft comfort letter re First Union and release of all Claims
04/07/16	TJM	0.60	Revise proposed order staying adversary proceeding pending appeal re NBSR and MNR (0.5) and email counsel for MNR/NBSR re same (0.1)
04/08/16	TJM	0.50	Confer Trustee re expert disclosures re 506(c) litigation (0.1); Revise and finalize Expert Disclosure (0.3) and email opposing counsel re same (0.1)
04/08/16	RND	0.10	Emails with Monitor re: Carmack Complaint
04/08/16	RND	0.10	Meeting with R. Keach re: registered agents for CP Entities
04/08/16	RND	0.10	Call with J. Wetch re: Carmack Complaint
04/08/16	LKZ	1.70	Revise designation of record and statement of issues on appeal.

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

04/08/16	ALS	0.10	Assist R. Desai re Carmack complaint
04/11/16	ALS	0.40	Docket scheduling re derailment litigation
04/11/16	ALS	0.20	Email to T. Shannon at Verrill Dana with respect to document database (.1); office conference with T. McKeon with respect to document database (.1)
04/11/16	ALS	0.40	Update docket schedule re preference actions.
04/11/16	ALS	0.20	Docket scheduling re Wheeling's Motion to Strike
04/11/16	DSA	0.30	Reviewed motion to strike expert designation file by Wheeling (.2); reviewed designation of record and issues for appeal for Irving Railroad (.1)
04/11/16	KQ	0.10	Office conference with L Zahradka and call to the Bankruptcy Court regarding need for filing transcript order in preparation for filing the designation of record related to New Brunswick Southern Railway Company Limited and Maine Northern Railway Company
04/11/16	KQ	0.30	Finalize and file the designation of record and statement of issues related to the proofs of claim filed by New Brunswick Southern Railway and Maine Northern Railway
04/11/16	KQ	0.30	Draft and file the Certificate of Service related to the designation of record and statement of issues related to the proofs of claim filed by New Brunswick Southern Railway and Maine Northern Railway
04/11/16	LKZ	1.10	Revise designation of record and statement of issues on appeal.
04/11/16	TJM	0.20	Confer A Stewart re CP discovery responses re production of documents (.1) and analysis re: same (.1).

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

04/11/16	TJM	0.30	Confer A Stewart re 506(c) motion status re Wheeling motion to strike (0.1); Review Wheeling motion to strike (0.2)
04/12/16	TJM	0.40	Conference with J Lewis re 506(c) Conference with J. Lewis re: 506(c) motion and Wheeling interrogatories (0.2)(0.2)
04/12/16	LKZ	0.50	Emails w/B.Keach, WD Trustee re: Carmack complaint.
04/12/16	RND	0.50	Emails with L. Zahradka, R. Keach, and J. Wetch re: filing of Carmack Complaint and service on CP Entities
04/12/16	JAL	0.20	Conference with TJM re 506(c) discovery responses.
04/12/16	JAL	1.60	Reviewed 506(c) motion, objection and interrogatories and requests for admission propounded upon trustee re same in preparation for drafting responses.
04/12/16	JAL	0.20	Conference with TJM re approach to responses to 506(c) interrogatories and requests for admission.
04/12/16	JAL	1.00	Began drafting responses to interrogatories from Wheeling on 506(c).
04/12/16	ALS	0.30	Review emails (x2) from L. Zahradka re filing of Carmack Complaint (.2); review Court docket for scheduling purposes (.1)
04/13/16	ALS	0.30	Meeting with R. Keach, J. Lewis and T. McKeon re discovery requests
04/13/16	ALS	0.40	Meeting with J. Lewis and T. McKeon re discovery requests (partial).
04/13/16	ALS	0.20	Docket scheduling re discovery requests
04/13/16	ALS	2.40	Work on discovery with respect to surcharge motion

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

04/13/16	JAL	6.90	Finished drafting responses to interrogatories received from Wheeling with respect to 506(c) surcharge claim (5.5); conference with TJM and A. Stewart to coordinate discovery responses (.4); conference with RJK and TJM re responses to discovery requests (1.0).
04/13/16	DSA	0.10	Reviewed e-mails concerning issues with Wheeling surcharge motion (.1)
04/13/16	RND	0.10	Email with J. Wetch and R. Keach re: order approving pro hac vice motions in Carmack litigation
04/13/16	RND	0.20	Emails with R. Keach, J. Wetch, and R. Minch re: ND Attachment Statute
04/13/16	LKZ	0.30	Confer w/J.Lewis re: responses to CP doc requests.
04/13/16	TJM	2.20	Confer J Lewis re responses to discovery re 506(c) (0.4); Confer J Lewis and A Stewart re 506(c) discovery (0.4); Confer J Lewis and Trustee re 506(c) discovery (1.0); analysis re: same (.4).
04/14/16	LKZ	0.90	Review Carmack Complaint.
04/14/16	RND	0.10	Email with L. Zahradka and J. Wetch re: service of Carmack Complaint
04/14/16	ALS	0.10	Email to T. McKeon re discovery
04/15/16	ALS	0.40	Continue work on discovery with respect to surcharge motion re: Wheeling collateral and CP's document requests
04/15/16	RND	0.10	Correspondence with R. Keach re: call to discuss ND Attachment Statute
04/18/16	RND	0.30	Emails with L. Zahradka and R. Keach and call with A. Stewart re: service of Carmack complaint on CP Entities
04/18/16	RND	0.10	Emails with J. Sternklar and R. Keach re: CP's U.S. registered agent for service

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

04/18/16	RND	0.50	Call with J. Wetch, R. Keach, and R. Minch re: North Dakota attachment statute [Carmack Complaint against CP Entities] (.4); analysis re: same (0.1).
04/18/16	RND	0.90	Review CP Entities' state of incorporation and corporate organization chart to determine proper service location (.3); Emails with R. Keach and J. Wetch re: same (.3); call with A. Stewart re: same (.3)
04/18/16	LKZ	0.40	Call w/local counsel re attachment issues i/c/w Carmack complaint.
04/18/16	ALS	0.10	Email to R. Keach re conference call re Carmack action
04/18/16	ALS	0.30	Conference call with R. Desai re service issues with respect to Carmack litigation
04/18/16	ALS	0.40	Research re service issues relating to Carmack litigation
04/18/16	TJM	0.20	Review Wheeling motion to strike (0.2)
04/18/16	TJM	0.20	Email counsel for CP re discovery deadlines (0.1); TC w/ T Shannon re MMA electronic documents (left vm) (0.1);
04/19/16	TJM	1.10	Review Wheeling motion to strike (0.3); Draft, edit and revise objection re same (0.8)
04/19/16	TJM	0.40	Finalize Trustee affidavit re notary (0.3) and email co counsel re same (0.1)
04/19/16	RND	0.10	Further emails with J. Sternklar and R. Keach re: CP's U.S. registered agent and possible service of CP in Canada
04/20/16	RND	0.20	Call with A. Bayus and emails with R. Keach and A. Bayus re: service in Canada

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

04/20/16	RND	0.40	Email with N. Hetu and call with Canadian bailiffs re: service on CP Entities (.3); Further email with R. Keach re: French translations of Carmack complaint for service on CP (.1).
04/20/16	RND	1.40	Research re: service of process in Canada via Hague Convention and based on different provincial statutes
04/20/16	LKZ	1.00	Prep for 4/20 status conference with District Court re: Derailment litigation.
04/20/16	KQ	1.30	Prepare documents for transmittal to Paquette to be served upon CP Railway Co. (1.0) and draft letter to S. Choquette regarding same (.3).
04/20/16	TJM	1.10	Draft, edit and revise objection to Wheeling motion to strike
04/21/16	TJM	0.20	TC w/ T Shannon re electronic files re MMA re CP litigation
04/21/16	TJM	2.90	Draft, edit and revise objection to Wheeling motion to strike
04/21/16	DSA	0.10	Reviewed orders entered in district court derailment litigation (.1)
04/21/16	LKZ	1.30	Prep for (.2) and telephonic status conference w/J.Nivison re: Derailment litigation (1.1).
04/21/16	RND	0.10	Email correspondence with J. Wetch re: Carmack Complaint
04/21/16	RND	0.20	Email with S. Choquette re: service on CP Entities (.1) and call with K. Quirk to coordinate service on CP Entities (.1).
04/22/16	LKZ	0.30	Review emails among clerk and parties re: hearing date for oral argument on Derailment cases (.1); review minute entries from 4/20 status conference (.1); review upcoming deadlines (.1).

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

04/22/16	MAS	0.70	Confer with Tim McKeon re: Wheeling motion to strike expert designation, steps to resolve prior to hearing.
04/22/16	MAS	0.60	Review Wheeling's motion to strike regarding expert designation/report and trustee's draft response.
04/22/16	DSA	0.10	Reviewed orders entered in District Court Derailment litigation (.1)
04/22/16	KQ	0.20	File via ECF the Trustee's objection to Wheeling's motion to strike expert designation
04/22/16	ALS	0.10	Email to T. McKeon re follow up on discovery
04/22/16	TJM	1.10	Confer w/ M Seidband re Wheeling motion to strike (0.7); Email counsel for Wheeling re deadlines (0.1); Finalize objection to Wheeling motion to strike for filing (0.3)
04/22/16	TJM	2.30	Draft, edit and revise response to Wheeling request for documents
04/22/16	TJM	0.30	Email counsel for CP re search terms re electronic discovery (0.1); Email A Stewart re status of discovery from Debtor's counsel (0.2)
04/22/16	TJM	1.20	Draft, edit and revise letter to counsel for First Union re scope re release of claims (1.2)
04/25/16	ALS	0.20	Review emails relating to CP/discovery search terms
04/25/16	KQ	0.10	Telephone call with R. Desai regarding service of the Carmack complaint to Canadian companies
04/25/16	KQ	1.90	Prepare documents for transmittal to Paquetta to be served upon CP Railway Co. and draft letter to C. Choquette regarding same.
04/25/16	KQ	0.30	Draft and file the Certificate of Service related to the Trustee's opposition to CP's motion to strike expert designation in Wheeling v. Keach

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

04/25/16	DSA	0.10	Reviewed e-mails and filings relating to surcharge motion against Wheeling.
04/25/16	LKZ	0.10	Review MN/NE RRs' counter-designation of record and emails w/B.Keach re: same.
04/25/16	RND	0.50	Emails and call with K. Quirk and S. Choquette re: service on CP Entities in Canada
04/26/16	RND	0.10	Call and Email with S. Choquette re: notarized affidavit of service on CP Entities
04/26/16	RND	0.10	Emails with L. Fjellanger and R. Keach re: service on Soo Line and DME (Carmack Complaint)
04/26/16	LKZ	0.70	Review procedural orders from J.Nivison (.4) and draft email to B.Keach re: same (.3).
04/26/16	ALS	0.20	Update docket scheduling re derailment litigation
04/26/16	ALS	0.20	Docket scheduling re Carmack litigation
04/26/16	ALS	0.10	Emails from/to T. Zarhadka re deadlines in derailment litigation
04/26/16	TJM	0.60	TC w/ F Caruso re 506(c) motions
04/27/16	TJM	0.10	Respond to email from J Lewis re responses to 506(c) discovery requests (0.1)
04/27/16	ALS	0.10	Email to R. Desai re service in Carmack litigation
04/27/16	DSA	0.30	Reviewed procedural order entered by the District Court and e-mails relating thereto.
04/27/16	ALS	1.30	Work on document production with respect to surcharge motion (1.2); emails to T. McKeon re same (.1)
04/27/16	JAL	3.60	Continued drafting responses to discovery requests from Wheeling re 506(c).
04/27/16	LKZ	0.30	Review docket entries stemming from Nivison procedural order (.1) and emails w/B.Keach re: same (.1); call w/J.Bethony re: summons to CP (.1).

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

04/28/16	RND	3.20	Review/analyze case law re: limiting liability and SOL for Carmack Claims (2.1); Review/analyze CP BOL and tariff (1.1)
04/28/16	LKZ	1.20	Further draft objection to motion for relief from judgment (.7); confer w/B. Keach re: same and deadlines under procedural order (.5).
04/28/16	JAL	5.00	Finished drafting discovery responses to first set of discovery requests received from Wheeling in 506(c) case.
04/28/16	TJM	1.30	Confer J Lewis re responses to Wheeling discovery requests re 506(c) (0.3) and finalize responses (0.6) and email counsel for Wheeling re same (0.1); Draft, edit and revise proposed seventh amended JPO (0.3)
04/29/16	TJM	2.80	Draft, edit and revise seventh amended JPO (0.9) and email to opposing counsel (0.1) and confer M Seidband re same (0.1); Review emails from counsel for Wheeling (0.2) and respond re same (0.4) and confer M Seidband re same (0.4); Review Wheeling motion to extend deadlines (0.3) and email counsel for Wheeling re same (0.4)
04/29/16	ALS	0.20	Email to R. Keach and T. McKeon re Wheeling's request for status conference and motion to enlarge deadlines (.1); update pleadings file with same (.1)
04/29/16	RND	2.70	Continue to review/analyze case law re: limitation of liability under carmack and begin drafting response to CP's pleading re: same
04/29/16	RND	3.90	Draft response to CP's pleading re: Carmack's limitation of liability
04/29/16	MAS	0.50	Confer with Tim McKeon re: Wheeling motion to strike, latest developments and communications with counsel to Wheeling (.1)(.4).

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

05/02/16	LKZ	0.10	Review upcoming deadlines.
05/02/16	DSA	0.30	Reviewed Wheeling reply to expert designation in surcharge matter and related filings (.3)
05/02/16	KQ	0.10	File via ECF the Trustee's response to Wheeling's April 29th filing in the adversary proceeding Wheeling v. Keach, et al.
05/02/16	TJM	0.10	Review revisions by First Union to comfort letter re release of claims against First Union (0.1)
05/02/16	TJM	0.30	Email Debtor counsel re access to documents w/ third party vendor (0.1) and review discovery terms re same (0.2)
05/02/16	TJM	2.70	Draft, edit, revise and finalize response to Wheeling motion (1.5) and confer M Siedband re same and preparation for hearing (1.0) and email Trustee re same (0.2)
05/03/16	TJM	0.20	TC w/ R Desai re CP re limitation of liability defense
05/03/16	TJM	0.50	Finalize letter to First Union re release of claims
05/03/16	TJM	0.40	Review documents re Wheeling request for documents (0.2); Review email from counsel for Wheeling and respond re same (0.2)
05/03/16	KQ	0.20	Finalize and file the Certificate of Service related to the Trustee's response to Wheeling's April 29th filing in the adversary proceeding of Wheeling v. Keach
05/03/16	DSA	0.10	Reviewed pleadings filed by Wheeling in adversary proceeding (.1)
05/03/16	ALS	0.10	Review email re 506(c) document production
05/03/16	LKZ	1.40	Research re: permissive intervention (1.0); begin draft of motion re: same (.4).
05/03/16	RND	2.60	Draft legal argument re: Carmack's limitation of liability

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

05/04/16	RND	3.30	Continue drafting legal argument re: Carmack's limitation of liability
05/04/16	RND	0.20	Emails with R. Keach re: limitation of liability under Carmack
05/04/16	LKZ	0.10	Begin draft motion to intervene.
05/04/16	PM	0.10	Email communications with Tim McKeon and Bob Keach re. CP discovery.
05/04/16	TJM	0.20	Review filings by Wheeling re 506(c)
05/04/16	TJM	0.20	Review CP's proposed search terms re electronic discovery (0.1) and email Trustee re same (0.1)
05/05/16	TJM	0.60	Confer M Seidband re preparation re hearing re Wheeling motion to strike and motion for status conference
05/05/16	PM	0.20	Meet with Tim McKeon to discuss status and next steps re: CP discovery
05/05/16	LKZ	2.60	Draft motion to intervene in Consolidated Derailment Case (2.1) and emails w/B.Keach re: same (.1); revise same (.2) and emails w/K.Quirk re: filing same (.2).
05/05/16	RND	7.90	Continue drafting legal argument and analysis re: Carmack's limitation of liability
05/05/16	ALS	0.30	Docket scheduling upcoming deadlines in Carmack litigation
05/05/16	ALS	0.20	Update docket scheduling re Motion to Strike Expert Designation and for Related Relief
05/05/16	ALS	0.20	Emails from/to T. McKeon re review of documents from Evidox
05/05/16	DSA	0.10	Reviewed e-mails and filings from Wheeling concerning surcharge claims (.1)
05/05/16	KQ	0.10	E-mail with L. Zahradka regarding service of the Motion to Intervene to be filed in the District Court related to the derailment litigation

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

05/06/16	KQ	0.20	Finalize and file via ECF the motion for limited intervention in the consolidated derailment cases
05/06/16	KQ	0.20	Finalize and file via ECF the Estate Representative's designation of pleadings regarding the common motions in the consolidated derailment litigation
05/06/16	DSA	0.20	Reviewed motion to intervene and others filing in the CP litigation (.2)
05/06/16	RND	3.90	Continue drafting legal argument and analysis re: Carmack's limitation of liability
05/06/16	MAS	0.80	Begin preparation for hearing on Wheeling motion to strike Caruso designation (includes conference with Tim McKeon)
05/06/16	LKZ	2.20	Finalize motion to intervene (.7); draft designation of pleadings for Derailment cases (.2); emails w/K.Quirk re: filing same (.1); emails w/B.Keach re: above (.1); review CP notice of intent to withdraw the reference (.5); review transmittal of record to BAP re: MN/NB RRs appeal (.2) and analysis re: same (.2); emails w/B.Keach re: above (.2).
05/07/16	ALS	0.10	Docket scheduling re Response Deadline re: Estate Representative's Motion to Intervene or, in the Alternative, for Leave to Intervene on a Limited Basis, in the Consolidated Derailment Case in derailment litigation case
05/07/16	ALS	0.10	Reply email to L. Zahradka re Designation of Record on Appeal to File
05/09/16	LKZ	0.20	Emails w/B.Keach re: MN/NB RRs settlement discussion.
05/09/16	MAS	1.50	Prepare for hearing on Wheeling motion to strike expert designation.
05/09/16	MAS	0.60	Confer with Tim re: Wheeling motion to strike.

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

05/09/16	TJM	0.10	Confer Trustee re CP supplemental responses to interrogatories (0.1)
05/09/16	TJM	3.20	Review file re preparation for hearing re Wheeling motion to strike and motion for status conference (2.6) and confer M Seidband re same (.6)
05/09/16	TJM	0.60	Review CP supplemental responses to interrogatories (0.6)
05/10/16	TJM	0.10	Email M Seidband re discovery status re Wheeling
05/10/16	MAS	1.50	Preparation for and attendance at hearing on Wheeling's motion to strike.
05/10/16	MAS	0.40	Draft summary of hearing notes and probable response for Wheeling motion to strike remaining issues.
05/10/16	LKZ	0.20	Review scheduling order for MN/NB RRs appeal (.1) and emails w/B.Keach re: same (.1).
05/10/16	ALS	0.20	Update docket scheduling re Wheeling adversary case
05/10/16	ALS	0.10	Review email from L. Zahradka re briefing order in Robert J. Keach v. New Brunswick Southern Railway, et al
05/11/16	KQ	0.30	Prepare exhibit related to 506c Discovery
05/11/16	RND	0.20	Emails with CP entities re: agreement extending answer deadline and agreement to dismiss DME from Carmack litigation
05/11/16	RND	0.10	Email with World Fuels re: Carmack litigation
05/11/16	RND	0.20	Review affidavit of service on CP entities in Canada and email with J. Wetch re: same
05/11/16	TJM	4.50	Confer M Seidband re hearing on Wheeling motion to strike (0.4) and confer M Seidband and Trustee re same (0.6); Draft, edit and revise Rule 26(b)(2)(C) disclosure (1.5) and TC w/ F Caruso re same (0.4) and emails w/ F Caruso re same (0.2); TC w/ F Caruso re

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

			506(c) (0.6); Review documents re fees re Sale of Assets (0.8)
05/11/16	TJM	0.80	Review CP discovery responses
05/11/16	TJM	2.20	Prepare for hearing re motion for summary judgment
05/12/16	TJM	0.70	Review documents from F Caruso re 506(c) claim
05/12/16	TJM	6.70	Prepare for hearing (0.9); Travel to and from court (0.5); Attend hearing re summary judgment, motion to strike and motion for status conference (2.9) and confer Trustee re same (0.9); Confer M Seidband re hearing on summary judgment (0.5); Draft, edit and revise proposed order re Wheeling motion to strike (0.9) and email Wheeling re same (0.1)
05/12/16	TJM	0.10	Email R Desai re dismissal of defendants in Carmack case (0.1)
05/12/16	RND	0.30	Email with T. McKeon re: dismissal of DME and draft notice of dismissal of DME
05/12/16	MAS	2.90	Prepare for and appear at hearing on Motion for Summary Judgment (re: wheeling security interest) and Wheeling motion to strike.
05/12/16	MAS	0.50	Confer with Tim McKeon following hearing on Wheeling's motion to strike re: next steps, proposed order language.
05/13/16	KQ	0.10	E-mail from and to T. McKeon regarding 506(c) discovery
05/13/16	DSA	0.10	Reviewed e-mails and docket entries relating to Wheeling proceedings (.1)
05/13/16	ALS	0.70	Work on supplemental 506(c) discovery re Wheeling (.4); emails from/to T. McKeon re same (.3)
05/13/16	ALS	0.20	Emails from/to K. Quirk re 506(c) discovery

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

05/13/16	TJM	1.90	Set up program to review/search documents re responding to CP discovery requests (0.5); Review email from counsel for CP re electronic discovery search terms (0.1) and analysis re same (1.3)
05/13/16	TJM	0.80	Emails w/ A Stewart re production of documents (0.1); Edit and revise proposed amended scheduling order (0.4) and order denying motion to strike (0.1); Review and respond to email from A Stewart re document production (0.2)
05/16/16	TJM	1.70	Review file and discovery items re developing search terms and parameters re electronic discovery (1.7)
05/16/16	PM	0.20	Meet with Bob Keach and Sam Anderson to discuss status of CP litigation.
05/16/16	PM	0.10	Meet with Tim McKeon to discuss CP discovery issues.
05/17/16	RND	0.20	Emails with L. Zahradka re: Carmack litigation
05/17/16	RND	0.20	Emails with R. Keach and World Fuels re: Carmack Litigation
05/17/16	RND	0.10	Emails with J. Wetch re: CP Limited and CP affidavits of service
05/17/16	ALS	0.10	Review emails from T. McKeon and F. Caruso re 506(c) discovery
05/17/16	KQ	0.20	Prepare and transmit the Carmack complaint to H. Miles, J. Whatley, B. Keach, R. Desai and L. Zahradka
05/17/16	TJM	0.40	Email counsel for Wheeling re proposed order re denying motion to strike (0.1); Listen to audio from hearing re motion to strike (0.2); Email F Caruso re documents in response to Wheeling requests (0.1)

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

05/18/16	TJM	0.10	TC w/ counsel for World Fuel re affidavit re BOL process
05/18/16	TJM	0.90	TC w/ R Desai re CP discovery requests (.3), analysis re: same (.5), and email discovery materials re same (0.1)
05/18/16	ALS	0.70	Continue work on 506(c) discovery
05/18/16	RND	0.30	Call with T. McKeon re: CP discovery requests
05/19/16	RND	0.10	Email with R. Keach and T. McKeon re: Carmack Litigation
05/19/16	LKZ	0.60	Confer w/A. Cummings re: appendix for MN/NB RRs appeal brief.
05/19/16	DSA	0.10	Reviewed order entered in CP litigation by the District Court (.1)
05/19/16	TJM	0.10	Email P McDonald re discovery search terms re CP
05/19/16	TJM	0.70	Emails w/ counsel for Wheeling re proposed order denying motion to strike (0.2); Review revisions to order denying motion to strike from Wheeling (0.1) and respond to email from counsel for Wheeling re same and 506(c) discovery (0.2); Edit and revise final version of proposed order re motion to strike for filing (0.2)
05/19/16	TJM	0.10	Email Trustee re conversation w/ counsel for WF re employee affidavit (0.1)
05/20/16	TJM	0.10	Email counsel for Wheeling re amended JPO (0.1)
05/20/16	KQ	0.10	File via Ecf the proposed order related to Wheeling & Lake Erie's Motion to strike expert designation and for related relief
05/20/16	KQ	0.20	Enter on the docket an agreed request to continue related to the preliminary hearing on the surcharge motion in Wheeling v. Keach
05/23/16	DSA	0.10	Reviewed orders entered in case relating to Wheeling adversary (.1)

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

05/23/16	LKZ	0.30	Review upcoming deadlines (.1); research re: personal jurisdiction issues (.2).
05/23/16	RND	0.10	Review email from local counsel re: Carmack Litigation
05/24/16	LKZ	3.20	Draft outline for opening brief for MN/NB RRs appeal and research in connection with same (2.6); emails w/B.Keach re: same (.1); begin shell for opening brief (.4); review upcoming deadlines (.1).
05/24/16	ALS	0.20	Emails from/to T. McKeon re status of 506c discovery
05/24/16	TJM	1.70	Review CP discovery electronic search terms and prepare list of terms
05/24/16	TJM	0.80	Review file re documents responsive to discovery demands re 506(c) (0.8)
05/25/16	TJM	0.50	Revise proposed seventh amended JPO (0.4) and email counsel for Wheeling re same (0.1)
05/25/16	ALS	0.10	Email to K. Quirk re 506c discovery
05/25/16	LKZ	0.80	Emails w/A.Cummings re: exhibits for MN/NB RRs appeal opening brief (.1); draft summary of litigation against CP for Canadian counsel in advance of 5/30 hearing (.6) and emails w/T.McKeon, R.Desai re: same (.1).
05/25/16	RND	0.20	Emails with R. Keach and J. Wetch re: stipulation of dismissal against DME
05/25/16	RND	0.10	Email with R. Keach re: discovery of CP Entities in Carmack Litigation
05/26/16	RND	2.30	Analyze potential discovery requests and begin drafting discovery requests in Carmack litigation
05/26/16	RND	0.90	Review CP's Answer to Carmack Complaint
05/26/16	RND	0.20	Further emails with R. Keach and J. Wetch re: stipulation of dismissal in Carmack Litigation

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

05/26/16	RND	0.10	Email with R. Keach re: CP Entities' Answers to Carmack Complaint
05/26/16	LKZ	0.70	Revise summary of Carmack litigation and research re: same (.6); emails w/B.Keach re: same (.1).
05/26/16	TJM	0.50	Edit LZ email re status of CP litigation (0.5)
05/27/16	TJM	1.00	Review documents re 506(c) discovery (0.6); Review email from counsel for Wheeling re amended JPO (0.1) and email Trustee re same (0.1); Respond to email from counsel for Wheeling re amended JPO (0.2)
05/27/16	LKZ	0.70	Review and summarize plaintiffs' response to trustee's motion to intervene in Derailment actions (.3); emails w/B.Keach re: same (.1); emails w/B.Keach re: summary of CP litigation (.1); review CP objection to motion to intervene (.1) and emails w/B.Keach re: same (.1).
05/27/16	RND	3.10	Continue working on discovery requests in Carmack litigation
05/27/16	ALS	0.20	Emails from/to R. Desai re pleadings re CP discovery
05/27/16	ALS	0.40	Continue work on 506(c) discovery
05/27/16	ALS	0.10	Email from L. Zahradka re Plaintiffs' response to motion to intervene filed in derailment litigation
05/31/16	ALS	0.10	Email to T. McKeon re 506(c) discovery
05/31/16	ALS	0.20	Docket scheduling re Reply Deadline re: Plaintiffs' Response to Estate Representative's Motion to Intervene and Reply Deadline re: CP's Response to Estate Representative's Motion to Intervene in Derailment Litigation
05/31/16	ALS	0.30	Docket scheduling in Carmack litigation (.2); review Order entered in Carmack litigation (.1)

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

05/31/16	DSA	0.20	Reviewed responses to motion to intervene filed by various parties (.2)
05/31/16	RND	5.80	Review CPRC's Answer and begin drafting discovery requests to CPRC
05/31/16	TJM	1.70	Review discovery production re 506(c) (1.1) Emails w/ F Caruso re same (0.2) and TC re same (0.1); Email counsel for Wheeling re document production (0.1); TC w/ F Caruso re same (0.2)
06/01/16	RND	0.20	Emails with R. Keach, J. Whatley, and J. Wetch re: Carmack litigation with CP Entities
06/01/16	RND	0.10	Emails with R. Keach re: Pretrial Scheduling Conference in Carmack Litigation
06/01/16	RND	5.70	Review CPRC and Soo Line Answers and prepare Discovery requests for same
06/01/16	LKZ	0.10	Review emails w/WD Trustee re: CP answers to Carmack complaints, discovery requests.
06/01/16	ALS	0.10	Docket scheduling dispositive motion deadline in Carmack litigation
06/01/16	ALS	0.20	Review Order and Court docket re upcoming deadlines in Carmack litigation
06/02/16	CBB	1.00	Federal legislative history research in connection with BAP brief
06/02/16	LKZ	4.20	Revise outline for MN/NB RRs brief (.1) and emails w/B.Keach re: same (.1); continue draft of brief (4.0).
06/02/16	RND	0.10	Emails with R. Keach and T. Thornton re: Rule 26(f) conference
06/02/16	RND	1.20	Review CP Limited's Answer and prepare discovery requests re: same
06/02/16	TJM	1.00	Review and revise search terms re electronic discovery re CP litigation
06/02/16	TJM	0.20	Review email from A Helman re Wheeling escrow (0.1) and confer Trustee re same (0.1)
06/02/16	TJM	0.50	Review recent decision re summary judgment

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

06/03/16	TJM	0.40	Review and revise search terms re electronic discovery
06/03/16	RND	1.40	Continuing drafting discovery requests to CP Limited
06/03/16	RND	0.10	Email with R. Keach re: discovery requests for CP Limited and Soo Line Corp.
06/03/16	LKZ	6.30	Review BAP brief cover page, appendices, etc. and BAP rules I/c/w same (.3); analysis re: and emails w/A.Cummings re: exhibits for appendix for BAP brief (.3); further revise statement of facts for MN/NB RRs BAP brief and insert citations for same (5.5); emails w/B.Keach re: same (.2).
06/03/16	CBB	3.00	Federal legislative history research in connection with BAP brief.
06/05/16	LKZ	4.00	Revise MN/NB RRs appellate brief.
06/06/16	LKZ	5.90	Review upcoming deadlines (.1); research for BAP brief (2.8); further revise argument section of same (2.8); emails w/A.Cummings re: status of same (.1); confer w/B.Keach re:same (.1).
06/06/16	RND	2.40	Draft discovery request to SOO Line Corporation and review/revise discovery requests to other CP Entities
06/07/16	PM	0.30	Review and comment on suggested search terms for CP discovery.
06/07/16	LKZ	3.60	Finalize draft of BAP brief (1.8); confer w/B.Keach (.5) and emails w/B.Keach re: same (.1); assemble motion for intervention briefing (.2); follow-up research re: BAP brief (1.0).
06/07/16	CBB	0.30	Legal research in connection with BAP brief
06/07/16	ALS	0.10	Office conference with T. McKeon re CP discovery issues

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

06/07/16	ALS	0.10	Office conference with R. Desai re Carmack discovery
06/07/16	TJM	0.50	Review proposed list of electronic search terms (0.4) and email P McDonald re same (0.1)
06/08/16	TJM	0.10	Review revisions to amended JPO re counsel for Wheeling (0.1)
06/08/16	LKZ	7.00	Several conferences w/B.Keach re: BAP brief (.9); revise same (5.5); emails w/WD Trustee re CP answers to Carmack complaint (.1); review RJK notice of appearance for BAP brief (.1) and review rules for BAP brief (.4).
06/08/16	RND	0.10	Emails with L. Zahradka re: Carmack litigation
06/08/16	RND	0.10	Emails with J. Whatley and L. Zahradka re: call to discuss Carmack litigation
06/09/16	RND	0.10	Emails with J. Wetch and L. Zahradka re: call to discuss Carmack Litigation
06/09/16	LKZ	11.20	Revise BAP brief (3.4); substantial conferences w/B.Keach re: same (1.1); substantial research re: same (2.2); several conferences w/A.Cummings (.5), K.Quirk (.6) re: TOC/TOA; and revise same (1.2); proofread brief (1.8); confer w/K.Quirk re: filing same (.2); emails w/local counsel to WD Trustee re: CP answers to Carmack complaint (.2).
06/09/16	KQ	6.10	Review brief and revise Table of Authorities (2.6), prepare Appendix for filing (2.1), file Appendix (.7), finalize and file the Appellant Brief (.7)
06/09/16	ALS	0.50	Begin work on table of authorities for Brief (.3); office conference with A. Cummings and L. Zahradka re same (.1); emails from/to L. Zahradka re same (.1)

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

06/09/16	ALS	0.20	Obtain case from Westlaw for R. Keach for use in Carmack litigation (.1); reply email to R. Keach re same with respect to Carmack litigation (.1)
06/09/16	DSA	0.10	Reviewed e-mails and orders entered in relation to CP litigation (.1)
06/10/16	LKZ	0.30	Confer w/A.Stewart re BAP brief.
06/13/16	LKZ	0.10	Emails w/B.Keach re: hearing on motion to intervene.
06/13/16	RND	0.10	Review email from R. Keach re: Rule 26(f) Report (Carmack Litigation)
06/13/16	DSA	0.10	Reviewed filings relating to appeal of decision relating to Irving railroad's admin claims (.1)
06/14/16	DSA	0.10	Reviewed e-mails concerning upcoming hearings in CP litigation (.1)
06/14/16	ALS	0.10	Update docket scheduling in derailment litigation
06/14/16	RND	0.20	Emails with R. Keach and J. Wetch re: CP's Proposed Rule 26(f) Report
06/14/16	RND	0.10	Email with R. Keach re: CP's proposed Rule 26(f) Report
06/14/16	RND	1.70	Review CP's proposed Rule 26(f) report and other pleadings and revise Rule 26(f) report accordingly (Carmack Litigation)
06/14/16	TJM	0.60	TC w/ F Caruso re 506(c) deposition (0.2); Review revised JPO re 506(c) claims (0.2) and counsel for Wheeling's email re same (0.2)
06/15/16	TJM	0.60	Review list of electronic discovery terms
06/15/16	TJM	0.10	Respond to email from counsel for Wheeling re 506(c) discovery (0.1)
06/15/16	RND	0.10	Email with J. Wetch re: Carmack litigation
06/16/16	RND	0.10	Email with R. Keach re: CP's second Motion to Withdraw Reference

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

06/16/16	RND	0.20	Review CP's Disallowance of Canadian claims and emails with R. Keach re: same
06/16/16	RND	0.10	Email with R. Keach and WF re: Bill of Lading
06/16/16	RND	0.30	Further revise Rule 26(f) Report based on calls with R. Keach and CP (Carmack Litigation)
06/16/16	RND	0.50	Call with J. Whitley, J. Wetch, and R. Keach re: Carmack litigation
06/16/16	RND	0.40	Rule 26 Initial Conference call with R. Keach and T. Thornton
06/16/16	RND	0.10	Follow up call with R. Keach re: Rule 26(f) Report
06/16/16	PM	0.30	Review CP Motion to Withdraw Reference.
06/16/16	ALS	0.20	Update pleadings re CP's Motion to Withdraw Reference (.1); email to R. Keach re CP's Motion to Withdraw Reference (.1)
06/17/16	ALS	0.10	Office conference with T. McKeon re CP discovery
06/17/16	DSA	0.10	Reviewed e-mails and motion to withdraw the reference filed by CP (.1)
06/17/16	RND	0.80	Review CP's Motion to Withdraw the Reference
06/17/16	TJM	0.90	Review and revise electronic discovery search terms re CP (0.5); Review electronic storage system of documents re responding to CP document requests (0.4)
06/20/16	TJM	0.30	Emails w/ counsel for Wheeling e case status (0.2) and TC w/ K Quirk re same (0.1)
06/20/16	KQ	0.10	Respond to L. Zahradka regarding filing an agreed request to continue related to the motion for relief from judgment and reconsideration re omnibus objection to claim filed by Estates of Marie Alliance, et al

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

06/20/16	KQ	0.30	E-mails from and to L. Zahrada regarding date for continued hearing and enter on to the docket Agreed Request to Continue hearing related to the motion for relief from judgment and reconsideration re omnibus objection to claim filed by Estates of Marie Alliance, et al
06/20/16	KQ	0.10	Enter onto the docket the Agreed Request to Continue related to hearing on preliminary surcharge motion on the adversary proceeding Wheeling v. Keach
06/20/16	LKZ	0.40	Review upcoming deadlines (.1), report from telephonic conference w/J.Nivison (.1); emails w/B.Keach re: same (.1); emails w/counsel to plaintiffs re: hearing on motion for relief from judgment (.1).
06/20/16	DSA	0.30	Reviewed e-mails and filings relating to withdrawal of the CP litigation from the Bankruptcy Court (.3)
06/21/16	ALS	0.20	Review email from L. Zahradka re timing of upcoming appeal related deadlines (.1); email to A. Cummings re appeal related deadlines (.1)
06/21/16	ALS	0.20	Update docket scheduling based on continued hearings on Surcharge Motion and Motion for Relief from Judgment and Reconsideration of Claim Trustees Third Omnibus Objection to Proofs of Claim That Will be Satisfied Under the CCAA Plan
06/21/16	LKZ	0.50	Confer w/B.Keach re: upcoming deadlines.
06/22/16	RND	0.20	Emails with R. Keach and T. Thornton re: revised Joint Rule 26(f) Report
06/22/16	RND	0.10	Email with J. Wetch and J. Whatley re: revised Joint Rule 26(f) Report

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

06/22/16	RND	0.10	Emails with R. Keach re: Response to CP's Motion to Withdraw the Reference
06/22/16	RND	0.20	Emails with T. McKeon and R. Keach re: CP's forum non conveniens motion
06/22/16	PM	0.30	Review CP Motion to Dismiss on Forum Non Conveniens grounds.
06/23/16	ALS	0.20	Review emails with respect to agreed upon search terms for CP discovery
06/23/16	TJM	1.10	Review CP motion to dismiss (0.3); Research forum non conveniens (0.8)
06/24/16	TJM	0.10	Email F Caruso re case status and strategy (0.1)
06/24/16	TJM	0.20	TC w/ Trustee re CP motion to dismiss
06/24/16	ALS	0.40	Telephone call from A. Rydzewski at U.S. District Court re filing of Corporate Disclosure Statement in Keach v CP case (.1); email to L. Zahradka re same (.1); review email from L. Zahradka re filing of Corporate Disclosure Statement (.1); filing of Corporate Disclosure Statement with Court (.1)
06/24/16	LKZ	0.70	Draft corporate disclosure statement for 16-180 (CP motion to withdraw reference) (.5); emails w/B.Keach (.1), A.Stewart (.1) re: same.
06/27/16	LKZ	0.20	Emails w./A.stewart, T.McKeon re: Wheeling withdrawal from CP case on motion to withdraw ref (.1) and analysis re: same (.1)
06/27/16	RND	0.50	Call with R. Keach re: Response to CP's Motion to Withdraw the Reference
06/27/16	RND	0.20	Call with R. Keach and T. Thornton re: Carmack litigation and Rule26(f) Report
06/27/16	RND	0.10	Correspondence with R. Keach re: CP's Motion to Withdraw the Reference
06/27/16	RND	0.10	Email with R. Keach re: follow up Rule 26(f) call with T. Thornton

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

06/27/16	RND	0.60	Emails with R. Keach and T. McKeon re: CP's Motion to Withdraw the Reference and Motion to Dismiss Adversary Proceeding
06/27/16	RND	0.90	Research re: choice of law issues
06/27/16	ALS	0.40	Emails from/to H. Pelkey re Wheeling's request for consent on motion to withdraw from case in Keach v CP adversary proceeding (.2); emails to/from L. Zahradka re same (.2)
06/27/16	DSA	0.30	Reviewed motion to dismiss filed by CP and related filings (.3)
06/27/16	TJM	0.30	Emails w/ Trustee re CP motion to dismiss
06/27/16	TJM	0.10	Review email from L. Zahradka re case status and respond re same (0.1)
06/28/16	TJM	0.10	Review email from Trustee and respond re same re CP discovery status (0.1)
06/28/16	RND	0.40	Emails with R. Keach and T. McKeon re: CP's Motion to Dismiss and Motion to Withdraw the Reference
06/28/16	RND	5.40	Research re: Motion to Withdraw Reference
06/28/16	LKZ	1.50	Review motion to enforce plan (.4); confer w/B.Keach re: same (.2); research re: (.4) and draft joinder to same (.3); emails w/J.Fischer (.1), K.Quirk (.1) re: filing same.
06/29/16	LKZ	1.10	Review revised motion to enforce plan (.1), research re: same (.2), and emails w/B.Keach re: same (.1); finalize joinder for filing (.1); confer w/B.Keach re: upcoming deadlines, litigation issues (.6).
06/29/16	KQ	0.40	Finalize and file the joinder to WD Trustee's Motion to Enforce
06/29/16	RND	0.10	Email with R. Keach and T. McKeon re: litigation issues
06/29/16	RND	0.40	Review R. Keach's comments/edits to CP Discovery Requests

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

06/29/16	ALS	0.10	Emails from/to R. Keach re Carmack litigation
06/29/16	JAL	0.40	Conference with TJM re opposition to motion to dismiss.
06/29/16	JAL	0.20	Conference with RJK re opposition to CP motion to dismiss.
06/29/16	TJM	0.50	TC w/ J Lewis re CP motion to dismiss (0.2) and email J Lewis re same (0.1); Review file for CP discovery production (0.2)
06/30/16	TJM	0.50	Draft, edit and revise motion for certain relief in Trustee's derailment litigation
06/30/16	JAL	3.60	Reviewed research re forum non conveniens (2.4); conference with RJK re opposition to motion to dismiss CP litigation (1.2).
06/30/16	ALS	0.80	Emails from/to T. McKeon re CP discovery (.2); process CP discovery (.6)
06/30/16	ALS	0.10	Email to R. Keach re CP discovery
06/30/16	ALS	0.30	Review draft interrogatories and request for documents for Carmack litigation (.2); conference with R. Desai re same (.1)
06/30/16	DSA	0.10	Reviewed motions to enforce plan injunction and e-mails relating thereto (.1)
06/30/16	RND	0.20	Emails with R. Keach re: revisions to CP Discovery Requests
06/30/16	RND	4.30	Revise Discovery Requests to Soo Line Co, Soo Line Corp., CPRC, and CP Limited based on comments from R. Keach
06/30/16	RND	1.60	Research re: choice of law issues

Total	10	921.50	

12 Plan and Disclosure Statement

Date	ATTY	Hours	
12/29/15	LKZ	0.20	Emails w/A.Helman re: plan status.

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

01/11/16	LKZ	3.50	Confer w/B.Keach re: motion to compel compliance with plan, upcoming plan deadlines (1.1); update plan timeline (1.2) and emails w/B.Keach re: same (.2); review bankruptcy rules, local rules, US Trustee guidelines in connection with same (1.0).
01/12/16	LKZ	2.80	Draft motion to enforce plan releases and injunctions.
01/13/16	LKZ	1.80	Further draft motion to enforce plan injunctions (1.5); confer w/B.Keach re: same (.1); review notice of intent to distribute sent to WD Trust Beneficiaries (.1) and confer w/B.Keach re: same (.1).
01/22/16	KQ	0.30	Finalize and file the Motion for Limited Exclusivity Extension, Motion to Expedite and Notice of Hearing
01/22/16	KQ	0.30	Prepare and send service of the Motion for Limited Exclusivity Extension, Motion to Expedite and Notice of Hearing
01/22/16	KQ	0.30	Draft and file the Certificate of Service related to the Motion for Limited Exclusivity Extension, Motion to Expedite and Notice of Hearing
01/27/16	LKZ	1.30	Call w/counsel to settling defendant re: status of dismissal from Derailment cases (.1); draft assignment agreement for Carmack claims to WD Trust (.7) and emails w/B.Keach re: same (.1); draft engagement letter for WD Trust/BSSN (.3) and emails w/B.Keach re: same (.1).
01/28/16	LKZ	0.20	Revise carmack claim assignment agreement.
01/29/16	LKZ	0.20	Call w/Settling Defendants re: dismissal status (.1) and emails w/B.Keach re: same (.1).

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

02/09/16	LKZ	0.80	Revise engagement letter for WD Trust (.6) and emails (.1) and confer (.1) w/B.Keach re: same.
02/11/16	LKZ	0.10	Revise WD Trust/BSSN engagement letter and emails w/J.Whatley re: same.
02/12/16	LKZ	0.20	Emails w/J.Whatley, J.Sternklar re: WD Trust engagement letter call for week of 2/22.
03/29/16	LKZ	0.10	Emails w/B.Keach re: Carmack claim assignment agreement.
04/07/16	LKZ	3.10	Revise engagement letter for WD Trustee (.2); prep for (.1) and calls w/ (.5) (.4) WD Trustee re: same and Carmack Claim assignment agreement; follow-up discussion w/B.Keach re: same (.8); draft motion to remedy Plan in connection with same (1.1).
04/08/16	LKZ	2.80	Further draft motion to remedy plan (.7) and confer w/B.Keach re: same and Carmack assignment agreement (.2); draft Derailment Trust Agreement (1.8) and confer w/B.Keach re: same (.1).
04/11/16	RND	0.30	Emails with J. Whatley, L. Zahradka, and R. Keach re: executed Carmack Assignment Agreement
04/11/16	LKZ	2.70	Update plan consummation timeline (.8); draft motion for extension of deadline to file final decree (.6) and FOO (.1) and confer w/B.Keach re: same (.1); review drafts of engagement letter w/WD Trustee (.8) and prepare execution version of same (.2) and Carmack assignment agreement (.1).
05/17/16	LKZ	2.20	Confer w/B.Keach re: CP opposition to motion to extend stay in CCAA (.2); draft letter in reponse (1.5); emails w/B.Keach re: same (.1); review revised version of same (.1); confer w/B.Keach re: same (.1); review email traffic (.1) and amended letter re: same

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
 Matter Number: 047375-00001
 RE: Chapter 11

	06/30/16	KQ	0.40	(.1). Prepare and send e-mail service of the joinder to the WD Trustee re motion to enforce plan
	06/30/16	KQ	0.70	Draft and file the Certificate of Service related to the joinder to WD Trustee's motion to enforce the plan
	Total 12		24.30	
14	Other			
	Date	ATTY	Hours	
	01/22/16	EMA	0.30	Call w/ french-speaking Derailment creditor re: status of the case (.1); coordinate with L. Zahradka re: response (.2).
	Total 14		0.30	
21	Tax Issues			
	Date	ATTY	Hours	
	03/30/16	LKZ	0.10	Review email re: Derby tax issue.
	Total 21		0.10	

ATTORNEY / PARALEGAL SUMMARY

01	Asset Analysis and Recovery			
	Name	Hours	Rate	Amount
	SAM ANDERSON	0.10	405.00	40.50
	Total 01	0.10		40.50
03	Business Operations			
	Name	Hours	Rate	Amount

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

LINDSAY ZAHRADKA	0.70	225.00	157.50
SAM ANDERSON	0.10	405.00	40.50

Total 03	0.80		198.00

04 Case Administration

Name	Hours	Rate	Amount
ANGELA STEWART	18.00	205.00	3,690.00
KARLA QUIRK	18.50	170.00	3,145.00
KATHERINE JOYCE	2.00	280.00	560.00
LINDSAY ZAHRADKA	16.70	225.00	3,757.50
PAUL MCDONALD	0.10	415.00	41.50
ROMA DESAI	0.50	225.00	112.50
SAM ANDERSON	1.60	405.00	648.00
TIMOTHY MCKEON	0.40	220.00	88.00

Total 04	57.80		12,042.50

05 Claims Administration and Objections

Name	Hours	Rate	Amount
ANGELA STEWART	16.50	205.00	3,382.50
CHRISTINE B. BERTSCH	0.30	115.00	34.50
JESSICA LEWIS	20.70	275.00	5,692.50
KARLA QUIRK	67.00	170.00	11,390.00
LINDSAY ZAHRADKA	117.60	225.00	26,460.00
PAUL MCDONALD	0.10	415.00	41.50
ROMA DESAI	1.00	225.00	225.00
SAM ANDERSON	4.20	405.00	1,701.00
TIMOTHY MCKEON	2.60	220.00	572.00

Total 05	230.00		49,499.00

07 Fee/Employment Applications

Name	Hours	Rate	Amount
ANGELA STEWART	9.30	205.00	1,906.50

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
 Matter Number: 047375-00001
 RE: Chapter 11

	KARLA QUIRK	8.10	170.00	1,377.00
	LINDSAY ZAHRADKA	41.90	225.00	9,427.50
	MICHAEL SIEDBAND	0.50	220.00	110.00
	ROMA DESAI	9.50	225.00	2,137.50
	SAM ANDERSON	2.10	405.00	850.50
	Total 07	71.40		15,809.00
08 Fee/Employment Objections				
	Name	Hours	Rate	Amount
	SAM ANDERSON	0.10	370.00	37.00
	TIMOTHY MCKEON	0.30	200.00	60.00
	Total 08	0.40		97.00
10 Litigation				
	Name	Hours	Rate	Amount
	ANGELA STEWART	109.80	205.00	22,509.00
	BODIE COLWELL	3.50	220.00	770.00
	CHRISTINE B. BERTSCH	5.90	115.00	678.50
	JESSICA LEWIS	22.70	275.00	6,242.50
	KARLA QUIRK	54.30	170.00	9,231.00
	LINDSAY ZAHRADKA	192.90	225.00	43,402.50
	MICHAEL SIEDBAND	0.70	200.00	140.00
	MICHAEL SIEDBAND	34.40	220.00	7,568.00
	PAUL MCDONALD	12.20	415.00	5,063.00
	PETER NICHOLS	18.90	180.00	3,402.00
	ROMA DESAI	166.10	225.00	37,372.50
	SAM ANDERSON	0.40	370.00	148.00
	SAM ANDERSON	12.50	405.00	5,062.50
	TIMOTHY MCKEON	1.80	200.00	360.00
	TIMOTHY MCKEON	285.40	220.00	62,788.00
	Total 10	921.50		204,737.50

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

12 Plan and Disclosure Statement

Name	Hours	Rate	Amount
KARLA QUIRK	2.00	170.00	340.00
LINDSAY ZAHRADKA	0.20	205.00	41.00
LINDSAY ZAHRADKA	21.80	225.00	4,905.00
ROMA DESAI	0.30	225.00	67.50

Total 12	24.30		5,353.50

14 Other

Name	Hours	Rate	Amount
EBEN ALBERT	0.30	240.00	72.00

Total 14	0.30		72.00

21 Tax Issues

Name	Hours	Rate	Amount
LINDSAY ZAHRADKA	0.10	225.00	22.50

Total 21	0.10		22.50

TOTAL FEES \$287,871.50

COST SUMMARY

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
 Matter Number: 047375-00001
 RE: Chapter 11

-----COST CODE SUMMARY-----		
-----COST CODE-----		AMOUNT
11	FILING FEE	200.00
15	SHERIFF FEE	230.15
16	TRANSCRIPT COST	233.49
20	OUTSIDE PHOTOCOPY	9.00
37	FEDERAL EXPRESS	412.57
40	MISCELLANEOUS	1682.00

COST DETAIL

FEDERAL EXPRESS - PAID TO: FEDERAL EXPRESS CORPORATION	10.70
FILING FEE - PAID TO: BUSINESSCARD SERVICES Certification for Admission Pro Hac Vice	100.00
FILING FEE - PAID TO: BUSINESSCARD SERVICES Certification for Admission Pro Hac Vice	100.00
TRANSCRIPT COST - PAID TO: LORI D. DUNBAR, RMR, CRR	53.10
FEDERAL EXPRESS - PAID TO: FEDERAL EXPRESS CORPORATION	31.59
MISCELLANEOUS - PAID TO: DLS	99.00
SHERIFF FEE - PAID TO: METRO LEGAL	130.00
OUTSIDE PHOTOCOPY - PAID TO: INFORME COPYING, CORP. REC. RETRIEVAL	9.00
FEDERAL EXPRESS - PAID TO: FEDERAL EXPRESS CORPORATION	43.14
FEDERAL EXPRESS - PAID TO: FEDERAL EXPRESS CORPORATION	23.39
MISCELLANEOUS - PAID TO: WESERVEMAIN	125.00
MISCELLANEOUS - PAID TO: BUSINESSCARD SERVICES Courts/USBC-ME	298.00

Bernstein Shur

Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway

July 12, 2016 Invoice# *****
Matter Number: 047375-00001
RE: Chapter 11

MISCELLANEOUS - PAID TO: UNITED STATES DISTRICT COURT	900.00	
FEDERAL EXPRESS - PAID TO: FEDERAL EXPRESS CORPORATION	23.22	
MISCELLANEOUS - PAID TO: PAQUETTE & ASSOCIES	260.00	
FEDERAL EXPRESS - PAID TO: FEDERAL EXPRESS CORPORATION	96.01	
FEDERAL EXPRESS - PAID TO: FEDERAL EXPRESS CORPORATION	96.01	
FEDERAL EXPRESS - PAID TO: FEDERAL EXPRESS CORPORATION	88.51	
SHERIFF FEE - PAID TO: PAQUETTE & ASSOCIES	100.15	
TRANSCRIPT COST - PAID TO: BUSINESSCARD	180.39	
SERVICES Veritext Original Transcript		
TOTAL EXPENSES		\$2,767.21
TOTAL FEES PLUS EXPENSES		\$290,638.71



Exhibit B
BIOGRAPHIES OF BSSN PROFESSIONALS AND PARAPROFESSIONALS

D. SAM ANDERSON

Sam Anderson is a co-chair of the firm's Business Restructuring and Insolvency Practice Group. Sam's practice focuses primarily on representing debtors in Chapter 11 reorganization proceedings. Sam's practice has focused most recently on representing real estate holding companies in chapter 11, including debtors in single asset real estate cases, and representing companies in the hospitality industry through reorganizations and asset sales. Additionally, Sam has considerable recent experience working on individual Chapter 11 reorganizations. He has extensive experience representing creditors in Chapter 11 proceedings, including representing landlords as creditors in these proceedings.

Sam has a wide range of experience in representing clients in pre-bankruptcy and bankruptcy related matters, including representing clients in valuation disputes, preference litigation, fraudulent transfer litigation, stay relief, assets sales under the Bankruptcy Code, plan confirmation and other matters arising under bankruptcy law.

He also has experience representing plaintiffs and defendants in commercial litigation in both state and federal courts. Sam was previously employed at firms in Philadelphia, Pennsylvania and Portland, Maine. He is recognized by Chambers USA and Best Lawyers in America.

KATHERINE A. JOYCE

Kat Joyce is the chair of the firm's Energy and Environmental Practice Group. One of Kat's primary practice areas is the environmental permitting and compliance issues arising from large-scale land developments and industrial operations. Kat's practice has focused most recently on environmental permitting and compliance issues related to energy and manufacturing facilities, including real estate remediation and managing associated liabilities. Kat regularly represents clients before the Maine Department of Environmental Protection and the United States Environmental Protection Agency. Kat has been recognized for her environmental practice in both Chambers and SuperLawyers. Kat was admitted to practice in Maine in 2003, and has been with Bernstein Shur since 2007.

PAUL MCDONALD

Paul McDonald is a shareholder and the chair of the Litigation Practice Group. Paul concentrates his practice in complex commercial and business litigation matters. He has tried cases to judges, juries, administrative appeal panels and arbitrators in Maine and across the country. Paul is recognized as a leading commercial litigator by Chambers USA, Best Lawyers in America, and Super Lawyers, and is rated AV-rated by Martindale-Hubbell. As Chambers USA put it in its 2009 Edition of America's Leading Business Lawyers, "His effectiveness in court is due to his careful preparation, thorough due diligence and presentation skills."

Paul is a frequent presenter at legal and business seminars and is the co-author of a Bernstein Shur's monthly Commercial and Business Litigation Newsletter. In 2010, Paul was awarded the Vincent L. McKusick Award by the Maine State Bar Association, which honors the author of the best article published in the Maine Bar Journal that year, for his article entitled Recovery of Lost Profits Damages; All Is Not Lost.

EBEN ALBERT

Eben practices in both the Litigation & Dispute Resolution and Technology, Outsourcing & Data Security practice groups. Eben is experienced in commercial litigation, personal injury, data security, real-estate litigation (boundary disputes, adverse possession, FEDs, etc.), professional negligence, and general civil litigation.

BODIE COLWELL

Bodie B. Colwell was a member of Bernstein Shur's Business Restructuring and Insolvency Practice Group. Her practice focused on bankruptcy and business reorganization, preference litigation, debt restructuring and general Chapter 11 bankruptcies.

Bodie serves as the coach of the teams representing the University of Maine School of Law at the Duberstein Moot Court Competition. Additionally, Bodie is a volunteer editor for the American Bankruptcy Institute Volo Project and is a certified mediator. Bodie earned her law degree *cum laude* from the University of Maine School of Law. She earned her BA from the University of Southern Maine, where she was president of the USM Political Science Student Association and a member of the *Pi Sigma Alpha* National Political Science Honor Society.

ROMA DESAI

Roma N. Desai is a member of Bernstein Shur's Business Restructuring and Insolvency Practice Group. Her practice focuses on commercial bankruptcy and business reorganization.

Prior to joining Bernstein Shur, Roma served as a federal law clerk for the Honorable J. Michael Deasy and the Honorable Mark W. Vaughn of the U.S. Bankruptcy Court for the District of New Hampshire. She has also worked for multiple New York City law firms, representing clients in commercial and corporate bankruptcy issues.

Roma earned her JD from Washington University in St. Louis School of Law, where she completed an externship with the enforcement division of the U.S. Securities and Exchange Commission. She is admitted to practice law in New York, the U.S. District Court for Eastern District of New York, the U.S. District Court for Southern District of New York the state of Maine and the U.S. District Court of Maine.

TIMOTHY MCKEON

Tim McKeon is a member of Bernstein Shur's Business Restructuring and Insolvency Practice Group. His practice focuses on business finance and restructuring proceedings, including Chapter 11, asset sales and acquisition, and bankruptcy related litigation.

Prior to joining Bernstein Shur, Tim was an associate at Davidoff Hutcher & Citron LLP in New York, New York. While there, he focused on bankruptcy, commercial litigation, general

corporate matters and government relations. During law school, Tim was a judicial intern for Hon. Carla E. Craig, U.S. Bankruptcy Chief Judge, E.D.N.Y. and Hon. Robert E. Grossman, U.S. Bankruptcy Judge, E.D.N.Y.

Tim earned his JD from Brooklyn Law School and his BA from the College of the Holy Cross, where he was a member of the Phi Sigma Tau Honor Society.

MICHAEL SIEDBAND

Michael is a member of the firm's Business Restructuring and Insolvency Practice Group. His practice focuses on business restructuring and insolvency proceedings, including chapter 11 reorganizations, asset sales and acquisitions, and bankruptcy-related litigation

Prior to joining Bernstein Shur, Michael served for two years as a law clerk to the Hon. Bruce A. Harwood and the Hon. J. Michael Deasy of the U.S. Bankruptcy Court for the District of New Hampshire. Prior to his clerkship, he was an associate at Looney & Grossman, LLP in Boston, Massachusetts, where he focused on bankruptcy, restructuring and commercial litigation. Michael has been ranked by Super Lawyers as a rising star in Bankruptcy & Creditor/Debtor Rights

Michael earned his JD from Boston College, where he was managing editor and staff writer for the Uniform Commercial Code Reporter-Digest. He earned his BS from Boston University, magna cum laude. Michael was a varsity rower in college and a member of the US National Team for rowing at the 2003 Pan-Am Games.

LINDSAY ZAHRADKA

Lindsay is a member of Bernstein Shur's Business Restructuring and Insolvency Practice Group. In her practice, Lindsay assists a broad array of corporate clients in matters including chapter 11 reorganizations, asset sales and acquisitions and bankruptcy-related litigation.

Prior to joining Bernstein Shur, Lindsay worked as an associate with Akin Gump in New York, where she focused on financial restructuring matters. She advised borrowers, debtors, official committees of unsecured creditors, lenders, and ad-hoc groups of bondholders in connection with pre-filing negotiations and chapter 11 proceedings.

PETER NICHOLS

Peter is a paralegal in the Litigation Group. Peter is a graduate of the University of Maine, and also attended Bentley College where he received a certificate in paralegal studies. He has been working as a litigation paralegal since 1985.

KARLA QUIRK

Karla Quirk is a paralegal in the Business Restructuring and Insolvency Practice Group. Karla served as a legal assistant at Bernstein Shur before being promoted to paralegal in 2012. She was previously employed at Verrill & Dana, LLP where she worked as a paralegal.

ANGELA STEWART

Angela is a paralegal in the Business Restructuring and Insolvency Practice Group. Angela has worked as a paralegal since 1997. She holds a BA in Public Management from the University of Maine.

CHRISTINE B. BERTSCH

Christine Bertsch has been the law librarian for Bernstein Shur since 1993. Her background includes academic and public library work experience at the University of Maine at Presque Isle, Dyer Library Association, and the Fountaindale Public Library District. She holds a master's degree in library science from the University of Denver, 1977, and a BA degree from Illinois State University.

**UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT
DISTRICT OF MAINE**

In re:

MONTREAL MAINE & ATLANTIC
RAILWAY, LTD.

Debtor.

Bk. No. 13-10670
Chapter 11

ORDER GRANTING FIRST INTERIM APPLICATION FOR COMPENSATION AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES FOR BERNSTEIN, SHUR, SAWYER & NELSON, P.A., AS COUNSEL TO ROBERT J. KEACH, ESTATE REPRESENTATIVE, FOR THE PERIOD DECEMBER 23, 2015 THROUGH AND INCLUDING JUNE 30, 2016

This matter having come before the Court on the *First Interim Application for Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses for Bernstein, Shur, Sawyer & Nelson, P.A., as Counsel to Robert J Keach, Estate Representative, for the Period December 23, 2015 Through and Including June 30, 2016* (the "Fee Application"),¹ and after proper notice to all creditors and other parties-in-interest, the Court having independently reviewed the Fee Application, it is hereby **ORDERED, ADJUDGED, and DECREED** as follows:

1. The Fee Application is granted.
2. In relation to the Compensation Period and, pursuant to 11 U.S.C. § 330, BSSN is allowed compensation for services to the Estate Representative in the aggregate amount of **\$290,638.71**, including professional fees in the amount of **\$287,871.50** and reimbursement of expenses in the amount of **\$2,767.21**.
3. The Fees and expenses for the Compensation Period are hereby awarded on an interim basis in accordance with the applicable sections of the Bankruptcy Code, the Federal Rules of Bankruptcy Procedure, and this Court's local rules.

¹ Capitalized terms not otherwise defined herein shall have the meaning ascribed to them in the Fee Application.

Dated: _____, 2016

The Honorable Peter G. Cary
Chief Judge, United States Bankruptcy Court

**UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT
DISTRICT OF MAINE**

In re:

MONTREAL MAINE & ATLANTIC
RAILWAY, LTD.

Debtor.

Bk. No. 13-10670

Chapter 11

NOTICE OF HEARING

Bernstein, Shur, Sawyer & Nelson, P.A. (“BSSN”), counsel to Robert J. Keach, the Estate Representative (the “Estate Representative”) of the bankruptcy estate of Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway, Ltd. (the “Debtor”), has filed the *First Interim Application for Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses for Bernstein, Shur, Sawyer & Nelson, P.A., as Counsel to Robert J. Keach, Estate Representative, for the Period December 23, 2015 Through and Including June 30, 2016* (the “Application”). A hearing on the Application is set to take place at the United States Bankruptcy Court, 537 Congress Street, Portland, Maine on **August 30, 2016 at 9:00 a.m.** (the “Hearing”).

By the Application, BSSN seeks a total amount of \$290,638.71, which includes \$287,871.50 for compensation of professional fees and \$2,767.21 for reimbursement of expenses incurred with respect to services rendered on behalf of the Estate Representative during the period December 23, 2015 through June 30, 2016 (the “Compensation Period”). BSSN seeks an order authorizing and approving this compensation for fees and expenses incurred during the Compensation Period on an interim basis.

Your rights may be affected. You should read these papers carefully and discuss them with your attorney, if you have one in this bankruptcy case. If you do not have an attorney, you may wish to consult one.

If you do not want the court to approve the Application, or if you want the court to consider your views on the Application, then on or before **August 23, 2016**, you or your attorney must file with the court a written response explaining your position. If you are not able to access the CM/ECF Filing System, your response should be served upon the Court at:

Alec Leddy, Clerk
United States Bankruptcy Court
202 Harlow Street
Bangor, Maine 04401

-and-

Sam Anderson, Esq.
Bernstein, Shur, Sawyer & Nelson, P.A.
100 Middle St., PO Box 9729
Portland, Maine 04104-5029

If you have to mail your response to the Court for filing, you must mail it early enough so that the Court will receive it on or before the date stated above.

If you or your attorney do not take these steps, the Court may decide that you do not oppose the relief sought in the Application and may enter an order granting that relief.

DATED: August 1, 2016

**BERNSTEIN, SHUR, SAWYER &
NELSON, P.A.**

/s/ Sam Anderson
Sam Anderson, Esq.
Lindsay K. Zahradka, Esq. (admitted *pro hac vice*)
100 Middle Street, P.O. Box 9729
Portland, Maine 04104-5029
Telephone: (207) 774-1200
Facsimile: (207) 774-1127
Email: sanderson@bernsteinshur.com
lzahradka@bernsteinshur.com